© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W WNNNDNNNNNNNERERRRRPRP B P PR R
P O © 0N O 0 WNIEPEPEO®O©OONOGON®WNNPRPR O

HOUSE AMENDMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

CHAMBER ACTI ON
Senat e House

ORI G NAL STAMP BELOW

Representative(s) Ogles and Brown offered the follow ng:

Amendment (with title amendment)

Renove fromthe bill: Everything after the enacting cl ause

and insert in lieu thereof:

Section 1. Subsection (4) is added to section 310.071
Fl orida Statutes, to read

310.071 Deputy pilot certification.--

(4) Notwithstanding s. 112.011 or any other provision

of lawrelating to the restoration of civil rights, an

appl i cant shall be disqualified fromapplying for and shall be

denied a deputy pilot certificate if the applicant, regardl ess

of adj udi cation, has ever been found guilty of, or pled guilty

or nolo contendere to, a charge which was:

(a) A felony or first degree m sdeneanor which

directly related to the navigation or operation of a vessel

or
(b) A felony involving the sale of or trafficking in,

or conspiracy to sell or traffic in, a controlled substance as

defined by chapter 893, or an offense under the | aws of any
1

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O WDN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

state or country which, if conmmtted in this state, would

constitute the felony of selling or trafficking in, or

conspiracy to sell or traffic in, such controlled substance.
Section 2. Subsection (4) of section 310.151, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:
310. 151 Rates of pilotage; Pilotage Rate Review
Boar d. - -

(4)(a) The applicant shall be given witten notice,
either in person or by certified mail, that the board intends
to nodify the pilotage rates in that port and that the
applicant may, within 21 days after recei pt of the notice,
request a hearing pursuant to the Administrative Procedure
Act. Notice of the intent to nodify the pilotage rates in that
port shall also be published in the Florida Adm nistrative
Weekly and in a newspaper of general circulation in the
affected port area and shall be mailed to any person who has
formally requested notice of any rate change in the affected
port area. Wthin 21 days after receipt or publication of
notice, any person whose substantial interests will be
affected by the intended board action may request a hearing
pursuant to the Adm nistrative Procedure Act. If the board
concludes that the petitioner has raised a disputed issue of
mat erial fact, the board shall designate a hearing, which
shal | be conducted by formal proceedi ng before an
adm ni strative | aw judge assigned by the Division of
Adm ni strative Hearings pursuant to ss. 120.569 and 120.57(1),
unl ess waived by all parties. |If the board concludes that the

petitioner has not raised a disputed issue of material fact

and does not designate the petition for hearing, that decision

shal |l be considered final agency action for purposes of s.

120. 68. The failure to request a hearing within 21 days after
2

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

recei pt or publication of notice shall constitute a waiver of
any right to an adninistrative hearing and shall cause the
order nodifying the pilotage rates in that port to be entered.
If an admi nistrative hearing is requested pursuant to this
subsection, notice of the tine, date, and | ocation of the
hearing shall be published in the Florida Adm nistrative
Weekly and in a newspaper of general circulation in the
affected port area and shall be mailed to the applicant and to
any person who has fornally requested notice of any rate
change for the affected port area.

(b) In any administrative proceeding pursuant to this

section, the board's proposed rate determ nation shall be

i medi ately effective and shall not be stayed during the

admi ni strative proceedi ng, provided that, pending rendition of

the board's final order, the pilot or pilots in the subject

port deposit in an interest-bearing account all anounts

received which represent the difference between the previous

rates and the proposed rates. The pilot or pilots in the

subj ect port shall keep an accurate accounting of all anpunts

deposited, specifying by whom or on whose behal f such anpunts

were paid, and shall produce such an accounti ng upon request

of the board. Upon rendition of the board's final order

1. Any anounts deposited in the interest-bearing

account which are sustained by the final order shall be paid

over to the pilot or pilots in the subject port, including al

i nterest accrued on such funds; and

2. Any anounts deposited which exceed the rates

sustained in the board's final order shall be refunded, with

the accrued interest, to those custoners fromwhomthe funds

were collected. Any funds that are not refunded after diligent

effort of the pilot or pilots to do so shall be disbursed by
3

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

the pilot or pilots as the board shall direct.
Section 3. Subsection (1) of section 399.061, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

399. 061 Inspections; correction of deficiencies.--
(1) (a) Al fFer—those elevators subject to this chapter
nmust be inspected pursuant to s. 399.13 by a third-party

i nspection service certified as a Qualified El evator |nspector

or maintained pursuant to a service mai ntenance contract

continuously in force. A statenent verifying the existence,

perfornmance, and cancell ation of each service nmi ntenance

contract nust be filed annually with the division as
prescribed by rule. Al el evators fer—whiech—a——service

pterentet——An—etevator covered by steh a service

nmai nt enance contract shall be inspected by a

certificate-of-conpetency hol der state—etevator—inspector at

| east once every 2 fiseal years; however, if the elevator is
not an escalator or a dunbwaiter and the el evator serves only
two adjacent floors and is covered by a service maintenance
contract, no inspection shall be required so |ong as the
service contract remains in effect.
(b) £y The division nay inspect an el evator whenever
necessary to ensure its safe operation
Section 4. Subsection (4) is added to section 455.201
4
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UuDWNER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Fl orida Statutes, to read

455,211 Board rules; final agency action
chal | enges. - -

(1) The secretary of the departnent shall have
standing to challenge any rule or proposed rule of a board
under its jurisdiction pursuant to s. 120.56. In addition to
chal | enges for any invalid exercise of delegated | egislative
authority, the admnistrative | aw judge, upon such a chall enge
by the secretary, may declare all or part of a rule or
proposed rule invalid if it:

(a) Does not protect the public fromany significant
and di scerni bl e harm or danages;

(b) Unreasonably restricts conpetition or the
availability of professional services in the state or in a
significant part of the state; or

(c) Unnecessarily increases the cost of professiona
services without a correspondi ng or equival ent public benefit.

However, there shall not be created a presunption of the
exi stence of any of the conditions cited in this subsection in
the event that the rule or proposed rule is chall enged.
(2) In addition, either the secretary or the board
shall be a substantially interested party for purposes of s.
120.54(7). The board may, as an adversely affected party,
initiate and nmaintain an action pursuant to s. 120.68
chal |l enging the final agency action
(3) No board created within the departnent shall have
standing to challenge a rule or proposed rul e of another
board. However, if there is a dispute between boards
concerning a rule or proposed rule, the boards nay avai
t hensel ves of the provisions of s. 455.207(5).
5
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(4) Any proposed board rul e which has not been

nodi fied to renpbve proposed comittee objections of the

Adm ni strative Procedures Conmittee nust receive approval from

the departnent prior to filing the rule with the Departnent of

State for final adoption. The departnent nay repeal any rule

enacted by the board which has taken effect w thout having net

proposed committee objections of the Adninistrative Procedures

Conmittee.

Section 5. Subsection (6) of section 455.217, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

455. 217 Exam nations.--This section shall be read in
conjunction with the appropriate practice act associated with
each regul ated profession under this chapter

(6) For exaninations devel oped by the departnent or a
contracted vendor, each board, or the departnentwhen there
is no board, nmay provide |licensure exaninations in an
applicant's native |language. Applicants for exam nation or
reexam nation pursuant to this subsection shall bear the ful
cost for the departnent's devel opnent, preparation
adm ni stration, grading, and evaluation of any exami nation in
a | anguage other than English or Spanish. Requests for
transl at ed exami nations, except for those in Spanish, nust be

on file in the board office, or with the departnent when there
is no board, at least 6 nmonths prior to the schedul ed
exam nation. Wen deternining whether it is in the public
interest to allow the exam nation to be translated into a
| anguage ot her than English or Spanish, the board, or the
departnment when there is no board, shall consider the
percent age of the popul ati on who speak the applicant's native
| anguage.

Section 6. Section 455.2179, Florida Statutes, is

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O M W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

amended to read:

455, 2179 Conti nui ng education provi der approval; cease
and desi st orders. --

(1) If a board, or the departnent if there is no
board, requires conpletion of continuing education as a

requi renent for renewal of a license, the board, or the

departnment if there is no board, shall approve providers of

t he continui ng educati on. The approval of a continuing

educati on provi der—the—approvat nust be for a specified
period of tine, not to exceed 4 years. An approval that does

not include such atine limtation may remain in effect only
until July 1, 2001, unless earlier replaced by an approval
that includes such a tine linmtation

(2) The departnent, on its own notion or at the
request of a board, shall issue an order requiring a person or
entity to cease and desist fromoffering any continuing
education prograns for |icensees, and revoking any approval of
the provider previously granted by the departnent or a board,
if the departnent or a board determines that the person or
entity failed to provide appropriate continuing education
services that conformto approved course nateri al

(3) Each board authorized to approve conti nui ng

education providers, or the departnent if there is no board,

may establish, by rule, a fee not to exceed $250 for anyone

seeki ng approval to provide continuing education courses and

may establish, by rule, a biennial fee not to exceed $250 for

the renewal of providership of such courses. The Florida Rea

Est at e Conmi ssi on, authorized under the provisions of chapter

475 to approve prelicensure, precertification, and

postlicensure education providers, nay establish, by rule, an

application fee not to exceed $250 for anyone seeki ng approval
7

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O M WDN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

to offer prelicensure, precertification, or postlicensure

educati on courses and nay establish, by rule, a biennial fee

not to exceed $250 for the renewal of such courses.

(4) The departnent and each affected board nmay adopt

rul es pursuant to ss. 120.536(1) and 120.54 to i npl enent the

provi sions of this section.
Section 7. Subsection (3) of section 455.219, Florida
Statutes, is repealed, and subsection (1) of that section is

amended to read:

455,219 Fees; receipts; disposition; periodic
managenent reports. --

(1) Each board within the departnent shall determne
by rule the anount of license fees for its profession, based
upon departnent - prepared | ong-range estinmates of the revenue
required to inplenent all provisions of lawrelating to the
regul ati on of professions by the departnment and any board;
however, when the departnent has deternined, based on the

| ong-range estimates of such revenue, that a profession's

trust fund noneys are in excess of the anpbunt required to

cover the necessary functions of the board, or the departnent

when there is no board, the departnent may adopt rules to

i npl erent a wai ver of license renewal fees for that profession

for a period not to exceed 2 years, as determ ned by the

departnent. Each board, or the departnent when there is no
board, shall ensure license fees are adequate to cover al
anticipated costs and to nmaintain a reasonabl e cash bal ance,
as determned by rule of the departnent, with advice of the
appl i cabl e board. If sufficient action is not taken by a board
within 1 year of notification by the departnent that |icense
fees are projected to be inadequate, the departnent shall set
|icense fees on behalf of the applicable board to cover
8

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

anticipated costs and to nmaintain the required cash bal ance.
The departnent shall include recormmended fee cap increases in
its annual report to the Legislature. Further, it is

| egislative intent that no regul ated profession operate with a
negati ve cash bal ance. The departnent nmy provide by rule for
t he advancenent of sufficient funds to any profession or the
Fl orida State Boxing Conmission operating with a negative cash

bal ance. Such advancenent may be for a period not to exceed 2
consecutive years and shall require interest to be paid by the
regul ated profession. Interest shall be calculated at the
current rate earned on Professional Regulation Trust Fund
i nvestments. Interest earned shall be allocated to the various
funds in accordance with the allocation of investnent earnings
during the period of the advance.

Section 8. Section 455.32, Florida Statutes, is
created to read

455,32 Managenent Privatization Act.--

(1) This section may be cited as the "Managenent

Privatization Act."

(2) As used in this section, the term

(a) "Corporation" neans the corporation or other

busi ness entity with which the departnent contracts pursuant

to subsection (3).

(b) "Executive director" nmeans the person appoi nted by

t he departnment pursuant to s. 455.203.

(c) "Secretary" neans the Secretary of Business and

Pr of essi onal Regul ati on.

(3) Based upon the request of any board, conm ssion

or council, the departnent is authorized to contract with a

corporation or other business entity to perform support

services specified in the contract. The contract nust be in
9

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

conpliance with this section and other applicable | ans and

nmust be approved by the board before the departnent enters

into the contract. The departnent shall retain responsibility

for any duties it currently exercises relating to its police

powers and any other current duty that is not provided to the

corporation by the contract. The contract shall provide, at a

m ni rum that:

(a) The corporation provide adninistrative,

i nvestigative, exam nation, licensing, and prosecutori al

support services in accordance with the provisions of this

section and the practice act of the relevant profession. Wth

approval of the departnent, the corporation nmay subcontract

for any of these services.

(b) The corporation utilize conputer technol ogy

conpatible with the departnent to ensure conpatibility and

availability to the public of infornmation provided for other

pr of essi ons by the departnent.

(c) The corporation submt an annual budget for

approval by the board and the departnent.

(d) The corporation keep financial and statistica

informati on as necessary to conpletely disclose the financial

condi ti on and operation of the project and as requested by the

O fice of Program Policy Anal ysis and Gover nment

Accountability, the Auditor General, and the departnent.

(e) If the certification process in subsection (10)

det ermi nes nonconpliance, the contract provide for nethods and

mechani sns to resolve the situation

(f) The corporation provide to the board and the

departnent, on or before Cctober 1 of each year, a report

describing all of the activities of the corporation for the

previous fiscal year. The report shall include:
10

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

1. Any audit perforned under subsection (9), including

financial reports and perfornance audits.

2. The nunber of |icense applications received, the

nunber of |icenses approved and denied, the nunber of |icenses

i ssued, and the average tinme required to issue a license.

3. The nunber of exam nations adm nistered and the

nunber of applicants who passed or failed the exam nation

4. The nunber of conplaints received, the nunber of

conplaints deternined to be legally sufficient, the nunber of

conpl ai nts disnm ssed, and the nunber of conplaints deternined

to have probabl e cause

5. The nunber of adnministrative conplaints issued and

the status of the conpl aints.

6. The nunber and nature of disciplinary actions taken
by the board.
7. Al revenue received and all expenses incurred by

the corporation over the previous 12 nonths in its perfornmance

of the duties under the contract.

8. The status of the conpliance of the corporation

with all perfornance-based program neasures adopted by the

boar d.
(g) Persons charged with the responsibility of

receiving and depositing fee and fine revenues shall be

required to have a faithful performance bond in such an anount

and according to such terns as shall be deternined in the

contract.
(4) The provisions of s. 768.28 apply to the

corporation, which is deened to be a corporation prinmarily

acting as an instrunentality of the state, but which is not an

agency within the neaning of s. 20.03(11).

(5) The corporation shall be funded through
11

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

appropriations allocated to the regulation of the rel evant

prof ession fromthe Professional Regul ation Trust Fund.

(6) |If the corporation is no |onger approved to

operate for the board or the board ceases to exist, noneys and

property held in trust by the corporation for the benefit of

the board shall revert to the board, or to the state if the

board ceases to exi st.

(7) The executive director shall supervise the

activities of the corporation to ensure conpliance with the

contract and provisions of this section and the practice act

of the relevant profession. The executive director shall be an

enpl oyee of the departnent and serve as a liaison between the

departnent, the board, and the corporation and shall ensure

that the police powers of the state are not exercised by the

cor porati on.

(8) The corporation nay not exercise any authority

assigned to the departnent or board under this section or the

practice act of the rel evant profession, including deternining

| egal sufficiency and probabl e cause to pursue disciplinary

action against a licensee, taking final action on license

applications or in disciplinary cases, or adopting

admi ni strative rul es under chapter 120.

(9) The corporation shall provide for an annua

financial and conpliance audit of its financial accounts and

records by an i ndependent certified public accountant in

accordance with generally accepted auditing standards. The

annual audit report shall include a detail ed suppl enenta

schedul e of expenditures for each expenditure category and a

nmanagenent letter. The annual audit report nust be subnitted

to the board, the departnent, and the Auditor General for

review. The Auditor CGeneral mmy, pursuant to his or her
12

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

authority or at the direction of the Legislative Auditing

Committee, conduct an audit of the corporation

(10) The board and the departnent shall annually

certify that the corporation is conplying with the terns of

the contract in a manner consistent with the goals and

pur poses of the board and in the best interest of the state.
(11) Nothing in this section shall linit the ability
of the corporation to enter into contracts and perform al

other acts incidental to those contracts that are necessary

for the adm nistration of its affairs and for the attai nnent

of its purposes.

(12) The corporation may acquire by | ease, and

mai ntain, use, and operate, any real or personal property

necessary to performthe duties provided by the contract and

this section.
(13) No later than Cctober 1, 2000, the departnent
shall contract with a corporation in accordance with

subsection (3) for the provision of services for architects

and interior designers.

(14) The departnent shall retain the i ndependent

authority to open, investigate, or prosecute any cases or

conpl aints, as necessary, to protect the public health,

safety, or welfare. |In addition, the departnment shall retain

sole authority to issue energency suspension or restriction

orders pursuant to s. 120.60 and to prosecute unlicensed

activity cases pursuant to ss. 455.228 and 455. 2281

(15) Corporation records are public records subject to
the provisions of s. 119.07(1) and s. 24(a), Art. | of the
State Constitution; however, public records exenptions set
forth in ss. 455.217 and 455.229 for records created or
nmai nt ai ned by the departnent shall apply to records created or

13
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

nmai nt ai ned by the corporation. The exenptions set forth in s.

455, 225, relating to conplaints and i nfornmati on obtai ned

pursuant to an investigation by the departnent, shall apply to

such records created or obtained by the corporation only unti

an investigation ceases to be active. For the purposes of this

subsection, an investigation is considered active so |long as

the corporation or any |l aw enforcenent or adm nistrative

agency is proceeding with reasonabl e di spatch and has a

reasonabl e, good-faith belief that it may lead to the filing

of adm nistrative, civil, or crimnal proceedings. An

i nvestigation ceases to be active when the case is disnissed

prior to a finding of probable cause and the board has not

exercised its option to pursue the case or 10 days after the

board nakes a deternination regardi ng probabl e cause. A

information, records, and transcriptions regarding a conplaint

that has been determined to be legally sufficient to state a

claimwithin the jurisdiction of the board becone available to

the public when the investigation ceases to be active, except

information that is otherwi se confidential or exenpt froms.

119.07(1). However, in response to an inquiry about the

licensure status of an individual, the corporation shal

di scl ose the exi stence of an active investigation if the

nature of the violation under investigation involves the

potential for substantial physical or financial harm The

departnent and the board shall have access to all records of

the corporation, as necessary, to exercise their authority to

approve and supervise the contract.

(16) If any provision of this section is held to be

unconstitutional or is held to violate the state or federa

antitrust laws, the follow ng shall occur

(a) The corporation shall cease and desist from
14

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

exerci sing any powers and duties enunerated in this section.

(b) The departnent shall resune the perfornmance of

such activities. The departnent shall regain and receive,

hol d, invest, and adm nister property and nmake expenditures
for the benefit of the board.

(c) The Executive Ofice of the Governor
not wi t hst andi ng chapter 216, is authorized to reestablish

positions, budget authority, and salary rate necessary to

carry out the departnent's responsibilities related to the

boar d.
(17) This section is repealed on Cctober 1, 2005, and
shal|l be reviewed by the Legislature prior to that date for

t he purpose of deternmining its continued existence.
Section 9. Subsection (8) is added to section 468. 382,
Fl orida Statutes, to read
468.382 Definitions.--As used in this act, the term
(8) "Absolute auction" nmeans an auction that requires

no mnimumopening bid that limts the sale other than to the
hi ghest bi dder.

Section 10. Subsections (4), (6), and (7) of section
468. 385, Florida Statutes, are anended to read:

468. 385 Licenses required; qualifications;

exam nation; bond. --
(4) Any person seeking a license as an aucti oneer mnust

shat pass a witten examni nation approved by the board

preparetd—and—atmnistered—by—the—depart+rent which tests his or

her general know edge of the laws of this state relating to

provisions of the Uniform Cormercial Code that are relevant to
butk—satesrauctions, the | aws of agency brokerage, and the
provi sions of this act.

(6) No person shall be licensed as an aucti oneer
15

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

unl ess he or she:

(a) Has held an apprentice license and has served as
an apprentice for 1 year or nore, or has conpleted a course of
study, consisting of not |less than 80 classroom hours of
instruction, that neets standards adopted by the board;

(b) Has passed the required an exani nati on eontucted

by—the—departrent; and
(c) |s approved by the board.

(7)(a) Any auction that is subject to the provisions

of this part nmust be conducted by an auctioneer who has an

active license or an apprentice who has an active apprentice

auctioneer license and who has received prior witten sponsor

consent.

(b) No business shall auction or offer to auction any
property in this state unless it is licensed as an auction
busi ness by the board or is exenpt fromlicensure under this
act. Each application for licensure shall include the nanes
of the owner and the business, the business mailing address
and | ocation, and any other information which the board nmay
require. The owner of an auction business shall report to the
board within 30 days of any change in this required
i nformati on.

Section 11. Section 468.3855, Florida Statutes, is
created to read
468. 3855 Apprenticeship training requirenents.--

(1) An auctioneer nmay not sponsor nore than three

apprentices at one tine. Any auctioneer who serves as a

sponsor nust have held an active, valid license for 3

consecutive years preceding the date on which that auctioneer

i s namred as sponsor of the apprentice.

(2) Any auctioneer who undertakes the sponsorship of
16

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

an apprentice shall ensure that the apprentice receives

training as required by board rule.

(3) An apprentice nust actively participate in auction

sales as required by board rule, and a record of each auction

for which participation credit is clained nust be made as

required by board rule.

(4) Apprentices are prohibited from conducting any

auction without the prior express witten consent of the

sponsor. The apprentice's sponsor nust be present at the

auction site at any tine the apprentice is actively

participating in the conduct of the auction. If the

apprentice's sponsor cannot attend a particul ar auction, the

sponsor nmay appoint a qualified auctioneer who neets the

requi renments of board rule to attend the auction in his or her

place. Prior witten consent nust be given by the apprentice's

sponsor for each substitution

(5) Each apprentice and sponsor shall file reports as

required by board rul e.

(6) A sponsor nmmy not authorize an apprentice to

conduct an auction or act as principal auctioneer unless the

sponsor has determ ned that the apprentice has received

adequate training to do so.

(7) The sponsor shall be responsible for any acts or

om ssions of the apprentice which constitute a violation of

law in relation to the conduct of an auction

(8) Al apprentice applications shall be valid for a

period of 6 nonths after board approval. Any applicant who

fails to conplete the licensure process within that tine shal

be required to nake application as a new applicant.

(9) Any licensed apprentice who wi shes to change the

sponsor under whom he or she is licensed nust submit a new
17

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

application and application fee. However, a new |license fee

shall not be required and credit shall be awarded for training

received or any period of apprenticeship served under the

previ ous sponsor.

(10) Credit for training received or any period of

apprenticeship served shall not be allowed unless it occurred

under the supervision of the sponsor under whose supervision

the apprentice is |licensed.

Section 12. Section 468.388, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

468. 388 Conduct of an auction.--

(1) Prior to conducting an auction in this state, an

auctioneer or auction business shall execute a witten
agreenent with the owner, or the agent of the owner, of any
property to be offered for sale, stating:

(a) The nane and address of the owner of the property;

(b) The nane and address of the person enploying the
aucti oneer or auction business, if different fromthe owner
and

(c) The terns or conditions upon which the auctioneer
or auction business will receive the property for sale and
remt the sales proceeds to the owner

(2) The auctioneer or auction business shall give the
owner one copy of the agreenent and shall keep one copy for 2
years after the date of the auction

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(3) 4 Each auctioneer or auction business shal

mai ntain a record book of all sal es for—whiech—a—witten
agreerent—s—reqgui+ed. The record book shall be open to

i nspection by the board at reasonabl e tines.
(4) Each auction nmust be conducted by an aucti oneer

who has an active license or by an apprentice who has an

active apprentice auctioneer |license and who has received

prior witten sponsor consent. Each auction nust be conducted

under the auspices of a licensed auction busi ness. Any

aucti oneer or apprentice auctioneer conducting an auction, and

any auction busi ness under whose auspi ces such auction is

hel d, shall be responsible for deternining that any

aucti oneer, apprentice, or auction business with whomthey are

associ ated in conducting such auction has an active Florida

aucti oneer, apprentice, or auction business |license.

(5) The principal auctioneer shall prom nently display

at the auction site the licenses of the principal auctioneer,

t he auction business, and any other |icensed aucti oneers or

apprentices who are actively participating in the auction. If

such a display is not practicable, then an oral announcenent

at the beginning of the auction or a promnent witten

announcenent that these |icenses are available for inspection
at the auction site nust be nade. Each—atetioneer—or—auction

ile original & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 00
rr 0004 07:26 am 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

i bt I L .

(6) |If a buyer premiumor any surcharge is a condition

to sale at any auction, the anount of the prem um or surcharge

nmust be announced at the begi nning of the auction and a

witten notice of this information nust be conspi cuously

di spl ayed or distributed to the public at the auction site.

(7) At the beginning of an auction nust be announced

the terns of bidding and sale and whether the sale is with

reserve, without reserve, or absolute or if a mnimumbid is

required. If the sale is absolute and has been announced or

advertised as such, an article or lot may not be wi thdrawn

fromsal e once a bid has been accepted. If no bid is received

within a reasonable tine, the itemor |ot nay be w thdrawn.

(8) |If an auction has been advertised as absolute, no

bid shall be accepted fromthe owner of the property or from

soneone acting on behalf of the owner unless the right to hid

is specifically permtted by | aw

(9) The auction business under which the auction is

conducted is responsible for all other aspects of the auction

as required by board rule. The auction busi ness may del egate

in whole, or in part, different aspects of the auction only to

the extent that such delegation is pernitted by |aw and that

such del egation will not inpede the principal auctioneer's

ability to ensure the proper conduct of his or her independent

responsibility for the auction. The auction busi ness under

whose auspices the auction is conducted is responsible for

ensuring conpliance as required by board rule.

(10)(a) When settlenent is not made i medi ately after

an auction, all sale proceeds received for another person nust

be deposited in an escrow or trust account in an insured bank

or savings and | oan association located in this state within 2
20

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

wor ki ng days after the auction. A maxi mum of $100 nmay be kept

in the escrow account for admnistrative purposes.

(b) Each auction business shall maintain, for not |ess

than 2 years, a separate | edger showi ng the funds held for

anot her person deposited and di sbursed by the auction business

for each auction. The escrow or trust account nust be

reconciled nonthly with the bank statenent. A signed and dated

record shall be maintained for a 2-year period and be

avail able for inspection by the departnment or at the request
of the board.
(c) Any interest which accrues to sal e proceeds on

deposit shall be the property of the seller for whomthe funds

were received unless the parties have agreed ot herw se by

written agreenent executed prior to the auction.

(d) Unless otherwi se provided by witten agreenent

executed prior to the auction, funds received by a |licensee

fromthe seller or his or her agent for expenses, including

advertising, nmust be expended for the purposes advanced or

refunded to the seller at the tine of final settlenent. Any

funds so received shall be mamintained in an escrow or trust

account in an insured bank or savings and | oan associ ati on

located in this state. However, this does not prohibit

advanced paynent of a flat fee.

(11)(a){6)r Al advertising by an auctioneer or auction
busi ness shall include the name and Florida |icense nunber of
such auctioneer and auction business. The term "adverti sing"
shall not include articles of clothing, directional signs, or
ot her pronotional novelty itens.

(b) No licensed auctioneer, apprentice, or auction

busi ness may di ssem nate or cause to be di ssem nated any

adverti senent or advertising which is fal se, deceptive,
21

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

m sl eadi ng, or untruthful. Any advertisenent or advertising

shal|l be deened to be fal se, deceptive, msleading, or
untruthful if it:

1. Contains nisrepresentations of facts.

2. |s msleading or deceptive because, in its content

or in the context in which it is presented, it nakes only a

partial disclosure of relevant facts.

3. Creates false or unjustified expectations of the

services to be perforned.

4, Contains any representation or claimwhich the

advertising licensee fails to perform

5. Fails to include the nane and |icense nunber of the

princi pal auctioneer and the auction busi ness.

0. Fails to include the nane and |icense nunber of the

sponsor if an apprentice is acting as the principa

auct i oneer.
7. Advertises an auction as absolute w thout

specifying any and all itens to be sold with reserve or with

m ni mum bi ds.

8. Fails to include the percentage anount of any

buyer's premi um or surcharge which is a condition to sale.

(c) The provisions of this subsection apply to nedia

exposure of any nature, regardl ess of whether it is in the

formof paid advertising.

(d) The auction business shall be responsible for the

content of all advertising disseminated in preparation for an

aucti on.
Section 13. Paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section
468. 389, Florida Statutes, is anended to read:
468.389 Prohibited acts; penalties.--
(1) The followi ng acts shall be grounds for the
22
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DMWNER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

disciplinary activities provided in subsections (2) and (3):

(c) Failure to account for or to pay or return, within
a reasonable tinme not to exceed 30 days, nobney or property
bel ongi ng to anot her which has cone into the control of an
aucti oneer or auction business through an auction.

Section 14. For the purpose of incorporating the
amendnent to section 468.389, Florida Statutes, in references
t hereto, subsection (3) of section 468.385 and section
468. 391, Florida Statutes, are reenacted to read:

468. 385 Licenses required; qualifications;
exam nati on; bond. --

(3) No person shall be licensed as an auctioneer or
apprentice if he or she:

(a) Is under 18 years of age; or

(b) Has committed any act or offense in this state or
any other jurisdiction which would constitute a basis for
di sciplinary action under s. 468.389.

468.391 Penalty.--Any auctioneer, apprentice, or
auction business or any owner or manager thereof, or, in the
case of corporate ownership, any substantial stockhol der of
the corporation owning the auction busi ness, who operates
wi thout an active license or violates any provision of the
prohibited acts listed under s. 468.389 commits a felony of
the third degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082 or s.
775.083.

Section 15. Subsection (2) of section 468.392, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

468.392 Auctioneer Recovery Fund.--There is created
t he Auctioneer Recovery Fund as a separate account in the
Prof essi onal Regul ation Trust Fund. The fund shall be
admi ni stered by the Florida Board of Auctioneers.

23
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O WDN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(2) Al paynents and di sbursenents fromthe Auctioneer
Recovery Fund shall be nade by the Treasurer upon a voucher
signed by the Secretary of Business and Professiona
Regul ati on or the secretary's designee. Amounts transferred to

t he Auctioneer Recovery Fund shall not be subject to any
limtation inposed by an appropriation act of the Legislature.

Section 16. Section 468.395, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

468.395 Conditions of recovery; eligibility.--

(1) Recovery fromthe Auctioneer Recovery Fund nay be

obt ai ned as foll ows:

(a) Any aggrieved person is eligible to receive

recovery fromthe Auctioneer Recovery Fund if the Florida

Board of Auctioneers has issued a final order directing an

offending licensee to pay restitution to the clainant as the

result of the licensee violating, within this state, any

provision of s. 468.389 or any rul e adopted by the board and

if the board determ ned that the order of restituti on cannot

be enforced; or

(b) - Any aggri eved person who obtains a fina
judgnent in any court against any licensee to recover danages
for any actual loss that results fromthe violation, within

this state, by faiture—tormeet—the—-obHgatiens—oef a |icensee
of any provision of s. 468.389 or any rul e wngder—this—part—and
the—+utes adopted by the board——mr%h—ef—mr%heu%—%fﬁdfﬁgs—by
aggrevet—personr nay, upon termnation of all proceedings,

i ncl udi ng appeal s and proceedi ngs suppl enental to judgnent for

coll ection purposes, file a verified application to the board

—the—eourt—in—which—thejudgrent—was—entered for an order

di recti ng paynment out of the Auctioneer Recovery Fund of the
24

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O M WDN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

anount of actual and—di+reet |oss in the transaction that
remai ns unpai d upon the judgrment. Netw-thstanding—subsection

f++ee-The anpunt of actual and—ei+eet | 0oss may i nclude court
costs, but shall not include attorney's fees or punitive
danmages awar ded

(2) The anmount paid fromthe Auctioneer Recovery Fund
may not exceed $50, 000 per cl ai mjudgrent or cl ai ns judgrents
arising out of the same transaction or auction or andg an
aggregate lifetine Iimt of $100,000 with respect to any one
| icensee. For purposes of this subsection, auctions conducted

under a single contract, agreement, or consignnent shall be

considered a single transaction or auction even though

conducted at nore than one tine or place.

(3) Aclaimfor recovery fromthe Auctioneer Recovery
Fund shall be made within 2 years fromthe tinme of the act
giving rise to the claimor within 2 years fromthe tine the
act is discovered or should have been discovered with the
exerci se of due diligence; however, in no event may a claim
for recovery be nade nore than 4 years after the date of the
act giving rise to the claim
(4) The board eeturt shall not issue an order for
payrment of a claimfromthe Auctioneer Recovery Fund unl ess
25
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

t he clai mant has reasonably established to e+ the board eeurt
that she or he has taken proper and reasonable action to

collect the anpbunt of her or his claimfromthe |icensee
H-ecensed—auctioneer responsible for the loss and that any
recovery nmade has been applied to reduce the anpunt of the
cl ai mon the Auctioneer Recovery Fund.

(5) Notwithstanding any other provision of this part,
no claimbased on any act or om ssion that occurred outside
this state or that occurred before October 1, 1991, shall be
payabl e submttedfor—payrent—to—or——payrent fromthe
Aucti oneer Recovery Fund aatH—after—Cetober—1,—1995

(6) In case of paynent of loss fromthe Auctioneer

Recovery Fund, the fund shall be subrogated, to the extent of

t he anobunt of the paynent, to all the rights of the clai mant

agai nst any licensee with respect to the | oss.
Section 17. Section 468.397, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

468.397 Paynent of claim--Upon a final order of the
court directing that paynent be made out of the Auctioneer
Recovery Fund, the board shall, subject to the provisions of
this part, make the paynent out of t+e the Auctioneer Recovery
Fund as provided in s. 468. 395.

Section 18. Section 468.433, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

468.433 Licensure by exam nation. --

(1) A person desiring to be licensed as a community
associ ati on manager shall apply to the departnent to take the
i censure exami nation. Each applicant nust file a conplete
set of fingerprints that have been taken by an authorized | aw
enforcenent officer, which set of fingerprints shall be
submtted to the Departnent of Law Enforcenent for state

26
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DMWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

processing and to the Federal Bureau of I|nvestigation for
federal processing. The cost of processing shall be borne by
the applicant.

(2) The department shall exanmine each applicant who is
at | east 18 years of age, who has successfully conpl eted al

prelicensure education requirenents,and who the departnent

certifies is of good noral character

(a) Good noral character neans a personal history of
honesty, fairness, and respect for the rights of others and
for the laws of this state and nation.

(b) The departnent may refuse to certify an applicant
only if:

1. There is a substantial connection between the |ack
of good noral character of the applicant and the professiona
responsibilities of a community association nmanager; and

2. The finding by the departnent of |ack of good nora
character is supported by clear and convinci ng evi dence.

(c) \When an applicant is found to be unqualified for a
| i cense because of a lack of good noral character, the
departnent shall furnish the applicant a statement containing
its findings, a conplete record of the evidence upon which the
determ nati on was based, and a notice of the rights of the
applicant to a rehearing and appeal

(d) The council shall establish by rule the required

anount of prelicensure education, which shall consist of not

nore than 24 hours of in-person instruction by a

depart nent - approved provi der and which shall cover all areas

of the exanmination specified in subsection (3). Such

i nstruction shall be conpleted within 12 nonths prior to the

date of the exami nation. Prelicensure education providers

shal | be considered continui ng educati on providers for
27

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

pur poses of establishing provider approval fees. A licensee

shall not be required to conply with the continui ng education

requi renents of s. 468.4337 prior to the first license

renewal . The departnent shall, by rule, set standards for

exceptions to the requirenent of in-person instruction in

cases of hardship or disability.

(3) 2y The council shall approve an exam nation for
licensure. The exam nation nust denonstrate that the
appl i cant has a fundanental know edge of state and federa
laws relating to the operation of all types of commnity
associations and state laws relating to corporations and
nonprofit corporations, proper preparation of community
associ ati on budgets, proper procedures for noticing and
conducting comunity associati on neetings, insurance matters
relating to comunity associations, and managenent skills.

(4) 3y The departnent shall issue a license to
practice in this state as a comunity associati on nanager to
any applicant who successfully conpletes the exam nation in
accordance with this section and pays the appropriate fee.

Section 19. Paragraph (h) of subsection (3) of section
468. 525, Florida Statutes, is repeal ed.

Section 20. Subsection (2) of section 468.526, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

468.526 License required; fees.--
(2) Two or nore, but not nore than five, enployee
| easi ng conpani es that are corporations—which—are nmpjority
owned by the sanme ultinate parent, entity, or persons nmay be
Iicensed as an enpl oyee | easi ng conpany group. An enpl oyee
| easi ng conpany group may satisfy the reporting and financi al
requirenents of this licensing |aw on a consoli dated basis.
As a condition of licensure as an enpl oyee | easi ng conpany
28
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

group, each conpany that is a nenber of the group shal
guar antee payrment of all financial obligations of each other
menber .

Section 21. Section 468.531, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

468.531 Prohibitions; penalties.--

(1) No person or entity shall

(a) Practice or offer to practice as an enpl oyee

| easi ng conpany, an enpl oyee | easing conpany group, or a
controlling person unless such person or entity is |icensed
pursuant to this part;

(b) Practice or offer to practice as an enpl oyee

| easi ng conpany or enpl oyee | easi ng conpany group unl ess al
controlling persons thereof are licensed pursuant to this
part;

(c) Use the nane or title "licensed enpl oyee | easing
conpany,

conmpany group,
enpl oyer organi zation, "er "controlling person,"” or words that

enpl oyee | easi ng conpany, ""enpl oyee | easi ng

pr of essi onal enpl oyer," "professiona

woul d tend to | ead one to believe that such person or entity

is registered pursuant to this part,when such person or

entity has not registered pursuant to this part;

(d) Present as his or her own or his or her entity's
own the |icense of another;

(e) Knowingly give false or forged evidence to the
board or a nenber thereof; or

(f) Use or attenpt to use a license that has been
suspended or revoked.

(2) Any person or entity that violates any provision
of this section conmits a m sdeneanor of the first degree,
puni shabl e as provided in s. 775.082 or s. 775.083.

29
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Section 22. Subsection (3) of section 470.005, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

470.005 Rul emaki ng authority of board and
departnent. - -

(3) The board shall adopt rules which establish
requi rements for inspection of direct disposal establishnents,
funeral establishnents, and cinerator facilities and the
records directly relating to the regul ated activities of the

licensee to ensure conpliance with the provisions of this

chapter and rul es adopted hereunder. Such rul es shal

include, but not be limted to, requirenents to inspect for
conpliance with federal and state laws relating to the
receiving, handling, storage, and di sposal of biohazardous and
hazar dous wast e.

Section 23. Section 470.015, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

470. 015 Renewal of funeral director and enbal ner
l'icenses. --

(1) The departnent shall renew a funeral director or
enbal ner |icense upon recei pt of the renewal application and
fee set by the board not to exceed $250. The board nmay
prescribe by rule continuing education requirenents of up to
12 classroom hours and may by rule establish criteria for

accepting alternative noncl assroom conti nui ng educati on on an

hour-for-hour basis, in addition to a board-approved course on

conmuni cabl e di seases that includes the course on human
i mrunodeficiency virus and acquired inmune deficiency syndrone
required by s. 455.2226, for the renewal of a funeral director
or enbal mer license. The board may provide for the waiver of
continuing education requirenents in circunstances that would
justify the waiver, such as hardship, disability, or illness.
30
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

The continuing education requirenent is not required after
July 1, 1996, for a licensee who is over the age of 75 years
if the licensee does not qualify as the sole person in charge
of an establishnment or facility.

(2) The departnent shall adopt rules establishing a
procedure for the biennial renewal of |icenses.

(3) The board shall adopt rules to establish

requi renents for the advertising of continuing education

cour ses.

Section 24. Subsection (1) of section 470.016, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

470.016 |Inactive status.--

(1) A funeral director or enbal ner license that has
becone inactive may be reactivated under s. 470.015 upon
application to the departnent. The board shall prescribe by
rul e continuing education requirenents as a condition of
reactivating a license. The continuing education requirenents
for reactivating a license may not exceed 12 classroom hours
and may by rule establish criteria for accepting alternative

noncl assroom conti nui ng educati on on an hour-for-hour basis,

in addition to a board-approved course on conmuni cabl e
di seases, for each year the |icense was inactive
Section 25. Subsection (2) of section 470.017, Florida
Statutes, is anended, and subsection (5) is added to that
section, to read
470.017 Registration as a direct disposer.--
(2) Any person who desires to be registered as a
di rect disposer shall file an application with the departnent
on a formfurnished by the departnent. The departnent shal
regi ster each applicant who has remitted a registration fee
set by the board departrent, not to exceed $200; has conpleted
31
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

the application formand remtted a nonrefundabl e application
fee set by the board departrrent, not to exceed $50; and neets
the follow ng requirenents:

(a) |Is at least 18 years of age.

(b) Is a high school graduate or equivalent.

(c) Has no conviction or finding of guilt, and has
never entered a plea of nolo contendere, regardl ess of
adj udication, for a crinme which directly relates to the
functions and duties of a direct disposer or the ability to
practice ef direct disposition.

(d) Has received a passing grade in a college credit
course in Florida nortuary |aw.

(e) Has conpleted a board-approved course on
conmuni cabl e di seases.

(f) Has passed an exam nation prepared by the
departnment on the local, state, and federal |aws and rul es
relating to the disposition of dead human bodi es.

(5) After June 30, 2001, a person nay not be

regi stered pursuant to this section. However, any person who

holds a valid registration on June 30, 2001, may continue to

renew such registration pursuant to s. 470.018 if the

registrant renmains current and in good standi ng.
Section 26. Subsection (2) of section 470.018, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

470.018 Renewal of registration of direct disposer.--

(2) The departnent shall adopt rules establishing a
procedure for the biennial renewal of registrations. The
board shall|l prescribe by rule continuing education
requirenments of up to 3 classroomhours and may by rule

establish criteria for accepting alternative noncl assroom

conti nui ng educati on on an hour-for-hour basis, in addition to
32

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

a board-approved course on communi cabl e di seases that includes
t he course on human i mmunodeficiency virus and acquired i nmmune
deficiency syndrone required by s. 455.2226, for the renewal
of a registration.

Section 27. Subsection (10) is added to section
470. 021, Florida Statutes, to read:

470.021 Direct disposal establishnent; standards and
| ocation; registration.--

(10) A direct disposal establishnent may not be

operated at the sane |location as any other direct disposal

establi shnent or funeral establishnent unl ess such

establishments were licensed as col ocated establishnments on
July 1, 2000.

Section 28. Section 470.028, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

470.028 Preneed sal es; registration of agents.--

(1) Al sales of preneed funeral service contracts or
di rect disposition contracts shall be made pursuant to chapter
497.

(2) No person nmay act as an agent for a funerat
th+eetor—f uneral establishnment —direet—dispoesersor direct
di sposal ¢isposer establishnment with respect to the sal e of
preneed contracts unless such person is registered pursuant to
chapter 497.

(3) Each licensee or registrant shall be subject to
discipline if his or her agent violates any provision of this
chapter applicable to such |icensee or registrant as
establ i shed by board rule.

Section 29. Subsection (2) of section 470.0301
Fl orida Statutes, is anended to read:

470.0301 Renoval services; refrigeration facilities;
33

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

centralized enbalmng facilities.--In order to ensure that the
renoval, refrigeration, and enbal ning of all dead human bodi es
is conducted in a manner that properly protects the public's
health and safety, the board shall adopt rules to provide for
the registration of renpoval services, refrigeration
facilities, and centralized enbalming facilities operated

i ndependently of funeral establishnments, direct disposa
establi shnents, and cinerator facilities.

(2) CENTRALI ZED EMBALM NG FACI LI TIES. --1n order to
ensure that all funeral establishnents have access to
enbalmng facilities that conply with all applicable health
and safety requirenents, the board shall adopt rules to
provide for the registration and operation of centralized

enbalmng facilities and shall require, at a mninum the
fol | owi ng:

(a) Al centralized enbalmng facilities shall contain
all of the equipnent and neet all of the requirenents that a
preparation roomlocated in a funeral establishnent is
required to neet, but such facilities shall not be required to
conply with any of the other requirenents for funera
establishnents, as set forth in s. 470.024.

(b) Each licensed centralized enbal nming facility shal
have at |east one full-tinme enbal mer in charge. The full-tine

enbal ner in charge nust have an active |license and may not be

the full-tine enbalner in charge, full-tinme funeral director

in charge, or full-tine direct disposer in charge of any other

establ i shnent |icensed under this chapter

(c) Any person, regardl ess of whether such person is
ot herwi se regulated by this chapter, nmay own such a facility,
provided that such facility is operated in accordance with the
rul es established by the board.

34
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DMWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(d) A centralized enbalmng facility may only provide
services to funeral establishnents.

(e) The practice of enbal ming done at a centralized
enbal mng facility shall only be practiced by an enbal ner
licensed under this chapter and shall be provided only to
i censed funeral establishments.

(f) Application for registration of a centralized
enbal mng facility shall be nmade on forns furnished by the
departnment and shall be acconpani ed by a nonrefundabl e fee not
to exceed $300 as set by board rule, and registration shall be
renewed biennially pursuant to procedures and upon paynent of
a nonrefundabl e fee not to exceed $300 as set by board rule.
The board may al so establish by rule a |late fee not to exceed
$50. Any registration not renewed within 30 days after the
renewal date shall expire without further action by the
depart nent.

(g) The board shall set by rule an annual inspection
fee not to exceed $100, payabl e upon application for
regi stration and upon renewal of such registration

(h) The board shall, by rule, establish operating

procedures which shall require, at a mninum that centralized

enbalmng facilities maintain a systemof identification of

hunman renai ns recei ved for enbal m ng.

Section 30. Subsections (2) and (3) of section
471.003, Florida Statutes, are anended to read:

471.003 Qualifications for practice, exenptions.--

(2) The followi ng persons are not required to register
under the provisions of this chapter ss—471+0601+47103% as a
regi stered engi neer:

(a) Any person practicing engineering for the
i mprovenent of, or otherw se affecting, property legally owned
35
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O WDN P

W WNNNNMNNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

by her or him unless such practice involves a public utility
or the public health, safety, or welfare or the safety or
health of enployees. This paragraph shall not be construed as
aut hori zing the practice of engineering through an agent or
enpl oyee who is not duly registered under the provisions of
this chapter ss—47#1001+-47103%.

(b)1. A person acting as a public officer enpl oyed by

any state, county, nunicipal, or other governnental unit of
this state when working on any project the total estinated
cost of which is $10,000 or |ess.

2. Persons who are enpl oyees of any state, county,
nmuni ci pal, or other governnental unit of this state and who
are the subordinates of a person in responsible charge
regi stered under this chapter ss—471+0661+-471+03% to the
extent that the supervision neets standards adopted by rul e of
t he board.

(c) Regular full-tinme enployees of a corporation not

engaged in the practice of engineering as such, whose practice
of engi neering for such corporation is linted to the design
or fabrication of nmanufactured products and servicing of such
products.

(d) Regular full-tine enployees of a public utility or
other entity subject to regulation by the Florida Public
Servi ce Conmi ssion, Federal Energy Regul atory Conm ssion, or
Federal Conmuni cati ons Commi ssion

(e) Enployees of a firm corporation, or partnership
who are the subordinates of a person in responsible charge,
regi stered under this chapter ss—471+-661+-471-037.

(f) Any person as contractor in the execution of work

desi gned by a professional engineer or in the supervision of
the construction of work as a forenman or superintendent.
36
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(g) A registered surveyor and nmapper who takes, or
contracts for, professional engineering services incidental to
her or his practice of surveying and nappi ng and who del egat es
such engi neering services to a regi stered professiona
engineer qualified within her or his firmor contracts for
such professional engineering services to be perforned by
others who are registered professional engineers under the
provi sions of this chapter ss—471004+471037

(h) Any electrical, plunbing, air-conditioning, or

nechani cal contractor whose practice includes the design and
fabrication of electrical, plunbing, air-conditioning, or
nechani cal systens, respectively, which she or he installs by
virtue of a license issued under chapter 489, under part | of
chapter 553, or under any special act or ordi nance when
wor ki ng on any construction project which:

1. Requires an electrical or plunbing or
air-conditioning and refrigeration systemwi th a val ue of
$50, 000 or |ess; and

2.a. Requires an aggregate service capacity of 600
anperes (240 volts) or less on a residential electrical system
or 800 anperes (240 volts) or less on a comercial or
i ndustrial electrical system

b. Requires a plunbing systemwth fewer than 250
fixture units; or

c. Requires a heating, ventilation, and
air-conditioning systemnot to exceed a 15-ton-per-system
capacity, or if the project is designed to acconmpdate 100 or
f ewer persons.

(i) Any general contractor, certified or registered
pursuant to the provisions of chapter 489, when negotiating or
perforni ng services under a design-build contract as |long as

37
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

t he engi neering services offered or rendered in connection
with the contract are offered and rendered by an engi neer
licensed or registered in accordance with this chapter

(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of this chapter ss+
4710601471037 or of any other law, no registered engi neer
whose principal practice is civil or structural engineering,

or enpl oyee or subordi nate under the responsible supervision
or control of the engineer, is precluded from performn ng
architectural services which are purely incidental to her or
hi s engi neering practice, nor is any registered architect, or
enpl oyee or subordi nate under the responsibl e supervision or
control of the architect, precluded from perform ng
engi neering services which are purely incidental to her or his
architectural practice. However, no engineer shall practice
architecture or use the designation "architect" or any term
derived therefrom and no architect shall practice engi neering
or use the designation "engineer" or any termderived
t herefrom
Section 31. Section 471.0035, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:
471.0035 Instructors in postsecondary educati ona
institutions; exenption fromregistration requirenent. --For
t he sol e purpose of teaching the principles and nethods of
engi neeri ng design, notw thstanding the provisions of s.
471.005(6), a person enployed by a public postsecondary
educational institution, or by an independent postsecondary
educational institution |icensed or exenpt fromlicensure
pursuant to the provisions of chapter 246, is not required to
regi ster under the provisions of this chapter ss+
471001471037 as a regi stered engi neer
Section 32. Section 471.005, Florida Statutes, is
38
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

amended to read:

471.005 Definitions.--As used in this chapter ss+
4710606147103 %, the term

(1) "Board" neans the Board of Professional Engineers.

(2) "Certificate of authorization" neans a license to
practice engineering issued by the departnent to a corporation
or partnership.

(3) "Departnent" neans the Departnent of Business and
Pr of essi onal Regul ati on.

(4) "Engineer" includes the terns "professiona
engi neer" and "registered engi neer" and nmeans a person who is
regi stered to engage in the practice of engineering under this
chapt er ss—471001+-471037

(5) "Engineer intern" neans a person who has graduated
from or is in the final year of, an engineering curricul um
approved by the board and has passed the fundanental s of
engi neeri ng exam nation as provided by rul es adopted by the
boar d.

(6) "Engineering" includes the term "professiona
engi neeri ng" and neans any service or creative wrk, the
adequat e performance of which requires engi neering education
training, and experience in the application of special
know edge of the mathematical, physical, and engi neering
sciences to such services or creative work as consul tation
i nvestigation, evaluation, planning, and design of engineering
wor ks and systens, planning the use of |and and water
teaching of the principles and nethods of engi neering design
engi neeri ng surveys, and the inspection of construction for
t he purpose of determining in general if the work is
proceeding in conpliance with drawi ngs and specifications, any
of which enbraces such services or work, either public or

39
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

private, in connection with any utilities, structures,
bui | di ngs, machi nes, equi pnent, processes, work systens,
projects, and industrial or consuner products or equi pnent of
a nechani cal, electrical, hydraulic, pneumatic, or therm
nature, insofar as they involve safeguarding life, health, or
property; and includes such ot her professional services as nay
be necessary to the planning, progress, and conpl etion of any
engi neering services. A person who practices any branch of
engi neeri ng; who, by verbal claim sign, advertisenent,

| etterhead, or card, or in any other way, represents hinself
or herself to be an engineer or, through the use of sone other
title, inplies that he or she is an engi neer or that he or she
is registered under this chapter ss—471+0601+-47103%, or who
hol ds hinself or herself out as able to perform or does

perform any engi neering service or work or any other service
desi gnated by the practitioner which is recognized as
engi neering shall be construed to practice or offer to
practice engineering within the neaning and intent of this
chapt er ss—471001+-471037

(7) "License" neans the registration of engineers or

certification of businesses to practice engineering in this
state.
(8) "Retired professional engineer" or "professiona

engi neer, retired" neans a person who has been duly |licensed

as a professional engineer by the board and who chooses to

relinquish or not to renew his or her license and applies to

and is approved by the board to be granted the title

" Pr of essi onal Engineer, Retired."

Section 33. Subsection (1) of section 471.011, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:
471. 011 Fees.--
40
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(1) The board by rule may establish fees to be paid
for applications, exam nation, reexam nation, |icensing and
renewal , inactive status application and reactivation of
i nactive licenses, and recordnaki ng and recordkeepi ng. The
board nay al so establish by rule a delinquency fee. The board
shal | establish fees that are adequate to ensure the continued
operation of the board. Fees shall be based on departnent
estimates of the revenue required to inplenment this chapter
SS—471001+-47103% and the provisions of law with respect to
the regul ati on of engineers.

Section 34. Subsection (4) and paragraph (a) of
subsection (5) of section 471.015, Florida Statutes, are
amended to read:

471. 015 Licensure.--

(4) The departnent shall not issue a |license by
endorsenent to any applicant who is under investigation in
anot her state for any act that would constitute a violation of
this chapter ss—4710601+-47103% or of part | of chapter 455
until such tine as the investigation is conplete and

di sci plinary proceedi ngs have been term nated.

(5)(a) The board shall deemthat an applicant who
seeks |licensure by endorsenent has passed an exanination
substantially equivalent to part | of the engineering
exam nati on when such applicant:

1. Has held a valid professional engineer's
registration in another state for 15 years and has had 20
years of continuous professional-Ilevel engineering experience;

2. Has received a doctorate degree in engineering from
an institution that has an undergraduat e a—fatioenaty
aceredited engi neering degree program which is accredited by

the Accreditation Board for Engi neering Technol ogy; or
41

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O b~ DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

3. Has received a doctorate degree in engineering and
has taught engineering full tinme for at least 3 years, at the
baccal aureate | evel or higher, after receiving that degree.

Section 35. Subsections (2) and (3) of section
471. 017, Florida Statutes, are anended to read

471.017 Renewal of license.--

(2) The board departrent shal |l adopt rules
establishing a procedure for the biennial renewal of |icenses.

(3) The board shall require a denobnstration of

conti nui ng professional conpetency of engineers as a condition

of license renewal or relicensure. Every |icensee nust

conpl ete 15 professional devel opnent hours, or the equival ent

t hereof, for each year of the |icense renewal period. The

board shall adopt rules that are consistent with the

gui deli nes of the National Council of Exaniners for

Engi neering and Surveying for nmultijurisdictional |icensees

for the purpose of avoiding proprietary continuing

prof essi onal conpetency requirenents. The board may, by rule,

exenpt from continui ng professional conpetency requirenents

retired professional engineers who no | onger sign and sea

engi neeri ng docunents and |icensees in unique circunstances

that severely linit opportunities to obtain the required

pr of essi onal devel opnent hour s. Cormenrecing—wth—H-censure

renewal—n—2002—each—tH-—ecensee—acti-vely—partieipating—in—the

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 00
07:26 am 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.

Amendnment No. _ (for drafter's use only)

Section 36. Section 471.019, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

471. 019 Reacti vati on;—desighn—of—engineering—works—or
; o I Lo - -
4 The board shall prescribe by rule continuing
education requirenents for reactivating a license. The
conti nuing education requirenents for reactivating a |license
for a registered engi neer may not exceed 12 cl assroom hours
for each year the license was inactive

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Section 37. Section 471.0195, Florida Statutes, is
created to read

471.0195 Florida Building Code training for
engi neers. --Effective January 1, 2000, all |icensees actively

participating in the design of engineering works or systens in

connection with buildings, structures, or facilities and

systens covered by the Florida Building Code shall take

conti nuing education courses and subnmit proof to the board, at

such tines and in such manner as established by the board by

rule, that the licensee has conpleted the core curricul um

courses and any specialized or advanced courses on any portion

of the Florida Building Code applicable to the |icensee's area

of practice or has passed the appropriate equival ency test of
the Buil ding Code Trai ning Program established by s. 553. 841.
The board shall record reported continui ng educati on courses

on a systemeasily accessed by code enforcenent jurisdictions

for eval uation when determning |icense status for purposes of

processi ng desi gn docunents. Local jurisdictions shall be

responsi ble for notifying the board when desi gn docunents are

submtted for building construction pernits by persons who are

not in conpliance with this section. The board shall take

appropriate action as provided by its rules when such

nonconpliance is determned to exist.

Section 38. Subsection (1) of section 471.023, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

471.023 Certification of partnerships and
corporations. --

(1) The practice of, or the offer to practice,
engi neering by registrants through a corporation or
partnership offering engineering services to the public or by
a corporation or partnership offering said services to the
44
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

public through registrants under this chapter ss+—

471001471037 as agents, enpl oyees, officers, or partners is
permitted only if the firm possesses a certification issued by
the departnent pursuant to qualification by the board, subject
to the provisions of this chapter ss—47+0661+471+063% (One or
nore of the principal officers of the corporation or one or

nore partners of the partnership and all personnel of the
corporation or partnership who act in its behalf as engineers
inthis state shall be registered as provided by this chapter
SS—4F1001+-47103% Al final draw ngs, specifications,

pl ans, reports, or docunents involving practices registered
under this chapter ss—471061471037 which are prepared or
approved for the use of the corporation or partnership or for

public record within the state shall be dated and shall bear
the signature and seal of the registrant who prepared or
approved them Nothing in this section shall be construed to
nean that a certificate of registration to practice

engi neering shall be held by a corporation. Nothing herein
prohi bits corporations and partnerships fromjoining together
to offer engineering services to the public, provided each
corporation or partnership otherwi se neets the requirenents of
this section. No corporation or partnership shall be relieved
of responsibility for the conduct or acts of its agents,

enpl oyees, or officers by reason of its conpliance with this
section, nor shall any individual practicing engineering be
relieved of responsibility for professional services perforned
by reason of his or her enploynent or relationship with a
corporation or partnership.

Section 39. Subsection (1) of section 471.025, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:
471.025 Seals.--

45
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(1) The board shall prescribe, by rule, a formof sea
to be used by registrants holding valid certificates of
registration. Each registrant shall obtain an inpression-type
netal seal in the formaforesaid and may, in addition
register his or her seal electronically in accordance with ss.
282.70-282.75. Al final draw ngs, specifications, plans,
reports, or docunents prepared or issued by the registrant and
being filed for public record and all final bid docunents

provided to the owner or the owner's representative shall be

signed by the registrant, dated, and stanped with said seal
Such signature, date, and seal shall be evidence of the
authenticity of that to which they are affixed. Draw ngs,
speci fications, plans, reports, final bid docunents, or

docunents prepared or issued by a registrant nay be
transnitted electronically and may be signed by the
regi strant, dated, and stanped electronically with said sea
in accordance with ss. 282.70-282. 75.

Section 40. Section 471.031, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.031 Prohibitions; penalties.--

(1) A person may not know ngly:

(a) Practice engineering unless the person is
regi stered under this chapter ss—471+-0661+-471-03%;

(b) Use the nane or title "registered engi neer" or any

other title, designation, words, letters, abbreviations, or
device tending to indicate that such person holds an active
regi stration as an engi neer when the person is not registered
under this chapter ss—471004+471037,

(c) Present as his or her own the registration of

anot her;

(d) Gve false or forged evidence to the board or a
46

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

nmenber thereof;

(e) Use or attenpt to use a registration that has been
suspended, revoked, or placed on inactive or delinquent
st at us;

(f) Enploy unlicensed persons to practice engineering;
or

(g) Conceal information relative to violations of this
chapt er ss—471-001+471037

(2) Any person who violates any provision of this
section commits is—gurtty—of a ni sdeneanor of the first
degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082 or s. 775.083.

Section 41. Section 471.037, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

471.037 Effect of chapter ss—471-0661+471037
| ocal ly. --

(1) Nothing contained in this chapter ss—
471001471037 shall be construed to repeal, anend, linmt, or
ot herwi se affect any local building code or zoning | aw or

ordi nance, now or hereafter enacted, which is nore restrictive
with respect to the services of registered engineers than the
provi sions of this chapter ss—471004+471+037

(2) In counties or nunicipalities that issue building

permts, such pernmits may not be issued in any case in which
it is apparent fromthe application for the building pernt
that the provisions of this chapter ss—47#+06681+471+-637 have
been vi ol ated. However, this subsecti on does not authorize the

wi t hhol di ng of building permits in cases involving the

exceptions and exenptions set out in s. 471.003.
Section 42. Subsection (11) of section 474.202,

Fl orida Statutes, is anended to read:

474.202 Definitions.--As used in this chapter

47
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(11) "Veterinarian" neans a health care practitioner

persoft who is licensed to engage in the practice of veterinary
nedicine in Florida under the authority of this chapter
Section 43. Section 474.203, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:
474.203 Exenptions.--This chapter shall not apply to:
(1) Any faculty nenber practicing only in conjunction
with teaching duties at a school or college of veterinary
nedi ci ne—Sueh—school—or—cotHtege—shat-—be | ocated in this
state and be accredited by the Anerican Veterinary Medical
Associ ation Council on Education. However, this exenption

shall only apply to such a faculty nenber who does not hold a

valid license issued under this chapter, but who is a graduate

of a school or college of veterinary nedicine accredited by

the Anerican Veterinary Medical Association Council on

Education or a school or coll ege recogni zed by the Aneri can

Vet eri nary Medi cal Associ ation Comi ssion for Foreign

Veteri nary G aduates. The faculty nenber exenption shal

automatically expire when such school or college terninates
the faculty nmenber from such teaching duties. On Decenber 31
of each year, such school or college shall provide the board
with a witten list of all faculty who are exenpt fromthis
chapter. Such school or college shall also notify the board in
writing of any additions or deletions to such list.

(2) A person practicing as an intern or resident

veterinari an who does not hold a valid |icense i ssued under

this chapter and who is a graduate in training at a school or

coll ege of veterinary nedicine located in this state and

accredited by the Anmerican Veterinary Medical Association

Council on Education or a school or college recogni zed by the

Anerican Veterinary Medical Association Conmission for Foreign
48

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DMWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Veterinary Graduates. Such intern or resident nust be a

graduate of a school or college of veterinary nedicine

accredited by the Anmerican Veterinary Medical Association

Council on Education. This exenption expires when such intern

or resident conpletes or is ternmnated from such training.

Each school or college at which such intern or resident is in

training shall, on July 1 of each year, provide the board with

a witten list of all such interns or residents designhated for

this exenption, and the school or college shall also notify

the board of any additions or deletions to the |ist.

(3)t2) A student in a school or college of veterinary
nedicine while in the performance of duties assigned by her or
his instructor or when working as a preceptor under the
i mredi ate supervision of a |licensee, provided that such
preceptorship is required for graduation froman accredited
school or college of veterinary nedicine. The |icensed
veterinarian shall be responsible for all acts perforned by a
preceptor under her or his supervision

(4) 3y Any doctor of veterinary nedicine in the enploy
of a state agency or the United States Governnent while
actually engaged in the performance of her or his official
duties; however, this exenption shall not apply to such person
when the person is not engaged in carrying out her or his
official duties or is not working at the installations for
whi ch her or his services were engaged.

(5) 4y Any person, or the person's regul ar enpl oyee,
admnistering to the ills or injuries of her or his own
animals, including, but not limted to, castration, spaying,
and dehorning of herd aninmals, unless title has been
transferred or enpl oynent provided for the purpose of
circunventing this law. This exenption shall not apply to

49
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DM WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

out-of -state veterinarians practicing tenporarily in the
state. However, only a veterinarian may inmunize or treat an
ani mal for di seases which are comunicabl e to humans and which
are of public health significance.

(6) 5y State agencies, accredited school s,
institutions, foundations, business corporations or
associ ati ons, physicians licensed to practice nedicine and
surgery in all its branches, graduate doctors of veterinary
nedi ci ne, or persons under the direct supervision thereof,
whi ch or who conduct experinents and scientific research on
animals in the devel opnent of pharnmaceuticals, biologicals,
seruns, or nethods of treatnent, or techniques for the
di agnosi s or treatnent of human ail nents, or when engaged in
t he study and devel opnent of nethods and techni ques directly
or indirectly applicable to the problenms of the practice of
veterinary nedicine

(7)t6) Any veterinary aide, nurse, |aboratory
technician, preceptor, or other enployee of a licensed
veterinarian who admini sters nedication or who renders
auxiliary or supporting assistance under the responsible
supervision of a sueh |icensed veterinarian practitioener,

i ncluding those tasks identified by rule of the board

requiring i medi ate supervision. However, the |licensed
veterinarian shall be responsible for all such acts perforned
under this subsection by persons under her or his supervision

(8) A veterinarian, licensed by and actively

practicing veterinary nedicine in another state, who is board

certified in a specialty recogni zed by the board and who

responds to a request of a veterinarian licensed in this state

to assist with the treatnent on a specific case of a specific

animal or with the treatnent on a specific case of the aninals
50

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

of a single owner, as long as the veterinarian |licensed in

this state requests the other veterinarian's presence. A

veterinari an who practices under this subsection is not

eligible to apply for a prenises permt under s. 474.215.

For the purposes of chapters 465 and 893, persons exenpt

pursuant to subsection (1), subsection (2), or subsection (4)

are deened to be duly licensed practitioners authorized by the

laws of this state to prescribe drugs or nedicinal supplies.
Section 44. Subsection (3) of section 474.211, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

474.211 Renewal of license.--

(3) The board may by rule prescribe continuing
education, not to exceed 30 hours biennially, as a condition
for renewal of a license or certificate. The criteria for such
prograns, providers, and e+ courses shall be approved by the

boar d.

Section 45. Paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of section
474.214, Florida Statutes, is anended to read:

474.214 Disciplinary proceedings. --

(2) When the board finds any applicant or veterinarian
guilty of any of the grounds set forth in subsection (1),
regardl ess of whether the violation occurred prior to
licensure, it may enter an order inposing one or nore of the
foll owi ng penalti es:

(c) Inposition of an administrative fine not to exceed

$5, 000540666 for each count or separate offense.

In determ ning appropriate action, the board nust first
consi der those sanctions necessary to protect the public.
Only after those sanctions have been inposed may the
51
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UuDWNER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

disciplining authority consider and include in its order
requi rements designed to rehabilitate the veterinarian. Al
costs associated with conpliance with any order issued under
this subsection are the obligation of the veterinarian

Section 46. For the purpose of incorporating the
amendnent to section 474.214, Florida Statutes, in references
t hereto, subsection (2) of section 474.207, Florida Statutes,
is reenacted to read:

474. 207 Licensure by exam nation. --

(2) The departnent shall |icense each applicant who
the board certifies has:

(a) Conpleted the application formand renmtted an
exam nation fee set by the board

(b)1. Gaduated froma college of veterinary nedicine
accredited by the American Veterinary Medical Association
Counci| on Education; or

2. Gaduated froma college of veterinary nedicine
listed in the Anerican Veterinary Medical Association Roster
of Veterinary Colleges of the Wrld and obtained a certificate
fromthe Education Comm ssion for Foreign Veterinary
Graduat es.

(c) Successfully conpleted the exam nation provi ded by
the departnent for this purpose, or an exam nation deternmn ned
by the board to be equival ent.

(d) Denonstrated know edge of the |aws and rul es
governing the practice of veterinary nedicine in Florida in a
manner designated by rul es of the board.

The departnent shall not issue a license to any applicant who
is under investigation in any state or territory of the United
States or in the District of Colunbia for an act which would
52
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

constitute a violation of this chapter until the investigation
is conplete and disciplinary proceedi ngs have been terninated,
at which tinme the provisions of s. 474.214 shall apply.

Section 47. For the purpose of incorporating the
amendnent to section 474.214, Florida Statutes, in references
thereto, subsection (2) of section 474.217, Florida Statutes,
is reenacted to read:

474. 217 Licensure by endorsenent. --

(2) The departnent shall not issue a |license by
endorsenent to any applicant who is under investigation in any
state, territory, or the District of Colunbia for an act which
woul d constitute a violation of this chapter until the
investigation is conplete and disciplinary proceedi ngs have
been terninated, at which tinme the provisions of s. 474.214
shal | apply.

Section 48. Subsection (7) of section 474.215, Florida
Statutes, is anended, and subsections (8) and (9) are added to
t hat section, to read

474.215 Prenises permts.--

(7) The board by rule shall establish m ninmm
standards for the operation of linmted service veterinary
nmedi cal practices. Such rules shall not restrict limted
service veterinary nedical practices and shall be consistent
with the type of linited veterinary nedical service provided.

(a) Any person that offers or provides linmted service
veterinary nedical practice shall obtain a biennial permt
fromthe board the cost of which shall not exceed $250. The
limted service pernittee shall register each | ocation where a

limted service clinic is held and shall pay a fee set by rule

not to exceed $25 to register each such | ocation

(b) Al permits issued under this subsection are
53

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

subj ect to the provisions of ss. 474.213 and 474. 214.
(c) Notwithstandi ng any provision of this subsection

to the contrary, any tenporary rabies vaccination effort

operated by a county health departnent in response to a public
health threat, as declared by the State Health Oficer in
consultation with the State Veterinarian, is not subject to

any preregistration, tine limtation, or fee requirenents, but

nmust adhere to all other requirenents for linted service

veterinary nedical practice as prescribed by rule. The fee

charged to the public for a rabies vaccination adninistered

during such tenporary rabies vaccination effort may not exceed

the actual cost of adm nistering the rabies vaccine. Such

rabi es vaccination efforts nay not be used for any purpose

other than to address the public health consequences of the

rabi es outbreak. The board shall be inmmediately notified in

writing of any tenporary rabies vaccination effort operated

under this paragraph

(8) Any person who is not a veterinarian |licensed

under this chapter but who desires to own and operate a

veterinary nedical establishnent or linmted service clinic

shall apply to the board for a premises pernit. |f the board

certifies that the applicant conplies with the applicable | aws

and rul es of the board, the departnent shall issue a prenises

permit. No permit shall be issued unless a licensed

veterinarian is designated to undertake the professiona

supervi sion of the veterinary nedical practice and the m ni mum

standards set by rule of the board for prem ses where

veterinary nedicine is practiced. Upon application, the

departnent shall subnit the pernittee's name for a statew de

crimnal records correspondence check through the Departnent

of Law Enforcenent. The pernittee shall notify the board
54

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

within 10 days after any designation of a new |icensed

veterinarian responsible for such duties. A pernittee under

this subsection is subject to the provisions of subsection (9)
and s. 474.214.
(9)(a) The departnent or the board nmay deny, revoke,

or suspend the pernit of any permittee under this section and

may fine, place on probation, or otherw se discipline any such

permttee who has:

1. Obtained a permit by msrepresentation or fraud or

t hrough an error of the departnent or board;

2. Attenpted to procure, or has procured, a pernit for

any ot her person by naking, or causing to be nade, any fal se

representation;

3. Violated any of the requirenents of this chapter or

any rule of the board; or

4. Been convicted or found guilty of, or entered a

pl ea of nolo contendere to, regardless of adjudication, a

felony in any court of this state, of any other state, or of
the United States.
(b) If the pernit is revoked or suspended, the owner

nmanager, or proprietor shall cease to operate the prem ses as

a veterinary nmedical practice as of the effective date of the

suspensi on or revocation. In the event of such revocation or

suspensi on, the owner, nmnager, or proprietor shall renove

fromthe prenises all signs and synbols identifying the

prem ses as a veterinary nedical practice. The period of any

such suspensi on shall be prescribed by rule of the board, but

may not exceed 1 year. If the pernit is revoked, the person

owni ng or operating the establishnment may not apply for a

permt to operate a prenises for a period of 1 year after the

effective date of such revocation. Upon the effective date of
55

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

such revocation, the permttee nust advise the board of the

di sposition of all nedicinal drugs and nust provide for

ensuring the security, confidentiality, and availability to

clients of all patient nedical records.
Section 49. Section 474.2165, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

474.2165 Ownership and control of veterinary nedica

patient records; report or copies of records to be

f urni shed. - -
(1) As used in this section, the term"records owner"

neans any veterinarian who generates a nedical record after

nmaki ng a physical exanmi nation of, or adm nistering treatnent

or dispensing |l egend drugs to, any patient; any veterinarian

to whomrecords are transferred by a previous records owner;

or any veterinarian's enployer, provided the enpl oynent

contract or agreenent between the enpl oyer and the

veterinari an designates the enpl oyer as the records owner

(2) Each person who provides veterinary medica
services shall maintain nedical records, as established by
rul e.

(3) Any records owner licensed under this chapter who

nakes an exanination of, or admnisters treatnent or dispenses

| egend drugs to, any patient shall, upon request of the client

or the client's legal representative, furnish, in atinely

manner, wi thout delays for legal review, copies of all reports

and records relating to such exam nation or treatnent,

i ncluding X rays. The furnishing of such report or copies

shal |l not be conditioned upon paynent of a fee for services

r ender ed.
(4) Except as otherwi se provided in this section, such

records nay not be furnished to, and the nedical condition of
56

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

a patient may not be discussed with, any person other than the

client or the client's legal representative or other

veterinarians involved in the care or treatnent of the

patient, except upon witten authorization of the client.

However, such records may be furni shed without witten

aut hori zati on under the follow ng circunstances:

(a) To any person, firm or corporation that has

procured or furnished such examination or treatnent with the

client's consent.

(b) In any civil or crimnal action, unless otherw se

prohi bited by | aw, upon the issuance of a subpoena froma

court of conpetent jurisdiction and proper notice to the

client or the client's legal representative by the party

seeki ng such records.

(c) For statistical and scientific research, provided

the information is abstracted in such a way as to protect the

identity of the patient and the client, or provided witten

permssion is received fromthe client or the client's |ega

representative

(5) Except in a nedical negligence action or

admi ni strative proceedi ng when a veterinarian is or reasonably

expects to be naned as a defendant, infornation disclosed to a

veterinarian by a client in the course of the care and

treatnent of the patient is confidential and nmay be discl osed

only to other veterinarians involved in the care or treatnent

of the patient, or if pernmitted by witten authorization from

the client or conpell ed by subpoena at a deposition

evidentiary hearing, or trial for which proper notice has been

gi ven.
(6) The departnent may obtain patient records pursuant

to a subpoena without witten authorization fromthe client if
57

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

t he departnent and the probabl e cause panel of the board find

reasonabl e cause to believe that a veterinarian has

excessively or inappropriately prescribed any controll ed

substance specified in chapter 893 in violation of this

chapter or that a veterinarian has practiced his or her

prof ession below that |evel of care, skill, and treatnent

required as defined by this chapter
(7) Notwithstanding the provisions of s. 455,242,
records owners shall place an advertisenent in the |oca

newspaper or notify clients, in witing, when they are

ternminating practice, retiring, or relocating and are no

| onger available to patients and shall offer clients the

opportunity to obtain a copy of their nedical records.
(8) Notwithstanding the provisions of s. 455,242,
records owners shall notify the board office when they are

ternminating practice, retiring, or relocating and are no

| onger available to patients, specifying who the new records

owner is and where the nedical records can be found.

(9) \Whenever a records owner has turned records over

to a new records owner, the new records owner shall be

responsi ble for providing a copy of the conplete nedica

record, upon witten request, of the client or the client's

| egal representative.

(10) Veterinarians in violation of the provisions of

this section shall be disciplined by the board.

(11) A records owner furnishing copies of reports or

records pursuant to this section shall charge no nore than the

actual cost of copying, including reasonable staff tine, or

the anobunt specified in adninistrative rule by the board.

(12) Nothing in this section shall be construed to

limt veterinarian consultations, as necessary.
58

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Section 50. Notwi thstanding the transfer of the

Di vision of Medical Quality Assurance to the Departnent of

Health or any other provision of lawto the contrary,

veterinarians |licensed under chapter 474, Florida Statutes,

shal | be governed by the treatnent of inpaired practitioner

provi sions of section 455.707, Florida Statutes, as if they

were under the jurisdiction of the Division of Medical Quality

Assurance, except that for veterinarians the Departnent of

Busi ness and Professional Regulation shall, at its option,

exerci se any of the powers granted to the Departnent of Health

by that section, and "board" shall nean board as defined in
chapter 474, Florida Statutes.

Section 51. Section 475.045, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

475.045 Florida Real Estate Commi ssion Education and
Resear ch Foundat i oni—Feundation—Advi-sory—Commi-ttee. - -

(1)(a) There is established a Florida Real Estate
Conmi ssi on Educati on and Research Foundati on, hereinafter

referred to as the "foundation," which shall be adm nistered
by the commi ssi on Feundati-on—Advisery—Comri-ttee

(b) The purposes, objectives, and duties of the
foundation are as foll ows:

1. To create and pronote educational projects to
expand the know edge of the public and real estate |icensees
in matters pertaining to Florida real estate.

2. To augnent the existing real estate prograns by
i ncreasi ng the nunber of teaching personnel and real estate
courses in the state in degree-granting prograns in
universities and colleges in this state.

3. To conduct studies in all areas that relate
directly or indirectly to real estate or urban or rura

59
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

econom cs and to publish and di ssem nate the findings and
results of the studies.

4. To assist the teaching programin real estate
of fered by the universities, colleges, and real estate schools
regi stered pursuant to this chapter in the state, when
requested to do so.

5. To develop and fromtine to tinme revise and update
materials for use in the courses in real estate offered by the
universities, colleges, and real estate schools registered
pursuant to this chapter in the state, when requested to do
so.

6. To nmake studies of, and recomend changes in, state
statutes and rmnuni ci pal ordi nances; provided, however, that
such studi es are requested by the Governor or the presiding
officers of the Legislature. The foundation shall naintain
political nonadvocacy.

7. To periodically review the progress of persons
conducting such research and studies. The results of any
research project or study shall not be published or
di ssem nated until it has been revi ewed and approved in
writing by the conmi ssion atvisory—commttee or its designated
representative

8. To prepare infornmation of consuner interest
concerning Florida real estate and to make the information
avail able to the public and appropriate state agenci es.

(c) The foundation may make a charge for its
publications and may receive gifts and grants from
f oundati ons, individuals, and other sources for the benefit of
t he foundati on.

(d) A report of the activities and acconplishnents of
t he foundati on shall be published annually.

60
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(e) On or before January 1 of each year, the
conm ssi on advi-sery—coenmttee shall file with the Governor
the presiding officer of each house of the Legislature, and
the secretary of the departnent a conplete and detail ed
written report accounting for all funds received and di sbursed

by the foundation during the precedi ng year

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Fawpur-stant—to—s—286-0%11—
(2)t5)y(a) The conmi ssion atvisery—<commttee shal

solicit advice and information fromreal estate |licensees, the

conmm ssion, universities, colleges, real estate schools

regi stered pursuant to this chapter and the general public for

t he purpose of subnmitting proposals for carrying out the

pur poses, objectives, and duties of the foundation.

(b) The commi ssi on advisory—comittee shall select the

62

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O WDN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

proposal s that shall be funded and shall give priority to
projects with the greatest potential for direct or indirect
benefit to the public.

(c) The commi ssi on advisory—comttee shall select the
university or college within the state or qualified full-tine
faculty nmenber of a university or college within the state
with the consent of the institution to performthe education
study, research study, or other project in accordance with the
pur poses, objectives, and duties of the foundation. |In those
i nstances where no university or college within the state, or
qualified full-tinme faculty nenber of a university or college
within the state with the consent of the institution, submts
an acceptabl e proposal, a qualified person or persons nmay be
sel ected in accordance with law to performthe education
study, research study, or other project in accordance with the
pur poses, objectives, and duties of the foundation.

(3)t6)(a) The director of the Division of Real Estate
of the departnment, hereinafter referred to as the "director,"
or her or his designated representative shall submt to the
conm ssi on advi-sery—commttee, in advance of each fiscal year
a budget for expenditures of all funds provided for the
foundation in a formthat is related to the proposed schedul e
of activities for the review and approval of the conmi ssion
atvi-sory—corm-ttee.

(b) The director shall subnit to the conm ssion
atvri-sory—comr-ttee all proposals received for its review and
approval in devel oping an educational and research agenda at
t he begi nning of each fiscal year and shall continuously

i nformthe commi ssi on advisery—commttee of changes in its

substance and schedul i ng.

(4) €7 The conmi ssi on advisory—commttee shall have
63

ile original & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 00
rr 0004 07:26 am 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O WDN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

the power and authority to adopt all rules necessary to
adnmi ni ster this section.

(5) £8) Netrther The foundati on may not ner—the
conm-ttee—shatH—be—permtted—to fund or offer educationa
courses designed to qualify persons for licensure or the
renewal of licenses pursuant to this chapter

(6) {9y Netrther The foundati on may not ner—the
conm-ttee——shat expend any funds for the purpose of enpl oying
staff.

(7) 38y The Treasurer shall invest $3 million fromthe
portion of the Professional Regulation Trust Fund credited to
the real estate profession, under the sane linitations as
applied to investnents of other state funds, and the incone
earned thereon shall be available to the foundation to fund
the activities and projects authorized under this section.
However, any bal ance of such interest in excess of $1 mllion
shall revert to the portion of the Professional Regul ation
Trust Fund credited to the real estate profession. |In the
event the foundation is abolished, the funds in the trust fund
shall revert to such portion of the Professional Regul ation
Trust Fund.

Section 52. Paragraph (d) is added to subsection (1)
of section 477.0132, Florida Statutes, to read:

477.0132 Hair braiding, hair wapping, and body
Wr appi ng registration.--

(1)

(d) Only the board may review, evaluate, and approve a

course required of an applicant for registration under this

subsection in the occupation or practice of hair braiding,

hai r wrappi ng, or body wapping. A provider of such a course

is not required to hold a license under chapter 246.
64

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Section 53. Subsection (2) of section 477.019, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

477.019 Cosnetol ogists; qualifications; |icensure;
supervi sed practice; license renewal ; endorsenent; continuing
educati on. - -

(2) An applicant shall be eligible for licensure by
exam nation to practice cosnetology if the applicant:

(a) |Is at least 16 years of age or has received a high
school di pl ong;

(b) Pays the required application fee, which is not

refundabl e, and the required exami nation fee, which is

refundable if the applicant is deternmined to not be eligible

for licensure for any reason other than failure to

successfully conplete the |icensure exani nation; and

(c)1. |s authorized Hotds—an—active—vatdt+icense to
practice cosnetology in another state or country, has been so
aut hori zed hetd—thet+iecense for at | east 1 year, and does not
qualify for licensure by endorsenent as provided for in

subsection (6); or
2. Has received a mninmumof 1,200 hours of training
as established by the board, which shall include, but shal
not be limted to, the equivalent of conpletion of services
directly related to the practice of cosnetol ogy at one of the
fol | owi ng:
a. A school of cosnetology |icensed pursuant to
chapt er 246.
b. A cosnetology programwithin the public schoo
system
c. The Cosnetology Division of the Florida School for
the Deaf and the Blind, provided the division neets the
standards of this chapter.
65
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRERERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

d. A governnent-operated cosnetol ogy programin this
state.

The board shall establish by rule procedures whereby the
school or programnay certify that a person is qualified to
take the required exam nation after the conpletion of a

m ni rum of 1, 000 actual school hours. |If the person then
passes the exam nation, he or she shall have satisfied this
requirenment; but if the person fails the exami nation, he or
she shall not be qualified to take the exam nation again unti
the conpletion of the full requirenents provided by this
secti on.

Section 54. Section 492.101, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

492.101 Purpose.--It is hereby declared to be the
public policy of the state that, in order to safeguard the
life, health, property, and public well-being of its citizens,
any person practicing or offering to practice geology in this
state shall neet the requirenents of this chapter the

. I ord ot L ohab

be—tHeensetd—as—provided—i+n—ss—492-161+-492-1165.
Section 55. Section 492.102, Florida Statutes, is

amended to read:

492.102 Definitions.--For the purposes of this chapter
$5—492101+-492-1165, unless the context clearly requires
ot herwi se:

(1) "Board" neans the Board of Professiona
Ceol ogi st s.
(2) "Departnent" neans the Departnent of Business and
Pr of essi onal Regul ati on.
(3) "Geology" neans the science which includes the
66
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

treatnent of the earth and its origin and history, in general
the investigation of the earth's crust and interior and the
solids and fluids, including all surface and underground

wat ers, and gases which conpose the earth; the study of the
nat ural agents, forces, and processes whi ch cause changes in
the earth; and the utilization of this know edge of the earth
and its solids, fluids, and gases, and their collective
properties and processes, for the benefit of humanki nd.

(4) "Geologist" neans an individual who, by reason of
her or his know edge of geology, soils, nmathematics, and the
physical and life sciences, acquired by education and
practical experience, is capable of practicing the science of
geol ogy.

(5) "Qualified geologist" neans an individual who
possesses all the qualifications for |icensure under the
provi sions of this chapter ss—492-164+492-1165, except that
such person is not |icensed.

(6) "Professional geologist" nmeans an individual who
is licensed as a geol ogi st under the provisions of this
chapt er s5—492161+-492-1165

(7) "Practice of professional geol ogy" neans the

perfornmance of, or offer to perform geol ogical services,
including, but not limted to, consultation, investigation
eval uati on, planning, and geol ogi c mappi ng, but not incl uding
mappi ng as prescribed in chapter 472, relating to geol ogica
wor k, except as specifically exenpted by this chapter ss—
492-101-492-1165. Any person who practices any specialty
branch of the profession of geology, or who by verbal claim

sign, advertisenment, letterhead, card, or any other neans
represents herself or hinself to be a professional geol ogist,
or who through the use of sone title inplies that she or he is
67
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

a professional geologist or that she or he is |licensed under
this chapter ss—492-161+492-1165, or who holds herself or
hi nsel f out as able to performor does perform any geol ogi cal

services or work recogni zed as professional geol ogy, shall be
construed to be engaged in the practice of professiona
geol ogy.

Section 56. Section 492.104, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

492.104 Authority to make rul es.--The Board of
Pr of essi onal Geol ogists has authority to adopt rules pursuant
to ss. 120.536(1) and 120.54 to inplenent this chapter ss+
492-101+-492-1165. Every licensee shall be governed and
controlled by this chapter ss—492161+492-1165 and the rul es
adopted by the board. The board is authorized to set, by

rule, fees for application, exanination, certificate of

aut hori zation, late renewal, initial |icensure, and |icense
renewal . These fees should not exceed the cost of
i npl erenting the application, exanination, initial l|icensure,

and |license renewal or other administrative process and shal
be established as follows: -

(1) The application fee shall not exceed $150 and
shall be nonrefundabl e.

(2) The exam nation fee shall not exceed $250 and
shal|l be refundable if the applicant is found to be ineligible
to take the licensure exam nation

(3) The initial license fee shall not exceed $100.

(4) The biennial renewal fee shall not exceed $150.

(5) The fee for a certificate of authorization shal
not exceed $350 and the fee for renewal of the certificate
shall not exceed $350.

(6) The fee for reactivation of an inactive |icense
68
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

shall not exceed $50.

(7) The fee for a provisional |icense shall not exceed
$400.

(8) The fee for application, exanination, and
licensure for a license by endorsenent shall be as provided in
this section for licenses in general

Section 57. Paragraph (c) of subsection (1) and
subsection (3) of section 492.105, Florida Statutes, are
amended to read:

492.105 Licensure by exam nation; requirenents;
fees.--

(1) Any person desiring to be licensed as a
prof essi onal geol ogi st shall apply to the departnent to take
the |icensure examination. The witten |icensure exam nation
shal | be designed to test an applicant's qualifications to
practice professional geol ogy, and shall include such subjects
as wWill tend to ascertain the applicant's know edge of the
theory and the practice of professional geol ogy and may
i nclude such subjects as are taught in curricula of accredited
col l eges and universities. The departnent shall exam ne each
appli cant who the board certifies:

(c) Has not committed any act or offense in any
jurisdiction which would constitute the basis for disciplining
a professional geologist licensed pursuant to this chapter ss—
492-101-492-1165.

(3) The departnent shall not issue a license to any

applicant who is under investigation in any jurisdiction for
an of fense which would constitute a violation of this chapter
$5—492101+-492-1165. Upon conpl etion of the investigation
the disciplinary provisions of s. 492.113 shall apply.
Section 58. Section 492.107, Florida Statutes, is
69

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O WDN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

amended to read:

492. 107 Seal s. --

(1) The board shall prescribe, by rule, a form of
seal, including its electronic formto be used by persons

holding valid licenses. Al geological papers, reports, and
docunents prepared or issued by the licensee shall be signed

by—the—+iecensee, dated, and sealed by the |icensee who

perforned or is responsible for the supervision, direction, or

control of the work contained in the papers, reports, or

docunent s stanped—w-th—sard—seat. Such signature, date, and

seal shall be evidence of the authenticity of that to which

they are affixed. Geol ogi cal papers, reports, and docunents

prepared or issued by the licensee may be transmtted

el ectronically provided they have been signed by the |icensee,

dated, and electronically sealed.It is unlawful for any

person to sign stanp or seal any docunent as a professiona

geol ogi st unl ess that person holds a current, active |icense
as a professional geol ogi st which has not with—a—seat—after
that—person—s—t+Hiecense—has expired or been revoked or
suspended, unless reinstated or reissued.

(2) No |licensee registrant shall affix or permt to be
af fi xed her or his the—+egistrant—s seal or nane to any
geol ogi ¢ reports, papers, or other docunents which depict work
which the licensee regrstrant is not |licensed to perform or
whi ch was not perfornmed by or under the responsible

supervision, direction, or control of the |licensee ts—beyond
I . , F . ol I Cn

Section 59. Subsection (2) of section 492.108, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

492.108 Licensure by endorsenent; requirenents;
fees.--

70
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(2) The departnent shall issue a license to practice
prof essi onal geology to any applicant who successfully
conplies with the requirenents of this section. The
departnent shall not issue a |license to any applicant who is
under investigation in any jurisdiction for an offense which
woul d constitute a violation of this chapter ss—
492-101+-492-1165. Upon conpl etion of the investigation, the
di sciplinary provisions of s. 492.113 shall apply.

Section 60. Section 492.111, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

492.111 Practice of professional geology by a firm
corporation, or partnership; certificate of
aut hori zation.--The practice of, or offer to practice,
pr of essi onal geol ogy by individual professional geol ogists
| icensed under the provisions of this chapter ss+
4921014923165 through a firm corporation, or partnership
of fering geol ogical services to the public through

individually licensed professional geol ogists as agents,

enpl oyees, officers, or partners thereof is permtted subject
to the provisions of this chapter ss—492-164+492-1165,

provi ded that:

(1) At all tinmes that it offers geological services to

the public, the firm corporation, or partnership has on file

with the departnent the nane and |icense nunber of one or nore

i ndi viduals who hold a current, active |license as a

prof essional geologist in the state and are serving as a

geol ogi st of record for the firm corporation, or partnership.

A geol ogi st of record may be any principal officer or enpl oyee

of such firmor corporation, or any partner or enployee of

such partnership, who holds a current, active license as a

prof essional geologist in this state, or any other
71

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Fl orida-licensed professional geologist with whomthe firm

corporation, or partnership has entered into a long-term

ongoi ng rel ationship, as defined by rule of the board, to

serve as one of its geologists of record. It shall be the

responsibility of the firm corporation, or partnership and

the geol ogist of record to notify the departnent of any

changes in the relationship or identity of that geol ogi st of
record within 30 days after such change. Gre—or—ore—of—the

(2) The firm corporation, or partnership has been
i ssued a certificate of authorization by the departnent as
provided in this chapter ss—492-1064+-492-1165. For purposes
of this section, a certificate of authorization shall be

required of any firm corporation, partnership, association

or person practicing under a fictitious name and offering

geol ogi cal services to the public; except that, when an

i ndividual is practicing geology in his or her owmn nane, he or
she shall not be required to obtain a certificate of

aut hori zation under this section. Such certificate of

aut hori zation shall be renewed every 2 years.

(3) Al final geol ogical papers or docunents involving
the practice of the profession of geol ogy which have been
prepared or approved for the use of such firm corporation, or
partnership, for delivery to any person for public record with
the state, shall be dated and bear the signature and seal of
t he professional geol ogi st or professional geol ogists who
prepared or approved them

72
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UuDWNER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(4) The fact that a |licensed geol ogi st practices
t hrough a corporation or partnership shall not relieve the
registrant frompersonal liability for negligence, m sconduct,
or wongful acts committed by himor her. Partnership and al
partners shall be jointly and severally liable for the
negl i gence, msconduct, or wongful acts conmmitted by their
agents, enployees, or partners while acting in a professiona
capacity. Any officer, agent, or enployee of a corporation
shal | be personally |iable and accountable only for negligent
acts, wongful acts, or nmisconduct committed by himor her or
commtted by any person under his or her direct supervision
and control, while rendering professional services on behalf
of the corporation. The personal liability of a sharehol der
of a corporation, in his or her capacity as sharehol der, shal
be no greater than that of a sharehol der-enpl oyee of a
corporation incorporated under chapter 607. The corporation
shall be liable up to the full value of its property for any
negligent acts, wongful acts, or msconduct conmtted by any
of its officers, agents, or enployees while they are engaged
on behal f of the corporation in the rendering of professiona
servi ces.

(5) The firm corporation, or partnership desiring a
certificate of authorization shall file with the departnent an
application therefor, upon a formto be prescribed by the
departnment, acconpani ed by the required application fee.

(6) The departnent may refuse to issue a certificate
of authorization if any facts exist which would entitle the
departnment to suspend or revoke an existing certificate of
authori zation or if the departnent, after giving persons
involved a full and fair hearing, determ nes that any of the
officers or directors of said firmor corporation, or partners

73
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

of said partnership, have violated the provisions of s.
492.113.

Section 61. Paragraphs (a), (b), and (g) of subsection
(1) of section 492.112, Florida Statutes, are anended to read:

492.112 Prohibitions; penalties.--

(1) A person may not know ngly:

(a) Practice geology unless the person is licensed
under this chapter ss—492161+-492-1165.

(b) Use the nane or title "Professional Geol ogist" or

any other title, designation, words, letters, abbreviations,
or device tending to indicate that the person holds an active
|icense as a geol ogi st when the person is not |icensed under
this chapter ss—492-161+492-1165.

(g) Conceal information relative to violations of this
chapt er s5—492—161+-492-1165

Section 62. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section
492. 113, Florida Statutes, is anended to read:

492.113 Disciplinary proceedings. --

(1) The followi ng acts constitute grounds for which
the disciplinary actions in subsection (3) nmay be taken

(a) Violation of any provision of s. 492.112 or any
ot her provision of this chapter ss—492-161+492-1165.

Section 63. Section 492.116, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

492.116 Exenptions.--The followi ng persons are
specifically exenpted fromthis chapter ss—492-1061+-4921165
provi ded, however, that all final geol ogi cal papers or

docunent s whi ch have been prepared by a person exenpt under
subsection (1), subsection (2), subsection (3), or subsection
(4) for delivery to any person for public record with the
state shall be dated and bear the signature and seal of the
74
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

prof essi onal geol ogi st or professional geol ogi sts who prepared
or approved them

(1) Persons engaged solely in teaching the science of
geol ogy.

(2) Persons engaged in geol ogi cal research which does
not affect the health, safety, or well-being of the public.

(3) Oficers and enpl oyees of the United States
CGovernnent, the State of Florida, water managenent districts,
or other local or regional governnental entities practicing
solely as such officers or enpl oyees.

(4) Regular full-tinme enployees of a corporation not
engaged in the practice of professional geology as such, who
are directly supervised by a person |licensed as a professiona
geol ogi st under this chapter ss—492161+492-1165.

(5) A person enployed on a full-tine basis as a

geol ogi st by an enpl oyer engaged i n the business of

devel oping, mning, or treating ores, other mnerals, and
petroleumresources if that person engages in geol ogica
practice exclusively for and as an enpl oyee of such enpl oyer
and does not hold herself or hinmself out and is not held out
as available to performany geol ogi cal services for persons
ot her than her or his enpl oyer.

Section 64. Section 492.1165, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

492.1165 Construction of chapter eh—87463.--Nothing
in this chapter ss—492-161+4921165—as—enacted—bychapter
87+463—taws—of—Ftorida;—shal | be construed to prevent or
prohibit the practice of any profession or trade for which a

license is required under any other law of this state, or the
practice by registered professional engineers.
Section 65. Paragraph (d) of subsection (3) of section
75
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 : m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIRPLOO N DMWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

310. 0015, Florida Statutes, is anended to read

310.0015 Piloting regulation; general provisions.--

(3) The rate-setting process, the issuance of |icenses
only in nunbers deened necessary or prudent by the board, and
ot her aspects of the econonic regulation of piloting
established in this chapter are intended to protect the public
fromthe adverse effects of unrestricted conpetition which
woul d result froman unlimted nunber of licensed pilots being
allowed to market their services on the basis of |ower prices
rat her than safety concerns. This system of regul ation
benefits and protects the public interest by maxim zing
saf ety, avoiding unecononic duplication of capital expenses
and facilities, and enhancing state regul atory oversight. The
system seeks to provide pilots with reasonabl e revenues,
taking into consideration the normal uncertainties of vesse
traffic and port usage, sufficient to maintain reliable,
stable piloting operations. Pilots have certain restrictions
and obligations under this system including, but not linted
to, the foll ow ng:

(d)1. The pilot or pilots in a port shall train and
conpensate all menber deputy pilots in that port. Failure to
train or conpensate such deputy pilots shall constitute a
ground for disciplinary action under s. 310.101. Nothing in
this subsection shall be deened to create an agency or
enpl oynent rel ationship between a pilot or deputy pilot and
the pilot or pilots in a port.

2. The pilot or pilots in a port shall establish a

conpet ency- based nmentor program by which nmnority persons, as
defined in s. 288.703(3), may acquire the skills for the
prof essi onal preparation and educati on conpetency requirenents

of a licensed state pilot or certificated deputy pilot. The
76

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

departnent shall provide the Governor, the President of the

Senate, and the Speaker of the House of Representatives with a

report each year on the nunmber of nminority persons, as defined

ins. 288.703(3), who have participated in each nentor

program who are licensed state pilots or certificated deputy

pilots, and who have applied for state pilot licensure or

deputy pilot certification

Section 66. The sum of $500,000 is appropriated from

t he Professional Regulation Trust Fund to the Departnment of

Busi ness and Professional Regul ation for the purpose of

di sbursing funds to any private corporation or business entity

to offset startup costs incurred in the inpl enentation of

section 455.32, Florida Statutes, the Managenent Privatization

Act, pursuant to a contract executed by the departnent.
Section 67. Subsection (12) of section 477.013,

Fl orida Statutes, is anended to read:
477.013 Definitions.--As used in this chapter
(12) "Body wrappi ng" neans a treatnent programthat

uses herbal wraps for the purposes of werght—toss—antd—of

cl eansi ng and beautifying the skin of the body, but does not

i ncl ude:

(a) The application of oils, lotions, or other fluids
to the body, except fluids contained in presoaked materials
used in the waps; or

(b) Mani pul ation of the body's superficial tissue,
other than that arising fromconpression emanating fromthe
wrap material s.

Section 68. This act shall take effect July 1, 2000.

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

ile or 0
rr 0004 m 02211-0067- 264249




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLOO®~NO®UuDWNER O

HOUSE AMENDMENT

Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st

Eng.

Amendnment No. _ (for drafter's use only)

=—=============== T | T L E AMENDMENT =========

And the title is anended as foll ows:
On page 1, line 1 through
page 7, line 26
renove fromthe title of the bill: all of said |ines

and insert in lieu thereof:
An act relating to regul ati on of professions
under the Departnent of Business and
Pr of essi onal Regul ation; anending s. 310.071,
F.S.; providing for disqualification from
appl ying for and denial of deputy pilot
certification for being found guilty of, or
having pled guilty or nolo contendere to,
certain crines; amending s. 310.151, F.S.
providing for deposit and disposition of
anounts received frominposition of pilotage
rates pending rendition of a final order
regardi ng such rates; anmending s. 399.061
F.S.; revising requirenents for el evator
i nspections and service mai ntenance contracts;
anending s. 455.211, F.S.; linmting a board's
authority to pronulgate rules under a specific
ci rcunstance; anending s. 455.217, F.S.
revising provisions relating to transl ation of
exam nations in Spanish; anending s. 455.2179,
F.S.; providing for approval of continuing
educati on providers; providing fees; providing
rul emaki ng authority; anmending s. 455.219,

F.S., and repealing subsection (3), relating to

fees required for approval as a continuing
78

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

ile or
rr0004

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

educati on provider; authorizing the departnment
to adopt rules to provide for waiver of |icense
renewal fees under certain circunstances and
for alimted period; creating s. 455.32, F. S
creating the Managenent Privatization Act;
providi ng definitions; authorizing the
departnment to contract with a corporation or
ot her business entity to perform support
services specified pursuant to contract;
providi ng contract requirenents; providing
corporation powers and responsibilities;
establishing reporting and audit requirenents;
providing for future review and repeal
anending s. 468.382, F.S.; defining the term
"absol ute auction"; anending s. 468.385, F.S.
revising requirenents relating to the conduct,
adm ni stration, approval, and scope of the
exam nation for |icensure as an aucti oneer
speci fying that an auction may only be
conducted by an active licensee; creating s.
468. 3855, F.S.; providing requirenents for
aucti oneer apprentices; anending s. 468. 388,
F.S.; adding requirenents and responsibilities
relating to the conduct of an auction; deleting
exceptions froma requirenent that auctions be
conducted pursuant to a witten agreenent;
anending s. 468.389, F.S.; providing for
di sciplinary action against |icensees who fai
to account for certain property; providing
penal ties; reenacting ss. 468.385(3), 468.391
F.S., relating to licensure as an aucti oneer
79

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

and to a crinmnal penalty, respectively, to
i ncorporate the anmendnent to s. 468.389, F.S.
in references thereto; anending s. 468. 392,
F.S.; authorizing the designee of the Secretary
of Busi ness and Professional Regulation to sign
vouchers for payment or disbursenent fromthe
Auctioneer Recovery Fund; anending s. 468. 395,
F.S.; revising conditions of recovery fromthe
Aucti oneer Recovery Fund; providing for
recovery fromthe fund pursuant to an order
i ssued by the Florida Board of Auctioneers;
deleting a requirenent that notice be given to
the board at the tine action is commenced;
providing limtations on bringing clains for
certain acts; providing subrogation rights for
the fund; anending s. 468.397, F.S., relating
to paynent of claim correcting | anguage;
anmending s. 468.433, F.S.; revising
requirenents for licensure as a comunity
associ ati on manager, to include certain
prelicensure education; providing for provider
approval , including fees; repealing s.
468.525(3)(h), F.S., relating to a prohibition
on enpl oyee | easi ng conpani es and groups from
i ncl udi ng enpl oyees who engage in services or
arrangenents that are not within the definition
of enpl oyee | easing; anending s. 468.526, F.S.
nodi fying qualifications for |icensure as an
enpl oyee | easi ng conpany group; anendi ng s.
468.531, F. S.; providing prohibitions agai nst
offering to practice enployee | easing wthout
80
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

being licensed and against the use of certain
titles relating to enpl oyee | easing wi thout
bei ng regi stered; providing penalties; anmending
s. 470.005, F.S.; providing rul emaki ng
authority to the Board of Funeral Directors and
Enbal ners relating to i nspection of direct
di sposal establishnents, funera
establi shnents, and cinerator facilities and
the records of each establishnment or facility;
anmending s. 470.015, F.S.; requiring board
approval of continuing education providers;
revising provisions relating to conti nuing
educati on hours; anending ss. 470.016, 470. 018,
F.S.; revising provisions relating to
conti nui ng educati on hours; anendi ng s.
470.017, F.S.; revising provisions relating to
registration as a direct disposer, including
fee-setting responsibility; providing certain
limtations on registration after a specified
date; anending s. 470.021, F.S.; prohibiting
col ocation of certain direct disposal
establishments with nore than one funera
establ i shnent or direct disposal establishnent;
anending s. 470.028, F.S.; revising provisions
relating to registration of agents for preneed
sal es; anmending s. 470.0301, F.S.; revising
provisions relating to registration of
centralized enbalmng facilities to provide for
operati ng procedures; providing requirenents
for full-tine enbal ners in charge; anending ss.
471.003, 471.0035, 471.011, 471.023, 471.037,
81
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

F.S.; updating references relating to
regul ati on of engineering to incorporate
provisions relating to the Florida Engi neers
Managenent Corporation and engi neers performng
bui | di ng code i nspector duties; anending s.
471.005, F.S.; defining the ternms "retired
prof essi onal engi neer" and "professiona
engi neer, retired"; updating references;
anmending s. 471.015, F.S.; revising educationa
requirenents for |licensure by endorsenent;
updating references; anending s. 471.017, F.S.
granting the Board of Professional Engineers
rul emaki ng authority to establish biennial
| icensure renewal procedures; replacing
conti nuing education provisions with provisions
requiring certain denonstration of continuing
pr of essi onal conpetency; anending s. 471.019,
F.S., to create s. 471.0195, F.S.; separating
provisions relating to building code training
fromprovisions relating to |icensure
reactivation requirenents; anending s. 471. 025,
F.S.; requiring final bid docunents to be
si gned, dated, and seal ed and authorizing the
el ectronic transfer of such docunents; anendi ng
s. 471.031, F.S.; providing a penalty for
certain activities prohibited under ch. 471
F.S., relating to engineering; updating
references; anending s. 474.202, F.S.; revising
the definition of the term"veterinarian"
anmending s. 474.203, F.S.; revising and
provi di ng exenptions fromregul ati on under ch
82
iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07:26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

474, F.S., relating to veterinary nedica
practice; providing that certain exenpt persons
are duly licensed practitioners for purposes of
prescribing drugs or nedicinal supplies;
anending s. 474.211, F.S.; providing that
criteria for providers of continuing veterinary
nedi cal education shall be approved by the
board; anending s. 474.214, F.S.; increasing
the administrative fine; reenacting ss.
474.207(2), 474.217(2), F.S., relating to
| icensure by exam nation and |icensure by
endor senent, to incorporate the anendnent to s.
474.214, F.S., in references thereto; anending
s. 474.215, F.S.; requiring limted service
permttees to register each |ocation and
providing a registration fee; providing
requi renents for certain tenporary rabies
vaccination efforts; providing permt and other
requi rements for persons who are not |icensed
veterinarians, but who desire to own and
operate a veterinary nedical establishnent;
providing disciplinary actions applicable to
hol ders of prenises pernits; anending s.
474. 2165, F.S.; providing requirenents with
respect to ownership and control of veterinary
nedi cal patient records; providing for the
furni shing of reports or copies of records;
providing for participation of veterinarians in
i mpaired practitioner treatnent prograns;
anmending s. 475.045, F.S.; abolishing the
Fl ori da Real Estate Commi ssion Education and
83

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0

07:26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
Bill No. CS/HB 2211, 1st Eng.
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

Resear ch Foundati on Advisory Committee and
transferring its duties to the conmm ssion
anending s. 477.013, F.S.; revising a
definition; amending s. 477.0132, F.S.
restricting to the Board of Cosnetol ogy
authority to review, evaluate, and approve
courses required for hair braiding, hair

wr appi ng, and body wrapping registration;
exenpting providers of such courses from
certain licensure; anending s. 477.019, F.S.
revising requirenents for licensure to practice
cosnetol ogy; providing fees; anending ss.
492.101, 492.102, 492.104, 492.105, 492.108,
492.112, 492.113, 492.116, 492.1165, F.S.
revising cross-references; anending s. 492. 107,
F.S.; revising provisions relating to the use
of seals by licensed geol ogi sts; anending s.
492.111, F. S.; providing requirenents rel ating
to geol ogi sts of record for firns,
corporations, and partnerships; anendi ng s.
310. 0015, F.S.; requiring the establishnent of
conpet ency-based nmentor prograns for minority
persons seeking to becone licensed state pilots
or certificated deputy pilots; requiring an
annual report thereon to the Governor and
Legi sl ature; providing an appropriation
providing an effective date.

iginal & 9 copies 05/ 02/ 0
07: 26 a

0
m 02211-0067- 264249




