© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W WNNNDNNNNNNNERERRRRPR R PP PR R
P O © 0 N0 0 WNZEPEPO®O©ONOGON®WNNPRP O

HOUSE AMENDMENT

751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)
CHAMBER ACTI ON

Senat e House

ORI G NAL STAMP BELOW

Representative(s) Benson offered the foll ow ng:

Amendment (with title amendment)
On page 12, line 19,
renove: all of said line

and insert:

Section 2. Section 399.01, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.01 Definitions.--As used in this chapter, the
term

(1) "Alteration" neans any change or addition to the
vertical conveyance ot her than mai ntenance, repair, or
repl acenent.

verti-cat—econveyance—
(2)3) "Certificate of operation” neans a document
i ssued by the departnent which indicates that the conveyance
has had the required safety inspection and tests and that fees
1

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O b~ W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNNERRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0BN WNIEREPRO O ®NOOOO M WN R O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

have been paid as provided in this chapter

(3) t4)y "Conveyance" neans an el evator, dunbwaiter
escal ator, noving sidewal k, platformlift, or anrd¢ stairway
chairlift.

(4) 5y "Departnment” neans the Department of Business
and Prof essional Regul ation

(5)¢6) "Division" means the Division of Hotels and
Restaurants of the Departnent of Business and Professional
Regul ati on.

(6) 7 "Elevator” means one of the follow ng
nmechani cal devi ces:

(a) A hoisting and | owering nechani sm equipped with a
car and platformthat noves in guide rails and serves two or
nore landings to transport naterial or passengers or both.

(b) An escalator, which is a power-driven, inclined
conti nuous stairway used for raising or |owering passengers.

(c) A dunbwaiter, which is a hoisting and | owering
nechani sm equi pped with a car of limted size which noves in
guide rails and serves two or nore | andings.

(d) A noving walk, which is a type of
passenger-carryi ng device on which passengers stand or wal k
and in which the passenger-carrying surface renains parallel
toits direction of notion and is uninterrupted.

(e) Aninclined stairway chairlift, which is a device
used to transport physically handi capped persons over
architectural barriers.

(f) An inclined or vertical wheelchair lift, which is
a device used to transport wheel chair handi capped persons over
architectural barriers.

03/1
06: 46 pm 01307-0003- 664885




© 00 N O O WDN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLOO®®~NO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(7) 69y "Existing installation"” nmeans an installation
defined as an "installation, existing" in the Florida Building
Code.

(8) 16y "El evator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee"
neans the conmittee appointed by the secretary of the
Depart nent of Business and Professional Regul ation.

(9) )y "Private residence" neans a separate dwelling
or a separate apartnent in a multiple dwelling which is
occupi ed by nmenbers of a single-famly unit.

(10) £32) "Servi ce mmi ntenance contract"” neans a
contract that provides for routine exam nation, lubrication
cl eani ng, adjustnent, replacenent of parts, and perfornmance of
appl i cabl e code-required safety tests such as on a traction
el evator and annual relief pressure test on a hydraulic
el evator and any ot her service, repair, and mai ntenance
sufficient to ensure the safe operation of the elevator. A

servi ce mmi ntenance contract shall be made avail abl e upon

request of the departnent for purposes of oversight and

noni t ori ng.

(11) (33) "Tenporarily dormant conveyance" neans a
conveyance whose power supply has been di sconnected by
renovi ng fuses and pl aci ng a padl ock on the nainline
di sconnect switch in the "OFF" position. The car is parked,
and the hoi stway doors are in the closed and | atched position
A wire seal is installed on the mainline disconnect switch by
a certified eertifieate—of——conpetency el evator inspector. This
conveyance iastatHation nay not be used again until it has
been put in safe running order and is in condition for use.
Annual inspections shall continue for the duration of the
tenmporarily dormant status by a certified eertifiecate—of
conpetency el evator inspector. The tenporarily dornmant status

iginal & 9 copies 03/1
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NRNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR P R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®NOO O M WN R O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

is renewabl e on an annual basis and nmay not exceed a 5-year
period. The inspector shall file a report with the departnment
chi-ef—etevator—inspeetor describing the current conditions.
The wire seal and padl ock may not be renoved for any purpose
Wi t hout perm ssion fromthe departnent etevator—inspeetor.
(12) (34) "Tenporary operation inspection permt" neans
an inspection perforned by a certified elevator inspector, the

successful passage of a—decurent—issued—bythe—departrent

which permts the tenporary use of a nonconpliant vertica

conveyance as provided by rule.

(13) (15) "Regi stered el evator conpany” neans an entity
regi stered with and authorized by the division enpl oyi ng
persons to construct, install, inspect, nmaintain, or repair
any vertical conveyance. Each registered el evator conpany nust
annually register with the division and mai ntain genera
liability insurance coverage in the mni num anounts set by
rul e the—division.

(14) 26> "Certified elevator inspector"” is a natura
person registered with and aut horized by the division to

construct, install, inspect, maintain, or repair any vertica
conveyance, after having properly acquired the qualified
el evator inspector credential as prescribed by the Anerican

Soci ety of Mechani cal Engineers. Each certified el evator

i nspector nust annually register with the division and provide
F I . I o . o : ot es

I b . o II I i I
wpor—provi-ting—anndal proof of conpletion of 8 hours of

conti nui ng education, proof that and the qualified el evator

i nspector credential remains in good standing, and proof of

03/1
06: 46 pm 01307-0003- 664885




© 00O N o O~ DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 ~N O UO0DN WNIERERPRO O ®ONOOOO M WN R O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

y | ot | e ed el .
w . et s | . ia general

liability insurance coverage in the mini num anounts set by the
di vi si on.

(15) 37 "Certified elevator technician" neans a
nat ural person authorized by the division to construct,
install, maintain, or repair any vertical conveyance, after
havi ng been issued an elevator certificate of conpetency by
the division. Each certified elevator technician nust annually
register with the division and be covered by maintaifn genera

liability insurance coverage in the mni num anounts set by the
di vi si on.

(16) (138) "El evator hel per" means a natural person
perforning work under the direct supervision of an el evator
certificate of conpetency hol der a—eertified—etevator
aspeetor—or—an—etevater—techniecian to construct, install

mai ntain, or repair any vertical conveyance.

(17) 19 "Elevator certificate of conpetency” neans a
credential issued by the division to any individual natura
person successfully conpleting an exam nation as prescribed by
rul e and payi ng a nonrefundabl e fee of $50. Such credenti al

shall be valid for and expire at the end of 1 year, and nmay be
renewed by the division when the division receives proof of
the elevator certificate of conpetency holder's conpletion of
8 hours of continuing education froma provider approved by

t he departnent and a nonrefundabl e renewal fee of $50. The

departnment shall adopt by rule criteria for providing approval

and procedures for continuing education reporting.

(a) An elevator certificate of conpetency may be

issued only if the applicant neets the foll ow ng requirenents:

1. Four years' work experience in the construction
5

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

nmai nt enance, service, and repair of conveyances covered by

this chapter. This experience shall be verified by current or

previously registered el evator conpanies as required by the

di vi si on.
2. One of the foll ow ng:

a. Proof of conpletion and successful passage of a

written exam nation administered by the division or a provider

approved by the division under standards it adopted by rule.

b. Proof of conpletion of an apprenticeshi p program

for el evator nechani cs which has standards substantially

equi val ent to those found in a national training program for

el evator nechanics and is registered with the Bureau of

Apprenticeship and Training of the United States Departnent of

Labor or a state apprenticeship authority.

c. Proof of licensure or certification by a state or

local jurisdiction in the United States having standards

substantially equal to or nore stringent than those of this

chapter.
(b) A licensed nechani cal engi neer whose license is in

good standing nay be granted an el evator certificate of

conpet ency.

Al'l other building transportation terns are defined in the
current Florida Building Code.

Section 3. Subsections (1) and (5) of section 399. 02,
Fl ori da Statutes, are anended to read

399.02 General requirenents.--

(1) The Elevator Safety Technical Advisory Conmittee
shal | devel op and subnit to the Director of Hotels and
Rest aurants proposed regatreifig revisions to the el evator
safety code so that it is the sane as or sinlar to the | atest

6

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O N D WNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

edi ti ons wersions of ASME Al7.1, ASME Al17.3, and ASME A18. 1.
(5)(a) The construction permtholder is responsible
for the correction of violations and deficiencies until the
el evator has been inspected and a certificate of operation has
been issued by the departnent. The construction pernithol der
is responsible for all tests of new and altered equi prnent
until the elevator has been inspected and a certificate of
operati on has been issued by the departnent.
(b) The el evator owner is responsible for the safe
oper ati on, are proper mai ntenance, and inspection and

correction of code deficiencies of the elevator after ++—has

been—inspected—and a certificate of operation has been issued

by the departnent. The responsibilities of the el evator owner

may be assi gned by | ease.

Section 4. Section 399.03, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

iginal & 9 copies 03/1
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O M W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

399.03 Design, installation, and alteration of
conveyances. - -

(1) A conveyance covered by this chapter may not be
erected, constructed, installed, or altered within buildings
or structures until unRtess a permt has been obtained fromthe
depart nent befoere—the—werk—+s—conmrenced. Pernmits nust be
applied for by a registered el evator conpany and nay only be

granted upon recei pt and approval of an application to be nade

on a formprescribed by the departnent, acconpani ed by proper

fees and a sworn statenent by an agent of the registered

el evator conpany that the plans neet all applicable el evator

safety and building codes. Permits may be granted only to

regi stered el evator conpani es i n good standi ng. When any

material alteration is nade, the alteration dewviee nust
conformto applicable requirenents of the Florida Building
Code and the provisions of this chapter fer—the—-atteration—A

. . w I e I
¢ . holdi I
contractor-—s—tH-cense—issued—under—this—ehapter. A copy of the

permit and plans nust be kept at the construction site at al

times while the work is in progress and until a certificate of

operation is issued.

(2) The departnent shall provide by rule for permt
application requirenments and permt fees.

(3) Pernits may be revoked for the foll ow ng reasons:

(a) There are any fal se statenments or
m srepresentations as to the material facts in the
application, plans, or specifications on which the pernit was
based.

(b) The permit was issued in error and not in
accordance with the code or rules.

8

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOOUuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(c) The work detailed under the pernit is not being
perforned in accordance with the provisions of the
application, plans, or specifications or with the code or
conditions of the permt.

(d) The construction pernitholder to whomthe pernit
was issued fails or refuses to conply with a stop-work order

(4) A pernit expires if:

(a) The work authorized by the permit is not comrenced
within 6 nonths after the date of issuance, or within a
shorter period of tine as the departnment nay specify at the
time the pernit is issued.

(b) The work is suspended or abandoned for a period of
60 days, or such shorter period of tinme as the departnent nay
specify at the tinme the pernmit is issued, after the work has
been started. For good cause, the departnent may allow a
di scretionary extension for the foregoi ng period.

(5) Al new conveyance installations nust be perforned

by a registered el evator conpany persen—to—whomatHcense—+to
AstaH—or—service—a——conveyance—has—been—+ssuet—Subseguent—to
AstaHati-on—theH-ecensed—person—H+rm—or—conpany st
certy—conpH-ance—wth—the—appt-cable—seetions—of—this
chapter—antd—the+Horida—DBuitding—Cotde. Before any vertica

conveyance is used, except those in a private residence, it

nmust be inspected by a certified el evator H-eensed i nspector

not enpl oyed, 6+ associ ated, or having a conflict of interest

with the el evator construction permthol der or el evator owner

and certified as neeting the safety provisions of the Florida
Bui | di ng Code, including the performance of all required

safety tests. The certified elevator inspector shall provide

the original copy of the inspection report to the departnent

within 5 days after the inspection. A certificate of operation
9

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

may not be issued until the pernitholder provides an affidavit

si gned by the construction supervisor attesting that the

supervi sor directly supervised the construction or

installation of the el evator. Upen—sueceesstul—inspeetion—the
e
. . Cbedi "
I ot I e F o .
I i  tre el .

bl I I b T . . .
fer—a—rnewinstatHat+oen—\Verti cal conveyances, incl uding

stairway chairlifts, and inclined or vertical wheelchair lifts

| ocated in private residences are not required to obtain a
certificate of operation under this chapter

(6)tH At the departnent's request, and to facilitate

oversight and nonitoring,the permthol der shall notify the

departnment of the schedul ed final inspection date and tine for

purposes of acquiring a certificate of inspection—a—witing-
I I bet et 4 I - shat—i

7) 8> Each el evator shall conply with the edition of
10

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

the Florida Building Code or Elevator Safety Code that was in
effect at the tine of receipt of application for the
construction pernit for the elevator

(8){9)y Each alteration to, or relocation of, an
el evator shall conply with the edition of the Florida Building
Code or Elevator Safety Code that was in effect at the tine of
receipt of the application for the construction permt for the
alteration or relocation.

(9) £36) When any change is made in the classification
of an elevator, the elevator shall conmply with all of the
requi renments of the version of the Florida Building Code or
El evator Safety Code that were in effect at the tine of
receipt of the application for the construction permt for the
change in classification

(10)(a) The tenporary use of an elevator during

installation or alteration is authorized for a period of 30

days after the conpletion of a satisfactory tenporary

operation inspection. An additional 30-day period of tenporary

use is authorized fromthe date of conpletion of each

addi tional satisfactory tenporary operation inspection. A

satisfactory tenporary operation inspection nust satisfy the

following criteria: the elevator is tested under contract

| oad; the hoistway is fully encl osed; the hoi stway doors and

interlocks are installed; the car is conpletely encl osed,

i ncludi ng door or gate and top; all electrical safety devices

are installed and properly functioning; and terninal stopping

equi pnent is in place for a safe runby and proper clearance.

When a car is provided with a tenporary encl osure, the

operati ng neans nust be by constant pressure push-button or

| ever-type switch. The car nay not exceed the m ni num safe

operating speed of the el evator, and the governor tripping
11

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

speed nust be set in accordance with the operating speed of

t he el evat or.

(b) Tenporary use is authorized only when a

satisfactory tenporary operation inspection report, conpleted

within the last 30 days by a certified el evator inspector, and

a notice prescribed by the departnent, bearing a statenent

that the elevator has not been finally approved by a certified

el evator inspector, are conspi cuously posted in the el evator
Section 5. Section 399.049, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:
399.049 Disciplinary action €ertificate—of
conpetency. - -
(1) SUSPENSHON-ORREVOCATHON-OFLHCENSE-OR-CERTH--CATE
OF—CAOVWPETENEY-——The departnent may suspend or revoke an
el evator inspector certification, an el evator conpany
regi stration, an el evator a—+iecense—or certificate of
conpetency, or an elevator certificate of operation issued

under this chapter or inpose an administrative penalty of up
to $1, 000 per violation upon any registered el evator conpany

H-censee or certificatehol der who commits any one or nore of
the follow ng violations:

(a) Any false statement as to a material matter in an
the application for registration, certification, or any pernit

or certificate issued under this chapter

(b) Fraud, msrepresentation, or bribery in the

practice of the profession securing—atH-ecense—or——certifiecate
of—conpetency.

(c) Failure by a certified elevator inspector to

provi de net+fy the departnent and the certificate of operation
hol der with a copy of the inspection report within 5 days

after the date of any inspection perforned after the initial
12

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O b~ DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

certificate of operation is issued of—a—conveyance—coveredby
o I I . . ¥ T - :

the—etevator—safety—ecode—+tnecorporated—into—thetHorida
Bui-+di-ng—Code.

(d) Violation of any provision of this chapter

(2) DHSEHPEHINARY-ACH-ON—ANy di sciplinary action
taken under this chapter nmust conply with chapter 120 and any
rul es adopted thereunder

Section 6. Section 399.061, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399. 061 |Inspections; service nmaintenance contracts;

correction of deficiencies.--

(1)(a) Al elevators or other conveyances subject to
this chapter nust be annually inspected by a certified
el evat or inspector thretgh—athird-—partyinspection—service,
or by a municipality or county under contract with the
di vi si onypursuant to s. 399.13. |If the el evator er—other

i Cl A,

conpany—however—i+f—the—etevator is not an escalator or a

dunbwai ter, serves only two adjacent floors, and is covered by

a service mmintenance contract, an inspection is not required
so long as the service contract remains in effect. Astatenent

(b) A statenent verifying the exi stence and

perfornance of each service mai ntenance contract nmust be filed

at least annually with the division and as prescribed by rule.
13

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Cancel |l ati on of a service mmi ntenance contract nust be
reported to the division as prescri bed by rul e. The—ti-vi-sion
. I I . F
. I i . . . .
L ablet . . .

(2) The division may enpl oy state inspectors to

i nspect an el evator whenever necessary to ensure its safe

operation. The division may al so enploy state el evator

i nspectors to conduct any the inspections as required by this
chapt er subseetten—{Ijand may charge a an—inspeection fee for
each inspection in an anmnount sufficient to cover the costs of
that inspection, as provided by rule, when a private certified

el evator inspector is not avail able. Each state el evator

i nspector shall be properly qualified as a certified el evator
i nspect or hetd—a—certi-Hcate—of—conpetency—i+ssued—by—the
i ision.

(3) \Whenever the division determines fromthe results

of any inspection that, in the interest of the public safety,
an elevator is in an unsafe condition, the division nay sea
the el evator or order the discontinuance of the use of the
el evator until the division deternmines by inspection that such
el evator has been satisfactorily repaired or replaced so that
the el evator may be operated in a safe manner

(4) \When the division determnes that an elevator is
in violation of this chapter or the Florida Buil ding Code, the

di vision may issue an order to the el evator owner requiring
correction of the violation and rei nspection of the el evator

evi dencing the correction
Section 7. Section 399.07, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:
399.07 Certificates of operation; tenporary—operation
14

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(1) tb) The certificate of operation is valid for a

period not to exceed 2 years and shall expire at the end of

t he period ef—t—year unl ess sooner—suspended—or revoked. The

departnment may adopt rules establishing a procedure for

certificate renewal. Certificates of operation nay be renewed

only for vertical conveyances having a current satisfactory

i nspection. The owner of an elevator operating with an expired

certificate of operation is in violation of this chapter

Certificate of operation renewal applications received by the

departnent after the date of expiration of the |last current

certificate nmust be acconpanied by a late fee of $50 in

addition to the annual renewal fee and any other fees required

by law. The departnent shall adopt by rule a fee schedule for

the renewal of certificates of operation. The fees nust be
deposited into the Hotel and Restaurant Trust Fund. The

(2)te)y The certificate of operation nmust be posted in

a conspicuous |location on the elevator and nust be franmed with
a transparent cover.

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRRRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNERPLO O N D WwNPRER O

© 00 N o O W DN P

751- 118AXA- 22
Anmendnment No.

_ (for drafter's use only)

Bill

HOUSE AMENDMENT
No. CS/ HB 1307

01307-0003- 664885




© 00 N O O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

(3) The certificate of operation shall contain the
text of s. 823.12, relating to the prohibition against snoking
in elevators.

(4) In addition to subsection (3), the designation "NO
SMKI NG' along with the international synbol for no snoking
shal | be conspicuously displayed within the interior of the
el evator in the plain view of the public.

(5) Except for as—authortzed—by—=a tenporary use
aut hori zed by this chapter eperation—perit, the operation or
use of any newy installed, relocated, or altered elevator is

prohibited until the el evator has passed the tests and
i nspections required by this chapter and a certificate of
operati on has been issued.

(6) The departnent may suspend any certificate of
operation if it finds that the elevator is not in conpliance
with this chapter or of rules adopted under this chapter. The
suspension remains in effect until the departnent receives
satisfactory results of an inspection perforned by a certified
el evator inspection indicating determnes—by—i+nspectiont hat
t he el evator has been brought into conpliance.

Section 8. Section 399.105, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.105 Adnministrative fines.--

(1) Any person who fails to conply with the reporting

requi rements of this chapter s—399-02 or with the reasonable

requests of the departnent to deternine whether the provisions
of a service maintenance contract and its inplenentation
ensur e assure safe el evator operation is subject to an
adnmi nistrative fine not greater than $1,000 in addition to any
ot her penalty provided by | aw
(2) Any person who conmences the operation
17

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O M W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WwNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

installation, relocation, or alteration of any elevator for
which a permt or certificate is required by this chapter

wi t hout having obtained fromthe departnent the permt or
certificate is subject to an adm nistrative fine not greater
than $1,000 in addition to any other penalty provided by | aw.

(3) An elevator owner who continues to operate an

el evator after notice to discontinue its use or after it has

been seal ed by the departnent is subject to an adm nistrative

fine not greater than $1,000 for each day the el evator has
been operated after the service of the notice or sealing by

the departnent, in addition to any other penalty provided by

| aw.

(4) An elevator owner who fails to conply with an
order to correct issued under s. 399.061(4) within 30 66 days
after its issuance is subject, in addition to any other
penalty provided by law, to an adninistrative fine set—by—the
departrent in an anobunt not to exceed $1, 000.

(5) Al administrative fines collected shall be
deposited into the Hotel and Restaurant Trust Fund.

Section 9. Subsection (2) of section 399.106, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

399. 106 Elevator Safety Technical Advisory
Conmittee. --

(2) The committee nenbers shall serve staggered terns
of 4 years to be set by rule without salary, but nay receive
fromthe state expenses for per diemand travel. The conmittee
eonm-sston shall appoi nt one of the nenbers to serve as chair.

18

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O~ W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

Section 10. Section 399.125, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399. 125 Reporting of elevator accidents er—neidents;
penalties.--Wthin 5 working days after any accident of
iRetrdent occurring in or upon any elevator, the certificate of
operation holder shall report the accident er—neident to the
di vision on a formprescribed by the division. Failure to
timely file this report is a violation of this chapter and
will subject the certificate of operation holder to an
adm nistrative fine, to be inposed by the division, in an
ampbunt not to exceed $1, 000.

Section 11. Section 399.13, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

399.13 Delegation of authority to nmunicipalities or
counties.--

(1) The departnent may enter into contracts with
nmuni ci palities or counties under which such nmunicipalities or
counties will issue construction permts—tenrporary—operation
perfits;and certificates of operation; will provide for
i nspection of elevators, including tenporary operation

i nspections; and will enforce the applicable provisions of the
Fl orida Building Code, as required by this chapter. The
nmuni cipality or county nmay choose to require inspections to be

perforned by its own inspectors or by private certified

el evator inspectors. Each such agreenent shall include a

provision that the nmunicipality or county shall maintain for

i nspection by the departnent copies of all applications for

permts issued, a copy of each inspection report issued, and

proper records showi ng the nunber of certificates of operation

i ssued; shall include a provision that each required

i nspection be conducted by a certified el evator inspector the
19

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O ®~NOO®UuDWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

ol : e : . w I
departwent; and may i ncl ude such other provisions as the

departnment deens necessary.

(2) The departnent may nake inspections of elevators
in such nunicipality or county for the purpose of determning
that the provisions of this chapter are being net and may
cancel the contract with any nmunicipality or county which the
departnment finds has failed to conmply with such contract or
the provisions of this chapter. The anendnents to chapter 399
by this act shall apply only to the installation, relocation
or alteration of an elevator for which a pernit has been
i ssued after QOctober 1, 1990.

Section 12. Section 553.509, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

553.509 Vertical accessibility.--Nothing in sections
553. 501-553. 513 or the guidelines, except 28 CF.R s. 36.403,
shal | be construed to relieve the owner of any buil ding,

structure, or facility governed by those sections fromthe
duty to provide vertical accessibility to all levels above and
bel ow t he occupi abl e grade | evel, regardless of whether the
gui delines require an elevator to be installed in such

buil ding, structure, or facility, except for

(1) Elevator pits, elevator penthouses, nechanica
rooms, piping or equipnent catwal ks, and autonobile
| ubrication and mai ntenance pits and pl atforns;

(2) Unoccupi abl e spaces, such as roons, enclosed
spaces, and storage spaces that are not designed for human
occupancy, for public accomopdations, or for work areas; and

(3) Cccupiable spaces and roons that are not open to
the public and that house no nore than five persons,
including, but not linmted to, equiprment control roons and

20

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNNNNRRRERRRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®UuDMWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

proj ecti on boot hs.

However, buildings, structures, and facilities nmust, as a
m ni num conply with the requirenents in the Arericans with
Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines.

Section 13. Effective May 1, 2003, paragraphs (c) and
(h) of subsection (1) of section 553.74, Florida Statutes, are
amended to read:

553.74 Florida Building Conm ssion.--

(1) The Florida Building Commission is created and
shall be located within the Departnent of Community Affairs
for adm nistrative purposes. Menbers shall be appointed by the
CGovernor subject to confirmation by the Senate. The conm ssion
shal | be conposed of 23 nenbers, consisting of the foll ow ng:

(c) ©One air-conditioning contractor or one nechanica

contractor certified to do business in this state and actively
engaged i n the profession

(h) One roofing or;sheet netal —or—air—conditioening
contractor certified to do business in this state and actively
engaged i n the profession

Section 14. Section 604.50, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

604.50 Nonresidential farm buil dings.--Notw thstanding
any other lawto the contrary, any nonresidential farm
bui | di ng teecated—on—aFfarmis exenpt fromthe Florida Building
Code and any county or nunicipal building code. For purposes
of this section, the term"nonresidential farm buil ding" neans
any building or support structure that is used for
agricul tural purposes, tecated—orn—a+tarmthat is not used as a
residential dwelling, and that is located on land that is an

integral part of a farmoperation or is classified as
21

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN PP

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R PR R
P O © 0 N O U0~ WNIERPLO O ®~NO®Uu D WNPRER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

agricultural land pursuant to s. 193.461. The term"farnlis
as defined in s. 823.14.

Section 15. Subsection (1) of section 627.0629,
Florida Statutes, as anmended by chapter 2001-372, Laws of

Fl orida, is anended to read:

627.0629 Residential property insurance; rate
filings.--

(1) Effective June 1, 2002,a rate filing for
residential property insurance nust include actuarially

reasonabl e di scounts, credits, or other rate differentials, or
appropriate reductions in deductibles, for properties on which
fixtures or construction techni ques denpnstrated to reduce the
amount of loss in a w ndstorm have been installed or

i mpl erented. The fixtures or construction techni ques shal

i ncl ude, but not be limted to, fixtures or construction

t echni ques whi ch enhance roof strength, roof covering
perfornmance, roof-to-wall strength,

wal | -to-fl oor-to-foundation strength, opening protection, and
wi ndow, door, and skylight strength. Credits, discounts, or
other rate differentials for fixtures and construction

t echni ques which neet the nmininumrequirenents of the Florida
Bui | di ng Code nust be included in the rate filing. A

i nsurance conpani es nust nmake a rate filing which includes the
credits, discounts, or other rate differentials by February
28, 2003.

Section 16. (1) The Legislature directs the Florida
Bui | di ng Conmi ssion to devel op buil ding code provisions that
may be added to the Florida Building Code to facilitate the
rehabilitation and use of existing structures. The comn ssion

shall select from avail abl e national or international nbde

codes or the codes or code provisions adopted by another state
22

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




© 00 N o O W DN P

W WNNNNMNNMNNNMNNNNRRRERRPRPEPR R R R
P O © 0 N O 00~ WNIRPLO O N DWNPER O

HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

to formthe foundation for the code provisions required by

this section.

(2) The commission shall seek consensus with fire

safety professionals, advocates for persons with disabilities,

representatives of the construction industry, |and-use

pl anners, building officials, and others identified by the

conm ssion as having an interest in building code provisions.

The commi ssion may nodify the sel ected nodel codes and

standards as needed to accommpbdate the specific needs of this

state.
(3) In conjunction with its code devel opnent

activities, the conmission shall identify |egislative changes

required to i npl enent the code provisions devel oped pursuant

to subsections (1) and (2).

(4) The commission shall report the activities

undertaken in response to the requirenents of this act to the

Legi sl ature on or before January 1, 2003, as a part of the

annual report required by s. 553.77(1)(b), Florida Statutes.

Recomended code provisions and the | egislative changes

required for inplenentation shall be attached as appendices to

t he annual report.

Section 17. Except as otherw se provided herein, this
act shall take effect upon beconing a | aw.

================ T | TLE A MENDMENT ===============
And the title is anended as foll ows:

On page 1, line 29,
renove: providing an effective date.

and insert:
23

iginal & 9 copies 03/ 12/ 02
06: 46 pm 01307- 0003- 664885




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

anending s. 399.01, F.S.; revising and renoving
definitions; requiring that el evator service
nmai nt enance contracts be nmade available to the
Depart nent of Business and Prof essi onal
Regul ati on upon request for oversight purposes;
revising qualifications for an el evator
certificate of conpetency; anending s. 399.02,
F.S.; providing that each el evator owner is
responsi ble for inspections and correction of
code deficiencies; elinnating a requirenment
that the departnent review service nai ntenance
contracts and deternmi ne whether they ensure
safe operation; anending s. 399.03, F.S.
revising requirenents relating to the design
installation, and alteration of conveyances;
provi di ng additional requirenments for issuance
of elevator permts; revising reporting
requi rements; providing requirenents for
tenporary operation inspections; anending s.
399.049, F.S.; revising grounds for suspension
or revocation of certification or registration
anending s. 399.061, F.S.; elimnating the
requi renment that annual inspections be
conducted through third-party inspection
services; revising reporting requirenents
relating to service maintenance contracts;
revising requirenents relating to the
correction of violations; anmending s. 399. 07,
F.S.; extending the period of validity of
certificates of operation from1l to 2 years;
revising fee provisions to conform anending s.
24
iginal & 9 copies 8%/12/02

©46 pm 01307-0003- 664885




HOUSE AMENDVMENT
751- 118AXA- 22 Bill No. CS/HB 1307
Anmendnent No. (for drafter's use only)

© 00 N o O W DN PP

W W NNNNMNNNMNNNRRRRRRR PR B R
P O © 0 ~N O U0 BM WNIERERPRO O ®ONO®D O M WN R O

399. 105, F.S.; providing administrative fines
for violations relating to reporting, operating
a seal ed elevator, and conplying with
correction orders; elimnating a restriction on
the i ssuance of an administrative fine relating
to conmencing installation without a
construction pernit; anending s. 399.106, F.S.
correcting a reference; anending s. 399. 125,
F.S.; elimnating the requirenent to report

el evator incidents; anmending s. 399.13, F.S.
allowing nunicipalities or counties that assune
el evator inspection duties to hire private

i nspectors to conduct inspections; anending s.
553.509, F.S.; providing a federal exception to
vertical accessibility guidelines; anending s.
553.74, F.S.; revising the nenbership of the

Fl orida Buil di ng Conmi ssion; anendi ng s.

604.50, F.S.; revising an exenption fromthe

Fl orida Building Code for nonresidential farm
bui |l di ngs; anending s. 627.0629, F.S.; revising
timefrane for rate filing for residential
property insurance; requiring the Florida
Bui | di ng Commi ssion to devel op buil di ng code
provisions to facilitate the rehabilitation and
use of existing structures; requiring the

commi ssion to identify |egislative changes
required to inplenment such code provisions;
requiring a report to the Legislature;
providing effective dates.

25
iginal & 9 copies 8%/12/02

©46 pm 01307-0003- 664885




