© 00 N oo o B~ W N PP

W W N N N D N D D NN DN PP P PP PP kPP PR
R, O © 00 N o o o W N PP O ©W 00 N O O b W N+, O

Fl orida Senate - 2007 COW TTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068
CHAMBER ACTI ON

Senat e House

Comm RCS
04/ 09/ 2007 05: 11 PM

The Conmittee on Regul ated Industries (King) recomrended the

foll owi ng anendnent:

Senate Anendnent (with title anendnent)

Del ete everything after the enacting cl ause

and insert:

Section 1. Subsection (3) of section 497.101, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

497.101 Board of Funeral, Cenetery, and Consuner
Servi ces; nenbership; appointnment; terns.--

(3) Board nenbers shall be appointed for terns of 4
years, and the State Health O ficer shall serve as |long as
that person holds that office. The designee of the State
Health Officer shall serve at the pleasure of the Governor
When the terns of the initial board menbers expire, the Chief
Financial O ficer shall stagger the terns of the successor
nmenbers as follows: one funeral director, one cenetery
representative, the nonument retailer deater, and one consuner
nmenber shall be appointed for terns of 2 years, and the
remai ni ng nenbers shall be appginted for terms of 4 years. Al

4:08 PM 04/05/07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN MDD DN PP P PP, PP PPk
O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O O 0o N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

subsequent terns shall be for 4 years.

Section 2. Paragraphs (e), (f), and (g) of subsection
(12) of section 497.141, Florida Statutes, are redesignated as
par agraphs (f), (g), and (h), respectively, and a new
paragraph (e) is added to that subsection, to read:

497. 141 Licensing; general application procedures.--

(12)

(e)l. It is unlawful for any person regul ated under

chapter 395, chapter 400, or chapter 429, or any officer

adm nistrator, or board nenber of such entity if the entity is

a firm corporation, partnership, or association, or _any

person owning 5 percent or nore of such entity to conduct,

mai ntai n, manage, own, or operate a licensee under this

chapter.
2. This paragraph does not apply to a board nenber of

a corporation or organi zation requl ated under chapter 395,

chapter 400, or chapter 429 if the board nenber serves solely

in a voluntary capacity, does not reqularly take part in the

day-t o-day operational decisions of the corporation or

organi zation, receives no remuneration for his or her

services, and has no financial interest and has no famly

nenbers with a financial interest in the corporation or

or gani zati on.

Section 3. Section 497.143, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

497.143 Licensing; linmted licenses for retired
prof essi onal s. - -

(1) It is the intent of the Legislature that, absent a
threat to the health, safety, and welfare of the public, the
use of retired professionals in good standing to serve the
rtgent—underservet—or—e+tical—need—poputations—of this

2
4:08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 $2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN MDD DN P P PP, P PP
O © 0o N o o A~ W N P O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COWM TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

state during tines of critical need should be encouraged. To

that end, rules may be adopted to permt practice by retired
professionals as limted |licensees under this section

(2) For purposes of this section, the term"critica

need" neans:

(a)  An executive order fromthe Governor declaring a

state of energency in an area;

(b) A request fromthe director of the Division of

Ener gency Managenent, as state coordinating officer for the

state's conprehensi ve _energency nanagenent pl an

(c) A request fromthe Florida Energency Mrtuary

Oper ati ons Response System sponsored by the University of

Florida in collaboration with the Maples Center for Forensic

Medi ci ne;

(d) A request fromany district nedical examner; or

(e) Activation of a state continuity of operations

plan.

(3) 2 Any person desiring to obtain a limted
Iicense, when permtted by rule, shall submt to the
departnment an application and fee, not to exceed $300, and an
affidavit stating that the applicant has been |icensed to
practice in any jurisdiction in the United States for at |east
10 years in the profession for which the applicant seeks a
limted license. The affidavit shall also state that the
applicant has retired er—ntends—to—+etire fromthe practice
of that profession and intends to practice only pursuant to
the restrictions of the limted |icense granted pursuant to
this section. If the applicant for a limted license subnits a
notarized statenent fromthe enpl oyer stating that the
applicant will not receive nonetary conpensation for any
service involving the practice of her or his profession, the

3
4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN MDD DN PP P PP, PP PPk
R O © 0o N o o A~ W N P O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

appteattoen—and all |icensure fees shall be waived. In no
event may a person holding a limted license under this
section engage in preneed sal es under such I[imted |icense.

()3 Limted licensure nay be denied to an applicant
who has comritted, or is under investigation or prosecution
for, any act which would constitute the basis for discipline

under this chapter

(5) (4 H . : . . .
. I : . . . . .

. . . . . hiel I .
of—26—Y-S—Cc—561{e)(3)—of—thetnternal—Revenrve—Cotde—and—whi-eh
. : . S : .

of—the—+mted—+eensee— Alinmted |icensee may provide

services only during tinmes of to—theintdigent—underserved—or
critical need poepuratiens within the state. Fhe—standard—+for

(B6) 5> The departnent may provide by rule for

supervision of limted licensees to protect the health,
safety, and welfare of the public.

(76 Each applicant granted a limted license is
subject to all the provisions of this chapter under which the
limted license is issued which are not in conflict with this
section.

(8 Al limted licensees shall work for an entity

li censed under this chapter

Section 4. Section 497.162, Florida Statutes, is
anended to read:

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N MDD MDD DN P P PP PP PP
R O © 0o N o o A~ W N P O ©W 0 N o 0o~ WwWN B+ O

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

497.162 Health and safety education.--All individuals
not licensed under this chapter who intend to be enpl oyed as
operational personnel affiliated with a direct disposa
establishnent, cinerator facility, renoval service,
refrigeration facility, or centralized enbalmng facility, as
weH—as al |l nonlicensed individuals who intend to be invol ved
in the removal or transportation of human renai ns on behal f of

a funeral establishment, direct disposal establishment, or

cinerator facility, and once every 6 vears each person who is

not licensed under this chapter who is enployed by an entity

licensed under this chapter shall conplete one course approved

by the licensing authority on communi cabl e di seases, within 10
days after the date that they begin functioning as operationa
personnel on behal f of any entity that is regulated by this
chapter. The course shall not exceed 3 hours and shall be

of fered at approved | ocations throughout the state. Such

| ocations may include establishnents that are |icensed under
this chapter. The licensing authority shall adopt rules to

i mpl enent and enforce this provision, which rules shal

i ncl ude provisions that provide for the use of approved

vi deocassette courses and other types of audio, video, or hone
study courses to fulfill the continuing education requiremnments
of this section.

Section 5. Subsection (2) of section 497.260, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read

497.260 Ceneteries; exenption; investigation and
nmedi ation. - -

(2) Section 497.276(1) as to burial records, and ss.
497.152(1)(d), 497.164, 497.2765, 497.278, 497.280, and
497.284 apply to all cenmeteries in this state.

Section 6. Paragraph (g) of subsection (2) of section

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN DN DN P P PP, PP PR
b O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl orida Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 2856

Bar code 585068
497.271, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

497.271 Standards for construction and significant
alteration or renovati on of mausol euns and col unbari a. - -

(2) The licensing authority shall adopt, by no later
than July 1, 1999, rules establishing m nimum standards for
all newy constructed and significantly altered or renovated
mausol euns and col unbaria; however, in the case of significant
alterations or renovations to existing structures, the rules
shal | apply only, when physically feasible, to the newly
altered or renovated portion of such structures, except as
specified in subsection (4). In devel opi ng and adopti ng such
rules, the licensing authority may define different classes of
structures or construction standards, and may provide for
different rules to apply to each of said classes, if the
desi gnati on of classes and the application of different rules
isinthe public interest and is supported by findings by the
Iicensing authority based on evidence of industry practices,
econom ¢ and physical feasibility, location, or intended uses;
provi ded, that the rules shall provide m ni mum standards
applicable to all construction. For exanple, and wi thout
limting the generality of the foregoing, the licensing
authority may determine that a small single-story ground |eve
mausol eum does not require the same | evel of construction
standards that a large multistory mausol eum mi ght require; or
that a mausol eum |l ocated in a lowlying area subject to
frequent flooding or hurricane threats mght require different
standards than one | ocated on high ground in an area not
subj ect to frequent severe weather threats. The |icensing
authority shall develop the rules in cooperation with, and
with technical assistance from the Florida Building
Conmi ssi on of the Depart nent OE Conmunity Affairs, to ensure

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N DN N N NN DN DN P P PP PP PP PR
O © 0o N o o A W N PP O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

that the rules are in the proper formand content to be
i ncluded as part of the State M ni num Buil di ng Codes under
part VII of chapter 553. If the Florida Building Comission
advi ses that sone of the standards proposed by the |icensing
authority are not appropriate for inclusion in such building
codes, the licensing authority may choose to include those
standards in a distinct chapter of its rules entitled
"Non- Bui | di ng- Code St andards for Mausol euns” or "Additiona
St andards for Mausol euns," or other term nology to that
effect. If the Iicensing authority elects to divide the
standards into two or nore chapters, all such rules shall be
bi nding on |icensees and others subject to the jurisdiction of
the licensing authority, but only the chapter containing
provi sions appropriate for building codes shall be transmitted
to the Florida Building Cormmi ssion pursuant to subsection (3).
Such rules may be in the form of standards for design and
construction; nethods, materials, and specifications for
construction; or other mechani sms. Such rules shall enconpass,
at a mninum the foll ow ng standards:

(c) Such structure nust contain adequate provision for

drai nage and ventilation. Private or fanmly nausol euns with

all crypts bordering an exterior wall must contain pressure

relief ventilation fromthe crypts to the outside of the

mausol eum t hr ough the exterior wall.

Section 7. Subsection (1) of section 497.367, Florida
Statutes, is anended to read:

497.367 Instruction on H'V and AIDS, funeral directors
and enbal ners. - -

(1) Each person licensed as a funeral director or
enbal mer under this chapter shall be required to conplete an
approved continuing educati onal course on human

7
4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D DD N NN MDD DN P P PP, PP PRk
b O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O ©W 0o N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856

Bar code 585068
i mmunodefici ency virus and acquired i nmmune deficiency syndrone
as a prerequisite for every third biennial |icensure renewal

at—teast—every—2—years. The course shall consist of education

on the nodes of transm ssion, infection control procedures,

clinical managenent, and prevention of hunman i nmunodefi ci ency
virus and acquired i mune deficiency syndrome. Such course
shal | include information on current Florida | aw on acquired
i mmune deficiency syndrome and its inpact on testing,
confidentiality of test results, and treatnent of patients.
Section 8. Paragraph (b) of subsection (1) of section

497.374, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

497.374 Funeral directing; licensure as a funera
director by endorsenment; l|icensure of a tenporary funera
director. --

(1) The licensing authority shall issue a license by

endorsenent to practice funeral directing to an applicant who
has remtted a fee set by rule of the licensing authority not
to exceed $200 and who:

(b)1. Holds a valid license to practice funera
directing in another state of the United States, provided
that, when the applicant secured her or his original |icense,
the requirenents for licensure were substantially equival ent
to or nore stringent than those existing in this state; or

2. Meets the qualifications for licensure in s.

497. 373 and has;7—w-thirr—1o—years—prtor—to—the—date—of
appteatt+oen,- successfully conpleted a state, regional, or

nati onal exam nation in nortuary science, which, as determ ned
by rule of the licensing authority, is substantially
equi valent to or nore stringent than the exam nation given by
the licensing authority.

Section 9. Subsection (1) of section 497.550, Florida
4:08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 ° s2856d-ri 08-ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN MDD DN P P PP, P PP
O © 0o N o o A~ W N P O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856

Bar code 585068
Statutes, is anended to read

497.550 Licensure of nonument establishnents required;
procedures and criteria.--

(1) LICENSE REQUI RED. --No person shall conduct,
mai ntai n, nanage, or operate a nonunent establishnent in this
state unl ess the nonument establishnment is |icensed pursuant
to this part.

(a) The two categories of monunent establishment
l'icensure available in this state are:

1. Monunent buil der.

2. Mnunent retailer dealer

(b) An applicant for licensure as a nmonunent
establ i shnent shall designate on the application formthe
cat egory of nonument establishnent |icensure for which he or
she i s applying.

(c) Each nonunment establishnent that is |icensed under
this chapter at 11:59 p.m on Septenber 30, 2005, is, on and
after Cctober 1, 2005, licensed as a nonunent retailer deater
subject to the requirenents of this chapter. A person who
becomes |icensed as a nonunent retailer deater by operation of
this paragraph may apply to the board for licensure as a
nmonurrent bui | der and, upon payment of applicable application
fees and the granting of such application and |icensure as a
nmonurrent bui |l der, such person's |licensure as a nonument
retailer deater will expire.

(d) The requirements of this chapter apply to both
nonurent retailers deaters and nonunent buil ders, except as
provided in this paragraph. Each monument establishment shal
be a physical structure that is |ocated at a specific street
address, in conpliance with zoning regul ati ons of the
appropriate local government, and not |ocated on property that

9
4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN MDD DN PP P PP, PP PPk
O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O O 0o N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

is exenpt fromtaxation, but a nonunment retailer dealer nay
not otherw se be required to conply with s. 497.552 or be
subj ect to inspection under this chapter

(e) A nonument establishment that is not |icensed
under the nonunent-builder category is not eligible for a
preneed sal es |license.

Section 10. Section 497.609, Florida Statutes, is
created to read

497.609 Liability of direct disposers, direct disposa

establishnents, funeral directors, funeral establishnents, and

cinerator facilities regarding cremation.--1f a direct

di sposer, direct disposal establishnment, funeral director

funeral establishnent, or cinerator facility is qgiven a copy

of the deceased's declaration of intent to be cremated that is

signed by the deceased and the deceased's hunan renmins are

subsequently crennted, or a court order directing the

cremati on of the deceased's human remins, no person nay nmake

a claimobjecting to the cremati on agai nst that direct

di sposer, direct disposal establishment, funeral director

funeral establishnment, or cinerator facility. |If a direct

di sposer, direct disposal establishment, funeral director

funeral establishnment, or cinerator facility perfornms a

cremati on pursuant to the authorization of a leqgally

aut hori zed person who represents that she or he is not aware

of any objection to the cremation of the deceased's human

renanins by others in the sane class of the person neking the

representation or of any person in a higher priority class,

and the deceased's human remmi ns are subsequently crenmated, no

person may make a claimobjecting to the cremati on agai nst

that direct disposer, direct disposal establishnment, funera

director, funeral establishnment, or cinerator facility.
10
4:08 PM 04/ 05/07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN DN DN P PP PP P PR
O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ O

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

Section 11. Subsections (5) through (14) of section
553.36, Florida Statutes, are renunbered as subsections (6)
t hrough (15), respectively, present subsections (15) and (16)
are renunmbered as subsections (17) and (18), respectively, and
new subsections (5) and (16) are added to that section, to
read:

553.36 Definitions.--The definitions contained in this
section govern the construction of this part unless the
context otherw se requires.

(5) "Columbarium' neans a structure or building that

is substantially exposed above the ground and that is intended

to be used for the inurnment of cremated rennins.

(16) "Private nausol eur nmeans a nmausol eum as defi ned

in s. 497.005(40) for the private use of a famly or group of

fanm |y nenbers.

Section 12. Paragraphs (j) and (k) are added to
subsection (9) of section 553.73, Florida Statutes, to read:

553.73 Florida Building Code. --

(9) The follow ng buildings, structures, and
facilities are exenpt fromthe Florida Building Code as
provided by law, and any further exenptions shall be as
determ ned by the Legislature and provided by | aw

(j) Prefabricated or pre-assenbl ed col unbaria.

(k) Prefabricated or pre-assenbled private nmausol euns

that are not wal k-in

Wth the exception of paragraphs (a), (b), (c), and (f), in
order to preserve the health, safety, and welfare of the

public, the Florida Building Conm ssion nmay, by rul e adopted
pursuant to chapter 120, provide for exceptions to the broad
cat egori es of buildings exenptig in this section, including

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN MDD DN P P PP, PP PR Pk
b O © 0o N o o A W N PP O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856

Bar code 585068
exceptions for application of specific sections of the code or
standards adopted therein. The Department of Agriculture and
Consuner Services shall have exclusive authority to adopt by
rul e, pursuant to chapter 120, exceptions to nonresidentia
farm bui |l di ngs exenpted in paragraph (c) when reasonably
necessary to preserve public health, safety, and welfare. The
exceptions nmust be based upon specific criteria, such as
under-roof floor area, aggregate electrical service capacity,
HVAC system capacity, or other building requirenments. Further
t he conmi ssion may recomend to the Legislature additiona
categories of buildings, structures, or facilities which
shoul d be exempted fromthe Florida Building Code, to be
provi ded by | aw.

Section 13. Subsection (14) of section 316.515,
Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

316. 515 Maxi mum wi dt h, height, length.--

(14) MANUFACTURED BUI LDI NGS. - - The Depart ment of
Transportation may, in its discretion and upon application and
good cause shown therefor that the same is not contrary to the
public interest, issue a special permt for truck
tractor-semitrailer conmbinations where the total number of
overw dt h deliveries of manufactured buil dings, as defined in

s. 553.36(13) s—553—36(%2), may be reduced by permtting the

use of an overlength trailer of no nmore than 54 feet.

Section 14. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) and
subsection (5) of section 627.702, Florida Statutes, are
amended to read:

627.702 Valued policy law --

(1)(a) In the event of the total |oss of any building,
structure, nobile home as defined in s. 320.01(2), or
manuf actured building as defined in s. 553.36(13) s+

12
4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N NN N D N N NN MDD DN PP P PP, PP PR
O © 0o N o o A~ W N P O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007 COW TTEE ANMENDVENT
Bill No. SB 2856
Bar code 585068

553-36(32), located in this state and insured by any insurer
as to a covered peril, in the absence of any change increasing
the risk without the insurer's consent and in the absence of
fraudul ent or crimnal fault on the part of the insured or one
acting in her or his behalf, the insurer's liability under the
policy for such total loss, if caused by a covered peril
shall be in the ambunt of noney for which such property was so
i nsured as specified in the policy and for which a prem um has
been charged and pai d.

(5) This section does not apply as to persona
property or any interest therein, except with respect to
nmobi | e homes as defined in s. 320.01(2) or manufactured

buil dings as defined in s. 553.36(13) s—553—36{(%2-. Nor does

this section apply to coverage of an appurtenant structure or
ot her structure or any coverage or claimin which the dollar
amount of coverage available as to the structure involved is
not directly stated in the policy as a dollar anopunt
specifically applicable to that particular structure.

Section 15. This act shall take effect July 1, 2007.

—=============== T | T L E AMENDMENT ===============
And the title is anended as fol |l ows:

Del ete everything before the enacting cl ause

and insert:
A bill to be entitled
An act relating to funeral and cenetery
i ndustry regul ati on; amending s. 497.101, F.S.
conform ng a reference; anending s. 497.141,
F.S.; prohibiting certaag persons from

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN DN DN P P PP, PP PR
b O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007

Bill

No. SB 2856

Bar code 585068
conducti ng, naintaining, nanagi ng, owning, or
operating |icensees under ch. 479; providing an
exception; anending s. 497.143, F.S.; revising
regul ati on and practice of limted |icensees;
amending s. 497.162, F.S.; requiring certain
enpl oyees to periodically conplete a course on
conmuni cabl e di seases; anmending s. 497. 260,
F.S.; requiring that a provision relating to
the installation of nmonunents applies to al
ceneteries in the state; amending s. 497.271
F.S.; requiring that certain mausol euns contain
pressure relief ventilation; amending s.
497.367, F.S.; revising the frequency wth
whi ch |icensed funeral directors and enbal nmers
are required to conplete a continuing education
course on H'V and AIDS; anending s. 497.374,
F.S.; revising qualifications for |icensure by
endorsenent for funeral directors; anending s.
497.550, F.S.; replacing the term "nonunent
dealer” with "monument retailer"; creating s.
497.609, F.S.; providing freedomfromliability
for direct disposers, direct disposal
establ i shments, funeral directors, funera
establishments, and cinerator facilities
perform ng cremation under certain
ci rcumst ances; amending s. 553.36, F.S.
providi ng definitions; amending s. 553.73,
F.S.; providing exceptions to the Florida
Bui | di ng Code relating to colunbaria and
mausol euns; anendi ng ss. 316. 515 and 627. 702,

F.S.; conform ng cross-references; providing an
14

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07 s2856d-ri 08- ede

COW TTEE AMENDMENT




© 00 N O O b~ W N P

W W N N N D N N NN DN DN P P PP, PP PR
b O © 0o N o o A~ W N PP O ©W 0 N o o~ WwWN B+ o

Fl ori da Senate - 2007
Bill No. SB 2856

Bar code 585068

effective date.

4: 08 PM 04/ 05/ 07

15

COW TTEE AMENDMENT

s2856d-ri 08- ede




