0 J o oo w N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
277
28
29

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

A bill to be entitled
An act relating to education funding; creating part IX
of ch. 159, F.S.; providing a short title; providing a
purpose; providing definitions; requiring that the
State Board of Education establish a program for
allocating the state volume limitation imposed by the
Internal Revenue Code on qualified school
constructions bonds; requiring that the Department of
Education administer such program; providing criteria
for determining whether to grant a request for the
volume limitation; requiring that the department
annually determine the amount of qualified school
construction bonds permitted to be issued and make
such information available to the public; requiring
that any unused volume limitation at the end of each
calendar year be carried forward; requiring that the
State Board of Education and the Department of
Education adopt rules; amending s. 1001.20, F.S.;
requiring that the Office of Technology and
Information Services within the Office of the
Commissioner of Education assist school districts in
securing Internet access and telecommunications
services that are eligible for funding under the
Schools and Libraries Program of the federal Universal
Service Fund; creating s. 1001.271, F.S.; requiring
that the Commissioner of Education purchase the
nondiscounted portion of Internet access services for
the Florida Information Resource Network; requiring

each school district, the Florida School for the Deaf

Page 1 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

and the Blind, and the Regional Education Consortia
that are eligible for the e-rate to submit a
requisition to the commissioner for at least the same
level of Internet access services used in the 2008-
2009 fiscal year; requiring that each user of the
network identify the source of funds in its
requisition; amending s. 1001.28, F.S.; revising the
Department of Education’s duties regarding distance
learning; amending s. 1001.395, F.S.; requiring that
the salary of district school board members be the
same amount as the annual calculation or the
district’s beginning salary for teachers who hold
baccalaureate degrees, whichever is less, for a
specified period; amending s. 1001.42, F.S.; revising
provisions relating to the number of days that all
schools are required to operate; clarifying provisions
authorizing the payment of earned leave and benefits
accrued by a district school board employee before his
or her employment contract expires; amending s.
1001.451, F.S.; delaying the expiration of provisions
relating to the amount of funding distributed to each
school district and eligible member of a regional
consortium service organization; amending s. 1001.47,
F.S.; authorizing elected district school
superintendents to reduce their salary rates on a
voluntary basis; requiring that each elected district
school superintendent’s salary be reduced by 2 percent
for the 2009-2010 fiscal year; amending s. 1001.50,

F.S.; clarifying provisions authorizing the payment of

Page 2 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

earned leave and benefits accrued by a district school
superintendent before his or her employment contract
terminates; limiting the amount of remuneration that a
district school superintendent receives annually from
state funds; providing a definition for the term
“remuneration”; limiting the use of the
superintendent’s compensation in calculating benefits
under ch. 121, F.S.; encouraging district school
boards and superintendents to review the
superintendent’s annual remuneration for the 2009-2010
fiscal year and mutually agree to at least a 5 percent
reduction; amending s. 1002.37, F.S.; providing that
the Florida Virtual School may not receive additional
state funds for the purpose of fulfilling the class
size requirements; amending s. 1002.45, F.S.; revising
provisions relating to school district virtual
instruction programs; providing definitions;
authorizing school districts to offer virtual
instruction programs through various methods;
specifying additional requirements for providers of
virtual instruction programs; providing requirements
for retention of approved provider status; providing
requirements for school district contracts with
providers; revising student eligibility criteria for
enrollment in school district virtual instruction
programs; revising funding and reporting provisions;
revising assessment and accountability provisions for
approved providers; providing for publication of

school grades and school improvement ratings; revising

Page 3 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

88 contract termination requirements; deleting obsolete

89 provisions; requiring that the Department of Education

90 review and report on the advisability of authorizing

91 approved private providers to provide specified

92 virtual instruction programs; amending s. 1002.71,

93 F.S.; revising provisions relating to the funding of

94 prekindergarten programs; amending s. 1003.02, F.S.;

95 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;

96 amending s. 1003.03, F.S.; extending dates relating to

97 the calculation of the number of students for purposes

98 of complying with the maximum-class-size requirement;

99 providing duties for the Department of Education if
100 the department determines that the number of students
101 assigned to any individual class exceeds the class
102 size maximum; providing for the reduction of the
103 class-size-reduction operating categorical allocation
104 under certain circumstances; requiring that the
105 department prepare a simulated calculation; amending
106 s. 1004.55, F.S.; providing that the regional autism
107 center at Florida State University, which is currently
108 located at the Department of Communication Disorders,
109 be located at the College of Medicine at Florida State
110 University; amending s. 1006.06, F.S.; providing that
111 universal school breakfast programs be offered only in
112 schools in which 80 percent or more of the students
113 are eligible for free or reduced price meals; revising
114 provisions relating to school breakfast programs to
115 include state allocations; amending s. 1006.21, F.S.;
116 revising provisions relating to the duties of district

Page 4 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
117 school superintendents and district school boards
118 regarding transportation; requiring that contiguous
119 school districts make provisions for reciprocal
120 policies and agreements for contracts for school bus
121 transportation services, inspections, and screening
122 requirements for public schools and public charter
123 schools; amending s. 1006.28, F.S.; clarifying the
124 definition of the term “adequate instructional
125 materials”; amending s. 1006.40, F.S.; revising
126 provisions relating to the use of the instructional
127 materials allocation; authorizing the Commissioner of
128 Education to waive for certain schools within a
129 district a requirement to purchase current
130 instructional materials; amending s. 1007.25, F.S.;
131 prohibiting public postsecondary educational
132 institutions from conferring an associate in arts or
133 baccalaureate degree upon any student who fails to
134 successfully complete certain requirements; providing
135 for a waiver and appeal process for students who have
136 a specific learning disability; requiring that each
137 public postsecondary educational institution establish
138 a committee to consider requests for such waivers;
139 providing for committee membership; repealing s.
140 1008.29, F.S., relating to the college-level
141 communication and mathematics skills examination;
142 amending s. 1008.41, F.S.; authorizing rather than
143 requiring the Commissioner of Education to employ the
144 Florida Information Resource Network to perform
145 certain functions relating to workforce education;

Page 5 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
146 creating s. 1010.06, F.S.; prohibiting the Division of
147 Public Schools within the Department of Education from
148 using state funds appropriated by the Legislature to
149 pay indirect costs to a university, community college,
150 school district, or other entity; amending s. 1010.11,
151 F.S.; authorizing each district school board,
152 community college board of trustees, and university
153 board of trustees to electronically transfer funds for
154 payment; amending s. 1011.09, F.S.; prohibiting a
155 district school board from using funds for out-of-
156 state travel, cellular phones, cellular phone service,
157 personal digital assistants, or any other mobile
158 wireless communication device or service through any
159 means, unless otherwise specifically approved by the
160 district school board; amending s. 1011.18, F.S.;
161 authorizing a district school superintendent to
162 transfer funds from a district school depository to
163 pay expenses, expenditures, or other disbursements if
164 proper documentation is provided; amending s. 1011.60,
165 F.S.; revising the minimum requirements for the
166 Florida Education Finance Program relating to the term
167 of operation; amending s. 1011.61, F.S.; redefining
168 the term “full-time equivalent student”; amending s.
169 1011.62, F.S.; requiring that a student who is
170 enrolled in study hall not be included in the
171 calculation of full-time equivalent student membership
172 for funding purposes; revising requirements for
173 calculating the district required local effort;
174 revising the requirements for the Department of

Page 6 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
175 Revenue with respect to certification of taxable value
176 as reflected by final administrative actions of the
177 value adjustment board; providing for calculating a
178 prior period funding adjustment millage in addition to
179 the required local effort millage; providing
180 definitions; extending a date relating to categorical
181 funds for instructional materials; deleting provisions
182 relating to the total allocation of state funds to
183 each district for current operation for the FEFP;
184 repealing s. 1011.68(7), F.S., relating to funds for
185 student transportation; removing a provision that
186 authorizes a district school board to transfer funds
187 to its Florida Education Finance Program; amending s.
188 1011.685, F.S.; revising provisions relating to class
189 size reduction operating categorical funds; repealing
190 s. 1011.69(4) (b), relating to funds that are excluded
191 from the school-level allocation under the Equity in
192 School-Level Funding Act; amending s. 1011.71, F.S.;
193 revising certain provisions relating to the district
194 school tax; waiving the three-fourths limit for
195 certain lease-purchase agreements for a specified
196 period; authorizing a district school board to levy an
197 additional millage for fixed capital outlay under
198 certain circumstances; authorizing a district school
199 board to levy, by a super majority vote, an additional
200 millage for critical capital outlay needs or operating
201 needs, subject to approval of the electors at the next
202 general election; authorizing the Commissioner of
203 Education to waive the equal-dollar reduction in

Page 7 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
204 Florida Education Finance Program funds if he or she
205 finds that a school district acted in good faith;
206 amending s. 1012.33, F.S.; revising provisions
207 relating to contracts for instructional staff;
208 advising a district school board not to enter into a
209 new professional service contract if the only
210 available funds are from nonrecurring Federal
211 Stabilization Funds; amending s. 1012.59, F.S.;
212 revising provisions relating to fees for educator
213 certification; amending s. 1012.71, F.S.; authorizing
214 the Department of Education to conduct a pilot program
215 to determine the feasibility of managing the Florida
216 Teachers Lead Program through a centralized electronic
217 system; providing requirements for such pilot program;
218 providing that participation in the pilot program is
219 voluntary; authorizing the department to limit the
220 number of participants to adequately test the
221 viability of the pilot program; amending s. 1013.37,
222 F.S.; requiring that the standards for new school
223 construction, remodeling, and renovation projects be
224 limited to certain minimum standards for construction
225 of educational facilities in the Florida Building Code
226 and the State Requirements for Educational Facilities;
227 providing for future expiration; amending s. 1013.62,
228 F.S.; revising the criteria for determining a charter
229 school’s eligibility for capital outlay funding;
230 amending s. 1013.64, F.S.; revising certain
231 limitations on the use of nonvoted millage for school
232 district capital projects; requiring that the school

Page 8 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




233
234
235
236
237
238
239
240
241
242
243
244
245
246
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

districts of Wakulla County and Liberty County
contribute specific millage amounts to the cost of
current special facilities projects for specified
fiscal years; repealing s. 9, chapter 2008-142, Laws
of Florida; abrogating the expiration of certain
amendments relating to categorical funding for the
operation of schools; providing for implementation of
specified appropriations; providing for the
incorporation by reference of certain calculations
used by the Legislature for the 2009-2010 fiscal year;

providing an effective date.

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

Section 1. Part IX of chapter 159, Florida Statutes,
consisting of sections 159.841, 159.842, 159.843, 159.844, and
159.845, is created to read:

PART IX
QUALIFIED SCHOOL CONSTRUCTION BONDS
159.841 Short title.—This part may be cited as the “Florida

Qualified School Construction Bond Allocation Act.”

159.842 Purpose.—The purpose of this part is to allocate

the state volume limitation imposed by s. 54F (d) of the code on

qualified school construction bonds to finance qualified school

construction facilities. Any bond issued which uses a portion of

the limitation imposed by s. 54F(d) (1)of the code, or uses a

portion of the limitation reallocated to the state pursuant to

s. 54F (d) (2) (D) of the code, may not be issued in this state

unless a written confirmation therefor is issued pursuant to

Page 9 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
262 this part.
263 159.843 Definitions.—As used in this part, the term:
264 (1) “Board” means the State Board of Education, created
265 pursuant to s. 2, Art. IX of the State Constitution.
266 (2) “Code” means the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as

267 amended, and the regulations and rulings issued thereunder.

268 (3) “Commissioner” means the Commissioner of Education.

269 (4) “Department” means the Department of Education, created

2701 pursuant to s. 20.15.

271 (5) “Issued” has the same meaning as in the code.

272 (6) “Qualified school construction bond” means a bond

273 described in s. 54F(a) of the code.

274 (7) “Qualified school construction facility” means a

275 facility permitted to be financed with qualified school

276 construction bonds pursuant to s. 54F (a) of the code.

277 159.844 Allocation of state volume limitation.—

278 (1) The board shall establish a program for allocating the

279 state volume limitation imposed by s. 54F(d) (1) of the code, or
280 reallocated to the state pursuant to s. 54F(d) (2) (D) of the

281 code, on qualified school construction bonds to finance

282| qualified school construction facilities. The Department of

283| Education shall administer the program for allocation of the

284 state volume limitation pursuant to an application and issuance

285 reporting process. Such program must include objective criteria

286| to be considered in determining whether to grant a request for

287 the volume limitation, including, but not limited to, the need

288 for a qualified school construction facility in the area

289| proposed in the application, the number of students to be served

290| by such facility, and the cost-effectiveness of the proposed

Page 10 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

291 facility.
292 (2) The department shall annually determine the amount of

293| qualified school construction bonds permitted to be issued in

294 this state under s. 54F(d) (1) of the code and shall make such

295 information available upon request to any person or agency.

296 (3) The department shall ensure that any volume limitation

297 that is unused at the end of each calendar year is carried

298 forward pursuant to s. 54F (e) of the code.

299 (4) The commissioner shall sign any certificate required by

300 the code which relates to the allocation of the state volume

301| limitation on qualified school construction bonds to finance

302| qualified school construction facilities.

303 159.845 Rules.—The board and the department shall adopt any
304 rules necessary to ensure the orderly implementation of this

305| part.

306 Section 2. Paragraph (a) of subsection (4) of section

307 1001.20, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

308 1001.20 Department under direction of state board.—

309 (4) The Department of Education shall establish the

310 following offices within the Office of the Commissioner of

311 Education which shall coordinate their activities with all other
312 divisions and offices:

313 (a) Office of Technology and Information Services.—

314| Responsible for developing a systemwide technology plan, making
315| budget recommendations to the commissioner, providing data

316 collection and management for the system, assisting school

317 districts in securing Internet access and telecommunications

318 services, including those eligible for funding under the Schools

319| and Libraries Program of the federal Universal Service Fund, and

Page 11 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

320 coordinating services with other state, local, and private

321 agencies. The office shall develop a method to address the need
322 for a statewide approach to planning and operations of library
323| and information services to achieve a single K-20 education

324| system library information portal and a unified higher education
325 library management system. The Florida Virtual School shall be
326| administratively housed within the office.

327 Section 3. Section 1001.271, Florida Statutes, 1s created
328 to read:

329 1001.271 Florida Information Resource Network.—Upon

330 requisition by school districts, community colleges,

331 universities, or other eligible users of the Florida Information

332 Resource Network, the Commissioner of Education shall purchase

333 the nondiscounted portion of Internet access services,

334 including, but not limited to, circuits, encryption, content

335 filtering, support, and any other services needed for the

336| effective and efficient operation of the network. For the 2009-

337 2010 fiscal year, each school district, the Florida School for
338 the Deaf and the Blind, and the Regional Education Consortia

339| eligible for the e-rate must submit a requisition to the

340 Commissioner of Education for at least the same level of

341 Internet access services used through the Florida Information

342 Resource Network contract in the 2008-2009 fiscal year. Each

343| wuser shall identify in its requisition the source of funds from

344 which the commissioner is to make payments.

345 Section 4. Subsection (2) of section 1001.28, Florida

346 Statutes, is amended to read:

347 1001.28 Distance learning duties.—The duties of the

348 Department of Education concerning distance learning include,

Page 12 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




349
350
351
352
353
354
355
356
357
358
359
360
361
362
363
364
365
366
367
368
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376
377

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

but are not limited to, the duty to:

(2) Coordinate the use of existing resources, including,
but not limited to, the state’s satellite transponders en—the
k, the Florida

WO
WO

Information Resource Network (FIRN), the Florida Knowledge

£ Onryrrandt na anA +h Nernagrtrmandt £ Ol A Al Tioayea 1
O O CCTTrotr sy ot ot~ oS pPparcitCitc —O=* T O CT ot T ottty
(QANEVS TR WN 4 o+ 11 + PPN R RN A = n £oa~2 7 + o+ ISEEE G SWANE Y —
oC T v ICCS S cCTrrrcC oMo rCaoc O raCc T rroctrCs coOoSupporc o

learning initiatives network.

Nothing in this section shall be construed to abrogate,
supersede, alter, or amend the powers and duties of any state
agency, district school board, community college board of
trustees, university board of trustees, the Board of Governors,
or the State Board of Education.

Section 5. Subsection (3) 1is added to section 1001.395,
Florida Statutes, as amended by section 1 of chapter 2009-3,
Laws of Florida, to read:

1001.395 District school board members; compensation.—

(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of this section and s.

145.19, for the 2009-2010 fiscal year, the salary of each

district school board member shall be the amount calculated

pursuant to subsection (1) or the district’s beginning salary

for teachers who hold baccalaureate degrees, whichever is less.

Section 6. Paragraph (a) of subsection (12) and subsection
(25) of section 1001.42, Florida Statutes, as created by section
2 of chapter 2009-3, Laws of Florida, are amended to read:

1001.42 Powers and duties of district school board.—The

Page 13 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

378 district school board, acting as a board, shall exercise all
379| powers and perform all duties listed below:

380 (12) FINANCE.—Take steps to assure students adequate

381| educational facilities through the financial procedure

382| authorized in chapters 1010 and 1011 and as prescribed below:
383 (a) Provide for all schools to operate at—deast 180 days.—
384 Provide for the operation of all public schools, both elementary
385 and secondary, as free schools for a term of at—Feast 180 days
386| or the equivalent on an hourly basis as specified by rules of
387 the State Board of Education; determine district school funds
388| necessary in addition to state funds to operate all schools for
389 such minimum term; and arrange for the levying of district

390 school taxes necessary to provide the amount needed from

391| district sources.

392 (25) EMPLOYMENT CONTRACTS.—6r—eorafter February—1,—2000, A

393 district school board may not enter into an employment contract
394| +that—ds—funded—fromstate—funds—and that requires the district

395 to pay from state funds an employee an amount in excess of 1

396 year of the employee’s annual salary for termination, buy-out,

397 or any other type of contract settlement. This subsection does

398 not prohibit the payment of earned leave and benefits in

399| accordance with the district’s leave and benefits policies which

400 were accrued by the employee before the contract terminates.

401 Section 7. Paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of section

402 1001.451, Florida Statutes, 1s amended to read:

403 1001.451 Regional consortium service organizations.—In
404 order to provide a full range of programs to larger numbers of

405 students, minimize duplication of services, and encourage the

406| development of new programs and services:

Page 14 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




407
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416
417
418
419
420
421
422
423
424
425
426
427
428
429
430
431
432
433
434
435

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

(2)

(c) Notwithstanding paragraph (a), the appropriation for
the 2009-2010 2668-2689 fiscal year may be less than $50,000 per
school district and eligible member. If the amount appropriated
is insufficient to provide $50,000, the funds available must be
prorated among all eligible districts and members. This
paragraph expires July 1, 2010 26695.

Section 8. Subsections (6) and (7) are added to section
1001.47, Florida Statutes, to read:

1001.47 District school superintendent; salary.—

(6) Notwithstanding the provisions of this section and s.

145.19, elected district school superintendents may reduce their

salary rate on a voluntary basis.

(7) Notwithstanding the provisions of this section and s.

145.19, for the 2009-2010 fiscal year the salary of each elected

district school superintendent calculated pursuant to s. 1001.47

shall be reduced by 2 percent.

Section 9. Subsection (2) of section 1001.50, Florida
Statutes, as amended by section 3 of chapter 2009-3, Laws of
Florida, 1s amended, and subsections (5) and (6) are added to
that section, to read:

1001.50 Superintendents employed under Art. IX of the State
Constitution.—

(2) The district school board of each of such districts
shall enter into contracts of employment with the district

school superintendent and shall adopt rules relating to his or

her appointment; however, emr—er—after February1+—2009+ the
district school board may not enter into an employment contract

that—is—funded—fromstate—funds—and that requires the district

Page 15 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

436 to pay from state funds a superintendent an amount in excess of

437 1 year of the superintendent’s annual salary for termination,
438| buy-out, or any other type of contract settlement. This

439| subsection does not prohibit the payment of earned leave and

440 benefits in accordance with the district’s leave and benefits

441 policies which were accrued by the superintendent before the

442 contract terminates.

443 (5) Notwithstanding any other law, resolution, or rule to

444 the contrary, a district school superintendent employed under

445| this section may not receive more than $225,000 in remuneration

446| annually from state funds. As used in this subsection, the term

4477 “remuneration” means salary, bonuses, and cash-equivalent

448 compensation paid to a district school superintendent by his or

449| her employer for work performed, excluding health insurance

450| benefits and retirement benefits. Only compensation, as defined

451 in s. 121.021(22), provided to a district school superintendent

452| may be used in calculating benefits under chapter 121.

453 (6) District school boards and superintendents employed

454| pursuant to this section are encouraged to review the

455 superintendent’s annual remuneration for the 2009-2010 fiscal

456 year and mutually agree to a reduction of at least 5 percent.

457 Section 10. Paragraph (g) of subsection (3) of section
458 1002.37, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

459 1002.37 The Florida Virtual School.—

460 (3) Funding for the Florida Virtual School shall be

461| provided as follows:

462 (g) The Florida Virtual School shall receive additional

463 state funds as may be provided in the General Appropriations

464 Act; however, such funds may not be provided for the purpose of

Page 16 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




465
466
467
468
469
470
471
472
473
474
475
476
477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487
488
489
490
491
492
493

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

fulfilling the class size requirements in ss. 1003.03 and
1011.685.
Section 11. Section 1002.45, Florida Statutes, 1s amended

to read:
1002.45 School district virtual instruction programs.-—
(1) PROGRAM.—

(a) For purposes of this section, the term:

1. “Approved provider” means a provider that is approved by

the Department of Education under subsection (2), the Florida

Virtual School, or a franchise of the Florida Virtual School.

2. “Wirtual instruction program” means a program of

instruction provided in an interactive learning environment

created through technology in which students are separated from

their teachers by time or space, or both, and in which a

Florida-certified teacher under chapter 1012 is responsible for

at least:

a. Fifty percent of the direct instruction to students in

kindergarten through grade 5; or

b. Eighty percent of the direct instruction to students in

grades 6 through 12.
(b)4&)> Beginning with the 2009-2010 school year, each

school district shall provide eligible students within its
boundaries the option of participating in a virtual instruction
program. The purpose of the program is to make instruction
available to students using online and distance learning
technology in the nontraditional classroom. The program shall

be:

1. provide—ir a—+e Full-time for students

H-
H-

enrolled in £ tgat—eobvrses—in kindergarten through

Page 17 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

494 grade 12. &8

495 2. o¥—3n Full-time or part-time for students enrolled in

496| dropout prevention and academic intervention programs under s.

497 1003.53 or Department of Juvenile Justice education programs

498| under s. 1003.52 wirtwat—eewrses in grades 9 through 12 as

499 ER Rl SWNE N - B I =S SNENE PN 2N 1Sy (T (~)
o trfO T T2 CC T PatftagTtaopit— (7 (S .

500 (c) To provide students with the option of participating in

501 virtual instruction programs as required by paragraph (b),

502 aschool district may:

503 1. Contract with the Florida Virtual School or establish a

504| franchise of the Florida Virtual School for the provision of a

505| program under paragraph (b). Using this option is subject to the
506 requirements of this section and s. 1011.61(1) (c)1l.b.(III) and
507 (IV) .

508 2. Contract with an approved provider under subsection (2)

509| for the provision of a full-time program under subparagraph

510 (b)l. or a full-time or part-time program under subparagraph
511 (b)2.
512 3. Enter into an agreement with another school district to

513| allow the participation of its students in an approved virtual

514 instruction program provided by the other school district. The

515 agreement must indicate a process for the transfer of funds

516 required by paragraph (7) (b).
517

518 Contracts under subparagraph 1. or subparagraph 2. may include

519| multidistrict contractual arrangements that may be executed by a

520 regional consortium for its member districts. A multidistrict

521 contractual arrangement or an agreement under subparagraph 3. is

522 not subject to s. 1001.42(4) (d) and does not require the

Page 18 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




523
524
525
526
527
528
529
530
531
532
533
534
535
536
537
538
539
540
541
542
543
544
545
546
547
548
549
550
551

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

participating school districts to be contiguous.

()Y T A~k o~k 1 diactrra -l o <79 4101 AWk SV T Sl BN N ST NPt SR SN SNk 3

\E> 10T C°TT [ ) i W4 W g |\ S WD iy U S S W w [=J A" S S U W & p uy LT o CIOaOCTTImUIT t/J_U\jJ_(_AllI. T
oo ot + ~ o~ o la +had oo Ner bt~ ey 4+ Al ot g ~+
CUThHho 1o T g 1T g o1 [N I A W AW gu Sy ) CITTO T L& R VLJ [ Sy e By A8 J\J_Y CTIT |\ N SRS I WS SR S W Sy
r cornt vt A N~z AN A~ A TNy 4+ Nernar+tmandt £
7 J\J_Y AN i R U iy &P B Wy wey A8 LJJ_VV_L\A 10 LA.LJLJJ_VV oL M_Y CTIT 7 LJLA.J_ CTIT T g

EIESNR 2 T B i B [ AP VN RV — R Do o i SN — SNy~ Ar o whi ol oz 2 aa A
T o rcratroct rot Concrattoor artaagemCicsy W CIrr— Ity e oo
oaant o~ o ot Iy o voag Al A A oAt e LA 9o s e
COoOcrat Tt ottt oy o oot O soOTrocToltr £t O T oo ot T
A1 at v ~+ o + nrasza A il A o

STttt CtTtoy CO—PTrovIOC—SutCi—pPTrogTdittsS -

(d)4e> A charter school may enter into a joint agreement

with the school district in which it is located for the charter

school’s students to participate in the an—appreoved—distriet

school district’s virtual instruction program.

(2) PROVIDER QUALIFICATIONS.—on—er—beforeMareh—31—2009;
EREW RN T B A I SWNE P NN S NS
ot ooy cactr ottty

(a) The department shall annually provide school districts
with a list of providers approved to offer virtual instruction
programs. a eewmtraet provider
must ammgatty document that it:

l.4&)> Is nonsectarian in its programs,

To be approved by the department,

admission policies,
employment practices, and operations;

2.4k Complies with the antidiscrimination provisions of s.
1000.05;

3.4e) Locates an administrative office or offices in this
state, requires its administrative staff to be state residents,
and requires all instructional staff members to be Florida-

certified teachers under chapter 1012, and conducts background

screenings for all employees or contracted personnel, as

1012.32,

required by s. using state and national criminal

history records;

Page 19 of 75

words underlined are additions.




Second Engrossed

CS for CS for SB 1676

20091676e2

n|l o - o P
H ol < O # P D
o~ @ o P (@] 0] q H @ n n H ¢ .
9] D 0] < Tl < O ~ D ® o] [0} ® @ uwp
B ) — < O al L -+ h =% s} ) o S T
a H —| O »n © 0 H m © a . b HoS
o 0 D ol & T| < NENY) D D ¢ P wnl A o 4D .
o O O, O O| T a (@] n 0|l - D & M 0| ~ in] D -H (VI
=3 gl g| ®© —| | £ N H P < -H S b o
[T & Hl 0| ®© al O] o] & ) ® T| < O 4D n P
O 0 D op @] > 9] (@] @] @] O [9)] N D 0] QO O 0] Ul D
! o| al o| -+ 4o < O h = S e D D
“H - o a “ O o 0 @] @] HORES | o| +# ~ [99] — - =
o O [99) ol Q| H| O ®wn|l »nl vl O oo D D SIS O] [09) D o
) - @ -H| gl L | - < @ D & Q| m©| T n Y D a9
o < — D Pl H | el Wl Tl v [ L 4P ol Qf -H -H D @ g4 O
O O — © L Ol g| O] © of @ O ol O] > | 4 HOJEN( D O
(oI & -H| | -H| O| O I R D o ¢ T| O <| # -Hw P X
0] B O Oo| T O al| - o| + o)l D [9)] “ (@] P [
-~ g H ® @] @] O H Oo| © © D i) 0] o) -H 4 D B
~ o ® n| 1S o| Tl -H 0] (NI @ ~ -~ g P D H ® Z
o A L D [9)] @] O (el S ~ 0| Al ® [o9] i 0] 0| © O, B D O
o, < P & n O a @ © O | T D — a < ] @ »Hoop H
b -H < (@] -— @] o O ¢ n D - H P )] B HO)J kY T H
0] ~ — he c| O -~ n Ol « 0] ~ D D © (@] D - H O
O D “ a a| P - @] — O W ORI o P [99] n [99] > > D D
— ORI F 0| @ O @ O | H -l O © ¢ O F O O ©| Al 4 D 0
i} ~ D D, G -~ (@] n @] o| « H [ SRS < @ H ® D H
H O & Ploal gl O o] < O (RS o~ ol O D (OTIEO)) n
n D i} @] O (@] O a — D D © | O a i (ORI S
n o - ~ O -H| -H n|l nl o Oo| T | -1 ¢ Ol H D ® fH e H
O T ® ol P nl n cl Al gl < 4 ® D ®©| O —| O| D ¢
O o o8 ~ € ©| | & > ®© | ©f O] ® W D S| o -t ~ 1 P g
O E D U D O | A 94| | © | -H D ® & wl | nl wnl P ¢ [ <
3 -H P S H| g] nl © o Hl wnl o O D O @ L P D N D
() ~ # & P L T g o0 Ll < O 4 O D & P U M| 4 o - D S K
> )] D 4P 0] o| + cl | O ol n D D 0] O] —~ O H @ D ™
< Yy B H O > 4l O © O 0wl O | N -4 H P T| P ®© & O H T H
94 © [ TR ] Qo 0 P gl B n g o & N H F& A H| —| O D -H >
o D [OR D O cl »n 0] Ol < O a ® D ® > © IS | 9] D 1
- a 0} L O | O —| = nl o & -4 D ¢} S| oAl P QO P D H
4 O [ 1§ B ()] Al O] | in} g O nh 4l v o 5 B ¢ O
o, £ -rH D + al L - 0] nl H H D D UH D Q) M @ o @ 0 o, H
0] o8 D -4 O| ®© T| 4| S| O O ) D o] 4| O] q [0
n o #$ T -—H| O O] | = T| 4 B D T| 0| O N - n & P H
0] 0] ® ~ o - O -H G c a B A o 0] > ®© ® -H - o 0
0 h & 4 -4 O] =| < N P O] ®© D D H > S| on ¢ H
n O o O] D O O ®w O n| 4| -H w @O -d D O m| ® | ©® #» [
o P b -H O g| «l o -+ 4l o] L H b P P 4 o ® ot
) N B P © 3| < g wl O =| ®© © D 4 @ of W -t D B oop g
n 0 -H DO O P ®wl O H|l S| & ¢ -H W Q] O 4| < H O « O
o o PP Of - -Hl S| O] O O # ¥ O ¢ ®© O L D -H ® q O
TR ) - D & H O] < g| O ol o] H )] D T| T| H|l & O (@ I
. S T R 15 0wl 4l P gl | Ll vl | L n ¢ g O 4| = D ¢ & D O
3 D h —| Pl g| O n| © D D D | H| B o ® D f W
@] ® @ (@] - (0] O > N < [ —H [ T ] > 4 -
@) A+~ O - o| 0| & 4l 0 gl @ P o~ O H| | ~ n 4 .~
. 7 - . 7 <l O] 0] v ©o o a O ¢ W H ¢ Q| O © o P L P 0 o
<l 0 T 4 ¢ | O > | B o 4 L » g4 ¢ - — > gl T LB ~
c -H & wn| gl ol ol g o o & ¢ = W O ©| O] O o
- @b Pl 4] O O H| V| H| P 0 RS o409
—~ O s T| 4] 9 S| O -l ® i O ¢ @ S P 0 v
(o R D YH ol ol g| O] o] of o ¢ D @ D © ol o O D @ &
O ®© » D ol =l Hl vl vl Ol = ol  #H b « Wl © P % -H P
N O TN O >~ 0 OO0 4 N MO S 10 W > 0w o0 O 4 N M S 0 W~ W o o
0N 0 O W0 W W w0 W W W W W YW WO o ~~I~N~>~>~N>~N>~M>~ >~ @
TN To N To N To NN To Yo N To NN To NN To BN To N To NN To NN To NNTo NN To NN To NN To NN To NENTo NENTo NENTo NTo NENTo NN To NENTo NENTo NENTo NENTo BENTe)

Page 20 of 75

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

4

CODING




581
582
583
584
585
586
587
588
589
590
591
592
593
594
595
596
597
598
599
600
601
602
603
604
605
606
607
608
609

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

REQUIREMENTS.—Each school district virtual instruction program

under this section eperatedorecontracted by a schootldistriet

must:
.

() P o ~11 EIEAW-R SIS T F SI EENENE N P F SN = S = 2N it £2 A

\LA.I S %U_LJ_ | g TTTOo C I OOC T ITUTIT T o C O [y Ly \—y [ S U S S A8
profoaas ~no Azt~ ndeor Aot~ 107D
t/J_UJ_\.,uu_LUJ.J.u_L A T T T OO | I i A 5 o pllut/k.,\.,J_ [N S W

TAZNAY Condiratr o Whao~lroca A o N3 e £ 11 mr] o r

\E A\ B AW B W Uy w U LJLA\./J\\jJ.\JLAll\J. Ov.LCCLL_LLL\j . - @ N S =y CLLLPLU_YCCQ . -
coantrantaA Ao A A S v A s o 1012 29 o e ot o4 S A
CUoUTTC 1O T TTT™ tJC.LnJ\JlLLLCL, o _LC\.:I_LAL.LC\A LJ_Y =] [ S W . I LAnJLll\j o C OO CT (@ yaw
At 3 "l Arama ]l e o~y A~ Ao
3 L & N U S N iy i @ R |\ S ) ) o S A iy @5 R LJ.LLJL,\J.L_Y ESANSLU LW S W )

(a)+e> Align virtual course curriculum and course content
to the Sunshine State Standards under s. 1003.41.

(b) 4y Offer instruction that is designed to enable a
student to gain proficiency in each virtually delivered course
of study.

(c)+4e)r Provide each student enrolled in the program with

all the necessary instructional materials.

(d) £+ Provide, when appropriate, each heuseheldhaving—a

full-time student enrolled in the program with:

1. All equipment necessary for participants in the school
district virtual instruction program, including, but not limited
to, a computer, computer monitor, and printer; and

2. Access to or reimbursement for all Internet services
necessary for online delivery of instruction.

(e)Her Not require tuition or student registration fees.

(4) CONTRACT REQUIREMENTS PROGRAM—CAPACTITY;—ENROLLMENT.—

Each contract with an approved provider must at minimum:

(a) Set forth a detailed curriculum plan that illustrates

how students will be provided services to attain proficiency in

the Sunshine State Standards.

(b) Provide a method for determining that a student has

Page 21 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




610
611
612
613
614
615
616
617
618
619
620
621
622
623
624
625
626
627
628
629
630
631
632
633
634
635
636
637
638

CS for CS for SB 1676

satisfied the requirements for graduatio

Second Engrossed

20091676e2

n in s. 1003.428, s.

1003.429, or s. 1003.43 if the contract

is for the provision of

a full-time virtual instruction program

to students in grades 9

through 12.

(c) Specify a method for resolving conflicts among the
parties.

(d) Specify authorized reasons for termination of the
contract.

(e) Require the approved provider to be responsible for all

debts of the school district wvirtual ins

truction program if the

contract 1s not renewed or 1s terminated.

(f) Require the approved provider to comply with all
requirements of this section. Beginping—with—the 20102011
a~h 1 PIANENEYS oot A At oo fLoarand Wy +1 o] ra Ao 73 a1
o o TTOOU T _YCDL.L, CA\./CtJL_ [ S A\AW AU I Hye L wye) A\ S S W E WSl W 8 LJ_Y T (LI S U g S SR W 4 @& § A= S S U W i & R =y
S~ 1 1am A~ o 1N0N2 27 ENEP I = 1 Al ot g~ o7 A 2 N Ao + 1
[ AN I B W A W | I i AW & e [y 1T . J 7 I (& [ ANV I B W A W g |\ N EUUD I WS S S W TITTE o TTITTTCOC T T ToO O T
nrallmant £ 2+ £.-71 + 2 xz3 a1 Trnat e~ o D N NP N SN 2
CTIT IO 1T T T O [ S N [ S - [ S U Ry S C I [ S S U U iy & Ry Y LT1TTO T OCTTITOUTT t/J_UgJ_(_/LJ.I.L 1T
zoA~ oo £ S+ g r o~k ] iz ner~l Tmanrnt+ 19047 oo +1h PN NP L 2o
Ay A2 AN g [ S - t/J__LUJ_ [NV I L WA W AN & R CIT OO T T TT O T 1T T0 0 T t/J_UgJ_(_/LJ.I.L
for +h Nratzrl ~A1re o~y 1 PYANENE VS B NP BN — NP B S B~ ~ N e | £ N~
[ S T tJ.LCV_LULAQ [ Y i A WA W g =y _YCQL.L =) \J.CQ_L\jllDLL_C\J. W I CTT (=8 \j.LDL\J.C o <77
maltine ot afant g A~ Ao r ettty 19 A 4 a~h 1 ocraAda e
lllul\_Lll\j QQLL__LQ_LQL\JL_U.L_Y tJ.L\J\j.LCQQ, A\ = O T T TCTTIT | i W o T [ Y i A W AW g =y \j.LDL\J._Lll\j
aszatam ez a A 4 o 10N0Q 24
Q_YQL_CJ.II. tJ.L\JV_L\J.C\J. LTT O e LT U U U« I T«

(5) STUDENT ELIGIBILITY.—A student may enroll in a

Enroliment in a sehool—distrietr virtual

provided by the school strict

in which he or she resides

instruction program

is

i
a2 Aa
T

n

B

+han
T

He-

+124
[Speavs

qar

Iy
L\

(0]
[00]

A ot o
1o T T

7
Al

1

<+

N
=yl -

[00]
T

=17

!

T i g s e T

o
3
W

tuden t

0]

ee

0]

a

@

conditions:

(a)

attendance at a public school in this st

ast one of the following

The student has spent the prior school year in

ate and was enrolled and

reported by a public school district for funding during the

Page 22 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

words underlined are additions.




639
640
641
642
643
644
645
646
647
648
649
650
651
652
653
654
655
656
657
658
659
660
661
662
663
664
665
666
667

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

preceding October and February for purposes of the Florida
Education Finance Program surveys.

(b) The student is a dependent child of a member of the
United States Armed Forces who was transferred within the last
12 months to this state from another state or from a foreign
country pursuant to the parent’s permanent change of station
orders.

(c) The student was enrolled during the prior school year
in a school district virtual instruction program under this
section or a K-8 Virtual School Program under s. 1002.415.

(6) STUDENT PARTICIPATION REQUIREMENTS.—Each student
enrolled in a school district wvirtual instruction program must:

(a) Comply with the compulsory attendance requirements of
s. 1003.21. Student attendance must be verified by the school
district.

(b) Take state assessment tests within the school district
in which such student resides, which must provide the student
with access to the district’s testing facilities.

(7) FUNDING.—

(a) For purposes of a school district virtual instruction
program, “full-time equivalent student” has the same meaning as
provided in s. 1011.61(1) (c)l.b.(III) or (IV).

(b) The school district in which the student resides shall

report full-time equivalent students for the school district
virtual instruction program and—fer—a—~charter—schoot
who—particeipate under paragraph {4 to the department enty in

a manner prescribed by the department, and funding shall be

provided through the Florida Education Finance Program. Funds

received by the school district of residence for a student in a

Page 23 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




668
669
670
671
672
673
674
675
676
677
678
679
680
681
682
683
684
685
686
687
688
689
690
691
692
693
694
695
696

CS for CS for SB 1676

Second Engrossed

20091676e2

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

virtual instruction program provided by another school district

under this section shall be transferred to the school district

providing the virtual instruction program.

(~Y T2 7 7 2 EESINE SN NS SR i o 1 A3 o+~ <7
\ 7 [ S U R S CTITT g LJLA.J_ (= C I [ ) I ) W 4 W g A Lo [ S S N wy

at it o 1T v Ao Q +hamaa~ o 1ama 4+~ 4+ Dernartmant +
STcoutCircs i gTratts CrroogTt =+ orC rritrcCtO coO oo oICitc —OT
Tiixzanrn 1 1 Tia ot 9 ~ IO Y - S o Adraomrmaaat Az 4 o N N A S o o A
ooV rrC oS crCe—pPpTrogratitns,; Oropoutc proveircror—prograitts,; ot

PN v oA st g Al Ao o
Caorr Tt voCto O pPpTrograitts .
(8) ASSESSMENT AND ACCOUNTABILITY.—
(a) Wrth+theexception—of—+h i ffered—Py—+he

1. Participate in the statewide assessment program under s.
1008.22 and in the state’s education performance accountability
system under s. 1008.31.

2. Recelve a school grade under as—previded—in s.
1008.341,

The school grade or school improvement rating received by each

1008.34

or a school improvement rating under s. as applicable.

approved provider shall be based upon the aggregated assessment

scores of all students served by the provider statewide A—sehoeot

an~h ] 1Ay o 10NQ 24 v v~ A £ +hh1 o o~ o n A oo
[ ANV I B W A W g | I i A & e [y T U U « T [ S N t/uJ_ A\ Ry g CTIT 1O Q\_,\_/L.,_LUJ.J., J_\_a\jL/LJ_\A._L\_,QL)
£+ Al PR O [P TP R PP, [P Ous J RPN NP S S PO S [V SR RV 2
O T TT OO T 1T A\ - TITTO TV OO T tJ_LUV_L\J.C_LO tJ()._LL,_L\/_LtJ().L,_Lll\j =TT LSS i 5wy

C .
distriet!ls—program. The department shall publish the school

grade or school improvement rating received by each approved

provider on its Internet website.

(b) The performance of part-time students in grades 9

through 12 underparagraph—+~—+te)> shall not be included for

Page 24 of 75

words underlined are additions.



697
698
699
700
701
702
703
704
705
706
707
708
709
710
711
712
713
714
715
716
717
718
719
720
721
722
723
724
725

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

purposes of school grades or school improvement ratings grading

under subparagraph (a)2.; however, their performance shall be

included for school grading or school improvement rating

purposes by the nonvirtual school providing the student’s
primary instruction.

(c) An approved provider A—program that receives is
desigrated—with a school grade of “D+" makingtess—than

tory—progressy or “F+” under s. 1008.34 or a school

PPN R
o T IO o

improvement rating of “Declining” under s. 1008.341 failing—*e

make—adeguate—progressy must file a school improvement plan with

the department for consultation to determine the causes for low

performance and to develop a plan for correction and
improvement.

An approved provider’s contract must be terminated Fhe

program receives a school grade of “D+" makingless—than

tory—progressy or “F+” under s. 1008.34 or a school

improvement rating of “Declining” under s. 1008.341 failing—*te

make—adegquate—progressy for 2 years during any consecutive 4-

year period. A provider that has a contract terminated under

this paragraph may not be an approved provider for a period of

at least 1 year after the date upon which the contract was

terminated and until the department determines that the provider

is in compliance with subsection (2) and has corrected each

cause of the provider’s low performance. Ff—a—ecentraectis neot

)
)

[ON
ar

rm PN | + 1 PPN S
oI 1T C A8 T UIT O T T

H
)]
H-

7 1
\A™ O

s

<

H

p A3

’

Hh
r

N
iy

ar
)]

£+ oo o v on bl ~era
- T J_\J\jJ_L/LlI.l A [N I A \JtJ\_/J_L/L

H-

+ 7
A @ =y

4

H

Fa

T ¢

ah DA I P SRV [ SR o, NPT S s o
LR I A A e |\ g [ S S P CTIITTCT T T

a
]
0}

Page 25 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Second Engrossed

CS for CS for SB 1676

20091676e2

D D
o ¢ o & YH HO)
D D @] in] -H HO)J D ®
- 0} — D ol
£ e O o8 O P ¢ T Q¢
b O o £ D w| O 0] b @ -Hoo4p
WD 0] — - -l qQ - PP P 4 &
HOj YH H ) © (@] FI < O ke [ oo 4 D D [y o
oo 15 S H DP T O P »m i} D @ ®H @O ¢ & D B @
T H H ©® O O v O] ¢ B (0] % ¢ -H o -H ¢ O QO -H D B
T ¢ ¢ O 4 O T| ©® W Pl A O -H P ¢H B ¢ G4 4 4
HO) jis) »oo-m a A 0] -~ i1y © QO © H P )] D o N - ¢ My kY
o O O O > H Sl Q Q| T 3 Ef B P O P P PO -
] L oo - o ¥ & -—H|l al P O H & F W o J
v -H o, © - PP 3 ~ a o O =3 ~ i} D 4 -H -H (VO] D @ @
O » O P — O 0| O o O - - a9 b ©® M ®» O O H B D &
H ¢ 4P o S oAl O 9 - L gl > BH & @ 4b (o N CRO)
Q YW H O ~ “ 1S — © ® ~ @ w v -H @ W @ (O] TR
o9} D o -H PP — o, B (o] ~ © =@ [09) -H a4 -H © N @
D 4 ©n 0|l P © g Q| o T HH — ® 4 ¢ -H P W
Hoo@ » o g -H|l O Sl O ol -H FCH (VIR ¢ ) N O W () B8} LW D
o ¢ -f 4 -~ O & w| L - o 4] 4 H 0 B3 0 D & & 4 O
T ood OO —~ P ) e < ¢ N H N O 4 T
-H ® O - c O -l © P — D> ¢ ¢ ¢ O -H D -H H F
»o-f O oW L o o H o v ® N Ep - B sH kORI
D> W ~ P 0 el I N ISENG) da o~ O O O ORI
H o0 0 o <l S I I R S B ) BT | I O] o O & 4£ O X ¢ q
O {4 - -4 £ O] O LD 3 A PG 1> (VI ] o P F P
(TN R T g ®w| A w9 -4 O 4 O] P D © d 4 B T " D
v - 0} B Al -H W Q n = Y S BT S e P & 0 H
¢ S H £ ®© O T P P © n Y |~ Q)] 4 B 4P D 4
L 4@ W D o o 0] . 09) ~ P> FH o b H B ¢ O g D .
PP n D — o n < 4 H -H & P w| Q ja g D ®®# $H B @© H c N o
-H -H @ g4 0 -H o O D T b & & EH D -H -H W D 4 W
E 4 P O O O n -4 O D -H O -A| T nw £ P q Q9 H P M
D 9] O 35 O A L o @ +H # T 0] H [} D D B @ D D
4w <+ n o0 g O O » ¢ ¢ 3 ~ 4 A © 4 O T &§E O O T
0} D ¥ > — P O n| 0 D & + @© O D & -H @ D q jou
(V1Y) D O O - n ey H )] S Y g D -H p oD O v —H B
T N« (M 4 P O Y el B (VIR () D Pl o P 4 WP b B @ PP
£ 0 0 Q, 4 O ®wn O nh Y T H| O O @ O H D > ¢ ¢© B O
¢ £ © @ T g T -+ ®© ™ ¢ o -A T n o " @ o oW ¢
D 4 < 0O 0 ¢ < |1k e O -f @© > 0 ) - L 4~ o -
O ¢ | 0 5 0P | on 0] N o @ B D 4P L @ -Ho 4D
(VN R} = ) L ) B3] D 0 | » D W 4 & T # ¥ ®
— o, W ® 0 @] E Y O D T~ O ~ g D H g T ~ fH
i) K Z nw g © O Z2 TV o B L A 3B [@>3Ne D D oo D D
e T o A Y H -d @& H S 4| O N e)) WP D © o 1 { D D
ow -Ho D i O o w H O » -H O O P O ~ d D 4 -f D D X W D
n Q H D H P 4 O L D T ¢ H 0 ™ ow D ®» o T H & D
L @ A 9 SN O S - © Al S « op 4b D (VIO ON HOJEEN ()]
A~ W B O 0 G Q0 M &P 0, | H| N P o D W ® ~ O ¥
P o O P O g O o @ Y ¢ O P » L H £ P Q@
~ N ¢ e o o o0 = gc D @ O | Tl © D ® O D O © O
NORERN ORI KM g % O H O % B o O] g| M b H & P B -H P -
oy - @ ] N BN £§ P O ®© -~ D 4 ©» - N P -H
o P oH D c ~ 4 0 P 3 o P 0 | g « N B D
® O [0} & [@)) S5 P O o - (OS] & O a n H X ® £ @ [99] . D, D D $H
4 > B4 -~ 0 g 3 0 - g o ¢ n| O Y & ¥ ¢ P O +~ n QO O
ol D H H - 0] ~ 1S “ Q kY - “ a e n Ky B [99] 0] H
® $H P P 4 T P O T ©| L O Q)] > O H T O o™ O
b OTR O N O 4 3w O - 3 D ~ 0| © q D b H B ~ P - H
P & ¢ S Poo < o P al o] < [ AR N b o & £ ¢
e ® -H O @] n -4 P - [9)] [OR - 9] i} [0 PRIt} [OFEET] o T P W D oD
© ™~ W O O 4 N MO < 0 W I~ 0 O O 4 N OO < I W >~ W o0 O +H N M <
N N NN MmO MmO MmO O O O O oOo»OS$§ S$Os OO oo TN 0 0 0N w0
~ 0™~ o0~ 0>~ ™~ 0~ ™~ 0~ ©~ 0~ ™~ ™~ "~ ™~H/’&™~H ™~ >~ ™>-™/™>~? ™~ > ™>~-™/™>T™/™>~™">-~/>~>-/> > ™~

Page 26 of 75

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

4

CODING




755
756
757
758
759
760
761
762
763
764
765
766
767
768
769
770
771
772
773
774
775
776
777
778
779
780
781
782
783

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

Mrana 2 ~voa A~ QO o alh 192 e st~ oA qan Al o e o o o oy
CootT st 9Tt tS cHHT o9t —TTZ2—a S oot 20— ot —PatrtagTaptt
(T7\ (~) + Nratzri Aarvra o ot v~ A A EEE N 2P \PoOE BN =D S NE S i SR T == S B
\ A A w cO— POV o Wit COoOncraoC e wrrocir o T oo COoOsSOTT oottt 1t
+ 2007 20N0Q o~k 1 szAaN 2 4 Nr~xza A SRR Atz Ao
TTIT \SAvARS U0 S0 T yCaorr o POVt oot —oCTvCto

(11)43+2)> RULES.—The State Board of Education shall adopt

rules necessary to administer this section, including rules that

prescribe school district amd—eharter—sehoolt reporting
requirements under subsection (7).

(12) STUDY.—The department shall review the advisability of

legislatively authorizing school districts to contract with

approved private providers for the provision of part-time

virtual instruction programs for students in grades 9 through 12

who are not enrolled in programs under ss. 1003.52 and 1003.53.

The department shall report its findings and recommendations to

the presiding officers of the Legislature and the Governor by

January 15, 2010.

Section 12. Paragraph (d) of subsection (3), paragraph (a)
of subsection (4), and paragraph (d) of subsection (6) of
section 1002.71, Florida Statutes, as amended by section 7 of
chapter 2009-3, Laws of Florida, are amended to read:

1002.71 Funding; financial and attendance reporting.—

(3)

(d) For programs offered by school districts pursuant to s.
1002.61 and beginning with the 2009 summer program, each

district’s funding shall be based on a fuli-time—eguivalent
student enrollment that is evenly divisible by 12. If the result

of dividing a district’s fult—-time—eguivatent student enrollment
by 12 is not a whole number, the district’s enrollment

calculation shall be adjusted by adding the minimum number of

£
=

B I S oo
% . S CLT1T

e—eguivatrent students to produce a fult—-timeeguivatent

Page 27 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




784
785
786
187
788
789
790
791
792
793
794
795
796
797
798
799
800
801
802
803
804
805
806
807
808
809
810
811
812

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

student enrollment calculation that is evenly divisible by 12.
(4) Notwithstanding s. 1002.53(3) and subsection (2):
(a) A child who, for any of the prekindergarten programs
listed in s. 1002.53(3), has not completed more than 70 &
percent of the hours authorized to be reported for funding under

subsection (2) may withdraw from the program for good cause and+

reenroll in one of the programs;—and—lbe—reported—Ffor—funding

P = B
L [ S U R

[0)]

—~
(=8

[0)]

NIl rrnoo r
I SAZE =N SATA=A = TC— oyt UL

w1 ok N
WIT T CTT T

1
T

ar
oy

a2
A=

-

rreotted. The total funding for a child who

0]
N
q
q

P

<

reenrolls in one of the programs for good cause may shatd+ not

exceed one full-time equivalent student. Funding for a child who

withdraws and reenrolls in one of the programs for good cause

shall be issued in accordance with the agency’s uniform

attendance policy adopted pursuant to paragraph (6) (d).

A child may reenroll only once in a prekindergarten program
under this section. A child who reenrolls in a prekindergarten
program under this subsection may not subsequently withdraw from
the program and reenroll. The Agency for Workforce Innovation
shall establish criteria specifying whether a good cause exists
for a child to withdraw from a program under paragraph (a),
whether a child has substantially completed a program under
paragraph (b), and whether an extreme hardship exists which is
beyond the child’s or parent’s control under paragraph (b).

(6)

(d) The Agency for Workforce Innovation shall adopt, for
funding purposes, a uniform attendance policy for the Voluntary
Prekindergarten Education Program. The attendance policy must

apply statewide and apply equally to all private prekindergarten

Page 28 of 75

words underlined are additions.



813
814
815
816
817
818
819
820
821
822
823
824
825
826
827
828
829
830
831
832
833
834
835
836
837
838
839
840
841

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

providers and public schools. The attendance policy must
blia] oo . g | | |
include at least the following provisions:
1. Beginning with the 2009-2010 fiscal year for school-year

programs, a student’s attendance may be reported on a pro rata

basis as a fractional part of a full-time equivalent student and

2. At a maximum, 20 percent of the total payment made on

behalf of a student to a private prekindergarten provider or a

public school may be for hours a student is absent. A—student

3. A private prekindergarten provider or public school may

not receive payment for absences that occur before a student’s

first day of attendance or after a student’s last day of

attendance. A—student—who deoesrotmeet—the minimum reguirement

The uniform attendance policy shall be used only for funding
purposes and does not prohibit a private prekindergarten
provider or public school from adopting and enforcing its
attendance policy under paragraphs (a) and (c).

Section 13. Paragraph (g) of subsection (1) of section

Page 29 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




842
843
844
845
846
847
848
849
850
851
852
853
854
855
856
857
858
859
860
861
862
863
864
865
866
867
868
869
870

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1003.02, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1003.02 District school board operation and control of
public K-12 education within the school district.—As provided in
part II of chapter 1001, district school boards are
constitutionally and statutorily charged with the operation and
control of public K-12 education within their school district.
The district school boards must establish, organize, and operate
their public K-12 schools and educational programs, employees,
and facilities. Their responsibilities include staff
development, public K-12 school student education including
education for exceptional students and students in juvenile
justice programs, special programs, adult education programs,
and career education programs. Additionally, district school
boards must:

(1) Provide for the proper accounting for all students of
school age, for the attendance and control of students at
school, and for proper attention to health, safety, and other
matters relating to the welfare of students in the following
fields:

(g) School operation.—

1. Provide for the operation of all public schools as free
schools for a term of =k—*Feast 180 days or the equivalent on an
hourly basis as specified by rules of the State Board of
Education; determine district school funds necessary in addition
to state funds to operate all schools for the minimum term; and
arrange for the levying of district school taxes necessary to
provide the amount needed from district sources.

2. Prepare, adopt, and timely submit to the Department of

Education, as required by law and by rules of the State Board of

Page 30 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




871
872
873
874
875
876
877
878
879
880
881
882
883
884
885
886
887
888
889
890
891
892
893
894
895
896
897
898
899

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

Education, the annual school budget, so as to promote the
improvement of the district school system.

Section 14. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) and subsection
(4) of section 1003.03, Florida Statutes, as amended by section
9 of chapter 2009-3, Laws of Florida, are amended to read:

1003.03 Maximum class size.—

(2) IMPLEMENTATION.—

(b) Determination of the number of students per classroom
in paragraph (a) shall be calculated as follows:

1. For fiscal years 2003-2004 through 2005-2006, the
calculation for compliance for each of the 3 grade groupings
shall be the average at the district level.

2. For fiscal years 2006-2007 through 2009-2010 2668-206069,
the calculation for compliance for each of the 3 grade groupings
shall be the average at the school level.

3. For fiscal year 2010-2011 28689-2010 and thereafter, the
calculation for compliance shall be at the individual classroom
level.

4. For fiscal years 2006-2007 through 2009-2010 and
thereafter, each teacher assigned to any classroom shall be
included in the calculation for compliance.

(4) ACCOUNTABILITY.—

(a)1l. Beginning in the 2003-2004 fiscal year, if the
department determines for any year that a school district has
not reduced average class size as required in subsection (2) at
the time of the third FEFP calculation, the department shall
calculate an amount from the class size reduction operating
categorical which is proportionate to the amount of class size

reduction not accomplished. Upon verification of the

Page 31 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




900
901
902
903
904
905
906
907
908
909
910
911
912
913
914
915
916
917
918
919
920
921
922
923
924
925
926
927
928

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

department’s calculation by the Florida Education Finance
Program Appropriation Allocation Conference and not later than
March 1 of each year, the Executive Office of the Governor shall
transfer undistributed funds equivalent to the calculated amount
from the district’s class size reduction operating categorical
to an approved fixed capital outlay appropriation for class size
reduction in the affected district pursuant to s. 216.292(2) (d).
The amount of funds transferred shall be the lesser of the
amount verified by the Florida Education Finance Program
Appropriation Allocation Conference or the undistributed balance
of the district’s class size reduction operating categorical.

2. In lieu of the transfer required by subparagraph 1., the
Commissioner of Education may recommend a budget amendment,
subject to approval by the Legislative Budget Commission, to
transfer an alternative amount of funds from the district’s
class size reduction operating categorical to its approved fixed
capital outlay account for class size reduction if the
commissioner finds that the State Board of Education has
reviewed evidence indicating that a district has been unable to
meet class size reduction requirements despite appropriate
effort to do so. The commissioner’s budget amendment must be
submitted to the Legislative Budget Commission by February 15 of
each year.

3. For the 2007-2008 fiscal year and thereafter, if in any
fiscal year funds from a district’s class size operating
categorical are required to be transferred to its fixed capital
outlay fund and the district’s class size operating categorical
allocation in the General Appropriations Act for that fiscal

year has been reduced by a subsequent appropriation, the

Page 32 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

929| Commissioner of Education may recommend a 50-percent reduction
930 in the amount of the transfer.

931 (b) Beginning in the 2010-2011 fiscal year and each year

932 thereafter, if the department determines that the number of

933 students assigned to any individual class exceeds the class size

934 maximum, as required in subsection (2), at the time of the third

935 FEFP calculation, the department shall:

936 1. Identify, for each grade group, the number of classes in

937 which the enrollment exceeds the maximum, the number of students

938 which exceed the maximum for each class, and the total number of

939 students which exceed the maximum for all classes.

940 2. Determine the number of full-time equivalent students

941| which exceed the maximum class size for each grade group.

942 3. Multiply the total number of FTE students which exceed

943 the maximum class size for each grade group by the district’s

944 FTE dollar amount of the class-size-reduction allocation for

945 that year and calculate the total for all three grade groups.

9406 4. Reduce the district’s class-size-reduction

947 operatingcategorical allocation by an amount equal to the sum of

948 the calculation in subparagraph 3.

949 (c) Upon verification of the department’s calculation by

950 the Florida Education Finance Program Appropriation Allocation

951| Conference and no later than March 1 of each year, the Executive

952 Office of the Governor shall place these funds in reserve and

953 the undistributed funds shall revert to the General Revenue Fund

954 unallocated at the end of the fiscal year. The amount of funds

955| reduced shall be the lesser of the amount verified by the

956| Florida Education Finance Program Appropriation Allocation

957 Conference or the undistributed balance of the district’s class-

Page 33 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




958
959
960
961
962
963
964
965
966
967
968
969
970
971
972
973
974
975
976
977
978
979
980
981
982
983
984
985
986

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

size-reduction operating categorical allocation.

(d) In lieu of the reduction calculation in paragraph (b),

the Commissioner of Education may recommend a budget amendment,

subject to approval of the Legislative Budget Commission, to

reduce an alternative amount of funds from the district’s class-

The

size-reduction operating categorical allocation.

commissioner’s budget amendment must be submitted to the

Legislative Budget Commission by February 15 of each year.

(e) In addition to the calculation required in paragraph

time of the third FEFP calculation for the 2009-2010

(a), at the

fiscal year, the department shall also prepare a simulated

calculation based on the requirements in paragraphs (b) and (c).

This simulated calculation shall be provided to the school

districts and the Legislature.

alh o171 At A o bz T 10 BN R TYNENE VSR X SN B A I E SN B R~ 13
STt ot TcCTmTriC—Oy ovatraao L o O Cotir—yCaor witrCitr OroStctrrtCcto ttave
notE ot + 1 + 17 ataa A ANt N~z Al N o n rocma v A 1

o T MC T —crrtC—owo— o cuattCc—pPCT \]S TS SR SAS AU AL S m T4 5 R S SAS [ 3 m Sy SRS -

crilha A~ 1 A (D) T a9~ o AN AN g oA £ +1h A1 ot v A+l o At Ao
SO SCCTtToOT (2 P st opOit—o COoOmMpar SO Ot~ Orsecrr Tttt S CToOoCT
ataa At a0 et aes ;7 £ +h Al v aAant o~k 1 PPN NE VS RN - 2

S TCoOCTIc Mot Siro—Ssuatrt vey o ot CourrCirc SCririoo0T—yCaotr ot o1

| Vasyro v A o~k 1o e
T o T oo —SCIrtooT—5Sy
2 Dol oo oo no e

T oo TrC— ot oo TTOT Sy
2 D) ZAr g ey e
o O TSy (> m

Page 34 of 75

words

underlined are additions.



Second Engrossed

CS for CS for SB 1676

20091676e2

¢ D D
D 4P n 4P Uk [09)
- D 4 & TP b v
D D BT 1 N & - oo -H
oo Moy O @ D D P 4 W b
D i) B P & O D - o D i
1y D HORE) oS D (o] D D 4 —
)] o L ¢ D @ 4 D jon oW & ~ -
Jon 1o} #$ A HooH & P A n B D b H ¢ D
B e B D ¢ [ o] . 4 4 W T H P
T i g 4 oo 4 O KOO ¢ F 4P ¢ 4t
HO)J D » © D HoW B 4 D D € (OFEEN O TR ()
> P D D - D # D D 4 -H 3] D D Ud
® H D & s ST "R O PR O PR () i D D -H S D -
ROTNON D oI D & P [ T ST VIR S} D v -d
@ i D D H E -H n D b O O & -H @ & D
b D - ()] D L - B N T £ P o-H P
Ho} E D N P O 1 O Hd WD TP P P $ v b -H H P
® B @ [ | (O 1] D -H K . D ® —
YH -H D FIUNOF b & ~H -H op o < D, 4b D
4y N~ 4 E ¢ ¢ ¢ ¢ & O O W W P ¢ N & ¢ Ny
1y & ® D G D ¢ © ¢ -7 O -4 O P - D H o O & -
4P D 4 H @ - © D t 4 (0] H HO) O} &
) bR D OB B0 0 e O O ¥ . n -
D D, & . L« 1 () R« N OO P < . N A~ P H -H N
— H 0 D -Hoo (o T D DI (DB ST D SN ) ) P N P @ P
® Qo0 ) - P & O+ H ¢ W g
o E P H D . D > ™ % M W D # ¢ - b B
D - D Lo o E Qg4 DINORE TR O - L O B )
-H o) mi & N 4 ® 4 D ¢ b 4P
4b b N O] b -H D > O O T @ -H - -
0} ) () D @ D © ¥ @ H D D - -HoHP @ P
B - @ oo N ) HOP A P RN O N SR I O N ()
] TS - - P R R I R () + - £ T 4
ai) 4 oo o I 4 B & P g O » L @ v PO
h 0} D D [N L o E D D & @ D [ONO] @ HOOj
o -Ho4b b D @ W -H | -H 4 S EH W - B 0P D
- HO)J D W O L R D OF o o -d O @ D -
o P ® T Qo D 4 . k3 > -
4 S U D o D b -d & E ™ & O P T -
D b -f i -H D b & o - & O ¢ O D -H ol
D 4P €L B o 4 O v g - - - @ (OTE O TR OB O
D 4P e 4 ¢ D - O O ¢ H ¢ ) D - @
) (O ) € P ® P &% 4 4 b £ 4 ¢ O s T B SR ()
- O - -H P oo Y . I O B R O} - (O . U o
YH A H oW P D . B - D -# -H > i
op) o - p] D (ON ORIV EEES U (O N 4 NISR
@ (R D 4 NI O] £ T « D 4 O M P D © O W
- -H ¢ [opJRT) [0} D D D 49} - . - T N @ -H
N bl [09) -H @ O @ . D D S H Y b HoH D
- b O P O Ho - h +~ & b 4b D & PP o H PO -
& — — o W D -H O H n o] D - — [ ] N ¢
-H ¢, O -H [ S} W A P -H @& H & H N o -H -
X ® s -H P o Q@ W 4 v O 0 D T ¥ P QO T N
® T ¢ D B » D -H T ¢ D D (O O B € € -
Y D NORENMO} - L0 o O $f O ¢ O 9O & & P
~ - - U ® oo 4 ¢ ¢ & o -d O ¢ & & O L @« -
. h 0 p o D D (] D b & ¢ b ¢ n 4h ® -H B -
< P P D D D - - [0} D H N E - g4 O P P r
D M- L0 KT} D o L M (VI o D H -H P ®
-H o U [OFIEN)} v -H H H & H O O &F H B D © £
TR} N h h ¢ Q ¢ ¢ H D £ Q@ ¢ o 4 B O T -
H D D D -t b B & £ £ P b @ - o ¢ T P D
[OFEENON H SHERON T D © P h orx @ O WP @© H e D ¢
™~ 00 O O 4 N M < 1 W ™~ 0 6O O 4 N OO < 1H W ~ o O O +H N MO < W
W W W O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O o 0o o O oA A oA A A
O Oy O OO OO0 OO OO0 OO OO O OO0 O OO O O O O O O O O O O O O O O o O
R e T e T B L L e T = HE S R B R

Page 35 of 75

striecken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




1016
1017
1018
1019
1020
1021
1022
1023
1024
1025
1026
1027
1028
1029
1030
1031
1032
1033
1034
1035
1036
1037
1038
1039
1040
1041
1042
1043
1044

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

Section 15. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section

1004.55, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1004.55 Regional autism centers.—

(1) Seven regional autism centers are established to
provide nonresidential resource and training services for
persons of all ages and of all levels of intellectual
functioning who have autism, as defined in s. 393.063; who have
a pervasive developmental disorder that is not otherwise
specified; who have an autistic-like disability; who have a dual
sensory impairment; or who have a sensory impairment with other
handicapping conditions. Each center shall be operationally and
fiscally independent and shall provide services within its
geographical region of the state. Service delivery shall be
consistent for all centers. Each center shall coordinate
services within and between state and local agencies and school
districts but may not duplicate services provided by those
agencies or school districts. The respective locations and
service areas of the centers are:

(a) The College of Medicine bepartment—of Communication
Biserders at Florida State University, which serves Bay,

Calhoun, Escambia, Franklin, Gadsden, Gulf, Holmes, Jackson,
Jefferson, Leon, Liberty, Madison, Okaloosa, Santa Rosa, Taylor,

Wakulla, Walton, and Washington Counties.

Page 36 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1045
1046
1047
1048
1049
1050
1051
1052
1053
1054
1055
1056
1057
1058
1059
1060
1061
1062
1063
1064
1065
1066
1067
1068
1069
1070
1071
1072
1073

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

Section 16. Paragraphs (a) and (b) of subsection (5) of
section 1006.06, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1006.06 School food service programs.—

(5) (a) Each district school board shall implement school
breakfast programs that make breakfast meals available to all
students in each elementary school. By the beginning of the
2010-2011 school year, universal ke school breakfast programs

shall be offered in schools in which 80 percent or more of the

students are eligible for free or reduced-price meals make

brealkfoaa taa At o oo o~
T TTINTTHOS C OO TTTICTOS LI \NPN & B Uy i

middte—andhigh sehoot. Each school shall, to the maximum

extent practicable, make breakfast meals available to students

N I I, [ W + 11 o 1 eam
Ly T TS €7 SV €V R S Sy @) B N ) |y [ @ Ny - - =] AP EL Y § § A )

at an alternative site location, which may include, but need not
be limited to, alternative breakfast options as described in
publications of the Food and Nutrition Service of the United
States Department of Agriculture for the federal School
Breakfast Program.

(b) Beginning with the 2009-2010 school year, each school
district must annually set prices for breakfast meals at rates
that, combined with federal reimbursements and state

allocations, are sufficient to defray costs of school breakfast

programs without requiring allocations from the district’s
operating funds, except if the district school board approves
lower rates.

Section 17. Subsection (5) is added to section 1006.21,
Florida Statutes, to read:

1006.21 Duties of district school superintendent and
district school board regarding transportation.—

(5) Contiguous school districts shall make provisions for

Page 37 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1074 reciprocal policies and agreements for contracts for school bus

1075 transportation services, inspections, and screening requirements

1076| for public schools and public charter schools.

1077 Section 18. Subsection (1) of section 1006.28, Florida

1078 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

1079 1006.28 Duties of district school board, district school
1080 superintendent; and school principal regarding K-12

1081 instructional materials.—

1082 (1) DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD.—The district school board has
1083| the duty to provide adequate instructional materials for all
1084| students in accordance with the requirements of this part. The
1085| term “adequate instructional materials” means a sufficient

1086 number of textbooks or sets of materials that are available in

1087 bound, unbound, kit, or package form and may consist of hard-

1088| backed or soft-backed textbooks, consumables, learning

1089 laboratories, manipulatives, electronic media, and computer

1090 courseware or software that serve serwving as the basis for

1091 instruction for each student in the core courses of mathematics,
1092 language arts, social studies, science, reading, and literature,
1093| except for instruction for which the school advisory council
1094 approves the use of a program that does not include a textbook
1095| as a major tool of instruction. The district school board has
1096 the following specific duties:

1097 (a) Courses of study,; adoption.—Adopt courses of study for
1098| wuse in the schools of the district.

1099 (b) Textbooks.—Provide for proper requisitioning,

1100 distribution, accounting, storage, care, and use of all

1101 instructional materials furnished by the state and furnish such

1102 other instructional materials as may be needed. The district

Page 38 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1103
1104
1105
1106
1107
1108
1109
1110
1111
1112
1113
1114
1115
1116
1117
1118
1119
1120
1121
1122
1123
1124
1125
1126
1127
1128
1129
1130
1131

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

school board shall assure that instructional materials used in
the district are consistent with the district goals and
objectives and the curriculum frameworks adopted by rule of the
State Board of Education, as well as with the state and district
performance standards provided for in s. 1001.03(1).

(c) Other instructional materials.—Provide such other
teaching accessories and aids as are needed for the school
district’s educational program.

(d) School library media services,; establishment and
maintenance.—Establish and maintain a program of school library
media services for all public schools in the district, including
school library media centers, or school library media centers
open to the public, and, in addition such traveling or
circulating libraries as may be needed for the proper operation
of the district school system.

Section 19. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) of section
1006.40, Florida Statutes, as amended by section 10 of chapter
2009-3, Laws of Florida, i1s amended to read:

1006.40 Use of instructional materials allocation;
instructional materials, library books, and reference books;
repair of books.—

(2) (a) Each district school board must purchase current
instructional materials to provide each student with a textbook
or other instructional materials as a major tool of instruction
in core courses of the appropriate subject areas of mathematics,
language arts, science, social studies, reading, and literature
for kindergarten through grade 12. Such purchase must be made
within the first 2 years after the effective date of the

adoption cycle; however, this requirement is waived for the

Page 39 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1132 adoption cycle occurring in the 2008-2009 academic year for

1133 schools within the district which are identified in the top four

1134 categories of schools pursuant to s. 1008.33, as amended by

1135 CS/CS/HB 991, Engrossed 1. The Commissioner of Education may

1136| provide a waiver of this requirement for the adoption cycle

1137 occurring in the 2008-2009 academic year if the district

1138 demonstrates that it has intervention and support strategies to

1139| address the particular needs of schools in the lowest two

1140| categories. Unless specifically provided for in the General

1141| Appropriations Act, the cost of instructional materials

1142| purchases required by this paragraph shall not exceed the amount
1143] of the district’s allocation for instructional materials,

1144| pursuant to s. 1011.67, for the previous 2 years.

1145 Section 20. Subsection (12) is added to section 1007.25,
11406 Florida Statutes, to read:

1147 1007.25 General education courses; common prerequisites;
1148 and other degree requirements.-—

1149 (12) (a) A public postsecondary educational institution may

1150 not confer an associate in arts or baccalaureate degree upon any

1151 student who fails to successfully complete one of the following

1152 requirements:

1153 1. Achieve a score that meets or exceeds a minimum score on

1154 a nationally standardized examination, as established by the

1155 State Board of Education in conjunction with the Board of

1156 Governors; oOr

1157 2. Demonstrate successful remediation of any academic

1158 deficiencies and achieve a cumulative grade point average of 2.5

1159 or above, on a 4.0 scale, in postsecondary-level coursework

1160 identified by the State Board of Education in conjunction with

Page 40 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1161
1162
1163
1164
1165
1166
1167
1168
1169
1170
1171
1172
1173
1174
1175
1176
1177
1178
1179
1180
1181
1182
1183
1184
1185
1186
1187
1188
1189

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

the Board of Governors. The Department of Education shall

specify the means by which a student may demonstrate successful

remediation.

(b) Any student who, in the best professional opinion of

the postsecondary educational institution, has a specific

learning disability such that the student cannot demonstrate

successful mastery of one or more of the authorized examinations

but is achieving at the college level in every area despite his

or her disability, and whose diagnosis indicates that further

remediation will not succeed in overcoming the disability, may

appeal through the appropriate dean to a committee appointed by

the president or the chief academic officer for special

consideration. The committee shall examine the evidence of the

student’s academic and medical records and may hear testimony

relevant to the case. The committee may grant a waiver for one

or more of the authorized examinations based on the results of

its review.

(c) Each public postsecondary educational institution

president shall establish a committee to consider requests for

waivers from the requirements in paragraph (a). The committee

shall be chaired by the chief academic officer of the

institution and shall have four additional members appointed by

the president as follows:

1. One faculty member from the mathematics department;

2. One faculty member from the English department;

3. The institutional test administrator; and

4. One faculty member from a department other than English

or mathematics.

(d) Any student who has taken the authorized examinations

Page 41 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1190 and has not achieved a passing score, but has otherwise

1191 demonstrated proficiency in coursework in the same subject area,

1192| may request a waiver from the examination requirement. Waivers

1193 shall be considered only after students have been provided test

1194 accommodations or other administrative adjustments to permit the

1195 accurate measurement of the student’s proficiency in the subject

1196| areas measured by the authorized examinations. The committee

1197 shall consider the student’s educational records and other

1198 evidence as to whether the student should be able to pass the

1199| authorized examinations. A waiver may be recommended to the

1200| president upon a majority vote of the committee. The president

1201| may approve or disapprove the recommendation. The president may

1202 not approve a request that the committee has disapproved. If a

1203| waiver is approved, the student’s transcript shall include a

1204 statement that the student did not meet the requirements of this

1205 subsection and that a waiver was granted.

12006 Section 21. Section 1008.29, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

1207 Section 22. Paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section

1208 1008.41, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1209 1008.41 Workforce education; management information

1210 system.—

1211 (1) The Commissioner of Education shall coordinate uniform
1212| program structures, common definitions, and uniform management
1213 information systems for workforce education for all divisions
1214| within the department. In performing these functions, the

1215| commissioner shall designate deadlines after which data elements
1216| may not be changed for the coming fiscal or school year. School

1217 districts and community colleges shall be notified of data

1218 element changes at least 90 days prior to the start of the

Page 42 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1219 subsequent fiscal or school year. Such systems must provide for:
1220 (c) Maximum use of automated technology and records in

1221| existing databases and data systems. To the extent feasible, the
1222 Florida Information Resource Network may shadtd be employed for
1223| this purpose.

1224 Section 23. Section 1010.06, Florida Statutes, 1s created
1225 to read:

1226 1010.06 Indirect cost limitation.—State funds appropriated

1227| by the Legislature to the Division of Public Schools within the

1228 Department of Education may not be used to pay indirect costs to

1229 a university, community college, school district, or any other

1230 entity.

1231 Section 24. Section 1010.11, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
1232 to read:
1233 1010.11 Electronic transfer of funds.—Pursuant to the

1234 provisions of s. 215.85, each district school board, community
1235| college board of trustees, and university board of trustees

1236 shall adopt written policies prescribing the accounting and

1237 control procedures under which any funds under their control are
1238 allowed to be moved by electronic transaction for any purpose
1239 including direct deposit, wire transfer, withdrawal, e¥

1240 investment, or payment. Electronic transactions shall comply

1241| with the provisions of chapter 668.

1242 Section 25. Subsection (4) is added to section 1011.09,
1243 Florida Statutes, to read:
1244 1011.09 Expenditure of funds by district school board.—All

1245 state funds apportioned to the credit of any district constitute
1246| a part of the district school fund of that district and must be

1247| Dbudgeted and expended under authority of the district school

Page 43 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1248| Dboard subject to the provisions of law and rules of the State
1249| Board of Education.
1250 (4) During the 2009-2010 fiscal year, unless otherwise

1251| specifically approved by the district school board, public funds

1252| may not be expended for out-of-state travel or cellular phones,

1253 cellular phone service, personal digital assistants, or any

1254 other mobile wireless communication device or service, including

1255 text messaging, whether through purchasing, leasing,

1256| contracting, or any other method. The expenditure of public

1257 funds for art programs, music programs, sSports programs, and

1258| extracurricular programs for students is a higher priority than

1259| expending funds for employee travel and cellular phones.
1260 Section 26. Subsection (4) of section 1011.18, Florida
1261 Statutes, is amended to read:

1262 1011.18 School depositories; payments into and withdrawals
1263 from depositories.—

1264 (4) HOW FUNDS DRAWN FROM DEPOSITORIES.—All money drawn from
1265 any district school depository holding same as prescribed herein
1266| shall be upon a check or warrant drawn on authority of the

1267 district school board as prescribed by law. Each check or

1268 warrant shall be signed by the chair or, in his or her absence,
1269 the vice chair of the district school board and countersigned by
1270 the district school superintendent, with corporate seal of the
1271 school board affixed. However, as a matter of convenience, the
1272 corporate seal of the district school board may be printed upon
1273 the warrant and a proper record of such warrant shall be

1274| maintained. The district school board may by resolution, a copy

1275 of which must be delivered to the depository, provide for

1276 internal funds to be withdrawn from any district depository by a

Page 44 of 775
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1277 check duly signed by at least two bonded school employees

1278 designated by the board to be responsible for administering such
1279 funds. However, the district school superintendent or his or her
1280| designee, after having been by resolution specifically

1281| authorized by the district school board, may transfer funds from
1282 one depository to another, within a depository, to another

1283 institution, or from another institution to a depository for

1284 investment purposes and may transfer funds to pay expenses,

1285| expenditures, or other disbursements that must be evidenced by

1286| an invoice or other appropriate documentation in a similar

ar
s

a o
\PAvA T v

s

o £
o C

1287 manner when—the

1288 advanee;—oF

e aY
T

[0F

oanaoh
CaooTt

£s. Such transfer may be made

qar
0]
Hh

3
L

)

17
=8

B

= T A\

1289| by electronic, telephonic, or other medium; and each transfer
1290 shall be confirmed in writing and signed by the district school
1291 superintendent or his or her designee.

1292 Section 27. Subsection (2) and paragraphs (d) and (f) of
1293 subsection (3) of section 1011.60, Florida Statutes, are amended
1294 to read:

1295 1011.60 Minimum requirements of the Florida Education

1296 Finance Program.—FEach district which participates in the state
1297 appropriations for the Florida Education Finance Program shall
1298| provide evidence of its effort to maintain an adequate school
1299| program throughout the district and shall meet at least the

1300 following requirements:

1301 (2) MINIMUM TERM.—Operate all schools for a term of &%

1302| ZJeast 180 actual teaching days or the equivalent on an hourly
1303| basis as specified by rules of the State Board of Education each

1304 school year. The State Board of Education may prescribe

1305| procedures for altering, and, upon written application, may

Page 45 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1306 alter, this requirement during a national, state, or local

1307 emergency as it may apply to an individual school or schools in
1308 any district or districts if, in the opinion of the board, it is
1309| not feasible to make up lost days or hours, and the

1310 apportionment may, at the discretion of the Commissioner of
1311| Education and if the board determines that the reduction of
1312 school days or hours is caused by the existence of a bona fide
1313| emergency, be reduced for such district or districts in

1314| proportion to the decrease in the length of term in any such
1315 school or schools. A strike, as defined in s. 447.203(6), by
1316| employees of the school district may not be considered an

1317 emergency.

1318 (3) EMPLOYMENT POLICIES.—Adopt rules relating to the

1319 appointment, promotion, transfer, suspension, and dismissal of
1320| personnel.

1321 (d) District school boards may authorize a maximum of six

1322| paid legal holidays which shall apply to the total annual number

1323 of required 486 days of service adopted by the board.

1324 (f) Such rules must not require more than 10 32 calendar

1325| months of service for swekh principals, other school site

1326 administrators, and instructional staff, as prescribed by rules

1327 of the State Board of Education ard—must—reguire—10—menths—teo

1328 inetude—not—tess—than196—days—ef—serviee, excluding Sundays and

1329 other holidays. Principals, other school site administrators,

1330 and instructional staff may serve more than 10 calendar months

1331 of service if specifically approved by the district school

1332| board. Contracts for 12 months of service may;—for—atl—members

1333 £ + 1 Nty ~t g A o] ot o £ £ wath Sz e Al oz~ o 1
Or—CchC——TirocrraoCTcrOhagrr—stcar W CTit ity oucit oS v IO T THHOTT

1334 basis—+e include reasonable allowance for vacation or further

Page 46 of 75
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1335
1336
1337
1338
1339
1340
1341
1342
1343
1344
1345
1346
1347
1348
1349
1350
1351
1352
1353
1354
1355
1356
1357
1358
1359
1360
1361
1362
1363

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

study as prescribed by the school board in accordance with rules
of the State Board of Education.

Section 28. Paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section
1011.61, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1011.61 Definitions.—Notwithstanding the provisions of s.
1000.21, the following terms are defined as follows for the
purposes of the Florida Education Finance Program:

(1) A “full-time equivalent student” in each program of the
district is defined in terms of full-time students and part-time
students as follows:

(c)l. A “full-time equivalent student” is:

a. A full-time student in any one of the programs listed in
s. 1011.62(1) (c); or

b. A combination of full-time or part-time students in any
one of the programs listed in s. 1011.62(1) (c) which is the
equivalent of one full-time student based on the following
calculations:

(I) A full-time student, except a postsecondary or adult
student or a senior high school student enrolled in adult
education when such courses are required for high school
graduation, in a combination of programs listed in s.
1011.62(1) (c) shall be a fraction of a full-time equivalent
membership in each special program equal to the number of net
hours per school year for which he or she is a member, divided
by the appropriate number of hours set forth in subparagraph
(a)1l. or subparagraph (a)2. The difference between that fraction
or sum of fractions and the maximum value as set forth in
subsection (4) for each full-time student is presumed to be the

balance of the student’s time not spent in such special

Page 47 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1364
1365
1366
1367
1368
1369
1370
1371
1372
1373
1374
1375
1376
1377
1378
1379
1380
1381
1382
1383
1384
1385
1386
1387
1388
1389
1390
1391
1392

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

education programs and shall be recorded as time in the
appropriate basic program.

(IT) A prekindergarten handicapped student shall meet the
requirements specified for kindergarten students.

(ITI) A full-time equivalent student for students in
kindergarten through grade 5 grades—%-8 in a school district

virtual instruction program under as—provided—irn s. 1002.45

shall consist of a student who has successfully completed a
basic program listed in s. 1011.62(1) (c)l.a. or b., and who is
promoted to a higher grade level.

(IV) A full-time equivalent student for students in grades

6 through 12 8—12 in a school district virtual instruction

program under s. 1002.45(1) (b)1l. and 2. as—preovided—an——S=

108062-45 shall consist of six full credit completions in programs

listed in s. 1011.62(1) (¢c)1l.b. or c. s+—30++E62{H~+er+= and 3 4.

Credit completions can be a combination of either full credits
or half credits.

(V) A Florida Virtual School full-time equivalent student
shall consist of six full credit completions in the programs
listed in s. 1011.62(1) (c)1l.b. for grades 6 through 8 and the

programs listed in s. 1011.62(1) (c)l.c. for grades 9 through 12

1071 /D)
T T T O

S H—ert+=—=and—4. Credit completions can be a
combination of either full credits or half credits.

(VI) Each successfully completed credit earned under the
alternative high school course credit requirements authorized in
s. 1002.375, which is not reported as a portion of the 900 net
hours of instruction pursuant to subparagraph (1) (a)l., shall be
calculated as 1/6 FTE.

2. A student in membership in a program scheduled for more

Page 48 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1393
1394
1395
1396
1397
1398
1399
1400
1401
1402
1403
1404
1405
1406
1407
1408
1409
1410
1411
1412
1413
1414
1415
1416
1417
1418
1419
1420
1421

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

or less than 180 school days or the equivalent on an hourly

basis as specified by rules of the State Board of Education is a

fraction of a full-time equivalent membership equal to the
number of instructional hours in membership divided by the
appropriate number of hours set forth in subparagraph (a)l.;
however, for the purposes of this subparagraph, membership in
programs scheduled for more than 180 days is limited to students
enrolled in juvenile justice education programs and the Florida

Virtual School.

The department shall determine and implement an equitable method
of equivalent funding for experimental schools and for schools
operating under emergency conditions, which schools have been
approved by the department to operate for less than the minimum
school day.

Section 29. Present paragraphs (1) through (p) of
subsection (1) of section 1011.62, Florida Statutes, are
redesignated as paragraphs (m) through (g), respectively, a new
paragraph (1) is added to that subsection, present paragraph (p)
of that subsection is amended, and subsections (4) and (5),
paragraph (b) of subsection (6), and paragraph (a) of subsection
(12) of that section are amended, to read:

1011.62 Funds for operation of schools.—If the annual
allocation from the Florida Education Finance Program to each
district for operation of schools is not determined in the
annual appropriations act or the substantive bill implementing
the annual appropriations act, it shall be determined as
follows:

(1) COMPUTATION OF THE BASIC AMOUNT TO BE INCLUDED FOR

Page 49 of 75

words underlined are additions.



CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1422 OPERATION.—The following procedure shall be followed in

1423 determining the annual allocation to each district for

1424| operation:

1425 (1) Study hall.—A student who is enrolled in study hall may

1426| not be included in the calculation of full-time equivalent

1427 student membership for funding under this section.
1428 (q)4er Calculation of additional full-time equivalent
1429| membership for the Florida Virtual School.—The #£etat reported

1430| full-time equivalent student membership for the Florida Virtual
1431 School for students who are also enrolled in a school district

1432 shall be multiplied by 0.114, and such value shall be added to

1433 the total full-time equivalent student membership.

1434 (4) COMPUTATION OF DISTRICT REQUIRED LOCAL EFFORT.—The
1435 Legislature shall prescribe the aggregate required local effort
1436 for all school districts collectively as an item in the General
1437| Appropriations Act for each fiscal year. The amount that each
1438| district shall provide annually toward the cost of the Florida
1439| Education Finance Program for kindergarten through grade 12
1440 programs shall be calculated as follows:

1441 (a) Estimated taxable value calculations.—

1442 l.a. Not later than 2 working days prior to July 19, the
1443| Department of Revenue shall certify to the Commissioner of

1444 Education its most recent estimate of the taxable value for
1445 school purposes in each school district and the total for all
1446 school districts in the state for the current calendar year
1447| Dbased on the latest available data obtained from the local

1448| property appraisers. The value certified shall be the taxable

1449| wvalue for school purposes for that year, and no further

1450 adjustments shall be made, except those made pursuant to

Page 50 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1451 paragraphs (c) and (d), or an assessment roll change required by

1452 final judicial decisions as specified in paragraph (12) (b). Not

1453| later than July 19, the Commissioner of Education shall compute
1454 a millage rate, rounded to the next highest one one-thousandth
1455| of a mill, which, when applied to 95 percent of the estimated
1456 state total taxable value for school purposes, would generate
1457 the prescribed aggregate required local effort for that year for
1458 all districts. The Commissioner of Education shall certify to
1459| each district school board the millage rate, computed as

1460| prescribed in this subparagraph, as the minimum millage rate
1461| necessary to provide the district required local effort for that
1462 year.

1463 b. The General Appropriations Act shall direct the

1464 computation of the statewide adjusted aggregate amount for

1465| required local effort for all school districts collectively from
1466| ad valorem taxes to ensure that no school district’s revenue
1467 from required local effort millage will produce more than 90
1468| percent of the district’s total Florida Education Finance

1469 Program calculation as calculated and adopted by the

1470 Legislature, and the adjustment of the required local effort

1471| millage rate of each district that produces more than 90 percent
1472 of its total Florida Education Finance Program entitlement to a
1473 level that will produce only 90 percent of its total Florida
1474| Education Finance Program entitlement in the July calculation.

1475 2. On the same date as the certification in sub-

1476 subparagraph 1l.a., the Department of Revenue shall certify to

1477 the Commissioner of Education for each district:

1478 a. Each year for which the property appraiser has certified
1479 the taxable value pursuant to s. 193.122(2) or (3), if

Page 51 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Second Engrossed

CS for CS for SB 1676

20091676e2

g H D
Q, o D D &
) O D B D UH D 4b
Y - —H o 4§ — ow D ow D
o) 0] i} D i D ® + HO)J 0] D @
© e © D -H » 49} oo n D
Y + O| P Ky 4P D ¢ ® HO)j
© - © )] o) ® D D — T @
Q, ~ | < [09] — — D -t h D H @©
Q . of -H| B O] D D T 4 ¢ B W @
3 © 0| P 0] fH D 0] [ I D )] D @ My ~
0 “ql gl B D -H P H P -H D ® ¢
| S| O] o o - Uy WP c O -H i) B ®
Q [OF S o| -+ © -H 0] i1y ® D [0} D . D
3 o] P> D g q E P S B B H N
0 Y P 4| © B ¢4 @ — D -H T »
o gl O] O O — D 4 ® Y v ¥ O D 44
“ © ©| -H|l -H| < ® 0] 8 @ @ ® H b D O, @
0} H B 4] W P he B -H D @© ¢ ® D H ¢ O
O ol 0l Qo -H 0p) D 44 B ) D o O ¢ #
q Qf Y Pl D D ud - T N Q (VIO
i QO 3| 0| 4| O — [09) D © D -H Yy ® ¢
S Q o O HO) D D oo B @ 1b D @© D
q 9] in] O| ® ® Q, « 4 B - @ 4 Y
@) L]« a G4 4 D O & D 4 of
- Q| O O o] O ® B . H &£ O £ ¢ D QO @
iS] S| wn| o] ol A 3] O, ¢ 4D D @ 4P D ¢ P D
() 0l -H al P P -H (O (VI ()] O & 4P N »n
O © - O D — ® K — B 4D D
- al 4l wn|l wn| © on D a4 @ D @ m™OH W D
H - QO - 4 D D o™ P W F T P D D & ~
- o} N 0] 4! ® ®© - (O HORE)]
+ o) © [0) ()] > YH 0] B Y D YH D @ @ [ON
“ 0] —~ | A D 09] T £ ©n D D B
Q =l O Q| S| L [09) D, b H 4 ] - —H
@] Hl < ©| H © D Hoo-H — )] — D O P D
=P O ~ B D o] D -H D © £ -d D D
~ n] - . + ﬂm 4 @ -H O DO » i1y »oo-m oo
O a > © (99 & « [0} ey YH D UH {
- O Q] & o o -t b ¢ - EI e ) —H <~ H " P
Y O o | < 4 B G H © [ I} P
oF -—| O| © - [09] P % Ww @ b o« ST § R PR
0] G = D 1y} ® . D @ D -H D @ D D
0] S A 0O © ~ be D @ [99] D 4 YH  -H D ¢ Uy
< o| | -A © © D B B D 9] s 9] 0]
+ O -H Y o 0} D @ -H D @ H P o - D D D
>~ P N o H 4 N D P n D D ¢ O 9 PP
O 4] ~| ®© ®© . (VIO TG S (o] D ¢ & b -t D —H
@) Sl Ol m| 4 g O Y O © D o & O O ! 1S ) B VA (VN
a O Oo| ~— | -H ~ D A B kSl o, - B 0] 9] b "
- @ o X © — ® )] B HoaQ M D D
0 ol O 4 Q ©) @ T 4 Y H O B O T H © & D D
31 O i e )] D oo} D ® D, ® e W -H £
~ gl - n| — ~ - o Q OJY o b O ¢ B QD
0] O © — | © e 4 _mf NN Eis) D — D ~ Y - ey ®
— ) > N Q @ ® . = ~H A D ol ORI [
Q ~ 3| 0l O » A~ D ® D H — B N ©
© | O] N v P B -t N0 . o . @ D D H oM > QW
@) Q] | N O| W ~ 4 -H O (DI ) N D W
- Q| “ | © -H & U o] D @ “H o -d D
— . © . Q| 3 B ® [OFEENON (O 1] o, @
Qf ®© X| M| T H| -Mm H D, D HTI VR ¢ S Y ¢
Q, . @] O g 0| © D D My D B @ ¢ - D B -H
©| P ] “ © )] [ H YH [OFETS] # W 0] O, W
O 4 N O < 0O W >~ 0 00 0O 4 N OO < 0w I~ W o0 O A N M S N O~ ©
0 W W 0 W W W W W W & & O O O O O O O O O O O O O o o o O
AU SRS IS RS RS U A SRR S AR S S LS R U L LB S S S S I U To B To N To B Vo R Vo RN Vo NN o NN To NN Te)
R s T T B B B e R L R = N = T e B B R e T = T = T = T = TR = N =

Page 52 of 75

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

4

CODING




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

200916706e2
1509 paragraph—H2 b
1510 (b)4ey> Equalization of required local effort.—
1511 1. The Department of Revenue shall include with its

1512 certifications provided pursuant to paragraph (a) its most

1513| recent determination of the assessment level of the prior year’s
1514 assessment roll for each county and for the state as a whole.
1515 2. The Commissioner of Education shall adjust the required
1516| local effort millage of each district for the current year,
1517 computed pursuant to paragraph (a), as follows:

1518 a. The equalization factor for the prior year’s assessment
1519| roll of each district shall be multiplied by 95 percent of the
1520 taxable value for school purposes shown on that roll and by the
1521| prior year’s required local-effort millage, exclusive of any
1522 equalization adjustment made pursuant to this paragraph. The
1523 dollar amount so computed shall be the additional required local
1524 effort for equalization for the current year.

1525 b. Such equalization factor shall be computed as the

1526| quotient of the prior year’s assessment level of the state as a
1527 whole divided by the prior year’s assessment level of the

1528 county, from which quotient shall be subtracted 1.

1529 c. The dollar amount of additional required local effort
1530 for equalization for each district shall be converted to a

1531| millage rate, based on 95 percent of the current year’s taxable
1532 value for that district, and added to the required local effort
1533| millage determined pursuant to paragraph (a).

1534 3. Notwithstanding the limitations imposed pursuant to s.
1535 1011.71(1), the total required local-effort millage, including

1536| additional required local effort for equalization, shall be an

1537 amount not to exceed 10 minus the maximum millage allowed as

Page 53 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1538
1539
1540
1541
1542
1543
1544
1545
1546
1547
1548
1549
1550
1551
1552
1553
1554
1555
1556
1557
1558
1559
1560
1561
1562
1563
1564
1565
1566

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

nonvoted discretionary millage, exclusive of millage authorized
pursuant to s. 1011.71(2). Nothing herein shall be construed to
allow a millage in excess of that authorized in s. 9, Art. VII
of the State Constitution.

4. For the purposes of this chapter, the term “assessment
level” means the value-weighted mean assessment ratio for the
county or state as a whole, as determined pursuant to s.
195.096, or as subsequently adjusted. However, for those parcels
studied pursuant to s. 195.096(3) (a)l. which are receiving the
assessment limitation set forth in s. 193.155, and for which the
assessed value is less than the just value, the department shall
use the assessed value in the numerator and the denominator of
such assessment ratio. In the event a court has adjudicated that
the department failed to establish an accurate estimate of an
assessment level of a county and recomputation resulting in an
accurate estimate based upon the evidence before the court was
not possible, that county shall be presumed to have an
assessment level equal to that of the state as a whole.

5. If, in the prior year, taxes were levied against an
interim assessment roll pursuant to s. 193.1145, the assessment
level and prior year’s nonexempt assessed valuation used for the
purposes of this paragraph shall be those of the interim
assessment roll.

(c)+ey Exclusion.—

1. In those instances in which:

a. There is litigation either attacking the authority of
the property appraiser to include certain property on the tax
assessment roll as taxable property or contesting the assessed

value of certain property on the tax assessment roll, and

Page 54 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1567 b. The assessed value of the property in contest involves
1568| more than 6 percent of the total nonexempt assessment roll, the
1569| plaintiff shall provide to the district school board of the
1570 county in which the property is located and to the Department of
1571| Education a certified copy of the petition and receipt for the
1572| good faith payment at the time they are filed with the court.
1573 2. For purposes of computing the required local effort for
1574 each district affected by such petition, the Department of

1575| Education shall exclude from the district’s total nonexempt
1576 assessment roll the assessed value of the property in contest
1577 and shall add the amount of the good faith payment to the

1578 district’s required local effort.

1579 (d){ey» Recomputation.—Following final adjudication of any
1580 litigation on the basis of which an adjustment in taxable value
1581 was made pursuant to paragraph (c) e, the department shall
1582 recompute the required local effort for each district for each
1583 year affected by such adjustments, utilizing taxable values
1584 approved by the court, and shall adjust subsequent allocations
1585| to such districts accordingly.

1586 (e) Prior period funding adjustment millage.—

1587 1. There shall be an additional millage to be known as the

1588 Prior Period Funding Adjustment Millage levied by a school

1589| district if the prior period unrealized required local effort

1590 funds are greater than zero. The Commissioner of Education shall

1591 calculate the amount of the prior period unrealized required

1592 local effort funds as specified in subparagraph 2. and the

1593| millage required to generate that amount as specified in this

1594 subparagraph. The Prior Period Funding Adjustment Millage shall

1595| be the quotient of the prior period unrealized required local

Page 55 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1596| effort funds divided by the current year taxable value certified

1597 to the Commissioner of Education pursuant to sub-subparagraph

1598 (a)l.a. This levy shall be in addition to the required local

1599| effort millage certified pursuant to this subsection. Such

1600| millage shall not affect the calculation of the current year’s

1601 required local effort and the funds generated by such levy shall

1602 not be included in the district’s Florida Education Finance

1603 Program allocation for that fiscal year. For purpose of the

1604| millage to be included on the Notice of Proposed Taxes, the

1605| Commissioner of Education shall adjust the required local effort

1606| millage computed pursuant to paragraph (a) as adjusted by

1607| paragraph (b) for the current year for any district that levies

1608 a Prior Period Funding Adjustment Millage to include all Prior

1609 Period Funding Adjustment Millage. For the purpose of this

1610| paragraph, there shall be a Prior Period Funding Adjustment

1611| Millage levied for each year certified by the Department of

1612 Revenue pursuant to sub-subparagraph (a)2.a. since the previous

1613| vyear certification and for which the calculation in sub-

1614 subparagraph 2.b. is greater than zero.

1615 2.a. As used in this subparagraph, the term:

1616 (I) “Prior year” means a year certified under sub-

1617 subparagraph (a)2.a.

1618 (IT) “Preliminary taxable value” means:

1619 (A) If the prior year is the 2009-2010 fiscal year or

1620 later, the taxable value certified to the Commissioner of

1621 Education pursuant to sub-subparagraph (a)l.a.

1622 (B) If the prior year is the 2008-2009 fiscal year or

1623 earlier, the taxable value certified pursuant to the final

1624 calculation as specified in former paragraph (b) as that

Page 56 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1625
1626
1627
1628
1629
1630
1631
1632
1633
1634
1635
1636
1637
1638
1639
1640
1641
1642
1643
1644
1645
1646
1647
1648
1649
1650
1651
1652
1653

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

paragraph existed in the prior year.

(ITI) “Final taxable wvalue” means the district’s taxable

value as certified by the property appraiser pursuant to s.

193.122(2) or (3), if applicable. This is the certification that

reflects all final administrative actions of the wvalue

adjustment board.

b. For purposes of this subsection and with respect to each

year certified pursuant to sub-subparagraph (a)2.a., if the

district’s prior year preliminary taxable value is greater than

the district’s prior year final taxable value, the prior period

unrealized required local effort funds are the difference

between the district’s prior year preliminary taxable value and

the district’s prior year final taxable value, multiplied by the

prior year district required local effort millage. If the

district’s prior year preliminary taxable value is less than the

district’s prior year final taxable value, the prior period

unrealized required local effort funds are zero.

(5) DISCRETIONARY MILLAGE COMPRESSION SUPPLEMENT.—The
Legislature shall prescribe in the General Appropriations Act,
pursuant to s. 1011.71(1), the rate of nonvoted current
operating discretionary millage that shall be used to calculate
a discretionary millage compression supplement. If the
prescribed millage generates an amount of funds per unweighted
FTE for the district that is less than the state average, the
district shall receive an amount per FTE that, when added to the
funds per FTE generated by the designated levy, shall equal the

SN + +hh ot 1 "+ 1
0 T T T T

m +
ITCT oSO Mo T oI TTT C

s
P
ar

A3 o
A= =)

@D

r
O

H-

A=

state average. Fe—Pbe—-eli 7

am @

migat ] tzsz+h m 17
moas Tt Vvy cCIrrC—It (=

(6) CATEGORICAIL FUNDS.—

z1 11 a o o PEC R IR N R
TIttott T C

11 5 A
nrrragC—poarSoaitc A%

H-
H-
H-
N
H-

rq =z S
[ 3 S e T Wy O O .

D
)

Page 57 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1654
1655
1656
1657
1658
1659
1660
1661
1662
1663
1664
1665
1666
1667
1668
1669
1670
1671
1672
1673
1674
1675
1676
1677
1678
1679
1680
1681
1682

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

(b) If a district school board finds and declares in a
resolution adopted at a regular meeting of the school board that
the funds received for any of the following categorical
appropriations are urgently needed to maintain school board
specified academic classroom instruction, the school board may
consider and approve an amendment to the school district
operating budget transferring the identified amount of the
categorical funds to the appropriate account for expenditure:

1. Funds for student transportation.

2. Funds for safe schools.

3. Funds for supplemental academic instruction.

4. Funds for research-based reading instruction.

5. Funds for instructional materials if all instructional
material purchases have been completed for that fiscal year, but
no sooner than March 1, 2010 26635.

(12) TOTAL ALLOCATION OF STATE FUNDS TO EACH DISTRICT FOR
CURRENT OPERATION.—The total annual state allocation to each
district for current operation for the FEFP shall be distributed
periodically in the manner prescribed in the General

Appropriations Act.

a Tl haas ~ S ni for vt ~Nor -t o n for +1h oD o
TIIC— ot oS T TIroTitc - oL o rCTrc—OptTracTroO—T0T cCrrCc— oL & oo

dotaorma A o oo~ o n (1 mazrl 0] o g Iz +1h Al ot g~ A~

A3 L o i 1 1 S S 3 A A S B RS L U 5 W A L W W my 77 morcrrpTrrrCO Oy crric— Oroc Tt CTOST

A1 FFEFApr 2 o1 ot~y o At aaeaa A 9y caalhea A~ o n (D b P =Y

T CrCrrcraor taoCtcOorr oo Ottt SO I o oottt T Ot 77 pPTroas oS

S Nt Atz AN L AN AN~ A ] Ao A ANt ot g s oD

oo oircs pProv Gt T CaoctCoTrrrCaoTr—CoOmMpoOncTiTe s Wttt Cit T I7L Ly

detreormana~A 2 oot o n (5 +h S Nt £ 4 SN i 32

A5 S S S 1 5 i i ) N S Y S L O 5 Tl W W S o7 7 crrIC—amooitc Tt O T oSpPpatt oLy

At~ A A S A A A A 2 A~ o n (7 +1h Ao~ 1~ 2 £a-11

SoppTrCmcCirc—as Ot Tttt t TS oalostT T TTOTT 77 critC— O CC T C—TIt—Ttuoxr

Page 58 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
1683 ISEEN AW S -2 (Q\ +he 11 ot 9 A LA ez gl A o0 o~ A Al A g A
O oo T T TIOUIT \ [, CTIT o IO T T T IUIT [ S JLAVCLLJ.J.C JLA»._) C I T ANPAW B U I Uy & N U B W iy §
1684| programs—asdetermined in subsection—{10+—Fthe eguatity assurance
1685 1111111 SN At Arma o~ 2 e A~ - (172 1 oo 4+ roeraa A
\jou_ullL., 4O A8 (= [ S ) ) A A oL [ S [ ¥ N [ WPl Wy WS S N i § AN = A [ SR N ) CTIT J_\/\ﬁkA_LJ_\/\A
1686| Jeoecaleffortas determinedin subseetion {4~ If the funds
1687 appropriated for the purpeose—of funding the total amountfeor
1688 current operation of the FEFP as—provided—in—this paragraph are
I I g I

1689| not sufficient to pay the state requirement in full, the

1690 department shall prorate the available state funds to each

1691| district in the following manner:

1692 1. Determine the percentage of proration by dividing the
1693| sum of the total amount for current operation, as provided in
1694 this paragraph for all districts collectively, and the total
1695 district required local effort into the sum of the state funds
1696 available for current operation and the total district required
1697 local effort.

1698 2. Multiply the percentage so determined by the sum of the
1699| total amount for current operation as provided in this paragraph
1700 and the required local effort for each individual district.
1701 3. From the product of such multiplication, subtract the
1702 required local effort of each district; and the remainder shall
1703| be the amount of state funds allocated to the district for

1704 current operation.

1705 Section 30. Subsection (7) of section 1011.68, Florida

1706 Statutes, is repealed.
1707 Section 31. Section 1011.685, Florida Statutes, is amended
1708 to read:

1709 1011.685 Class size reduction; operating categorical fund.—

1710 (1) There is created an operating categorical fund for

1711 implementing the class size reduction provisions of s. 1, Art.

Page 59 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1712
1713
1714
1715
1716
1717
1718
1719
1720
1721
1722
1723
1724
1725
1726
1727
1728
1729
1730
1731
1732
1733
1734
1735
1736
1737
1738
1739
1740

CS for CS for SB 1676

IX of the State Constitution. These
each school district in the amount p

in the General Appropriations Act.

Second Engrossed

20091676e2

funds shall be allocated to

rescribed by the Legislature

(2) Class size reduction operating categorical funds shall
be used by school districts to reduce class size as required in
s. 1003.03, or the funds may be used for any lawful operating
expenditure; however, priority shall be given to increasing
salaries of classroom teachers. feor—the following:

() T P EE T Al o2 EEE NN P B S =S T | manmnoe - 1 £ + 1

\(.A./ N [ A NPLW B I W) ue) o LTTOO O [ Sy A 1T aIT LT TVW IO J.I.L(_A.J.J.J.J.\_,J_, [ S - T
Al at g At oo A A PV S I R T i B NN B SN O S E T W T P D N i I =i BN I IR
|\ N SRS I WS S S W ey TTTOO o T T T CUoUTTho C T T OUOCITUTITO T TITTE LTTITUTINS T A CTTIC T T 1T OO 1T
o 1002 N2 (71 r +1h roadir b 2~ £ +g ISR SRR PN N ~NENE S £ NN S NP S T I B 2N
[y LU U I UIT L A T [ S PR W B U B NP WS S N i g T W O COATTTICOS t/\.,J_ AN & e J_\.a\iu_LJ_\.,\A.
bz 1002 N2 (D)
oy O TOUUI . U\ VA

(1) Ty anmsz 1 oawrfa-1 nor ot 4o nonda 11 2 £ + 1 A4 ot g ~+

\E [ S ull_y LW IO \JtJC.LL;LL,Lll\j CAFCLLMLLLA.LC, i - - T |\ S EUrUD iy U S S W W
haoao mea+ +1h oottt a Al s amaame 2 A g £ A 4 1002 N2 (71
TTTOS T C T CUITT o C I COCIUIITO 1T T TTITATINS TOACTTIC T I 1T Tk =TT O e LT O U I« U L7/

» + 1 roadir~+ o n £ +1q ataiAANtE A N~ 7Aoo A rag A Nty o
A T [ S PR W B U i) W WS S N i e T W O COATTTICOS t/\_,J_ AN & R J_\_a\iu_LJ_\_,\A. Ly [y
10N NAR/LIDY o T rzAxzA rnxr1 rat+sz a1 P IR TN EIR NN
T U T e U T \ [ 12 LLUVV\./V\./J_, t/J_ [ SN S [SSJ5 i N & Ry e y 8 3_I_V\_,J.J. \awy TTTTCOC T T ToO T
PIN N o £ ~l oo m o~y e AN~ 2 o 1012 A1 (DY ()
[S5J & N Eiy @) i Eps ) WS ) g o LTCTOO O T OUTIT C T T TITT IO T4 A\ S WP E E i NS W ) [ S [y [N S W o UL\ Vi \N=Wi
A+ Tminl Amearnt A4 FFarmt 3 S A A N x7 NNtz a oo Ana Ao+~ = AN
ATTE sy _LllltJ_LClllCllL_ T |\ N E E S N S W B ) U Ey 5 B UPL WP W 3 t/QL t/_l_\JV_LlJ_LulllJ o CO I I CTTr 1T
o 1012 29
O e J S W . .

Section 32. Paragraph (b) of subsection (4) of section
1011.69, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

Section 33. Section 1011.71, Florida Statutes, as amended

by section 12 of chapter 2009-3,
read:
1011.71 District school tax.—
(1) If the district school tax
General Appropriations Act or the su
the General Appropriations Act,

desiring to participate in the state

Page 60 of
CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

Laws of Florida,

is amended to

is not provided in the

bstantive bill implementing

each district school board

allocation of funds for

75

words underlined are additions.




1741
1742
1743
1744
1745
1746
1747
1748
1749
1750
1751
1752
1753
1754
1755
1756
1757
1758
1759
1760
1761
1762
1763
1764
1765
1766
1767
1768
1769

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

current operation as prescribed by s. 1011.62(12) shall levy on
the taxable value for school purposes of the district, exclusive
of millage voted under the provisions of s. 9(b) or s. 12, Art.
VII of the State Constitution, a millage rate not to exceed the
amount certified by the commissioner as the minimum millage rate
necessary to provide the district required local effort for the
current year, pursuant to s. 1011.62(4) (a)l. In addition to the
required local effort millage levy, each district school board
may levy a nonvoted current operating discretionary millage. The
Legislature shall prescribe annually in the appropriations act
the maximum amount of millage a district may levy.

(2) In addition to the maximum millage levy as provided in
subsection (1), each school board may levy not more than 1.5
375 mills against the taxable value for school purposes for
district schools, including charter schools at the discretion of
the school board, to fund:

(a) New construction and remodeling projects, as set forth
in s. 1013.64(3) (b) and (6) (b) and included in the district’s
educational plant survey pursuant to s. 1013.31, without regard
to prioritization, sites and site improvement or expansion to
new sites, existing sites, auxiliary facilities, athletic
facilities, or ancillary facilities.

(b) Maintenance, renovation, and repair of existing school
plants or of leased facilities to correct deficiencies pursuant
to s. 1013.15(2).

(c) The purchase, lease-purchase, or lease of school buses.

(d) Effective July 1, 2008, the purchase, lease-purchase,
or lease of new and replacement equipment, and enterprise

resource software applications that are classified as capital

Page 61 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1770
1771
1772
1773
1774
1775
1776
1777
1778
1779
1780
1781
1782
1783
1784
1785
1786
1787
1788
1789
1790
1791
1792
1793
1794
1795
1796
1797
1798

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

assets in accordance with definitions of the Governmental
Accounting Standards Board, have a useful life of at least 5
years, and are used to support districtwide administration or
state-mandated reporting requirements.

(e) Payments for educational facilities and sites due under
a lease-purchase agreement entered into by a district school
board pursuant to s. 1003.02(1) (f) or s. 1013.15(2), not
exceeding, in the aggregate, an amount equal to three-fourths of
the proceeds from the millage levied by a district school board

pursuant to this subsection. For the 2009-2010 fiscal year, the

three-fourths limit is waived for lease-purchase agreements

entered into before June 30, 2009, by a district school board

pursuant to this paragraph.

(f) Payment of loans approved pursuant to ss. 1011.14 and
1011.15.

(g) Payment of costs directly related to complying with
state and federal environmental statutes, rules, and regulations
governing school facilities.

(h) Payment of costs of leasing relocatable educational
facilities, of renting or leasing educational facilities and
sites pursuant to s. 1013.15(2), or of renting or leasing
buildings or space within existing buildings pursuant to s.
1013.15(4) .

(1) Payment of the cost of school buses when a school
district contracts with a private entity to provide student
transportation services if the district meets the requirements
of this paragraph.

1. The district’s contract must require that the private

entity purchase, lease-purchase, or lease, and operate and

Page 62 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1799| maintain, one or more school buses of a specific type and size
1800 that meet the requirements of s. 1006.25.

1801 2. Each such school bus must be used for the daily

1802 transportation of public school students in the manner required
1803| by the school district.

1804 3. Annual payment for each such school bus may not exceed
1805 10 percent of the purchase price of the state pool bid.

1806 4. The proposed expenditure of the funds for this purpose
1807| must have been included in the district school board’s notice of
1808| proposed tax for school capital outlay as provided in s.

1809 200.065(10).

1810 (7) Payment of the cost of the opening day collection for
1811 the library media center of a new school.

1812 (3) (a) Notwithstanding subsection (2), if the revenue from

1813 1.5 mills is insufficient to meet the payments due under a

1814 lease-purchase agreement entered into before June 30, 2009, by a

1815 district school board pursuant to paragraph (2) (e), or to meet

1816 other critical district fixed capital outlay needs, the board,
1817 in addition to the 1.5 mills, may levy up to 0.25 mills for

1818 fixed capital outlay in lieu of levying an equivalent amount of

1819| the discretionary mills for operations as provided in the

1820| General Appropriations Act. Millage levied pursuant to this

1821 subsection is subject to the provisions of s. 200.065 and,

1822 combined with the 1.5 mills authorized in subsection (2), may

1823 not exceed 1.75 mills. If the district chooses to use up to 0.25

1824| mills for fixed capital outlay, the compression adjustment

1825 pursuant to s. 1011.62(5) shall be calculated for the standard

1826| discretionary millage that is not eligible for transfer to

1827 capital outlay.

Page 63 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1828 (b) In addition to the millage authorized in this section,

1829| each district school board may, by a super majority vote, levy

1830 an additional 0.25 mills for critical capital outlay needs or

1831 for critical operating needs. If levied for capital outlay,

1832| expenditures shall be subject to the requirements of this

1833 section. If levied for operations, expenditures shall be

1834 consistent with the requirements for operating funds received

1835| pursuant to s. 1011.62. If the district levies this additional

1836 0.25 mills for operations, the compression adjustment pursuant

1837 to s. 1011.62(5) shall be calculated and added to the district’s

1838 FEFP allocation. Millage levied pursuant to this paragraph is

1839| subject to the provisions of s. 200.065. In order to be

1840 continued, millage levied pursuant to this paragraph must be

1841 approved by the voters of the district at the next general

1842 election.

1843 (4)+43> If the revenue from the millage authorized in

1844 subsection (2) is insufficient to make payments due under a

1845 lease-purchase agreement entered into prior to June 30, 2008, by
1846 a district school board pursuant to paragraph (2) (e), an amount
1847 up to 0.5 625 mills of the taxable value for school purposes
1848 within the school district shall be legally available for such
1849| payments, notwithstanding other restrictions on the use of such
1850 revenues imposed by law.

1851 (5)+4 Effective July 1, 2008, ard—threugh June36+—2046+ a

1852 school district may expend, subject to the provisions of s.
1853 200.065, up to $100 per unweighted full-time equivalent student
1854 from the revenue generated by the millage levy authorized by

1855 subsection (2) to fund, in addition to expenditures authorized

1856 in paragraphs (2) (a)-(j), expenses for the following:

Page 64 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1857
1858
1859
1860
1861
1862
1863
1864
1865
1866
1867
1868
1869
1870
1871
1872
1873
1874
1875
1876
1877
1878
1879
1880
1881
1882
1883
1884
1885

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

(a) The purchase, lease-purchase, or lease of driver’s
education vehicles; motor vehicles used for the maintenance or
operation of plants and equipment; security vehicles; or
vehicles used in storing or distributing materials and
equipment.

(b) Payment of the cost of premiums for property and
casualty insurance necessary to insure school district
educational and ancillary plants. Operating revenues that are
made available through the payment of property and casualty
insurance premiums from revenues generated under this subsection
may be expended only for nonrecurring operational expenditures
of the school district.

(6) 45 Violations of the expenditure provisions in
subsection (2) or subsection (4) shall result in an equal dollar
reduction in the Florida Education Finance Program (FEFP) funds
for the violating district in the fiscal year following the
audit citation.

(7)+6)> These taxes shall be certified, assessed, and
collected as prescribed in s. 1011.04 and shall be expended as
provided by law.

(8)+4+r Nothing in s. 1011.62(4) (a)l. shall in any way be
construed to increase the maximum school millage levies as
provided for in subsection (1).

(9)48)> In addition to the maximum millage levied under this
section and the General Appropriations Act, a school district
may levy, by local referendum or in a general election,
additional millage for school operational purposes up to an
amount that, when combined with nonvoted millage levied under

this section, does not exceed the 10-mill limit established in

Page 65 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1886
1887
1888
1889
1890
1891
1892
1893
1894
1895
1896
1897
1898
1899
1900
1901
1902
1903
1904
1905
1906
1907
1908
1909
1910
1911
1912
1913
1914

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

s. 9(b), Art. VII of the State Constitution. Any such levy shall
be for a maximum of 4 years and shall be counted as part of the
10-mill limit established in s. 9(b), Art. VII of the State
Constitution. Millage elections conducted under the authority
granted pursuant to this section are subject to s. 1011.73.
Funds generated by such additional millage do not become a part
of the calculation of the Florida Education Finance Program
total potential funds in 2001-2002 or any subsequent year and
must not be incorporated in the calculation of any hold-harmless
or other component of the Florida Education Finance Program
formula in any year. If an increase in required local effort,
when added to existing millage levied under the 10-mill limit,
would result in a combined millage in excess of the 10-mill
limit, any millage levied pursuant to this subsection shall be
considered to be required local effort to the extent that the
district millage would otherwise exceed the 10-mill limit.

Section 34. If the Commissioner of Education determines

that a school district acted in good faith, he or she may waive

the equal-dollar reduction, required in s. 1011.71, Florida

Statutes, for audit findings during the 2007-2008 fiscal year

which were related to the purchase of software.

Section 35. Paragraph (g) of subsection (3) of section
1012.33, Florida Statutes, is amended, and subsection (9) is
added to that section, to read:

1012.33 Contracts with instructional staff, supervisors,
and school principals.—

(3)

(g) Beginning July 1, 2001, for each employee who enters

into a written contract, pursuant to this section, in a school

Page 66 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

1915 district in which the employee was not employed as of June 30,
1916 2001, or was employed as of June 30, 2001, but has since broken
1917| employment with that district for 1 school year or more, for
1918| purposes of pay, a district school board must recognize and

1919| accept each year of full-time public school teaching service

1920 earned in the State of Florida er—euvtside—the—state—and for
1921| which the employee received a satisfactory performance

1922 evaluation; however, an employee may voluntarily waive this

1923| provision. Instructional personnel employed pursuant to s.
1924 121.091(9) (b)3. are exempt from the provisions of this

1925| paragraph.

1926 (9) Notwithstanding this section or any other law or rule

1927 to the contrary, for the 2009-2010 and 2010-2011 fiscal years,

1928| district school boards should not enter into a new professional

1929 service contract if the only funds available to pay such

1930 contract are from nonrecurring Federal Stabilization Funds.

1931 Section 36. Subsection (1) of section 1012.59, Florida

1932 Statutes, is amended to read:

1933 1012.59 Certification fees.—

1934 (1) The State Board of Education, by rule, shall establish
1935 separate fees for applications, examinations, certification,
1936 certification renewal, late renewal, recordmaking, and

1937 recordkeeping, and may establish procedures for scheduling and
1938 administering an examination upon an applicant’s request. Each
1939 fee shall be based on department estimates of the revenue

1940 required to implement the provisions of law with respect to
1941 certification of school personnel. The application fee shall be

1942 nonrefundable. Each examination fee shall be sufficient to cover

1943 the actual cost of developing and administering the examination+

Page 67 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1944
1945
1946
1947
1948
1949
1950
1951
1952
1953
1954
1955
1956
1957
1958
1959
1960
1961
1962
1963
1964
1965
1966
1967
1968
1969
1970
1971
1972

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

D,

bt oho Nt Az~
© (o

11 STNAN Far o Aspoma o4 o
gt —Sarr— 10 X CCeCCG——Too—=L

by
A\ [ 1 I S N A N & 1 1 B M 19 @ B W W Y

Section 37. Subsection (6) is added to section 1012.71,
Florida Statutes, to read:

1012.71 The Florida Teachers Lead Program.-—

(6) For the 2009-2010 fiscal year, the Department of

Education is authorized to conduct a pilot program to determine

the feasibility of managing the Florida Teachers Lead Program

through a centralized electronic system. The pilot program must:

(a) Be established through a competitive procurement

process;

(b) Provide the capability for participating teachers to

purchase from online sources;

(c) Provide the capability for participating teachers to

purchase from local vendors by means other than online

purchasing;

(d) Generally comply with the provisions of this section;

(e) Be subject to annual auditing requirements to ensure

accountability for funds received and disbursed; and

(f) Provide for all unused funds to be returned to the

state at the close of each fiscal year.

Any participation in this pilot program by school districts and

individual teachers must be on a voluntary basis. The department

may limit the number of participating districts to the number it

deems feasible to adequately measure the viability of the pilot

program. The department is not required to implement this pilot

program if it determines that the number of school districts

willing to participate is insufficient to adequately measure the

viability of the pilot program.

Page 68 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1973
1974
1975
1976
1977
1978
1979
1980
1981
1982
1983
1984
1985
1986
1987
1988
1989
1990
1991
1992
1993
1994
1995
1996
1997
1998
1999
2000
2001

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

Section 38. Subsection (6) is added to section 1013.37,
Florida Statutes, to read:

1013.37 State uniform building code for public educational
facilities construction.—

(6) Notwithstanding the requirements of section 22 of

chapter 2008-227, Laws of Florida, the standards for new school

construction, remodeling, and renovation projects shall be

limited to the minimum standards for construction of educational

facilities contained in section 423 of the Florida Building Code

and the State Requirements for Educational Facilities contained

in rules adopted by the Department of Education. This subsection

expires July 1, 2010.
Section 39. Subsection (1) of section 1013.62, Florida

Statutes, is amended, and paragraphs (f), (g), and (h) are added
to subsection (2) of that section, to read:

1013.62 Charter schools capital outlay funding.—

(1) In each year in which funds are appropriated for
charter school capital outlay purposes, the Commissioner of
Education shall allocate the funds among eligible charter
schools.

(a) To be eligible for a funding allocation, a charter
school must:

l.a.H{a)r++ Have been in operation for 3 or more years;

b. Be governed by a governing board established in the

state for 3 or more years which operates both charter schools

and conversion charter schools within the state;

c.Z2+ Be an expanded feeder chain of a charter school within
the same school district that is currently receiving charter

school capital outlay funds; or

Page 69 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2002
2003
2004
2005
2006
2007
2008
2009
2010
2011
2012
2013
2014
2015
2016
2017
2018
2019
2020
2021
2022
2023
2024
2025
2026
2027
2028
2029
2030

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

d.3~ Have been accredited by the Commission on Schools of
the Southern Association of Colleges and Schools.

2.4} Have financial stability for future operation as a
charter school.

3.4e)> Have satisfactory student achievement based on state
accountability standards applicable to the charter school.

4.+4€) Have received final approval from its sponsor
pursuant to s. 1002.33 for operation during that fiscal year.

5.4e) Serve students in facilities that are not provided by
the charter school’s sponsor.

(b) The first priority for charter school capital outlay
funding is shaid—Pbe to allocate to #he charter schools that
received funding in the 2005-2006 fiscal year an allocation of
the same amount per capital outlay full-time equivalent student,
up to the lesser of the actual number of capital outlay full-
time equivalent students in the current year, or the capital
outlay full-time equivalent students in the 2005-2006 fiscal
year. After calculating the first priority, the second priority
is shatd—Pbe to allocate excess funds remaining in the
appropriation in an amount equal to the per capital outlay full-
time equivalent student amount in the first priority calculation
to eligible charter schools not included in the first priority

calculation and to schools in the first priority calculation

with growth greater than imn—exeess—ef the 2005-2006 capital

outlay full-time equivalent students. After calculating the
first and second priorities, excess funds remaining in the

appropriation must shatd be allocated to all eligible charter

schools.

(c) A charter school’s allocation may skhatd+ not exceed one-

Page 70 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

2031 fifteenth of the cost per student station specified in s.
2032 1013.64(6) (b) . Before releasing Prier—+teo—therelease—-of capital

2033| outlay funds to a school district on behalf of the charter
2034 school, the Department of Education must skedldt ensure that the

2035| district school board and the charter school governing board

2036| enter into a written agreement that provides inreludes—provisions
2037 for the reversion of any unencumbered funds and all equipment
2038 and property purchased with public education funds to the

2039| ownership of the district school board, as provided for in

2040 subsection (3) i1f+—3nr+the event—+that the school terminates

2041| operations. Any funds recovered by the state shall be deposited
2042 in the General Revenue Fund.

2043 (d) A charter school is not eligible for a funding

2044 allocation if it was created by the conversion of a public

2045 school and operates in facilities provided by the charter

2046| school’s sponsor for a nominal fee, or at no charge, or if it 1is
2047 directly or indirectly operated by the school district.

2048 (e) Unless otherwise provided in the General Appropriations
2049| Act, the funding allocation for each eligible charter school is
2050| shatdl—be determined by multiplying the school’s projected

2051 student enrollment by one-fifteenth of the cost-per-student

2052 station specified in s. 1013.64(6) (b) for an elementary, middle,
2053 or high school, as appropriate. If the funds appropriated are
2054 not sufficient, the commissioner shall prorate the available
2055 funds among eligible charter schools. However, a ae charter

2056 school or charter lab school may not shaltdt receive state charter

2057 school capital outlay funds greater than im—-exeess—ef the one-

2058 fifteenth cost per student station formula if the charter

2059 school’s combination of state charter school capital outlay

Page 71 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2060
2061
2062
2063
2064
2065
2066
2067
2068
2069
2070
2071
2072
2073
2074
2075
2076
2077
2078
2079
2080
2081
2082
2083
2084
2085
2086
2087
2088

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

funds, capital outlay funds calculated through the reduction in
the administrative fee provided in s. 1002.33(20), and capital
outlay funds allowed in s. 1002.32(9) (e) and (h) exceeds the
one-fifteenth cost per student station formula.

(f) Funds shall be distributed on the basis of the capital
outlay full-time equivalent membership by grade level, which is
shatt—Pbe calculated by averaging the results of the second and
third enrollment surveys. The Department of Education shall
distribute capital outlay funds monthly, beginning in the first
quarter of the fiscal year, based on one-twelfth of the amount
the department reasonably expects the charter school to receive
during that fiscal year. The commissioner shall adjust
subsequent distributions as necessary to reflect each charter
school’s actual student enrollment as reflected in the second
and third enrollment surveys. The commissioner shall establish
the intervals and procedures for determining the projected and
actual student enrollment of eligible charter schools.

(2) A charter school’s governing body may use charter
school capital outlay funds for the following purposes:

(f) Effective July 1, 2008, purchase, lease-purchase, or

lease of new and replacement equipment, and enterprise resource

software applications that are classified as capital assets in

accordance with definitions of the Governmental Accounting

Standards Board, have a useful 1life of at least 5 years, and are

used to support schoolwide administration or state-mandated

reporting requirements.

(g) Payment of the cost of premiums for property and

casualty insurance necessary to insure the school facilities.

(h) Purchase, lease-purchase, or lease of driver’s

Page 72 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2089
2090
2091
2092
2093
2094
2095
2096
2097
2098
2099
2100
2101
2102
2103
2104
2105
2106
2107
2108
2109
2110
2111
2112
2113
2114
2115
2116
2117

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

education vehicles; motor vehicles used for the maintenance or

operation of plants and equipment; security vehicles; or

vehicles used in storing or distributing materials and

equipment.

Conversion charter schools may use capital outlay funds received
through the reduction in the administrative fee provided in s.
1002.33(20) for renovation, repair, and maintenance of school
facilities that are owned by the sponsor.

Section 40. Paragraph (b) of subsection (6) of section
1013.64, Florida Statutes, as amended by section 14 of chapter
2009-3, Laws of Florida, is amended, and subsection (7) 1is added
to that section, to read:

1013.64 Funds for comprehensive educational plant needs;
construction cost maximums for school district capital
projects.—Allocations from the Public Education Capital Outlay
and Debt Service Trust Fund to the various boards for capital
outlay projects shall be determined as follows:

(6)

(b)1. A district school board, including a district school
board of an academic performance-based charter school district,
must not use funds from the following sources: Public Education
Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund; School District and
Community College District Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust
Fund; Classrooms First Program funds provided in s. 1013.68;
effort index grant funds provided in s. 1013.73; nonvoted 1.5-
mill +I=F5—midtt levy of ad valorem property taxes provided in s.

1011.71(2); Classrooms for Kids Program funds provided in s.

1013.735; District Effort Recognition Program funds provided in

Page 73 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2118
2119
2120
2121
2122
2123
2124
2125
2126
2127
2128
2129
2130
2131
2132
2133
2134
2135
2136
2137
2138
2139
2140
2141
2142
2143
2144
2145
2146

CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2

s. 1013.736; or High Growth District Capital Outlay Assistance
Grant Program funds provided in s. 1013.738 for any new
construction of educational plant space with a total cost per
student station, including change orders, that equals more than:

a. $17,952 for an elementary school,

b. $19,386 for a middle school, or

c. $25,181 for a high school,

(January 2006) as adjusted annually to reflect increases or
decreases in the Consumer Price Index.

2. A district school board must not use funds from the
Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund or
the School District and Community College District Capital
Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund for any new construction of
an ancillary plant that exceeds 70 percent of the average cost
per square foot of new construction for all schools.

(7) Notwithstanding subsection (2), the district school
board of Wakulla County shall contribute 1 mill in the 2009-2010
fiscal year and 0.5 mill in the 2010-2011 fiscal year to the

cost of currently funded special facilities construction

projects. The district school board of Liberty County shall

contribute 1 mill for each of the fiscal years 2009-2010 through

2011-2012 to the cost of currently funded special facilities

construction projects. If funds are made available in the

General Appropriations Act for the 2009-2010 fiscal year for the

district school board of Calhoun County from the Special

Facilities Construction Account, the district school board shall

contribute 1.125 mills for each of the fiscal years from 2009-

2010 through 2012-2013 to the cost of funded special facilities

Page 74 of 75

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for CS for SB 1676 Second Engrossed

20091676e2
2147 construction projects.
2148 Section 41. Section 9 of chapter 2008-142, Laws of Florida,
2149 is repealed.
2150 Section 42. In order to implement Specific Appropriations

2151 5A, 6, 7, 76, and 77 of the General Appropriations Act for the

2152 2009-2010 fiscal year, the calculations of the Florida Education

2153 Finance Program for the 2009-2010 fiscal year in the document
2154 entitled “Public School Funding - The Florida Education Finance

2155| Program,” dated May 5, 2009, and filed with the Secretary of the

2156| Senate are incorporated by reference for the purpose of

2157| displaying the calculations used by the Legislature, consistent

2158| with requirements of the Florida Statutes, in making

2159| appropriations for the Florida Education Finance Program.

2160 Section 43. This act shall take effect July 1, 2009.

Page 75 of 75
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.






