F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010
1 A bill to be entitled
2 An act relating to the review of the Department of
3 Management Services under the Florida Government
4 Accountability Act; reenacting s. 20.22, F.S., relating to
5 the creation and organization of the Department of
6 Management Services; amending s. 120.54, F.S.; requiring a
7 petitioner requesting an administrative hearing to include
8 the petitioner's e-mail address; requiring the request for
9 administrative hearing by a respondent to include the e-
10 mail address of the party's counsel or qualified
11 representative; creating s. 120.585, F.S.; requiring the
12 filing of documents with the Division of Administrative
13 Hearings by electronic means under certain circumstances;
14 amending ss. 57.111, 120.56, 120.569, 120.57, 553.73, and
15 961.03, F.S.; providing for electronic filing and
16 transmission procedures for certain actions, proceedings,
17 and petitions; conforming provisions to changes made by
18 the act; amending s. 287.05721, F.S.; deleting the
19 definition of the term "council"; repealing s. 287.0573,
20 F.S., relating to the Council on Efficient Government;
21 amending s. 287.0574, F.S.; conforming provisions to
22 changes made by this act; amending s. 287.0943, F.S.;
23 deleting provisions establishing the Minority Business
24 Certification Task Force, requiring that criteria for the
25 certification of minority business enterprises be approved
26 by the task force, and authorizing the task force to amend
27 the statewide and interlocal agreement for the
28 certification of minority business enterprises; amending

Page 1 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010
29 s. 287.0947, F.S.; authorizing the Secretary of Management
30 Services to establish the Florida Advisory Council on
31 Small and Minority Business Development for certain
32 purposes; amending s. 440.192 and 440.25, F.S.; providing
33 and revising procedures for filing petitions for benefits
34 and other documents in workers' compensation benefits
35 proceedings to provide for electronic filing and
36 transmission under certain circumstances; amending s.
37 440.29 and 440.45, F.S.; authorizing the Office of the
38 Judges of Compensation Claims to adopt rules for certain
39 purposes; reenacting s. 760.03(1), F.S., relating to
40 creation of the Commission on Human Relations; amending s.
41 760.11, F.S.; increasing for a specified period the time
42 within which the commission must determine if there is
43 reasonable cause to believe that certain discriminatory
44 practices have occurred; providing a filing fee for an
45 administrative hearing; providing for waiver or recovery
46 of the fee under certain circumstances; amending s.
47 766.305, F.S.; revising service and notice requirements
48 for petitions seeking compensation for a birth-related
49 neurological injury to provide for electronic
50 notification; amending s. 766.309, F.S.; providing and
51 revising procedures for determinations of such injury
52 claims to provide for electronic notification; amending s.
53 766.31, F.S.; providing and revising procedures for
54 notification of awards of compensation for such injuries
55 to provide for electronic notification; providing an
56 effective date.

Page 2 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

57
58 Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
59

60 Section 1. Section 20.22, Florida Statutes, is reenacted.

ol Section 2. Paragraph (b) of subsection (4) of section

62 57.111, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

63 57.111 Civil actions and administrative proceedings

64 initiated by state agencies; attorneys' fees and costs.—

65 (4)

66 (b)1l. To apply for an award under this section, the

67 attorney for the prevailing small business party must submit an
68 itemized affidavit to the court which first conducted the

69| adversarial proceeding in the underlying action, or by

70| electronic means through the division's website to the Division

71 of Administrative Hearings, which shall assign an administrative
72 law judgey# in the case of a proceeding pursuant to chapter 120,

73 which affidavit shall reveal the nature and extent of the

74 services rendered by the attorney as well as the costs incurred

75 in preparations, motions, hearings, and appeals in the

76| proceeding.

77 2. The application for an award of attorney's fees must be
78| made within 60 days after the date that the small business party
79| becomes a prevailing small business party.

80 Section 3. Paragraph (b) of subsection (5) of section

81 120.54, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

82 120.54 Rulemaking.—
83 (5) UNIFORM RULES.—
84 (b) The uniform rules of procedure adopted by the

Page 3 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

85 commission pursuant to this subsection shall include, but are
86| not limited to:
87 1. Uniform rules for the scheduling of public meetings,
88 hearings, and workshops.
89 2. Uniform rules for use by each state agency that provide
90| procedures for conducting public meetings, hearings, and
91| workshops, and for taking evidence, testimony, and argument at
92 such public meetings, hearings, and workshops, in person and by
93| means of communications media technology. The rules shall
94| provide that all evidence, testimony, and argument presented
95 shall be afforded equal consideration, regardless of the method
96| of communication. If a public meeting, hearing, or workshop is
97| to be conducted by means of communications media technology, or
98 if attendance may be provided by such means, the notice shall so
99| state. The notice for public meetings, hearings, and workshops
100 utilizing communications media technology shall state how
101| persons interested in attending may do so and shall name
102 locations, if any, where communications media technology
103 facilities will be available. Nothing in this paragraph shall be
104 construed to diminish the right to inspect public records under
105 chapter 119. Limiting points of access to public meetings,
106| hearings, and workshops subject to the provisions of s. 286.011
107 to places not normally open to the public shall be presumed to
108 violate the right of access of the public, and any official
109| action taken under such circumstances is void and of no effect.
110 Other laws relating to public meetings, hearings, and workshops,
111 including penal and remedial provisions, shall apply to public

112 meetings, hearings, and workshops conducted by means of

Page 4 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

113 communications media technology, and shall be liberally

114 construed in their application to such public meetings,

115| hearings, and workshops. As used in this subparagraph,

116 "communications media technology" means the electronic

117 transmission of printed matter, audio, full-motion video,

118 freeze-frame video, compressed video, and digital video by any
119| method available.

120 3. Uniform rules of procedure for the filing of notice of
121| protests and formal written protests. The Administration

122| Commission may prescribe the form and substantive provisions of
123 a required bond.

124 4. Uniform rules of procedure for the filing of petitions
125 for administrative hearings pursuant to s. 120.569 or s. 120.57.
126| Such rules shall require the petition to include:

127 a. The identification of the petitioner, including the

128 petitioner's e-mail address, if any, for the transmittal of

129 subsequent documents by electronic means.

130 b. A statement of when and how the petitioner received

131 notice of the agency's action or proposed action.

132 c. An explanation of how the petitioner's substantial

133 interests are or will be affected by the action or proposed

134 action.

135 d. A statement of all material facts disputed by the

136| petitioner or a statement that there are no disputed facts.

137 e. A statement of the ultimate facts alleged, including a

138 statement of the specific facts the petitioner contends warrant

139 reversal or modification of the agency's proposed action.

140 f. A statement of the specific rules or statutes that the
Page 5 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

141| petitioner contends require reversal or modification of the

142 agency's proposed action, including an explanation of how the
143 alleged facts relate to the specific rules or statutes.

144 g. A statement of the relief sought by the petitioner,

145 stating precisely the action petitioner wishes the agency to

146 take with respect to the proposed action.

147 5. Uniform rules for the filing of request for

148 administrative hearing by a respondent in agency enforcement and
149| disciplinary actions. Such rules shall require a request to

150 include:

151 a. The name, address, e-mail address, and telephone number

152 of the party making the request and the name, address, e-mail
153 address, and telephone number of the party's counsel or

154| qualified representative upon whom service of pleadings and

155 other papers shall be made;

156 b. A statement that the respondent is requesting an

157 administrative hearing and disputes the material facts alleged
158| by the petitioner, in which case the respondent shall identify
159 those material facts that are in dispute, or that the respondent
160 is requesting an administrative hearing and does not dispute the
161| material facts alleged by the petitioner; and

162 c. A reference by file number to the administrative

163 complaint that the party has received from the agency and the
164 date on which the agency pleading was received.

165
166| The agency may provide an election-of-rights form for the

167 respondent's use in requesting a hearing, so long as any form

168| provided by the agency calls for the information in sub-

Page 6 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

169 subparagraphs a. through c. and does not impose any additional
170 requirements on a respondent in order to request a hearing,

171 unless such requirements are specifically authorized by law.
172 6. Uniform rules of procedure for the filing and prompt
173 disposition of petitions for declaratory statements. The rules
174 shall also describe the contents of the notices that must be
175| published in the Florida Administrative Weekly under s. 120.565,
176| 1including any applicable time limit for the filing of petitions
177 to intervene or petitions for administrative hearing by persons
178| whose substantial interests may be affected.

1795 7. Provision of a method by which each agency head shall
180| provide a description of the agency's organization and general
181| course of its operations. The rules shall require that the

182 statement concerning the agency's organization and operations be
183| published on the agency's website.

184 8. Uniform rules establishing procedures for granting or
185| denying petitions for variances and waivers pursuant to s.

186 120.542.

187 Section 4. Paragraphs (c) and (d) of subsection (1) of
188 section 120.56, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

189 120.56 Challenges to rules.—

190 (1) GENERAL PROCEDURES FOR CHALLENGING THE VALIDITY OF A
191 RULE OR A PROPOSED RULE.—

192 (c) The petition shall be filed by electronic means with

193] the division, which shall, immediately upon filing, forward by

194 electronic means copies to the agency whose rule is challenged,

195 the Department of State, and the committee. Within 10 days after
196 receiving the petition, the division director shall, if the

Page 7 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

197| petition complies with the requirements of paragraph (b), assign
198 an administrative law judge who shall conduct a hearing within
199 30 days thereafter, unless the petition is withdrawn or a

200 continuance is granted by agreement of the parties or for good
201 cause shown. Evidence of good cause includes, but is not limited
202 to, written notice of an agency's decision to modify or withdraw
203 the proposed rule or a written notice from the chair of the

204| committee stating that the committee will consider an objection
205| to the rule at its next scheduled meeting. The failure of an

206 agency to follow the applicable rulemaking procedures or

207 requirements set forth in this chapter shall be presumed to be
208| material; however, the agency may rebut this presumption by

209| showing that the substantial interests of the petitioner and the
210 fairness of the proceedings have not been impaired.

211 (d) Within 30 days after the hearing, the administrative
212 law judge shall render a decision and state the reasons therefor

213 in writing. The division shall forthwith transmit by electronic

214| means copies of the administrative law judge's decision to the
215 agency, the Department of State, and the committee.

216 Section 5. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) of section
217 120.569, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

218 120.569 Decisions which affect substantial interests.—
219 (2) (a) Except for any proceeding conducted as prescribed
220 in s. 120.56, a petition or request for a hearing under this
221 section shall be filed with the agency. If the agency requests
222 an administrative law judge from the division, it shall so

223| notify the division by electronic means through the division's

224 website within 15 days after receipt of the petition or request.

Page 8 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

225| A request for a hearing shall be granted or denied within 15

226| days after receipt. On the request of any agency, the division
227 shall assign an administrative law judge with due regard to the
228 expertise required for the particular matter. The referring

229 agency shall take no further action with respect to a proceeding
230 under s. 120.57(1), except as a party litigant, as long as the
231 division has Jjurisdiction over the proceeding under s.

232 120.57(1) . Any party may request the disqualification of the

233| administrative law judge by filing an affidavit with the

234| division prior to the taking of evidence at a hearing, stating
235| the grounds with particularity.

236 Section 6. Paragraph (d) of subsection (3) of section

237 120.57, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

238 120.57 Additional procedures for particular cases.—

239 (3) ADDITIONAL PROCEDURES APPLICABLE TO PROTESTS TO

240 CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD.—Agencies subject to this chapter
241 shall use the uniform rules of procedure, which provide

242| procedures for the resolution of protests arising from the

243 contract solicitation or award process. Such rules shall at

244 least provide that:

245 (d)1. The agency shall provide an opportunity to resolve
246 the protest by mutual agreement between the parties within 7

247 days, excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and state holidays, after
248 receipt of a formal written protest.

249 2. If the subject of a protest is not resolved by mutual
250 agreement within 7 days, excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and state
251 holidays, after receipt of the formal written protest, and if
252 there is no disputed issue of material fact, an informal

Page 9 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTAT

253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261
262
263
264
265
266
2677
268
269
270
271
272
273
274
275
276
277
278
279
280

HB 7159

proceeding shall be conducted pursuant to subsection (2) and
applicable agency rules before a person whose qualifications

have been prescribed by rules of the agency.

holidays, after receipt of the formal written protest, and if
there is a disputed issue of material fact, the agency shall

refer the protest to the division by electronic means through

3. If the subject of a protest is not resolved by mutual

agreement within 7 days, excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and state

the division's website for proceedings under subsection (1).

to read:

120.585 Electronic filing.—All documents filed with the

Section 7. Section 120.585, Florida Statutes, 1s created

division by a party represented by an attorney must be filed by

I V E S

2010

electronic means through the division's website. All documents

filed with the division by a party not represented by an

attorney shall, whenever possible, be filed by electronic means

through the division's website.

to read:
287.05721 Definitions.—As used in ss. 287.0571-287.0574

the term=

\ L NP TIUNpp I I | SO + 1 Cormad mELes
7 T e s iy

Section 8. Section 287.05721, Florida Statutes, is amended

’

S aWal n o
A\SAW AW ¥ 1 i ups npu T |F ¥ A SR WA WA W i 1 ) U mpu S W i 5 T O TCTTT

42> "outsource" means the process of contracting with a

whole or in part, or an activity as defined in s.

and accountability for the service or activity and there is a

transfer of management responsibility for the delivery of

Page 10 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

vendor to provide a service as defined in s. 216.011(1) (f), in

216.011(1) (rr), while a state agency retains the responsibility

hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA

281
282
283
284
285
286
287
288
289
290
291
292
293
294
295
296
297
298
299
300
301
302
303
304
305
306
307
308

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI

HB 7159 2010

resources and the performance of those resources.

Section 9. Section 287.0573, Florida Statutes, is

repealed.

Section 10. Section 287.0574, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

287.0574 Business cases to outsource; review and analysis;
requirements.—

(1) A business case to outsource having a projected cost
exceeding $10 million in any fiscal year shall require:

(a) An initial business case analysis conducted by the

the

state agency and submitted to #he—-eewneilts the Governor,

President of the Senate, and the Speaker of the House of

Representatives at least 60 days before a solicitation is

iSSUGd Th oo~ ] akh~11 PR IET = +h hitatimnmaaa ~oa A alszaa o

. [ S i ) AL U i R B N S [SSJ5 N & iy e =y ARV & R H W it & N WPl usy CTT OO LTI TS WO o T ullu_L_YQ_LQ
ENAA PR T SN I SN N N DL P TN roarm et +1h ot o+ Seroa o~ +h Corzorno
(@ Ruaw O DT T aIT (& W B vy _L».)UJ__Y J_\.,t/UJ_ (= ja T o C OO CT (.A.\.j\.,llk/_y I T UV O ITTITOT I
+1 Preact darnd+ £+ [N S PP~ I S 2N [P -~ £+ & ST £

T T T OO AT TITC e T u\_,LLup\_,, (@R uaw T ut/\_,ui S g T 1T IOTNOoO T g
Rorraoaaant o+ 27 o+ ~ Az o~ rore et 2o N A A A i+ o+

T \_,t/J_\_,L_)\_,ll CTO T IV TOo WITCTTT T (& W B vy —LA_)UJ—_Y J_\_,t/UJ_ (= ) \_/Ulllt/_l_\_, L.,\_,\A., L W AW wn g
oot 20 Aoz WA fF o +1 PN 1 aa o+ P=IN BE APEE ENE S EE

T OO T T \.A-(./L_YA) L PR E N S w) T u\j\_,ll\_/_y Lo o UUTO T oo T T T T CTOCITUTT

(b) A final business case analysis conducted by the state

agency and submitted after the conclusion of any negotiations,

at least 30 days before execution of a contract, to the—-eouvneil;

the Governor, the President of the Senate, and the Speaker of
the House of Representatives.

(2) A proposal to outsource having a projected cost that
ranges from $1 million to $10 million in any fiscal year shall
require:

(a) An initial business case analysis conducted by the
state agency and submission of the business case, at least 30

Page 11 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00

vV E S




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

309| days before issuing a solicitation, to £he—eeuneils the

310 Governor, the President of the Senate, and the Speaker of the
311 House of Representatives.

312 (b) A final business case analysis conducted by the state
313 agency and submitted after the conclusion of any negotiations,

314 at least 30 days before execution of a contract, to the—-eouneil;

315 the Governor, the President of the Senate, and the Speaker of
316 the House of Representatives.

317 (3) A business case to outsource having a projected cost
318| that is less than $1 million in any fiscal year shall require a
319| final business case analysis conducted by the state agency after
320 the conclusion of any negotiations and provided at least 30 days
321| before execution of a contract to the department eeureit. Fhe
322| eeouwneitshall preovide sueh business eases intEs anrnvat—report

323 + +1h Teocogral -+
(- a—y I J_l\.,\.j_Lu_LuL.,uJ_\.,o

324 (4) For any proposed outsourcing, the state agency shall
325 develop a business case that justifies the proposal to
326 outsource. In order to reduce any administrative burden, £he
327| ecouneit—may—ar+ow a state agency may e submit the business case
328 in the form required by the budget instructions issued pursuant
329 to s. 216.023(4) (a)7., augmented with additional information if
330 necessary, to ensure that the requirements of this section are
331| met. The business case is not subject to challenge or protest
332| pursuant to chapter 120. The business case must include, but
333| need not be limited to:
334 (a) A detailed description of the service or activity for
335| which the outsourcing is proposed.
336 (b) A description and analysis of the state agency's

Page 12 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

337 current performance, based on existing performance metrics if
338 the state agency is currently performing the service or

339 activity.

340 (c) The goals desired to be achieved through the proposed
341 outsourcing and the rationale for such goals.

342 (d) A citation to the existing or proposed legal authority
343 for outsourcing the service or activity.

344 (e) A description of available options for achieving the
345 goals. If state employees are currently performing the service
346| or activity, at least one option involving maintaining state
347| provision of the service or activity shall be included.

348 (f) An analysis of the advantages and disadvantages of
349| each option, including, at a minimum, potential performance

350 improvements and risks.

351 (g) A description of the current market for the

352 contractual services that are under consideration for

353 outsourcing.

354 (h) A cost-benefit analysis documenting the direct and
355 indirect specific baseline costs, savings, and qualitative and
356| quantitative benefits involved in or resulting from the

357 implementation of the recommended option or options. Such

358 analysis must specify the schedule that, at a minimum, must be
359| adhered to in order to achieve the estimated savings. All

360 elements of cost must be clearly identified in the cost-benefit
361 analysis, described in the business case, and supported by

362 applicable records and reports. The state agency head shall

363| attest that, based on the data and information underlying the
304 business case, to the best of his or her knowledge, all

Page 13 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

365| projected costs, savings, and benefits are valid and achievable.
366 As used in this section, the term "cost" means the reasonable,
367 relevant, and verifiable cost, which may include, but is not

368 limited to, elements such as personnel, materials and supplies,
369 services, equipment, capital depreciation, rent, maintenance and
370 repairs, utilities, insurance, personnel travel, overhead, and
371 interim and final payments. The appropriate elements shall

372| depend on the nature of the specific initiative. As used in this
373 section, the term "savings" means the difference between the

374| direct and indirect actual annual baseline costs compared to the
375 projected annual cost for the contracted functions or

376| responsibilities in any succeeding state fiscal year during the
377 term of the contract.

378 (i) A description of differences among current state

379| agency policies and processes and, as appropriate, a discussion
380 of options for or a plan to standardize, consolidate, or revise
381 current policies and processes, 1f any, to reduce the

382 customization of any proposed solution that would otherwise be
383 required.

384 (J) A description of the specific performance standards
385 that must, at a minimum, be met to ensure adequate performance.
386 (k) The projected timeframe for key events from the

387| beginning of the procurement process through the expiration of a

388 contract.

389 (1) A plan to ensure compliance with the public records
390 law.
391 (m) A specific and feasible contingency plan addressing

392 contractor nonperformance and a description of the tasks

Page 14 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

393 involved in and costs required for its implementation.

394 (n) A state agency's transition plan for addressing

395 changes in the number of agency personnel, affected business
396| processes, employee transition issues, and communication with
397 affected stakeholders, such as agency clients and the public.
398 The transition plan must contain a reemployment and retraining
399 assistance plan for employees who are not retained by the state
400 agency or employed by the contractor.

401 (o) A plan for ensuring access by persons with

402| disabilities in compliance with applicable state and federal
403 law.

404 (p) A description of legislative and budgetary actions
405 necessary to accomplish the proposed outsourcing.

406 (5) In addition to the contract requirements provided in
407 s. 287.058, each contract for a proposed outsourcing, pursuant
408 to this section, must include, but need not be limited to, the
409 following contractual provisions:

410 (a) A scope-of-work provision that clearly specifies each
411 service or deliverable to be provided, including a description
412 of each deliverable or activity that is quantifiable,

413| measurable, and verifiable. This provision must include a clause
414 that states if a particular service or deliverable is

415 inadvertently omitted or not clearly specified but determined to
416| be operationally necessary and verified to have been performed
417| by the agency within the 12 months before the execution of the
418 contract, such service or deliverable will be provided by the
419| contractor through the identified contract-amendment process.
420 (b) A service-level-agreement provision describing all

Page 15 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

421 services to be provided under the terms of the agreement, the
422 state agency's service requirements and performance objectives,
423 specific responsibilities of the state agency and the

424 contractor, and the process for amending any portion of the

425 service-level agreement. Each service-level agreement must

426 contain an exclusivity clause that allows the state agency to
4277 retain the right to perform the service or activity, directly or
428| with another contractor, if service levels are not being

429| achieved.

430 (c) A provision that identifies all associated costs,

431 specific payment terms, and payment schedules, including

432| provisions governing incentives and financial disincentives and
433| criteria governing payment.

434 (d) A provision that identifies a clear and specific

435| transition plan that will be implemented in order to complete
436| all required activities needed to transfer the service or

437 activity from the state agency to the contractor and operate the
438 service or activity successfully.

439 (e) A performance-standards provision that identifies all
440 required performance standards, which must include, at a

441 | minimum:

442 1. Detailed and measurable acceptance criteria for each
443 deliverable and service to be provided to the state agency under
444 the terms of the contract which document the required

445| performance level.

446 2. A method for monitoring and reporting progress in

447 achieving specified performance standards and levels.

448 3. The sanctions or disincentives that shall be imposed

Page 16 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

449 for nonperformance by the contractor or state agency.

450 (f) A provision that requires the contractor and its

451 subcontractors to maintain adequate accounting records that

452 comply with all applicable federal and state laws and generally
453 accepted accounting principles.

454 (g) A provision that authorizes the state agency to have
455 access to and to audit all records related to the contract and
456| subcontracts, or any responsibilities or functions under the

457 contract and subcontracts, for purposes of legislative

458 oversight, and a requirement for audits by a service

459| organization in accordance with professional auditing standards,
460 if appropriate.

4601 (h) A provision that requires the contractor to interview
462| and consider for employment with the contractor each displaced
463| state employee who is interested in such employment.

464 (1) A contingency-plan provision that describes the

465| mechanism for continuing the operation of the service or

466| activity, including transferring the service or activity back to
467 the state agency or successor contractor if the contractor fails
468 to perform and comply with the performance standards and levels
469| of the contract and the contract is terminated.

470 (j) A provision that requires the contractor and its

471 subcontractors to comply with public records laws, specifically
472 to:

473 1. Keep and maintain the public records that ordinarily
474 and necessarily would be required by the state agency in order
475| to perform the service or activity.

476 2. Provide the public with access to such public records

Page 17 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA

477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487
488
489
490
491
492
493
494
495
496
497
498
499
500
501
502
503
504

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI

HB 7159 2010

on the same terms and conditions that the state agency would
provide the records and at a cost that does not exceed that
provided in chapter 119 or as otherwise provided by law.

3. Ensure that records that are exempt or records that are
confidential and exempt are not disclosed except as authorized
by law.

4. Meet all requirements for retaining records and
transfer to the state agency, at no cost, all public records in
possession of the contractor upon termination of the contract
and destroy any duplicate public records that are exempt or
confidential and exempt. All records stored electronically must
be provided to the state agency in a format that is compatible
with the information technology systems of the state agency.

(k) A provision that addresses ownership of intellectual
property. This paragraph does not provide the specific authority
needed by an agency to obtain a copyright or trademark.

(1) TIf applicable, a provision that allows the agency to

purchase from the contractor, at its depreciated value, assets
used by the contractor in the performance of the contract. If
assets have not depreciated, the agency shall retain the right
to negotiate to purchase at an agreed-upon cost.

of subsection

Section 11. Subsection (2)

(3) of section 287.0943,

and paragraph (e)

Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

287.0943 Certification of minority business enterprises.—
(2) () Th £~ T oyl a4 o~ 4+ oarmszar =~
\NZWi I |\ S S ) ) T - J\J_Y |\ R e o A8 Ay ANZA P i RV T L
WNJS m Nt b c7 Daoadm oo (b3 L3 b2~y Mol T "W mp ool £
L.l_l_llu_l__LL,_y OO TITCTO O CcCCo T C I T TrCOCTCITUIlT TCOOIY [ B U S W) ey [ N iy C o IY [ SN S W ey
a1 + o fFram SN A~~~ it ] ISR SR NP N IR — IR S~ ZNE N
[0 | & = g =y T T C o |\ S U w3 o Llcvcoou_L_y, L AW sy T T8O O [ g g L/lCllL,_L_Y CTIITTIT
Page 18 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00

vV E S




vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2010

HB 7159

D
h D & HO)
D b - P 0 di
~ ¥ B N e oy
0] & D, a1y 9] D oo KO)]
D H ) H P -H & D p D
- 0 & - N D ¢ ¢ D 4D o Ky
ORI (V) T + - D QW D 4
¢ o W ke D @ D @ & -d @ -
¢ P D - £ - o, - D & D 4P P
D D 4P ()] [OFE. & & ()] ¢
HOZE O B O B | (IS [o9) ® D W@ -t
D oy D, NI . [0} YH D O D D
» ~ (V] -H » D — D o)l .hn.. wuL
(ORI $H @ o o L H D 1D N OR
® ¢ <~ @ e - M i [ )] (VR n P (o]
i D ®© 4P (NI 0 o D - -Ho D P
® & 4 [09] H < B [op) b D [09) RO D
T R R D @ - M - P @ ol 4
o 4@ ey . b >Ap | b ® T
ST (VI VI (ORI 3 OB | PP o} (OB i
L (I O VI R @ SR () N1 SR ( S -H 4P D - —H
— D [¢p] © -H ()] » - ® - - [4p] @ ww o)l — = IN
® HOJ - ® k< 0] @ i1y - 4 N 4 D 4P D — L - -
@ HO) D ¢ H & D W D D ® Hi ® $H 4 W
D D D — D B D 0n @ » D © ow D D
-H & H O —H 4 N D Q©  -H - - H oo D N ud e
RN By B D @ U ©h A = [\ O [ S OIS
) - 4o D < D i £ -
H ™ O ()] [09) -H Uh —H W 4 KN N i} [09) BT
¢ o ¥ D 1) P D [s0) ® D D D Y Kd [{o I |
D - [ON ® ey 4P - ® -m -t D )] D D +# @ b
ORI n N = € @ H ) @ S D - B D
oo [09] ()] D @ D D o, ¢ YH oo (Ox —H
— D ~ ¢« q YH -l b D, -A - O, @ U D oo P
H QO n W b M U B D ® £ #» ¢ ¢
P b T 4 - & P ® m H & -
o9 o 4D M Y D -H H Y -H - UH D D ) o)
I OVI(V N D B Y D D O 4l D NaEENOR D & ™ -
D D UH o)l o)l D D D D g1y K -H ® 0] H
D & D D D ¢ T © £ & | [ox) - ()] jon D
(0] H ()] D [99) [0} D [0} D @ YH [19] -H < @
H h [09) (OFIEN(V] HOoL R H A [OJ | D @ 4 [09) )] b
D D @ Y B -H H 0] YH H ® [0}
WP D D - HO) T B © B P Woq [09] D >4
I b0 T P P -4 P Y - H Q
L ) N o T R £ £ (R O - d 0 P F £ >
Q© -H @ -H D () H H H D H @ -H B € ®
® > © Q b O O N O b O 0] g
W < -M ¢ H - ~H ®© R ()] -t . < K
D Q©h P D Q EN EN EN < [ ] 4l D Eiy) . D
D v O - O, £ h ) O @
L 41 -fd B n D D D D D <~ ¥ D & H P ¢
EH D b [09] D N« @ D [1V] D & D D
-H P E B B B B ER . . D @ D S R
P H - @ - -H ' P B i .
~ ¢ ¢ @ () D D D O
D o9} o, O E N . . . . . . - & 9] i1y N
~ -f -f - o6 - HoON oD W - - P ~ ¢ ® -H e -
ST ) b 4 - O o 4 W @ 5 @
e, - -H- (RO - - ) D B P O P -
& ¢ PO > @ N m D,
D iy D D ON oo D E oo ool B &
v & & > P H ) D D P D & D
n W ™~ O O O «+H N O < 1O W >~ 0 O O +H N OO < 1’ W >~ 0 O O « «
O o o o o 4 4 d4 A4 4 4 +d4 d4 +H4 +H4 N N N N N N N N N N O O ™M
To N To B To N To I To NN o ENNTo NN o NN To NN o NN To NENNTo NN To NN o NN To NN o NENNToNENNTo INNNTe NENNTo NN Te NENNTo NN Te NN To NN Te NN To NN TONENNTo)

Page 19 of 37

d are additions.

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb7159-00



F L ORI

533
534
535
536
537
538
539
540
541
542
543
544
545
546
547
548
549
550
551
552
553
554
555
556
557
558
559
560

D A H O U S E O F R EPRESENTAT

HB 7159

vV E S

2010

(a)+er
certification criteria shall,
1.
288.703(3),

In assessing the status of ownership and control,
at a minimum:
Link ownership by a minority person, as defined in s.
or as dictated by the legal obligations of a
certifying organization, to day-to-day control and financial
risk by the gqualifying minority owner, and to demonstrated
expertise or licensure of a minority owner in any trade or

profession that the minority business enterprise will offer to

business enterprise.
2. If present ownership was obtained by transfer,
the minority person on whom eligibility is based to have owned
at least 51 percent of the applicant firm for a minimum of 2
years,

was by a nonminority who is or was a relative,

or current employer of the minority person on whom eligibility

Page 20 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

the state when certified. Businesses must comply with all state

licensing requirements prior to becoming certified as a minority

require

when any previous majority ownership interest in the firm

former employer,

hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

561 is based. This requirement shall not apply to minority persons
562| who are otherwise eligible who take a 5l-percent-or-greater

563 interest in a firm that requires professional licensure to

564 operate and who will be the qualifying licenseholder for the

565 firm when certified. A transfer made within a related immediate
566 family group from a nonminority person to a minority person in
567 order to establish ownership by a minority person shall be

568 deemed to have been made solely for purposes of satisfying

569| certification criteria and shall render such ownership invalid
570 for purposes of qualifying for such certification if the

571 combined total net asset value of all members of such family

572| group exceeds $1 million. For purposes of this subparagraph, the
573| term "related immediate family group" means one or more children
574 under 16 years of age and a parent of such children or the

575 spouse of such parent residing in the same house or living unit.
576 3. Require that prospective certified minority business
577 enterprises be currently performing or seeking to perform a

578 useful business function. A "useful business function" is

579| defined as a business function which results in the provision of
580| materials, supplies, equipment, or services to customers. Acting
581 as a conduit to transfer funds to a nonminority business does
582| not constitute a useful business function unless it is done so
583 in a normal industry practice. As used in this section, the term
584 "acting as a conduit" means, in part, not acting as a regular
585| dealer by making sales of material, goods, or supplies from

586 items bought, kept in stock, and regularly sold to the public in
587 the usual course of business. Brokers, manufacturer's

588 representatives, sales representatives, and nonstocking

Page 21 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

589| distributors are considered as conduits that do not perform a
590 useful business function, unless normal industry practice

591 dictates.

592 (b)«4#£ When a business receives payments or awards

593 exceeding $100,000 in one fiscal year, a review of its

594 certification status or an audit will be conducted within 2

595 years. In addition, random reviews or audits will be conducted
596| as deemed appropriate by the Office of Supplier Diversity.

597 (c)+e>r The certification criteria approved—by—the—task
598| feree—and adopted by the Department of Management Services shall
599| be included in a statewide and interlocal agreement as defined
600 in s. 287.09431 and, in accordance with s. 163.01, shall be

601| executed according to the terms included therein.

602 (d)4> The certification procedures should allow an

603| applicant seeking certification to designate on the application
604 form the information the applicant considers to be proprietary,
605| confidential business information. As used in this paragraph,
606 "proprietary, confidential business information" includes, but
607 is not limited to, any information that would be exempt from
608| public inspection pursuant to the provisions of chapter 119;
609 trade secrets; internal auditing controls and reports; contract
610 costs; or other information the disclosure of which would injure
611 the affected party in the marketplace or otherwise violate s.
612 286.041. The executor in receipt of the application shall issue
613| written and final notice of any information for which

614 noninspection is requested but not provided for by law.

615 (e)43+)> A business that is certified under the provisions

616 of the statewide and interlocal agreement shall be deemed a

Page 22 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA

HB 7159

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

2010

617
618
619
620
621
622
623
624
625
626
627
628
629
630
631
632
633
634
635
636
637
638
639
640
641
642
643
644

certified minority enterprise in all Jjurisdictions or
organizations where the agreement is in effect, and that
business is deemed available to do business as such within any
such jurisdiction or with any such organization statewide. All
state agencies must accept minority business enterprises
certified in accordance with the statewide and interlocal
agreement of s. 287.09431, and that business shall also be
deemed a "certified minority business enterprise" as defined in
s. 288.703. However, any governmental jurisdiction or
organization that administers a minority business purchasing
program may reserve the right to establish further certification

procedures necessary to comply with federal law.

(=) Th
\J7 -

3
8

(@]

o
™~
D U S T oo oA K e IO S B ISR, I I S B NS
qu_\_,\_,lll\_,J.J.L_, TITCOS T T \.IJ.J.L/L\./L./\./\A., _LJ.J._LL./_LL/L_L\./\A., (@R uaw _L\.avu_l__l_ Ay AL L I WA WA W § Ly g
leasat+ +oo I NSO P £+ PRPENETS S R P RN PN I S NI NP S +h
T OO T T W CIT 11T OO0 e T |\ WP iy U S _Ll.lv CITC T CTI OO t/L/LJ_L./ -y T
P S S I DA [ SAMMEIL 1Y PAFES ~ o B s I
Ay _I_g_)L_,_I_J.J.v qu_\./\./lll\./J.lL./ (@R uAw L/L\.A.Ut/k./\./u Ly T o C OO CT T UJ__L\j_LJ.J.(./L_L_L
S I P IO P ntomd S L LU B JEay
Ay \NCANPL W I WA WA W § LI W S W B ua (R O TTTITCK T A2 wa L_,_I_J__Y_I_J.J.\j I T C 1T T .
(1) Th ool £on a1l pheoe Lo 1 £ et o la+rar
\NEAYA [ N o N ) CTOoIY [ SN S W ) [ & =y = T T C [ S T T 1T 1O C C T T [ Sy & N WPl W
N/ I~ P o S, o o [ P o N
CTITTIT 1 \J.LAL_YO T T T PR E N Wl W U S VA W) AW § & N w oy A - CITT 1O T T

(e) Any participating program receiving three or more
challenges to its certification decisions pursuant to subsection
(4) from other organizations that are executors to the statewide

and interlocal agreement, shall be subject to a review by the

office, as provided in paragraphs (a) and (b), of the

Page 23 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

645 organization's capacity to perform under such agreement and in

646 accordance with the certification core criteria established by

647 the—+task—feree. The office shall submit a report to the

648 secretary of the Department of Management Services regarding the
649 results of the review.

650 Section 12. Subsection (1) of section 287.0947, Florida
651 Statutes, is amended to read:

652 287.0947 Florida Advisory Council on Small and Minority
653| Business Development; creation; membership; duties.—

654 (1) On or after October 1, 2010 #5896, the secretary of the
655| Department of Management Services Laborand Employment—Seeurity

656| may create the Florida Advisory Council on Small and Minority

657| Business Development with the purpose of advising and assisting

658| the Office of Supplier Diversity seeretary in carrying out the

659| office's seeretary's duties with respect to minority businesses
660 and economic and business development. It is the intent of the
661 Legislature that the membership of such council include

662| practitioners, laypersons, financiers, and others with business
663| development experience who can provide invaluable insight and
664 expertise for this state in the diversification of its markets
665 and networking of business opportunities. The council shall

666 initially consist of 19 persons, each of whom is or has been
667 actively engaged in small and minority business development,
668 either in private industry, in governmental service, or as a
669| scholar of recognized achievement in the study of such matters.
670 Initially, the council shall consist of members representing all
671 regions of the state and shall include at least one member from

672| each group identified within the definition of "minority person"

Page 24 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

673 in s. 288.703(3), considering also gender and nationality

674 subgroups, and shall consist of the following:

675 (a) Four members consisting of representatives of local
676 and federal small and minority business assistance programs or
677 community development programs.

678 (b) Eight members composed of representatives of the

679| minority private business sector, including certified minority
680| Dbusiness enterprises and minority supplier development councils,
681 among whom at least two shall be women and at least four shall
682| be minority persons.

683 (c) Two representatives of local government, one of whom
684 shall be a representative of a large local government, and one
685 of whom shall be a representative of a small local government.
686 (d) Two representatives from the banking and insurance

687 industry.

688 (e) Two members from the private business sector,

689 representing the construction and commodities industries.

690 (f) The chairperson of the Florida Black Business

691 Investment Board or the chairperson's designee.

692
693| A candidate for appointment may be considered if eligible to be
694 certified as an owner of a minority business enterprise, or if
695 otherwise qualified under the criteria above. Vacancies may be
696 filled by appointment of the secretary, in the manner of the
697 original appointment.

698 Section 13. Subsections (1) and (8) of section 440.192,
699 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

700 440.192 Procedure for resolving benefit disputes.—
Page 25 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

701 (1) Any employee may, for any benefit that is ripe, due,

702 and owing, file by eertifiedmail;—oer by electronic means
703| appreovedlby—the PeputyCchiefJudger with the Office of the
704 Judges of Compensation Claims a petition for benefits which
705| meets the requirements of this section and the definition of

706 specificity in s. 440.02. An employee represented by an attorney

707 shall file by electronic means approved by the Deputy Chief

708 Judge. An employee not represented by an attorney may file by

709| certified mail or by electronic means approved by the Deputy

710| Chief Judge. The department shall inform employees of the

711 location of the Office of the Judges of Compensation Claims and

712 the office's website address for purposes of filing a petition

713 for benefits. The employee shall also serve copies of the

714| petition for benefits by certified mail, or by electronic means
715 approved by the Deputy Chief Judge, upon the employer and the
716| employer's carrier. The Deputy Chief Judge shall refer the

717| petitions to the judges of compensation claims.

718 (8) Within 14 days after receipt of a petition for

719| benefits by certified mail or by approved electronic means, the

720 carrier must either pay the requested benefits without prejudice
721 to its right to deny within 120 days from receipt of the

722| petition or file a response to petition with the Office of the
723| Judges of Compensation Claims. The response shall be filed by

724 electronic means approved by the Deputy Chief Judge. The carrier

725 must list all benefits requested but not paid and explain its
726 justification for nonpayment in the response to petition. A
727 carrier that does not deny compensability in accordance with s.

728 440.20(4) is deemed to have accepted the employee's injuries as

Page 26 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

729 compensable, unless it can establish material facts relevant to
730 the issue of compensability that could not have been discovered
731 through reasonable investigation within the 120-day period. The
732 carrier shall provide copies of the response to the filing

733| party, employer, and claimant by certified mail or by electronic

734| means approved by the Deputy Chief Judge.

735 Section 14. Subsection (1) and paragraphs (a), (c), and
736 (e) of subsection (4) of section 440.25, Florida Statutes, are
737 amended to read:

738 440.25 Procedures for mediation and hearings.—

739 (1) Forty days after a petition for benefits is filed

740| under s. 440.192, the judge of compensation claims shall notify
741 the interested parties by order that a mediation conference

742| concerning such petition has been scheduled unless the parties
743| have notified the judge of compensation claims that a private
744 mediation has been held or is scheduled to be held. A mediation,
745| whether private or public, shall be held within 130 days after
746| the filing of the petition. Such order must give the date the
747 mediation conference is to be held. Such order may be served
748| personally upon the interested parties or may be sent to the

749 interested parties by mail or by electronic means approved by

750 the Deputy Chief Judge. If multiple petitions are pending, or if

751 additional petitions are filed after the scheduling of a

752| mediation, the judge of compensation claims shall consolidate
753| all petitions into one mediation. The claimant or the adjuster
754 of the employer or carrier may, at the mediator's discretion,
755 attend the mediation conference by telephone or, if agreed to by

756 the parties, other electronic means. A continuance may be

Page 27 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

757 granted upon the agreement of the parties or if the requesting
758| party demonstrates to the judge of compensation claims that the
759 reason for requesting the continuance arises from circumstances
760| beyond the party's control. Any order granting a continuance

761| must set forth the date of the rescheduled mediation conference.
762| A mediation conference may not be used solely for the purpose of
763| mediating attorney's fees.

764 (4) (a) If the parties fail to agree to written submission
765| of pretrial stipulations, the judge of compensation claims shall
766| conduct a live pretrial hearing. The judge of compensation

767 claims shall give the interested parties at least 14 days'

768| advance notice of the pretrial hearing by mail or by electronic

769| means approved by the Deputy Chief Judge.

770 (c) The judge of compensation claims shall give the
771| interested parties at least 14 days' advance notice of the final
772 hearing, served upon the interested parties by mail or by

773 electronic means approved by the Deputy Chief Judge.

774 (e) The order making an award or rejecting the claim,

775 referred to in this chapter as a "compensation order," shall set
776 forth the findings of ultimate facts and the mandate; and the
777 order need not include any other reason or justification for

778 such mandate. The compensation order shall be filed in the

779| Office of the Judges of Compensation Claims at Tallahassee. A
780 copy of such compensation order shall be sent by mail or by

781 electronic means approved by the Deputy Chief Judge to the

782 parties—and attorneys of record and any parties not represented

783 by an attorney at the last known address of each, with the date

784 of mailing noted thereon.

Page 28 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

785 Section 15. Subsection (3) of section 440.29, Florida

786 Statutes, is amended to read:

787 440.29 Procedure before the judge of compensation claims.—
788 (3) The practice and procedure before the judges of

789 compensation claims shall be governed by rules adopted by the
790 Office of the Judges of Compensation Claims Supreme—Court,

791 except to the extent that such rules conflict with the

792| provisions of this chapter.

793 Section 16. Subsection (4) of section 440.45, Florida

794 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

795 440.45 Office of the Judges of Compensation Claims.—

796 (4) The Office of the Judges of Compensation Claims shall

797 adopt rules to effectuate effeet the purposes of this section.

798| Such rules shall include procedural rules applicable to workers'

799| compensation claim resolution, including rules requiring

800| electronic filing and service where deemed appropriate by the

801 Deputy Chief Judge, and uniform criteria for measuring the

802 performance of the office, including, but not limited to, the
803 number of cases assigned and resolved dispesed, the age of

804| pending and resolved dispesed cases, timeliness of decisions
805 deeisionmaking, extraordinary fee awards, and other data

806| necessary for the judicial nominating commission to review the
807| performance of judges as required in paragraph (2) (c). Fhe

808

809 Ot e~ T c7 220421 + 1 a2 a A~ A~A Ty OFF1 ~ £ + 1 Ti1dcraa
AL & e Eay ().tJtJ_L_Y % I i N W e CTITCT [ SN i S wyw ) ().\J.UtJL,C\J. J\J_Y T [ S S W ) A\ = T UU\A\jCO
810 £ O rmiear o4 o PN BN I R S S T INE 2 + + +ha1 a0 ao~~+ n I~~~
O \/UllthCllQ().L,_LUll A By @ gu By 3 § Y ) tJL/l_LOL/l().llb \—awy CIT 1O [ 7\ W2 U Bl W i § O ° O OIS
811 effeetiver
812 Section 17. Paragraph (b) of subsection (4) of section

Page 29 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

813 553.73, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

814 553.73 Florida Building Code.—
815 (4)
816 (b) Local governments may, subject to the limitations of

817 this section, adopt amendments to the technical provisions of
818 the Florida Building Code which apply solely within the

819 jurisdiction of such government and which provide for more
820| stringent requirements than those specified in the Florida
821| Building Code, not more than once every 6 months. A local

822 government may adopt technical amendments that address local
823| needs if:

824 1. The local governing body determines, following a public
825| hearing which has been advertised in a newspaper of general
826| «circulation at least 10 days before the hearing, that there is a
827 need to strengthen the requirements of the Florida Building
828 Code. The determination must be based upon a review of local
829| conditions by the local governing body, which review

830| demonstrates by evidence or data that the geographical

831 jurisdiction governed by the local governing body exhibits a
832 local need to strengthen the Florida Building Code beyond the
833| needs or regional variation addressed by the Florida Building
834 Code, that the local need is addressed by the proposed local
835 amendment, and that the amendment is no more stringent than
836 necessary to address the local need.

837 2. Such additional requirements are not discriminatory
838 against materials, products, or construction techniques of
839| demonstrated capabilities.

840 3. Such additional requirements may not introduce a new

Page 30 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

841 subject not addressed in the Florida Building Code.
842 4. The enforcing agency shall make readily available, in a
843| wusable format, all amendments adopted pursuant to this section.
844 5. Any amendment to the Florida Building Code shall be
845 transmitted within 30 days by the adopting local government to
846 the commission. The commission shall maintain copies of all such
847 amendments in a format that is usable and obtainable by the
848| public. Local technical amendments shall not become effective
849| until 30 days after the amendment has been received and
850| published by the commission.
851 6. Any amendment to the Florida Building Code adopted by a
852 local government pursuant to this paragraph shall be effective
853| only until the adoption by the commission of the new edition of
854 the Florida Building Code every third year. At such time, the
855| commission shall review such amendment for consistency with the
856 criteria in paragraph (8) (a) and adopt such amendment as part of
857 the Florida Building Code or rescind the amendment. The
858 commission shall immediately notify the respective local
859| government of the rescission of any amendment. After receiving
860 such notice, the respective local government may readopt the
861 rescinded amendment pursuant to the provisions of this
862| paragraph.
863 7. FEach county and municipality desiring to make local
864 technical amendments to the Florida Building Code shall by
865 interlocal agreement establish a countywide compliance review
866| Dboard to review any amendment to the Florida Building Code,
867 adopted by a local government within the county pursuant to this
868| paragraph, that is challenged by any substantially affected

Page 31 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

869| party for purposes of determining the amendment's compliance

870 with this paragraph. If challenged, the local technical

871 amendments shall not become effective until time for filing an
872 appeal pursuant to subparagraph 8. has expired or, if there is
873 an appeal, until the commission issues its final order

874 determining the adopted amendment is in compliance with this

875 subsection.

876 8. If the compliance review board determines such

877 amendment is not in compliance with this paragraph, the

878| compliance review board shall notify such local government of
879| the noncompliance and that the amendment is invalid and

880 unenforceable until the local government corrects the amendment
881 to bring it into compliance. The local government may appeal the
882| decision of the compliance review board to the commission. If
883| the compliance review board determines such amendment to be in
884 compliance with this paragraph, any substantially affected party
885| may appeal such determination to the commission. Any such appeal
886| shall be filed with the commission within 14 days of the board's
887| written determination. The commission shall promptly refer the

888 appeal to the Division of Administrative Hearings by electronic

889| means through the division's website for the assignment of an

890 administrative law judge. The administrative law judge shall

891 conduct the required hearing within 30 days, and shall enter a
892 recommended order within 30 days of the conclusion of such

893| hearing. The commission shall enter a final order within 30 days
894 thereafter. The provisions of chapter 120 and the uniform rules
895 of procedure shall apply to such proceedings. The local

896| government adopting the amendment that is subject to challenge

Page 32 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

897 has the burden of proving that the amendment complies with this
898| paragraph in proceedings before the compliance review board and
899 the commission, as applicable. Actions of the commission are

900 subject to judicial review pursuant to s. 120.68. The compliance
901 review board shall determine whether its decisions apply to a
902 respective local jurisdiction or apply countywide.

903 9. An amendment adopted under this paragraph shall include
904| a fiscal impact statement which documents the costs and benefits
905| of the proposed amendment. Criteria for the fiscal impact

906| statement shall include the impact to local government relative
907 to enforcement, the impact to property and building owners, as
908| well as to industry, relative to the cost of compliance. The

909| fiscal impact statement may not be used as a basis for

910 challenging the amendment for compliance.

911 10. In addition to subparagraphs 7. and 9., the commission
912| may review any amendments adopted pursuant to this subsection
913| and make nonbinding recommendations related to compliance of

914 such amendments with this subsection.

915 Section 18. Subsection (1) of section 760.03, Florida

916 Statutes, is reenacted.

917 Section 19. Subsections (3), (7), and (8) of section

918 760.11, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

919 760.11 Administrative and civil remedies; construction.—
920 (3) Except as provided in subsection (2), the commission
921 shall investigate the allegations in the complaint. Within 240
922| 3186 days after ef the filing of the complaint or, effective July

923 1, 2013, within 180 days after the filing of the complaint, the

924 commission shall determine if there i1s reasonable cause to

Page 33 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

925| believe that discriminatory practice has occurred in violation
926 of the Florida Civil Rights Act of 1992. When the commission
927 determines whether er—snet there is reasonable cause, the

928 commission by registered mail shall promptly notify the

929 aggrieved person and the respondent of the reasonable cause
930 determination, the date of such determination, and the options
931 available under this section.

932 (7) If the commission determines that there is not

933| reasonable cause to believe that a violation of the Florida
934| Civil Rights Act of 1992 has occurred, the commission shall
935| dismiss the complaint. The aggrieved person may request an

936| administrative hearing under ss. 120.569 and 120.57, but any
937 such request must be made within 35 days after ef the date of

938| determination of reasonable cause and any such hearing shall be
939| heard by an administrative law judge and not by the commission

940 or a commissioner. An aggrieved person seeking administrative

941 relief shall submit a $200 filing fee to the Division of

942| Administrative Hearings, which shall be waived upon a finding

943 that the aggrieved person is indigent pursuant to s. 57.081. The

944 division, in its discretion, may provide for the recovery of the

945 filing fee if the aggrieved person prevails at the hearing. If

946 the aggrieved person does not request an administrative hearing

947| within the 35-day period 35—+days, the claim will be barred. If

948 the administrative law judge finds that a violation of the

949 Florida Civil Rights Act of 1992 has occurred, he or she shall

950 issue an appropriate recommended order to the commission

951| prohibiting the practice and recommending affirmative relief

952 from the effects of the practice, including back pay. Within 90
Page 34 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

953| days after ef the date the recommended order is rendered, the
954 commission shall issue a final order by adopting, rejecting, or
955| modifying the recommended order as provided under ss. 120.569
956 and 120.57. The 90-day period may be extended with the consent
957 of all the parties. In any action or proceeding under this

958 subsection, the commission, in its discretion, may allow the
959| prevailing party a reasonable attorney's fee as part of the

960| costs. It is the intent of the Legislature that this provision

961 for attorney's fees be interpreted in a manner consistent with

962 federal case law involving a Title VII action. If In—the—event
963| the final order issued by the commission determines that a

964| wviolation of the Florida Civil Rights Act of 1992 has occurred,
965| the aggrieved person may bring, within 1 year after ef the date
966 of the final order, a civil action under subsection (5) as if
967 there has been a reasonable cause determination or accept the
968 affirmative relief offered by the commission, but not both.

969 (8) If Fr—+theevent—that the commission fails to

970 conciliate or determine whether there is reasonable cause on any
971 complaint under this section within 240 188 days after ef the
972 filing of the complaint or, effective July 1, 2013, within 180

973| days after the filing of the complaint, an aggrieved person may

974 proceed under subsection (4)+ as if the commission determined
975 that there was reasonable cause.

976 Section 20. Subsection (2) of section 766.305, Florida
977 Statutes, 1is amended to read:

978 766.305 Filing of claims and responses; medical

979| disciplinary review.—

980 (2) The claimant shall furnish the division with as many

Page 35 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

981 copies of the petition as required for service upon the

982 association, any physician and hospital named in the petition,
983 and the Division of Medical Quality Assurance, along with a $+5
984 filing fee of $15 payable to the Division of Administrative

985 Hearings. Upon receipt of the petition, the division shall

986 immediately serve—the asSseociation— by Servieceuvporn—the agent

987 doaioanat A + -~ o~ + cnwvtzd o~ n Kheah 1 £ £ +ha oo~ o g A
MCQJ.\leLAL_CM - a—y (_/L&/\_/Ck/k_ oo LV I CTT 1T [N AN i iy @ S S O CTIT oo uvuCT 1O CTIUlly LJ_Y
988 registered—or—ecertified mail;—and——shalt mail copies of the

989| petition, by registered or certified mail, to any physician,
990| health care provider, and hospital named in the petition, and

991 shall furnish a copy by electronic means through the division's

992| website or regular mail to the Division of Medical Quality
993| Assurance, ana the Agency for Health Care Administration, and

994 the association by service upon the agent designated to accept

995 service on behalf of the association.

996 Section 21. Subsection (2) of section 766.309, Florida

997 Statutes, is amended to read:

998 766.309 Determination of claims; presumption; findings of

999 administrative law judge binding on participants.—
1000 (2) If the administrative law judge determines that the
1001 injury alleged is not a birth-related neurological injury or
1002 that obstetrical services were not delivered by a participating
1003| physician at the birth, she or he shall enter an order and shall
1004 cause a copy of such order to be sent immediately to the parties

1005| by electronic means through the division's website or by regular

1006 registered—eor—ecertified mail.
1007 Section 22. Subsection (3) of section 766.31, Florida
1008 Statutes, 1is amended to read:

Page 36 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

HB 7159 2010

1009 766.31 Administrative law judge awards for birth-related
1010 neurological injuries; notice of award.—

1011 (3) A copy of the award shall be sent immediately by
1012 electronic means through the division's website or by regular

1013| <registeredor—eertified mail to each person served with a copy
1014 of the petition under s. 766.305(2).

1015 Section 23. Paragraph (b) of subsection (4) of section
1016 961.03, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1017 961.03 Determination of status as a wrongfully

1018 incarcerated person; determination of eligibility for

1019| compensation.—

1020 (4)

1021 (b) If the prosecuting authority responds as set forth in
1022| paragraph (2) (b), and the court determines that the petitioner
1023 is eligible under the provisions of s. 961.04, but the

1024| prosecuting authority contests the nature, significance or

1025 effect of the evidence of actual innocence, or the facts related
1026 to the petitioner's alleged wrongful incarceration, the court
1027 shall set forth its findings and transfer the petition by

1028 electronic means through the division's website to the division

1029 for findings of fact and a recommended determination of whether
1030 the petitioner has established that he or she is a wrongfully
1031 incarcerated person who is eligible for compensation under this
1032 act.

1033 Section 24. This act shall take effect July 1, 2010.

Page 37 of 37

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb7159-00



