O J o oo w N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
277
28
29

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252
By Senator Simpson
18-00578B-13 20131252

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

A bill to be entitled
An act relating to building construction; amending s.
381.0065, F.S.; specifying that certain actions
relating to onsite sewage treatment and removal are
not required if a bedroom is not added during a
remodeling addition or modification to a single-family
home; prohibiting a remodeling addition or
modification from certain coverage or encroachment;
authorizing a local health board to review specific
plans; requiring a review to be completed within a
specific time period after receipt of specific plans;
amending s. 489.127, F.S.; revising civil penalties;
authorizing a local building department to retain 75
percent of certain fines collected if it transmits 25
percent to the Department of Business and Professional
Regulation; amending s. 489.131, F.S.; deleting
legislative intent referring to a local agency’s
enforcement of regulatory laws; deleting the
definitions of “minor wviolation” and “notice of
noncompliance”; deleting provisions that provide for
what a notice of noncompliance should or should not
include; deleting a provision that provides for
further disciplinary proceedings for certain
licensees; amending s. 489.531, F.S.; revising a
maximum civil penalty; amending s. 553.73, F.S.;
prohibiting any provision of the International
Residential Code relating to mandated fire sprinklers
from incorporation into the Florida Building Code;

amending s. 553.79, F.S.; authorizing a site plan to

Page 1 of 19

words underlined are additions.



30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252

be maintained at the worksite as an electronic copy;
requiring the copy to be open to inspection by certain
officials; amending s. 553.842, F.S.; requiring an
application for state approval of a certain product to
be approved by the department after the application
and related documentation are complete; amending ss.
553.901, 553.902, 553.903, 553.904, 553.905, and
553.906, F.S.; requiring the Florida Building
Commission to adopt the Florida Building Code-Energy
Conservation; conforming subsequent sections of the
thermal efficiency code; amending s. 553.912, F.S.;
providing that certain existing heating and cooling
equipment is not required to meet the minimum
equipment efficiencies; amending s. 553.991, F.S.;
revising the purpose of the Florida Building Energy-
Efficiency Rating Act; amending s. 553.992, F.S.;
requiring the department to administer statewide
criteria for building energy-efficiency rating
systems; requiring department rules to prohibit a sole
provider from conducting functions relating to the
building energy-efficiency rating system; amending s.
553.993, F.S.; providing a definition for the term
“building energy-efficiency rating system”; amending
s. 553.995, F.S.; deleting a minimum requirement for
the building energy-efficiency rating system; revising
language; requiring the interest group to advise the
department in the adoption and administration of the
system; deleting a provision that requires the

interest group to assist in the implementation of the

Page 2 of 19

words underlined are additions.



59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
system by performing certain acts; requiring the
department to approve, rather than develop, a training
and certification program to certify raters; providing

an effective date.

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

Section 1. Paragraph (aa) of subsection (4) of section
381.0065, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

381.0065 Onsite sewage treatment and disposal systems;
regulation.—

(4) PERMITS; INSTALLATION; AND CONDITIONS.—A person may not
construct, repair, modify, abandon, or operate an onsite sewage
treatment and disposal system without first obtaining a permit
approved by the department. The department may issue permits to
carry out this section, but shall not make the issuance of such
permits contingent upon prior approval by the Department of
Environmental Protection, except that the issuance of a permit
for work seaward of the coastal construction control line
established under s. 161.053 shall be contingent upon receipt of
any required coastal construction control line permit from the
Department of Environmental Protection. A construction permit is
valid for 18 months from the issuance date and may be extended
by the department for one 90-day period under rules adopted by
the department. A repair permit is valid for 90 days from the
date of issuance. An operating permit must be obtained prior to
the use of any aerobic treatment unit or if the establishment
generates commercial waste. Buildings or establishments that use

an aerobic treatment unit or generate commercial waste shall be

Page 3 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99
100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110
111
112
113
114
115
116

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
inspected by the department at least annually to assure
compliance with the terms of the operating permit. The operating
permit for a commercial wastewater system is valid for 1 year
from the date of issuance and must be renewed annually. The
operating permit for an aerobic treatment unit is wvalid for 2
years from the date of issuance and must be renewed every 2
years. If all information pertaining to the siting, location,
and installation conditions or repair of an onsite sewage
treatment and disposal system remains the same, a construction
or repair permit for the onsite sewage treatment and disposal
system may be transferred to another person, if the transferee
files, within 60 days after the transfer of ownership, an
amended application providing all corrected information and
proof of ownership of the property. There is no fee associated
with the processing of this supplemental information. A person
may not contract to construct, modify, alter, repair, service,
abandon, or maintain any portion of an onsite sewage treatment
and disposal system without being registered under part III of
chapter 489. A property owner who personally performs
construction, maintenance, or repairs to a system serving his or
her own owner-occupied single-family residence is exempt from
registration requirements for performing such construction,
maintenance, or repairs on that residence, but is subject to all
permitting requirements. A municipality or political subdivision
of the state may not issue a building or plumbing permit for any
building that requires the use of an onsite sewage treatment and
disposal system unless the owner or builder has received a
construction permit for such system from the department. A

building or structure may not be occupied and a municipality,

Page 4 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
117| political subdivision, or any state or federal agency may not
118 authorize occupancy until the department approves the final
119 installation of the onsite sewage treatment and disposal system.
120 A municipality or political subdivision of the state may not
121 approve any change in occupancy or tenancy of a building that
122| uses an onsite sewage treatment and disposal system until the
123 department has reviewed the use of the system with the proposed
124 change, approved the change, and amended the operating permit.

125 (aa) An existing-system inspection or evaluation, a

126| modification, replacement, or upgrade of an onsite sewage

127 treatment and disposal system, or a pump-out of an existing tank

128| 1is not required for a remodeling addition or modification to a

129| single-family home if a bedroom is not added. However, a

130| remodeling addition or modification may not cover any part of

131 the system or encroach upon a required setback or the

132| unobstructed area. The local health department may review a

133 floor plan and site plan that show the distance of the

134 remodeling addition or modification from the system to determine

135 if a setback or unobstructed area is impacted. The review shall

136| Dbe completed within 5 business days after receipt of an adequate

137 floor plan and site plan.

138 Section 2. Paragraphs (c) and (f) of subsection (5) and

139 subsection (6) of section 489.127, Florida Statutes, are amended
140 to read:

141 489.127 Prohibitions; penalties.—

142 (5) Each county or municipality may, at its option,

143| designate one or more of its code enforcement officers, as

144 defined in chapter 162, to enforce, as set out in this

145 subsection, the provisions of subsection (1) and s. 489.132(1)

Page 5 of 19
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




146
147
148
149
150
151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173
174

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
against persons who engage in activity for which a county or
municipal certificate of competency or license or state
certification or registration is required.

(c) The local governing body of the county or municipality

may is—awvthorized—te enforce codes and ordinances against
unlicensed contractors under the provisions of this subsection
and may enact an ordinance establishing procedures for
implementing this subsection, including a schedule of penalties
to be assessed by the code enforcement officer. The maximum
civil penalty which may be levied may shalt not exceed $2,000
£566. Moneys collected pursuant to this subsection shall be
retained locally, as provided for by local ordinance, and may be
set aside in a specific fund to support future enforcement
activities against unlicensed contractors.

(f) If the enforcement or licensing board or designated
special magistrate finds that a violation exists, the
enforcement or licensing board or designated special magistrate
may order the violator to pay a civil penalty of not less than
the amount set forth on the citation but not more than $1,500
£4+0668 per day for each violation. In determining the amount of
the penalty, the enforcement or licensing board or designated
special magistrate shall consider the following factors:

1. The gravity of the violation.

2. Any actions taken by the violator to correct the
violation.

3. Any previous violations committed by the violator.

(6) Local building departments may collect outstanding
fines against registered or certified contractors issued by the

Construction Industry Licensing Board and may retain 75 25

Page 6 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




SB 1252

2013

Florida Senate

20131252

18-00578B-13

G 0] D
in] @ P D D En] D
-—H 0 O 5 Ok L D O
H o2 o4 - NI T [ & O & jon
+ O [( ) (9] © D H - D TR O
© O 0] D 4y -H on HooP - D &
< c o 0O wn ¢ & <o O U ol L S O R I O BT ) W 4 - D
i} @] O )] a o P Koo (OF g @ D @ q D #H O &£
L 0 - O @© A b A K W & D 4P - 2 - D D
O Q ) o, -4 D #H = ¢ A D ¥ ¢ ¥ & ¢ ~ HOj D D O
0] 0] O S 0] D K3 0] [( Y D = 0] NS (4] { H
T < O O S5 0 ®© gO] iy ¢ H oW ¢ -H 4P - -H D O D
= Q P 9] Q g ¢ ¢ O ¢ v O B e @9 O | 4 -Ho4D
> © O O L& T -rH D @ o)l D D B & ] D D  YH
O 0} U O O O W 4 () D & 4 ®© @& ¢ H M ¢ ¢ -fH F
“ 0] “ O < D - D H W Y B -H [OF)] ® -rH 0] D
0 4 - D oYy . b T @ D [ 9] o ST D @
@ O —~ S O Ho@ wooq T 9 ¢ EB O H |~ ® o,
~ O ~ oo P -4 G D -f 0] D ® ® D & @ { . ® 9] @
P > 0 ~ O T < L » [09] D 4 4 M0 D D D
O 0] O © < -H @] D D -H B | D D ® [ONS | B ¢ oo D
o & 4 S o £ © EW o4 P00 > g P! ¢ ¥ 4 4
— P Q, O ~ P T D ® D @ D @ — H & D D VI, 3] D
— - [ B I @ R« HH D ¢ D b O D D ¢ 44 @ i 3 -t
O n ® IENe) P © ®© Q- [ox) -H o @ P ¢ D 4 - 4P
O 0] o © |~ D . © T #H D B ® D 0] T P W ®
o O (0] IR ] D -H - [9) © P H O -H P kY D -H &
o A P n T n QO 0] o ¥ 0] @ D @ H B D [{ O] D -fd 4 H
2 W HORNN) o o O D B D D D P QD D ¢ @ D
o 3 O o O A © @ o -H N -H P D & B $H ¢ D @ D 4
o o0 < n g e T =TI © P ©® P ¢ F 4 -4 O @ O 40 T4
—~ g - QO L — D a [N | D ® + -f Eiy) & - -f
QO P T 4 & Q . Q, @O -~ - H Y © 4 D Rty D
© ~ O © 4 3 = g o ¢ D L P () D O o D
“Q O O O ® O 4 9 © H & ©h P YH B W & PO H P
0] (@) O . — 0 — O D O - ® - -t D [¢p] ® -t ® P -
“ O P © A | > Q0 H 4O & o D 4 O u 4 D P
© P © g - U9 & o0 ¢ o PP v ¢ 4 O -f - (ORI )
g Q ~ > d P oA 4 0 o -m P -1 B O D 4 b O © w
> 0 P g 9 n P i - ) O -fd P w4 H O R OB
O U g P O O 4 O L T w ¥ L o E D @ 4 D 4 & & ORI
S 4 0O 4 ® P 4 O 0O 0 & -d o ¢ ¢ H D w P & pg B DO M s
£ 0 E ©® 4 B - o S O Q = P - ¢ -H P n G P
o, P o o P Q o 0 D O D D @ D o] N . D
0 4 0 @ © © < O A O @O - n oH >N P E D - D h N P o 4P
0} _mﬁ C T 4 P 0O P 494 4 P & - 4 ¢ TR D D ¢ - -H o W@
c 0, © - 0, Q -H (S D D & @ HORENO)! B H
- O O A — 0 (VIS =3 o0 -H ' A H D % 4P D @ D
“ o i T a c O -4 O P 0 D E TSI (VI () ® By D D e 4 ¢ -f
N is) T O 2w T 4 © D D ¢ o H B P ) D
Q 0] M A g P O 4 — @ B H O B 4 HOj D @ iy D,
g PS> Y H ©n (@] o #H O @ -H W @ P D [ox
P 4 P O < O -—H 0 » O D ® © n - v -f D © ™ ¢
= O 4 o —~ O S ¢ O D $H @ # ¢ & 4 — Db & % -
4 n O O A kb 4 © g -+ A P —~ H @ ® 3 D ¢ n ¢ P D
O & £ 0 ¥ + — O O o B )N BT R« -H @ D & ¢ H & D
© a O ~ O ~ A 4 T 0 T #H 4 H o E D @ D D ¢ -
P Y P A 0O 4 0~ P H 0 O o ¢ A D -H0 O ORI T
c L 0O g N m v — ©® O T ¢ @ d D © N P >N P N H G K T
O (ORI — —~ o -d - n H P & P Hd B H P D - D -l
O >~ 0] . ] > 4 0w -M D -m ® O, D 4d [ 0] [ 1Y)
4 O H P (o)) o O O O O) D & D @O D & ®© ¢
(O O 0} [e¢] o < W © D @ [o9] [ D - D UH My D -H &
o, P 0 O < [ SR 0, D — D ©  -H b )] b ® ® D P ¢ T H#
N O ™~ 0 O O 4 N O < 1 W I~ 0w O O + N M < 1O W ™~ 0O O O +H4 N ™M
.~ [~ [~ [~ [~ W W W W W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O O O O O O
— A 4 =4 4 A A = = A d4 =4 = d A 4 = A A4 4 4 4 4 4 = N N N «

Page 7 of 19

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

4

CODING




204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215
216
217
218
219
220
221
222
223
224
225
226
227
228
229
230
231
232

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

s2 4+ A2 AN~ N P TN I =2 TN S NP N NN~ + 1 for +1h

W I CTT CTIT LA TTTTITITIC, 7 AT ULJ \./_LJ__Y OO UTTTOT 1T CTITT [ S N CTIT

N PN S come ]z o + ] o~ N RN PN B AP +

v IO T T U ja—y \/UILLLJ_L_Y W I CTT CTIT |\ S\ S S i i &P B BN B ) [ S @ R S Sy U g ) g & [ . Y TS ja
Foalea St~y N A~y A vz AT g Ay g b o a A N g A £ 4+ 4
CTIN T 7 NA N7 W S u\JJ.J.CuL_J.Ll\j T VvV T O T CITOUTT W LT CTIITIT (&Y [ wn t/CJ.J.\JM A C LI
wmarrld +hoarn a7 2 A g a0t o n £ Lty Ao~ o g

UAAYAY. 3= w CITITCTTT 1o LT T S Y T L1 o C IO COCIIUIT A\ [ S U R S U R ) S MJ.QVJ.BJ.J.LLLAJ._Y

Section 4. Paragraph (c) of subsection (4) of section
489.531, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

489.531 Prohibitions; penalties.—

(4) Each county or municipality may, at its option,
designate one or more of its code enforcement officers, as
defined in chapter 162, to enforce, as set out in this
subsection, the provisions of subsection (1) against persons who
engage in activity for which county or municipal certification
is required.

(c) The local governing body of the county or municipality

may is—awtheorized—+te enforce codes and ordinances against
unlicensed contractors under the provisions of this section and
may enact an ordinance establishing procedures for implementing
this section, including a schedule of penalties to be assessed
by the code enforcement officers. The maximum civil penalty
which may be levied may shed® not exceed $2,000 $566. Moneys
collected pursuant to this section shall be retained locally as
provided for by local ordinance and may be set aside in a
specific fund to support future enforcement activities against
unlicensed contractors.

Section 5. Subsection (17) of section 553.73, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

553.73 Florida Building Code.—

(17) A provision Fheprovisions—eof seetion R3II3of the most

Page 8 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252

233| euwvrrent—versiern of the International Residential Code relating

234 to mandated fire sprinklers may not be incorporated into the

235 Florida Building Code as adopted by the Florida Building

236| Commission and may not be adopted as a local amendment to the
237 Florida Building Code. This subsection does not apply to a local
238 government that has a lawfully adopted ordinance relating to

239| fire sprinklers which has been in effect since January 1, 2010.
240 Section 6. Subsection (18) is added to section 553.79,

241 Florida Statutes, to read:

242 553.79 Permits; applications; issuance; inspections.—

243 (18) For the purpose of inspection and record retention,

244 site plans for a building may be maintained in the form of an

245 electronic copy at the worksite. These plans must be open to

246| inspection by the building official or a duly authorized

247 representative, as required by the Florida Building Code.

248 Section 7. Paragraph (a) of subsection (5) of section

249 553.842, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

250 553.842 Product evaluation and approval.—

251 (5) Statewide approval of products, methods, or systems of
252 construction may be achieved by one of the following methods.
253 One of these methods must be used by the commission to approve
254 the following categories of products: panel walls, exterior

255 doors, roofing, skylights, windows, shutters, and structural
256 components as established by the commission by rule. A product
257 may not be advertised, sold, offered, provided, distributed, or
258| marketed as hurricane, windstorm, or impact protection from

259| wind-borne debris from a hurricane or windstorm unless it is
260 approved pursuant to this section or s. 553.8425. Any person who

2601 advertises, sells, offers, provides, distributes, or markets a

Page 9 of 19
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
262 product as hurricane, windstorm, or impact protection from wind-
263| borne debris without such approval is subject to the Florida
264 Deceptive and Unfair Trade Practices Act under part II of
265 chapter 501 brought by the enforcing authority as defined in s.
266| 501.203.
267 (a) Products for which the code establishes standardized
268| testing or comparative or rational analysis methods shall be
269| approved by submittal and validation of one of the following
270 reports or listings indicating that the product or method or
271 system of construction was in compliance with the Florida
272 Building Code and that the product or method or system of
273| construction is, for the purpose intended, at least equivalent
274 to that required by the Florida Building Code:
275 1. A certification mark or listing of an approved
276 certification agency, which may be used only for products for
277 which the code designates standardized testing;
278 2. A test report from an approved testing laboratory;
279 3. A product evaluation report based upon testing or
280 comparative or rational analysis, or a combination thereof, from
281 an approved product evaluation entity; or
282 4. A product evaluation report based upon testing or
283 comparative or rational analysis, or a combination thereof,
284 developed and signed and sealed by a professional engineer or
285 architect, licensed in this state.
286
287| A product evaluation report or a certification mark or listing
288 of an approved certification agency which demonstrates that the
289| product or method or system of construction complies with the

290 Florida Building Code for the purpose intended is equivalent to

Page 10 of 19
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




291
292
293
294
295
296
297
298
299
300
301
302
303
304
305
306
307
308
309
310
311
312
313
314
315
316
317
318
319

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
a test report and test procedure referenced in the Florida
Building Code. An application for state approval of a product
under subparagraph 1. or 3. must be approved by the department
after the commission staff or a designee verifies that the
application and related documentation are complete. This
verification must be completed within 10 business days after
receipt of the application. Upon approval by the department, the
product shall be immediately added to the list of state-approved
products maintained under subsection (13). Approvals by the
department shall be reviewed and ratified by the commission’s
program oversight committee except for a showing of good cause
that a review by the full commission is necessary. The
commission shall adopt rules providing means to cure
deficiencies identified within submittals for products approved
under this paragraph.

Section 8. Section 553.901, Florida Statutes, is amended to
read:

553.901 Purpose of thermal efficiency code.—The Department
of Business and Professional Regulation shall prepare a thermal
efficiency code to provide for a statewide uniform standard for
energy efficiency in the thermal design and operation of all
buildings statewide, consistent with energy conservation goals,
and to best provide for public safety, health, and general

welfare. The Florida Building Commission shall adopt the Florida

Building Code-Energy Conservation FleridaFErergyEfficieneyCode
for Building Coenstructionwithin the FloridaRuilding Cede, and

shall modify, revise, update, and maintain the code to implement

the provisions of this thermal efficiency code and amendments

thereto, in accordance with the procedures of chapter 120. The

Page 11 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




320
321
322
323
324
325
326
327
328
329
330
331
332
333
334
335
336
337
338
339
340
341
342
343
344
345
346
347
348

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
department shall, at least triennially, determine the most cost-
effective energy-saving equipment and techniques available and
report its determinations to the commission, which shall update
the code to incorporate such equipment and techniques. The
proposed changes shall be made available for public review and
comment no later than 6 months before prier—+e code
implementation. The term “cost-effective,” as used in fer—the

purpeses—ef this part, means shall be econstruved—to—mean CcosSt-

effective to the consumer.
Section 9. Section 553.902, Florida Statutes, is reordered
and amended to read:

553.902 Definitions.—As used in Fer—thepurpeses—ef this

part, the term:

(2) 43> “Exempted building” means:

(a) A Amy building or portion thereof whose peak design
rate of energy usage for all purposes is less than 1 watt (3.4
Btu per hour) per square foot of floor area for all purposes.

(b) A Amy building that whieh is neither heated nor cooled
by a mechanical system designed to control or modify the indoor
temperature and powered by electricity or fossil fuels.

(c) A Amy building for which federal mandatory standards
preempt state energy codes.

(d) A Any historical building as described in s.
267.021(3) .

The Florida Building Commission may recommend to the Legislature
additional types of buildings which should be exempted from

compliance with the Florida Building Code-Energy Conservation

FleoaraAda T vz BDFL1 g Anrn~yy O~ A frr Daaa 1 A2 -~
B s s & & s Tt T CTCTICY \CAC A ST e A = e e = ¥ AT

Page 12 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




349
350
351
352
353
354
355
356
357
358
359
360
361
362
363
364
365
366
367
368
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376
377

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252

(4)+42> “HVAC” means a system of heating, ventilating, and
air-conditioning.

(6) 43> “Renovated building” means a residential or
nonresidential building undergoing alteration that varies or
changes insulation, HVAC systems, water heating systems, or
exterior envelope conditions, 1f prewvided the estimated cost of
renovation exceeds 30 percent of the assessed value of the
structure.

(5)+4) “Local enforcement agency” means the agency of local
government which has the authority to make inspections of
buildings and to enforce the Florida Building Code. The term +&
includes any agency within the definition of s. 553.71(5).

(3)+45> “Exterior envelope physical characteristics” means
the physical nature of those elements of a building which
enclose conditioned spaces through which energy may be
transferred to or from the exterior.

(1)+6)> “Energy performance level” means the indicator of
the energy-related performance of a building, including, but not
limited to, the levels of insulation, the amount and type of
glass, and the HVAC and water heating system efficiencies.

Section 10. Section 553.903, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
to read:

553.903 Applicability.—This part applies shatdt—appty to all
new and renovated buildings in the state, except exempted
buildings, for which building permits are obtained after March
15, 1979, and to the installation or replacement of building
systems and components with new products for which thermal

efficiency standards are set by the Florida Building Code-Energy

Conservation FleridaFErergy Efficieney Code—for Building

Page 13 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
378| €Cemstruwetiern. The provisions of this part shall constitute a
379| statewide uniform code.
380 Section 11. Section 553.904, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
381 to read:
382 553.904 Thermal efficiency standards for new nonresidential
383| buildings.—Thermal designs and operations for new nonresidential
384| Dbuildings for which building permits are obtained after March

385 15, 1979, must shatd: at a minimum take into account exterior

386| envelope physical characteristics, including thermal mass; HVAC,
387 service water heating, energy distribution, lighting, energy

388| managing, and auxiliary systems design and selection; and HVAC,

389| service water heating, energy distribution, lighting, energy

390| managing, and auxiliary equipment performance, and are shait not
391| ¥be required to meet standards more stringent than the provisions
392 of the Florida Building Code-Energy Conservation Flerida—FEnrergy

393 Dffa sy OA~A fr Daaa 71 A4~
[ e g S = ¥ 5 A S A SA A A R S O S S A g a2y ¥ AT

Q

a1~ o n
cLraCTITOTT

394 Section 12. Section 553.905, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
395 to read:

396 553.905 Thermal efficiency standards for new residential
397| buildings.—Thermal designs and operations for new residential
398| buildings for which building permits are obtained after March
399 15, 1979, must sheadd at a minimum take into account exterior
400| envelope physical characteristics, HVAC system selection and
401 configuration, HVAC equipment performance, and service water
402| heating design and equipment selection and are shatd not be

403 required to meet standards more stringent than the provisions of

404 the Florida Building Code-Energy Conservation Flerida—Energy

+or. HVAC equipment

405 o~ A~y O
T CTr ety <TSOoOOC—=T0<T

406| mounted in an attic or a garage is shald not be required to have

Page 14 of 19
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




407
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416
417
418
419
420
421
422
423
424
425
426
427
428
429
430
431
432
433
434
435

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
supplemental insulation in addition to that installed by the
manufacturer. All new residential buildings, except those herein
exempted, must shald have insulation in ceilings rated at R-19
or more, space permitting. Thermal efficiency standards do not
apply to a building of less than 1,000 square feet which is not
primarily used as a principal residence and which is constructed
and owned by a natural person for hunting or similar
recreational purposes; however, #e such person may not build
more than one exempt building in any 12-month period.

Section 13. Section 553.906, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
to read:

553.906 Thermal efficiency standards for renovated
buildings.—Thermal designs and operations for renovated
buildings for which building permits are obtained after March

15, 1979, must shatd+ take into account insulation; windows;

infiltration; and HVAC, service water heating, energy
distribution, lighting, energy managing, and auxiliary systems
design and equipment selection and performance. Such buildings
are shatdt not be required to meet standards more stringent than

the provisions of the Florida Building Code-Energy Conservation

leoraida
O TG

i
T

xal

Nneresy TEL2 ~a A~y O~ A frr Daaa 1 Aa o~ O~
ey ottt Chty coOOC—T 0T oS urr OGOt

rsErwetion. These

[0)]

standards apply only to those portions of the structure which
are actually renovated.

Section 14. Section 553.912, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

553.912 Air conditioners.—All air conditioners that are
sold or installed in the state must shald meet the minimum
efficiency ratings of the Florida Energy Efficiency Code for

Building Construction. These efficiency ratings must shadtt be

Page 15 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252

436| minimums and may be updated in the Florida Building Code-Energy
437| Conservation Flerida—FEnergy Effieieney Code—Ffor Ruilding

438 Ceonstruwetion by the department in accordance with s. 553.901,

439 following its determination that more cost-effective energy-

440 saving equipment and techniques are available. It is the intent
441 of the Legislature that all replacement air-conditioning systems
442| Dbe installed using energy-saving, quality installation

443| procedures, including, but not limited to, equipment sizing

444 analysis and duct inspection. Notwithstanding this section,

445 existing heating and cooling equipment in residential

446| applications need not meet the minimum equipment efficiencies,

447| except to preserve the original approval or listing of the

448| equipment.

449 Section 15. Section 553.991, Florida Statutes, is amended
450 to read:

451 553.991 Purpose.—The purpose of this part is to provide for

[0)]

452 & Sstatewide oversight of waifeormsystem—for rating systems for
4

453| the energy efficiency of buildings. It is in the interest of the

454 state to encourage energy efficiency the—~ecensideration—of—Fthe

455| epergy-effieieney rating—system in the market so as to provide

456| market rewards for energy-efficient buildings and to those

457| persons or companies designing, building, or selling energy-
458 efficient buildings.

459 Section 16. Section 553.992, Florida Statutes, is amended
460 to read:

461 553.992 Adoption of rating system.—The Department of

462 Business and Professional Regulation shall adopt, update, and

463 maintain, and administer & statewide criteria for a unifeorm

464| building energy-efficiency rating system to implement the

Page 16 of 19
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




465
466
467
468
469
470
471
472
473
474
475
476
477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487
488
489
490
491
492
493

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
provisions of this part and amendments thereto in accordance

with the procedures of chapter 120 and shall, upon the request

of any builder, designer, rater, or owner of a building, issue
nonbinding interpretations, clarifications, and opinions
concerning the application and use of the building energy-
efficiency emergy rating system under rules that the department

adopts in accordance with chapter 120. Department rules must

prohibit a sole provider from conducting functions relating to

the building energy-efficiency rating system, including energy

rating, enerqgy testing, certification of energy raters, and

training.

Section 17. Present subsections (3) through (5) of section
553.993, Florida Statutes, are redesignated as subsections (4)
through (6), respectively, and a new subsection (3) is added to
that section to read:

553.993 Definitions.—For purposes of this part:

(3) “Building energy-efficiency rating system” means a

whole building energy evaluation system established by the

Residential Energy Services Network, Commercial Energy Services

Network, or Building Performance Institute, or a nationally

recognized rating system approved by the department.

Section 18. Section 553.995, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
to read:

553.995 Energy-efficiency ratings for buildings.—

(1) The building energy-efficiency rating system must shaltd

at a minimum:

(a)4k>r Take into account local climate conditions,

Page 17 of 19

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




494
495
496
497
498
499
500
501
502
503
504
505
506
507
508
509
510
511
512
513
514
515
516
517
518
519
520
521
522

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252

construction practices, and building use.

(b)4e> Be compatible with standard federal rating systems
and state building codes and standards, where applicable, and
shall satisfy the requirements of s. 553.9085 with respect to
residential buildings and s. 255.256 with respect to state
buildings.

(2) Building Fhe energy-efficiency rating systems system
adopted by the department must shaid provide a means of
analyzing and—ecomparing the relative energy efficiency of
buildings upon the sale of new or existing residential, public,
or commercial buildings.

(3) The department shall establish a voluntary working
group of persons interested in the building energy-efficiency
rating system or energy efficiency, including, but not limited
to, such persons as electrical engineers, mechanical engineers,
architects, public utilities, and builders. The interest group

shall advise the department in the adoption and administration

develoepment of the building energy-efficiency rating system =ud

(4) The department shall approve dewvelep a training and
certification program to certify raters. In addition to the
department, ratings may be conducted by any local government or
private entity, provided that the appropriate persons have
completed the necessary training and have been certified by the

department. The Department of Management Services shall rate

Page 18 of 19

words underlined are additions.



Florida Senate - 2013 SB 1252

18-00578B-13 20131252
523| state-owned or state-leased buildings, if previded—that the
524 appropriate persons have completed the necessary training and
525| have been certified by the Department of Business and
526 Professional Regulation. A state agency that whieh has building
527 construction regulation authority may rate its own buildings and
528| those it is responsible for, if the appropriate persons have
529| completed the necessary training and have been certified by the
530| Department of Business and Professional Regulation. The
531 Department of Business and Professional Regulation may charge a
532 fee not to exceed the costs for the training and certification
533 of raters. The department shall by rule set the appropriate
534 charges for raters to charge for energy ratings, not to exceed
535 the actual costs.
536 Section 19. This act shall take effect July 1, 2013.

Page 19 of 19
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.






