F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1 A bill to be entitled

2 An act relating to the deregulation of professions and
3 occupations; providing a short title; amending s.

4 287.055, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
5 by the act; amending s. 322.57, F.S.; defining the

6 term "servicemember"; requiring the Department of

7 Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles to waive certain

8 commercial driver license requirements for

9 servicemembers and veterans under certain

10 circumstances; requiring rulemaking; amending s.

11 326.004, F.S.; deleting the requirement for a yacht
12 broker to maintain a separate license for each branch
13 office; deleting the requirement for the division to
14 establish a fee; amending s. 447.02, F.S.; conforming
15 provisions to changes made by the act; repealing ss.
16 447.04, 447.041, 447.045, and 447.06, F.S., relating
17 to licensure and permit requirements for business

18 agents, hearings for persons or labor organizations
19 denied licensure as a business agent, confidential
20 information obtained during the application process,
21 and required registration of labor organizations,
22 respectively; amending s. 447.09, F.S.; deleting
23 certain prohibited actions relating to the right of
24 franchise of a member of a labor organization;
25 repealing ss. 447.12 and 447.16, F.S., relating to

Page 1 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
26 registration fees and applicability; amending s.
277 447.305, F.S.; deleting a provision that requires
28 notification of registrations and renewals to the
29 department; amending s. 455.213, F.S.; requiring the
30 Department of Business and Professional Regulation or
31 a board to seek reciprocal licensing agreements with
32 other states under certain circumstances; providing
33 requirements; creating s. 455.2278, F.S.; providing
34 definitions; prohibiting the department or a board
35 from suspending or revoking a person's license solely
36 on the basis of a delinquency or default in the
37 payment of his or her student loan; prohibiting the
38 department or a board from suspending or revoking a
39 person's license solely on the basis of a default in
40 satisfying the requirements of his or her work-
41 conditional scholarship; amending s. 456.072, F.S.;
42 providing that failing to repay a student loan issued
43 or guaranteed by the state or the Federal Government
44 in accordance with the terms of the loan is not
45 considered a failure to perform a statutory or legal
46 obligation; repealing s. 456.0721, F.S., relating to
47 practitioners in default on student loan or
48 scholarship obligations; amending s. 456.074; removing
49 the requirements for immediate suspension of a health
50 care practitioner for default on a specified student

Page 2 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
51 loan; amending s. 468.401, F.S.; revising a
52 definition; amending s. 468.505, F.S.; providing that
53 certain unlicensed persons are not prohibited or
54 restricted from his or her practice, services, or
55 activities in dietetics and nutrition under certain
56 circumstances; amending s. 468.517, F.S.; providing
57 that certain unlicensed persons may not practice
58 dietetics and nutrition for remuneration in certain
59 licensed healthcare facilities; amending s. 468.524,
60 F.S.; deleting the time restriction for an employee
61 leasing company to reapply for licensure; amending s.
62 468.603, F.S.; revising a definition; amending s.
63 468.609, F.S.; revising certain experience
64 requirements for a person to take the examination for
65 certification; revising the time period a provisional
66 certificate is valid; amending s. 468.613, F.S.;
67 providing for waiver of specified requirements for
68 certification under certain circumstances; amending s.
69 468.8314, F.S.; requiring an applicant for a license
70 by endorsement to maintain a specified insurance
71 policy; requiring the department to certify an
72 applicant who holds a specified license issued by
73 another state or territory of the United States under
74 certain circumstances; amending s. 471.015, F.S.;
75 revising licensure requirements for engineers who hold

Page 3 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

76 specified licenses in another state; amending s.

77 473.308, F.S.; deleting continuing education

78 requirements for license by endorsement for certified
79 public accountants; amending s. 474.202, F.S.;

80 revising the definition of the term "limited-service
81 veterinary medical practice" to include certain

82 vaccinations or immunizations; amending s. 474.203,

83 F.S.; providing an exemption for a person whose work
84 is solely confined to microchip implantation in dogs
85 and cats; amending s. 474.207, F.S.; revising

86 education requirements for licensure by examination;
87 amending s. 474.217, F.S.; requiring the Department of
88 Business and Professional Regulation to issue a

89 license by endorsement to certain applicants who

90 successfully complete a specified examination;

91 amending s. 476.114, F.S.; revising training

92 requirements for licensure as a barber; amending s.

93 476.144, F.S.; requiring the department to license an
94 applicant who is licensed to practice barbering in

95 another state; amending s. 477.013, F.S.; revising the
96 definition of the term "hair braiding"; repealing s.
97 477.0132, F.S., relating to registration for hair

98 braiding, hair wrapping, and body wrapping; amending
99 s. 477.0135, F.S.; providing additional exemptions
100 from license or registration requirements for

Page 4 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
101 specified occupations or practices; amending s.
102 477.019, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
103 by the act; amending s. 477.0201, F.S.; providing
104 requirements for registration as a specialist;
105 amending s. 477.026, F.S.; conforming provisions to
106 changes made by the act; amending s. 477.0263, F.S.;
107 authorizing certain persons to perform specified
108 cosmetology services in a location other than a
109 licensed salon under certain circumstances; amending
110 ss. 477.0265 and 477.029, F.S.; conforming provisions
111 to changes made by the act; amending s. 481.201, F.S.;
112 deleting legislative findings relating to the practice
113 of interior design; amending s. 481.203, F.S.;
114 revising definitions; amending s. 481.205, F.S.;
115 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;
116 amending s. 481.207, F.S.; revising certain fees for
117 interior designers; amending s. 481.209, F.S.;
118 providing requirements for a certificate of
119 registration and a seal for interior designers;
120 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;
121 amending s. 481.213, F.S.; revising requirements for
122 certification of licensure by endorsement for certain
123 licensees to engage in the practice of architecture;
124 providing that registration is not required for
125 specified persons to practice; amending s. 481.2131,

Page 5 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
126 F.S.; requiring certain interior designers to include
127 a specified seal when submitting documents for the
128 issuance of a building permit; amending s. 481.215,
129 F.S.; revising the number of hours of specified
130 courses the board must require for the renewal of a
131 license or certificate of registration; authoring
132 licensees to complete certain courses online; amending
133 s. 481.217, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes
134 made by the act; amending s. 481.219, F.S.; deleting
135 provisions permitting the practice of or offer to
136 practice interior design through certain business
137 organizations; deleting provisions requiring
138 certificates of authorization for certain business
139 organizations offering interior design services to the
140 public; requiring a licensee or applicant in the
141 practice of architecture to qualify a business
142 organization; providing requirements; amending
143 481.221, F.S.; requiring registered architects and
144 certain business organizations to display their
145 license number in specified advertisements; amending
146 s. 481.223, F.S.; providing construction; amending s.
147 481.2251, F.S.; revising acts that constitute grounds
148 for disciplinary actions relating to interior
149 designers; amending ss. 481.229 and 481.231, F.S.;
150 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;

Page 6 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
151 amending s. 481.303, F.S.; deleting the definition of
152 the term "certificate of authorization"; amending s.
153 481.310, F.S.; providing that an applicant who holds a
154 specified degree is not required to demonstrate 1 year
155 of practical experience for licensure; amending s.
156 481.311, F.S.; requiring the Board of Landscape
157 Architecture to certify an applicant who holds a
158 specified license issued by another state or territory
159 of the United States under certain circumstances;
160 conforming provisions; amending s. 481.313, F.S.;
161 authorizing a landscape architect to receive hour-for-
162 hour credit for certain approved continuing education
163 courses under certain circumstances; 481.317, F.S.;
164 conforming provisions; amending s. 481.319, F.S.;
165 deleting the requirement for a certificate of
166 authorization; authorizing landscape architects to
167 practice through a corporation or partnership;
168 amending s. 481.321, F.S.; requiring a landscape
169 architect to display their certificate number in
170 specified advertisements; amending s. 481.329, F.S.;
171 conforming a cross-reference; amending s. 489.103,
172 F.S.; revising certain contract prices for exemption;
173 amending s. 489.111, F.S.; providing that an applicant
174 who is exempt from a specified examination is eligible
175 for licensure; amending s. 489.113, F.S.; providing

Page 7 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
176 that an applicant holding a specified degree does not
177 have to pass a certain examination; amending s.
178 489.115, F.S.; requiring the Construction Industry
179 Licensing Board to certify any applicant who holds a
180 specified license to practice contracting issued by
181 another state or territory of the United States under
182 or certain persons licensed by endorsement or
183 reciprocity under certain circumstances; amending s.
184 489.511, F.S.; requiring the board to certify as
185 qualified for certification by endorsement any
186 applicant who holds a specified license to practice
187 electrical or alarm system contracting issued by
188 another state or territory of the United States under
189 certain circumstances; amending s. 489.517, F.S.;
190 providing a reduction in certain continuing education
191 hours required for certain contractors; amending s.
192 489.518, F.S.; requiring a person to have completed a
193 specified amount of training within a certain time
194 period to perform the duties of an alarm system agent;
195 amending s. 492.104, F.S.; conforming provisions to
196 changes made by the act; amending 492.108, F.S.;
197 requiring the department to issue a license by
198 endorsement to any applicant who has held a specified
199 license to practice geology in another state,
200 territory, or possession of the United States for a

Page 8 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
201 certain period of time; providing that an applicant
202 may take the examination required by the board if they
203 have not met the specified examination requirement;
204 amending s. 492.111, F.S.; deleting the requirements
205 for a certificate of authorization for a professional
206 geologist; amending ss. 492.113 and 492.115, F.S.;
207 conforming provisions; creating s. 509.102, F.S.;
208 providing a definition for the term "mobile food
209 dispensing vehicles"; prohibiting a municipality,
210 county, or other local governmental entity from
211 requiring a separate license, registration, or permit
212 or fee or from operating within the jurisdiction;
213 providing applicability; amending s. 548.003, F.S.;
214 deleting the requirement that the Florida State Boxing
215 Commission adopt rules relating to a knockdown
216 timekeeper; amending s. 548.017, F.S.; deleting the
217 licensure requirement for a timekeeper or announcer;
218 amending s. 553.5141, F.S.; conforming provisions to
219 changes made by the act; amending s. 553.74, F.S.;
220 revising the membership and qualifications of the
221 Florida Building Commission; amending s. 558.002,
222 F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made by the
223 act; amending s. 823.15, F.S.; authorizing certain
224 persons to implant dogs and cats with specified radio
225 frequency identification devices under certain

Page 9 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
226 circumstances; authorizing such persons to contact the
227 owner of record listed on such devices; providing
228 effective dates.

229
230 Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
231

232 Section 1. This act may be cited as the "Occupational

233| Freedom and Opportunity Act."

234 Section 2. Paragraphs (h) and (k) of subsection (2) of
235 section 287.055, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

236 287.055 Acquisition of professional architectural,

237| engineering, landscape architectural, or surveying and mapping
238 services; definitions; procedures; contingent fees prohibited;
239| penalties.—

240 (2) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this section:

241 (h) A "design-build firm" means a partnership,

242 corporation, or other legal entity that:

243 1. 1Is certified under s. 489.119 to engage in contracting
244 through a certified or registered general contractor or a

245 certified or registered building contractor as the qualifying
246 agent; or

247 2. Is qualified eertified under s. 471.023 to practice or
248 to offer to practice engineering; qualified eertified under s.
2491 481.219 to practice or to offer to practice architecture; or

250 qualified eertified under s. 481.319 to practice or to offer to

Page 10 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

251| practice landscape architecture.

252 (k) A "design criteria professional" means a firm that is

253 qualified whe—heltds—aecurrent—eertificateof registratien under
254 chapter 481 to practice architecture or landscape architecture
255 or a firm who holds a current certificate as a registered

256| engineer under chapter 471 to practice engineering and who is
257 employed by or under contract to the agency for the providing of
258 professional architect services, landscape architect services,
259| or engineering services in connection with the preparation of
260 the design criteria package.

2601 Section 3. Subsection (4) of section 322.57, Florida

262 Statutes, 1s renumbered as subsection (5), and a new subsection
263 (4) is added to that section, to read:

264 322.57 Tests of knowledge concerning specified vehicles;
265 endorsement; nonresidents; violations.—

266 (4) (a) As used in this subsection, the term

267 "servicemember" means a member of any branch of the United

268 States military or military reserves, the United States Coast

269 Guard or its reserves, the Florida National Guard, or the

270 Florida Air National Guard.

271 (b) The department shall waive the requirement to pass the

272 examination for a commercial driver license for servicemembers

273 and veterans if:

274 1. The applicant is a veteran who has been honorably

275 discharged from military service within 1 year before the

Page 11 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

276 application.

277 2. The applicant is trained as an Army Motor Transport

278 Operator (MOS 88M) or a similar military specialty.

279 3. The applicant has received training to operate large

280 trucks in compliance with the Federal Motor Carrier Safety

281 Administration.

282 4. The applicant has at least 2 years of experience in the

283| military driving vehicles that would require a commercial driver

284 license to operate.

285 (c) An applicant must complete all other requirements for

286| a commercial driver license within 1 year after receiving a

287| waiver under paragraph (b) or the waiver is invalid.

288 (d) The department shall adopt rules to administer this

289 subsection.

290 Section 4. Subsection (13) of section 326.004, Florida
291 Statutes, is amended to read:

292 326.004 Licensing.—

293 (13) Each broker must maintain a principal place of

294| business in this state and may establish branch offices in the

295 state. Asecpoarateticensemustbe maintainedforeach branch

296 effiece—TFhedivisten shall establtish by rule o feeneot—+toexceed

297 $100—for—each branch officelicense

298 Section 5. Subsection (3) of section 447.02, Florida

299 Statutes, 1is amended to read:

300 447.02 Definitions.—The following terms, when used in this
Page 12 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

301 chapter, shall have the meanings ascribed to them in this

302 section:

303 I I

304| and—Prefessiernat Regutation—

305 Section 6 Section 447.04, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
306 Section 7. Section 447.041, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
307 Section 8 Section 447.045, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
308 Section 9. Section 447.06, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
309 Section 10. Subsections (6) and (8) of section 447.09,

310 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
311 447.09 Right of franchise preserved; penalties.—It shall

312 be unlawful for any person:

314 possessing—a—valttrd—andsubsistingIicense—orpermit-
315 (Q\ T mal Sz £ 1 o at At a9 Sy STl 0 o n o o
\\J, N TN ull_Y [ S €5 Ry SRS ) ) o COCTTITTTTIC 1T aIT L/Lt/t/_l__l_ O CITCUTT [ S N (&

316 tieense-

317 Section 11. Section 447.12, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
318 Section 12. Section 447.16, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
319 Section 13. Subsection (4) of section 447.305, Florida

320 Statutes, is amended to read:

321 447.305 Registration of employee organization.—
322 (4 Noetsg £33 A+ o n £ roxd ot o na arm A A ATzl o £
\ I/ TN T I I T CTOCIUIT O J_C\j_LQ CLr O CIUTTOo TTE LT COTITTIT WO IO O
323 rord ab ot o n a1 =S TSN P 2NN BT S SO N B I BT S SE NG SINE 0 SN B SN0 TS 0 2
_Lc\j_LQL,_L().L,_LULI [0 | & = g =y LA T O T T T OoITCT XD (& e J_C\jl/l_l_()._\_ TTITTCCT T VOISO J\J_Y LSS i 5wy

2240 commizssion To toe Separtment of Busineass and Profesaionast
325| Regulation—

Page 13 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

326 Section 14. Subsection (14) is added to section 455.213,
327 Florida Statutes, to read:
328 455.213 General licensing provisions.—

329 (14) The department or a board must enter into a

330 reciprocal licensing agreement with other states if the practice

331 act within the purview of this chapter permits such agreement.

332 If a reciprocal licensing agreement exists or if the department

333| or board has determined another state's licensing requirements

334 or examinations to be substantially similar to those under the

335| practice act, the department or board must post on its website

336| which jurisdictions have such reciprocal licensing agreements or

337 substantially similar licenses.

338 Section 15. Section 455.2278, Florida Statutes, is created
339 to read:

340 455.2278 Restriction on disciplinary action for student

341 loan default.—

342 (1) DEFINITIONS.—As used in this section, the term:

343 (a) "Default" means the failure to repay a student loan

344 according to the terms agreed to in the promissory note.

345 (b) "Delinquency" means the failure to make a student loan

346| payment when it is due.

347 (c) "Student loan" means a federal-guaranteed or state-

348 guaranteed loan for the purposes of postsecondary education.

349 (d) "Work-conditional scholarship" means an award of

350 financial aid for a student to further his or her education

Page 14 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

351| which imposes an obligation on the student to complete certain

352| work-related requirements to receive or to continue receiving

353 the scholarship.

354 (2) STUDENT LOAN DEFAULT; DELINQUENCY.—The department or a

355| board may not suspend or revoke a license that it has issued to

356 any person who is in default on or delinquent in the payment of

357 his or her student loans solely on the basis of such default or

358| delinquency.

359 (3) WORK-CONDITIONAL SCHOLARSHIP DEFAULT.—The department

360 or a board may not suspend or revoke a license that it has

361 issued to any person who is in default on the satisfaction of

362| the requirements of his or her work-conditional scholarship

363 solely on the basis of such default.

364 Section 16. Paragraph (k) of subsection (1) of section

365 456.072, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

366 456.072 Grounds for discipline; penalties; enforcement.—
367 (1) The following acts shall constitute grounds for which
368 the disciplinary actions specified in subsection (2) may be

369 taken:

370 (k) Failing to perform any statutory or legal obligation
371| placed upon a licensee. For purposes of this section, failing to
372 repay a student loan issued or guaranteed by the state or the

373| Federal Government in accordance with the terms of the loan is

374 not EVSI SN i I AN PR AN IR IR S B~ P WoNE 2L L arnh Al Aol g~ hlieoa+ 1 ~nma
Ot —TaorTrrr g cOo—COoOMpPTry Wttt — ST v SO Tra TSP~ OO0 8o tTorS

375| shall—Pbe considered a failure to perform a statutory or legal

Page 15 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

() YH b D
D D HOj 0] [(p I b 4D
D D D oo b -H N

— P T O] o D D © T DL ¢

T ¢ o © b0 il ™ ¢ O H -
® ™ 0 P §®) N 0 4 Jon 4 - L P

ReH s b - o} o e ¢ Q@ D wpw -H O O
) @O -H $H own Y T D b & 0 O E I B Ho0P

o O O n (@] © )] o 4 g [ D Y o,

HO) RO | [OFEEEN O - — - -t [ IS D Ko €
() O () 0] 3] T — D — )] @ D [ pI1 ] D
0 2 £ @ T ~ 0} H <~ -H -H O ¢ H © O -H

D b ¢ 0 ~ I P P ¢ f & W o oq
on o O} (O} < £ T P ¢ & 4P D P o}
& — D Q s} ~ - -H [ w YH B ~ — ®

- D 44 3 o iy D &£ D ~ [op) ~ W

(K D — s} . N b T @ D [ox) [09] D & B
@ H ] O 0 H B $H H & @ -1 @ D @ W

D ~ @ (V] © (] Te} Y [E FRRIS) D W D -H E & [09) ®

-H v ¢ B S T W < O ® » -7 -H — + o
+ ) D O w g q P b n A ) D ¢ u -
() g o O S| ®© o O e P H 4@ @ P D ¢ D
® jib) O k& O O - 4 D D & I N ON D O

[Sp It ] ) 0] -~ -~ in] ® @ )] D, [49] @ D Hoo-H
pe o @ o PP ~ in] -~ My D ® N W D O (O]
H H ¢ - @) n O @) iB] P 4 NP D i 0] [09)
® HOj Yy 0] S5 0] O HO) D D 4] @ - D @ -
@ nh P — 4 (0] © ¢ b P D b 1 4 O T

-H -H 4D ® 4 H Y D 4 D D D i 4P B

— N O N 4 Q, -H o M D 4 © 4D b h I
o, @ T O O A o) NI h ¢ H & & 4

-H D 0] @ O « 0] ® ® D o - ® ® D  YH -
0] -H @ g o oo~ — (| R (3 D @ D OF H D ¥
i P4 O ©® O < @© BY b 0D D 4 D 44 4

-H P S oY . ~ O b T -HfE P D IO

HO) D wWw v oA 3 © oo 4 b L () D ¢

I A0 0 B w0 o T < R ) -Ho b ¢ & -f -f
& — - n o< O @© -H P D D oo @ -H W
2 ORI — 0 g o & o D g & 4 O O
& D b O 4 o P 4 ®© U b 4 dh D -H B D

- o E > 0 0 0] b ¢ P P O o T OO
@ O, 4P o S O O < _ D 4 >4 @ -HF D D

- -H ® ¢ D A P n P LR A o O 4 [0} [49) [( ] & H
& o N b & ~ O Q S 0 9 0 - D D W o

N P d G © O S 0 +dA ®n -fd - b - ¢ L D D L
) F T () 1) 50 W0 [9p] 0] © a D # 4 b O T oo . &

on 1) ® o O OIS 0] { -H H @ B D 4P D UH D

1b —H ()] ™ @ a Y @) D 4 [ T} ow b D
D @ -f D . . Q (OB & 0] bt < P [OXIN(Y) D 4d

i) L 4P d4 o © o~ ©o g O A P &L D ¢ T 9
(3 () HO) o - — ®© ¢ ¢ e L ¢ D - o, 4
® 0] fH D HORETS 4 D o, T My -H T D €

D D T & c n o< O O D © H ¢ [N (o D

~ ¢ ud O, 4 0] O o A ™~ D D D — g [99] D 4D [0} i
G Hon i = A - o g S L s I 1 D B
O P @« £ P i) o P ~ e T &€ ¢ @ F - Y

- b ®» @© O© O Tl O n ©O©W A4 +~ O © D @ #H B¢ @
iS] q - 4 4 g 0] 0] Q [OJET] n 4 & < H N - D D,
© D 4 @ D P nn ~H nn P < o ¥ £ P 4 D @ ® K JNO) D
o ¢ H © 3 Q P B & D, ¢ D -

- o Q D o} 0] s Q, HoOP ¢ D D — »

— D D @ D [oF © )] ® [ON —H -H T D D

Q (OT C N (O BN I Q in 3 D W D ¢ ¢ H D ¢ @
O B n WP A Y n (9] o) D O D B ® D W @ 4

O© ™~ W O O 4 N OO < 1N W >~ 0 O O 4 N MO < 1O W~ O O O

~ [~ [~ [~ W 0 W oW W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O

Mm M MmO M MO MmO MO MO O MO O O O O O O O O O OO 0O OO

Page 16 of 103

words underlined are additions.

)

CODING: Words stricken are deletions

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
401 thetiecenseepursuant—+teo——s+—456-073=
402 Section 19. Subsection (8) of section 468.401, Florida

403 Statutes, is amended to read:
404 468.401 Regulation of talent agencies; definitions.—As
405| wused in this part or any rule adopted pursuant hereto:

406 (8) "Artist" means a person under the age of 18 performing

407 on the professional stage or in the production of television,
408| radio, or motion pictures; a musician or group of musicians; or
409 a model.

410 Section 20. Paragraph (n) is added to subsection (1) of
411 section 468.505, Florida Statutes, to read:

412 468.505 Exemptions; exceptions.—

413 (1) Nothing in this part may be construed as prohibiting
414 or restricting the practice, services, or activities of:

415 (n) A person who provides information, recommendations, or

416 advice concerning nutrition, or who markets food, food

417| materials, or dietary supplements for remuneration, if that

418| person does not represent himself or herself as a dietitian,

419 licensed dietitian, registered dietitian, licensed nutritionist,

420 nutrition counselor, or licensed nutrition counselor, or use any

421 word, letter, symbol, or insignia indicating or implying that he

422 or she i1s a dietitian, nutritionist, or nutrition counselor.

423 Section 21. Paragraphs (c) through (g) of subsection (1)
424 of section 468.517, Florida Statutes, are redesignated as
425 paragraphs (d) through (h), respectively, and a new paragraph

Page 17 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

~ — &
o) e b &
P w0 ~ Ud D D
o) o O © - B ¢
O Y © ~ §©) o [49) 1b N D
n @] el “ ] — - — ()] [4p) @ ® -
q O 0] (@] 4 “ o, @ - D @ 4D
0} H in] ~ (@] D, D H -H ®
“ O H “ ol < — ® >N H H & &
o| - Q © (@] ~ (£ D )] D o D - Y
—| +| T| S| | —~ doE b SRR “ O
(0] “ c o] L 0] ~ D Hoo ©h P h oo D ud
ol - © 3 Qf — < D [o)) D (O] ® ® D oo
-H| © Q SIS ~N T (VI A O PR (VI « ® - -t
) + O 0] 0] ~ 9] ® v -f »q
ol -H o o| T Xl o~ . D H D O J (VIR | SR 15
o o O ©nl < 0| T oe} H P b #H O ¢ T ) o
4 0| T g B ~ O ORI D 1] ¢ - D
[oF O a Q - < -t -H —H @ ® D — 4P -
<q S| O O ®© N (02BN R OR D D NORENOR ]
o -—H| O — @ - O @ D (OPES I
o| @ Tl H| -Hl 4| Q ) s D P D b @ D © @& YW
. - 0] W ol =& - DI ¥ D 4P & i £ U
O + a 9} > A T P @ -H D HO) [ + 9] D B
© | Al Al g | P g N @) | -H D D @ B 0 O
0] . Y O Al u S|~ Q . b & ¢ (V] D D jon
4 0 e P Gl O H| O © 0 O D D ®© ¢ N - D -mH
0] > 3 (@) - -— O H ~ 0 - — [0} - @ ¢ > En]

o A ~ gc|l A H| o ol —~ H = b - b O O O T O 4
TERENNE R o) s o > — o) 0] b i AH D -H D -H D & D
— < T © o H P| Ll — o ¢ -Hood o o b @

~ ®© A G| 4 & =1 Y1 T — -~ © H B ¢ B & B¢ & Q D
o o =2 (] 0] o| o - @ O < — jon @ NISRE ()] D O D D ©
O O O al gl < -4 9 v - D D YW @ b » -1 & L& @@ B

-— 0, G 0 3 - O . .o ] [( he] D D b -t — P +# P ®
) LY O = o > © 0| o a O o -f Ky D — 0, [} 0]
O o~ -— 0] al Al YH| -H| WO (@) © YW H @ H (ON D Y4d [09) D
0] (9] ) ) S - — < < - [0) D D H (V)] D -f D
0 q (@] 0] 0] | P P ~ o HoouH - & H D
Q O a i) “ 4| O ~ . O (@] D D H» - D D D D 4D @
S50 A 0| ol 3| 0| @ 4l w o O -H © 4 P ¢ O & ¢ D
n P o> Al W gl P O o L% I ( BRS RS 1 S s () B () wn @ oG - D -
-4 @© O (] Tl <] —~ QO @ @ D D ® H @ D # & ¥
P Q = o © A o gl -H & 53 O O ¢ - B - [ I ( o - NIER
(VI c c n c =3 ~ w0 o A q 4 b & -f - D Ko D K] o)
< C Al A NEROIEEE! §©) o o~ - D Y EH ¢ D @ ¢ -f
2 O O —| | © 3| O O] 4 oo HoD D O, ¢ D 4 D 4
4 0 O O O ol wn|l T| O [ OB O R OF H LN O BN ON D K [09]
O Ay “ o wnl ™ al -H al oA N & IS O, @ D H e -f D # O D
iS] O @© o o L O] > N N ®© ® Y D [09] ® P
o, o 3 “ a O o —~ Ho ® » D 9] D @
T o~ S|l o o ~ O H|l 4] H] & wn < ¢ b ¢ & A £ -d & H L -
O —H & M 0| V| O ol Qf ~| O A N & 4 -H # B & B ¢ Ep
T 0 Q| © - T} oo ©h @ D D O
T . a © < © © - ~ in] ~ . D D -H N - fon
© (ee] — — (@) e O — O n [e0) A~ N ® oo 4 A~ H M~ [0)) T~ B
o o o| -H 0| H T S | R O 0 O oo P h @ p L -f D) D
S 4 ~ ~ t e o u t ~ S t 4 ~— .V .V ._||_ ~— ~— £'|_ ~— Vl_
-— - g P O Q| 3 (DI 4 @ kY] 4y o
S 0] oF ~ < 0] ~ in] -t i1y D ._.u D B M
—~ P O T O i O —~ @ — HOJ & & [99] 0]
O S gl S | - Xl A s} ¢ ¢ O 4 jon ®
~ a 3 O] < = (0] ~ 0 ® D B ® D -rH RO
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1 W >~ 0O O O 4 N MO < 0 O I~ W O O
N N N N O M MO MmO O O O O O O S$@ <$° O S$°OFoTo oo 0
AU S RS S U R S U SRR S LS S VRS S R U A LIRS (R S VIS U S VRS U S

Page 18 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

451
452
453
454
455
456
457
458
459
460

461 Section 23. Paragraph (f) o
462 468.003, Florida Statutes, 1s amended to read:

463 468.603 Definitions.—As used in this part:

464 (5) "Categories of building code inspectors" include the
465 following:

466 (f) "Residential omre—and—two—familtydwelling inspector"”

467| means a person who is qualified to inspect and determine that

468 one-family, two-family, or three-family residences not exceeding

469| two habitable stories above no more than one uninhabitable story

470 and accessory use structures in connection therewith emre—and—two

tu¥res are constructed in

471 familydwellings—andaoceessory—S
472 accordance with the provisions of the governing building,

473 plumbing, mechanical, accessibility, and electrical codes.

474 Section 24. Paragraph (c) of subsection (2) and paragraph
475 (a) of subsection (7) of section 468.609, Florida Statutes, are

Page 19 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

476 amended to read:

477 468.609 Administration of this part; standards for

478 certification; additional categories of certification.—

479 (2) A person may take the examination for certification as
480 a building code inspector or plans examiner pursuant to this

481| part if the person:

482 (c) Meets eligibility requirements according to one of the
483 following criteria:

484 1. Demonstrates 4 & years' combined experience in the

485 field of construction or a related field, building code

486| inspection, or plans review corresponding to the certification
487 category sought;

488 2. Demonstrates a combination of postsecondary education
489 in the field of construction or a related field and experience
490 which totals 3 4 years, with at least 1 year of such total being
491 experience in construction, building code inspection, or plans
492 review;

493 3. Demonstrates a combination of technical education in
494 the field of construction or a related field and experience

495| which totals 3 4 years, with at least 1 year of such total being
496| experience in construction, building code inspection, or plans
497 review;

498 4. Currently holds a standard certificate issued by the
499| Dboard or a firesafety inspector license issued pursuant to

500 chapter 633, with khas a minimum of 3 years' verifiable full-time

Page 20 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

501 experience in firesafety inspection or firesafety plan review,

502 and has satisfactorily completed a building code inspector or
503| plans examiner training program that provides at least 100 hours
504| but not more than 200 hours of cross-training in the

505 certification category sought. The board shall establish by rule
506 criteria for the development and implementation of the training
507| programs. The board shall accept all classroom training offered
508| by an approved provider if the content substantially meets the
509| intent of the classroom component of the training program;

510 5. Demonstrates a combination of the completion of an

511| approved training program in the field of building code

512 inspection or plan review and a minimum of 2 years' experience
513 in the field of building code inspection, plan review, fire code
514 inspections and fire plans review of new buildings as a

515 firesafety inspector certified under s. 633.216, or

516| construction. The approved training portion of this requirement
517 shall include proof of satisfactory completion of a training

518| program that provides at least 200 hours but not more than 300
519| hours of cross-training that is approved by the board in the

520 chosen category of building code inspection or plan review in
521 the certification category sought with at least 20 hours but not
522 more than 30 hours of instruction in state laws, rules, and

523 ethics relating to professional standards of practice, duties,
524 and responsibilities of a certificateholder. The board shall

525| coordinate with the Building Officials Association of Florida,

Page 21 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

526 Inc., to establish by rule the development and implementation of
527 the training program. However, the board shall accept all

528 classroom training offered by an approved provider if the

529 content substantially meets the intent of the classroom

530 component of the training program;

531 6. Currently holds a standard certificate issued by the
532| board or a firesafety inspector license issued pursuant to

533 chapter 633 and:

534 a. Has at least 4 & years' verifiable full-time experience
535| as an inspector or plans examiner in a standard certification
536| category currently held or has a minimum of 4 & years'

537| verifiable full-time experience as a firesafety inspector

538 licensed pursuant to chapter 633.

539 b. Has satisfactorily completed a building code inspector
540 or plans examiner classroom training course or program that

541| provides at least 200 but not more than 300 hours in the

542 certification category sought, except for one-family and two-
543 family dwelling training programs, which must provide at least
544 500 but not more than 800 hours of training as prescribed by the
545| board. The board shall establish by rule criteria for the

546| development and implementation of classroom training courses and
547| programs in each certification category; or

548 7.a. Has completed a 4-year internship certification

549| program as a building code inspector or plans examiner while

550 employed full-time by a municipality, county, or other

Page 22 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

551 governmental Jjurisdiction, under the direct supervision of a
552 certified building official. Proof of graduation with a related
553| vocational degree or college degree or of verifiable work

554 experience may be exchanged for the internship experience

555 requirement year-for-year, but may reduce the requirement to no
556 less than 1 year.

557 b. Has passed an examination administered by the

558 International Code Council in the certification category sought.
559| Such examination must be passed before beginning the internship
560| certification program.

561 c. Has passed the principles and practice examination

562| before completing the internship certification program.

563 d. Has passed a board-approved 40-hour code training

564 course in the certification category sought before completing
565| the internship certification program.

566 e. Has obtained a favorable recommendation from the

567 supervising building official after completion of the internship
568 certification program.

569 (7) (a) The board shall provide for the issuance of

570| provisional certificates valid for 2 years d+—pear, as specified
571| by board rule, to any building code inspector or plans examiner
572| who meets the eligibility requirements described in subsection
573 (2) and any newly employed or promoted building code

574 administrator who meets the eligibility requirements described

575 in subsection (3). The provisional license may be renewed by the

Page 23 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

576| board for just cause; however, a provisional license is not

577 valid for longer than 3 years.

578 Section 25. Section 468.613, Florida Statutes, is amended
579 to read:

580 468.613 Certification by endorsement.—The board shall

581 examine other certification or training programs, as applicable,
582| upon submission to the board for its consideration of an

583| application for certification by endorsement. The board shall
584 waive its examination, qualification, education, or training
585| requirements, to the extent that such examination,

586| qualification, education, or training requirements of the

587 applicant are determined by the board to be comparable with

588 those established by the board. The board shall waive its

589| examination, qualification, education, or training requirements

590 if an applicant for certification by endorsement is at least 18

591 years of age; is of good moral character; has held a valid

592| building administrator, inspector, plans examiner, or the

593 equivalent, certification issued by another state or territory

594 of the United States for at least 10 years before the date of

595 application; and has successfully passed an applicable

596| examination administered by the International Codes Council.

597 Such application must be submitted to the board while the

598 applicant holds a valid license in another state or territory or

599| within 2 years after the expiration of such license.

600 Section 26. Subsection (3) of section 468.8314, Florida

Page 24 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

601 Statutes, is amended to read:

602 468.8314 Licensure.—

603 (3) The department shall certify as qualified for a
604 license by endorsement an applicant who is of good moral

605 character as determined in s. 468.8313, who maintains an

606| insurance policy as required by s. 468.8322, and who:+

607 (a) Holds a valid license to practice home inspection
608 services in another state or territory of the United States,
609| whose educational requirements are substantially equivalent to
610 those required by this part; and has passed a national,

611 regional, state, or territorial licensing examination that is
612| substantially equivalent to the examination required by this
613| part; or

614 (b) Has held a valid license to practice home inspection

615 services issued by another state or territory of the United

616| States for at least 10 years before the date of application.

617 Such application must be submitted to the department while the

618 applicant holds a valid license in another state or territory or

619| within 2 years after the expiration of such license.

620 Section 27. Subsection (5) of section 471.015, Florida

621 Statutes, is amended to read:

622 471.015 Licensure.—

623 (5) (a) The board shall deem that an applicant who seeks
624 licensure by endorsement has passed an examination substantially

625 equivalent to the fundamentals examination when such applicant

Page 25 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

626| has held a valid professional engineer's license in another
627 state for 10 5 years and—has—had—20—years—of—continvous
628| preofessierat—level engincering experienece.

629 (b) The board shall deem that an applicant who seeks

630 licensure by endorsement has passed an examination substantially
631 equivalent to the fundamentals examination and the principles
632 and practices examination when such applicant has held a wvalid

633| professional engineer's license in another state for 15 25 years

634 A e oA PEANEE T P NNy LS S IS E G T T “NE VNG SN~ Wi - 1 xzen ]
[y wLw § TTITCTOO T AV _Y\.,(.A.J_u . CUTTITC T ITTOOUTS t/J_UJ_\.,uu_LUJ.J.u_L [ N NP VA NP
635| enginceringexpericnece.
636 Section 28. Subsection (7) of section 473.308, Florida

637 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

638 473.308 Licensure.—

639 (7) The board shall certify as qualified for a license by
640 endorsement an applicant who:

641 (a)3= 1Is not licensed and has not been licensed in another
642 state or territory and who has met the requirements of this

643 section for education, work experience, and good moral character
644 and has passed a national, regional, state, or territorial

645 licensing examination that is substantially equivalent to the

646| examination required by s. 473.306; or and

647 2 oo ~eomin T At A ]y A 3 a0 4 Airoaat 3 A o~ roono o +h
0 oS COomMpTr ettt Suti—Corcriar g COuCao O CouarrSCo as 1
648 beoard 4 ma SN g S ERCE I SN IR SN 2 lama+a £~ Aol el 2 AT
OO CCts  opp T op T oty wI it cifC— T titrco +t O CaotCtir—appTrrCaioTT
649 Dmszonr v a~nd o ot Lot 2 o 472 219 bt o+ 1 St o~
DA IS T S SACT = S CAS S S S Ry & S SR Sy O S S ey 5 ) T O T oLy Put ot oot outtt
650 olTrana SNo oo 11 asralantd 4+ +h W S IR T I 2 Airoat 1 A
CoOorroCo—ao oL o varrCitc O It oo g SoCaotTT=OTT

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

651
652
653
654
655
656
657
658
659
660
661
662
663
664
665
666
667
668
669
670
671
672
673
674
675

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

haia vl a3 ~a+ g~ £ 9 A g
o aopprrCacTrOot—TTOoTr T st T

i
(b)l.&= Holds a valid license to practice public
accounting issued by another state or territory of the United
States, i1f the criteria for issuance of such license were
substantially equivalent to the licensure criteria that existed
in this state at the time the license was issued;

2.5+~ Holds a valid license to practice public accounting
issued by another state or territory of the United States but
the criteria for issuance of such license did not meet the

requirements of subparagraph 1. sub-subparagraph—a-; has met the

requirements of this section for education, work experience, and

good moral character; and has passed a national, regional,
state, or territorial licensing examination that is
substantially equivalent to the examination required by s.
473.306; or

3.e+ Holds a valid license to practice public accounting
issued by another state or territory of the United States for at
least 10 years before the date of application; has passed a
national, regional, state, or territorial licensing examination
that is substantially equivalent to the examination required by
s. 473.306; and has met the requirements of this section for
good moral character.;—and

2 115
0 T

o ~Neamen] A+~ A Nt 2 oy
oo COMpP Tttt

o~ ] 1 ey
CoOTTtTroTs

Page 27 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

676| eguivalent—to—the econtinuing education reguirements—Tfor—=
677 Florida—ecertificd public accountan
678| duringthe 2 years—immediately preecedingher or hisappltication
679 Fferdiecensure by endeorsement—

680 Section 29. Subsection (6) of section 474.202, Florida

681 Statutes, 1is amended to read:

682 474.202 Definitions.—As used in this chapter:

683 (6) "Limited-service veterinary medical practice" means
684| offering or providing veterinary services at any location that
685| has a primary purpose other than that of providing veterinary
686| medical service at a permanent or mobile establishment permitted
687| Dby the board; provides veterinary medical services for privately
688| owned animals that do not reside at that location; operates for
689| a limited time; and provides limited types of veterinary medical

690 services, including vaccinations or immunizations against

691 disease, preventative procedures for parasitic control, and

692| microchip implantation.

093 Section 30. Subsection (9) is added to section 474.203,
694 Florida Statutes, to read:
695 474.203 Exemptions.—This chapter does not apply to:

696 (9) An employee, agent, or contractor of a public or

697 private animal shelter, humane organization, or animal control

698 agency operated by a humane organization or by a county,

699| municipality, or other incorporated political subdivision whose

7001 work is confined solely to the implantation of a radio frequency

Page 28 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

701 identification device microchip for dogs and cats in accordance
702| with s. 823.15.
703

704 For the purposes of chapters 465 and 893, persons exempt

705 pursuant to subsection (1), subsection (2), or subsection (4)
706 are deemed to be duly licensed practitioners authorized by the
707 laws of this state to prescribe drugs or medicinal supplies.

708 Section 31. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) of section

709 474 .207, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

710 474.207 Licensure by examination.—

711 (2) The department shall license each applicant who the
712| board certifies has:

713 (b)1l. Graduated from a college of veterinary medicine

714 accredited by the American Veterinary Medical Association

715 Council on Education; or

716 2. Graduated from a college of veterinary medicine listed
717 in the American Veterinary Medical Association Roster of

718| Veterinary Colleges of the World and obtained a certificate from
719 the Education Commission for Foreign Veterinary Graduates or the
720 Program for the Assessment of Veterinary Education Equivalence.

721

722 The department shall not issue a license to any applicant who is
723| under investigation in any state or territory of the United
724 States or in the District of Columbia for an act which would

725| constitute a violation of this chapter until the investigation

Page 29 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

726 is complete and disciplinary proceedings have been terminated,
7277 at which time the provisions of s. 474.214 shall apply.

728 Section 32. Subsection (1) of section 474.217, Florida

729 Statutes, is amended to read:

730 474.217 Licensure by endorsement.—

731 (1) The department shall issue a license by endorsement to
732 any applicant who, upon applying to the department and remitting
733 a fee set by the board, demonstrates to the board that she or
734 he:

735 (a) Has demonstrated, in a manner designated by rule of
736| the board, knowledge of the laws and rules governing the

737| practice of veterinary medicine in this state; and

738 (b)1l. Either Holds, and has held for the 3 years

739 immediately preceding the application for licensure, a valid,
740 active license to practice veterinary medicine in another state
741 of the United States, the District of Columbia, or a territory
742 of the United States, provided that the applicant has

743 successfully completed a state, regional, national, or other

744| examination that is equivalent to or more stringent than the

745 examination required by the board reeguirements—Ffor licensure—in

746 the—3s

PRI oand r  +
=TT LT Ty A\ = [

ar
ar

ot o A2 o
otatctcy OIS

[0)]

«

747| meore—stringent—thanthe reguirements—eof +thisehapter; or
748 2. Meets the qualifications of s. 474.207(2) (b) and has

749 successfully completed a state, regional, national, or other

750| examination which is equivalent to or more stringent than the

Page 30 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

751 examination given by the department and has passed the board's
752 clinical competency examination or another clinical competency
753 examination specified by rule of the board.

754 Section 33. Effective January 1, 2021, subsection (2) of
755 section 476.114, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

756 476.114 Examination; prerequisites.—

757 (2) An applicant shall be eligible for licensure by

758| examination to practice barbering if the applicant:

759 (a) Is at least 16 years of age;
760 (b) Pays the required application fee; and
761 (c)l. Holds an active wvalid license to practice barbering

762 in another state, has held the license for at least 1 year, and
763| does not qualify for licensure by endorsement as provided for in
764 s. 476.144(5); or

765 2. Has received a minimum of 900 43266 hours of training

766 in sanitation, safety, and laws and rules, as established by the

767 board, which shall include, but shall not be limited to, the
768 equivalent of completion of services directly related to the

769| practice of barbering at one of the following:

770 a. A school of barbering licensed pursuant to chapter

771 1005;

772 b. A barbering program within the public school system; or
773 c. A government-operated barbering program in this state.
774

775 The board shall establish by rule procedures whereby the school

Page 31 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

776 or program may certify that a person is qualified to take the
777 required examination after the completion of a minimum of 600
778| 3+666 actual school hours. If the person passes the examination,
779 she or he shall have satisfied this requirement; but if the

780| person fails the examination, she or he shall not be qualified
781 to take the examination again until the completion of the full
782 requirements provided by this section.

783 Section 34. Subsection (5) of section 476.144, Florida
784 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

785 476.144 Licensure.—

786 (5) The board shall certify as qualified for licensure by

787| endorsement as a barber in this state an applicant who holds a

788 current active license to practice barbering in another state.

789| The board shall adopt rules specifying procedures for the

790 licensure by endorsement of practitioners desiring to be

791 licensed in this state who hold a current active license in
792 another state—e* country and who have met qualifications

793 substantially similar to, equivalent to, or greater than the
794 qualifications required of applicants from this state.

795 Section 35. Subsection (9) of section 477.013, Florida
796 Statutes, is amended to read:

797 477.013 Definitions.—As used in this chapter:

798 (9) "Hair braiding" means the weaving or interweaving of

799| natural human hair or commercial hair, including the use of hair

800| extensions or wefts, for compensation without cutting, coloring,

Page 32 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

801| permanent waving, relaxing, removing, or chemical treatment and

802 dooca et 1 ~Taa 3~ + 4 11 £
oSOt T uaGe—=C

803 Section 36. Section 477.0132, Florida Statutes, is

804 repealed.

805 Section 37. Subsections (7) through (11) are added to
806 section 477.0135, Florida Statutes, to read:

807 477.0135 Exemptions.—

808 (7) A license or registration is not required for a person

809| whose occupation or practice is confined solely to hair braiding

810 as defined in s. 477.013(9).

811 (8) A license or registration is not required for a person

812| whose occupation or practice is confined solely to hair wrapping

813 as defined in s. 477.013(10).

814 (9) A license or registration is not required for a person

815| whose occupation or practice is confined solely to body wrapping

816 as defined in s. 477.013(12).

817 (10) A license or registration is not required for a

818| person whose occupation or practice is confined solely to

819| applying polish to fingernails and toenails.

820 (11) A license or registration is not required for a

821| person whose occupation or practice is confined solely to makeup

822 application, which includes, but is not limited to, application

823| of makeup primer, face paint, lipstick, eyeliner, eye shadow,

824 foundation, rouge or cheek color, mascara, sStrip lashes,

825 individual lashes, face powder, corrective stick, and makeup

Page 33 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

826 remover; but does not include manual or chemical exfoliation,

827 semi-permanent lash application, lash or brow tinting, or hair

828 removal.

829 Section 38. Subsections (6) and (7) of section 477.019,
830 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

831 477.019 Cosmetologists; qualifications; licensure;

832 supervised practice; license renewal; endorsement; continuing
833| education.—

834 (6) The board shall certify as qualified for licensure by
835| endorsement as a cosmetologist in this state an applicant who

836| holds a current active license to practice cosmetology in

[OR
B
B

qar

837 another state. Theboar

838 hbotirae 2 £ + 1 11 cmanrna PRI WL
oot o T crc T CCoct—wao —Tooutd

839 o¥r—mere—hovrs—of prelicensure—-
840
841
842

843 (7) (a) The board shall prescribe by rule continuing

844 education requirements intended to ensure protection of the

845| public through updated training of licensees and registered

846 specialists, not to exceed 10 +6 hours biennially, as a

847 condition for renewal of a license or registration as a

848 specialist under this chapter. Continuing education courses

849 shall include, but not be limited to, the following subjects as
850 they relate to the practice of cosmetology: human

Page 34 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

851 immunodeficiency virus and acquired immune deficiency syndrome;
852 Occupational Safety and Health Administration regulations;

853| workers' compensation issues; state and federal laws and rules
854 as they pertain to cosmetologists, cosmetology, salons,

855 specialists, specialty salons, and booth renters; chemical

856 makeup as it pertains to hair, skin, and nails; and

857 environmental issues. Courses given at cosmetology conferences
858| may be counted toward the number of continuing education hours
859| required if approved by the board.

860
861
862
863| subseetion—

864 (b)+4e> The board may, by rule, require any licensee in

865| wviolation of a continuing education requirement to take a

866 refresher course or refresher course and examination in addition
867 to any other penalty. The number of hours for the refresher

868 course may not exceed 48 hours.

869 Section 39. Effective January 1, 2021, subsection (1) of
870 section 477.0201, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

871 477.0201 Specialty registration; qualifications;

872 registration renewal; endorsement.—

873 (1) Any person is qualified for registration as a

874 specialist in any ere—eormore—-of+the specialty practice

875| praetiees within the practice of cosmetology under this chapter

Page 35 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

876| who:
877 (a) 1Is at least 16 years of age or has received a high
878 school diploma.

879 (b) Has received a certificate of completion for:—n—=a

880 1. 180 hours of training, as established by the board,

881| which shall focus primarily on sanitation and safety, to

882| practice specialties as defined in s. 477.013(6) (a) and (b);

883| speetattvyovrsuant—teo—s+—4+ 36+
884 2. 220 hours of training, as established by the board,

885| which shall focus primarily on sanitation and safety, to

886| practice the specialty as defined in s. 477.013(6) (c); or

887 3. 400 hours of training or the number of hours of

888 training required to maintain minimum Pell Grant requirements,

889| as established by the board, which shall focus primarily on

890 sanitation and safety, to practice the specialties as defined in

891 s. 477.013(6) .

892 (c) The certificate of completion specified in paragraph

893 (b) must be from one of the following:

894 1. A school licensed pursuant to s. 477.023.

895 2. A school licensed pursuant to chapter 1005 or the

896| equivalent licensing authority of another state.

897 3. A specialty program within the public school system.
898 4. A specialty division within the Cosmetology Division of
899| the Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind, provided the

900 training programs comply with minimum curriculum requirements

Page 36 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

901 established by the board.
902 Section 40. Paragraph (f) of subsection (1) of section
903 477.026, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

904 477.026 Fees; disposition.—

905 (1) The board shall set fees according to the following
906 schedule:

907 HF—Fer—haoir bratders—hair wroppers—andPbody wWrappersy
908| feesfer registration shatt neot exceed$25-

909 Section 41. Subsection (4) of section 477.0263, Florida

910 Statutes, 1s amended, and subsection (5) is added to that

911 section, to read:

912 477.0263 Cosmetology services to be performed in licensed

913 salon; exceptions.—

914 (4) Pursuant to rules adopted by the board, any

915 cosmetology or specialty service may be performed in a location

916| other than a licensed salon when the service is performed in

917 connection with a special event and is performed by a person whe
918| “Is——employedbyaticensed—satenr—nd who holds the proper license
919 or specialty registration. Arn—appeointment—for the performance—-of

920 1111111 Pl S NE L T T ] ot o n +heoar +h e o 13 ocarnamna a1 n o oot
ull_Y o o T [S5J\ SPRN i VA Hi W) wy LI (& T O C T T ITTUTT o CTIT T CITTTT (& T T O T TIO T o TOUTT T Oo T

921 | bemade—through aticensed—saton

922 (5) Any person who holds the proper license may perform

923| hair shampooing, hair cutting, hair arranging, nail polish

924 removal, nail filing, nail buffing, and nail cleansing services

925 in a location other than a licensed salon.

Page 37 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

926
927
928
929
930
931
932
933
934
935
936
937
938
939
940
941
942
943
944
945
946
947
948
949
950

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2

477.0265 Prohibited acts.—
(1) It is unlawful for any person to:
(f) Advertise or imply that skin care

wrapping, as performed under this chapter,

477.029 Penalty.—

(1) It is unlawful for any person to:

provided in this chapter.

to read:

Section 42. Paragraph (f) of subsection (1) of section

477.0265, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

have any relationship

to the practice of massage therapy as defined in s. 480.033(3),

except those practices or activities defined in s. 477.013.
Section 43. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section

477.029, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

(a) Hold himself or herself out as a cosmetologist ors

specialist—hair—wrapper—hoir bratder;—or body—wrapper unless

duly licensed or registered, or otherwise authorized, as

Section 44. Section 481.201, Florida Statutes, is amended

481.201 Purpose.—The primary legislative purpose for
enacting this part is to ensure that every architect practicing
in this state meets minimum requirements for safe practice. It
is the legislative intent that architects who fall below minimum

competency or who otherwise present a danger to the public shall

2020

services er—body

be prohibited from practicing in this state. The fegistature

T Y i U Py S T S SV, Ay S o £ o+ I N I BRI

T O CTITCTI T T TTCTOO CITTr T J -y ) =TT CTITCT TTTC T T T O C A\ - LSS iy L% 3 7 e ) (s [ S ) i
Page 38 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
951 +ha o~ g A £ ot~ o r Ao~ EIRANE SN | v A~~~ r
T t/.Luul_J.uC A [ S N R WP NI R S N MC»_)J.\jll (e awy [ S N R WP NI R S N MCQJ.\leC.LQ A

952 | architeets—whohave the designeducationandtraining reguired

953 by—thispart—or—to persons—who areexcemptedfromthe provisiens
954 of—Ethispart-

955 Section 45. Section 481.203, Florida Statutes, is amended
956| to read:

957 481.203 Definitions.—As used in this part, the term:

958 (1)43> "Architect" or "registered architect" means a

959| natural person who is licensed under this part to engage in the
960| practice of architecture.

961 (2)+6> "Architecture" means the rendering or offering to
962 render services in connection with the design and construction
963 of a structure or group of structures which have as their

964| principal purpose human habitation or use, and the utilization
965 of space within and surrounding such structures. These services
966 include planning, providing preliminary study designs, drawings
967 and specifications, job-site inspection, and administration of
968 construction contracts.

969 (3)4+r "Board" means the Board of Architecture and

970 Interior Design.

971 (4) "Business organization" means a partnership, a limited

972 liability company, a corporation, or an individual operating

973 under a fictitious name.

974 (T L A P I S U | EUe s G S
\N=i A2 T C I T T CTTOC O OO CITO T T Z T CTTUIlT TIT TATThO r A [ S U S S S WY @ By Uy

975 facaiad b o+ departmant + P S oy ISP, I oy
T oo acT D J\J_Y T \J.CtJ()._L CITCTTT T \—awy L \/U_LtJU_L().L,_LULI O tJ()._L CITC 1T OlL_Lt/ (s

Page 39 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
976| practicearehitectureor dinterior design
977 (5)44)> "Certificate of registration" means a license

978 issued by the department to a natural person to engage in the
979| practice of architecture or interior design.

980 (6)+4+3> "Common area" means an area that is held out for
981| wuse by all tenants or owners in a multiple-unit dwelling,

982 including, but not limited to, a lobby, elevator, hallway,

983 laundry room, clubhouse, or swimming pool.

984 (7)42> "Department" means the Department of Business and
985| Professional Regulation.

986 (8)+3+4)» "Diversified interior design experience" means
987| experience which substantially encompasses the various elements
988 of interior design services set forth under the definition of
989 "interior design" in subsection (10)-+485-.

990 (9)+4+5)> "Interior decorator services" includes the

991 selection or assistance in selection of surface materials,

992| window treatments, wallcoverings, paint, floor coverings,

993 surface-mounted lighting, surface-mounted fixtures, and loose
994 furnishings not subject to regulation under applicable building
995 codes.

996 (10)48)» "Interior design" means designs, consultations,
997 studies, drawings, specifications, and administration of design
998 construction contracts relating to nonstructural interior

999| elements of a building or structure. "Interior design" includes,

1000l but is not limited to, reflected ceiling plans, space planning,

Page 40 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1001 furnishings, and the fabrication of nonstructural elements

1002| within and surrounding interior spaces of buildings. "Interior
1003 design" specifically excludes the design of or the

1004 responsibility for architectural and engineering work, except
1005 for specification of fixtures and their location within interior
1006 spaces. As used in this subsection, "architectural and

1007| engineering interior construction relating to the building

1008 systems" includes, but is not limited to, construction of

1009 structural, mechanical, plumbing, heating, air-conditioning,
1010| wventilating, electrical, or vertical transportation systems, or
1011 construction which materially affects lifesafety systems

1012| pertaining to firesafety protection such as fire-rated

1013 separations between interior spaces, fire-rated vertical shafts
1014 in multistory structures, fire-rated protection of structural
1015 elements, smoke evacuation and compartmentalization, emergency
1016 ingress or egress systems, and emergency alarm systems.

1017 (11)4+6) "Nonstructural element" means an element which
1018 does not require structural bracing and which is something other
1019 than a load-bearing wall, load-bearing column, or other load-
1020| bearing element of a building or structure which is essential to
1021 the structural integrity of the building.

1022 (12)4+3) "Reflected ceiling plan" means a ceiling design

1023| plan which is laid out as if it were projected downward and

1024 which may include lighting and other elements.

1025 (13)49> "Registered interior designer" er—'dinterior

Page 41 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1026| desigrer™ means a natural person who holds a valid certificate
1027 of registration to practice interior design is—tiecensed—under

1028| +his——part.
1029 (14)43+6)> "Responsible supervising control" means the

1030 exercise of direct personal supervision and control throughout
1031 the preparation of documents, instruments of service, or any
1032 other work requiring the seal and signature of a licensee under
1033| this part.

1034 (15)+4+2)» "Space planning" means the analysis, programming,
1035| or design of spatial requirements, including preliminary space
1036| layouts and final planning.

1037 (16)+4#+r "Townhouse" is a single-family dwelling unit not
1038| exceeding three stories in height which is constructed in a

1039| series or group of attached units with property lines separating
1040 such units. Each townhouse shall be considered a separate

1041| Dbuilding and shall be separated from adjoining townhouses by the
1042| wuse of separate exterior walls meeting the requirements for zero
1043 clearance from property lines as required by the type of

1044 construction and fire protection requirements; or shall be

1045 separated by a party wall; or may be separated by a single wall
1046| meeting the following regquirements:

1047 (a) Such wall shall provide not less than 2 hours of fire
1048 resistance. Plumbing, piping, ducts, or electrical or other

1049| building services shall not be installed within or through the

1050 2-hour wall unless such materials and methods of penetration

Page 42 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1051 have been tested in accordance with the Standard Building Code.
1052 (b) Such wall shall extend from the foundation to the

1053| underside of the roof sheathing, and the underside of the roof
1054 shall have at least 1 hour of fire resistance for a width not
1055 less than 4 feet on each side of the wall.

1056 (c) Each dwelling unit sharing such wall shall be designed
1057 and constructed to maintain its structural integrity independent
1058 of the unit on the opposite side of the wall.

1059 Section 46. Paragraph (a) of subsection (3) of section
1060 481.205, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1061 481.205 Board of Architecture and Interior Design.—

1062 (3) (a) Notwithstanding the provisions of ss. 455.225,

1063 455.228, and 455.32, the duties and authority of the department
1064 to receive complaints and investigate and discipline persons

1065 licensed or registered under this part, including the ability to

1066| determine legal sufficiency and probable cause; to initiate
1067| proceedings and issue final orders for summary suspension or

1068 restriction of a license or certificate of registration pursuant

1069 to s. 120.60(6); to issue notices of noncompliance, notices to
1070 cease and desist, subpoenas, and citations; to retain legal
1071 counsel, investigators, or prosecutorial staff in connection

1072| with the licensed practice of architecture or registered and

1073 interior design; and to investigate and deter the unlicensed

1074| practice of architecture amd—interieor design as provided in s.

1075 455.228 are delegated to the board. All complaints and any

Page 43 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1076 information obtained pursuant to an investigation authorized by
1077 the board are confidential and exempt from s. 119.07(1) as

1078 provided in s. 455.225(2) and (10).

1079 Section 47. Section 481.207, Florida Statutes, is amended
1080 to read:

1081 481.207 Fees.—The board, by rule, may establish separate

1082 fees for architects and registered interior designers, to be

1083| paid for applications, examination, reexamination, licensing and
1084 renewal, delinquency, reinstatement, and recordmaking and

1085| recordkeeping. The examination fee shall be in an amount that
1086| covers the cost of obtaining and administering the examination
1087 and shall be refunded if the applicant is found ineligible to
1088 sit for the examination. The application fee is nonrefundable.
1089| The fee for initial application and examination for architects
1090| and—dnrterieor desigrers may not exceed $775 plus the actual per
1091 applicant cost to the department for purchase of the examination
1092 from the National Council of Architectural Registration Boards
1093| er—the
1094| =xes

4“
D

I o R, [ I = S s
J N N WPl NP SR S W J_/\_,L_)_Lvll EUU_L_LJ__L\./L/LL,_LUJ.J.U,

eetively, Oor similar national organizations. The initial

o}

1095 nonrefundable fee for registered interior designers may not

1096| exceed $75. The biennial renewal fee for architects may not

1097| exceed $200. The biennial renewal fee for registered interior

1098| designers may not exceed $75 $588. The delinquency fee may not
1099| exceed the biennial renewal fee established by the board for an

1100 active license. The board shall establish fees that are adequate

Page 44 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1101 to ensure the continued operation of the board and to fund the
1102| proportionate expenses incurred by the department which are

1103 allocated to the regulation of architects and registered

1104 interior designers. Fees shall be based on department estimates
1105 of the revenue required to implement this part and the

1106| provisions of law with respect to the regulation of architects
1107 and interior designers.

1108 Section 48. Section 481.209, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
1109| to read:

1110 481.209 Examinations.—

1111 (1) A person desiring to be licensed as a registered

1112 architect by initial examination shall apply to the department,
1113| complete the application form, and remit a nonrefundable

1114 application fee. The department shall license any applicant who
1115 the board certifies+

1116 42> has passed the licensure examination prescribed by
1117 board rule+ and

1118 4> 1s a graduate of a school or college of architecture
1119 with a program accredited by the National Architectural

1120| Accreditation Board.

1121 (2) A person seeking to obtain a certificate of

1122 registration as a registered interior designer and a seal

1123| pursuant to s. 481.221 must provide the department with his or

1124 her name and address and written proof that he or she has

1125 successfully passed the qualification examination prescribed by

Page 45 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

O
0] $H H
~ n “ . H D o D
O -l O b ¥ D - o™ 4 -
0 IS iS) £ D - 4 -t H 1] Ko
0 NEY)) B u H D [09] D D
(0] > . o| H| P [o9) D UH D 1Y) D - 4
O —l N[ O b ¢« & & o D 4P jon HOREEY D ¢
O — a o 0| H D b 0 . % - D -
) ] Q [QV “ D v -H D & - H D &
() H| E| O P o-H P -Ho@ gO) D & (VIO
nl P g N © h o H P D W & 0 D -H - H D
9] a 9] ~ + — -t @ Eiy) - o)} D - & o -H
L o 0O ®© nl P §H - D 4 D -m 4 b T D U
-~ A @) Qf > ™ ®© D b & & Houd -H 1] D Hoo-f
nl O O Q - HowW PP IO | 0 ¢ -d oo
4 O 3| O S| G & ()] [09] Y -H o 4H KN
ol A 0 4l B @] [{ ] D D @ H D -H @ D
0| O - o ) ORI 2N () b ¢ 0 o p
Gl ™| wn S| g YW L ®n D D Hoo-f ] - (VI -H -
O O o L ol O © ® & s [99) P® O -H HOJ D ©h P
= -H < -— ~ i B ® D D HO) @ »
+ “ > 0 [9)] P P Ky [4p] Ny D HO) YH -H  -H RO
() 0] 4l Q Q © 0 D ® @ YH D HO)J D
o| P (@) O - [o9) D, D D D iy D [o9) kY]
-~ 4 o) o O @ D © ¢ o D [09] TR D
Al H N0} o c 0] D T -H k< i -A 4 4 ® D - Ko
- > C o| -H “ ) — 4 ® ® D ] ®
— 4] | 4| 4| O -H D B D D D D >~ D
© o - g “ cal H| Q@ D @ on B bl bl & i1y b
S| H| P 4| O] © O PP ® ¢ o @ oo
a Sl 0] P L D £ 0 AL q D T
— | a n o @ D -H » gy pe
ol A o| -H iB] N s ¢ @ » [09) [ O]
oy O| 4| T T| ®© D D ¢ © D D . o ® D
-4l & O Sl O O] ¥ ™ o D L + D L #
0wl 3| n nl o O -H H @ P T+ & D D - P & D
0| O ®w| ®© o H ©» O - D D — D D
Al O] o 0 e I P Y o » aqa e oy p4p oY
ol gl ©f g L -# ¢ -4 O W E & B ¢ 4
S (] O © - “ H & ® L D D — D
o| -Hl 3| X| © o H A P O oo ¢ O o} T )
- a 0 0] 0] n @] n ® < ) D & En]
“ “ ] © D ® D ® 49} 49} P D ® 4]
o O wl | o 2l © T £ /4 s B P ® b O B @
Pl H P gl o ©h N P @ oy — O
al Al Al O O| o] & . ¢ ® ® EN R O PR (N O .
H| —l A gl -H| 4 Hooq $H jon 4 P HO) £ P IO
©| 4 © - 2| © O D ® D - D F @ D @ > @
g O O > ) N« jou jon ® ® q ®
O -H| w| T Q o » H O T P © ®
4 Q c 3 ® a o -AH| -f o - D D D [99) oo [09)
<l ol o 2 ®© 0| 0 D @ -H H P P n W
— L] H O ol O D & D Y4y D D u y | H @
- iB] o| | ¥| T W H B -H & & & D
@) o © o) c & ) B b
a @] O ] W 0] 0] “ Y ® Y D A~ N N A~ — —~
3 - el | O D D Q, P D D q B HORENe
O >~ | O al L Qf A - D -H n v O ~x
Ol L A (0] (@) ISR Y SR ()] KN [o9) [o9) - 4D
| P 0 0] © o O D D L99) s H Ko [09)
| “ 0 ~ of A L D D ® ® K ®
G o Q () O Q| a @ @ @ D D D P D
L ol ol o o -l ol Al -H B -H 4 bel bel (0] —
O© ™~ W O O 4+ N O « 1" W >~ 0O O O 4 N OO I 0O W ~ W O O
N N N N ™MD MmO MmO MO O O O O O O - $¢@ $°$ TN
— 4 A4 A4 A4 A4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A o
— 4 A4 4 A4 A4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A —

Page 46 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

bl iu)
HO HO) HO) o
D B k< D ]
$H @ oo 1P D H ] O
D O o -t [o9] D -H - - -
e o - ® o B —
4P [00) 4P jon iy D O o o~ Q,
fH Q O] D 0n o)l H D O Q,
ol b b ¢ @ D - @ e -~ ]
© & D - ) - D +
-H o9} fH Rty [ B D My D O q >
> -H D D % $H gO] o #Hq o O oY
® &6 -H 4 D ol oo n A (] (@)
ow KN b O ¢ P 4 - 4 D iR}
(OB o) D, D [09] D - “ O [ )
uy EIS Y — D -H D -H D N U H (@) 0] Q ~
D O ¢ — S| HO) H HO) D (] P 3
- (] D ® D o D —~ Q a0
D D, o P 4 H oo b ™ 3 - o
o0 g ~ . o D - - 0 o O
D D D oh — Y — -rH -H MO ) O
(OR ) P D P sH -H 6 T T ST
H Q P ¢ - o Y D ' SR OY o g _ —
B ¥ N L 0 D # D -m @ © M
Q, o9} ) [09) D @ ~ $H n a O “
s < il 0] oo - Q@ - s o o
D & HoQ & R D © ~ O 0
ow D M ® [o9) U [o9) N Q i} ()
a1y g1y ) S D Y D D H ~ O © a o]
@ D T Yd D B — D q “ 0] 0]
fH ® fH D D D D [0} B - < QO ) o A
D ) D D K5 D » D Ky H —~ & 0| -4 W
Ul - P (0] D Ny ol D — ] A~ A
— ~ 0] o) Er P D i1y i1y ~ oo (o) —
~ o, d 53 D jon - [OFEE O T 0O 4 ©
P (OR D (O . ® —H D - 9] “~ © “ — 3
@) ® D b & HO) D HO) c @© O ©c O
D - P D D D jou q [( VI ) o 4 T <
QN 0] ) - )] @ o)l D - ~ a [9)] )]
ool 0 4P 4P - - O —H -t ) [99] O © -
N 4D @ ® s ® [0} @ —H Y O (OS] i
s i I~ D [0} D o)l D ® e -f () i) 0] a [9)]
~ & LS HO) L| n 3 ~ 4 0O 0
H T P [OXNO) ~ n ~ n Q P o B3 g A
Q K K D D - H n D 3 ® O n P
NO) (V) ®h D D — HORN = L ¢ T R
D D D EORE D H -H D o - 0 P QO o P
b N0 H B D @ - 4 D [V ) O O 0, 4
) (OR 9] » » D on D . © o A 0] 0]
€ ()] o D 1] q HORE o T wn 4 T O
Koy (V] . oo & @ [o9) N D < A
D P @ - n » - D “ + 0] o
ni b D D & N £ a (@) @ ™ G “
>™® - E P =i 4 N EH @ o 4 o 4 H ©
4P HO) 1SRNV I ® D & P -~ B P N (@)
@ @ D o)l @ ® . D P . Q
)] HOj D H P D D n Ky < $H @] ~ O - —~
B ¢ -f 0, D ¢ - D (o)) [ONEENON O ™M P oo - O
o P 4P E ¢ 4 (ol D Hooo v < -4
() (OFEEENV] D -H ® D 4 ® ® N O iu}
4] Q ) [0} B ® )] —H D, D . [0}
HO) O B o B — Q©h P — T O
B O Y D ¢ HO) D YH D ¢ © O i
o)) (V) D $H  -H D ) D [ AN < ®© =2
— N MO N O ™~ 0 O O +d N MO < N W >~ 0 O O +d N M oW
[To TNNTo NENNTo BNNTo BENNTo NENNTo NENNTo NN To NENNTe BN o BN Vo BN Ve BENN o SN U BNNUo SR Vo SRR Vo JENN Vo SRR Uo NN S o N s SR A D
— 4 A4 4 A4 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A —
— 4 A4 4 A4 A4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A —

Page 47 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1176| registration and who has paid the initial licensure or

1177 registration fee. Licensure as an architect under this section

1178 shall be deemed to include all the rights and privileges of
1179 registration +ieenmsuwre as an interior designer under this

1180 section.

1181 (2) The board shall certify for licensure or registration

1182| by examination any applicant who passes the prescribed licensure

1183| or registration examination and satisfies the requirements of

1184 ss. 481.209 and 481.211, for architects, or the requirements of
1185 s. 481.209, for interior designers.
1186 (3) The board shall certify as qualified for a license by

1187| endorsement as an architect or registration as a registered an

1188 interior designer an applicant who:
1189 (a) Qualifies to take the prescribed licensure or

1190 registration examination, and has passed the prescribed

1191 licensure or registration examination or a substantially

1192| equivalent examination in another jurisdiction, as set forth in

1193 s. 481.209 for architects or registered interior designers, as

1194 applicable, and has satisfied the internship requirements set
1195| forth in s. 481.211 for architects;
1196 (b) Holds a valid license to practice architecture or a

1197 license, registration, or certification to practice interior

1198 design issued by another jurisdiction of the United States, if
1199| the criteria for issuance of such license were substantially

1200| equivalent to the licensure criteria that existed in this state

Page 48 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORI

1201
1202
1203
1204
1205
1206
1207
1208
1209
1210
1211
1212
1213
1214
1215
1216
1217
1218
1219
1220
1221
1222
1223
1224
1225

D A H O U S E O F R EPRESENTAT

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2

at the time the license was 1ssued; provided;—however;—that—an
S~ 9 o~ g hoaoa bhoaar T2 ~ArmanA £ 100~ £ +1h s bl A W e N a r
ut/t/J.J.uullL_ Wi T TTITTOO O TTT LT T O CTTIOoO T [ S N o O A T C LT C 1 [ S N R WP NI R S N

1 oan
AN

(c)

holds a valid certificate issued by the National Council of

Has passed the prescribed licensure examination and

Architectural Registration Boards,

the United States.

An architect who 1s licensed i1n another state who seeks

qualification for license by endorsement under this subsection

and holds a valid license to

practice architecture issued by another state or jurisdiction of

must complete a board-approved 2 hour course on wind mitigation

I V E S

2020

under the Florida Building Code.
(8)

person whose occupation or practice is confined to interior

A certificate of registration is not required for a

decorator services or for a person whose occupation or practice

is confined to interior design as provided in this part.

(1)

Section 50. Subsection of section 481.2131, Florida

Statutes, is amended to read:

481.2131 1Interior design; practice requirements+

disclosure of compensation for professional services.—

(1)

An 7\ 1 +orad 1T 2aA
= TZ2CC

+

1r o r
rn wp— T30 EERwAw IO

interior designer may is—at

481.203.

perform "interior design" as defined in s. Interior

design documents prepared by a registered interior designer

Page 49 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

| a

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1226 shall contain a statement that the document is not an

1227 architectural or engineering study, drawing, specification, or
1228 design and is not to be used for construction of any load-

1229| Dbearing columns, load-bearing framing or walls of structures, or
1230 issuance of any building permit, except as otherwise provided by
1231 law. Interior design documents that are prepared and sealed by a
1232 registered interior designer must may, 1f required by a

1233| permitting body, be accepted by the permitting body be—submitted

1234 for the issuance of a building permit for interior construction
1235| excluding design of any structural, mechanical, plumbing,

1236| heating, air-conditioning, ventilating, electrical, or vertical
1237| transportation systems or that materially affect lifesafety
1238 systems pertaining to firesafety protection such as fire-rated
1239| separations between interior spaces, fire-rated vertical shafts
1240 in multistory structures, fire-rated protection of structural
1241 elements, smoke evacuation and compartmentalization, emergency

1242 ingress or egress systems, and emergency alarm systems. If a

1243| permitting body requires sealed interior design documents for

1244 the issuance of a permit, a person performing interior design

1245 services who is not a licensed architect must include a seal

1246| issued by the department and in conformance with the

1247 requirements of s. 481.221.

1248 Section 51. Section 481.215, Florida Statutes, is amended
1249 to read:

1250 481.215 Renewal of license or certificate of

Page 50 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1251 registration.—

1252 (1) Subject to the requirement of subsection (3), the

1253 department shall renew a license or certificate of registration

1254 upon receipt of the renewal application and renewal fee.
1255 (2) The department shall adopt rules establishing a

1256| procedure for the biennial renewal of licenses or certificates

1257 of registration.

1258 (3) A Ne license or certificate of registration renewal

1259| may not shaltdt be issued to an architect or a registered an

1260| interior designer by the department until the licensee or
1261 registrant submits proof satisfactory to the department that,
1262| during the 2 years before prier—+te application for renewal, the

1263| licensee or registrant participated per biennium in not less

1264 than 20 hours of at least 50 minutes each per biennium of
1265 continuing education approved by the board. The board shall

1266| approve only continuing education that builds upon the basic

1267 knowledge of architecture er—irnterier—design. The board may make
1268 exception from the requirements of continuing education in

1269 emergency or hardship cases.

1270 (4) The board shall by rule establish criteria for the
1271 approval of continuing education courses and providers and shall
1272| by rule establish criteria for accepting alternative

1273| nonclassroom continuing education on an hour-for-hour basis.

1274 (5) For a license or certificate of registration, the

1275| Dboard shall require, by rule adopted pursuant to ss. 120.536(1)

Page 51 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1276 and 120.54, 2 a——speeified—mnumber—of hours in specialized or

1277 advanced courses—approved by —theFlorida Buitding Commissiory

1278 on any portion of the Florida Building Code, adopted pursuant to
1279| part IV of chapter 553, relating to the licensee's respective

1280 area of practice. Such hours count toward the continuing

1281 education hours required under subsection (3). A licensee may

1282 complete the courses required under this subsection online.

1283 Section 52. Section 481.217, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
1284 to read:

1285 481.217 Inactive status.—

1286 (1) The board may prescribe by rule continuing education
1287| requirements as a condition of reactivating a license. The rules
1288| may not require more than one renewal cycle of continuing

1289| education to reactivate a license or registration for a

1290 registered architect or registered interior designer. Fer

1291

a
&

o g P
o T=OTT

1292 +h o+ Thaaa 1 Al e~y baoat~ len o] Ser ESHE TN I NE | r
chiaoc oS oapOt— it oo ot KIrow T CcOgC— 0O cCTTT=0oT

)]

1293 (2) The board shall adopt rules relating to application
1294| procedures for inactive status and for the reactivation of

1295 inactive licenses or registrations.

1296 Section 53. Section 481.219, Florida Statutes, is amended
1297 to read:

1298 481.219 Qualification of business organizations

1299 P R =i RSP R N I, A e REEIE
|2 WPR S U S S S WY 5 B WS S N i § A\ - tJ()._L L,llC_LOLJ._LtJO, i A ) ) i

1300 corperations.

Page 52 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

P i
© D (o] [4p]
4 Ko -H 1y} oy
< A } c c @ <
o & ~ ~ - 0] O ~
5 -H % ¢ (0] th [o9) <o oo oo
O H D D @ ¢ ol V| P D H D h 0]
G 4 4b D D o ©| -H [{ I - H < ©
- < —~ 4 -H nh ¢ O] < N[ 4 K k< My D iS)
4P i) @ ) ® oo @ B o < -H » B H HOREET )]
D “ H ) D Ky a O a D i ~ @ W al -
fH Q -H ) D K 0] ® . ol -H © 9] { H H H ® D -~
D D b L P ¢ H D C 2| O ® D D D D +
uy D ® (@) H ot O O (1] Y [99) P b HORECE! [09) D 0] a
Uy [09] N (0] D [ox) Ho-H P N ol -H 4 - D @ Y o o O
D @& D £ O ¢ &£ D - o D LE ) D 4 @l O
b O, -A -H D O Wl g| wl 4 u q D > 1~ o ©
b © & o ¢ P ~ O O ®© 0 HOom P b -m P ]
£ - D O D D [o9) 0 [9) o O W ® D b 4 0] o)
RS T ) B VR ST (e T ol g9l af o ¢ . - S
o D Y ¢ D (9] Ql O -+ & [OAT = W oo D [N g
ST I 1)) D #H O -4 O n| N - ¢ -H D @ D ol ™
D QL H| P ¢ -H g 2] =) b B - D #Ho-H A cl W
(0] ¢ D [OFEEEN ()N TR Ql ®n| Q [o9) lox 44 44 i) -
Uy @ H - - - 4y (0} D D D (s D » — » > —
D » Y fH ~ 4 D W in] a [0} [OFEE. YH Ky )] D D © ©
-H (@) () O h D O al -4l < 4 U ® [op) ® N <] 3
D [09) WA H B < @ wnl P B D DEENON D D QD oX
()] D | w4y A D @& ®h wn O 3 O, Q D KON D B o
-4 B o O Q9 ¢ b o Al Q> ~ Q n P ®n o ®w
4P < S 4 ¢ ¢ o o W9 D D ip Al P
()] U] (O PR O P ¥« - Q| @ Al & & Ky §) © H I
® D -H [{O 1] D )] [oF — H ® ® D -H [0} D ©
HoH ol €@ 0 O H -4 ®© ®wn| © o) jon ORI I ()] N[ ®
o $# O] » Qg b @ » o 3| $# ™ b4 -4 -l
D 4| $H P ¢ B & O g O D @O H ] cl o
D Rty 2 ) D D ~ © 0] EH @ B ) -H oo o|
on @ @ @ O 9] 0, “ — D D @ B D @ o) a
Bo-d N[ 4P ~ D ~ r S| | o] -f R I LO XM O NI (V] D o 3
- K b)) n 0] (@] in] © 1S B i D D @C 4o - . @]
> ¢ c ® (] ¢ -d P < ol < M ® -H M 4 iy} N 4P 0]
] D ] [OFEEN )] ® be o P 0] 0] (9] O N P ® n “
g o) O o ¢ ¢ ol + Q| -m (ONENO) b & 0 0 0l 3
O 4 ¢ A4 £ 0O P o w| A B § -4 - L 0 ¢ -H o] P
0] S O D > D 9] ® ] al < e [0} D S -H (OB a O
o] 3 [ ) | O © <4l £ Q B T AR Al O
n v n <~ O ¢ P O 4l O P ¢ P D @© » ¥ 0wl
o O 0 ™0 ™D P o A ©| -H B [ON @ ) o] Ko S0 -+
0] 0] 0] @ + -m [0) — — 4 ® H -H D D Ql G
o ¥ a ® -H O W M 4 Q) O D D H W 9] 0] O
e e B | (ON —H D Ky Q © (@] [oF Y HOJ on — - IS “
—| < 0 E - -H P ® 3 | D @ H ® o YH ©
0 3 D D o, n wH O o] B o) 4@ D
IS 4 Q ) ® fH H O H > D D n D & —
© - b @ ~ -—H| O O # [ONE g o B} @| O
T| Moo - Y g9 @ o D P00 —
— O o| 4b H @ —~ O 0] ol O - [09) My . () o)l —~| O
— o -~ -d H0) D N © [0} o - )] D [ D D ™ O
~ -~ 4 - D + ~ “ 9] © YH -H )] fH D #+ ~| -H
+ -— -rH 4P o Ka Q, - - i1y - D - -rH -rH s}
O - O -H  -H D ol a| # (DR o » O
© © ® & HO) 0] O (@] H ® H D )] [OEE | ©
IS 3| - - H @ ey s Q| D H D My D H K o
o, o —+« - — D B P =1 ()] OV h B W [oF
— N MO N O~ 0 O O A N MO < N W >~ 0 O O +d N M oW
o O o 0o o o o o o A = A A A4 =4 4 =4 4 =4 N N N N N
M M MmO MmO M MmO MO O MO O MO O O O O O O O O O O OO 0 O
— 4 A4 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A o

Page 53 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

1326
1327
1328
1329
1330
1331
1332
1333
1334
1335
1336
1337
1338
1339
1340
1341
1342
1343
1344
1345
1346
1347
1348
1349
1350

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

registered architect under this part. A qualifying agent who

terminates an affiliation with a qualified business organization

shall immediately notify the department of such termination. If

such qualifying agent is the only qualifying agent for that

business organization, the business organization must be

qualified by another qualifying agent within 60 days after the

termination. Except as provided in paragraph (b), the business

organization may not engage in the practice of architecture

until it is qualified by another qualifying agent.

(b) In the event a qualifying agent ceases employment with

a qualified business organization, the executive director or the

chair of the board may authorize another registered architect

employed by the business organization to temporarily serve as

its qualifying agent for a period of no more than 60 days. The

business organization is not authorized to operate beyond such

period under this chapter absent replacement of the qualifying

agent who has ceased employment.

(c) A qualifying agent shall notify the department in

writing before engaging in the practice of architecture in her

or his own name or in affiliation with a different business

organization, and she or he or such business organization shall

supply the same information to the department as required of

applicants under this part.

(21 Tear +1h e aoc P N s - T i~ R £

\ 7/ [ B N CTIT tJL/l_LtJUO [=) A\ CIT 1O [=) \/bJ.Ull, (& Ay T C T T T CTTOC A\
P S [ P I B N P O B - NS N REE TR IR
OO CITO LT T Z O C IOl [0 B Iy & R S iy T J_C\il/l_l_-\_cu [ S N (@ \/U-Lt-/u-\_()-b_l_ulll [ S ) ) R G PR W )

Page 54 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2




vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

) ol 0] (@] K
- ¢ < O < D HORENO)] D
A -0 n - v = ReH b
D v @ 4 N < P — ® ® HO)J
B - @] “ O (@] B} 0] D -H HOJ -rH
® o, W 4P @] ] 0] D YH D ®
) D 9] Q, ~ 0] a 9] H ey &Y D D,
M ()] ® o P09 w - a 0] D 4 HO) B4 h
D &£ ¢ o i R = R O . ¢ [ T 9)
HOj Rty [OFEEES | 0] 0] D i} O 0] ~ Y ® ® ®
@ =i g . 9 O H oA A = N D @ P n T
s} D o @ 5 n P oo 2z iy N @ YH D
N1 LAY 4 C R\ > s D TS L (Y D - D
o n £ © L T 0 0 b - L Y@
¢ n - 94 P 4 <o < ®, B ) & Db -d ¥
-H Q 1y) 0] c [OF o -f O in] in] D (3} D D H» 4D
B ) ] ool - 4 —H O Ky D (O on © H HO)J
(VY I () ~ O H Qg My [ 1] (0] D ¢
H » - 4 T »w T O S O O <~ 4D ()] - v ©
O 4 b D o o QO D - [o9) KN )] Uy
(OB Y - . © @] > H O — < @ H — ® D - HO)J @
b © T -~ - O - A ®© = ® D P b P P D
@ @ n P o & 0] —H Y (O] D K3 ©  -H
oo @ - [00] in} o] 0] Qo -H Q 0 o [OR D H D D 4P
D g O > 99 d 3 O gO) -H H D v O P
[¢p] -H @ ~ 0] - — © Q, o) ~ D ~ [4p] — [OR N
oo P Q@ E W O ~ [=ENO} n P n g @ ® O -d
O O i i > H @ H © i} [ D D @ on H
O, O ¢ 1Y) @] O a O D (@] © D $H YH 9] K D 4D D
Y @ @] (OB - 4 [0) O -H [ON D D - o
4o @ T O T 4 Y R N ON $H D N D 4
D D & @& n P O ¢ T B O c P (O R ()] N ¢ P
-H k3 c © 1S H 0] B )] ® D -H ® ®
~ { ~ D O ~ q © D (VS| -H H [/ p IS H
(OFEEN()] K3 - n P o, O A a U D - [o9) ® - U
-HoHP QP P o O ¢ H o O - oy D, - ¢ D
on @ » - @] a n ~ D -~ a [ONE ) D D ® ®
[SONEL ¢ ¢ <« SoH P o, » O 9] © D D Ho4 H ow 0]
H k3 o = o e [OFEEY D 4b D, . O - .
Y ol D fH i) © QO 0] a © 0] = n ® HO)J — ¢ o
¢ & om D n 4 § 4 O S0 OB Y@ D D ¥ & O D
#H -m q O 3 o -A in] < ~ D D -H on — @ o, - q
W <M o} O D)o IR n | o . | O I .
® Q p Q O 0] (@] < © “ o)) [OR i1y D & - sl
O, W d 4 T T O N @ O jon ¢ - D © 4 > P op
4 Q — 3 -~ - O 0] -H n - ® D Ko fon ST
< D 1 ¢ c 4 4 S g Q > ' 4 [09) D © @
bl (VT | a O O = © (@] ® @ SR ()] @ H D, 0] .
¢ ~ - (o) M H D D W D D D D N
® O ® @ QoA 0 [0) ~ 0, §0) & @ D )] K3 HO)J i1y ®
o £ & O 94 4 O Q, B oA NN O RN jon
i 1y) o - — < ] 3 © — ()] - D — P D @ Y -
D o [09] [09] — @) [OTEENE] n —H D <~ 0 4 D @ D D
) Q & A © O )] “ IS ) D D @ BEHo-d Y Eiy)
o9} V)] G o 0 [0} P O HOJ v 4 Rty i D
>~ P D = P g [9) H -4 T T ®
4P D 4 — 9 A A <~ 3| T A~ D 4 o 4~ N D
-H - O < 0 0 S W gl o oo D © W O w -H -f D
H #$ A -H -~ 0 o U B3 4 T+ -H B D -H ~~ ¢ 4 D
S O I L H BP9 Q O © O i I OR 0 D -H uh
L4 0 > O © L0 D D ¥ &L
® O -Hd o (0] St O ®© D, iy H (] P D
-H - D @ 0] 4 g P “ () ® @ D D @ B B G
—H Y -m -H [9)] (@] (@] in] 9] Q, wm [ON -H YH [49] D ® [ORN]
— N MO N O ™~ 0 O O +d N MO < N W >~ 0 O O +d N M oW
0N 1o 0 W0 0w W w0 w!mw W YW W v w v wuw wu ow o r~ M~~~ ~ >~
M M MmO M MO M MO MO O MO O O O O O O O O O O O O O 0 O
— 4 A4 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A o

Page 55 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

~H
2 —
O ®
T 0 0
= [ HO)j & & (9]
© % O @ D D 0]
o < O 1] -t HOj c 0}
4P (0] z 0 ~ o Al Y ; e
0 ® o Y ~ P D 19} ] o] ¥
- o ol ¢« O O Q, O b & ¢ 4P 3
o] 4 0w o g 0 A P £ -H P ¢ 4 W@ Q <>
—HAl 0 O iS] e e )] B« O L D D D >
+ 4 0 HOJ “ in] n A [4p] & . - © o -H
©| H 3 D X O “ o 4y H D O 4 4] D 4 © P
N @] HOJ @] H 0] [0) D D )] ® Ky D H © [9)] Q, @]
S - o| - O O o H o B 4P (I] o £ <
of gl o V| » w g B o N DR ST O Of P O -f -H| O
o L D 94 O — 4 O T TV q -H H O A
vl O M8 0 O ®© H b ®© -f ¢ 0 - L B OR - —
Of 41 € o & O 4 o O © [0 R O PR £ I YH SO — > ®©
n| O D -4 O g - U L - KPP @ L G
q - < W W o Y4 N WO P 4P 4P bR = I
Ol n ¥ ©n Hl Y ~ n O w0 W 4o ¢ ®n H D ol
O nl © O o ™ Y + D4 -H -H P D ( P = g
- 0] N O ~ a 0] ~ O — ey D [( ww O Q (@)
—A | H H wnl 4 ® Q > O o4l b 1] D <l © A
H g > 0] © O g P P b P P Y @ 2l H D
of | ¢ 4 O o € —+H © - @, b & ¢ D k) — O
3 ¢ o0 4 4 O —~ 9 g -H @ P -d P D ™ + 0}
2l Q]  »w » O O ®©® g O N - — @ Sl o owm
O B “ a O ~ @ D £y P ® D D 0] 0]
— (0] ® o ol -H > O O [ -H @ -fH D ® q @ o n
— o ™ wm 4 P C U SIS | ® 4 D i ©| -4 -
© O WY -f o, - © > nm D, Ky on [OR @ —H <] el
= D nh C — L2 © ® ~ D D —H Yl o -+ P
— ¢ o o -H ~ A D & ¢ Q 0 H (M D al
— “ O S0 S Q o, - 0] My D ® My - “
] o| # nl L S -4 -4 P D - [o9) — [/ pJE1S] > ~ O
el ® fH - < Q © fH ) g HO) ® [ON Y 0, O
0 0] ) D ~ 4 — (9] © i) YH D e -f D -H - - - a
al - - 0] @] oA n LN D & H H @ @ D —| G =3
O O| W H Y o] o - o D @ D @ D [} © 0
~ - O W 0] 0] a n P D fH o, - D D & D . 3 4 O
o > P P O 94 P P T A . H D [09] -t Hq ol 0o o
O W fH @ o -d 1S o < © D D 4 - D H a -
Q H ¢ HdH O] E & © L L O H# b O O P ¢ ¢ <SP
— ) i) - o, -H @ ® D D [OR D O 0 -H
0] © fH g9 - IS a 9] H D D H My D D, @ c P
e 3 (V] D Q O o A A -A D My D P §0) B [Ea] Q, Y
= O g 4 o < U S« D . 0}
Hoo— © 0] o 4 P D D ® K] H D @ ~ O
O b © g| < ~ jou Y (V] D o D c
Pl Y ~ O o Y a © > d o D [OR YH B -H O q
3 0 O O o o Q D - ~ i1y -~ @]
+ HOj ) 3 - - () - — on [49] D ® L -H
—~| < ()] O (@) P n P Q T +~ H D [o9) 4 4 —~ N —~|] @ P
[To] @ - o A © Y M [ORENO] ® @ H D B g -H Ne} N o]
~ O YW » P “ 0] H n T T H @ D o HO)j Y § ~ -~ “
-~ - A A @] a o +» -H D D @ [l D D a O
—A H S o, P o, -H > o, n P - ()] ow © Q,
[OTIN] O O ~ ~ H (@] H H K] n D Rty ol d
Q, P ~ 0 A @] © O a H D D ® D $H P “~ O
@ o' © 4 @] o, O -A 0, ] [T OTI () @, ® @] @]
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1 W >~ 0O O O 4 N MO < 0 O I~ W O O
~ [~ [~ [~ W 0 W oW W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O
Mm M MmO M MO MmO MO MO O MO O O O O O O O O O OO 0O OO
— 4 A4 4 A A4 A4 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A o

Page 56 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA

1401
1402
1403
1404
1405
1406
1407
1408
1409
1410
1411
1412
1413
1414
1415
1416
1417
1418
1419
1420
1421
1422
1423
1424
1425

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI

CS/HB 1193, 2020

Engrossed 2

department within 30 days after ef any change in the information

contained in the application upon which the qualification

aor
T

()]

tifieation 1s based. Any registered architect er—dnterior

desigrer who qualifies the business organization shall ensure

+ 3 :
1T

B

13m
it

ar
)

A NN
< ©

12 13+
s & 3 e e e

b

7 nz

Oy X N
CompToiTy 7 A= S e

l__l.

H

O e
COoOT PO

fu

[OR
D.
|,__I -
o)
|,__I -
-
|,__l

ISEEN W)
< o

T [Saws (A

qar

EaY (7 =~ 1 12N raornan o
o777 TaT OC—TTCoSPOosTo

(]
0]

provi
responsible supervising control of projects of the business

organization emntity and shall notify the department of the upen

termination of her or his employment with a business

organization qualified partrership;—Iimited liakbility companysr
or—ecorporation—<certified under this section shaett—metify—the

department—of the termination within 30 days after such

termination.

(7)4++1> A business organization is not Ne—eerporation;

THmited liability companyr—or partnership——shall—be relieved of

responsibility for the conduct or acts of its agents,

employees,
or officers by reason of its compliance with this section.
However, except as provided in s. 558.0035, the architect who
signs and seals the construction documents and instruments of
service 1s shatit—Pbe liable for the professional services
performed, and the interior designer who signs and seals the

interior design drawings, plans, or specifications shall be

liable for the professional services performed.

(12 T O U [ AN S SN Tt e
\J_ I J_/_I_O\/_LtJ_L_Lll()._L_Y C1TOTT ().\j()._l_llol, r \/U_LtJU_L().L,_LULII [ S ) A8

0 S T S B DA, N [Py AP i N B O O A I NS N

_L_L().J\J_L_L_LL,_Y \/UllltJ().ll_Y, O tJ()._L L,llC_LOJ.J._LtJ [ | & = g = LA A\ B 1) 1§ R E R A WD ) WPl PR S WA W T LSS iy

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2

vV E S




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

1426
1427
1428
1429
1430
1431
1432
1433
1434
1435
1436
1437
1438
1439
1440
1441
1442
1443
1444
1445
1446
1447
1448
1449
1450

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

Ei
to mean that a certificate of registration to practice

architecture er—interier design must shaltd be held by a business

m

EE R L N I A R
P ) i ey A8 i S Ny @ A5 N S S S

H-

organization eerporatien—1+ e

_Y, C\Jlllpall_y, \JI
partnrership. Nething—3n This section does not prohibit a
business organization from offering prehibits—eceorporationsy
1imd IETUCNEY s i s - D

RN T AN
L"u\.j\" CTIT T

o—effer architectural , engineering, interior design,
surveying and mapping, and landscape architectural services, or

any combination of such services, to the public if the business

organilzatilon—provided—thatecach corporation,—IimitedIiabitity
e

companyr—or Ppartnership otherwise meets the requirements of law
(1 4\ TAFNEV S WA | no T ama+an T2 17 247 A~ o o
\J___[, UJ_t/UJ_L/LL_,_LUJ.J.g_), [ N Y § R Sy UL SR W ) [ S Sy 6 NN NI J S S L_,_Y Ulllt/uj.l_l_\_,g_), A
Bartrnaralhtoene AT A4y o ] 8] s 4 £ £ ot e d
t/uJ_ L_,J.J.\_,J_g_)J.L_Lt/g_) J.LU_I_\A._I_J.J.\j Y/l & R Bpm S W § | WP Eiy U S S S WY 5 B UP) W g O CITO T T2 TOCITTUIT iy
nraot o~ ENE A N I SN SR TN ah=~17 W nerma ol o+ o EIESNEE 0 SNPNE S S I S |
t/J_L/L\_/ C T OO CCIT T T T T TTIT T [SSJ5 i N & Ry e =y T t/\_,J_J.LL_LL.,L.,\_,u \a COo O 1T CITIT 1T C T 1T

Section 54. Subsections (5) and (10) of section 481.221,
Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

481.221 Seals; display of certificate number.—

(5) A Ne registered interior designer may not shait affix,
or permit to be affixed, her or his seal or signature to any

plan, specification, drawing, or other document which depicts

Page 58 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1451| work which she or he is not competent or registered J}ieensed to

1452| perform.

1453 (10) Each registered architect must er—interior designer;

1454 A N S D NE L N N n 1 ama+aA T4 111 34+x7 SN~ cg r vt~ alg o
AT cTaACTIT k/\JJ.t/\JJ.(_AL_J.\JJ.l, [ S § G Sy S WSl W 8 [ S Sy €5 I NI S - L__Y \_/\Jlllt/ull I . - t/u_l. CITTCT IO J.J.t/

1455| helding o —ecertificateof auvthorization—shalt include her or his

1456 license its—eertifieate number in any newspaper, telephone
1457 directory, or other advertising medium used by the registered

1458 licensee. Each business organization must include the license

1459| number of the registered architect who serves as the qualifying

1460 agent for that business organization in any newspaper, telephone

1461| directory, or other advertising medium used by the business

1462 organization arehzrtect;—3nterior designer,—corporatron;—trmrted
1463| Jdiekility—ecompanyr—or Ppartnrership-—A corporation;,—timited

1464| Jiebidity company;or partnership s not—required—todispiay—the
1465 ooyt 1 £1 ~o niimlh £ 2 Ala sz Aaa o1 rocogiratrarad vl g At o r
CCTrTcTrrTrCaoct—TomoCT O T rv oo r rtCgTro et —arCirrcCCtTts—OT

1466| interior—designers—employed—byor—working—within—the

1467 | eerporation—imited tiohitity companyr—or parErersaie.
1468 Section 55. Section 481.223, Florida Statutes, is amended

1469 to read:

1470 481.223 Prohibitions; penalties; injunctive relief.—
1471 (1) A person may not knowingly:
1472 (a) Practice architecture unless the person is an

1473 architect or a registered architect; however, a licensed
1474 architect who has been licensed by the board and who chooses to

1475| relinguish or not to renew his or her license may use the title

Page 59 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1476 "Architect, Retired" but may not otherwise render any
1477 architectural services.

1478
1479| registeredinterior desigrer unless—etherwise oxemptedhereins
1480
1481
1482

12N
©

P
J
o

1483 +h vl o roanAas oo EIEA —NE N HNE N o a3 e Azl A~
CTCITTCT W IO T [ S NP B W B W (.A.ll_Y [ S N R WPl N R S N \.,s_)_L\.jll O o LTV I CTT O e

1484 (b)4e> Use the name or title "architect," e¥ "registered

(0N

)

1485 architect," or “4nterieo

rer"or "registered interior

s

o3 e
\.IU_I_&
ey

-

K

T

ar

+ Fant
(= [ S P W wy

@D

+
O

[0)]

1486 designer, "—er—word e ~ when the person is not then

1487 the holder of a valid license or certificate of registration

1488 issued pursuant to this part. This paragraph does not restrict

1489| the use of the name or title "interior designer" or "interior

1490 design firm."

1491 (c)+8 Present as his or her own the license of another.

1492 (d)4e)> Give false or forged evidence to the board or a

1493 member thereof.

1494 (e)4+£r Use or attempt to use an architect er—interier

1495| desigrer license or interior design certificate of registration

1496 that has been suspended, revoked, or placed on inactive or

1497 delinquent status.

1498 (f)4e Employ unlicensed persons to practice architecture

1499| er—interiordesign.

1500 (g)4kR)» Conceal information relative to violations of this
Page 60 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
1501| part.
1502 (2) Any person who violates any provision of subsection
1503 (1) commits a misdemeanor of the first degree, punishable as

1504| provided in s. 775.082 or s. 775.083.

1505 (3) (a) Notwithstanding chapter 455 or any other law to the
1506| contrary, an affected person may maintain an action for

1507 injunctive relief to restrain or prevent a person from violating
1508| paragraph (1) (a) ory paragraph (1) (b)i—er—paragraph—~(~+er. The
1509| prevailing party is entitled to actual costs and attorney's

1510 fees.

1511 (b) For purposes of this subsection, the term "affected
1512 person" means a person directly affected by the actions of a
1513| person suspected of violating paragraph (1) (a) ory paragraph
1514 (1) (b) 7/er—paragraph—I)r{e)> and includes, but is not limited to,
1515 the department, any person who received services from the

1516| alleged violator, or any private association composed primarily
1517 of members of the profession the alleged violator is practicing
1518 or offering to practice or holding himself or herself out as
1519| qualified to practice.

1520 Section 56. Section 481.2251, Florida Statutes, is amended
1521 to read:

1522 481.2251 Disciplinary proceedings against registered

1523 interior designers.—

1524 (1) The following acts constitute grounds for which the

1525| disciplinary actions specified in subsection (2) may be taken:

Page 61 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

D D
o o o D b
a “ H 0} g i ow H
- ] N (@] (@) < i} ®
= O D in] D D H
(0] - ~ ~ > D 4 P D 4 i
a ~ o c| O © o — o ow D @
O q D O [(ONEYS ] o O P P D g Rty Rty D
94 O W e B A B W o ¢ o 0 )
- @ i) O 0] )] 3 D 0] ~ -H ® D D b
94 P - ] > T o O o~ S O 4H B bS w & ¢ =
O © O 0] 0] K] o -H D [ D o % B ® H
iE) D - o 0] O To] © O [9) —H o ] D
<~ o 0 (= o H oo < D O @ U D -~ ¢ > @
o O -f |l f# P H O H g O ¢ ¢ i w o ¢ &P
¢ o W Pl > —H 49 P O A S -H  -H
-H 0] ) S - o 0 < 0] 4q o -H > [OFEE Y D i) H i1y 9] [99]
¢y P ol P o <o =2 P P S Y D q Y D -H D
i O @) D 4 B o o =2 O & - o (OB OV > P
e O I T O L © D 0 4 D > D HO)
P ~ S > 0O S % g <D P T P (VT
D 0 D O] H —~  Q © O (@] a 0 & -H @ @ En] D
D A 4 ) D O ~ 4 O 0 B b [ 4 -
S al -H g gl >N wH"woo>™ B oA O ) D o ® D W
~ D O Hoo-H (@] a (@] in] O 0w  -A D c 0 OF D
() [09] @) D - M — - Q > H b -— H < 4
-H q @ | P ~ P 4 -4 O O H O, @ T ® [09) o ¢
® 0] D — @ + @ ~ O 3 9] (0] <~ @ [10] D - [
) -H ®n O] O o H 4w D o O 4 -H=
D 5 - a a oA W ] ~ (@] — ) — g1y H
D T o D A W 4 T S - [SIE)] @ 0 D B D
) - 0] © - a © [ e o @ D -—H G Y [OJES ]
Y © ® 0| - o P O O BB O A [09) e D D
0] S 0} + © M- (@] >~ P )] iy D Hoo-H
Pl ~ T 0] 0] im] n Y a a 0] B H “ D @ [OFEETS)
0 O e T O O -HA o -A T AQ D, o ¥ D
A>T Y (N TR ) -~ g Y D . - N D
o Q @ O [OFEES) 4| T in] (@] o “ Ky D ~ P O
0 O - O O u -H O O 4P [OJ TR @4
“ ~ Q r b ® -~ H T - @ > D -H
> ol 4 S 4 O O O g 4 §0] -~ O 0 P 0
O 494 0 D o < B P E O O D D L2 0 -H N ¢
L0 g G b nw O m g O A -+ Y P Jon o, ¢4 » -H B
Q v Al A A O H 4 n o @ -H 0} n
o A @ 2z P [ ST > o A -H D —H O D @ [o9) D
a [ a D “ © 0] i} a > Ko D, o #»  -d (O 1]
-~ Q O © 0] 0] 4l < © O @ (@] 0] )] -H O
in I e @) 4 T q [OAIN)] <~ ¢
O, > Y o H P (9] O O 4 Qo -4 [09) ~ & -H m D
g Q O ) O «Hl ¢ +H o o > -t (O @on
0} o - ® o © > c O O @ HO) ©n [09) - H
N SRS > 9 QO - .~ S 49 4 T I P D
] q 0] © q @] ISEE © ] P O, o [o)) © © D - D,
& O o O o m i M B 5§
| g I N o - o o ¢ - A P
+ © Dl T [0) >~ P in] in] H D D
—~ ®© —~ @© O 4 P B o~ D D — K D A~ |
© IS o~ Q 4| O 50 -H in] O n > P O D D Ul @
- P o - Pl g u 4 H = - O P 4 o - Y+ @ s + O
nl 3 w0 & O P L2oH 0 D .~ o )
-~ O Al 0 S 9w c —~ 4 ) D -
o oy w O Y g A T i o) -
0| < ol 3 4 B3 O o 9 o D - @
al P 4 w4 © O 9 o© O 0, .t B
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1 W >~ 0O O O 4 N MO < 0 O I~ W O O
N N N N O M MO MmO O O O O O O S$@ <$° O S$¢$*°OFoT oo 0
[To N Vo BT B To BN To NN To NENNTo NN To NN To NN Te NN To T BENNTo NN To NN To NN T NN To NN To NENNTo NN To NNNTe NN To NN To BN TO NENNTe)
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

Page 62 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

o
a “ D HO) @
¢ - O 0] My @ ®
D — O LI O N1y [1M] D
-H - N 3 [9) ) ST 4P
4 L (VIR —~ O 0} 0 W@ D Q0P
® Gl Y © O 0] O @ O D -H NORENO] D
() © — O g Y - g o P . ¢ @
-H al > g -+ 0 > 0 b P b P & D4
- P+~ A | 9 9 g HoP b O -H -
Q nl £ © O —~H ®0 0} o o B W ST S P x
D - q H S50 o~ A 0 O H D @ 4y ®
oy O O T © O in] n A 4P [ s G oab
— o o T g o o R z @ (0] D o
® S o A 0 1S 0] o - O @ D £ - D HO)J D
() — — 4 ®© g 4 ® P 4 -H -
) Q o “ )] © i} n o M (@] bl -H ® o oI ]
— < 0] “ o T O 0] O ~ ® D @ [0}
) a O “ )] 5 0 A i H n ~ O D
fH oo O © © )] a Ky B Hop [0} D
D e o 0] a O 1S ~ 0 0] ® D D [ORES | ow
o~ O o +» A 0] > 4 (@] 0] P o, -d ® B
b - o 1S in] - 4 )] > D Y @
fH < >~ P A - “ ~ O 0, n D D @ D LS ® @
D 2z n Y @) (@) 0] 9 - =] -t 4 [o9) [ I N ®
i« — (@] © i 0, O on [OR @ Ry D H 4
O] P © > g 0, ~ G O iy D D O D 4P
4P “ o Q 0O w M (ORI o P §O)j q oo @ -
P (V] (@) O R O ] e al P Y s -H - ® » oo K3
D 4 0, A T 0 Y T @| O D P H P Ko D D
O o L 0 o 0 2 0 g 4| o D 4 D D -H &
S| q “ o O < o H P [ ()] H o4 P ¢ p I SR}
O ™ o 4 g o0 P 5 g O w0l w D D & P ® D
i« T £ 3 A M o W Al -A -t D L EF H ©
Rty © a o P a ~ -~ H o @O @ P D o -H @ D
o - 0] o <o -A 0] )] ] 0] 0] -H g D [0} D @ €
4 & o 4 35 O > -H O H < > jou H (OB D
b ¢ o~ 4 50T - > D Ui IV T O VR (R
D — O T L wm 0] in] O O 0] “ H D D D D &£
O W A 4 nm o 0o, 4 ¢ o O D, <A & ) D
H H 4 0 Q - o o o © P bR N ~ ¢ ™ o
B () @ O O o -H O 0] b D -H D UH |
K (OR [T 0] n n 0] [0} o 9 g ¢ kS [0} ~ @ D &£
O “ “ T O e O )] ® H s ® D D
® D O O O 0] LA A D [o)) Rty [ox H
4P o Q o O S o E ol @ oo 1] oo O ud
D a o o @ ~ o o O =2 «© @ -H ¢ P -dH F
i) (op) - (@) c O 9 -+ - 0] < -H B 4 - [09) ® Ko
T I e I s B () B O n v NI E -HooW & -H 4 D
g - (o] 4 O O o [ (9] O 0] ® ® O Y, [ [OFEE M
D = u o o0 g HA o = € « A = HP n & 4 o o
- 2 9 9 O <o - O 2 0 D ¢ & < D O -H
H® O O & wn =T ®w - -—H g - D D - » O ®©
K ER a A H 0] in] — LY > ® q [0} HO)J <L D
® A 0] o T - @ - -— . @ HO)
(OR © > Q0 in] Q O H D D
—~ — — O “ — - —~| -H ) N A~ D A~ » b - Y
(OO 0] O <4 4 S O wH o0 o ©w g M - H & D
-H ~ —A 5 0 P A — n = g o 4 ¥ ~ + ¢ D H T+ -d
oo A W g Y 0} O O O §o} b ¢ B s
iy H o+ P >N 0 r 0, n WY H n D 4 D
— o 4 Q, [9) [ “ ® Ko ® 4P
D - o - a a a 0] 0] 0] ] D D D ® oo
Rty + 2 © o -H 1S S S 0, RO} [OFEEETSE S | -H
— N MO N O ™~ 0 O O +d N MO < N W >~ 0 O O +d N M oW
[To TNNTo NENNTo BNNTo BENNTo NENNTo NENNTo NN To NENNTe BN o BN Vo BN Ve BENN o SN U BNNUo SR Vo SRR Vo JENN Vo SRR Uo NN S o N s SR A D
To N To B To N To N To N o NN To NN o NN To NN o NN To NN o NN To NN To NN o NN o NN To NN To NN To NN To NN To NENNTO NN o NENNTo RRNNTO)
— 4 A4 4 A4 A4 A 4 A A4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A4 4 A —

Page 63 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

Uy
@]
fH 0]
D —H —H < 0]
@ D — D S o~ o] a
- (T N TR I R
@ — o ¥ D 4 & B H “ 0] O WY
i} ~ © My [0} @ O (O O
D H H0 D KPP D T P X @
£ 0 i O O ¢ D [ I ) >y $H (0] ©
® ) ) -~ -H D a O W - D HORNNETS
- O ~ i) ® H b D b . © O @] a “
¢ be 0] O O D D ® H fH D a @ in] © 0]
D fH i) [ on D M W © ] a D e
-t Q -— ~ | —H ~ ® N B O “ O -H s} 0] ©
1b [09] e in} [OTIN(V] oo IS D -H 4 Y O -l 4 O n =]

® @) - o b & » >~ 0 g PP o o

fH fH S 0] 0] ~ @ @ [ I TR ()] i} i} (] 0] 0] ©

D D @ 0o < D -H D oo a H ~ D O WY
HORE | O L P o P P L P A O O D o» o WY 0
- “ O D o B D 3 0 D -~ o

9] Rty 0} a » ~ D ® n D o > O in] - a e Y

¢ @ o) 9 A D ¢© P o o j o o o

D O q O B D H D ™Nog = O © ] > (OS] a
) & 0] ~ - -f H D — B (@] O ~ “ > o -
) Y T L £ T ¢ £ @ n P o -~ s S YR !
fH ol ] O - B4 o -H O [T a — o m + © -
D ® O © S5 o H H» - 0n D ] - Q| a - © Q ©
(o) + ~ o] n n @ Ky Q, ~ 9] Q, -~ o “ 0] i

@ @ 4 q P D D D -H —~ (@] © P 0] in] n “

D Y o O D @ [OJ ()] O, P > 0, 9] ~ 9] 0]
- @ H O @ P - n P o — g O - —H 9O
Rty )] - @] (99 - YH H D D © - < b 0] a @]

e & “ -4 @ 4 D & 4 o iE) (OS] - 0

n b 10) D e B D D - n O Y © e o “

@ 4 @] RONEN O] H D Q©h T A (@] ~ a i) O O 0]

O D I~ © “ @ D n ® a P 0] (o] 9] o - )

O o1~ O @] ~ fH ® - - O a i “ PP

15 o\ a ™ O [ ) ~ {1 O O nlf ~ ® 0O O &€ ®© ®©

b ¢4 Y+ 4 © ~ & - f - ! n A - (O] ©c ~ g

) D O >~ M q - D #$ T Q P o a i) o~ O

-Hooo o O 7P D » » ~ 3 O ] [0} D H A “

0] Hoo o c a B B D D D D © 9] © 1S ~ = 9] @] > @]
oo O, N a - o @ ) H -m O ©) o 4
4P e DY P -H - D D b O < ©O = O O M D <& g

W ~ i) 0] @ be W H $H - a )] in] B 0] @] O

4 @ op (0] - o, - >~ [0} [OFEEN ) -— 0] -H oA (18]

b ¢ « O g € jon D -7 S <o 2 oA — - 1 P 0
-H q = @] <~ @ n o ¢ H in] i (@] i @ © © -~ <

Y . 0] O O a D -H D S e B | )] n > ® 0 “~

4 v O ™ O g O YWY uyd NI c O 4 ®© B 3 O O O

] -~ - D D - n 0] 4 (@] a 4 4 <] 4y [O P

o9} QP YW ~ 0 ® ® D < H )] Q Q O D I o

b @ D @) ~ O & h P ow v = P Q) M~ (a7 H o
— 4P 0] o) D i1y - -t 0] 0] o Lo

()] @ o~ (@] -H @ 4 H P n o o D ~

N D D — 0 — a “ i1y w D D Y — i) - — — ~ - — ~
-H W [ g o A o O ® g D N 0 - M Q @) ©h O Uy
HO) P~ O = o -H Y By b ®» — T o = — O

(] ® - - “ ® H [0} a a O D O
M B > — 0 ¥ D -H  H i R OB ol P
- D M o P b @ & 4 D o XM n )

O R (VL O] o < ¢ @ - o u » 4 ®©® O B 0l o
W »  w» 0 oo+ D P D D o P W [09] w| 3
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1 W >~ 0O O O 4 N MO < 0 O I~ W O O
~ [~ [~ [~ W 0 W oW W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O
To N To B To N To N To N o NN To NN o NN To NN o NN To NN o NN To NN To NN To NN o HENNTo NN NN To NN To NN o NENNTS NN o NENNTS BENENC)
— 4 A4 4 A4 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A 4 A4 4 A —

Page 64 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1601 violation of the Florida Building Code as reported by a local
1602 jurisdictions+—er

1603 “+er—TFssuanee—of o reprimand.

10604 Section 57. Paragraph (b) of subsection (5) and

1605 subsections (6) and (8) of section 481.229, Florida Statutes,

1606 are amended to read:

1607 481.229 Exceptions; exemptions from licensure.—
1608 (5)
1609 (b) Notwithstanding any other provision of this part, all

1610| persons licensed as architects under this part shall be

1611| qualified for interior design registration dieemsuvre upon

1612 submission of a completed application for such license and a fee
1613| not to exceed $30. Such persons shall be exempt from the
lol4 requirements of s. 481.209(2). For architects licensed as
1615 interior designers, satisfaction of the requirements for renewal
1616| of licensure as an architect under s. 481.215 shall be deemed to

1617 satisfy the requirements for renewal of registration lieensuare

1618 as an interior designer under that section. Complaint

1619| processing, investigation, or other discipline-related legal
1620 costs related to persons licensed as interior designers under
1621 this paragraph shall be assessed against the architects' account
1622 of the Regulatory Trust Fund.

1623 (6) This part does shald not apply to:

1624 (a) A person who performs interior design services or

1625 interior decorator services for any residential applications+

Page 65 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1626| provided—that suvech person deoesneotadvertise as—or represent

1627 himselfeor herself as——aninterieordesigner. For purposes of

1628 this paragraph, "residential applications” includes all types of
1629 residences, including, but not limited to, residence buildings,
1630 single-family homes, multifamily homes, townhouses, apartments,
1631 condominiums, and domestic outbuildings appurtenant to one-

1632 family or two-family residences. Hewewver;—'"residentialt

1633| =ppltiecations' deoes—rot—iretlude commeonoreas—associated with

1634| instarces—ofmultiple—unit dwelling applications~
1635 (b) An employee of a retail establishment providing

1636 "interior decorator services" on the premises of the retail
1637| establishment or in the furtherance of a retail sale or
1638| prospective retail sale, provided that such employee does not

1639| advertise as, or represent himself or herself as, a registered

1640| =& interior designer.

1641 (8) A manufacturer of commercial food service equipment or
1642 the manufacturer's representative, distributor, or dealer or an
1643 employee thereof, who prepares designs, specifications, or

1644 layouts for the sale or installation of such equipment is exempt

1645 from licensure as an architect or registration as an interior

16406 designer, if:

1647 (a) The designs, specifications, or layouts are not used
1648 for construction or installation that may affect structural,
1649| mechanical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, ventilating,

1650 electrical, or vertical transportation systems.

Page 66 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1651 (b) The designs, specifications, or layouts do not

1652| materially affect lifesafety systems pertaining to firesafety
1653| protection, smoke evacuation and compartmentalization, and
1654 emergency ingress or egress systems.

1655 (c) Each design, specification, or layout document

1656| prepared by a person or entity exempt under this subsection
1657 contains a statement on each page of the document that the

1658| designs, specifications, or layouts are not architectural+

1659| dimterieor—designy Oor engineering designs, specifications, or
1660 layouts and not used for construction unless reviewed and
1661 approved by a licensed architect or engineer.

1662 Section 58. Subsection (1) of section 481.231, Florida
1663 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

1664 481.231 Effect of part locally.—

1665 (1) Nethimg—3n This part does not shall—be—econstruved—=Fe

1666| repeal, amend, limit, or otherwise affect any specific provision
1667 of any local building code or zoning law or ordinance that has
1668| been duly adopted, now or hereafter enacted, which is more

1669 restrictive, with respect to the services of registered

1670 architects or registered interior designers, than the—preovisiens
1671 of this part; provided, however, that a licensed architect shall
1672| be deemed registered tieemsed as an interior designer for

1673| purposes of offering or rendering interior design services to a
1674 county, municipality, or other local government or political

1675 subdivision.

Page 67 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

1676
1677
1678
1679
1680
1681
1682
1683
1684
1685
1686
1687
1688
1689
1690
1691
1692
1693
1694
1695
1696
1697
1698
1699
1700

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

Section 59. Section 481.303, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

481.303 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:

(1) "Board" means the Board of Landscape Architecture.

(2)44» "Certificate of registration" means a license
issued by the department to a natural person to engage in the
practice of landscape architecture.

(3)42)> "Department" means the Department of Business and

Professional Regulation.

+ 2 1o+
e L oTTT

s

A3

(5 "o
o7 O

-

oy

+ g Fonoa o+
(= o CITTCTTT O (=

s

o
Faw o™

v

K

nr o
o T o

ar

P £ 74
| UPR W wy g LT

P

(4)+6> "Landscape architecture" means professional
services, including, but not limited to, the following:

(a) Consultation, investigation, research, planning,
design, preparation of drawings, specifications, contract
documents and reports, responsible construction supervision, or
landscape management in connection with the planning and
development of land and incidental water areas, including the
use of Florida-friendly landscaping as defined in s. 373.185,
where, and to the extent that, the dominant purpose of such
services or creative works is the preservation, conservation,
enhancement, or determination of proper land uses, natural land
features, ground cover and plantings, or naturalistic and

aesthetic values;

Page 68 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1701 (b) The determination of settings, grounds, and approaches
1702 for and the siting of buildings and structures, outdoor areas,
1703 or other improvements;

1704 (c) The setting of grades, shaping and contouring of land
1705 and water forms, determination of drainage, and provision for
1706 storm drainage and irrigation systems where such systems are
1707 necessary to the purposes outlined herein; and

1708 (d) The design of such tangible objects and features as
1709| are necessary to the purpose outlined herein.

1710 (5)+#H- "Landscape design" means consultation for and

1711| preparation of planting plans drawn for compensation, including
1712| specifications and installation details for plant materials,
1713 soil amendments, mulches, edging, gravel, and other similar

1714| materials. Such plans may include only recommendations for the
1715 conceptual placement of tangible objects for landscape design
1716| projects. Construction documents, details, and specifications
1717 for tangible objects and irrigation systems shall be designed or
1718 approved by licensed professionals as required by law.

1719 (6)+43> "Registered landscape architect" means a person who
1720 holds a license to practice landscape architecture in this state
1721 under the authority of this act.

1722 Section 60. Section 481.310, Florida Statutes, is amended
1723 to read:

1724 481.310 Practical experience requirement.—Beginning

1725 October 1, 1990, every applicant for licensure as a registered

Page 69 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1726 landscape architect shall demonstrate, before prier—+teo
1727 licensure, 1 year of practical experience in landscape

1728 architectural work. An applicant who holds both a bachelor's

1729| degree and a master's degree in landscape architecture is not

1730 required to demonstrate 1 year of practical experience in

1731 landscape architectural work to obtain licensure. The board

1732 shall adopt rules providing standards for the required

1733| experience. An applicant who qualifies for examination pursuant
1734 to s. 481.309(1) (b)l. may obtain the practical experience after
1735| completing the required professional degree. Experience used to
1736| qualify for examination pursuant to s. 481.309(1) (b)2. may not
1737| be used to satisfy the practical experience requirement under
1738 this section.

1739 Section 61. Subsections (5) and (6) of section 481.311,
1740 Florida Statutes, are renumbered as subsections (4) and (5),
1741 respectively, and subsection (3) and present subsection (4) of
1742 that section are amended, to read:

1743 481.311 Licensure.—

1744 (3) The board shall certify as qualified for a license by
1745 endorsement an applicant who:

1746 (a) Qualifies to take the examination as set forth in s.
1747 481.309; and has passed a national, regional, state, or

1748 territorial licensing examination which is substantially

1749| equivalent to the examination required by s. 481.309; er

1750 (b) Holds a wvalid license to practice landscape

Page 70 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1751 architecture issued by another state or territory of the United
1752 States, if the criteria for issuance of such license were

1753 substantially identical to the licensure criteria which existed
1754 in this state at the time the license was issued; or=

1755 (c) Has held a valid license to practice landscape

1756 architecture in another state or territory of the United States

1757 for at least 10 years before the date of application and has

1758 successfully completed a state, regional, national, or other

1759| examination that is equivalent to or more stringent than the

1760| examination required by the board, subject to subsection (5). An

1761| applicant who has met the requirements to be qualified for a

1762 license by endorsement except for successful completion of an

1763| examination that is equivalent to or more stringent than the

1764 examination required by the board may take the examination

1765| required by the board without completing additional education

1766 requirements. Such application must be submitted to the board

1767| while the applicant holds a valid license in another state or

1768 territory or within 2 years after the expiration of such

1769 license.

1770 (4 Th hroaard achall ot £57 oo o] 3 £4 A £ o e S L8 o
\_.[, [ B N N O T I [N 2 NN Ny & R S iy A\ L_,_I_J__Y & ) \1\4[(./L—L—LJ——L\./\A [ S N L |\ \PI S W S S (& Syl wy
1771 £ St~ g o n sz AT 9 N SN AN~ o n v vt Aol o
A O CITO LT T Z O C IOl ull_y utJtJ_L_L\./ulll_ \.z\J_LtJ\J_LLALL__LUll A tJuJ_ L_llC_LQLJ._LtJ Wil
1772 ot 9 o fF o o + 1 Y ANI1 AT ANt o £ o 4917 210
[0 & Rl UPIN HErUD R S S S ) T J.C\-iu.L.LClllClll—Q A\ =) I UL e O L
1773 Section 62. Subsection (4) of section 481.313, Florida

1774 Statutes, 1is amended to read:
1775 481.313 Renewal of license.—

Page 71 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA

1776
1777
1778
1779
1780
1781
1782
1783
1784
1785
1786
1787
1788
1789
1790
1791
1792
1793
1794
1795
1796
1797
1798
1799
1800

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI

CS/HB 1193, 2020

Engrossed 2

(4) The board, by rule adopted pursuant to ss. 120.536(1)

and 120.54, shall establish criteria for the approval of
continuing education courses and providers, and shall by rule
establish criteria for accepting alternative nonclassroom

continuing education on an hour-for-hour basis. A landscape

architect shall receive hour-for-hour credit for attending

continuing education courses approved by the Landscape

Architecture Continuing Education System or another nationally

recognized clearinghouse for continuing education that relate to

and increase the basic knowledge of landscape architecture, as

determined by the board, if such landscape architect submits

proof satisfactory to the board that such course was approved by

the Landscape Architecture Continuing Education System or

another nationally recognized clearinghouse for continuing

education, the syllabus or outline for such course, and

attendance of such course.

Section 63. Subsection (2) of section 481.317, Florida
Statutes, 1s amended to read:

481.317 Temporary certificates.—

(D) HHeoan Aotz ] sz + 1 hearaA S Al o~ cgm A+ £ + 1 £ ant

\ [ \Jt/ul.l L/Lt/t/J_UVL/L_L LJ_Y T WA LG I ER W § (@R uaw t/u_ylll\_allk., e T [ S [ w
1 491 207 + 1 Adornartmant o711 Syrant o b Arnan o o
[ S =) e A T 7 7 T \J.Ct./u_l_ CIT T T [0 W Iy & R S iy \jJ_ullL_ (&N l_Clllt/uJ_ QLJ__Y
PPANEE I I S RN £ St s o 2 n vy ] r\ r\ anrnaca £ 2 A ey~
CcC o T C I T 1T TTOCT A\ - OO CITO T T Z T CITUIlT [ S \A A S h 1T T QtJC\.z_L.L_LC\J. tJ.L\JJC\.zL_
EISNEE T SN PPV SN Fry N ot AN e o S 1 PN S NP + £
=TT CIT 1O O C OO CT i S L tJC_L_LU\J. TToOCT \—awy = o T - _YC()._L \awy LT AAY mey .
ot o PN S LN PN NP AL I £ Srasrtdad N £+
O C OO CTT \/U_LtJU_L().L,_LULII tJ().-LbllC-LOLJ._LtJ, A _L_L_Llll, tJ_LUV_L\J.C\J. A i A LS i B ey
[N N NP | £ N £+ PN S LN N £+ 1 NP SN £
tJ_L_Lll\/_LtJ()._L |\ N R S ) W S ) A\ LS i B ey \/U_LtJU_L().L,_LULII T A\ - T tJ().-LbllC-LO .

Page 72 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2

vV E S




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
1801 thepartrnership—or one—-of the prirncipatsinthe fietitieousty
1802 ramed—Firmhas—obtained a temporary eertificateof registration
1803 in—aeccordance—with subseetion—{(1+)—
1804 Section 64. Section 481.319, Florida Statutes, is amended
1805 to read:
1806 481.319 Corporate and partnership practice of landscape
1807 architecture+——eertificateof authorization.—
1808 (1) The practice of or offer to practice landscape

1809| architecture by registered landscape architects registered under
1810 this part through a corporation or partnership offering

1811 landscape architectural services to the public, or through a
1812 corporation or partnership offering landscape architectural
1813 services to the public through individual registered landscape
1814 architects as agents, employees, officers, or partners, 1is

1815| permitted, subject to the provisions of this section, if:

1816 (a) One or more of the principal officers of the

1817 corporation, or partners of the partnership, and all personnel
1818 of the corporation or partnership who act in its behalf as

1819 landscape architects in this state are registered landscape
1820 architects; and

1821 (b) One or more of the officers, one or more of the

1822 directors, one or more of the owners of the corporation, or one
1823 or more of the partners of the partnership is a registered

1824 landscape architect+——and

1825 (~) Th P NE P NN T I N2 r bt~ as e N2 aaaa
<7 It COoOE PO OO P it EoTrPo—Tias Ot —T5out

Page 73 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
1826 certifiecateof authorization by the board as provided herein.
1827 (2) All documents involving the practice of landscape

1828 architecture which are prepared for the use of the corporation
1829 or partnership shall bear the signature and seal of a registered
1830 landscape architect.

1831 (3) A landscape architect applying to practice in the name
1832| of a An—appitieant corporation must shadtt file with the

1833 department the names and addresses of all officers and board
1834| members of the corporation, including the principal officer or
1835| officers, duly registered to practice landscape architecture in
1836| this state and, also, of all individuals duly registered to
1837| practice landscape architecture in this state who shall be in
1838 responsible charge of the practice of landscape architecture by

1839 the corporation in this state. A landscape architect applying to

1840| practice in the name of a Anp—eapplticant partnership must shatd

1841 file with the department the names and addresses of all partners
1842 of the partnership, including the partner or partners duly

1843 registered to practice landscape architecture in this state and,
1844 also, of an individual or individuals duly registered to

1845| practice landscape architecture in this state who shall be in
1846 responsible charge of the practice of landscape architecture by
1847 said partnership in this state.

1848 (4) Each landscape architect qualifying a partnership or
1849| and corporation Iieemsed under this part must shalid notify the

1850| department within 1 month after ef any change in the information

Page 74 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1851 contained in the application upon which the license is based.
1852| Any landscape architect who terminates her or his er—her

1853 employment with a partnership or corporation licensed under this
1854| part shall notify the department of the termination within 1

1855 month after such termination.

1856 (B NiarmarnT 2oy o~ PNt T N oNE VS 2NN 2SN =) n £V
o7 DrSCTrpTrIitalty ot tTOoOagaTritotc o CcOoOTrpOTacTOoOiT—OT

1857 Barrnaoaraha+rn o171 S Adma g ot 2 o manmnay oA " +h
PorchaCrrosirroStiaor T OoC ottt S cCTr Tt i ciC—oSatC— ST ot Ot — o1t

1858| seme—grournds—asdiseiptirary acticor agoinst o registered

1859 Jderndsecape—arehiteets

1860 (5)+6)> Except as provided in s. 558.0035, the fact that a
1861 registered landscape architect practices landscape architecture
1862 through a corporation or partnership as provided in this section
1863| does not relieve the landscape architect from personal liability
1864 for her or his e¥xr—her professional acts.

1865 Section 65. Subsection (5) of section 481.321, Florida

1866 Statutes, is amended to read:

1867 481.321 Seals; display of certificate number.—
1868 (5) Each registered landscape architect must and—eaech
1869 | ecorperaticon—-or partrcrship holding o certificate—of

1870 atvthorization—shatt include her or his 4+s certificate number in

1871 any newspaper, telephone directory, or other advertising medium

1872 used by the registered landscape architect, corporation, or

1873| partnership. A corporation or partnership must is—met—reguired

1874| +eo display the certificate number numbers of at least one

1875 officer, director, owner, or partner who is a dndividuat

Page 75 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1876 registered landscape architect arehiteets employed by or

1877| practicing with the corporation or partnership.

1878 Section 66. Subsection (5) of section 481.329, Florida
1879 Statutes, is amended to read:

1880 481.329 Exceptions; exemptions from licensure.—

1881 (5) This part does not prohibit any person from engaging

1882 in the practice of landscape design, as defined in s. 481.303 s+

1883| 481303+, or from submitting for approval to a governmental
1884 agency planting plans that are independent of, or a component
1885| of, construction documents that are prepared by a Florida-

1886| registered professional. Persons providing landscape design

1887 services shall not use the title, term, or designation

1888 "landscape architect," "landscape architectural," "landscape
1889| architecture,”™ "L.A.," "landscape engineering," or any

1890 description tending to convey the impression that she or he is a
1891 landscape architect unless she or he is registered as provided
1892 in this part.

1893 Section 67. Subsection (9) of section 489.103, Florida
1894 Statutes, is amended to read:

1895 489.103 Exemptions.—This part does not apply to:

1896 (9) Any work or operation of a casual, minor, or

1897 inconsequential nature in which the aggregate contract price for
1898 labor, materials, and all other items 1s less than $2,500

1899| $457666, but this exemption does not apply:

1900 (a) If the construction, repair, remodeling, or

Page 76 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1901 improvement is a part of a larger or major operation, whether
1902 undertaken by the same or a different contractor, or in which a
1903 division of the operation is made in contracts of amounts less
1904| than $2,500 $34+666 for the purpose of evading this part or
1905 otherwise.

1906 (b) To a person who advertises that he or she is a

1907 contractor or otherwise represents that he or she is qualified
1908 to engage in contracting.

1909 Section 68. Subsection (2) of section 489.111, Florida
1910 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

1911 489.111 Licensure by examination.—

1912 (2) A person shall be eligible for licensure by

1913| examination if the person:

1914 (a) 1Is 18 years of age;
1915 (b) Is of good moral character; and
1916 (c) Meets eligibility requirements according to one of the

1917 following criteria:

1918 1. Has received a baccalaureate degree from an accredited
1919| 4-year college in the appropriate field of engineering,

1920 architecture, or building construction and has 1 year of proven
1921 experience in the category in which the person seeks to qualify.
1922 For the purpose of this part, a minimum of 2,000 person-hours

1923 shall be used in determining full-time equivalency. An applicant

1924| who is exempt from passing an examination or portion thereof as

1925| provided in s. 489.113(1) is eligible for a license under this

Page 77 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1926 section.

1927 2. Has a total of at least 4 years of active experience as
1928 a worker who has learned the trade by serving an apprenticeship
1929 as a skilled worker who is able to command the rate of a

1930| mechanic in the particular trade or as a foreman who is in

1931 charge of a group of workers and usually is responsible to a
1932 superintendent or a contractor or his or her equivalent,

1933| provided, however, that at least 1 year of active experience
1934 shall be as a foreman.

1935 3. Has a combination of not less than 1 year of experience
1936| as a foreman and not less than 3 years of credits for any

1937 accredited college-level courses; has a combination of not less
1938 than 1 year of experience as a skilled worker, 1 year of

1939| experience as a foreman, and not less than 2 years of credits
1940 for any accredited college-level courses; or has a combination
1941 of not less than 2 years of experience as a skilled worker, 1
1942 year of experience as a foreman, and not less than 1 year of
1943 credits for any accredited college-level courses. All junior
1944 college or community college-level courses shall be considered
1945 accredited college-level courses.

1946 4.a. An active certified residential contractor is

1947| eligible to receive a certified building contractor license

1948 after passing or having previously passed +£ake the building

1949| contractors' examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 3

1950 years of proven experience in the classification in which he or

Page 78 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1951 she is certified.
1952 b. An active certified residential contractor is eligible

1953 to receive a certified general contractor license after passing

1954 or having previously passed +£ake the general contractors'

1955 examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of

1956| proven experience in the classification in which he or she is
1957 certified.

1958 c. An active certified building contractor is eligible to

1959| receive a certified general contractor license after passing or

1960| having previously passed #£ake the general contractors'

1961| examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of
1962| proven experience in the classification in which he or she is
1963| certified.

1964 5.a. An active certified air-conditioning Class C

1965| contractor is eligible to receive a certified air conditioning

1966| Class B contractor license after passing or having previously

1967| passed £ake the air-conditioning Class B contractors'

1968 examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 3 years of

1969| proven experience in the classification in which he or she 1is
1970 certified.

1971 b. An active certified air-conditioning Class C contractor

1972 is eligible to receive a certified air conditioning Class A

1973 contractor license after passing or having previously passed

1974| +ake the air-conditioning Class A contractors' examination if he

1975| or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of proven experience in

Page 79 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

1976 the classification in which he or she is certified.
1977 c. An active certified air-conditioning Class B contractor

1978 is eligible to receive a certified air conditioning Class A

1979 contractor license after passing or having previously passed

1980| +ake the air-conditioning Class A contractors' examination if he
1981 or she possesses a minimum of 1 year of proven experience in the
1982| classification in which he or she is certified.

1983 6.a. An active certified swimming pool servicing

1984 contractor is eligible to receive a certified residential

1985| swimming pool contractor license after passing or having

1986| previously passed £ake the residential swimming pool

1987| contractors' examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 3
1988 years of proven experience in the classification in which he or
1989| she is certified.

1990 b. An active certified swimming pool servicing contractor

1991 is eligible to receive a certified commercial swimming pool

1992 contractor license after passing or having previously passed

1993| +ake the swimming pool commercial contractors' examination if he
1994 or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of proven experience in
1995 the classification in which he or she is certified.

1996 c. An active certified residential swimming pool

1997 contractor is eligible to receive a certified commercial

1998 swimming pool contractor license after passing or having

1999| previously passed £ake the commercial swimming pool contractors'

2000| examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 1 year of proven

Page 80 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2001 experience in the classification in which he or she is
2002 certified.

2003 d. An applicant is eligible to receive a certified

2004 swimming pool/spa servicing contractor license after passing or

2005| having previously passed fake the swimming pool/spa servicing

2006 contractors' examination if he or she has satisfactorily

2007 completed 60 hours of instruction in courses related to the

2008 scope of work covered by that license and approved by the

2009| Construction Industry Licensing Board by rule and has at least 1
2010 year of proven experience related to the scope of work of such a
2011 contractor.

2012 Section 69. Subsection (1) of section 489.113, Florida
2013 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

2014 489.113 Qualifications for practice; restrictions.—

2015 (1) Any person who desires to engage in contracting on a
2016 statewide basis shall, as a prerequisite thereto, establish his
2017 or her competency and qualifications to be certified pursuant to
2018 this part. To establish competency, a person shall pass the

2019 appropriate examination approved by the board and certified by

2020 the department. If an applicant has received a baccalaureate

2021| degree from an accredited 4-year college in building

2022 construction, or a related degree as approved by the board by

2023 rule, and has a grade point average of 3.0 or higher, such

2024 applicant is only required to take and pass the business and

2025 finance portion of the examination. Any person who desires to

Page 81 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2026| engage in contracting on other than a statewide basis shall, as
2027 a prerequisite thereto, be registered pursuant to this part,
2028 unless exempted by this part.

2029 Section 70. Subsection (3) of section 489.115, Florida
2030 Statutes, is amended to read:

2031 489.115 Certification and registration; endorsement;

2032 reciprocity; renewals; continuing education.—

2033 (3) The board shall certify as qualified for certification
2034| by endorsement any applicant who:

2035 (a) Meets the requirements for certification as set forth
2036 in this section; has passed a national, regional, state, or

2037| United States territorial licensing examination that is

2038| substantially equivalent to the examination required by this
2039| part; and has satisfied the requirements set forth in s.

2040 489.111;

2041 (b) Holds a wvalid license to practice contracting issued
2042| by another state or territory of the United States, 1if the

2043| criteria for issuance of such license were substantially

2044| equivalent to Florida's current certification criteria; e=

2045 (c) Holds a wvalid, current license to practice contracting
2046 issued by another state or territory of the United States, if
2047 the state or territory has entered into a reciprocal agreement
2048 with the board for the recognition of contractor licenses issued
2049 in that state, based on criteria for the issuance of such

2050 licenses that are substantially equivalent to the criteria for

Page 82 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2051| certification in this state;

2052 (d) Has held a valid license to practice contracting

2053 issued by another state or territory for at least 10 years

2054| before the date of application and is applying for the same or

2055 similar license in this state, subject to subsections (5)-(9).

2056 The board may consider whether such applicant has had a license

2057 to practice contracting revoked, suspended, or otherwise acted

2058 against by the licensing authority of another state, territory,

2059| or country. Such application must be submitted to the board

2060| while the applicant holds a valid license in another state or

2061| territory or within 2 years after the expiration of such

2062 license. A building contractor, residential contractor, general

2063| contractor, or roofing contractor who obtains a license by

2064 endorsement or reciprocity under this paragraph must have

2065 completed, within the previous 2 years or within 30 days after

2066| being licensed, a board-approved 2 hour course on wind

2067| mitigation, flood resistance, and water intrusion requirements

2068 under the Florida Building Code. The approved course may be

2069| provided online. The board may approve other building code

2070 courses to satisfy this requirement, provided the necessary wind

2071 mitigation, flood resistance, and water intrusion requirements

2072 are presented. The board may also determine whether a building,

2073 residential, general, or roofing contractor applicant has

2074 experience and technical competence in wind mitigation and water

2075 intrusion.

Page 83 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2076 Section 71. Subsection (5) of section 489.511, Florida
2077 Statutes, is amended to read:

2078 489.511 Certification; application; examinations;

2079| endorsement.—

2080 (5) The board shall certify as qualified for certification
2081 by endorsement any individual applying for certification who:
2082 (a) Meets the requirements for certification as set forth
2083 in this section; has passed a national, regional, state, or

2084| United States territorial licensing examination that is

2085| substantially equivalent to the examination required by this
2086| part; and has satisfied the requirements set forth in s.

2087| 489.521; e=x

2088 (b) Holds a valid license to practice electrical or alarm
2089 system contracting issued by another state or territory of the
2090 United States, if the criteria for issuance of such license was
2091 substantially equivalent to the certification criteria that

2092| existed in this state at the time the certificate was issued; or

2093 (c) Has held a valid license to practice electrical or

2094 alarm system contracting issued by another state or territory

2095 for at least 10 years before the date of application and is

2096| applying for the same or similar license in this state, subject

2097 to ss. 489.510 and 489.521(3) (a), and subparagraph (1) (b)1. Such

2098 application must be submitted to the board while the applicant

2099| holds a valid license in another state or territory or within 2

2100 years after the expiration of such license. An electrical

Page 84 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2101 contractor or alarm system contractor who is licensed in another

2102 state who seeks qualification for license by endorsement under

2103 this paragraph must complete a class on the Florida Building

2104 Code approved by the board, not to exceed 2 hours.

2105 Section 72. Subsection (3) and paragraph (b) of subsection
2106 (4) of section 489.517, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
2107 489.517 Renewal of certificate or registration; continuing
2108| education.—

2109 (3) (a) Each certificateholder or registrant licensed as a

2110 specialty contractor or an alarm system contractor shall provide

2111| proof, in a form established by rule of the board, that the

2112 certificateholder or registrant has completed at least 7 14

2113| classroom hours of at least 50 minutes each of continuing

2114 education courses during each biennium since the issuance or
2115 renewal of the certificate or registration. The board shall by
2116 rule establish criteria for the approval of continuing education
2117 courses and providers and may by rule establish criteria for
2118 accepting alternative nonclassroom continuing education on an
2119| hour-for-hour basis.

2120 (b) Each certificateholder or registrant licensed as an

2121 electrical contractor shall provide proof, in a form established

2122 by rule of the board, that the certificateholder or registrant

2123| has completed at least 11 classroom hours of at least 50 minutes

2124| each of continuing education courses during each biennium since

2125 the issuance or renewal of the certificate or registration. The

Page 85 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2126| board shall by rule establish criteria for the approval of

2127 continuing education courses and providers and may by rule

2128 establish criteria for accepting alternative nonclassroom

2129 continuing education on an hour-for-hour basis.

2130 (4)

2131 (b)1. For licensed specialty contractors or alarm system

2132| contractors, of the 7 #4 classroom hours of continuing education

2133| required, at least 1 hour F—hewrs must be on technical subjects,

2134 1 hour on workers' compensation, 1 hour on workplace safety, 1

2135| hour on business practices, and fer—alarmsystem—econtractors—and
2136| edeetricatecontracters engaged i atarm System cortractings 2

2137| hours on false alarm prevention.

2138 2. For licensed electrical contractors, of the minimum 11

2139 classroom hours of continuing education required, at least 7

2140 hours must be on technical subjects, 1 hour on workers'

2141 compensation, 1 hour on workplace safety, and 1 hour on business

2142| practices. Electrical contractors engaged in alarm system

2143| contracting must also complete 2 hours on false alarm

2144| prevention.

2145 Section 73. Paragraph (b) of subsection (1) of section
2146 489.518, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

2147 489.518 Alarm system agents.—

2148 (1) A licensed electrical or alarm system contractor may
2149| not employ a person to perform the duties of a burglar alarm

2150 system agent unless the person:

Page 86 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

2151
2152
2153
2154
2155
2156
2157
2158
2159
2160
2161
2162
2163
2164
2165
2166
2167
2168
2169
2170
2171
2172
2173
2174
2175

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

(b) Has successfully completed a minimum of 14 hours of

training within 90 days after employment, to include basic alarm

system electronics in addition to related training including
CCTV and access control training, with at least 2 hours of
training in the prevention of false alarms. Such training shall
be from a board-approved provider, and the employee or applicant
for employment shall provide proof of successful completion to
the licensed employer. The board shall by rule establish
criteria for the approval of training courses and providers and
may by rule establish criteria for accepting alternative
nonclassroom education on an hour-for-hour basis. The board
shall approve providers that conduct training in other than the
English language. The board shall establish a fee for the
approval of training providers or courses, not to exceed $60.
Qualified employers may conduct training classes for their
employees, with board approval.

Section 74. Section 492.104, Florida Statutes, is amended,
to read:

492.104 Rulemaking authority.—The Board of Professional
Geologists has authority to adopt rules pursuant to ss.
120.536(1) and 120.54 to implement this chapter. Every licensee
shall be governed and controlled by this chapter and the rules
adopted by the board. The board is authorized to set, by rule,

fees for application, examination, eertifiecate of auvtheorizationy

late renewal, initial licensure, and license renewal. These fees

Page 87 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2




F L ORTIDA

2176
2177
2178
2179
2180
2181
2182
2183
2184
2185
2186
2187
2188
2189
2190
2191
2192
2193
2194
2195
2196
2197
2198
2199
2200

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

may sheoutd not exceed the cost of implementing the application,

examination, initial licensure, and license renewal or other
administrative process and shall be established as follows:

(1) The application fee shall not exceed $150 and shall be
nonrefundable.

(2) The examination fee shall not exceed $250, and the fee
may be apportioned to each part of a multipart examination. The
examination fee shall be refundable in whole or part if the
applicant is found to be ineligible to take any portion of the
licensure examination.

(3) The initial license fee shall not exceed $100.

(4) The biennial renewal fee shall not exceed $150.

(5 Th + for o~ At L0 A ST T SNPANE NS SN I BN NP ST i B NN
\\J/ [ N i R ) [ S [ S N (& |7 WPI Eiy U S S S WY & B UP) Wy g O CITO T T 2T CITTUIT [SSJ5 N & iy =y o T
o A 2N S 1 £ oy o] £ +1 PP S R = PP P N B N
Ay AN AL WA W § EE A A (@R uaw T [ S [ S N T O T T T WO g T | WP Eiy U S S S WY & RGP Wy [SSJ5 i N & Ry e =y o
o S2AEN
< A\ AL W w 5 EE A A
(5)46)> The fee for reactivation of an inactive license may
shat+ not exceed $50.
(6)++H- The fee for a provisional license may shat+ not
exceed $400.
(7)48> The fee for application, examination, and licensure

for a license by endorsement is shaltd—Pe as provided in this
section for licenses in general.

Section 75. Subsection (1) of section 492.108, Florida

Statutes, 1is amended to read:

492.108 Licensure by endorsement; requirements; fees.—

Page 88 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2

vV E S




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2201 (1) The department shall issue a license by endorsement to
2202 any applicant who, upon applying to the department and remitting
2203 an application fee, has been certified by the board that he or
2204 she:

2205 (a) Has met the qualifications for licensure in s.

2206 492.105(1) (b)-(e) and:=

2207 1l.4b)> Is the holder of an active license in good standing
2208 in a state, trust, territory, or possession of the United

2209 States.

2210 2.4e) Was licensed through written examination in at least
2211 one state, trust, territory, or possession of the United States,
2212 the examination requirements of which have been approved by the
2213| board as substantially equivalent to or more stringent than

2214 those of this state, and has received a score on such

2215 examination which is equal to or greater than the score required
2216| by this state for licensure by examination.

2217 3.4eh Has taken and successfully passed the laws and rules
2218| portion of the examination required for licensure as a

2219| professional geologist in this state.

2220 (b) Has held a valid license to practice geology in

2221 another state, trust, territory, or possession of the United

2222 States for at least 10 years before the date of application and

2223| has successfully completed a state, regional, national, or other

2224 examination that is equivalent to or more stringent than the

2225 examination required by the department. If such applicant has

Page 89 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2226| met the requirements for a license by endorsement except

2227 successful completion of an examination that is equivalent to or

2228| more stringent than the examination required by the board, such

2229 applicant may take the examination required by the board. Such

2230 application must be submitted to the board while the applicant

2231 holds a valid license in another state or territory or within 2

2232 years after the expiration of such license.

2233 Section 76. Section 492.111, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
2234 to read:
2235 492.111 Practice of professional geology by a firm,

2236| corporation, or partnership+—eertificateof authorizatien.—The

2237| practice of, or offer to practice, professional geology by

2238| individual professional geologists licensed under the provisions
2239 of this chapter through a firm, corporation, or partnership

2240 offering geological services to the public through individually
2241 licensed professional geologists as agents, employees, officers,
2242 or partners thereof is permitted subject to the provisions of
2243| this chapter, 1if preovided—that:

2244 (1) At all times that it offers geological services to the

2245| public, the firm, corporation, or partnership is qualified by

2246| has—eon—fite—with the department—+the name—andliecensenumber—o
2247 one or more individuals who hold a current, active license as a
2248| professional geologist in the state and are serving as a

2249| geologist of record for the firm, corporation, or partnership. A

2250 geologist of record may be any principal officer or employee of

Page 90 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

o T ¢ o~ HO) o
O [OJ] (@) D -H )] D a “
- a D ™M B -H Ky - @]
< + o h T u Mk NI S
O | © b o < [o9) D D Q B ¢ — ~
i o M n P 9 <o A -H P B [0} D O a
0 T O © -H O P q U O BN oy b -H > o O
-~ O — ) ¢ P> @ TR SR, o0 -
H Y Y o - L < A D D @ D D N - 0 P
O O O > D n -H = D H o -d on D D D Q ©
[ O S NO) o, -H WP P D [99) b 0 “
(0] [y o 0 [09) o n T U ® D in} 0] (@)
O o ~ g n & O O Y ® O -H W D P! o o> O
>  @© ~ e A D o O ® ® ) D H D -H T 0] © “
o) O 4 O O & O g ©O o HOoDy O D g < O
— o <o A (@) J'S] N 0] () [0} B D H [99) il K3 3 O
Q wm P a D o g ~ [OFE Y » D D — D (O
& o O 0 < ¢ 0 A Q O} O} H 49 4 o U -~
o 0 0] o 0] 4 L E& P - ® D D T A g
O > ~ “ D G > O 9] H I~ P NN O] H G “~
4 A o P £ © £ BH o (TR ~ £ H n @ oS 2 -
o © “ o ¥ © in] D ® @ K] D B D @] 4
s 0 Q () a o ¢ - h D D >
~ 0] “ O P D H - H D -m W on @ 0 o <
Q > o <c | o @ O o 4 P H — D “ @] O
o A 2 O O O ® D ™ ® &4 -fH O 4 3
+ ) ~ a B i B O, D D @ ] D ) ® o, O n
~ O o < O — a O on 9] ® -H [{ I © 0]
© © i) P H ® QO [0) H B [l D N 9] o O W
0, © - o & = o D N W D £ - @]
[ = (] 09] IS bR D —H [op) Ky oo —
>~ P 0 0] ~ in] ~ O 4 D D D © O 0]
a q + o - i1y © © @ #H P D ~ & - O )]
@ 0] 0] n P S H o, g D @ D [l D ¥ - q =3
IS a “ 0] P -H D UWH Ky & B ® o O
Y S o -A . o # - D -H ol [( I () b\ o A 0]
O ) ) O > O 4 ® H B @ @ -H — n c
O —~ T QO 4 o O H c P -t UH H o n P
~ a O 0] O < D N D D ~ @ D D 0) 0]
q @ - 0] 4 O O ] > O, -f n KT D ® oo o Y “
O o 0 0] 0] in] . H fH D U D D @] O
- n P P a “ < > -H [0} D D [OR D YH B B — o
FEREG) n o A 4 i o O @ oD D n ® ® © 0,
© —~ - © 0] 4y 4 - a a B B -H )] a o]
“ O o q 0] O in] 0] © I~ B O] HO) on - 4y - 0] 0]
O ¢ O O wn T O T & & ¢ — jon 4 D H o g >
Q, —~ - © 9] o - O K] H ® ® q - + O
~ O O n c n P -H o UH D @ D B D — “
O S 0 T 0 % 9 o w O H ] D @4 — QO
O = o 0 (o - (@] O & H D © < O Q,
“H A ~ o 3 D D . [ ® D )] 0] ©
~ ~ o < o, O — o, 0 @ B H D ~ ¢ ~ O - 0]
@) O, ®© “ n -4 - — | - = ® D -H © 4 O “
- q o 4 <o O o C H )] H ) n @ -H -~ @]
g <o O O w o < C n o D P - -Hoo@ il
4 ®n A T o O nl g P 4~ Y P N D -H W —~| O T
-— “ 0 ) ] O O 4 q - ey -H -H b s D N © 0]
4 (0] 0 0 S 0 T - o T ) Ky P o 4P (0] |y “
a 0] q () L P “ in] Ka D -H D @ O ®©
e P 0] o, @© -d (@] © 9] D n ¢ ) — D & Q,
O ~ O @] — o - > [T 5| iy )] D [0} 0] 0]
3 © ~ 0 -H ~ O Y 0] 0] © on B -H D D B G “
0 o, O - O “ @] 1S 4 T ® H ® UH [O) S N )] + 0,
— N MO N O ™~ 0 O O +d N MO < N W >~ 0 O O +d N M oW
0N 1o 0 W0 0w W w0 w!mw W YW W v w v wuw wu ow o r~ M~~~ ~ >~
N N NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN N
N N NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN N

Page 91 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2276| partnership, for delivery to any person for public record with
2277 the state, shall be dated and bear the signature and seal of the
2278| professional geologist or professional geologists who prepared
2279 or approved them.

2280 (3)f4)> Except as provided in s. 558.0035, the fact that a
2281 licensed professional geologist practices through a corporation
2282 or partnership does not relieve the registrant from personal
2283| liability for negligence, misconduct, or wrongful acts committed
2284| Dby her or him. The partnership and all partners are Jjointly and
2285 severally liable for the negligence, misconduct, or wrongful
2286 acts committed by their agents, employees, or partners while
2287 acting in a professional capacity. Any officer, agent, or

2288| employee of a corporation is personally liable and accountable
2289 only for negligent acts, wrongful acts, or misconduct committed
2290| by her or him or committed by any person under her or his direct
2291 supervision and control, while rendering professional services
2292 on behalf of the corporation. The personal liability of a

2293 shareholder of a corporation, in her or his capacity as

2294 shareholder, may be no greater than that of a shareholder-

2295 employee of a corporation incorporated under chapter 607. The
2296| corporation is liable up to the full value of its property for
2297 any negligent acts, wrongful acts, or misconduct committed by
2298 any of its officers, agents, or employees while they are engaged
2299| on behalf of the corporation in the rendering of professional

2300 services.

Page 92 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

on O C )
@ nh 0] 0] O 0]
® Hoo N o -
D D . © in] a O WY
4 L @ o O [0) < O A
¢ ¢ 4H IR Ee n o = | o
O O D HoT ~ o -A © . 0] ©
> FE G . D h uH ® O g n o ]
@4 o D @ D I ¢« © < 0 2 -4 O
-H K #H P D n (£ a P - )] n
H ® be ® [o9) >N H O o - 0] >~ -
- O, @ D 0] ke @ D YH ~ (@] 0 (@] ~ o “ —
9] O - -f D ® b ™M a ~ 4 9] @] o
O P . #H Y O, ~ — ) O )] (0] — “ 0]
HO) O -H - # @ [ I o9 9 v ) o O O
O @ HWp o P D @ . a 3 [0} -3 0] @]
OTEEEN R || ¢ " @« 4 - D N Q T 0 2 o 0 Y| O
-H Eiy K5 D D -H H » - O O 0] © n o <
Ko ) 0] b ® n < - a 0 i) — 0] -
n 4 n © -H  h  $H -H — - g n T g —~ O
fH Rty O — [OXIERO) D D be a — (@] S e BT |
P -f fH P @ @ [ON D O (O o, -H © @] n c
o k3 D, D -H H - H Hoo-H e —H P O - 3 @)
a1y K3 i1y D & D o, P | S o - - n Q T ©
K 0] O [/ pITY] kY )] O . n T H 0 a o
® — HO] £ - (] D D ] 9] 0] - a O O WY © Q|
o, -f 0] K ® H fH on 0 o 3 O O — 4 (@)
4 D -H D D D a (9] O 3] @) 0 0
H 4 o ~ P L 4 -—H»m 0} 2 = B O
D L K £ P O o -+ P o T ~ o 0 n A
& [( ~ D O o0 wn L o To) o -4 <G
~ P ¢ + D A L O 4 A © — T © O 0
¢ ¢ D 09] D & @ ud [{V AN @) o P — o - (@) “
D [¢p] 4y -H L3 D -rH — ~ O — O © 0 . [99] Q, — 0]
- K D & 4 P D .o 4 4 -4 < = ™~ o o g
Rty @ 1y D b ® ® - - [« ) Q © O P ~ N 0 O (OS]
® D D b ® » O ®© g 0 (0] < O g o N
q - ¢ 09] H D @ [99) - 0] >0 oo O P - ] (o]
D Rty D RiY) HO) D P ~ ~ ~ a — — 0,
[ON ® (OR 0] fH K] Y b O @ i) — © 0] O [9)] ©
H N B ® D D -H D ® 0] O o o (] o g -— 4 Q c “
D -H 4y £ P L& on P o4 0 o Q P i) O g O oO
() H N T 4 uH [09) Q — IS O @) @ A
D 4 >™N@ $H ~ 3 T O P A (0] Q o = 0 <
~ A& D ¢ b W T b o »n 0 H4 4 w0 g 0 0] n o
i H W ® [OFEEELY @ H» - O O @ )] i i) 0] 0] q
4 B O [00] T O E . n 9 0 n 9 Y O
-H ® & 4y B Y D [4p] . o - 0] H > . @] + o -H
(1] () -Ho b —H & & >~ E A T O Q o a4 [T
4 @ ~H - D ™~ [ o r~ o O ®©
) D 4P o b & B T ¢ o O S G c .
o D 4 D 4H 1] o n o g o . [« n -4 T @)
EH ] o < -t - H H O 4 4 BH T A -d Y O — S [ONEENON
4P D P4 ® D ¢ A — (OS] = (ORI — O ] o
¢ - T & P o, ~ . [T T P - S & O
~ O ¥ N b wm P v O n N ~ -+ 0O T 4 O = N ©O O O
p -H ® -t & - D 4« P O O o < o~ - o O O T o O
<+ 4 () v 4b 4 b b - »nn P < —~ O Y -A 19p] c < g0 -H ~
-H - D ¢ O 4+ D @ m A oA A [0} O — 0
WP S R o S T B O P O «© “ ) =
H D, 0, 4 B Uy © 0 Y = [« n - o
Q [ON B D B @ YH YH i - [0) o - @] o ~ -d
) ® (V)] o -H D D n O O O W + “ o Y
— N MO N O~ 0 O O A N MO < N W >~ 0 O O +d N M oW
o O o 0o o o o o o A = A A A4 =4 4 =4 4 =4 N N N N N
M M MmO MmO M MmO MO O MO O MO O O O O O O O O O O OO 0 O
N N NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN NN N

Page 93 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2326 certificates—-of auvthorization topractiece professional geology
2327 in the state shall be prepared annually by the department. A
2328 copy of this roster must be made available to shall—be

2329| ebtainabteby each licensed professional geologist and each

2330 firm, corporation, or partnership qualified by a professional

2331| geologist heldinga—ecertifiecateofautheorization, and copies
2332 thereof shall be placed on file with the department.

2333 Section 79. Section 509.102, Florida Statutes, 1s created
2334 to read:

2335 509.102 Mobile food dispensing vehicles.—

2336 (1) As used in this section, the term "mobile food

2337| dispensing vehicle" means any vehicle-mounted public food

2338 service establishment which is self-propelled or otherwise

2339| movable from place to place and includes self-contained

2340 utilities, including, but not limited to, gas, water,

2341 electricity, and liquid waste disposal.

2342 (2) A municipality, county, or other local government

2343 entity may not:

2344 (a) Require a separate license, registration, or permit

2345| beyond those established by the division under s. 509.241 as a

2346 condition for the mobile food dispensing vehicle's operation

2347| within the jurisdiction.

2348 (b) Require a separate license, registration, or permit

2349| fee beyond those established by the division under s. 509.251 as

2350 a condition for the mobile food dispensing vehicle's operation

Page 94 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2351| within the jurisdiction.

2352 (c) Prohibit mobile food dispensing vehicles from

2353 operating within the jurisdiction.

2354 (3) This section may not be construed to affect a

2355| municipality, county, or other local governmental entity's

2356 authority to regulate the operation of mobile food dispensing

2357 vehicles other than the regulations described in subsection (2).

2358 (4) This section does not apply to any port authority,

2359| aviation authority, airport, or seaport.

2360 Section 80. Paragraph (i) of subsection (2) of section
2361 548.003, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

2362 548.003 Florida State Boxing Commission.—

2363 (2) The Florida State Boxing Commission, as created by
2364 subsection (1), shall administer the provisions of this chapter.
2365 The commission has authority to adopt rules pursuant to ss.

2366 120.536(1) and 120.54 to implement the provisions of this

2367 chapter and to implement each of the duties and responsibilities

2368 conferred upon the commission, including, but not limited to:

2369 H—Pesigrationandduties—of o krockdown timekeeper-

2370 Section 81. Subsection (1) of section 548.017, Florida
2371 Statutes, is amended to read:

2372 548.017 Participants, managers, and other persons required
2373| to have licenses.—

2374 (1) A participant, manager, trainer, second, +timekeepers;
2375 referee, judge, ammreunree¥r; physician, matchmaker, or promoter

Page 95 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2376 must be licensed before directly or indirectly acting in such
2377 capacity in connection with any match involving a participant. A
2378| physician approved by the commission must be licensed pursuant
2379 to chapter 458 or chapter 459, must maintain an unencumbered
2380 license in good standing, and must demonstrate satisfactory
2381| medical training or experience in boxing, or a combination of
2382| both, to the executive director before working as the ringside
2383| physician.

2384 Section 82. Paragraph (d) of subsection (1) of section
2385 553.5141, Florida Statutes, 1s amended to read:

2386 553.5141 Certifications of conformity and remediation

2387 plans.—

2388 (1) For purposes of this section:

2389 (d) "Qualified expert" means:

2390 1. An engineer licensed pursuant to chapter 471.

2391 2. A certified general contractor licensed pursuant to

2392 chapter 489.

2393 3. A certified building contractor licensed pursuant to
2394 chapter 489.

2395 4. A building code administrator licensed pursuant to

2396 chapter 468.

2397 5. A building inspector licensed pursuant to chapter 468.
2398 6. A plans examiner licensed pursuant to chapter 468.
2399 7. An interior designer registered dieensed pursuant to

2400 chapter 481.

Page 96 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
2401 8. An architect licensed pursuant to chapter 481.
2402 9. A landscape architect licensed pursuant to chapter 481.
2403 10. Any person who has prepared a remediation plan related

2404 to a claim under Title III of the Americans with Disabilities
2405 Act, 42 U.S.C. s. 12182, that has been accepted by a federal
2406 court in a settlement agreement or court proceeding, or who has
2407| been qualified as an expert in Title III of the Americans with
2408 Disabilities Act, 42 U.S.C. s. 12182, by a federal court.

2409 Section 83. Effective January 1, 2021, subsection (1) of
2410 section 553.74, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

2411 553.74 Florida Building Commission.—

2412 (1) The Florida Building Commission is created and located
2413| within the Department of Business and Professional Regulation
2414 for administrative purposes. Members are appointed by the

2415| Governor subject to confirmation by the Senate. The commission
2416 is composed of 19 24 members, consisting of the following

2417 members:

2418 (a) One architect licensed under chapter 481 with at least

2419| 5 years of experience in the design and construction of

2420| buildings designated for Group E or Group I occupancies by the

2421 Florida Building Code ¥registered—topracticein—this stateand

2422 aetively—engaged—in—theprofession. The American Institute of
2423 Architects, Florida Section, is encouraged to recommend a list
2424 of candidates for consideration.

2425 (b) One structural engineer registered to practice in this

Page 97 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA

2426
2427
2428
2429
2430
2431
2432
2433
2434
2435
2436
2437
2438
2439
2440
2441
2442
2443
2444
2445
2446
2447
2448
2449
2450

H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI

CS/HB 1193, 2020

Engrossed 2

state and actively engaged in the profession. The Florida
Engineering Society is encouraged to recommend a list of
candidates for consideration.

(c) One air-conditioning contractor, e¥ mechanical

contractor, or mechanical engineer certified to do business in

this state and actively engaged in the profession. The Florida

Air Conditioning Contractors Association, the Florida
Refrigeration and Air Conditioning Contractors Association, awrd
the Mechanical Contractors Association of Florida, and the

Florida Engineering Society are encouraged to recommend a list

of candidates for consideration.

(d) One electrical contractor or electrical engineer

certified to do business in this state and actively engaged in
the profession. The Florida Association of Electrical
Contractors, and the National Electrical Contractors

Association,

Florida Chapter, and the Florida Engineering

Society are encouraged to recommend a list of candidates for

consideration.

[ \ A maoambaoar £ £ o o o ot 0 n meora Yy

\\_,, T T T T 1T [N S . S t/J_UL_,\_, C 11T \_,J.J.v_LJ.J.\_,\_,J__LJ.J.v A
+ oah il oS A2y a9 o S~ 0 vz~ neoeraoaaal 1N + ~r~AfaAaoon n T
L_,\_,\_/J.LJ.J.U_LU&_Y AR T34 ju =y L/L\_/L_,_I_V\_,_L_Y \_,J.J.vuv\_,u i S T t/J_UJ_\_,;_);_)_LUJ.J. [ B N B
] ra A O S+ r £ + 1 (@) o + <z £ T IDEVAN ~+ 1 n e r o Al
[ I S U S S & bllutJl_C.L A\ T LJ\J\./_LCL__Y A\ i SR S i ) LT T O C T T CITOUIT J-All\j.LllCCJ_O T
+ i ra A o Marah 1 o A ITrnorna~t r o A\ Walal P i ] n ~
T [ R S U S S & i SR S i ) T T OSITT IO (@B aw § J_lthJC\.zL_U.LQ ITOo oo TITTOaOCITUIT [ R Sy
ne ot + raoasA~Amman Al o 13 o+ £ A Aa AN+ a v AN~ AN o n
Cll\/UL/l.L().\jC\J. | T O O OO T IO (& L 10 O A\ COTITOT OO T TO [ S N CUOTThO T OCTC 1O C IOl

@

+£> One certified general contractor or one certified

building contractor certified to do business in this state and

Page 98 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2

vV E S




F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

2451
2452
2453
2454
2455
2456
2457
2458
2459
2460
2461
2462
2463
2464
2465
2466
2467
2468
2469
2470
2471
2472
2473
2474
2475

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

actively engaged in the profession. The Associated Builders and
Contractors of Florida, the Florida Associated General

Contractors Council, the Florida Home Builders Association, and

the Union Contractors Association are encouraged to recommend a
list of candidates for consideration.

(f)4e> One plumbing contractor licensed to do business in
this state and actively engaged in the profession. The Florida
Association of Plumbing, Heating, and Cooling Contractors is
encouraged to recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

(g)+> One roofing or sheet metal contractor certified to
do business in this state and actively engaged in the
profession. The Florida Roofing, Sheet Metal, and Air
Conditioning Contractors Association and the Sheet Metal and Air
Conditioning Contractors' National Association are encouraged to
recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

(h)4+> One certified residential contractor licensed to do
business in this state and actively engaged in the profession.
The Florida Home Builders Association is encouraged to recommend
a list of candidates for consideration.

(i)43> Three members who are municipal, county, or
district codes enforcement officials, one of whom is also a fire
official. The Building Officials Association of Florida and the
Florida Fire Marshals and Inspectors Association are encouraged
to recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

{

\ On mamb n+ +h I
7 T =

] r Tz rAar o o o
1< T TITCTINO T WITO T TP [CAT ¥ Reye) T

Page 99 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2




vV E S

R EPRESENTATI

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2020

Engrossed 2

CS/HB 1193,

. q
— @) =
P D S > @) . gl o 0
-H 4 20 0 Y (= D & 4 (V] (o
o) © A @ D> $ 0 - -
S O} N G n 0 - el P 4 O
YH ) “H A S ~ -3 0] 0] HOJ 9] ® @ ] c
W o g« o T > O P D @ (OO} D IR
D ® © 0] N oA a © H D - G & O
Ke a o P o -~ H -4 T D UH ¢ g1y & © 0]
N1y B O “ © ol O n  -H H D -H D 4 )
o D -+ O P <G n ®© B T © ¢ ¢ T O S5 ©
O ) i) n P W o O a -H [ON P o D a )
£ & @ O (@) c n - © ol & © " o 0
O Q0 N O »n g -~ @) D D g
O o - ~ A in] im] O O oG ® [o9] D n
U 0N ¢ o o0 <o Al O — T O W 4 D 4D n -
D -H D © PP = < -~ a 1S (@] H UH o - L g
4y -H o 3 © 3 D @ D # T o P
@ ® ) “ © a i} > Q P P D -H -H D 3
¢ v ® o <o A a in] 0] O )] @ b m o] a
-H H O ©| -H T L © - -H P he ® o A
o9} fH ¢ T 0w Al - 0] c H - [o)) D -Ho Y & “
Q D 0] > o9 Al A ~ i 3 @ o)) ) D B [OFEN )]
T - -H n - o Q9 Q S5 0o g [ D ¢ ® D 0
D ER o9} G i) = © P © [o)) Rty D [0} o O
() ¢ Q © 9 O ©n o ®wn = o H ¢ ¢ B @ o o
4 D | a © o| -A ° -A a ® D . D o)l D o - A
bl D ) © o <o A o C © QO ¢ @ n ® ¢ O )]
b TS 4 0O O i IR B o T = -Ho N D D D D b —H 3
¢ & ¢ o+ P Q| < - -H g i H ¢ oA d H 4 Q
5 0 ¢ 4 © <o ) g o 4 O P 0 I ON (VI R
D -+ U O a + o| -H s A (@] O { b ® D ® T Q @]
(O J)) — -~ P = — QO D - H S T @ T
T © &= @© = O 0 M Y 4 D - D D QO
(VY 1| Y O )] < 0 D O] HO) ® 4 -d P g @]
) g1y © “ 9] 0] a P 0] 0] O ® -H D 4 - PP
[09] D ® (@) (ORI [ g o P H [o9) © oo [09)
-Hon P = WH| O oA H D P ¢ d B P & YW O
O -H O n P Al A (@] )] T @ D D D O 0]
D & O O A Pl oY 3 O] P O D b O O N
ow oy 1 I B | ~ QO 4 Q > O ® L@ 0 -H
®E 0O ¢ O L 4 O E O 94 © q D B B Y O Y
— v QO A Q O S Q O P 1S - iy D D D Q @]
H (o] e © & T ®0 3 @ ® YH 4 . YH e C
O -H U o A n 0 o Q S O (VIS D @ [(ONES)
KON b E Q A A < €& O T O 4 n Qo b n g 3
£ - © O B TR G & g b & ¢ -0 O ©
Q Yy 0 ©n Y Q -~ O V)] 4 D B 4 P 0O
£ 4w O o 4 <o O W o O & - B & D ®© B & w0
q -+ O T O O o0 0 ©n . o gO] v -4 v O -HA
0] —H -~ g n o - a D g -H D [OJN ]
[N O g 2 Powm o P o @ T F& H D O
d ¢ @ in] -~ P Q o A d jon €@ ( D O ¢ i
-H -~ 0 | S o o ¥ -H ® PHn @ =z
. HORE O] E 0] -~ -4 A © ) (TS N )
A~ — « — O n m . — — - r A~ D A~ ® —_ y
M o @ - n n O O T M T © O b O L T VI R I
+ 3 £ ~ < 49 Al 4 O =~ o 0O -+ T ¥+ -f b + O T O —| L
m & @] o | -dA| T -~ o O -H ) -H )]
D n o Q9 3 4G @ O w0 ()] P ® 4 3
0] ) “ = o] O O o 0 a ® n D [99] o]
L0000 O Y O o| & S g n O $H -H 4 H -H a
Er H o, O O ~ © = 0]} < O [ON — D M -
© ™~ 0O O O 4 N O < 1 W >~ 0O O O 4 N MO < 0 O I~ W O O
.~ >~ >~ [~ 0O 0 @ W W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O O O
SIS U A R RS RS S R U (S R U L LS B S R SR A I B I TS
N N N N N NN N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N N

Page 100 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2501 actively engaged in the industry. The Florida Building Material
2502 Association, the Florida Concrete and Products Association, and
2503 the Fenestration Manufacturers Association are encouraged to
2504 recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

2505 (m)«4¥)> One member who 1s a representative of the building
2506| owners and managers industry who is actively engaged in

2507 commercial building ownership or management. The Building Owners
2508 and Managers Association is encouraged to recommend a list of
2509| candidates for consideration.

2510 (n)+4s> One member who is a representative of the insurance

2511| industry. The Florida Insurance Council is encouraged to

2512 recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

2513 H—Ore—rember —who 3 s5—o represerntative of publiec

2514| edueatien~

2515 (o) One member who 1s a swimming pool contractor
2516| licensed to do business in this state and actively engaged in
2517 the profession. The Florida Swimming Pool Association and the
2518 United Pool and Spa Association are encouraged to recommend a
2519 list of candidates for consideration.

2520 (p)+F One member who is a representative of the Chief

2521 Resilience Officer under the Executive Office of the Governor.

2522 The Chief Resilience Officer is encouraged to recommend a list

2523| of candidates for consideration the—greenbuitdingindustry —and
2524 | wheo—is—a—third-party commission agent——a Floridaboar

2525| +heUnited—States GCreen BuildingCouncitl—or GCreen Builtding

Page 101 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



2526
2527
2528
2529
2530
2531
2532
2533
2534
2535
2536
2537
2538
2539
2540
2541
2542
2543
2544
2545
2546
2547

FLORIDA HOUS STE OF REPRESENTATIVES
CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020
Iritiative—a professional—whois acereditedunder—+the

5
Pesigan—ELEER-.

(g) 4w One member who 1s a representative of a natural gas
distribution system and who is actively engaged in the
distribution of natural gas in this state. The Florida Natural
Gas Association is encouraged to recommend a list of candidates
for consideration.

Eo—One—member—who—is—a representativeof +the Department
o Agriculiture—and Consumer—Services! Officeof Energy—The
Commissioner—of Agricultureis—encouraged—to—recommend—atist—of
cordidates—Ffeor consideration~

S Sre—wmember —wheshatl be +ae eaaiyr

Section 84. Subsection (7) of section 558.002, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

558.002 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:

(7) "Design professional" means a person, as defined in s.
1.01, licensed or registered in this state as an architect,
interior designer, landscape architect, engineer, surveyor, or
geologist.

Section 85. Subsection (5) is added to section 823.15,
Florida Statutes, to read:

2548
2549
2550

823.15

animal control agencies;

Dogs and cats released from animal shelters or

sterilization requirement.—

Page 102 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb1193-03-e2



F L ORTIDA H O U S E O F R EPRESENTATI V E S

CS/HB 1193, Engrossed 2 2020

2551 (5) (a) Employees, agents, or contractors of a public or

2552| private animal shelter, a humane organization, or an animal

2553 control agency operated by a humane organization or by a county,

2554| municipality, or other incorporated political subdivision may

2555 implant dogs and cats with a radio frequency identification

2556| microchip device as part of their work with such public or

2557 private animal shelter, humane organization, or animal control

2558 agency.
2559 (b) Notwithstanding s. 474.2165, employees, agents, or

2560 contractors of a public or private animal shelter, a humane

2561 organization, or an animal control agency operated by a humane

2562 organization or by a county, municipality, or other incorporated

2563| political subdivision may contact the owner of record listed on

2564 a radio frequency identification microchip device to verify pet

2565 ownership.
2566 Section 86. Except as otherwise expressly provided in this

2567 act, this act shall take effect July 1, 2020.

Page 103 of 103

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb1193-03-e2



