[EY

O W 0 < o OB w N

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

LEGISLATIVE ACTION
Senate . House
Comm: RCS
01/22/2020

The Committee on Innovation, Industry, and Technology

(Albritton) recommended the following:
Senate Amendment (with title amendment)

Delete lines 232 - 2196
and insert:

Section 3. Present subsection (4) of section 322.57,
Florida Statutes, is redesignated as subsection (5), and a new
subsection (4) is added to that section, to read

322.57 Tests of knowledge concerning specified vehicles;
endorsement; nonresidents; violations.—

(4) (a) As used in this subsection, the term “servicemember”

Page 1 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

means a member of any branch of the United States military or

military reserves, the United States Coast Guard or its

reserves, the Florida National Guard, or the Florida Air

National Guard.

(b) The department shall waive the requirement to pass the

Commercial Driver License Skills Tests for servicemembers and

veterans if:

1. The applicant has been honorably discharged from

military service within 1 year of the application, if the

applicant is a veteran;

2. The applicant is trained as an MOS 88M Army Motor

Transport Operator or similar military job specialty;

3. The applicant has received training to operate large

trucks in compliance with the Federal Motor Carrier Safety

Administration; and

4. The applicant has at least 2 years of experience in the

military driving vehicles that would require a commercial driver

license to operate.

(c) An applicant must complete every other requirement for

a commercial driver license within 1 year of receiving a waiver

under paragraph (b) or the waiver is invalid.

(d) The department shall adopt rules to administer this

subsection.

Section 4. Subsection (13) of section 326.004, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

326.004 Licensing.—

(13) Each broker must maintain a principal place of

business in this state and may establish branch offices in the

state. A seporateticensemustbe mointained for—ecach branch

Page 2 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

£Fi Ml Aagdotne o1 aeb ol T il g wnla o Fan e s mnn ]
NI S S i W wy [ N i ) ALV 1o ITUTT O IO 11T oo COX0 T IO IT Ly [ S U e ) U [ S ) IToCT (i o T TXK
S100 Fevr coemh naporm el A2 nn T8 s oo
Ed= AV A v [ S cTaACTIT oL TTATICTTT |\ S N i W wy LTI T TTTIOoOCT

Section 5. Subsection (3) of section 447.02, Florida
Statutes, 1s amended to read:

447.02 Definitions.—The following terms, when used in this
chapter, shall have the meanings ascribed to them in this

section:

A\ 14

wad—PrefessieonatRegudation—

Section 6. Section 447.04, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

Section 7. Section 447.041, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

Section 8. Section 447.045, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

Section 9. Section 447.06, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
Section 10. Subsections (6) and (8) of section 447.09,

Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
447.09 Right of franchise preserved; penalties.—It shall be

unlawful for any person:

(G m B S P U S R, IO, AP [P, S HPI [V [PV
\ 1 (& By e o T TS TITT OO u\jclll— W I CTToOOCT LluV_Lll\j U0 CTOIIITC T (@ yaw
P U pep P, I S PP [y S S SUNpAV: I IS O
tJ\JQQCQQ_Lll\j T A&, = sy w § ATTE [SATY Ve sy l—_Lll\j T T CT TTTIO T A\ = tJC.LJ.LI._LL_
(Q\ Mmoo P s P P U S VNP UV U, I JPSVPp N SO - A
\\J, 1 T ull_y [ S & R W ) ) o COCTTITCTTTC =TT IT utJtJ_L_L\./ul—_Lull [ S L

Section 11. Section 447.12, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

Section 12. Section 447.16, Florida Statutes, is repealed.
Section 13. Subsection (4) of section 447.305, Florida

Statutes, 1is amended to read:

447.305 Registration of employee organization.—

(4Y Ne+1 £ ~o 4+ 1 n £ +vevq ot a4 o neoa Srm Al e 7 ] o £

7 WO T rCacTrOt— OO TrsStcraot O oG Tt wa S OT
roerd ot o n ah o171 I Frrvrmna oA S Al S dm Az o sy
O TrstraocTr oot Ot rroarirroitCOac—TTCguTrarr  TTrcCTvaT s Oy cII

Page 3 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

[RIERAIY =720
Regutation~

Section 14. Subsection (14) is added to section 455.213,
Florida Statutes, to read:
455.213 General licensing provisions.—

(14) The department or a board must enter into a reciprocal

licensing agreement with other states if the practice act within

the purview of this chapter permits such agreement. If a

reciprocal licensing agreement exists or if the department or

board has determined another state’s licensing requirements or

examinations to be substantially equivalent or more stringent to

those under the practice act, the department or board must post

on its website which jurisdictions have such reciprocal

licensing agreements or substantially similar licenses.

Section 15. Paragraph (k) of subsection (1) of section
456.072, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

456.072 Grounds for discipline; penalties; enforcement.—

(1) The following acts shall constitute grounds for which
the disciplinary actions specified in subsection (2) may be
taken:

(k) Failing to perform any statutory or legal obligation
placed upon a licensee. For purposes of this section, failing to
repay a student loan issued or guaranteed by the state or the

Federal Government in accordance with the terms of the loan is

t EVSI SN i I AN o~ ~x PR
no Ot ——TaorT =TS cOo—COoOMP Ty —WI
1

shatt—Pbe considered a failure to perform a statutory or legal

bl t A N PNE IR RO T NI I RPN IR N B 2NENE S S NN S A amin~a A a7 7
O l a lon (@ yaw 8 CTIT T TT TTITOTT |\ B SN ) W [ S S i iy @ R oo T IOUIT T A\ A S AuAw § [ | & = upu = LA
7 I P 4

Page 4 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

4H bl D a
D HO)j O P 4 O
D D b s - Y
b o B & D D ¢ T D | L0
() O] [09) [02INO)] D - . O 0
D P ] D i} @ 4 - E o c o -
(O ie} 0 - e ¢ @ D W -1 O O O @ O
4w - 0} o b @ o O £ < © ¢ - - -
D @) ~ + D @ o p o - D YH (OB S e o | P
o, O n @] © )] [J RS D H O © P O a
0) - — - -rH D i) o D @ 4 0] a ) ()
P T £ g} UL ~ -fd - D e P ¢ O 0 -~ 4 ®© &
0 < ) b g H & I g [0) i)
[0) ) < e s+ ¢ F 4 D © f © AR ol
D Q (O} < = T &9 4 B ~ o} b H © ©
Rty in] ~ -— - D & O D ~ N ~ W 0] O Q|
— 3 o H P ¢ D o)l [o9) D & @ — > 0
o - + . o~ b B ¢ -# & & -H @ D ¢ o~ o~ 4 Q| ©
P ®© - © Nel ) o | LA (NI TR O N & 0 — 0 le)
B <o O i) L0 | £ N [4p] b - - —H —H 4P o a T QO
o n g wm <t 0] D #H ¢ - — D 4 UH &g ®© O o 0| S
() 3 q ® [ ) Ka] @ (] ® D ® D O o A O (@R S
T M © q O D D & My 99} (OB D -~ [ S - 2
) 0] T O - H @ 0] [OR n @ D By i) © i) (@] >
L R - IS ® D @ n Y D T I O O O O Q
-H 0O 0 Yy iR} - My 4 >N B D # 0 o L A 500
W o0 3 O @] in] PP D O 0 ¢ - D @ 0 (= © A
e 0} O D O D b 1 4 O QO T -
T —~ B M 9] © @ H D D D & Rty B . 3 (OB i
O o D — M D # @ #H™ [09] o ®n T «© -—
¢ O 0~ 4 Q -H P @ @ P $ & & T g 3 .
o 0 (@) #H P D & -f T ¢ D uH P H o0 O ()]
P 0 g 0] P W 4o ¢ P Q@ OB HoO + O E )
O ®© ™~ — S & D 4 O D ¢ D U4 ud W (VTN 0]
. & 4 O < © P -HE HORENO) @ W ~ O oA
HORERIS| i} . — e @] D Hoo & m D g Q 9] 0] O a
D B n WO jo] Won D -H D D & -7 ~ A Y al s
- n c @© G o P D D Lo -H 4 . - -
H DS N o o ¥ - @ D ¢ D 4 EH @& —H O nh ~ 3 > O
i) — 9 o~ b b b 4k D -H B Q n o @ L
ON > g 2 © U @ B D g Y b © O O gl ©
m] @] @] @] QO | D D 4P o - & D g (SRS “~ i)
o -~ A o L < . @GN YW pm © H o 3 n wn
D — P ] [OJ1Y) D - D N D W H @ P 0 n
- © O Q o g »n O -H D ¥ -m ¢ — D D ¢ Y ®© O O »m
4P S50 5 O A 4o - P @ D O T ow . P ®© P w0 (R
® . n n T © 0] D -+ 4P @ B D 4P D YH B AW a = g
(op) (R O N () N15) © P on i D [o9) 0] n P
-H — . - O 04 A D © > S8 N1 A LV} D H « ®© O 3
- @ O ~ £ O 4 o P D A Q ¢ T 4 B o© T - Q o o
HO) 0 — © O H ¢ O ¢ D - (OB o, — A 4 -~ 0
D - H a6 O P4 -H #H P D S % 0
T < o n < O D D O H & ¢ @ ¢ D & O W >~ q
[ON 0] O o -+ ™~ D, D D =i Y n D 4P 0] D O —~+ o S ]
- S -H - o o DD $H o ¢ - DEENOR B P A L ™M &) 494 O
on i} o P ~ . (@] ® @ ¢ ¢ ® -H 9] [OAI )] [ . o -H
N o U Tl O n W A +~ O © D o #$ B @ D O <0 o~ —~ O A
H S 0 o OO . n ¥ [T N 4“4 -H D P 0o n ©W ~ Q O
® PN H n P S Y 4 4P D ® ® O -H N O~ ~— Y4!m
— M 3 Q H B & ! O, W D -m — ™ Q, -H
D (@) Q iS] 0, HoD P D D — » .
e i Q, © 0 P o, — - T D D oo > O
()] o 0] in} 3 D & D S & H ¥ D W My Ne} [o R
N - Y 0 () o D ©® O B (VORI N OR P < o =
0 O O 4 N OO < N W >~ 0w O O 4 N M <L 0 W I~ W o O 4 N M < 00w
N ()} (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) — — — — — — — — — — N N (QV] N [Q\ [Q\ N
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

Page 5 of 73

580-02259B-20

:21 PM

26

1/17/2020 2



Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

127 or 1s exempt from licensure under this act. Each application for
128 |licensure must shadt+ include the names of the owner and the

129 |business, the business mailing address and location, and any

130 other information which the board may require. The owner of an
131 auction business shall report to the board within 30 days of any
132 change in this required information.

133 Section 19. Paragraph (f) of subsection (5) of section

134 468.003, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

135 468.603 Definitions.—As used in this part:

136 (5) “Categories of building code inspectors” include the
137 following:

138 (f) “Residential one—and—two—famity dwelling inspector”

139 |means a person who is qualified to inspect and determine that

140 one-family, two-family, or three-family residences not exceeding

141 two habitable stories above no more than one uninhabitable story

142 and accessory use structures in connection therewith emre—and—two

143 | famitydwellings—and—acecesseory—StEruetuyres are constructed in

144 accordance with the provisions of the governing building,

145 plumbing, mechanical, accessibility, and electrical codes.

146 Section 20. Section 468.613, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
147 to read:

148 468.613 Certification by endorsement.—The board shall

149 |examine other certification or training programs, as applicable,
150 upon submission to the board for its consideration of an

151 application for certification by endorsement. The board shall
152 waive its examination, qualification, education, or training
153 requirements, to the extent that such examination,

154 qualification, education, or training requirements of the

155 applicant are determined by the board to be comparable with

Page 6 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




156
157
158
159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173
174
175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
184

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

those established by the board. The board shall waive its

examination, qualification, education, or training requirements

if an applicant for certification by endorsement is at least 18

years of age; is of good moral character; has held a valid

building administrator, inspector, plans examiner, or the

equivalent, certification issued by another state or territory

of the United States for at least 10 years before the date of

application; and has successfully passed an applicable

examination administered by the International Code Council. Such

application must be made either when the license in another

state or territory is active or within 2 years after such

license was last active.

Section 21. Subsection (3) of section 468.8314, Florida

Statutes, 1is amended to read:

468.8314 Licensure.—

(3) The department shall certify as qualified for a license
by endorsement an applicant who is of good moral character as

determined in s. 468.8313, who maintains an insurance policy as

required by s. 468.8322, and who:+

(a) Holds a valid license to practice home inspection
services in another state or territory of the United States,
whose educational requirements are substantially equivalent to
those required by this part; and has passed a national,
regional, state, or territorial licensing examination that is
substantially equivalent to the examination required by this
part; or

(b) Has held a valid license to practice home inspection

services issued by another state or territory of the United

States for at least 10 years before the date of application.

Page 7 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

185 Such application must be made either when the license in another

186 state or territory is active or within 2 years after such

187 license was last active.

188 Section 22. Subsection (5) of section 471.015, Florida

189 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

190 471.015 Licensure.—

191 (5) (a) The board shall deem that an applicant who seeks

192 licensure by endorsement has passed an examination substantially
193 |equivalent to the fundamentals examination when such applicant

194 |has held a valid professional engineer’s license in another

195 state for 10 15 years and—has—had—20—years—of—continvous

196 |prefessienal—level engincering experience.

197 (b) The board shall deem that an applicant who seeks

198 licensure by endorsement has passed an examination substantially
199 |equivalent to the fundamentals examination and the principles
200 and practices examination when such applicant has held a wvalid

201 |professional engineer’s license in another state for 15 25 years

202 ard—has—had—30—years—ef econtinveousprofessionatl—TFeved

203 | enginceringexperienece.

204 Section 23. Subsection (7) of section 473.308, Florida

205 Statutes, is amended to read:

206 473.308 Licensure.—

207 (7) The board shall certify as qualified for a license by
208 endorsement an applicant who:

209 (a)d3= Is not licensed and has not been licensed in another

210 state or territory and who has met the requirements of this
211 section for education, work experience, and good moral character
212 and has passed a national, regional, state, or territorial

213 licensing examination that is substantially equivalent to the

Page 8 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




214
215
216
217
218
219
220
221
222
223
224
225
226
227
228
229
230
231
232
233
234
235
236
237
238
239
240
241
242

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

2020

COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

| REERRN =725

examination required by s. 473.306; or and

2 oo o~emenT At A caanh v g pmga gy A daa vk 03~y i~ e A
s 1TITOO uulllt/J.CL_CM o T u\JLlL_J.LlLAJ.Ll\j oA O T T T ITOUIT ASZANP L W B S ) uar ) T T
board PN I NS N S BN PRI SN IR N = 1ima+a £~ o~ RN AN N |
0TI A8 NSO LA.LJLJJ—VLJJ—-LLAL, I W I T TTT CTIT L TTIT T CTO [ S N T oTT LA.LJLJ_L_L\_/LAJ\J_L
2 N N A N ot £t 1 oo 472 219 e+ 4+ 1 Wk~ R T
_Y L@ R LJ i S B AW § 4O =] (= O CTT [ S =] e [ 7 LW AW g wy T T OO T o o TT
= raoao oo oo szl A+ +1h PN S NP RPNy izt 2~
A\ZA AW I Ear ) ua ) &y €% N s b\iu_l_vu_l_\.allk., [y CTIT pullk.,_l_llu_l_ll\.j AT O T ITTUIT
Yoyt v A At o LA o T ra1 AN Ao 4 A T 9~ o~ NntEarm+ 12 N~ a~A
J_C\.iLAL_LClllCLLL,LJ [ S L [ S U S Bp W § @ § |\ WPRN S U S S S WL W 5 tJLALJLL\./ AT T ToOTITCTOITC LTI CT TITIoCTX™K
T e oo Arrra ey +1 2 PN L T T 0ot 2 AW I BN PN B B S N LSNP NP I R W S ~ VNN e
=TT CITT1IO o C OO CT \ALA.LLLLKJ I _YCU.J_IJ LLLLLLLCMLKJLL.CL_Y tJ_LC\./C\ALll\j T O

r 11~ ISEERLS 12N roaaamandt .
A= [ S S W) WS i S U g Sy oy Ly Lo TTIITTITC

!

i
b)l.a= Holds a valid license to practice public accounting
issued by another state or territory of the United States, if
the criteria for issuance of such license were substantially
equivalent to the licensure criteria that existed in this state
at the time the license was issued;

2.b+ Holds a valid license to practice public accounting
issued by another state or territory of the United States but
the criteria for issuance of such license did not meet the
requirements of sub-subparagraph a.; has met the requirements of
this section for education, work experience, and good moral
character; and has passed a national, regional, state, or
territorial licensing examination that is substantially
equivalent to the examination required by s. 473.306; or

3.e+ Holds a valid license to practice public accounting
issued by another state or territory of the United States for at
least 10 years before the date of application; has passed a
national, regional, state, or territorial licensing examination
that is substantially equivalent to the examination required by
s. 473.306; and has met the requirements of this section for

good moral character+—ard
5y 1 i . . i . ]

Page 9 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




243
244
245
246
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261
262
263
264
265
266
267
268
269
270
271

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

Section 24. Subsection (6) of section 474.202, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

474 .202 Definitions.—As used in this chapter:

(6) “Limited-service veterinary medical practice” means
offering or providing veterinary services at any location that
has a primary purpose other than that of providing veterinary
medical service at a permanent or mobile establishment permitted
by the board; provides veterinary medical services for privately
owned animals that do not reside at that location; operates for
a limited time; and provides limited types of veterinary medical

services, including vaccinations or immunizations against

disease, preventative procedures for parasitic control, and

microchipping.

Section 25. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) of section
474,207, Florida Statutes, 1s amended to read:

474 .207 Licensure by examination.—

(2) The department shall license each applicant who the
board certifies has:

(b)1l. Graduated from a college of veterinary medicine
accredited by the American Veterinary Medical Association
Council on Education; or

2. Graduated from a college of veterinary medicine listed
in the American Veterinary Medical Association Roster of
Veterinary Colleges of the World and obtained a certificate from

the Education Commission for Foreign Veterinary Graduates or the

Page 10 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




272
273
274
275
276
277
278
279
280
281
282
283
284
285
286
287
288
289
290
291
292
293
294
295
296
297
298
299
300

Florida Senate - 2020
Bill No. SB 474

COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

| REERRN =725

Program for the Assessment of Veterinary Education Equivalence.

The department shall not issue a license to any applicant who is
under investigation in any state or territory of the United
States or in the District of Columbia for an act which would
constitute a violation of this chapter until the investigation
is complete and disciplinary proceedings have been terminated,
at which time the provisions of s. 474.214 shall apply.

of section 474.217, Florida

Section 26. Subsection (1)

Statutes, 1s amended to read:

474.217 Licensure by endorsement.—

(1) The department shall issue a license by endorsement to
any applicant who, upon applying to the department and remitting
a fee set by the board, demonstrates to the board that she or
he:

(a) Has demonstrated, in a manner designated by rule of the
board, knowledge of the laws and rules governing the practice of
veterinary medicine in this state; and
(b)1. EBEither Holds,

immediately preceding the application for licensure,

and has held for the 3 years

a valid,
active license to practice veterinary medicine in another state
of the United States,

the District of Columbia, or a territory

of the United States, provided that the applicant has

successfully completed a state, regional, national, or other

examination that is equivalent to or more stringent than the

examination required by the board reguirements for 1icensure—in

+1 RS E I BNy SN Al ot~ PO N I S NE A D SN o zal amt o+ -~
I _I_Qn_)u_l_l.l\j QL_L/LL_\_/, A\ i I ) L_J__L&/L_, A L_\_/J_J__LL_\JJ__Y €7 N -y \_/\1\,{_!_ [ € N S S N R Ry A
m v ot v oAt +1 + 1 v o m nt o £ + 1 o aoah v+ v OI‘
IO 1 QL,J__LJ.J.&\_,J.J.L, CIITTATT LS i By J_\_,\iu_l_J_\_,lll\_,J.J.L,\_) . CITT 15 J.LL/LLJL,\_,J_,

2. Meets the qualifications of s. 474.207(2) (b) and has

Page 11 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




301
302
303
304
305
306
307
308
309
310
311
312
313
314
315
316
317
318
319
320
321
322
323
324
325
326
327
328
329

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

successfully completed a state, regional, national, or other
examination which is equivalent to or more stringent than the
examination given by the department and has passed the board’s
clinical competency examination or another clinical competency
examination specified by rule of the board.

Section 27. Subsection (2) of section 476.114, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

476.114 Examination; prerequisites.—

(2) An applicant shall be eligible for licensure by
examination to practice barbering if the applicant:

(a) Is at least 16 years of age;

(b) Pays the required application fee; and

(c)l. Holds an active wvalid license to practice barbering
in another state, has held the license for at least 1 year, and
does not qualify for licensure by endorsement as provided for in
s. 476.144 (5); or

2. Has received a minimum of 900 45266 hours of training in
sanitation, safety, and laws and rules, as established by the

board, which shall include, but shall not be limited to, the

equivalent of completion of services directly related to the
practice of barbering at one of the following:
a. A school of barbering licensed pursuant to chapter 1005;
b. A barbering program within the public school system; or

c. A government-operated barbering program in this state.

The board shall establish by rule procedures whereby the school
or program may certify that a person is qualified to take the
required examination after the completion of a minimum of 600

1+-666 actual school hours. If the person passes the examination,

Page 12 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




330
331
332
333
334
335
336
337
338
339
340
341
342
343
344
345
346
347
348
349
350
351
352
353
354
355
356
357
358

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

she or he shall have satisfied this requirement; but if the
person fails the examination, she or he shall not be qualified
to take the examination again until the completion of the full
requirements provided by this section.

Section 28. Subsection (5) of section 476.144, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

476.144 Licensure.—

(5) The board shall certify as qualified for licensure by

endorsement as a barber in this state an applicant who holds a

current active license to practice barbering in another state.

The board shall adopt rules specifying procedures for the

licensure by endorsement of practitioners desiring to be
licensed in this state who hold a current active license in
another state—e¥r country and who have met qualifications
substantially similar to, equivalent to, or greater than the
qualifications required of applicants from this state.

Section 29. Subsection (9) of section 477.013, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

477.013 Definitions.—As used in this chapter:

(9) “Hair braiding” means the weaving or interweaving of

natural human hair or commercial hair, including the use of hair

extensions or wefts, for compensation without cutting, coloring,

permanent waving, relaxing, removing, or chemical treatment and
olaq +h 13 o £ s o P o r 17
[ i N I W i W W B Wy T o™ O TTO 11T A3 CTTToITUTTOo o A

Section 30. Section 477.0132, Florida Statutes, is

repealed.

Section 31. Subsections (7) through (10) are added to
section 477.0135, Florida Statutes, to read:

477.0135 Exemptions.—

Page 13 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




359
360
361
362
363
364
365
366
367
368
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376
377
378
379
380
381
382
383
384
385
386
387

Florida Senate - 2020 COMM
Bill No. SB 474
R =722
(7) A license or registration is not required

ITTEE AMENDMENT

for a person

whose occupation or practice is confined solely to

hair braiding

as defined in s.
(8)

477.013(9).

A license or registration is not required

for a person

whose occupation or practice is confined solely to

hair wrapping

477.013(10).

A license or registration is not required

as defined in s.
(9)

for a person

whose occupation or practice is confined solely to

body wrapping

as defined in s.
(10)

477.013(12) .

A license or registration is not require

d for a person

whose occupation or practice is confined solely to

applying

polish to fingernails and toenails.
(6) (7)

are amended to read:

Section 32. Subsections and of sectio

Florida Statutes,

477.019 Cosmetologists; qualifications; licen

supervised practice; license renewal; endorsement;

education.—

(6) The board shall certify as qualified for

n 477.019,

surey;

continuing

licensure by

endorsement as a cosmetologist in this state an applicant who

holds a current active license to practice cosmeto

another state and who has completed a 2-hour cours

logy in
e approved by

the board on human immunodeficiency virus and acqu

ired immune

deficiencyv svndrome. The board mar Aot recuire oFr £ £
y y . [ S i ) OTITO J.I.l(./L_Y o T [ S U R S S ) t/J_UUJ_ e
P B o I B =R N 1icana PO P I N o

\NPAW B U L WPy @5 B WS S W i i @ R TTITOTUI O i - - CTITCT T T CT CTTIO T WO T oo acT D =TT L O COOCTT I T

et raa 1 20N I o P, [ SN P D P |

J_C\il/l_l__l_co L7 A\YAAvA O IO 1T TTITOTUI O A\ - tJ_LC_L_L\/CLIOL/l_LC ANPAW B U I WPy 5 B b N i § (@ yaw
£ N a4 n g~ o n T2 o a1l o ot 1 n = o + ~ o~ ]
- r Wil T CTCCTTT = I TITOoO T ITOUTT TTT 1O O O o T T TITUIT AW AW A wyw) TToCT (/ltJtJ_L_Y

Page 14 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM

580-02259B-20




388
389
390
391
392
393
394
395
396
397
398
399
400
401
402
403
404
405
406
407
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

education requirements intended to ensure protection of the
public through updated training of licensees and registered
specialists, not to exceed 10 +6 hours biennially, as a
condition for renewal of a license or registration as a
specialist under this chapter. Continuing education courses
shall include, but not be limited to, the following subjects as
they relate to the practice of cosmetology: human
immunodeficiency virus and acquired immune deficiency syndrome;
Occupational Safety and Health Administration regulations;
workers’ compensation issues; state and federal laws and rules
as they pertain to cosmetologists, cosmetology, salons,
specialists, specialty salons, and booth renters; chemical
makeup as it pertains to hair, skin, and nails; and
environmental issues. Courses given at cosmetology conferences
may be counted toward the number of continuing education hours

required if approved by the board.

an 1z + hat+ Wy A2~y o oo oy hodsz sgrarnmymine 1 o
SOTCTYy O Tttt OTarOTritgy ottt wWriappTritgy, oL OO0ty WwWIaoppTitg L5
mirt Ffram + 1 oannt 7 1 ey Adrroaa+ o N A1t g AT At o £ +h1a

CxX o Tt OoM  cC— Comrcrriorr g COatCaoa ot o remcirc s Ot =S

+4e} The board may, by rule, require any licensee in
violation of a continuing education requirement to take a
refresher course or refresher course and examination in addition
to any other penalty. The number of hours for the refresher
course may not exceed 48 hours.

Section 33. Subsection (1) of section 477.0201, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

477.0201 Specialty registration; qualifications;

registration renewal; endorsement.—

Page 15 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




417
418
419
420
421
422
423
424
425
426
4277
428
429
430
431
432
433
434
435
436
437
438
439
440
441
442
443
444
445

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

(1) Any person is qualified for registration as a

specialist in any ere—eormore—-of—+the specialty practice
praectiees within the practice of cosmetology under this chapter
who:

(a) Is at least 16 years of age or has received a high
school diploma.

(b) Has received a certificate of completion for: im—=a

1. One hundred and eighty hours of training, as established

by the board, which shall focus primarily on sanitation and

safety, to practice specialties as defined in s. 477.013(6) (a)

and (b); sepeciatty oursvant—teo—s—4++013(6+

2. Two hundred and twenty hours of training, as established

by the board, which shall focus primarily on sanitation and

safety, to practice the specialty as defined in s.
477.013(06) (c); or

3. Four hundred hours of training or the number of hours of

training required to maintain minimum Pell Grant requirements,

as established by the board, which shall focus primarily on

sanitation and safety, to practice the specialties as defined in
s. 477.013(6) (a)-(c).

(c) The certificate of completion specified in paragraph

(b) must be from one of the following:

1. A school licensed pursuant to s. 477.023.

2. A school licensed pursuant to chapter 1005 or the
equivalent licensing authority of another state.

3. A specialty program within the public school system.

4. A specialty division within the Cosmetology Division of
the Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind, provided the

training programs comply with minimum curriculum requirements

Page 16 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




446
447
448
449
450
451
452
453
454
455
456
457
458
459
460
461
462
463
464
465
466
467
468
469
470
471
472
473
474

Florida Senate - 2020
Bill No. SB 474

COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

| REERRN =725

established by the board.
Section 34. of section
477.026, Florida Statutes,

477.026 Fees;

Paragraph (f) of subsection (1)
is amended to read:
disposition.—

(1) The board shall set fees according to the following

schedule:
(£ Tor haoatvr e Aavra o v tgv Ao A WA rgv NN o
\_L[ [ S N P Y N € R LJ_LL;LL\AC.LLJ, P Y N € R VV.LL;LtJtJC.LnJ, (@ W aw § LJ\J\A_Y VV.LLALtJtJC.LLJ,
£ o frav vnvq o o n oh 11 Nt ~ A &0
[ S L Sy ) [ S N .LCKJLLJL—.LDLL.L\JLL [SSJ5 W Iy & R S iy IO T APV oA WA AW § Ed N

Section 35. Subsection (4) of section 477.0263, Florida

Statutes, 1s amended, and subsection (5) is added to that

section, to read:

477.0263 Cosmetology services to be performed in licensed
salon; exceptions.—
(4) Pursuant to rules adopted by the board, any cosmetology
or specialty service may be performed in a location other than a

licensed salon when the service is performed in connection with

a special event and i1s performed by a person whe—is—employed—by

3
-

B
B

He

._

[0F

rsed——sateon—and who holds the proper license or specialty

)

=
(=8 =

B

I SN SUN PN
. CIITTTTC [ S

registration. Arn

@D
T

+

T

i

n
T

n
T A\

ar

q
ar

St heor +hon
(Smopmm Tcrr—C

(
|__I.
q
|__l
q
Q)

73 o
vV O

[0)]
s

=

n

T

G-

13

ng
(

B

o n
o T O+

ar
[OR

13~ o
[ = s mp A oy S A 7

T
.
1
H

5) Hair shampooing, hair cutting, hair arranging, nail

polish removal, nail filing, nail buffing, and nail cleansing

may be performed in a location other than a licensed salon when

the service is performed by a person who holds the proper

license.
Section 36. of section
477.0265, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

477.0265 Prohibited acts.—

Paragraph (f) of subsection (1)

Page 17 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




475
476
477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487
488
489
490
491
492
493
494
495
496
497
498
499
500
501
502
503

Florida S
Bill No.

(1)

(£)
wrapping,
to the pr

except those practices or activities defined in s.

Sect
477.029,
477.
(1)
(a)
specialis
duly lice
provided
Sect
to read:
481.
enacting

in this s

enate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

SB 474

| REERRN =725

It is unlawful for any person to:

Advertise or imply that skin care services er—body

as performed under this chapter, have any relationship
480.033(3),

477.013.

actice of massage therapy as defined in s.

of subsection of section

(a) (1)

is amended to read:

ion 37.
Florida Statutes,
029 Penalty.—

Paragraph

It is unlawful for any person to:

Hold himself or herself out as a cosmetologist ors

L —hair—wrabper—hoir braider—or bodywrapper unless

nsed or registered, or otherwise authorized, as

in this chapter.
ion 38. Section 481.201, Florida Statutes, is amended
201 Purpose.—The primary legislative purpose for

this part is to ensure that every architect practicing

tate meets minimum requirements for safe practice. It

is the legislative intent that architects who fall below minimum
competency or who otherwise present a danger to the public shall
be prohibited from practicing in this state. TheLfegistature
PP S PN IR [P S SN S I S P I S 2N EIEN S £+ 1] P N B I REERNE S
[ S U N S U R ) WS [ Ep . i AW W) CITTO T [ -y = ) LI T TTTC T 1T OO O g T t/uu_l__l_\_/ ja [ S ) .
+ 1 [ S R Pl RO S S PP L I PP I -
T t/J_L/L\_/L./_L\_/\_/ e [ S N R WPl N R S N \A.\_/A)_Lvl.l iy [ S N R WP N R S N \A.\_,g_)_LvJ.J.\_,J_;_) A
ENECAN AN I S NPE SR 0 =Y sz + 1 Adoaq ~n Adrront+ o PN AN B NN RN IR NP NN S I B N
O CTITI T C T T TCTOo AR T4 IV CTIT A8 O_L\jll O T T T ITTOUTT (@ yaw 8 L,_L()._Lll_l_ll\j - \iu_l__l_ A8
bszr +ha1a ot r noran~nmn o 21 ~ mertEa~A £~ Nraosrs c nea
J\J_Y CIT 1O tJ().-Lb O \—awy tJC-LOUllO AR T4 & i oy = CllltJL,C\J. 1T 1 OTIT T tJ_LUV_LQ_LUllQ
£ g o oy
O CIT 1O tJ()._LL,o

Section 39. Section 481.203, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

481.203 Definitions.—As used in this part, the term:

1/17/2020

Page 18 of 73

2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

[MRNCHRALY ===
504 (3) 4+ “Board” means the Board of Architecture and Interior
505 Design.
506 (7) 42> “Department” means the Department of Business and
507 Professional Regulation.
508 (1)+43> “Architect” or “registered architect” means a

509 |natural person who is licensed under this part to engage in the
510 |practice of architecture.
511 (5)+4) “Certificate of registration” means a license or

512 registration issued by the department to a natural person to

513 |engage in the practice of architecture or interior design.

514 (4)45)r “Business organization” means a partnership, a

515 limited liability company, a corporation, or an individual

PEE TN NS RN/
O CT AT I OUIT

s
He-
W\

516 |operating under a fictitious name “Certifiecate—-of

H
H
@D
@D
H

A

517 moana N o~ L4 o T ot Iy + 1 Aornartmant 4+ PN N S NN 2SN O n e
I TTTTOS L CcC oL C I 1T TTOCT oo aT U LJ_Y CTITT \ACtJDL.L CIITTTTC sy L \./\J.LtJ\J.LDLl.L\Jll O
518 NN R NPNE U AN IR 5 PENE N S P ENEPAP NP SN SR IS RENE S NE NPV DN PV
t/L/LJ_ L.,J.J.\_,J_L_)J.L_Lt/ (i t/J_L/L\_/L.,_L\_/\_, OO CCIT T T T T TTITT A [ S N R WP N R S N \A.\_,L_)_L\jl.l-
519 (2) 46> “Architecture” means the rendering or offering to

520 render services in connection with the design and construction
521 of a structure or group of structures which have as their

522 |principal purpose human habitation or use, and the utilization
523 |of space within and surrounding such structures. These services
524 include planning, providing preliminary study designs, drawings
525 and specifications, job-site inspection, and administration of
526 construction contracts.

527 (16) 4+ “Townhouse” is a single-family dwelling unit not
528 |exceeding three stories in height which is constructed in a

529 |series or group of attached units with property lines separating
530 such units. Each townhouse shall be considered a separate

531 |building and shall be separated from adjoining townhouses by the

532 |use of separate exterior walls meeting the requirements for zero

Page 19 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




533
534
535
536
537
538
539
540
541
542
543
544
545
546
547
548
549
550
551
552
553
554
555
556
557
558
559
560
561

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

clearance from property lines as required by the type of
construction and fire protection requirements; or shall be
separated by a party wall; or may be separated by a single wall
meeting the following requirements:

(a) Such wall shall provide not less than 2 hours of fire
resistance. Plumbing, piping, ducts, or electrical or other
building services shall not be installed within or through the
2-hour wall unless such materials and methods of penetration
have been tested in accordance with the Standard Building Code.

(b) Such wall shall extend from the foundation to the
underside of the roof sheathing, and the underside of the roof
shall have at least 1 hour of fire resistance for a width not
less than 4 feet on each side of the wall.

(c) Each dwelling unit sharing such wall shall be designed
and constructed to maintain its structural integrity independent
of the unit on the opposite side of the wall.

(10)+8) “Interior design” means designs, consultations,
studies, drawings, specifications, and administration of design
construction contracts relating to nonstructural interior
elements of a building or structure. “Interior design” includes,
but is not limited to, reflected ceiling plans, space planning,
furnishings, and the fabrication of nonstructural elements
within and surrounding interior spaces of buildings. “Interior
design” specifically excludes the design of or the
responsibility for architectural and engineering work, except
for specification of fixtures and their location within interior
spaces. As used in this subsection, “architectural and
engineering interior construction relating to the building

systems” includes, but is not limited to, construction of

Page 20 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




562
563
564
565
566
567
568
569
570
571
572
573
574
575
576
577
578
579
580
581
582
583
584
585
586
587
588
589
590

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

structural, mechanical, plumbing, heating, air-conditioning,
ventilating, electrical, or vertical transportation systems, or
construction which materially affects lifesafety systems
pertaining to firesafety protection such as fire-rated
separations between interior spaces, fire-rated vertical shafts
in multistory structures, fire-rated protection of structural
elements, smoke evacuation and compartmentalization, emergency
ingress or egress systems, and emergency alarm systems.

(11)4%y “Registered interior designer” exr—%

desigrer” means a natural person who holds a valid certificate

B

+ RPN
| [ S N

m

T

B

a 13- A
ot

of registration to practice interior design is—Ztiee

(12) 436> “Nonstructural element” means an element which

o r
o T

H

does not require structural bracing and which is something other
than a load-bearing wall, load-bearing column, or other load-
bearing element of a building or structure which is essential to
the structural integrity of the building.

(13) 4+ “Reflected ceiling plan” means a ceiling design
plan which is laid out as if it were projected downward and
which may include lighting and other elements.

(15)++2> “Space planning” means the analysis, programming,
or design of spatial requirements, including preliminary space
layouts and final planning.

(6)+4+3)r “Common area” means an area that is held out for
use by all tenants or owners in a multiple-unit dwelling,
including, but not limited to, a lobby, elevator, hallway,
laundry room, clubhouse, or swimming pool.

(8)+4+4) “Diversified interior design experience” means

experience which substantially encompasses the various elements

Page 21 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




591
592
593
594
595
596
597
598
599
600
601
602
603
604
605
606
607
608
609
610
611
612
613
614
615
616
617
618
619

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

of interior design services set forth under the definition of
“interior design” in subsection (10)-&3.

(9)4F5> “Interior decorator services” includes the
selection or assistance in selection of surface materials,
window treatments, wallcoverings, paint, floor coverings,
surface-mounted lighting, surface-mounted fixtures, and loose
furnishings not subject to regulation under applicable building
codes.

(14)+36)» “Responsible supervising control” means the
exercise of direct personal supervision and control throughout
the preparation of documents, instruments of service, or any
other work requiring the seal and signature of a licensee under
this part.

Section 40. Paragraph (a) of subsection (3) of section
481.205, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

481.205 Board of Architecture and Interior Design.—

(3) (a) Notwithstanding the provisions of ss. 455.225,
455.228, and 455.32, the duties and authority of the department
to receive complaints and investigate and discipline persons

licensed or registered under this part, including the ability to

determine legal sufficiency and probable cause; to initiate
proceedings and issue final orders for summary suspension or

restriction of a license or certificate of registration pursuant

to s. 120.60(6); to issue notices of noncompliance, notices to
cease and desist, subpoenas, and citations; to retain legal
counsel, investigators, or prosecutorial staff in connection

with the licensed practice of architecture or registered =and

interior design; and to investigate and deter the unlicensed

practice of architecture amdinterier design as provided in s.

Page 22 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




620
621
622
623
624
625
626
627
628
629
630
631
632
633
634
635
636
637
638
639
640
641
642
643
644
645
646
647
648

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

455.228 are delegated to the board. All complaints and any
information obtained pursuant to an investigation authorized by
the board are confidential and exempt from s. 119.07(1) as
provided in s. 455.225(2) and (10).

Section 41. Section 481.207, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

481.207 Fees.—

(1) The board, by rule, may establish separate fees for

architects and—anterierdesigrers, to be paid for applications,

examination, reexamination, licensing and renewal, delinquency,
reinstatement, and recordmaking and recordkeeping. The
examination fee shall be in an amount that covers the cost of
obtaining and administering the examination and shall be
refunded if the applicant is found ineligible to sit for the
examination. The application fee is nonrefundable. The fee for

initial application and examination for architects and—Tnterior

desigrers may not exceed $775 plus the actual per applicant cost
to the department for purchase of the examination from the

National Council of Architectural Registration Boards er—the

P

T4 tan 14 s
NCL U I € Ny S S S S WY @ S UM W

ar
o]
)]

3 ] Corineos ] £ T+ L] r N no
O T CcounCrrr— O —TIrcCTt O & TS

H

Qa9 oy
o TYIT

tivelyy or similar national organizations. The biennial

P

A=

o}

o
T30

T

renewal fee for architects may not exceed $200. Fhebienniat

ranarzal £ EIENES IR ANF SIPNE S RPN S DN B NS ST NS TS NN = o d-_SENN The
T O T T T WO [ S [ S N [ S N R WPl N R S N \A.\_,A)_L\jll\_,J_s) lllu_Y o Ay AN AL AW § R AYAY

delinquency fee may not exceed the biennial renewal fee
established by the board for an active license. The board shall
establish fees that are adequate to ensure the continued
operation of the board and to fund the proportionate expenses
incurred by the department which are allocated to the regulation

of architects and registered interior designers. Fees shall be

Page 23 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




649
650
651
652
653
654
655
656
657
658
659
660
661
662
663
664
665
666
667
668
669
670
671
672
673
674
675
676
677

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

based on department estimates of the revenue required to
implement this part and the provisions of law with respect to
the regulation of architects and interior designers.

(2) The board may establish a fee for certificates of

registration for interior designers. Such fee, if established,

is not refundable and may not exceed $75. A certificate of

registration is valid for 2 years and a registered interior

designer may renew the registration. The biennial renewal fee

may not exceed $75.

Section 42. Section 481.209, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

481.209 Examinations.—

(1) A person desiring to be licensed as a registered
architect by initial examination shall apply to the department,
complete the application form, and remit a nonrefundable
application fee. The department shall license any applicant who
the board certifies+

42> has passed the licensure examination prescribed by
board rules and

k) is a graduate of a school or college of architecture
with a program accredited by the National Architectural
Accreditation Board.

(2) A person seeking to obtain a certificate of

registration as a registered interior designer and a seal

pursuant to s. 481.221 must provide the department with his or

her name and address and written proof that he or she has

successfully passed the qualification examination prescribed by

the Council for Interior Design Qualification or its successor

entity or the California Council for Interior Design

Page 24 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

4 §O]
D $H $ HO)j
o - H D D D D
o) G D - o - HOoE & u
-H D - - fH [l Rty H D o - -
(S TS -H O up < D - ® D o 4 -d ) P
> @ Y] D D P Q- 4P P [69) 4P
—| L P D ® [ON YH o 4y @ D YH o H KO) D
— g & (0N} D ¢ D -H §0) D -M [ox) D T ¢ D D o
S O ¢ P $H -H |- L L oo @ D
e = D ¢ D H o &£ & $H & O - © W P & @
wl P -H ¢ -H & P (VI O} (o] D D - ® D » -t D 4 D *
0Nl 4 D " D D ] D q - - q - 1] £ - D UH D
Ol © D @© uH o - o W $H o W My KN b 4O ¢
O o ¥ T D 4 D -H D D -mH [09) o))
o O & @ D ¢ Hoo-H Hoowm b - [P ) uhy D Db & A —
3| O - -H G D (O (OFIT! jou ®, D o S [09]
0 &0 + -m Kd D -H - D H -H P 1Y) ® D
Ol P B¢ i oo D [N O D ON H Nl )
nl g b T P o P o™ -f oo o™ -f 0 € w P~
©| o o Uy D @ -H - -H P ® -H O D - D D D op i fH
< W - N P 0g] [09) O, ) DL > D
> 4 ¢ @ b & | O D 4l - D U 4 D B -
4 Ql © P D H @© © T Y © D - © D B EISEEN ) @ VIR R
(@) -H o -H @ X D D [ON [09) & [op) D
ol > & £ O -4 ¢ STR] N Ho B H4b - ni
NENO) 1] D H D D i Y D i D & H @ @
> ol ¢ . ¢ v P -H -H P -H @ ® -H P My D P M
! -Ho-f (O D H D D H D 4 P DL DO " -
—H € ® H & ® ¢ D D b D P oo D P 4
I c P D Y] D H S ¢ T D D D
Sl O oW T & O & T qQ on @ D ) D D
| L ® D D D - - - YH - Boo4p { D
0} YH D -H @ HO) © iy © - — ~ O o)l
4| O © D & 4 s ¢ D oo D [09) o D N Q H $H OO D
O H H ® e ® B P ¢ W ® (O 1] D [OR D I ®
nl ol @ ¢ - o 0o | 0 O] D O] D P ¢ & O @
n| © ¢ b © Hp -1 P E & ~— & D Hoo@ 4b D D
O & © ¢« D R ON D D q ) -
o €| ® ¥ O @ & ¢ H & O 4 CUR L onooq P
O @ - ¢ O © O 4 uYd D Uy D ® 4y D < Hj) [ VI 1]
3 x| e -H -H (O 1] » 0] 0] - I~ D { D
nl o o H D D HO) D ~ & Q P P
(OFE(} D 4 ® NIE ] D TR DR )] $H T @ [N} ~
nl L e v b & £ & P P P 4 D ¢® @ D [\ R )] D D
Pl a Lo P #H OEF OB 4 BTG D BTG Q- T D ¢ @ D
Al O D 4 HO) ~ T I~ ~ O D D b & Q ud D
] R L PP PO PP @, b ¢ T N L O N R IR B ( S o
~ © H H 0] D @ H @ » ke @ & [0} kY @ ()] o, & U ¢
o »| o D @© 4 ¢ © ¢ & D P D ¢ D P € D NISE )
- fon D D 4P D { D on [ ] . @
al 3| -H PR -H o @ D -H @ D - -H ¢ - D i B & P I~
o| o ¢ -H 0 & D d i N s r 4 L 0 O O g
Hl O o™ & B0 q O o0 O 9 ¢ ® D @ @ N ogo-H o -H &P
) n  -d H MO E D g i O, HOO # D H & ¢ ¢
©| o O, F 0 L b pe jon ¢ W D ol
Ol ol » & P H P o +~ ¢ D +~ A~ D 4~ D o D B M O D
- P P O &€ F ¢ O QL O g T B S L O O PR O R |
H| O| ¢ @ P ~+ ¢ ~x ¢ [ox o =R R OR
—Hl O O A A n o, Y] . o) + D (OFREN(] D -
P 0 O H H -H & 9] 4a - Hoo- -H N - n O N B @
S nl H @ P W ® 10] [09] 10] HO) O B D o}
O () £ 4 D D @ D D D D D B O T E U D @
O] o & © © T Yy -H P pe §O) —H @) ® E D ¢ -H
0 O O 4 N MO < 1N W >~ W o0 O A N M S N0 W I~ 0 o0 O +d4 N M S .n W
I~ >~ 0 0 W W W W W W W W O & O O O O O O O O O O O O o o o
W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W VW VW VW W W O ~ ™~ >~~~ -~ ~

Page 25 of 73

580-02259B-20

:21 PM

26

1/17/2020 2



Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

|| 377230

707

708

709

710

711

712 BF

713 Urited—States—inetuding those programs—Schoots—and——ecolleges

714 aeeredited by —the Foundationfor Interior Pesign Eduecation

715 Researeh-—The boardshall adeptrules providingforthe review

716 ard—approvat—ef—diversified interior designexperience—reguired
717 | by—this—subsecetion.

718 Section 43. Section 481.213, Florida Statutes, 1s amended

719 to read:

720 481.213 Licensure and registration.—

721 (1) The department shall license or register any applicant

722 |who the board certifies 1s qualified for licensure or

723 |registration and who has paid the initial licensure or

724 registration fee. Licensure as an architect under this section

725 shall be deemed to include all the rights and privileges of
726 |registration dieemsuvre as an interior designer under this

727 section.

728 (2) The board shall certify for licensure or registration

729 |by examination any applicant who passes the prescribed licensure
730 or registration examination and satisfies the requirements of

731 ss. 481.209 and 481.211, for architects, or the requirements of

732 s. 481.209, for interior designers.
733 (3) The board shall certify as qualified for a license by

734 endorsement as an architect or registration as a registered anm

735 interior designer an applicant who:

Page 26 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




736
737
738
739
740
741
742
743
744
745
746
7477
748
749
750
751
752
753
754
755
756
757
758
759
760
761
762
763
764

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

(a) Qualifies to take the prescribed licensure or

registration examination, and has passed the prescribed

licensure registration examination or a substantially equivalent

examination in another Jjurisdiction, as set forth in s. 481.209

for architects or registered interior designers, as applicable,

and has satisfied the internship requirements set forth in s.
481.211 for architects;
(b) Holds a valid license to practice architecture or a

license, registration, or certification to practice interior

design issued by another jurisdiction of the United States, if
the criteria for issuance of such license were substantially

equivalent to the licensure criteria that existed in this state

B

ar

at the time the license was issued; provided—however—tha

—~
(=9

.
!

W\ o

B

+
C

|,__l
(
|:_I
(
m
|,__I -
q
s

T

-

[0}
d
H~
Ho

n

o g
o T=GTT

@

(c) Has passed the prescribed licensure examination and
holds a valid certificate issued by the National Council of
Architectural Registration Boards, and holds a valid license to
practice architecture issued by another state or jurisdiction of

the United States.

An architect who is licensed in another state who seeks

qualification for license by endorsement under this subsection

must complete a class approved by the board on the Florida

Building Code.

(4) The board may refuse to certify any applicant who has
violated any of the provisions of s. 481.223, s. 481.225, or s.
481.2251, as applicable.

Page 27 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




765
766
767
768
769
770
771
772
773
774
775
776
777
778
779
780
781
782
783
784
785
786
7877
788
789
790
791
792
793

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

(5) The board may refuse to certify any applicant who is
under investigation in any Jjurisdiction for any act which would
constitute a violation of this part or of chapter 455 until such
time as the investigation is complete and disciplinary
proceedings have been terminated.

(6) The board shall adopt rules to implement the provisions
of this part relating to the examination, internship, and
licensure of applicants.

(7) For persons whose licensure requires satisfaction of
the requirements of ss. 481.209 and 481.211, the board shall, by
rule, establish qualifications for certification of such persons
as special inspectors of threshold buildings, as defined in ss.
553.71 and 553.79, and shall compile a list of persons who are
certified. A special inspector is not required to meet standards
for certification other than those established by the board, and
the fee owner of a threshold building may not be prohibited from
selecting any person certified by the board to be a special
inspector. The board shall develop minimum gqualifications for
the qualified representative of the special inspector who is
authorized under s. 553.79 to perform inspections of threshold
buildings on behalf of the special inspector.

(8) A certificate of registration is not required for a

person whose occupation or practice is confined to interior

decorator services or for a person whose occupation or practice

is confined to interior design except as required in this part.

Section 44. Subsection (1) of section 481.2131, Florida

Statutes, is amended to read:
481.2131 Interior design; practice requirements; disclosure

of compensation for professional services.—

Page 28 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




794
795
796
797
798
799
800
801
802
803
804
805
806
807
808
809
810
811
812
813
814
815
816
817
818
819
820
821
822

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

(1) A registered interior designer is authorized to perform
“interior design” as defined in s. 481.203. Interior design
documents prepared by a registered interior designer shall
contain a statement that the document is not an architectural or
engineering study, drawing, specification, or design and is not
to be used for construction of any load-bearing columns, load-
bearing framing or walls of structures, or issuance of any
building permit, except as otherwise provided by law. Interior
design documents that are prepared and sealed by a registered
interior designer must may, 1f required by a permitting body, be

accepted by the permitting body be—submitted for the issuance of

a building permit for interior construction excluding design of
any structural, mechanical, plumbing, heating, air-conditioning,
ventilating, electrical, or vertical transportation systems or
that materially affect lifesafety systems pertaining to
firesafety protection such as fire-rated separations between
interior spaces, fire-rated vertical shafts in multistory
structures, fire-rated protection of structural elements, smoke
evacuation and compartmentalization, emergency ingress or egress

systems, and emergency alarm systems. Interior design documents

submitted for the issuance of a building permit by an individual

performing interior design services who is not a licensed

architect must include a seal issued by the department and in

conformance with the requirements of s. 481.221.

Section 45. Section 481.215, Florida Statutes, 1s amended

to read:

481.215 Renewal of license or certificate of registration.—

(1) Subject to the requirement of subsection (3), the

department shall renew a license or certificate of registration

Page 29 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




823
824
825
826
827
828
829
830
831
832
833
834
835
836
837
838
839
840
841
842
843
844
845
846
847
848
849
850
851

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

upon receipt of the renewal application and renewal fee.
(2) The department shall adopt rules establishing a

procedure for the biennial renewal of licenses and certificate

of registrations.

(3) A Ne license or certificate of registration renewal may

not shatdt be issued to an architect or a registered an interior

designer by the department until the licensee or registrant

submits proof satisfactory to the department that, during the 2
years before prier—te application for renewal, the licensee or
registrant participated per biennium in not less than 20 hours
of at least 50 minutes each per biennium of continuing education
approved by the board. The board shall approve only continuing
education that builds upon the basic knowledge of architecture
or interior design. The board may make exception from the
requirements of continuing education in emergency or hardship
cases.

(4) The board shall by rule establish criteria for the
approval of continuing education courses and providers and shall

by rule establish criteria for accepting alternative

nonclassroom continuing education on an hour-for-hour basis.

Ri13 ] A2~ OArnrnd oo b n_ Nyt o b £ + 1 hm| a1 A Daaa T A3 o~
Do O oot S oS TO;  Of—aity poOTrcTOo Ot T o O ourt T OTitg
Caod St AA o nart T3 ot~ BB roalat+ 1 A~ 4+
SOt opPp TP urrSouditc coO—paorft Tv O CriaptCtr o995, LftoTaoctIitg O

Section 46. Section 481.217, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

481 .217 Inactive status.—

Page 30 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

() ¢ O T| ™ 0}
0] D HO) O | H G
— -H go] oy - A - $H ) ®
o 3 Rio} Q ® Pl A D a
O ~ © q O O Al - HO)j a O ~
- 0} o} a ~ o —| D HO) o - -—H|l @
20 B -~ 0} h 9 © ¢ ¢ D - + D
T o o T £ 0 £ D o, 3| - O 4P 0} Q ©| -
O H e D . ® © - ol 1 -H -H n  -H o O N 4
=) -+ © ¢ O g o D TR D ol g Al
o - 3 o o A O 0 o L °© v QO A b~ o L gl ¢
o O S Y LR R s - ON b 4 N n + g o ©N
n -4 O 4 {4 0 QO P n| & H <© W ¢ ¢ H S 0 ~ O ®
oS L wH 0o P P oo ~ al ¢ b o - s b ¢ O gl 4 @
g 0 g o & P © > o) ol P R B o O & A o] ol o -4
-4 O O g o - - 0} - W O -fH W D -HoH P P A oo D
5 A O o| -4 ¥ fH o in] + b D [ D -mH — Ky @] + 0| W W
o -~ @ D 4 O 3 o] < i T O ©n| ©
- QW P (0] D -m © in] N| - D P ~ — ] Ny O, 0 0] N O W
+ @ O ©| O 0] H o 0 © -—| n [N © H o)) 0| -H [ D D
q “ D a ~ in] al| - H o D “ D B H n @] al| -H kY
O O O | 4 ™ H A 0 ol D D -H 3 P D D -4 QO ©f wn| ¢ -H
o ¢ 4 ®wnl O dA & P 0O ol ® 4 D ® D ¢ 4 < O o B D B
- o Al -d o - c © ISR | D 9] ] @] D My ~ P “ 40 Q 0N lox
o ) D — P O o @ H 0] [0} H n Q| O D D
— © O 0] 0] U 0] -~ U D D HooH 0] O,
) > S P D D “ H “ n| v D )] o, -H © )] D o nl g K
9 -+ o O O 0 D -H H O -H O al nl | B D
2 © Y| A D D n W O O 4 D D O ™ H -H 0 O O O, @
> 0 = O 4 o o 0| [ al -H o) D o9 QD wog Ol gl >
O © O 3| & P +H T < -H| -Ho N © B W O Al Al WH D
o & o0 o & ¢ B3 & O ~ n| - P D »w H O, O A A wn| Al & H
O S| 0] 9] ~ © ~ @ -l O S0 » “ o)l D n o 3| | ¥ ®
Q 4 o o 3 P - Q e & O & D ~ - Qf Q| ® o
-~ O P ™ O P ®n © N ~ HOP | - ~ L > ®© S| 1 !
4 O O O w ¢ & O B H . H| | D, -H WH| $H O 4 D O o o ¢
@) S o+ H O FE ¥ 0 P P A o h O D - D 4 [ TR
n < O ~ O T © w0l © - D D 4 o~ D ™ O © n| - D
0] O | T 0] c L A @l L P P 4y QO g D ©| | T| -H
~ 0 -H a © ~ Hoo- n o @] 9] B+ © D ] — 0] “ © [T
Q L © P N | 4 -H| HoQ Q, 0 O o O O S o ¢
-~ g 0] ~ D © [0) ~ O i) D > D O, D & P “ 0 O [N
> T L L o0 hHh O © > - o ¢ @] - -H O ) D ol B Qf -
T o © < A T P O 4 g ¢ S| € < -t o O Ll P H
E O O > P O O w L g o -~ % b o v » b ~ P wn| O o o ¢
O 4 -4 O @ @ O @© O Hl @ ol # -H| ¢ TR 9] G| O © S| &
O o P O # ¥ O © n - [OF ) [ D O ~ D 4 P o O| L H
4 © g O P 4 o w — 0wl -4 o ¢ P n ¢ O O -Hl -H o]
© o -H ~ ¢ © -H 0] . ©| Y a N[ D o Al S| | WY ®
O 0 0] (O o D O n o~ 3 D 0] Hoo-H & n o o O o O
QO © 4 4 O ©© & QO 494 g @] | O D ol ¢ O D ¢ Q S1er 4H
-~ IS B O 0] o o - © o, O -H 3 © © ©| — D
0] 0 3 O @ 9] O W O a (o)} D — 0] o -~ n n n ©
g P o P D n < -~ (@] — -H 1S “~ $H > D ® Wl ~ > D
== q 0] T P T H w —~ -d N 4P S i} @] D “ HO) ~ H @] (@] O
0} “ a 0] — 0] P . ® P 0] B ~ ©
—~ & O Y4 H H ~ Y4 O U & —« O —~ 0O 0 <~ 0 S TRT] —~ QO] O 9 U
— o P A 0] D P N -3 > O T o -f — 0] 9] b D [§y} (QV} O [} o -f
~ 4 O P P H Q4 - T A4 O @© < U ~ 0| ¢ -H D ~ Al ®w| ©] uH
- a © )] fH o P 0] -H - a {9} H in] a -
i} o -A D 4P O O “ Rty < -H (OFI D n O ] [N ls)
o > 5 o ¥ P O ®© 4 0 wnl % P - @] O O|
O ® T O ¢ @ g a O D H 3 D @@ S -Hl QO D
4 £ O 4 -H W Q, -H 2 ) © Q| » -H 4 o —| 3| {
N O TN O >~ 0 OO0 4 N OO S W > W o0 O 4 N M S 0 W~ W o O
0N 0O O W0 W W w0 W W W W YW YW WO o ~M~I~~>~ >~~~ D>~ @
[e6) [e6) (e 0] (e 0] (0] (o) [o6) [o6) (e0) (0] (0] [o6) [o6) [o6) (e0) (e0) (e0) [o0) [o0) [o0) (e0) (e0) (e0) (e 0] (e 0] (e 0] [e0) [e0) [e0)

Page 31 of 73

580-02259B-20

26:21 PM

1/17/2020 2



881
882
883
884
885
886
887
888
889
890
891
892
893
894
895
896
897
898
899
900
901
902
903
904
905
906
907
908
909

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

PEWANE VS AN i -2 Jaima+and 12117 34+c7 ~Ameno s Nt Aol g E SR NNE S -2

u\JJ.t/\JJ.(_AL_J.\JLL, [ S § g Sy S WSl W 8 J.J.(_A.LJJ.J.J.L__Y uulllb/ull_y, t/(_/LJ. L_LlCJ.;_)LJ.J.t/, O t/CJ.»._)\JJ.l

Bractd g e aan A o £ A b g Ao o o fFLfaramne~y v g At ]

t/J.(_/LuL_J.uJ.LL\j T T IO U [ S S N U By U B W @ W ) LLK_A.LLI.C, \JJ.J.CJ.J.LL\j € NN S U7p R R Sy WP WP W WS U (N Sy @5 R )
Yzl N+ + P 2N B AP TNE IR 2 2 | PP ANE N AN SN PEANEEN 7 n o

=] [ SV i wy =] [ a CTIT LJUJ\J_L_L\./ JV_LJ.J.L_,_L_Y 7 =] LJLA.J_LA.L_, _L_Y TITOW \4 J_, VWIT T aTIT

3 da 79 A7 RPN ANE P NPT SIS NE S SN I SN R T IE 1 r r 1o PRI 2Ny

T TITTO TV T UOT T =y LJJ_LA.\_/L_,_I_\_/_I_J.J.\j | €% N SN N R R Sy Wy A\ S W g 1T T - g TT 15 WIT TTTOITT 7

ol PPN N P 2NN i NN 2N rocr ol o+ 15N cort s £ A i A o

[ ¥ A w A T [SSJ8 i N & Ry e T Ay J_\.,\iu_LJ_\.,\A. (o a Ay 7 WPLN Sy UPI i S WL W & IO 1T CIT 1O

ot 1 A Caort a1 £1 At 1~ Nndar +h1 o oot g Ay 4+ ESE SNV

[RGBy W i § |\ NI S S S S S WY @ R WS S W i § |\ 3 i A W & weg - CTIT IO [T S W |\ WPl Uy W B W i § Ry |\ S S e

RN S I AT R T 2 cavizai ~aa ah o] 1T~ 1404 11 +h raioh+ o A

€ NN S U7 R R Sy WPl WP W WP U R Sy @5 R Sy oo LTV I COTCTO [SR Y = == [ S i S W W ) w @ g T J_L\jLJ.L,LJ (@ yaw

Briszilocgaa £ vt a L4 A d A nder acivbhan~t 1 A (2 + ESE SANEYN

tJ_LLVLLC\jCQ oL |2\ NESRN S Ui S S S Ny @ i) U S N i § |\ 3 i A W & g [T S W |\ WPl Uy U B W i § \ = Ry |\ S S .

Tt~y Aaod ey ozl Ao

[ S N R WPl N R S N \A.\_,».)_L\.jll oo LTV I OTNO

practice of architecture unless its qualifying agent is a

registered architect under this part. A qualifying agent who

terminates an affiliation with a qualified business organization

shall immediately notify the department of such termination. If

such qualifying agent is the only qualifying agent for that

business organization, the business organization must be

qualified by another qualifying agent within 60 days after the
(o),

organization may not engage in the practice of architecture

termination. Except as provided in paragraph the business

until it is qualified by another qualifying agent.

(b) In the event a qualifying agent ceases employment with

a qualified business organization, the executive director or the

chair of the board may authorize another registered architect

employed by the business organization to temporarily serve as

The

its qualifying agent for a period of no more than 60 days.

business organization is not authorized to operate beyond such

period under this chapter absent replacement of the qualifying

agent who has ceased employment.

(c) A qualifying agent shall notify the department in

Page 32 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

)] 0] O
l e < O c sH T P @
“ — - D 0w A 0 = D D @
Q () D NO) PP Y G My — ® ®
< S| B 4 “ O O L0 P @ - HO)j
nl wnl O 44 (N ON i O O ®© 0] D D © 4 D
al w D D o 4 0 o om My & D
-~ O| G| O D W D o n o0 9O w —H g o 4 b >N T P L
a o O D 4 D @ e =3 g (O D DL ¢ H ¥
| -H| -H| “ R LI s B O B .l q (0) # P 0 0 4 ¢ P
“l wn|l P A e & ¢ - 0] < S O H A A = ~ O D [ )]
3| 3| © 3 v -d B O P g n P o Hd = ~ n o D
L Ql N Of -l + L S q L >y 0 & H ofd P 4
O -l O 4 o) ) 4 ®© L T 0 0 o0 o n g o0 | D
O L G| 4 -H . ¢ O N 4 ¢ 4 <o g D B ¢ O &
) a © + [OEE D D ()] Q, - o -f o » P O, D ® D D D
- O o ®m fH D 4 O My a H O D D oo o, @ 4 Rty
ol o4l 49l D -H © - - ~ O H o 1S VI« D (B 1 S R 5} o
O 0] O O #H W b H 9] HORN )] “ O O H H 0] )]
[T ) ® D ® D T < QO D - ~ ® KO -t
| H| n|l < [ I T O TR ()] - o O > P 0O <4 g © D H P D Uy
-Hl 0| O b ¢ ® b ¢ ®© -A - o -4 A ® = ¢ O P O 4 -
H| T| O E ~ O e D + 9 £ - O ®© YW & D D 4
¢) al B ¢ ¢ ¢ & QN -# n © O &4 -H Q n o - D D H H
© - “ D D D [l 4P e @] > o, ] O [OR P - — [OR D
O 0| © -H v n -H ~ 0O S -+ - © 0, T D ~ 0 [ON )]
O S| 3| & + $H @ b & O w O ~ S o ~ B k0 ¢
Al P Ql O D © D D & ©n £ A > 4 & 494 @© P N D @ D @ ®
P -H T D (OFIE()) ® S5 0O 4 O D O © [ $H © W [99] H
ol 2| © n o ¢ 0O 0O O -A - = 0 T b o B O D D
© O O D W fH -H o O T # “~ - O, & H D B
4 gl 3| S N W D D ¢ @© T n PO ¢ T B O PP D d, 4 [op)
of O wn| L - - K} ©| 4 $H o0 P < (o] (0] ® D [09)
-— I O] ~ ~ D a <~ q © D o P { N n P Y -H
| L “ O Rty EENON D $H o w P O O -H a -H D - 9] ®
gl @© o] 4 o-H b [09] D -4 O O ¢ wW o T Wy #H @ D, —
Do W -4 @ ¢ -H PP S Y D -~ g -H P - D D —
— ol < . D B O -H on @ o 4 P O O T wnn «© [« D “ @ K ®
cl -+l <l O P P W T 3 2 4 c D & -H D B Iy . @
-H| W A4l O O $H 4 ©® O O gl © O g [T IRNO] T @
Hl 49l P ©f O & ¢ b T L < E 4 O < h & B & O O
o ©f O] ® Q ®D W - D w © B © A & £ <o D - D -H & H P
o) IS D ¢ $H ¥ « % -H g @) N + ~ H o & @& ' ¢ ¢
-Hl Gl O 4| | & D@ ¢ P b 44 O O O O © £ Y n o 4+ b Q@
o -H| S| O] -H| ¥ O, 4 L -4 O O T U Nl 0 ®©® O [ox) HOZEN RN D © &
© n| Hl <4 B Y 4P S -~ - H 0] 0] fon [4p] D -mH ® D Eiy)
o 4 al Pl <~ O ¢ O 4 4 4 g q Db Q > -Ho 4D ) D
| O] 3| -H B P w ¢ ® O O =B © ¢ o] ¢ 4 o P & HoOP
0] a H D & & ~ v S qa o ¥ “ ® D & D D D O
Ol ©f O O @ © @ D ¢ -— -4 n O 4| ¥ Q, H & - & D ® D
O g g Tl 4 O ™ 9 W 49 9 o ¢ Q, T P A > D - ®
Y4l © < ®© o E P - D g o0 3 OF © () - D ™
O a a )] i} fH D D @ [4p] — @] o, ¥ 9] H D ~ 0N H D D
4 @] D -H [0} D D —~ -A @ O 9] H “~ H P @ D D @ 4
ol gl -H O] w| B 4 [09) ORI RS e B 6 PN O BN ) D | O < D ¢ © & H E
Ql 2| L < P c >~ P = BN« 0 4 -H -H 4D
O o L S| A~ MNP D H P~ Y | <~ S| T — D b ¢ £ A~
o) N ol op -H -H -f D D < O O < w »™» gl o e} ® D @O 44y O W
|l | Al > O v ¢ o+ ¥ -H S — O o O 3| ¢ 4 T ~ ® ¢ -H B D -H
-~ Al g —| -H D -H - 4 - -~ P 4 QO ¢ O ®© O $H D ¢ D ey
PG| © Q9 - L9 b P > O © o L 9 b 9 T
- o Qf O 1SR VI ()] #$ P Y O & ©®© O ®© O PR TS
“ “ “ S B - - @ D 0] 4 v g D P Y 0] ® D @ D D @
= O O]l nl ® ® M U -H $H n O O ¥ P n O wn o O -H W N D
O H N MO T 0O W I~ O OO0 O A N OO P O W I~ 0 o0 O A N M N W~
— 4 4 A4 4 4 4 d 4 4 N N N N N N N N NN OO O O O OO OO0
O Oy O OO OO O O OO OO O OO0 OO O O O OO0 OO OO OO0 OO OO O OO O OO O O O O

Page 33 of 73

580-02259B-20

:21 PM

26

1/17/2020 2



COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

a
H O
in} H -
HOj @] ® i)
-H (V)] ®
® ] v $H ¢ 0 =]
OB % e} ¢ O O ) Y
9} LR ol ) ® -H HO)J 0] 0] O
¢ ®n 4 0} = O <~ (o] o al o4 7 S
© [« )] ® Y o R ()] ® -Hl O L 4
n ¢ o < ©| A O Q o [OFEE (o R} m 0 -—
0] o w o0 g 0 A B DI P VI o U o S|~ >
0 ) O 0 < S S0 L6 9 -d -Ho O W O Q > -0
Y ¢ PDlH P P o4 P n A P E c 4 D -m c H S
-HE - | H B D (@) [ ) & b ® 44 h @ 1P o © L P
1b N| O HORES “w 0 o Uy b © © $H -H D D © o, O
I ) - ol -1 O O O & 4 D ¢ © H P #H 0 n g o <
Q @ a o P a i) H b D [OFEENO)] ® ¢ - 0] (@] -
(O ©| P D w O —~ 4 O [¢ T V1 S R (I )] P -~ 0O A
o S O © Y 4 @ - P O P -H -HoD H — QO
OREE S S04 &€ Ol & O 4 & O © D @ A 4 -H h uH S TON Hl > @ O
K D @] (@] D O O a { -H N ¢ D -f - ® —l P < a
© - -t < Wl oA O 4 ~ -H D @ 4 4 4 ©| 4 0 ©
D 4 O] wnl b v H| W < n O w W & P 0 H (TR S| c
HOREEN(V] ol nl @ O o>y Y in] TSI SR Y L I () D D @ ol -4 g O
b\ 0wl Ol g O sf O ¢ 0O ~ O D A 4o Qo+ 0D q E Q O
¢ -H cl gl -1 H ® ©c Q > 0 4H 4 T D O @ -A >
O] O Al ¢ > o 4 O c P — D P T H W © © <loH PG
) D O )] D “ O © s © - ® D @ D D D 2| O [M]
o) —Hl 3l ¢ O H &4 O 4 Qo <G o @ b -H T b & ¢ 0}
D 4P — Q 4 »n > A4 O © g O - H - - @ D L T 0 r%
a©oB - 4| O O 4 q D & 44 » D @ jon D cl o
' P ol Ol § & O & > T U © ¢ & -f D T ¥ D @ ol ¥ ®0
~ > nl 4 b g -H D H B P D o4 o 4 A 4
P4 z| O Y4 -H Y A © > ®W H NoEENON o s £ S O
oy D ol & D h <o Qo P © [OTINY] < @ — D ~H Y -~ PP
® — D O - <~ -d o, ¢ O nh H ¢ - D o — 4
) o — ~ D O ] o Q o, 0] D D ® ® ® a ~ ©
-4 « @©| O] 4 nl < © A A P o D -H © o L - <~ O
| P o | £ 4 o Q ®© £ ¢ ¥ LT O P n oo >N Q0 T om
e, v @ —H O D O Y — n © D b ® -1 D - - HloHog >
o -+ N 4 g A A O Y S o+ w0 U E M HoOoH O E ¥ D —Hl S B3 ©
© U . @ Ol W $H YW O T o ~ ~ O D D & ¢ [ ()] —| ® T
- G S OB 0 < noP O TRY: LB R () B () b ¢ |+ © 4 O
oD o >N P O O P P T A M D D N & -f & W S5 0O O O
& T Hl @ 4 4 4 O S © $ D b -H P B P o a A ™M
VI o H ¢ {4 O O E ® L L O O ¢ OV Y P ¢ ST N
) S ) P A 9o A £ ¢ e ¢ ¢ O [ N O) <S4 Hog
D N ®© © H — E o w0 D D U O PR (3 [OFEENOF O © L -H
NI o 3| P D Q| 4 o A -4 A My D D 4 D B S O 4 <
¢ Q O gl O 4 <o < D ¢ H ¢ O W .« P [] (OS]
@ O - 4 —~ © o H P D KT H € ] O -H
D © O O ¢ ®©® S| O [ D 4l s ¢ O D O o =
-H o4 P O P W . 9 XYW g © > & ¢ D I L W £ - o| <
4P = 3 ®wl O O O O o O (¢ D - ~ Ef B4 -—H| O
T T 0 N O NN I - —H O -H o G| D 1] P A g
NP c D O O P on P O T +~ ¥ D © ¢ +~ ¥ A~ N —~|] @© L O
-H - O RN O @ 4 © o L P E& H ¢ o B fo NS o Nl © &
TR O WY o D 4 O 4 W T T Y ¢ D ¢ + O + W ~| Al 4 B
D -t ul e I o g o P A b O & D D gl o N
&£ —~ oo P o L 9 H > O 0 4w A © &L | Q
) ® o, @ @] @] “ 1S ~ @] fH H H 9] D i3] o 4 0,
i} B 4 Q, P - (@] © O a “ D D ® D $H B “ O QO
(R OX1Y © O © W o Q O HA O (O OFEEN O PO} ON ® ol v T
O O 4 N M < 0O W >~ W o0 O 4 N M < 0N W I~ 0 o0 O d N M S N W~
oo TR SIS LB RS S S (RS VRS IS I N To B To N To U e T I To BENNTo NENNTo NN To BN T NN Vo RN Ne BENVe BN Vo BN Vo NI Vo BN BN}
O O OO OO OO0 O O OO OO O OO O O OO O OO O O O OO O O O O OO OO O O O

Page 34 of 73

580-02259B-20

:21 PM

26

1/17/2020 2



968
969
970
971
972
973
974
975
976
977
978
979
980
981
982
983
984
985
986
987
988
989
990
991
992
993
994
995
996

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

contained in the application upon which the qualification

1+
T

()]

tifieation 1s based. Any registered architect or interior

designer who qualifies the business organization shall ensure

; oty Himited iﬂ:ahﬂ:iﬂ:E& compatty7 ©% ?afEPre-PS-h%p—a-S
L ded 4 ] . 7 CEE ] : .
responsible supervising control of projects of the business

organization emtity and shall notify the department of the upern

termination of her or his employment with a business

organization qualified partrership;—Iimited liakhility companyr
or—ecorporation—<certified under this section shett-—metify—the

department—eof the termination within 30 days after such

termination.

AW ot a2 B 1 N
Y COmpTiTy 7 A S e

trership—shalt—Pbe relieved of
responsibility for the conduct or acts of its agents, employees,
or officers by reason of its compliance with this section.
However, except as provided in s. 558.0035, the architect who
signs and seals the construction documents and instruments of
service is shait—Pbe liable for the professional services
performed, and the interior designer who signs and seals the
interior design drawings, plans, or specifications shall be

liable for the professional services performed.

(1Y TV ot T d g s b e b o o s s T4t
\J_ , 15 _Lt/_L_LJ.J.(_/LJ__Y L C 11T (_/Lvu_l_l.lg_)k_, L UJ_t/UJ_(_/LL_,_LUJ.J., [ S ) S WP WA W &

P S T S At arakhtes a1 ] B O O R I NS N

_L_L().J\J_L_L_LL,_Y \/UllltJ().ll_Y, O tJ()._L L,llC_LOJ.J._LtJ [0 | & = g = LA OOl T 1O C O 1T T =TT LSS i 5wy

(8) +3) Nethimg—in This section may not shalt be construed

to mean that a certificate of registration to practice

Page 35 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

997 architecture must er—interior designshallt be held by a business

998 organization eerperatieon,—Iimited Iiabitity company,—or

999 |partrership. Nething—3n This section does not prohibit a
1000 |business organization from offering prehibits—ecorporationssy
1001 Hwdtred—Ttiokbilitvycorpanies—andpartecrships—frorJoiaing

1002 together+to—offer architectural, engineering, dnterior—de

1o
EaSEry

[0)]

1003 surveying and mapping, and landscape architectural services, or

1004 any combination of such services, to the public if the business

1005 |organizationy—previded—that—ecach ecorporation,—timitedIiability
1006 |ecompanyr—or—partrership otherwise meets the requirements of law.
1007 H4—Cerporations—imited—tiabit ity companies,—oF

1008 |partrerships—heolding a—valid ecertificateof authorizatien—=+o
1009 |practiece—arehiteeture—shall be permitted tousein—their+title
1010 the—term—irnterior desigrer’or “registeredinterieor desigrer?
1011 Section 48. Subsections (1), (3), (5, (7), ((10), (11), and
1012 (12) of section 481.221, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
1013 481.221 Seals; display of certificate number.—

1014 (1) The department beard shall prescribe, by rule, one or

1015 |more forms of seals to be used by registered architects holding
1016 |valid certificates of registration.

1017 (3) The department beard shall adopt a rule prescribing the

1018 distinctly different seals to be used by registered interior
1019 |designers holding valid certificates of registration. Each
1020 registered interior designer shall obtain a seal as prescribed

1021 |by the department beard, and all drawings, plans,

1022 specifications, or reports prepared or issued by the registered
1023 interior designer and being filed for public record shall bear
1024 the signature and seal of the registered interior designer who

1025 |prepared or approved the document and the date on which they

Page 36 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1026
1027
1028
1029
1030
1031
1032
1033
1034
1035
1036
1037
1038
1039
1040
1041
1042
1043
1044
1045
1046
1047
1048
1049
1050
1051
1052
1053
1054

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

were sealed. The signature, date, and seal shall be evidence of
the authenticity of that to which they are affixed. Final plans,
specifications, or reports prepared or issued by a registered
interior designer may be transmitted electronically and may be
signed by the registered interior designer, dated, and sealed
electronically with the seal in accordance with ss. 668.001-
668.006.

(5) No registered interior designer shall affix, or permit
to be affixed, her or his seal or signature to any plan,
specification, drawing, or other document which depicts work

which she or he is not competent or registered dieensed to

perform.

(7) No registered interior designer shall affix her or his
signature or seal to any plans, specifications, or other
documents which were not prepared by her or him or under her or
his responsible supervising control or by another registered
interior designer and reviewed, approved, or modified and
adopted by her or him as her or his own work according to rules

adopted by the department beard.

(10) Each registered architect must er—dnterierdesigner;

hatd+ include her or his

license its—eertifieate number in any newspaper, telephone
directory, or other advertising medium used by the registered

licensee. FEach business organization must include the license

number of the registered architect who serves as the qualifying

agent for that business organization in any newspaper, telephone

directory, or other advertising medium used by the business

organization arehztteect;—3nterior designer,—corporation;—trmrted

Page 37 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1055
1056
1057
1058
1059
1060
1061
1062
1063
1064
1065
1066
1067
1068
1069
1070
1071
1072
1073
1074
1075
1076
1077
1078
1079
1080
1081
1082
1083

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

Bill No. SB 474
13l 1 a4+x7 ~Ami~n— g r vt~ alg o VAN NN N | n 1 4ma+~A
i SN Sy @ R N S S S W uuulj_uu.xl_y, A\ t/u_l. L_LlCJ.»._)LJ.J_t/ Fany \_/\JJ.t/\JJ.(_A.L_J.\JJ.l, [ S W ) ) N Sy U WPl W §
13l T a4+x7 ~Ami~n— g BartEnaoaralhaae 2o A~ e A A1 arnl sy +h A
J_J.(_A.LJJ_J.J.L__Y uulllt/ull I A\ t/u_l. L_LlCJ.»._)LJ.J_t/ ) T T J.C\.iLAJ.J.CM \awy MJ.»._)t/J.(_A. T
oot a £~ P LN SNZNE ESE I T I EE TN B VS NPT AP~ NP~ BTN 2N SN I SN Sl S
A\ T C 1 1T 1T CTTC TT I - . TTITTO TV IO I J—\/\j_l_u C O 1T T LT CITIT T T T TO g
EIRAE —NE r A~~~ man A s r e~ led CE IR~ SN RN =
[ S N R Wy [ SN E N A\ 8 U_I_\jj.l. 10 J.I.I.LJ_LV_Y A\ 8 J\J_Y A VA= = ) _I_J.J.\j W LT CTIT 1T CIT

f 4 rrited }iabﬂ:}ﬂ:Ei compatty7 ©% ?a—EEFre-PS-h%p.

(11) When the certificate of registration of a registered

architect er—interier designrer has been revoked or suspended by

the board,

the registered architect er—irnterior—desigrer shall
surrender her or his seal to the secretary of the board within a
period of 30 days after the revocation or suspension has become

effective. If the certificate of the registered architect e

RSN PN PN
S s 1 W s i

desigrer has been suspended for a period of time, her
or his seal shall be returned to her or him upon expiration of
the suspension period.

(12) A person may not sign and seal by any means any final

plan, specification, or report after her or his certificate of

registration has expired or is suspended or revoked. A

registered architect er—interiordesignrer whose certificate of
registration is suspended or revoked shall, within 30 days after
the effective date of the suspension or revocation, surrender
her or his seal to the executive director of the board and

confirm in writing to the executive director the cancellation of

the registered architect’ s—er—anterieordesigrerls electronic
8

signature in accordance with ss. 66 When a

8
registered architect’s er—interieordesignerls certificate of

registration is suspended for a period of time, her or his seal
shall be returned upon expiration of the period of suspension.
Section 481.223, is amended

Section 50. Florida Statutes,

to read:

Page 38 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1084
1085
1086
1087
1088
1089
1090
1091
1092
1093
1094
1095
1096
1097
1098
1099
1100
1101
1102
1103
1104
1105
1106
1107
1108
1109
1110
1111
1112

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

481.223 Prohibitions; penalties; injunctive relief.—

(1) A person may not knowingly:

(a) Practice architecture unless the person is an architect
or a registered architect; however, a licensed architect who has
been licensed by the board and who chooses to relinquish or not
to renew his or her license may use the title “Architect,

Retired” but may not otherwise render any architectural

services.

(b)Y Dot o~ B NN r A~cd o~y 1201 aa +1h Nnoaranry 4o o

N7 1L T OC T ITTCTT [ S N R WPl N SR S N \A.\.,Q_L\.jll TIT 1800 CTT t/\.,J_Qull ) (&
LN =R o NE N B IR~ NE r A~cd s ~1 oo +h vl o mant A A~
J_\.,\.j_LuL.,\.,J_\.,\A. [ S N R WPl N S S N \A.\.,u_L\.jll\.,J_ TIT 1T CTO O OTCTITTCT W IO T Ay \_,u.Lt/L_,\_,\A. ITCT 1T Ty
hotiaszar ENEENEE PN S NS NSV DN =T VSN NS S 01 2N NN N A 13 cnarmand ey +4 e rd
ITTOWT VT Ly aIT [ S N R WPl N R S N \A.\_,s_)_L\.jll\.,J_ W T TTTOO O TTT T T O CTTIO T LJ_Y T WA LG B R W §
A oh oo + ral 3w o r N~ roanatr oo » ey 19~
AT WITT CITOO O TWO ja—y J_CLLLL\.iLALLJLJ. O ITToCT ja—y 1TV T1T 1S5 O T [ S S ) W B ST )
masz +h 14+ 1 NTort s~y Mo e Rotd v A naad onocg o~
lllu_y | e s T C T 1T [ S N N WP NI S S W UCQL\leC.L, (L5 Y UPl UP B S WL W § L AW s lllu_y ITToCT
+hoarrra o raoandar Sz g N g L DI I LA DL S T ]
COCITCTCITTW IO T [ S N i B W B wg (.A.ll_y [ S N S U SR S S g \ACQLKJLL oo LTV ICOTCTO

(b)4e) Use the name or title “architect,” e “registered

architect,” or

erieor—designer’—eor “registered interior
£
1

designers+” er—words—teo—that—effeets when the person is not then

the holder of a valid license or certificate of registration

issued pursuant to this part. This paragraph does not restrict

the use of the name or title “interior designer” or “interior

design firm.”

(c)+4e Present as his or her own the license of another.

(d)4e) Give false or forged evidence to the board or a

member thereof.

(e)+£)r Use or attempt to use an architect er—dnterior

desigrer license or interior design certificate of registration

that has been suspended, revoked, or placed on inactive or
delingquent status.

(f)4e Employ unlicensed persons to practice architecture

Page 39 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1113
1114
1115
1116
1117
1118
1119
1120
1121
1122
1123
1124
1125
1126
1127
1128
1129
1130
1131
1132
1133
1134
1135
1136
1137
1138
1139
1140
1141

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

) Conceal information relative to violations of this

ara oy Ao e
CTTTroTT OCToTIgit.

—

part.

(2) Any person who violates any provision of subsection (1)
commits a misdemeanor of the first degree, punishable as
provided in s. 775.082 or s. 775.083.

(3) (a) Notwithstanding chapter 455 or any other law to the
contrary, an affected person may maintain an action for
injunctive relief to restrain or prevent a person from violating
paragraph (1) (a) ory paragraph (1) (b)s—er—paragraph—ti+te)r. The
prevailing party is entitled to actual costs and attorney’s
fees.

(b) For purposes of this subsection, the term “affected
person” means a person directly affected by the actions of a
person suspected of violating paragraph (1) (a) ory paragraph
(1) (b) 7/er—paragraph—I)r{te)r and includes, but is not limited to,
the department, any person who received services from the
alleged violator, or any private association composed primarily
of members of the profession the alleged violator is practicing
or offering to practice or holding himself or herself out as
qualified to practice.

Section 51. Section 481.2251, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

481.2251 Disciplinary proceedings against registered
interior designers.—

(1) The following acts constitute grounds for which the
disciplinary actions specified in subsection (2) may be taken:

(a) Attempting to register ebtain;—ebtainingy Or renewing

registration+ by bribery, by fraudulent misrepresentation, or

Page 40 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

D D
Ky D @ D bl O
H 0} RTV R 1 ) o $H —
KT “ O < H Eny] ® @ -
D 0 P D D s D 4
- ~ > b #H ' 4 4 i) -
s < O © o — o D O] @ 4 . 0
D ol 0o A & T N L B O N1 B (1 & D iy )
4 ol ¥ ¢ A @) T VS Y DY 0} ™
@ < o0 O wn 3 4o O M S D -t e IR A
- Pl > T & O «~« O 4 O W B P D S - ol & O
@l O o = W0 - D —H O ~ & 0B s RO) @ -
D Ol 4 o O o ® T w0 - o & ¢ D D 9 H o~
()] - e A @ S LR ) O P YW @ D c & D A =
- H @ P~ O b ¢ O ¢ O 4 -~ oG9 o) 1L nl © ©
4 Al D -~ 4 H O A h 0 D 4 -H ® Al =1 A
) P O 0 € O P A > O & D -~ 4 o) o) o
® [ L N = RS N e D T O R D O >
4 Q — P Q0 ¢ B2 OO & -H 4 r D W HO) — 9l 4 ®©
ON ol P T B (VI ) 0 NIE D o & O Py
S 0> 0O G D G O TR OB O) > $H H O o o
b S 4 Q © U ¢ O & u g & - T D b <& O T
Rty 0] b O -~ o 0 P b o ¢ kSl -H H P O 0
0l -H o G >N W . P A O ©® D D ® B 4 b -~
D a s o| < O >~ O n A D @ o (OB D $H ¢ o
N Q -~ ®© 24 0O > "M c o o O P O O Y
¢ O 4 ~ B 4 — T T 49 @ @ = Hon -~ & ¢ H H H O O
D —H & P © 4 O A »0 0} ~ @ <° ¢ - HoH B O <o g
P —| - ®w O] O S -4 494 wn O & c O & 2@ 4P = )
- o Al H P o4 O A9 4P o QO 4 b ¢ T S
oL g o H S H 2 9 » & — b @ Y 0
o P @ A ¢ @ T 4 O B ¢ O w0 ¢ u Ay T T B
P Hl - O P O O G O H P E ® 4 & O + D O ™ w
o P o Y| A 5S> Bown P 0 9 g S VA B SR IO T
~ ol O of £ n© O g o [0} B o $H @ T | A H (O >
o) T O O O A H © -4 T Q D, S D D ® 4 © Q
“ oo -—H g D . o 4 -d b W | o
© g4 O P Y| T P 4 O H 49 !m D i ~ @ b & & ®© O T
@) @] O Oo| w o -H (@] O D 4 ~ ¥ © H Hoo-H - ]
Q - D ®© -~ -~ @ O $H - D o P Y
S 4P N 9 O T O g 4 KO > D D D —H W T < < -~
(0) 0} 0o g| 3 O g O O D © D -~ O, -f n B¢ -~ 0 3
< i) nw o mm™ g L A A4 P H @O @ H D » B H — D O
P a o A -A O O 1S 0 a ¢ O - O, [ON - a 0]
Al & 2 P 4 A A O A A D l 0} o D @ P " A Y
4 ~ o O P > > a4 D, O D -m b D o
O a [N ) IS o < s O O v @ -f (OBt D ¥ -H ~ ~ T
o - S | L H O 4 O ¢ O O n ¢ ™ O O Y
Y H P nl O O U YH O A fH -H ! o - < O o) n O
@) o o Al g -HA (@) > H g -H ~ @ nh ¢ & ¢ o <4 O
S| a ® ol ®© > o 0] O @© -d P o -f 99 H D -mM a s O
“ - “ 0] a ~ O 1S ey Y [99] =il ww D — ® - 4 .
o > g O Yl H @© -H BRI I O NN ) — - D o, H - Y
o O O ()] @ T © ¢ H T ¢ g O “
) o A ~ 0~ 0o M - o o ¢ O -f [ETRE PR T ¢ B O = QO O
@ P| T 0] > P PP W @ D D D, ON
~ © O 4 P 3 ~ D -H @ —_ ~ 0 [09) A~ B o
S e~ O Y T B A P O 0> T T O D [l I )] Py
o ~ P| g n o4 -HA = - o P & @ ~ — o~ D -H Y+ O O
3 0| o q o L - D W D o~ o v ¢ n o
O = 0 S 0 © —~ D D -4 » 2 0
S o 0 o L G - —~ - ¢ O H 0] — ® (@] ~
e of 3 -4 B3 O o Q D @ D - @ D — a
+H 49 w4 ®© O 4 © L P N — B ON M
N MO < O~ o0 O 4 NM <N O~ 0 00 4 N OO S W0m W I~ w o O
ASUEE S U S S S S U S L To B To RN To BN To BENNTo NN Vo NENN To NN To ENNTo NENNTe NENINo BENINo BN\ BN No B Vo BN Vo ENNe BNo IRV BN Co B a
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

Page 41 of 73

580-02259B-20

:21 PM

26

1/17/2020 2



COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

2020

Florida Senate

Bill No.

SB 474

| REERRN =725

Q D jon H

o -~ 0 Lo ® D ~H

) ] ) P 4P ¢ D —

— O Q 0 oo $H N -H “H & ¢ P

(O] O © P Y- D D D @ o 4 D U4H
o & M - < 9 D & y L& P K~ — &
S -+ 0 > ) P + & R ORI © O o P
- n] “ “ @ D D D D D -m & D ~ 4 O @ D
O — 0 (0] O D — 4 Y - ww [1v] » 3 O - -H D
5o+ A 0 ) B D b (] 1P -H i) PR S T
T © O n - S oo (VT 1S R (. @) 4 0O D D @
o g 0] i} a S | @ ® D H @ D H 0] @] © My
- 0 “~ a o O b D D D D -H D i [ | ~

o A 4 &g ¥ oo on [o9) P " ! - [ © P« VIR ) N1 3}

4 0 ®© — n © X D [{ I = i @ -H @ e in} oo D
O O S5 0 G —H -iH D N P W O -~ O . ¢ ¢

g9 w T T O 2 < E ) oo D D S (O« D
o O ®© 3 -~ o P B -H D D T 4 0] L J S T L ) PN /)
a O © “ 9] 0] Ky D Y — v 4 -d 0] D
- 0] > 1S @] 9] in] e -d D + [P IS ~ o] (o BN ~ D
— 4 P e ) O (OFE. S $H b ¢ ¢ 0} - D th T
- - (TR 0, D D b ~ & & O @ go] Y IR
4 ~ O “ QO o - & n fH D on [4p] ® ® 0] & a O ~ - o4

O © o “ O - [ON 9] i1y D oo D 0] in] £ P ®
g Q, [SEEON O My oo D © % H ¢ P “ T O -H P 4
O n ® - D ] D ¢ -0 0 D @ o R | i
5 P 0 O o c| L H D) [( I 2 Ko ol O @ O [op)
)] ~ 5 W a © (@] U ® -H H @ D @ @ P “ (@RS D

(@) 0] 1S o -+ “ a D D — D D D @ D D 4 @] D @ {
o o g i) s P D < h -4 P - o O & P -
[ () NS [ 2 1 )] @ Ko B i D 4D D a H »m -H o Ud
-~ Y 3 O O -A| -H D D D H O @ [ I -— O -4 ¥ N UH
) a —H H O -Ho @ ow P -H | D ¢ 4 o & B D D
o g -A ~ 0 4 0Ol o [ 1] P D @ & ¢ ¢ 0] in} OO
] O o -H 0] ST -H D $H D D D D I O “ @
4 50 - S>> O P o O T T O PR N PR [ @ O |~ % ©®
P o -4 O (ORI D O ® b & & & q O [OANENO)
0 a P 49 T o O H 4 D D D ¢ T c ~ & -0 &
Q . o o o o P O, W oo D H 0] [o9] 0] D “ © > - 4q -
O o -H [0) © 0] D Rty D | -Hoo (@] O D

n n 0 o < g N O -t ~ & W & D ¢ o g B ¥ D
Y O o O U ®m [ . N 3 D D b & O q o o o0 fH ¢
O O 0] T P a A ® D o)l B [o)) [ SR ] . a -—H P v -H -H

T -~ o P [ O) ¢ F D Uy P H oA L2 0 & y
o @ ~ O ¢ P =2 © » H -H & HOJEEY ' BN O} 4 & oD Yy I O I
S O 4 o HoQ < ¢ B OH - SV T I R O N VRS AN ) = g @ O
—H P o O -H O n P -H W @ W & -H @ D - O g O <~ § ®
o O S X ®n U O $ 2 O - -HoWpp s O A - QO g 0O g
o ¢ 4 o © & 0O HA 2 ¢ P £ N " D H D O O g O 44 uH
g o o 4 = O &« L O H N oo b ¢ - P ~ O A A D O
E n =2 o®0 - -~ g D ™G -HooB O W D 4 “ 0
- ~ QO + — N~ - ® K D HO)j [0} D D & D O ~ O @ 4]

o O T - © - - > (VI ~ P & P H H O T D 4P
>~ w0 + Q (@] fH @ D () [ (XN O - @
— O “ — a o~ A i) o~ A~ D -H ~ » b - Y [¢p] D D —~ 0 —~ a “ P w
— 4 9 0 W 0 o ® g o ¢ 4 &€ © H H H < 0 H 0O O @ &
5 0 P A~ — g g 4 v ko v ) H T+ H T B~ o ~ o A4 § B
Hooq r (0] O O O < -f D B s D @ - -~ 4 @ ¢
— P > 0 Y 0w W $o O up D H P A > R O TR
— O —~ P Q, n o Y B @ = P oH AP b o L 0
—H g g & d) o 0 0 D - b @ oo o) O < 4 @
= © O -H “ g4 o o P -H 4 BB 0 a -+ @ -
— N O N O >~ 00 O O 4 N M < .0 W >~ W o O 4 N M S 0w I~ 0 O
.~ >~ [~ [~ >~ >~ [~ [~ [~ 00 0 W W W W W W W W O O O & O O O O O O
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

Page 42 of 73

580-02259B-20

:21 PM

26

1/17/2020 2



1200
1201
1202
1203
1204
1205
1206
1207
1208
1209
1210
1211
1212
1213
1214
1215
1216
1217
1218
1219
1220
1221
1222
1223
1224
1225
1226
1227
1228

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

Hh
B

D
H
H-
H

o Ao fai1
13 Co CaxaTC T oot T T opUIitTo=L

R N N | o
N S = A2

q
E
[0)]
m
E
H
)]
[0)]

(2) When the board finds any person guilty of any of the
grounds set forth in subsection (1), it may enter an order
taking the following action or imposing one or more of the
following penalties:

(a) Refusal to register the applicant appreve—arn
ﬁ?ﬁeﬁﬁeﬂ—f@%&ﬁﬁﬁf@' i ' ’

(b) Refusal to renew an existing registration tieense;
c

) Removal from the state registry Reveeation—or

suspension—ofa—tieense; Or

(d) Imposition of an administrative fine not to exceed $500
£1+-6068 for each violation or separate offense and a fine of up
to $2,500 $5+6688 for matters pertaining to a material violation
of the Florida Building Code as reported by a local

jurisdictions+—er

(o) Taooiian~ £ o Ao g o A
<7 TSouottCC— O TP TrTitaitic.

Section 52. Paragraph (b) of subsection (5), and
subsections (6), and (8) of section 481.229, Florida Statutes,
are amended to read:

481.229 Exceptions; exemptions from licensure.—

(5)

(b) Notwithstanding any other provision of this part, all
persons licensed as architects under this part shall be

qualified for interior design registration dieensure upon

submission of a completed application for such license and a fee
not to exceed $30. Such persons shall be exempt from the

requirements of s. 481.209(2). For architects licensed as

Page 43 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1229
1230
1231
1232
1233
1234
1235
1236
1237
1238
1239
1240
1241
1242
1243
1244
1245
1246
1247
1248
1249
1250
1251
1252
1253
1254
1255
1256
1257

Florida Senate - 2020
Bill No. SB 474

COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

satisfaction of the requirements for renewal

481.215 shall be deemed to

5755

interior designers,
of licensure as an architect under s.

satisfy the requirements for renewal of registration liecensure

as an interior designer under that section. Complaint

processing, investigation, or other discipline-related legal
costs related to persons licensed as interior designers under
this paragraph shall be assessed against the architects’ account

of the Regulatory Trust Fund.

(6) This part shall not apply to+
+

£ 1< r g fFfoama 1<z oo g A Ao Hoveszar N a A+ 0 o1
Tty O twO—rtdittrry tTtocorTuChiCe s TTOwWCe vy T o OCircrroT
Sl 9 Nt g Aol A o At 2~ 104 oAy S Ao oo~ At Al o+
PP T Co Tt oS SO C o1 O T CrroGC—COoOmmOI—arCa o oo oo CTrao Tttt —w ot

ishment providing
“interior decorator services” on the premises of the retail
establishment or in the furtherance of a retail sale or
prospective retail sale, provided that such employee does not
advertise as, or represent himself or herself as, an interior
designer.

(8) A manufacturer of commercial food service equipment or
or dealer or an

the manufacturer’s representative, distributor,

employee thereof, who prepares designs, specifications, or

Page 44 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1258
1259
1260
1261
1262
1263
1264
1265
1266
1267
1268
1269
1270
1271
1272
1273
1274
1275
1276
1277
1278
1279
1280
1281
1282
1283
1284
1285
1286

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

layouts for the sale or installation of such equipment is exempt

from licensure as an architect er—interieor designer, 1if:

(a) The designs, specifications, or layouts are not used
for construction or installation that may affect structural,
mechanical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, ventilating,
electrical, or vertical transportation systems.

(b) The designs, specifications, or layouts do not
materially affect lifesafety systems pertaining to firesafety
protection, smoke evacuation and compartmentalization, and
emergency ingress or egress systems.

(c) Each design, specification, or layout document prepared
by a person or entity exempt under this subsection contains a

statement on each page of the document that the designs,

specifications, or layouts are not architectural+—interior
designy Or engineering designs, specifications, or layouts and
not used for construction unless reviewed and approved by a
licensed architect or engineer.

Section 53. Subsection (1) of section 481.231, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

481.231 Effect of part locally.—

(1) Nething—=w This part does not shall-—be—econstrved—=+eo

repeal, amend, limit, or otherwise affect any specific provision
of any local building code or zoning law or ordinance that has
been duly adopted, now or hereafter enacted, which is more

restrictive, with respect to the services of registered

architects or registered interior designers, than the—preovisien

[0)]

of this part; provided, however, that a licensed architect shall
be deemed registered dieensed as an interior designer for

purposes of offering or rendering interior design services to a

Page 45 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1287
1288
1289
1290
1291
1292
1293
1294
1295
1296
1297
1298
1299
1300
1301
1302
1303
1304
1305
1306
1307
1308
1309
1310
1311
1312
1313
1314
1315

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

county, municipality, or other local government or political
subdivision.

Section 54. Section 481.303, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
to read:

481.303 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:

(1) “Board” means the Board of Landscape Architecture.

(3) 42> “Department” means the Department of Business and
Professional Regulation.

(6) 43> “Registered landscape architect” means a person who
holds a license to practice landscape architecture in this state
under the authority of this act.

(2)44) “Certificate of registration” means a license issued
by the department to a natural person to engage in the practice

of landscape architecture.

(4)+6> “Landscape architecture” means professional
services, including, but not limited to, the following:

(a) Consultation, investigation, research, planning,
design, preparation of drawings, specifications, contract
documents and reports, responsible construction supervision, or
landscape management in connection with the planning and
development of land and incidental water areas, including the
use of Florida-friendly landscaping as defined in s. 373.185,
where, and to the extent that, the dominant purpose of such
services or creative works is the preservation, conservation,

enhancement, or determination of proper land uses, natural land

features, ground cover and plantings, or naturalistic and

Page 46 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1316
1317
1318
1319
1320
1321
1322
1323
1324
1325
1326
1327
1328
1329
1330
1331
1332
1333
1334
1335
1336
1337
1338
1339
1340
1341
1342
1343
1344

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

(b) The determination of settings, grounds, and approaches

aesthetic wvalues;

for and the siting of buildings and structures, outdoor areas,
or other improvements;

(c) The setting of grades, shaping and contouring of land
and water forms, determination of drainage, and provision for
storm drainage and irrigation systems where such systems are
necessary to the purposes outlined herein; and

(d) The design of such tangible objects and features as are
necessary to the purpose outlined herein.

(5)+#H- “Landscape design” means consultation for and
preparation of planting plans drawn for compensation, including
specifications and installation details for plant materials,
soil amendments, mulches, edging, gravel, and other similar
materials. Such plans may include only recommendations for the
conceptual placement of tangible objects for landscape design
projects. Construction documents, details, and specifications
for tangible objects and irrigation systems shall be designed or
approved by licensed professionals as required by law.

Section 55. Section 481.310, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
to read:

481.310 Practical experience requirement.—Beginning October
1, 1990, every applicant for licensure as a registered landscape
architect shall demonstrate, prior to licensure, 1 year of
practical experience in landscape architectural work. An

applicant who holds a master of landscape architecture degree

and a bachelor’s degree in a related field is not required to

demonstrate 1 year of practical experience in landscape

architectural work to obtain licensure. The board shall adopt

Page 47 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1345
1346
1347
1348
1349
1350
1351
1352
1353
1354
1355
1356
1357
1358
1359
1360
1361
1362
1363
1364
1365
1366
1367
1368
1369
1370
1371
1372
1373

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

rules providing standards for the required experience. An
applicant who qualifies for examination pursuant to s.

481.309(1) (b)1. may obtain the practical experience after
completing the required professional degree.

481.309(1) (b) 2.

Experience used to
qualify for examination pursuant to s. may not
be used to satisfy the practical experience regquirement under
this section.

and (4) of section 481.311,

Section 56. Subsections (3)

Florida Statutes, are amended, to read:
481.311 Licensure.—
(3) The board shall certify as qualified for a license by

endorsement an applicant who—+

(A Oa3alafdon + + o1 + 1 N I P S - A B, I NP
\u.[ guu.;;.l.;co ja—y CTICT T C AT I TITTOCITUTIT & e [y O 1T CTT LI =)
4Q1 20Q e A d oo e o ot o o] P | PR
1 O T T I2 (@B aw § TITTOO tJ(.ALLJLJC\A llul—L\JlluL, J—C\jL\JlluL, Qbul‘c, O
P I + 1 e NS S I N o 491 230Q. -
b\iu_l_vu_l_\_,llk_, iy T Ay €% 11 ) 1) A N Ry Ay @ R WS S N O J_\.a\iu_LJ_\./\.A. LJ_Y =] e A A 7 A\

4+ holds a valid license to practice landscape

architecture issued by another state or territory of the United

States LR, PR S I R, £ a4 s o
I P S T LT T C T T ITT [ S T oo UdTdITC T A\ - o LTI T T T TTTIO T W T
P S B ls I T P AUy Ry, [ + 1 1 e P S S P, N R, ERPFEpGS |
[SAvS W) l—ulll—_Lu_L_L_y TACTTIC IO ja T T T C CTTTI OOl T LT T C T T ITTT WITITCOTT o o T
1T +ha o at+ N+ ~ + + 1 + 11~ n o I 1 ey =
i S CIT 1S o C AT [ & Ny wy T C LTI T i R i P S B BTN ) Wy WTLOSO T oo g
(4N Tk Teonard b1l seaedd £ o e TS £ A £ o o S £ o
\__[, [ B N N O T IO [N 25 NN Ny & R S iy A\ L.,_LJ__Y & ) \1\4I.L/L_L_LJ__L\.4\A. [E S N (&8 NP WP S WS S S S WY &P B U

Section 57. Subsection (2) of section 481.317, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

481.317 Temporary certificates.—

2 —Ypeorn—approval—bythe beoardand payment—of +the feeset

ia—s+—48F-30F—+the department——shalt—grantatemporary

Page 48 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1374
1375
1376
1377
1378
1379
1380
1381
1382
1383
1384
1385
1386
1387
1388
1389
1390
1391
1392
1393
1394
1395
1396
1397
1398
1399
1400
1401
1402

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

PP S ol PP SN N PN N S NI N N | = = NN I = D I SN (N =
|2\ WP Sy Ui S S S Wy & S WP uSy O O CITO LT T T CITUlT [ S A " A 1T T QHC\_/J.J.J.CLA tJJ.\JJC\_/L_
an o ab ot L o a4+ cscconand 1 oy 4+ S 114+ £

LT CITT 1O o C OO CT [ S U t/CJ.J.\JM IToCT - a—y AT T T - o [y AIT oaT -

ot o P NE S NPNE SN S BN NartEnaral o~ £ e Nroatzra A~A ~ £ +

o CTCT \./VJ_LJUJ_LAL.,_LUIII LJLA.J_ CTIT J_UJ.J._LLJ, 7 L L LIty LJJ_UV_I_\A A8 1T g CTIT

N RN P | £ N £ 4+ PN S L N £ 4+ PN SN £
LJJ__Lll\./_LLJLA._L |\ N S ) 10 g CTIT \./VJ_LJUJ_LAL.,_LUIII 1T g CTIT LJLA.J_ CTIT 10 g
+1h NartEnaral o~ r +1h PSRNV I~ NN BV I~ ~ 2 ST S I o
T t/uJ_ L.,ll\.,J_uJ.L_Lt/, A IO g CTIT t/J__Lllk/_Lt/u_Lu 1T T J__L\./L.,_LL.,_LULAQ_L_Y
Aamaed £1 vy oo htaimad o 4+ men~anoancg AN g 0 N £ vt oty 0 A
TTTTIT SO [ S — Y TTTOS U0 CTOIIITTICT T L L,CllltJ\J_LLAL.L_Y CcC o LT C I T TTOCT oL J_C\jLnJl—J_ulaL\Jll

Section 58. Section 481.319, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
to read:
481.319 Corporate and partnership practice of landscape

architecture+—eertificateof authorizatien.—

(1) The practice of or offer to practice landscape
architecture by registered landscape architects registered under
this part through a corporation or partnership offering
landscape architectural services to the public, or through a
corporation or partnership offering landscape architectural
services to the public through individual registered landscape
architects as agents, employees, officers, or partners, is
permitted, subject to the provisions of this section, if:

(a) One or more of the principal officers of the
corporation, or partners of the partnership, and all personnel
of the corporation or partnership who act in its behalf as
landscape architects in this state are registered landscape
architects; and

(b) One or more of the officers, one or more of the
directors, one or more of the owners of the corporation, or one
or more of the partners of the partnership is a registered

landscape architects—and

(o) T P S N SN
\\./[ [N B N B \./\JJ_LJ\JJ_L/LL._L\JJ.J. A tJL/LJ_

Page 49 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1403
1404
1405
1406
1407
1408
1409
1410
1411
1412
1413
1414
1415
1416
1417
1418
1419
1420
1421
1422
1423
1424
1425
1426
1427
1428
1429
1430
1431

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

a1 oot 1A Iy haard
o 2o cTroO—Ooy € ECAVAS mEnw ,

(2) All documents involving the practice of landscape
architecture which are prepared for the use of the corporation
or partnership shall bear the signature and seal of a registered
landscape architect.

(3) A landscape architect applying to practice in the name
of a Amn—appitieant corporation must shadt+ file with the

department the names and addresses of all officers and board

members of the corporation, including the principal officer or
officers, duly registered to practice landscape architecture in
this state and, also, of all individuals duly registered to
practice landscape architecture in this state who shall be in
responsible charge of the practice of landscape architecture by
the corporation in this state. A landscape architect applying to

practice in the name of a Amr—apptieant partnership must shatt

file with the department the names and addresses of all partners
of the partnership, including the partner or partners duly
registered to practice landscape architecture in this state and,
also, of an individual or individuals duly registered to
practice landscape architecture in this state who shall be in
responsible charge of the practice of landscape architecture by
said partnership in this state.

(4) Each landscape architect qualifying a partnership or

aad corporation d+ieemsed under this part must shkhadtd notify the

department within 1 month after ef any change in the information
contained in the application upon which the license is based.
Any landscape architect who terminates her or his er—her
employment with a partnership or corporation licensed under this

part shall notify the department of the termination within 1

Page 50 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1432
1433
1434
1435
1436
1437
1438
1439
1440
1441
1442
1443
1444
1445
1446
1447
1448
1449
1450
1451
1452
1453
1454
1455
1456
1457
1458
1459
1460

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

month after such termination.

(5) T a9y N~ o N AN g o N NN~ o n L
UJ.QVJ.BJ.J.LLLAJ._Y €7 NN U N (_A.\jK_AJ.LL»._)L_ (&1 k/\JJ.t/\JJ.(_AL_J.\JLL A
nartrrnaAarabh i~ a7 7 PN PN IR BRI NS S~ B I~ 2 o mannary oA n +
LJLA.J_ CIT - UJ.J._I_LJ [ 2 NN iy & R S T €% A\ B ) 1 A S R R SRS W) - A\ 8 i S CIT o CATTT T - (¥ yaw 5 A\ iy CIT

+6) Except as provided in s. 558.0035, the fact that a
registered landscape architect practices landscape architecture
through a corporation or partnership as provided in this section
does not relieve the landscape architect from personal liability
for her or his er—her professional acts.

Section 59. Subsection (5) of section 481.321, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

481.321 Seals; display of certificate number.—

(5) Each registered landscape architect must and—each

avthorization—shatt include her or his 4+s certificate number in

any newspaper, telephone directory, or other advertising medium

used by the registered landscape architect, corporation, or

partnership. A corporation or partnership must is—smet—reguired

£o display the certificate number mumbers of at least one

officer, director, owner, or partner who is a individaat

registered landscape architect arehiteets employed by or
practicing with the corporation or partnership.

Section 60. Subsection (5) of section 481.329, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

481.329 Exceptions; exemptions from licensure.—

(5) This part does not prohibit any person from engaging in

the practice of landscape design, as defined in s. 481.303 s+

481303+, or from submitting for approval to a governmental

Page 51 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1461
1462
1463
1464
1465
1466
1467
1468
1469
1470
1471
1472
1473
1474
1475
1476
1477
1478
1479
1480
1481
1482
1483
1484
1485
1486
1487
1488
1489

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

agency planting plans that are independent of, or a component
of, construction documents that are prepared by a Florida-
registered professional. Persons providing landscape design
services shall not use the title, term, or designation

7

“landscape architect,” “landscape architectural,” “landscape

”

architecture,” “L.A.,” “landscape engineering,” or any
description tending to convey the impression that she or he is a
landscape architect unless she or he is registered as provided
in this part.

Section 61. Subsection (9) of section 489.103, Florida
Statutes, 1s amended to read:

489.103 Exemptions.—This part does not apply to:

(9) Any work or operation of a casual, minor, or
inconsequential nature in which the aggregate contract price for
labor, materials, and all other items is less than $2,500
£4+6668, but this exemption does not apply:

(a) If the construction, repair, remodeling, or improvement
is a part of a larger or major operation, whether undertaken by
the same or a different contractor, or in which a division of
the operation is made in contracts of amounts less than $2,500
$1+-666 for the purpose of evading this part or otherwise.

(b) To a person who advertises that he or she is a
contractor or otherwise represents that he or she is qualified
to engage in contracting.

Section 62. Subsection (2) of section 489.111, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

489.111 Licensure by examination.—

(2) A person shall be eligible for licensure by examination

if the person:

Page 52 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

[RIERAIY =720
1490 (a) Is 18 years of age;
1491 (b) Is of good moral character; and
1492 (c) Meets eligibility requirements according to one of the
1493 |following criteria:
1494 1. Has received a baccalaureate degree from an accredited

1495 4-year college in the appropriate field of engineering,

1496 architecture, or building construction and has 1 year of proven
1497 experience in the category in which the person seeks to qualify.
1498 For the purpose of this part, a minimum of 2,000 person-hours
1499 |shall be used in determining full-time equivalency.

1500 2. Has a total of at least 4 years of active experience as
1501 a worker who has learned the trade by serving an apprenticeship
1502 as a skilled worker who is able to command the rate of a

1503 |mechanic in the particular trade or as a foreman who is in

1504 charge of a group of workers and usually is responsible to a
1505 superintendent or a contractor or his or her equivalent,

1506 |provided, however, that at least 1 year of active experience
1507 shall be as a foreman.

1508 3. Has a combination of not less than 1 year of experience
1509 as a foreman and not less than 3 years of credits for any

1510 accredited college-level courses; has a combination of not less
1511 than 1 year of experience as a skilled worker, 1 year of

1512 |experience as a foreman, and not less than 2 years of credits
1513 for any accredited college-level courses; or has a combination
1514 of not less than 2 years of experience as a skilled worker, 1
1515 year of experience as a foreman, and not less than 1 year of
1516 credits for any accredited college-level courses. All junior

1517 college or community college-level courses shall be considered

1518 accredited college-level courses.

Page 53 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

1519 4.a. An active certified residential contractor is eligible

1520 to receive a certified building contractor license after passing

1521 |or having previously passed #£ake the building contractors’

1522 |examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 3 years of
1523 |proven experience in the classification in which he or she is
1524 certified.

1525 b. An active certified residential contractor is eligible

1526 to receive a certified general contractor license after passing

1527 or having previously passed +ake the general contractors’

1528 |examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of
1529 |proven experience in the classification in which he or she is
1530 certified.

1531 c. An active certified building contractor is eligible to

1532 receive a certified general contractor license after passing or

1533 |having previously passed #£ake the general contractors’

1534 examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of
1535 |proven experience in the classification in which he or she is
1536 |certified.

1537 5.a. An active certified air-conditioning Class C

1538 contractor is eligible to receive a certified air-conditioning

1539 |Class B contractor license after passing or having previously

1540 |passed £ake the air-conditioning Class B contractors’

1541 examination if he or she possesses a minimum of 3 years of

1542 |proven experience in the classification in which he or she is
1543 |certified.

1544 b. An active certified air-conditioning Class C contractor

1545 is eligible to receive a certified air-conditioning Class A

1546 contractor license after passing or having previously passed

1547 |+ake the air-conditioning Class A contractors’ examination if he

Page 54 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1548
1549
1550
1551
1552
1553
1554
1555
1556
1557
1558
1559
1560
1561
1562
1563
1564
1565
1566
1567
1568
1569
1570
1571
1572
1573
1574
1575
1576

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of proven experience in
the classification in which he or she is certified.
c. An active certified air-conditioning Class B contractor

is eligible to receive a certified air-conditioning Class A

contractor license after passing or having previously passed

f£ake the air-conditioning Class A contractors’ examination if he
or she possesses a minimum of 1 year of proven experience in the
classification in which he or she is certified.

6.a. An active certified swimming pool servicing contractor

is eligible to receive a certified residential swimming pool

contractor license after passing or having previously passed

£ake the residential swimming pool contractors’ examination if
he or she possesses a minimum of 3 years of proven experience in
the classification in which he or she is certified.

b. An active certified swimming pool servicing contractor

is eligible to receive a certified commercial swimming pool

contractor license after passing or having previously passed

£ake the swimming pool commercial contractors’ examination if he
or she possesses a minimum of 4 years of proven experience in
the classification in which he or she is certified.

c. An active certified residential swimming pool contractor

is eligible to receive a certified commercial swimming pool

contractor license after passing or having previously passed

£ake the commercial swimming pool contractors’ examination if he
or she possesses a minimum of 1 year of proven experience in the
classification in which he or she is certified.

d. An applicant is eligible to receive a certified swimming

pool/spa servicing contractor license after passing or having

previously passed fake the swimming pool/spa servicing

Page 55 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1577
1578
1579
1580
1581
1582
1583
1584
1585
1586
1587
1588
1589
1590
1591
1592
1593
1594
1595
1596
1597
1598
1599
1600
1601
1602
1603
1604
1605

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

contractors’ examination if he or she has satisfactorily
completed 60 hours of instruction in courses related to the
scope of work covered by that license and approved by the
Construction Industry Licensing Board by rule and has at least 1
year of proven experience related to the scope of work of such a
contractor.

Section 63. Subsection (3) of section 489.115, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

489.115 Certification and registration; endorsement;
reciprocity; renewals; continuing education.—

(3) The board shall certify as qualified for certification
by endorsement any applicant who:

(a) Meets the requirements for certification as set forth
in this section; has passed a national, regional, state, or
United States territorial licensing examination that is
substantially equivalent to the examination required by this
part; and has satisfied the requirements set forth in s.
489.111;

(b) Holds a valid license to practice contracting issued by
another state or territory of the United States, if the criteria
for issuance of such license were substantially equivalent to
Florida’s current certification criteria; e

(c) Holds a wvalid, current license to practice contracting
issued by another state or territory of the United States, if
the state or territory has entered into a reciprocal agreement
with the board for the recognition of contractor licenses issued
in that state, based on criteria for the issuance of such
licenses that are substantially equivalent to the criteria for

certification in this state; or

Page 56 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1606
1607
1608
1609
1610
1611
1612
1613
1614
1615
1616
1617
1618
1619
1620
1621
1622
1623
1624
1625
1626
1627
1628
1629
1630
1631
1632
1633
1634

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

(d) Has held a valid, current license to practice

contracting issued by another state or territory of the United

States for at least 10 years before the date of application and

is applying for the same or similar license in this state,

subject to subsections (5)-(9). The board may consider whether

such applicant has had a license to practice contracting

revoked, suspended, or otherwise acted against by the licensing

authority of another state, territory, or country. Such

application must be made either when the license in another

state or territory is active or within 2 years after such

license was last active.

Section 64. Subsection (5) of section 489.511, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

489.511 Certification; application; examinations;
endorsement.—

(5) The board shall certify as qualified for certification
by endorsement any individual applying for certification who:

(a) Meets the requirements for certification as set forth
in this section; has passed a national, regional, state, or
United States territorial licensing examination that is
substantially equivalent to the examination required by this
part; and has satisfied the requirements set forth in s.
489.521; e

(b) Holds a valid license to practice electrical or alarm
system contracting issued by another state or territory of the
United States, if the criteria for issuance of such license was
substantially equivalent to the certification criteria that
existed in this state at the time the certificate was issued; or

(c) Has held a valid, current license to practice

Page 57 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1635
1636
1637
1638
1639
1640
1641
1642
1643
1644
1645
1646
1647
1648
1649
1650
1651
1652
1653
1654
1655
1656
1657
1658
1659
1660
1661
1662
1663

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

electrical or alarm system contracting issued by another state

or territory of the United States for at least 10 years before

the date of application and is applying for the same or similar

license in this state, subject to ss. 489.510 and 489.521(3) (a),

and subparagraph (1) (b)1l. Such application must be made either

when the license in another state or territory is active or

within 2 years after such license was last active.

Section 65. Subsection (3) and paragraph (b) of subsection
(4) of section 489.517, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

489.517 Renewal of certificate or registration; continuing
education.—

(3) Each certificateholder or registrant shall provide
proof, in a form established by rule of the board, that the
certificateholder or registrant has completed at least 11 +4
classroom hours of at least 50 minutes each of continuing
education courses during each biennium since the issuance or
renewal of the certificate or registration. The board shall by
rule establish criteria for the approval of continuing education
courses and providers and may by rule establish criteria for
accepting alternative nonclassroom continuing education on an
hour-for-hour basis.

(4)

(b) Of the 11 4 classroom hours of continuing education
required, at least 6 # hours must be on technical subjects, 1
hour on workers’ compensation, 1 hour on workplace safety, 1
hour on business practices, and for alarm system contractors and
electrical contractors engaged in alarm system contracting, 2
hours on false alarm prevention.

Section 66. Paragraph (b) of subsection (1) of section

Page 58 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1664
1665
1666
1667
1668
1669
1670
1671
1672
1673
1674
1675
1676
1677
1678
1679
1680
1681
1682
1683
1684
1685
1686
1687
1688
1689
1690
1691
1692

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

489.518, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

489.518 Alarm system agents.—

(1) A licensed electrical or alarm system contractor may
not employ a person to perform the duties of a burglar alarm
system agent unless the person:

(b) Has successfully completed a minimum of 14 hours of

training within 90 days after employment, to include basic alarm

system electronics in addition to related training including
CCTV and access control training, with at least 2 hours of
training in the prevention of false alarms. Such training shall
be from a board-approved provider, and the employee or applicant
for employment shall provide proof of successful completion to
the licensed employer. The board shall by rule establish
criteria for the approval of training courses and providers and
may by rule establish criteria for accepting alternative
nonclassroom education on an hour-for-hour basis. The board
shall approve providers that conduct training in other than the
English language. The board shall establish a fee for the
approval of training providers or courses, not to exceed $60.
Qualified employers may conduct training classes for their
employees, with board approval.

Section 67. Section 509.102, Florida Statutes, is created
to read:

509.102 Mobile food dispensing vehicles; preemption.—

(1) As used in this section, the term “mobile food

dispensing vehicle” means any vehicle that is a public food

service establishment and that is self-propelled or otherwise

movable from place to place and includes self-contained

utilities, including, but not limited to, gas, water,

Page 59 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1693
1694
1695
1696
1697
1698
1699
1700
1701
1702
1703
1704
1705
1706
1707
1708
1709
1710
1711
1712
1713
1714
1715
1716
1717
1718
1719
1720
1721

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

electricity, or liquid waste disposal.

(2) Regulation of mobile food dispensing vehicles involving

licenses, registrations, permits, and fees and the regulation of

the operation of mobile food dispensing vehicles is preempted to

the state. A municipality, county, or other local government

entity may not:

(a) Require a separate license, registration, or permit

other than the license required under s. 509.241, or require the

payment of any license, registration, or permit fee other than

the fee required under s. 509.251, as a condition for the

operation of a mobile food dispensing vehicle within the

entity’s jurisdiction;

(b) Prohibit mobile food dispensing vehicles from operating

within the entity’s jurisdiction.

Section 68. Paragraph (i) of subsection (2) of section
548.003, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

548.003 Florida State Boxing Commission.—

(2) The Florida State Boxing Commission, as created by
subsection (1), shall administer the provisions of this chapter.
The commission has authority to adopt rules pursuant to ss.
120.536(1) and 120.54 to implement the provisions of this
chapter and to implement each of the duties and responsibilities
conferred upon the commission, including, but not limited to:

(2 T ~ 4 2 nA At a Ao £ ] ~l T
T T T OTt oG o c e o O a Kot KGO WTT

o g n n
O LT T

o

Section 69. Subsection (1) of section 548.017, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:
548.017 Participants, managers, and other persons required

to have licenses.—

(1) A participant, manager, trainer, second, £imekeeper;

Page 60 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1722
1723
1724
1725
1726
1727
1728
1729
1730
1731
1732
1733
1734
1735
1736
1737
1738
1739
1740
1741
1742
1743
1744
1745
1746
1747
1748
1749
1750

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

referee, judge, amreuvnece¥r; physician, matchmaker, or promoter
must be licensed before directly or indirectly acting in such
capacity in connection with any match involving a participant. A
physician approved by the commission must be licensed pursuant
to chapter 458 or chapter 459, must maintain an unencumbered
license in good standing, and must demonstrate satisfactory
medical training or experience in boxing, or a combination of
both, to the executive director before working as the ringside
physician.

Section 70. Paragraph (d) of subsection (1) of section
553.5141, Florida Statutes, i1s amended to read:

553.5141 Certifications of conformity and remediation
plans.—

(1) For purposes of this section:

(d) “Qualified expert” means:

1. An engineer licensed pursuant to chapter 471.

2. A certified general contractor licensed pursuant to
chapter 489.

3. A certified building contractor licensed pursuant to
chapter 489.

4. A building code administrator licensed pursuant to
chapter 468.

5. A building inspector licensed pursuant to chapter 468.

6. A plans examiner licensed pursuant to chapter 468.

7. An interior designer registered dieenmsed pursuant to
chapter 481.

8. An architect licensed pursuant to chapter 481.
9. A landscape architect licensed pursuant to chapter 481.

10. Any person who has prepared a remediation plan related

Page 61 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1751
1752
1753
1754
1755
1756
1757
1758
1759
1760
1761
1762
1763
1764
1765
1766
1767
1768
1769
1770
1771
1772
1773
1774
1775
1776
1777
1778
1779

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

to a claim under Title III of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, 42 U.S.C. s. 12182, that has been accepted by a federal
court in a settlement agreement or court proceeding, or who has
been qualified as an expert in Title III of the Americans with
Disabilities Act, 42 U.S.C. s. 12182, by a federal court.

Section 71. Effective January 1, 2021, subsection (1) of
section 553.74, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

553.74 Florida Building Commission.—

(1) The Florida Building Commission is created and located
within the Department of Business and Professional Regulation
for administrative purposes. Members are appointed by the
Governor subject to confirmation by the Senate. The commission
is composed of 19 2% members, consisting of the following
members:

(a) One architect licensed pursuant to chapter 481 with at

least 5 years of experience in the design and construction of

buildings designated for Group E or Group I occupancies by the

g + nra~
O CcOo—pTratc

B

Florida Building Code xegistere

SNt crn] < oA 1 N
CTtcrvery CShgagSo——=Iir—Tt1

tHh

aA. The American Institute of

3
[,

[0)]
[0)]

1
[ S N i

gl

Architects, Florida Section, is encouraged to recommend a list
of candidates for consideration.

(b) One structural engineer registered to practice in this
state and actively engaged in the profession. The Florida
Engineering Society is encouraged to recommend a list of
candidates for consideration.

(c) One air-conditioning contractor, e¥ mechanical

contractor, or mechanical engineer certified to do business in

this state and actively engaged in the profession. The Florida

Air Conditioning Contractors Association, the Florida

Page 62 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1780
1781
1782
1783
1784
1785
1786
1787
1788
1789
1790
1791
1792
1793
1794
1795
1796
1797
1798
1799
1800
1801
1802
1803
1804
1805
1806
1807
1808

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

Refrigeration and Air Conditioning Contractors Association, and
the Mechanical Contractors Association of Florida, and the

Florida Engineering Society are encouraged to recommend a list

of candidates for consideration.

(d) One electrical contractor or electrical engineer

certified to do business in this state and actively engaged in
the profession. The Florida Association of Electrical
Contractors, amd the National Electrical Contractors

Association, Florida Chapter, and the Florida Engineering

Society are encouraged to recommend a list of candidates for

consideration.

{ \ On moamihawr £ £ Nraoatroact o n ner1 r 1

\C[ T T TTNO T 1T OTIT [N S S S Y tJ_L\JL,C\.zL,L\Jll Cll\lelCC.LLll\j A
+ ] ozt 1o ANtz xs Nty 4 1 Nrafoaoas n T
l,C\.zLJ.ll\JL\J\j_Y WIT e ) LAVL,LVCL_Y Cll\ju\jC\A LI T tJ_L\J_LCnJLJL\Jll [N N i )
i ra Ao O St r £ + 1 [« o + <z £ e Dr~t ok ] n Tnrnera ro A
[ S N N S S W & LJ.(.;LtJL,C.L L\ T b.)\J\.zLCL,_Y L\ i SR S S ) T T O C T T TCTIOUIT J._ALLKJLLLCCJ_LJ (@B aw §

oA At~ £ o g
CottOTr oo ctC STt o —COto=T

(e)+£)F One certified general contractor or one certified

building contractor certified to do business in this state and

actively engaged in the profession. The Associated Builders and
Contractors of Florida, the Florida Associated General

Contractors Council, the Florida Home Builders Association, and

the Union Contractors Association are encouraged to recommend a
list of candidates for consideration.

(f)4e> One plumbing contractor licensed to do business in
this state and actively engaged in the profession. The Florida
Association of Plumbing, Heating, and Cooling Contractors is
encouraged to recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

(g) ) One roofing or sheet metal contractor certified to

do business in this state and actively engaged in the

Page 63 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1809
1810
1811
1812
1813
1814
1815
1816
1817
1818
1819
1820
1821
1822
1823
1824
1825
1826
1827
1828
1829
1830
1831
1832
1833
1834
1835
1836
1837

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

profession. The Florida Roofing, Sheet Metal, and Air
Conditioning Contractors Association and the Sheet Metal and Air
Conditioning Contractors’ National Association are encouraged to
recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

(h)+43> One certified residential contractor licensed to do
business in this state and actively engaged in the profession.
The Florida Home Builders Association is encouraged to recommend
a list of candidates for consideration.

(1) 45> Three members who are municipal, county, or district
codes enforcement officials, one of whom is also a fire
official. The Building Officials Association of Florida and the
Florida Fire Marshals and Inspectors Association are encouraged

to recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

(7)4m)r One member of a Florida-based organization of

persons with disabilities or a nationally chartered organization

of persons with disabilities with chapters in this state which

complies with or is certified to be compliant with the

requirements of the Americans with Disability Act of 1990, as

amended.

(k) 4> One member of the manufactured buildings industry
who is licensed to do business in this state and is actively
engaged in the industry. The Florida Manufactured Housing
Association is encouraged to recommend a list of candidates for

consideration.

Page 64 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1838
1839
1840
1841
1842
1843
1844
1845
1846
1847
1848
1849
1850
1851
1852
1853
1854
1855
1856
1857
1858
1859
1860
1861
1862
1863
1864
1865
1866

Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

| REERRN =725

nractioan 2 +ha o oot A A St gzl A~ 2 A AL Ao o A
t/J.(_/LuL_J.uC LTT CITT 1O o C OO CT AT uuL_J.VCJ._Y Cll\ju\jcu LTT CTIT t/J.\JJ.C»._)»._)J.\JJ.l
T Fleorids T~ 3y Qg At 1o ne o~ 4+ roas e~~~ A o
T [ B S N S B W N & § J_lj.l\j [ S J__I_J.J.\j [ AN S ) L,_Y ) A i R LN W e u\j\/\A e a T O O UTTIITIT T TITOE
13 o+ £ Ao A At~ o Ao d A g A
L 1o T oL A\ @ B ¥ AW pu LW § & iy =] [ S N CUThHhOo 1T O C I OUTT
() O moamih s o ERP N Y N NP~ SN i I T EEE NI S E PN S P NN B A= P
\t// T R ANSY Y § ¥ WA wps my Wit =y (& J_\_,t/J_\_,Q\_,J.J.L_,uL_,_LV\_, g (& lllull_Lk/_Lt/u_L_LL./_Y A
PN SNENE Y SN Ntz Th Tleorads T Ao~ £ O+ a0oa and + 1 Tl arado
(=9 CITIITO T CT O \.z\JLAlll._Y- [ S o B L UL ITTUT™ J_ICDL\jLAC A LTI CTO Tt (SR i LI T U1 U™
Naoanea ot 3 A £ (Ot o PN ne raccaA roacsamman A o 7 0 o4+ £
IToo oo ITaTIUIT oL UOTIT T I TO a1 Cll\.z\JLA.LDL\jC\A Ry LT O UM TS (=9 [ Sy Wy o o
oan A1 Aot "o LA Ao d A g A
COTITOITIUOTOTT o [ S CUoUTT o I OOT 1O CIUlT

(1) +4e One member of the building products manufacturing
industry who is authorized to do business in this state and is
actively engaged in the industry. The Florida Building Material
Association, the Florida Concrete and Products Association, and
the Fenestration Manufacturers Association are encouraged to
recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

(m) ¥} One member who is a representative of the building
owners and managers industry who is actively engaged in
commercial building ownership or management. The Building Owners
and Managers Association is encouraged to recommend a list of
candidates for consideration.

(n)+4s> One member who is a representative of the insurance

industry. The Florida Insurance Council is encouraged to

recommend a list of candidates for consideration.

Tt

IS AU S Jpe PO A B P P
S Wt ) (& J_\.at/J_\./L)\./J.J.L.,L/LL.,_LV\./ e | B N e \Awaw . AT ITTCUTT

(+) O maoamis
T/ T IreTo

(o) 4w)> One member who is a swimming pool contractor
licensed to do business in this state and actively engaged in
the profession. The Florida Swimming Pool Association and the
United Pool and Spa Association are encouraged to recommend a
list of candidates for consideration.

(p) -+ One member who is a representative of the green

Page 65 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




1867
1868
1869
1870
1871
1872
1873
1874
1875
1876
1877
1878
1879
1880
1881
1882
1883
1884
1885
1886
1887
1888
1889
1890
1891
1892
1893
1894
1895

Florida Senate - 2020
Bill No. SB 474

COMMITTEE AMENDMENT

| REERRN =725

building industry and who is a third-party commission agent, a
Florida board member of the United States Green Building Council
or Green Building Initiative, a professional who is accredited

under the International Green Construction Code (IGCC), or a

professional who is accredited under Leadership in Energy and
Environmental Design (LEED).

(g) 4w)» One member who is a representative of a natural gas
distribution system and who is actively engaged in the
distribution of natural gas in this state. The Florida Natural
Gas Association is encouraged to recommend a list of candidates

for consideration.

{ \ On maoamhbhar 7 10 o v Ao ANt Ny £ +1h Dernayrtmaoant+ £+
X7 T ICMoCTT Wito— TS o Tt CpProStircatTrv e O oS oCpPpaor ottt OT
Nl ovar ] 9990 A A O~y Qasryzas Al ALL£4 A~ £ Ty Th
o rrcorcotrC—aortt OrroomCc ot v Cto T CC— O o ICTgy I
Commi oo Arn g £ Nerra oaa ] 49990 1o ne raoea A roacsamman A o 7 o o4+ +
Ot S o onC O I grrCtorcorC— o Critourragto—Cco—TrCComtCt—a TSt O

—Oremember—whoe—shall be—+theechairs

Section 73. Subsection (7) of section 558.002, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

558.002 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:

(7) “Design professional” means a person, as defined in s.

1.01, who is licensed in this state as an architect+—interior

gdesigner, a landscape architect, an engineer, a surveyor, Or a

geologist or who is a registered interior designer, as defined

481.203.

in s.

================= T I] TLE AMENDME N T ================
And the title is amended as follows:
Delete lines 7 - 189

and insert:

Page 66 of 73

1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

(TR

1896 Regulation; amending s. 322.57, F.S.; defining the
1897 term “servicemember”; requiring the Department of
1898 Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles to waive the

1899 requirement to pass the Commercial Driver License
1900 Skills Tests for certain servicemembers and veterans;
1901 requiring an applicant who receives such waiver to
1902 complete certain requirements within a specified time;
1903 requiring the department to adopt rules; amending s.
1904 326.004, F.S.; deleting the requirement that a yacht
1905 broker maintain a separate license for each branch
1906 office; deleting the requirement that the Division of
1907 Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes
1908 establish a fee; amending s. 447.02, F.S.; conforming
1909 provisions to changes made by the act; repealing s.
1910 447.04, F.S., relating to licensure and permit

1911 requirements for business agents; repealing s.

1912 447.041, F.S., relating to hearings for persons or
1913 labor organizations denied licensure as a business
1914 agent; repealing s. 447.045, F.S., relating to

1915 confidential information obtained during the

1916 application process; repealing s. 447.06, F.S.,

1917 relating to required registration of labor

1918 organizations; amending s. 447.09, F.S.; deleting
1919 certain prohibited actions relating to the right of
1920 franchise of a member of a labor organization;

1921 repealing s. 447.12, F.S., relating to registration
1922 fees; repealing s. 447.16, F.S., relating to

1923 applicability; amending s. 447.305, F.S.; deleting a
1924 provision that requires notification of registrations

Page 67 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

(TR

1925 and renewals to the Department of Business and

1926 Professional Regulation; amending s. 455.213, F.S.;
1927 requiring the department or a board to enter into

1928 reciprocal licensing agreements with other states

1929 under certain circumstances; providing requirements;
1930 amending s. 456.072, F.S.; specifying that the failure
1931 to repay certain student loans is not considered a
1932 failure to perform a statutory or legal obligation for
1933 which certain disciplinary action can be taken;

1934 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;

1935 repealing s. 456.0721, F.S., relating to health care
1936 practitioners who are in default on student loan or
1937 scholarship obligations; amending s. 456.074, F.S.;
1938 deleting a provision relating to the suspension of a
1939 license issued by the Department of Health for

1940 defaulting on certain student loans; amending s.

1941 468.385, F.S.; revising requirements relating to

1942 businesses auctioning or offering to auction property
1943 in this state; amending s. 468.603, F.S.; revising
1944 which inspectors are included in the definition of the
1945 term “categories of building code inspectors”;

1946 amending s. 468.613, F.S.; providing for waiver of
1947 specified requirements for certification under certain
1948 circumstances; amending s. 468.8314, F.S.; requiring
1949 an applicant for a license by endorsement to maintain
1950 a specified insurance policy; requiring the department
1951 to certify an applicant who holds a specified license
1952 issued by another state or territory of the United
1953 States under certain circumstances; amending s.

Page 68 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

A
1954 471.015, F.S.; revising licensure requirements for
1955 engineers who hold specified licenses in another
1956 state; amending s. 473.308, F.S.; deleting continuing
1957 education requirements for license by endorsement for
1958 certified public accountants; amending s. 474.202,
1959 F.S.; revising the definition of the term “limited-
1960 service veterinary medical practice” to include
1961 certain procedures; amending s. 474.207, F.S.;
1962 revising education requirements for licensure by
1963 examination; amending s. 474.217, F.S.; requiring the
1964 department to issue a license by endorsement to
1965 certain applicants who successfully complete a
19606 specified examination; amending s. 476.114, F.S.;
1967 revising training requirements for licensure as a
1968 barber; amending s. 476.144, F.S.; requiring the
1969 department to certify as qualified for licensure by
1970 endorsement an applicant who is licensed to practice
1971 barbering in another state; amending s. 477.013, F.S.;
1972 revising the definition of the term “hair braiding”;
1973 repealing s. 477.0132, F.S., relating to registration
1974 for hair braiding, hair wrapping, and body wrapping;
1975 amending s. 477.0135, F.S.; providing additional
1976 exemptions from license or registration requirements
1977 for specified occupations or practices; amending s.
1978 477.019, F.S.; deleting a provision prohibiting the
1979 Board of Cosmetology from asking for proof of certain
1980 educational hours under certain circumstances;
1981 revising requirements for certification of licensure
1982 by endorsement for a certain applicant to engage in

Page 69 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

(TR
1983 the practice of cosmetology; conforming provisions to
1984 changes made by the act; amending s. 477.0201, F.S.;
1985 providing requirements for registration as a
1986 specialist; amending s. 477.026, F.S.; conforming
1987 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
1988 477.0263, F.S.; providing that certain cosmetology
1989 services may be performed in a location other than a
1990 licensed salon under certain circumstances; amending
1991 ss. 477.0265 and 477.029, F.S.; conforming provisions
1992 to changes made by the act; amending s. 481.201, F.S.;
1993 deleting legislative findings relating to the practice
1994 of interior design; amending s. 481.203, F.S.;
1995 revising and deleting definitions; amending s.
1996 481.205, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
1997 by the act; amending s. 481.207, F.S.; authorizing the
1998 board to establish certain fees for certificates of
1999 registration for interior designers; specifying that
2000 such registration is valid for a specified period of
2001 time; authorizing registered interior designers to
2002 renew such registration; conforming provisions to
2003 changes made by the act; amending s. 481.209, F.S.;
2004 providing requirements for a certificate of
2005 registration and a seal for interior designers;
2006 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;
2007 amending s. 481.213, F.S.; revising requirements for
2008 certification of licensure by endorsement for a
2009 certain licensee to engage in the practice of
2010 architecture; providing that a registration is not
2011 required for specified persons to practice; conforming

Page 70 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

A

2012 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
2013 481.2131, F.S.; requiring certain interior designers
2014 to include a specified seal when submitting documents
2015 for the issuance of a building permit; amending s.
2016 481.215, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
2017 by the act; deleting a provision requiring a specified
2018 number of hours in certain courses for the renewal of
2019 a license; amending s. 481.217, F.S.; conforming

2020 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
2021 481.219, F.S.; deleting provisions permitting the

2022 practice of or offer to practice interior design

2023 through certain business organizations; deleting

2024 provisions requiring certificates of authorization for
2025 certain business organizations offering interior

2026 design services to the public; requiring a licensee or
2027 applicant in the practice of architecture to qualify
2028 as a business organization; providing requirements;
2029 amending s. 481.221, F.S.; conforming provisions to
2030 changes made by the act; requiring registered

2031 architects and certain business organizations to

2032 display certain license numbers in specified

2033 advertisements; amending s. 481.223, F.S.; providing
2034 construction; conforming provisions to changes made by
2035 the act; amending s. 481.2251, F.S.; revising the acts
2036 that constitute grounds for disciplinary actions

2037 relating to interior designers; conforming provisions
2038 to changes made by the act; amending ss. 481.229 and
2039 481.231, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
2040 by the act; amending s. 481.303, F.S.; deleting the

Page 71 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

(TR

2041 definition of the term “certificate of authorization”;
2042 amending s. 481.310, F.S.; providing that an applicant
2043 who holds certain degrees is not required to

2044 demonstrate 1 year of practical experience for

2045 licensure; amending s. 481.311, F.S.; revising

2046 requirements for certification of licensure by

2047 endorsement for a certain applicant to engage in the
2048 practice of landscape architecture; amending s.

2049 481.317, F.S.; conforming provisions to changes made
2050 by the act; amending s. 481.319, F.S.; deleting the
2051 requirement for a certificate of authorization;

2052 authorizing landscape architects to practice in the
2053 name of a corporation or partnership; amending s.

2054 481.321, F.S.; requiring a landscape architect to

2055 display a certain certificate number in specified

2056 advertisements; amending s. 481.329, F.S.; conforming
2057 a cross-reference; amending s. 489.103, F.S.; revising
2058 certain contract prices for exemption; amending s.
2059 489.111, F.S.; revising provisions relating to

2060 eligibility for licensure; amending s. 489.115, F.S.;
2061 requiring the Construction Industry Licensing Board to
2062 certify any applicant who holds a specified license to
2063 practice contracting issued by another state or

2064 territory of the United States under certain

2065 circumstances; amending s. 489.511, F.S.; requiring
2066 the board to certify as qualified for certification by
2067 endorsement any applicant who holds a specified

2068 license to practice electrical or alarm system

2069 contracting issued by another state or territory of

Page 72 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20




Florida Senate - 2020 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 474

A

2070 the United States under certain circumstances;

2071 amending s. 489.517, F.S.; providing a reduction in
2072 certain continuing education hours required for

2073 registered contractors; amending s. 489.518, F.S.;
2074 requiring a person to have completed a specified

2075 amount of training within a certain time period to
2076 perform the duties of an alarm system agent; creating
2077 s. 509.102; preempting the regulation of mobile food
2078 dispensing vehicles to the state; defining the term
2079 mobile food dispensing vehicle; amending s. 548.003,
2080 F.S.; deleting the requirement that the Florida State
2081 Boxing Commission adopt rules relating to a knockdown
2082 timekeeper; amending s. 548.017, F.S.; deleting the
2083 licensure requirement for a timekeeper or an

2084 announcer; amending s. 553.5141, F.S.; conforming
2085 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
2086 553.74, F.S.; revising the membership and

2087 qualifications of the Florida Building Commission;
2088 amending ss. 558.002, 559.25, and 287.055,

Page 73 of 73
1/17/2020 2:26:21 PM 580-02259B-20






