Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

By the Committees on Fiscal Policy; and Education Pre-K -12

594-01839-24 20247002c1

0 J o oo w N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
277
28
29

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

A bill to be entitled
An act relating to deregulation of public
schools/school district finance and budgets,
facilities, and administration and oversight; amending
s. 120.81, F.S.; providing that district school boards
are not subject to certain rule requirements under
certain circumstances; amending s. 163.31777, F.S.;
revising requirements for what a district school
board’s interlocal agreement must address; amending s.
200.065, F.S.; requiring a district school board to
advertise its intent to adopt a tentative budget on a
publicly available website if it does not advertise
such intent in a newspaper of general circulation;
defining the term “publicly accessible website”;
amending s. 252.38, F.S.; requiring district school
boards to provide personnel access to facilities for
emergency management, rather than staffing such
facilities, or perform other specified duties as may
be required in the county emergency management plan;
amending s. 316.173, F.S.; revising requirements for
signage that must be posted on certain school buses;
authorizing certain civil penalties to be used by a
district school board to recruit and retain specified
school bus drivers; amending s. 1001.02, F.S.;
revising a duty of the State Board of Education to
adopt certain rules; amending s. 1001.23, F.S.;
requiring the Department of Education to annually
inform district school superintendents that they may

petition to receive a specified declaratory statement;

Page 1 of 86

words underlined are additions.



30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

requiring the department to annually provide school
districts with a list of statutory and rule
requirements; providing requirements for such list;
amending s. 1001.372, F.S.; authorizing public notices
for district school board meetings to be posted on a
publicly accessible website or the official district
school board website; amending s. 1001.42, F.S.;
deleting requirements for financial procedures that
must be followed by district school boards to ensure
adequate educational facilities for students; amending
s. 1001.49, F.S.; revising the general powers of
district school superintendents to include
establishing a process for the review and approval of
certain policies and procedures through the delegated
authority of district school boards; amending s.
1002.20, F.S.; revising a requirement relating to how
a parent is informed of placement of a student in a
specified program; revising a requirement relating to
how a parent is informed of a student’s suspension;
deleting a requirement that the school financial
report be in the student handbook; requiring the
department to produce specified reports relating to
school accountability and make such reports available
on the department’s website; requiring each school
district to provide a link to such reports; deleting a
requirement that an economic security report of
employment and earning outcomes be provided to
students; amending s. 1002.33, F.S.; deleting a

requirement for an unused district school board

Page 2 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

facility or property to be provided for a charter
school’s use; revising a requirement for school
districts to provide certain information relating to
vacant classrooms to the department; amending s.
1002.333, F.S.; revising a provision authorizing
school districts to make certain unused facilities
available to hope operators; amending s. 1003.03,
F.S.; deleting a requirement for district school
boards to provide an accountability plan to the
Commissioner of Education under certain conditions;
amending s. 1003.53, F.S.; revising how district
school boards may provide notice to parents relating
to a dropout prevention and academic intervention
program; repealing s. 1006.025, F.S., relating to
guidance services; amending s. 1006.09, F.S.; revising
how a school principal or the principal’s designee may
provide notice to inform a parent of a student’s
suspension; amending s. 1006.1494, F.S.; providing
that provisions relating to student online personal
information protection do not require a K-12 school,
school district, or school board to include any
provisions in an operator or vendor contract; amending
s. 1010.02, F.S.; providing that school districts are
subject to varying reporting frequencies based on
financial status; requiring the State Board of
Education to adopt rules; amending s. 1010.11, F.S.;
providing that school districts are exempt from
certain requirements relating to electronic transfer

of funds; amending s. 1010.20, F.S.; requiring charter

Page 3 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
88 schools to respond to monitoring questions from the
89 department; amending s. 1011.03, F.S.; requiring
90 district school boards to publish their tentative
91 budgets on a publicly accessible website if not
92 published on the district’s official website; deleting
93 a requirement for district school boards to publish
94 their tentative budgets in a newspaper or at a
95 courthouse under certain circumstances; amending s.
96 1011.035, F.S.; revising requirements relating to a
97 district school board publishing its tentative budget
98 online; amending s. 1011.14, F.S.; revising the types
99 of facilities on which district school boards may
100 incur certain financial obligations; amending s.
101 1011.60, F.S.; revising circumstances under which the
102 State Board of Education may alter the requirement for
103 the minimum term schools must be open; amending s.
104 1011.68, F.S.; deleting a prohibition on use of funds
105 by school districts to purchase certain transportation
106 equipment and supplies; amending s. 1011.69, F.S.;
107 deleting a requirement relating to Title I fund
108 allocations to schools; providing a new category of
109 funding school districts are authorized to withhold;
110 revising a category of funding a school district is
111 authorized to withhold; requiring the department to
112 make certain funds available to local education
113 agencies; amending s. 1011.71, F.S.; revising the
114 types of facilities and expenditures for which
115 district school boards may use millage levies to fund;
116 amending s. 1013.15, F.S.; conforming provisions to

Page 4 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
117 changes made by the act; providing that the lease-
118 purchase of certain facilities is exempt from certain
119 requirements; making a technical change; amending s.
120 1013.16, F.S.; providing that a minimum lease term
121 requirement for land for certain construction projects
122 does not apply to district school boards; amending s.
123 1013.19, F.S.; requiring proceeds from certain sales
124 or leases of property to be used by boards of trustees
125 for a Florida College System institution or state
126 university; amending s. 1013.20, F.S.; deleting a
127 district school board requirement to plan for the use
128 of relocatables; deleting a requirement for the
129 commissioner to provide a progress report to the
130 Legislature; repealing s. 1013.21, F.S., relating to
131 reduction of relocatable facilities in use; amending
132 s. 1013.28, F.S.; deleting a requirement for surplus
133 tangible personal property to be provided to charter
134 schools; amending s. 1013.31, F.S.; requiring each
135 Florida College System institution board of trustees
136 and state university board of trustees to arrange for
137 educational plant surveys; deleting provisions
138 relating to when an educational plant survey
139 recommendation is not required; requiring Florida
140 College System institution and state university
141 boards, but not district school boards, to participate
142 in specified surveys; deleting a requirement for
143 school districts to submit certain data to the
144 department; revising requirements for what a survey
145 report must include; deleting a requirement that a

Page 5 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
146 school district’s survey must be submitted as part of
147 the district educational facilities plan; deleting a
148 requirement for the department to perform an analysis
149 of such surveys; revising requirements for a
150 facilities needs survey submitted by a district school
151 board; requiring that the release of funds for a PECO
152 project be subject to certain authorizations; amending
153 s. 1013.35, F.S.; deleting definitions; revising
154 requirements for the contents of a district school
155 board tentative district educational facilities plan;
156 deleting a requirement for district school boards to
157 coordinate with local governments to ensure
158 consistency between school district and local
159 government plans; authorizing, rather than requiring,
160 local governments to review tentative district
161 educational facilities plans; making conforming
162 changes; amending s. 1013.356, F.S.; revising
163 requirements for lease terms for certain construction
164 projects; deleting a requirement relating to certain
165 construction costs; amending s. 1013.385, F.S.;
166 deleting requirements for a resolution relating to
167 educational facilities construction which may be
168 adopted by district school boards; providing that
169 exceptions to requirements for public shelter design
170 criteria remain subject to certain emergency
171 management provisions; providing that a school board
172 may not be required to build more emergency-shelter
173 space than identified as needed; amending s. 1013.41,
174 F.S.; revising requirements for an educational

Page 6 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
175 facilities plan; revising the duties of the Office of
176 Educational Facilities; amending s. 1013.45, F.S.;
177 exempting district school boards from certain contract
178 limitations; specifying that a requirement for the
179 services of a registered architect apply to Florida
180 College System institution and state university boards
181 of trustees; deleting a requirement for district
182 school boards to reuse existing construction
183 documents; amending s. 1013.48, F.S.; deleting a
184 requirement for a school district to monitor and
185 report change orders on a district educational
186 facilities plan; amending s. 1013.64, F.S.; providing
187 that remodeling projects for district school boards
188 must be based on specified determinations; providing
189 that a requirement for how certain funds must be spent
190 only applies to Florida College System institution and
191 state university boards; revising requirements for the
192 use of funds from the Special Facility Construction
193 Account; deleting prohibitions on the use of specified
194 funds that meet certain thresholds; requiring the
195 department to estimate, rather than review and adjust,
196 the cost per student station to reflect actual
197 construction costs; deleting a requirement for the
198 Auditor General to review certain documentation;
199 deleting requirements relating to district school
200 board use of funds for construction projects; amending
201 s. 1013.68, F.S.; revising requirements for a school
202 district to receive a specified distribution of funds;
203 amending ss. 163.3180, 1002.31, 1003.621, 1003.631,

Page 7 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
204 1011.6202, 1011.73, 1012.555, and 1013.62, F.S.;
205 conforming cross-references and provisions to changes
206 made by the act; providing an effective date.

207
208| Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
209
210 Section 1. Paragraph (m) is added to subsection (1) of
211 section 120.81, Florida Statutes, to read:

212 120.81 Exceptions and special requirements; general areas.—
213 (1) EDUCATIONAL UNITS.—
214 (m) District school boards are not subject to the

215 requirements for rules in this chapter when exercising their

216| powers and duties identified in chapters 1000-1014 to formulate

217| policy with public input at a public meeting.

218 Section 2. Paragraphs (e) and (f) of subsection (2) and

219 subsection (4) of section 163.31777, Florida Statutes, are

220 amended to read:

221 163.31777 Public schools interlocal agreement.—

2272 (2) At a minimum, the interlocal agreement must address the
223 following issues:

224 (e) A process for the school board to inform the local

225 government regarding the effect of comprehensive plan amendments
226 on school capacity. The capacity reporting must be consistent
227 with laws and rules relating to measurement of school facility
228 capacity and must also identify how the district school board
229 will meet the public school demand based on the facilities plan
230| werk—program adopted pursuant to s. 1013.35.

231 (f) Participation of the local governments in the

232| preparation of the annual update to the district school board’s

Page 8 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




233
234
235
236
237
238
239
240
241
242
243
244
245
246
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
S—year—distriet facilities plan werk—program andeducationat

prant—suvrvey prepared pursuant to s. 1013.35.
(4) At the time of the evaluation and appraisal of its

comprehensive plan pursuant to s. 163.3191, each exempt
municipality shall assess the extent to which it continues to
meet the criteria for exemption under subsection (3). If the
municipality continues to meet the criteria for exemption under
subsection (3), the municipality shall continue to be exempt
from the interlocal agreement requirement. Each municipality
exempt under subsection (3) must comply with this section within

1 year after the district school board proposes, in its S—year

district facilities plan werk—pregram, a new school within the
municipality’s Jjurisdiction.

Section 3. Paragraph (f) of subsection (2) of section
200.065, Florida Statutes, 1is amended to read:

200.065 Method of fixing millage.—

(2) No millage shall be levied until a resolution or
ordinance has been approved by the governing board of the taxing
authority which resolution or ordinance must be approved by the
taxing authority according to the following procedure:

(f)1. Notwithstanding any provisions of paragraph (c) to
the contrary, each school district shall advertise its intent to

adopt a tentative budget on a publicly accessible website

pursuant to s. 50.0311 or in a newspaper of general circulation

pursuant to subsection (3) within 29 days of certification of

value pursuant to subsection (1). For the purpose of this

paragraph, the term “publicly accessible website” includes a

district school board’s official website if the school board

website satisfies the remaining requirements of s. 50.0311. Not

Page 9 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




262
263
264
265
266
267
268
269
270
271
272
273
274
275
276
277
278
279
280
281
282
283
284
285
286
287
288
289
290

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
less than 2 days or more than 5 days thereafter, the district
shall hold a public hearing on the tentative budget pursuant to
the applicable provisions of paragraph (c). In the event of
postponement or recess due to a declared state of emergency, the
school district may postpone or recess the hearing for up to 7
days and shall post a prominent notice at the place of the
original hearing showing the date, time, and place where the
hearing will be reconvened. The posted notice shall measure not
less than 8.5 by 11 inches. The school district shall make every
reasonable effort to provide reasonable notification of the
continued hearing to the taxpayers. The information must also be

posted on the school district’s website if the district school

board uses a different method of advertisement.

2. Notwithstanding any provisions of paragraph (b) to the
contrary, each school district shall advise the property
appraiser of its recomputed proposed millage rate within 35 days
of certification of value pursuant to subsection (1). The
recomputed proposed millage rate of the school district shall be
considered its proposed millage rate for the purposes of
paragraph (b).

3. Notwithstanding any provisions of paragraph (d) to the
contrary, each school district shall hold a public hearing to
finalize the budget and adopt a millage rate within 80 days of
certification of value pursuant to subsection (1), but not
earlier than 65 days after certification. The hearing shall be
held in accordance with the applicable provisions of paragraph
(d), except that a newspaper advertisement need not precede the
hearing.

Section 4. Paragraph (d) of subsection (1) of section

Page 10 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
291 252.38, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:
292 252 .38 Emergency management powers of political
293| subdivisions.—Safeguarding the life and property of its citizens
294 is an innate responsibility of the governing body of each
295| political subdivision of the state.
296 (1) COUNTIES.—
297 (d) During a declared state or local emergency and upon the
298 request of the director of a local emergency management agency,
299| the district school board or school boards in the affected area
300| shall participate in emergency management by providing
301 facilities and necessary personnel to access staff such

302 facilities or perform other duties related to the facilities as

303| may be required pursuant to the county emergency management plan

304 and program. Each school board providing transportation

305 assistance in an emergency evacuation shall coordinate the use
306 of its wvehicles and personnel with the local emergency

307| management agency.

308 Section 5. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) and subsection
309 (7) of section 316.173, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
310 316.173 School bus infraction detection systems.—

311 (2) (a) The school district must post high—visibility

312| ¥efleetive signage on the rear of each school bus in which a
313 school bus infraction detection system is installed and

314 operational which indicates the use of such system. The signage
315| must be in the form of one or more signs or stickers and must
316| contain the following elements in substantially the following
317 form:

318 1. The words “STOP WHEN RED LIGHTS FLASH” or “DO NOT PASS
319 WHEN RED LIGHTS FLASH.”

Page 11 of 86
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
320 2. The words “CAMERA ENFORCED.”
321 3. A graphic depiction of a camera.
322 (7) The civil penalties assessed and collected for a

323| wviolation of s. 316.172(1) (a) or (b) enforced by a school bus
324 infraction detection system must be remitted to the school

325 district in which the violation occurred. Such civil penalties
326| must be used for the installation or maintenance of school bus
327 infraction detection systems on school buses, for any other
328 technology that increases the safety of the transportation of
329 students, e¥ for the administration and costs associated with
330 the enforcement of violations as described in this section, or

y -

331 to provide financial awards to recruit or retain school bus

332 drivers in the school district in which the civil penalties are

333 assessed and collected.

334 Section 6. Paragraph (n) of subsection (2) of section

335 1001.02, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

336 1001.02 General powers of State Board of Education.—
337 (2) The State Board of Education has the following duties:
338 (n) To adopt cohesive rules pursuant to ss. 120.536(1) and

339 120.54, within statutory authority as specifically provided by
340 law.

341 Section 7. Subsections (5) and (6) are added to section

342 1001.23, Florida Statutes, to read:

343 1001.23 Specific powers and duties of the Department of

344 Education.—In addition to all other duties assigned to it by law
345 or by rule of the State Board of Education, the department

346 shall:

347 (5) Annually by August 1, inform district school

348 superintendents that pursuant to s. 120.565, the superintendents

Page 12 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




349
350
351
352
353
354
355
356
357
358
359
360
361
362
363
364
365
366
367
368
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376
377

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

may receive a declaratory statement, within 90 days of

submitting a petition to receive such statement, regarding the

department’s opinion as to the applicability to a school

district of a statutory or rule provision as it applies to the

district’s particular set of circumstances.

(6) Annually maintain and make available to school

districts a list of all requirements in statute and rule

relating to required actions by district school boards or

superintendents. The list must include, but is not limited to,

required parent notifications; information that must be posted

to the district website; and reporting, filing, and

certification requirements.

Section 8. Paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of section
1001.372, Florida Statutes, 1is amended to read:

1001.372 District school board meetings.—

(2) PLACE OF MEETINGS.—

(c) For purpose of this section, due public notice shall

consist of, at least 2 days prior to the meeting: continuous

publication on a publicly accessible website as provided in s.

50.0311 or the official district school board website; by

publication in a newspaper of general circulation in the county
or in each county where there is no newspaper of general
circulation in the county an announcement over at least one
radio station whose signal is generally received in the county,
a reasonable number of times daily during the 48 hours
immediately preceding the date of such meeting;+ or by posting a
notice at the courthouse door if no newspaper is published in

the county—at—deast 2 days—prier—to—the meetin

J.J.g .
Section 9. Paragraph (1) of subsection (12) of section

Page 13 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

P
—H . ® E @ h
HOE D ® -
.. D ¢ D ~ 4D b) « W My
o = OB ST E T SR ) [ SO )
o 1) -H B @ o D b D 4
EH ®© —  H N o-H H PP B N D
_ 0] o O n |+ T © P -H D up o .
QO iE) Q D P ¥ ¢ ¢ P oW TS U1} N [op)
T 0 © L @ D ®© H ¢ ©| D 4P OV OO ) 4P o 4D
g A 3 O O O B O D & - D @ H @ K D ¢
© O o “ 0] N Y -H P D -1 T £ - D &Y D O] D
O 4 O B Q §O] D @ 4 v iy P 0, (N OF
Q 0 o O +HA ¢ H B H O | Q c @ (] D
b S O H c ® O © P O D T 0 D Ko H Y
— 0] O O 4 )] -H @ D D @ D [0} ®
O n O w D D H W D -4 4 & ¥ ¢ @ O ORI
o - i “ 0] — ¢ P @ D [T o - ~ @ -H
PR e S [« o T D @ O b > v [op) - [09) ® HORENO)]
T O ®© Q Q. Y T W D o W @ n P D ¢ B
® n g HO R © @ D H Y D D D D D 9] . ] ®
0] n +» S5 © ® O F H D . & [49] O SR O N W
(U z P+ © ool () & b n = - e D D
O ~ O n @] D ~ -1 B ® H ® D 0 Y D oo s
O A T o O 4@ D D D YH D -H — D ~ [0} B ® P
) S “ 0] 0] © T R ] @ W &Y Wy D Ky b D T 99 ) H [ON
P © QO 4 o ®© [ I D @© ¢ ® D 4 E H -t D D
o n O o (R L )] Ho QP . P F ¢
O 4+ O T n YH o -fd f© P £ & T R (VI T 0 o N ON
T O O 0 — D H © H H D ¢ P . D
q ° @ o O ~ ~ H N D ® o [0} D D D - 9] [ON —
O wH 9] Nl Hoo (O [O2IS ] 0] ® n -H [ BT b D
g O w A O P D ® & & O © O W )] 4 @ D & P
] @ — o 4 D @© ¢ ¢ W D T D P T © ©N @
0 Nl el S () [OFI )] P ¢ ¢ O ST I ()} MO} [op)
9] QO o wm 0 O ®© T P Y =il #+ -H Y - D -H ® [om [on
—H 4 o 0 o 3 S O 4 O T YW B F P D ¢ O, U ® -H ¥
£ 4 -4 O O O b g o & O 14 0 P # OF & D 4 . D
[ N S S s . OO T, - ¢ B SR (VR () ¢ © N 4 D ™ D 4
n T O i} n g o " O P -H [on n -H ® 4H D [0} D o -
0] @ O I D @ B H P © D ¢ N D > ¢ B & P
IR Q 4 B ~ © © P ¢ D D Y D @ ™G ¢ ¢ D
S5 a ~ 4 X ®n n W & @ ¢ ¢ -4 @ @ D 4 4P BT LY. R o D & @
D © T 4 ®© O 4 T & D D Wt 4P N -H O -H P H (o))
(] 49 © H A O B ¢ -H @© -H ® D ~NopE @ W D D —
+ 0 © | L P ® — @ P ® D 0] ® D -H ® 9] Y 4y ®
n 4 O & c o+ O ™ H ¢ 0 @& @ N P ® D -H QB D &
o 9 49 i 4 © | ¢ -f b & ¢ B n© ¢ P ~ O O ¢ P g T H
© = o u -+ g e - & 4P B D -H ® [OMENO] oo -H - ® D D D
T O 4 XYW =2 O O & ®» [l D D B @ W H Y -H P b b
-~y (@] 4« © 4 -H D -H @ D ~ HO)J (VY | Uy ® 0] )] ® @
S O 0 =Z wHW o 9 D B | D ® ® ¢ D & O ¢ D ¢ -H
O N <o Q, H -—=H 4 [ NET()] D fH o b K] 4y [ON ® M
—~ < 0 m T 0 v 8 OO O -H P D & D ¢« o ¢ 0
Fo « w O © T M P £ -H ! D Tl D . & @ 4@ -H o @ @
— c ~ g o YH D B P @ B O O = A~ LI = I VRS PR T =
. O P T « @] N o~ D WH © D D
N O O — A A H O D D L @ oW CRIG) . . . . . . . .
SHEE S T B B G S T s L ) T H - D ® D @ v o W O & o
. ST s O K TR D B Wl N ©
— i} 0] 0o <o H D O, -H @,
o n z 5P O D O H D ©
o -4 O T 3 -t O ¢ D D o
— T O O ®© HO) D © -H ) D ®
0 O O 4 N OO < N W >~ 0w O O 4 N M <L 0 W I~ W o O H N M < N W
I~ [~ 0 0 0 0 W W 0 W W W O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O O
M M M M MO MO MO O O O O O O O O O OO0~ o0OoO0o»"0$$@ Lo

Page 14 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




407
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416
417
418
419
420
421
422
423
424
425
426
427
428
429
430
431
432
433
434
435

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
r heyr £FarAdam~ya A A~ g A~ T x4+ +he Ad ot g~ o~ 1 bhoeaord
. - TTC1T J.J.LLMJ.Ll\j»._) AT J.Ct/\JJ.L_ |\ S i S W W U (- a—y CTIT |\ S EArUD i U S S W W [ ) i L W 4w g L AW L I mpw §
b ran~»A PN Aociima s+ At o EPSENP TR o Sl BV RPN S BN =N 2SN NE SIS
P AW AW ) I - \/VJ—\A, LJLA.LJ J—, \WAWAWRw NS J.J.L.,, \Auk_,u, 7 [SSJJLW N S SR S W T LT TITT T OUOT T T 1T OUTT
noecAa o + conditoat o o~~~ a0 LS EE N I NENE I PN ha ~h
J.J.\./k/\./uou__Y ja \SZAW N I AW i W I U wy (& t/J_Ut/\./J_ (&% L AWy wy A Ay €% 11 ) 1) A N Ry Iy @ R WP S N O WITITCOTT T
Tty EEEPAEIE SNV BP S G T BN SO NE 1 i SNNE S 20N R norfarm 260 ol A~
LTTT C T T ITO I (& N W i Sy WP W =) LJ_Y LTV OO CITOIT 250 -y tJC.L.L\J.Llll =y OLAUJC\/L Ry
+ 1 Brosrl g na £ o 117 47 (1) A (4
T tJ_L\JVLLJL\JllLJ L O e i S EERE= AT \ T/

Section 10. Subsection (3) of section 1001.49, Florida
Statutes, 1s amended to read:

1001.49 General powers of district school superintendent.—
The district school superintendent shall have the authority, and

when necessary for the more efficient and adequate operation of
the district school system, the district school superintendent
shall exercise the following powers:

(3)
AUTHORITY OF THE DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD.—Establish a process for

APPROVE OPERATIONAL POLICIES THROUGH THE DELEGATED

the review and approval of districtwide policies and procedures,

through the formal delegated authority of the district school
board, RECOMMEND—POLICIES-—Recommend—to—thedistriet——sechoolt

2N 11k

g f S A At o o
A S oo P TtTro—S ottt

Siesa Sea potieies pertaining to the district
school system as the district school superintendent may consider
necessary for its more efficient operation.

(e)

and subsections

Section 11. Paragraph
(4),

Florida Statutes,

of subsection (2),
(16) (24)

are amended to read:

paragraph (a)

of subsection and of section
1002.20,
1002.20 K-12 student and parent rights.—Parents of public
school students must receive accurate and timely information
regarding their child’s academic progress and must be informed

of ways they can help their child to succeed in school. K-12

Page 15 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

words underlined are additions.



436
437
438
439
440
441
442
443
444
445
446
447
448
449
450
451
452
453
454
455
456
457
458
459
460
461
462
463
464

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
students and their parents are afforded numerous statutory
rights including, but not limited to, the following:

(2) ATTENDANCE.-—

(e) Dropout prevention and academic intervention programs.—
The parent of a public school student has the right to receive

written notice by certified mail or other method agreed to by

the parent prior to placement of the student in a dropout
prevention and academic intervention program and shall be
notified in writing and entitled to an administrative review of
any action by school personnel relating to the student’s
placement, in accordance with the provisions of s. 1003.53(5).

(4) DISCIPLINE.-—

(a) Suspension of public school student.—In accordance with
the provisions of s. 1006.09(1)-(4):

1. A student may be suspended only as provided by rule of
the district school board. A good faith effort must be made to
immediately inform the parent by telephone of the student’s
suspension and the reason. Each suspension and the reason must
be reported in writing within 24 hours to the parent by United
States mail or other method agreed to by the parent. A good

faith effort must be made to use parental assistance before
suspension unless the situation requires immediate suspension.

2. A student with a disability may only be recommended for
suspension or expulsion in accordance with State Board of
Education rules.

(16) SCHOOL ACCOUNTABILITY AND SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT RATING
REPORTS; FISCAL TRANSPARENCY.—Parents of public school students
have the right to an easy-to-read report card about the school’s

grade designation or, if applicable under s. 1008.341, the

Page 16 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




465
466
467
468
469
470
471
472
473
474
475
476
477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487
488
489
490
491
492
493

Florida Senate

594-01839-24

school’s improvement rating,

report,
S.
parents

student

a1 At
o

1010.

2024 Cs for SB 7002

20247002c1
and the school’s accountability
including the school financial report as required under
215. The school financial report must be provided to the
and indicate the average amount of money expended per
in the school;—whiehmust—alse—beincludedin—+the

o2 ma
o LIt

The department shall

o
=] 1T C

produce

the reports under this subsection and make the reports

for each school available on the department’s website in

a

prominent location. Each public school district must prov

ide a

link on its website to these reports for parent access.

Section 12. Paragraphs (e) and (g) of subsection (18) of
section 1002.33, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1002.33 Charter schools.—

(18) FACILITIES.—

(e) FH—adistriet—school beoardFfacility or property—is
PN I I N | T o B P I R P marlead £ s oo o]
(&8 [ € N S 6P B 7 LV ANSLUPY & I W i I J Ju =y QUJ_LJ_LUQI T I T O [N S N \.A._LQLJ\JQL/L_L, A
+hh g o 111 aand 1+ ah~11 2N nroszidad FAar N At Ay o~ 17 &
O CITCT W IO T ULIUOC\A, [ [ B Iy & R S iy j Ay tJ_LUV_L\J.C\J. [ S N (@ LN I N 6P R Sy U e [S AN i B A [=)
17 n +h o oot o o 1+ 1T a0 maA ~xzn2 1 11 + +hoar a4
L& ey 1T LS i B ey o LI TS WO &) [ i ) T [ NV €5 R E Sy 6P I N S ) | O CITTIC T tJL/lJ\J_L_L\/
sehoots—in—thedistriet- A charter school that receives surplus,

marked for disposal,

property from the sponsor may not sell or dispose of such

facilities or property without written permission of the

Page 17 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are

or otherwise unused facilities or reeeiving

additions.




494
495
496
497
498
499
500
501
502
503
504
505
506
507
508
509
510
511
512
513
514
515
516
517
518
519
520
521
522

Florida Senate - 2024

594-01839-24
sponsor. Similarly,

charter status,

CS for SB 7002

20247002c1

for an existing public school converting to

no rental or leasing fee for the existing

facility or for the property normally inventoried to the

conversion school may be charged by the district school board to

the parents and teachers organizing the charter school.

The

charter school shall agree to reasonable maintenance provisions

in order to maintain the facility in a manner similar to

district school board standards.

The Public Education Capital

Outlay maintenance funds or any other maintenance funds

generated by the facility operated as a conversion school shall

remain with the conversion school.

(9)

Each school district shall annually provide to the

£S5 ptan the

IRV |
WO T

Department of Education as—part—ef

ISR TP NENE
oy oo

number of existing vacant classrooms in each school that the

district does not intend to use or does not project will be

needed for educational purposes for the following school year.

The department may recommend that a district make such space

available to an appropriate charter school.

Section 13. Paragraph (d)

of subsection

of section

(7)

1002.333, Florida Statutes, 1is amended to read:

1002.333 Persistently low-performing schools.—

(7) FACILITIES.—

(d) A school district may make available Ne—Zater—than
Jantary—+—Ehedepartment shall annvally provide—to——schoot
eHstriets—a tist—eof att underused, vacant, or surplus facilities

Page 18 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

words underlined are additions.




523
524
525
526
527
528
529
530
531
532
533
534
535
536
537
538
539
540
541
542
543
544
545
546
547
548
549
550
551

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

of hope may use—an—ecduecationalfaecility identified in—+this
paragraph at no cost or at a mutually agreeable cost not to
exceed $600 per student. A hope operator using a facility
pursuant to this paragraph may not sell or dispose of such
facility without the written permission of the school district.
For purposes of this paragraph, the term “underused, wvacant, or
surplus facility” means an entire facility or portion thereof
which is not fully used or is used irregularly or intermittently
by the school district for instructional or program use.

Section 14. Subsection (4) of section 1003.03, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

1003.03 Maximum class size.—

S SRR, [P, PNV Y- S I PP A Adat st ot ol 1T beard o4
J.CLJ_LLALA._L_Y - T tJ_Lull |\ WPRN S Ul S S S WL W ) LJ_Y T 1o T I CTC [ Y i A W 4w g =y LA L i upw § I T
Aecmrilhace +1 P R L S L P S, 1 P R S L e s I S| KN el
A\ S WP WD J WP S B WA uSa ) T L)t/\./\./_LJ__L\./ o T I UTTO T |\ N EUUD I WS S S W LA/ S CTOIN T [ S |\ S W & uea
Qe+l £+ LT T atrdmer ol 1 sz

C OO0 T1IO A T J—\J_L_L\JVV_LJ.J.& =] TR0 1T _Y\_/(_/LJ_

Section 15. Subsection (5) of section 1003.53, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

1003.53 Dropout prevention and academic intervention.—

(5) Each district school board providing a dropout
prevention and academic intervention program pursuant to this

section shall maintain for each participating student records

Page 19 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
552 documenting the student’s eligibility, the length of
553| participation, the type of program to which the student was
554| assigned or the type of academic intervention services provided,
555| and an evaluation of the student’s academic and behavioral
556| performance while in the program. The school principal or his or
557 her designee shall, prior to placement in a dropout prevention
558 and academic intervention program or the provision of an
559| academic service, provide written notice of placement or
560| services by certified mail, return receipt requested, to the
561 student’s parent. The parent of the student shall sign an
562 acknowledgment of the notice of placement or service and return
563 the signed acknowledgment to the principal within 3 days after

564 receipt of the notice. District school boards may adopt a policy

565 that allows a parent to agree to an alternative method of

566| notification. Such agreement may be made before the need for

567 notification arises or at the time the notification becomes

568 required. The parents of a student assigned to such a dropout
569| prevention and academic intervention program shall be notified
570 in writing and entitled to an administrative review of any

571 action by school personnel relating to such placement pursuant
572 to the provisions of chapter 120.

573 Section 16. Section 1006.025, Florida Statutes, is

574 repealed.
575 Section 17. Paragraph (b) of subsection (1) of section
576 1006.09, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

577 1006.09 Duties of school principal relating to student

578 discipline and school safety.—

579 (1)

580 (b) The principal or the principal’s designee may suspend a

Page 20 of 86
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




581
582
583
584
585
586
587
588
589
590
591
592
593
594
595
596
597
598
599
600
601
602
603
604
605
606
607
608
609

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
student only in accordance with the rules of the district school
board. The principal or the principal’s designee shall make a
good faith effort to immediately inform a student’s parent by
telephone of a student’s suspension and the reasons for the
suspension. Each suspension and the reasons for the suspension
shall be reported in writing within 24 hours to the student’s

parent by United States mail. District school boards may adopt a

policy that allows a parent to agree to an alternative method of

notification. Such agreement may be made before the need for

notification arises or at the time the notification becomes

required. Each suspension and the reasons for the suspension
shall also be reported in writing within 24 hours to the
district school superintendent. A good faith effort shall be
made by the principal or the principal’s designee to employ
parental assistance or other alternative measures prior to
suspension, except in the case of emergency or disruptive
conditions which require immediate suspension or in the case of
a serious breach of conduct as defined by rules of the district
school board. Such rules shall require oral and written notice
to the student of the charges and an explanation of the evidence
against him or her prior to the suspension. Each student shall
be given an opportunity to present his or her side of the story.
No student shall be suspended for unexcused tardiness, lateness,
absence, or truancy. The principal or the principal’s designee
may suspend any student transported to or from school at public
expense from the privilege of riding on a school bus for
violation of district school board transportation policies,
which shall include a policy regarding behavior at school bus

stops, and the principal or the principal’s designee shall give

Page 21 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
610 notice in writing to the student’s parent and to the district
611 school superintendent within 24 hours. School personnel shall
612| not be held legally responsible for suspensions of students made
613| 1in good faith.
614 Section 18. Paragraph (j) is added to subsection (6) of
615 section 1006.1494, Florida Statutes, to read:

616 1006.1494 Student online personal information protection.—
617 (6) This section does not do any of the following:
618 (J) Require a K-12 school, school district, or district

619| school board to include any provision in a contract with any

620 operator or vendor.
621

622 The State Board of Education may adopt rules to implement this
623 section.

024 Section 19. Subsection (1) of section 1010.02, Florida

625 Statutes, is amended to read:

626 1010.02 Financial accounting and expenditures.—

627 (1) All funds accruing to a school district or a Florida
628| College System institution must be received, accounted for, and
629| expended in accordance with law and rules of the State Board of
630 Education.

631 (a) A school district may be subject to varying reporting

632 frequencies based on its financial status, as determined in

633 State Board of Education rule:

634 1. A school district identified as having a financial

635 concern may be required to submit monthly financial reports.

636 2. A school district not identified as having a financial

637 concern may be required to submit financial reports no more

638 often than once every quarter.

Page 22 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




639
640
641
642
643
644
645
646
647
648
649
650
651
652
653
654
655
656
657
658
659
660
661
662
663
664
665
666
667

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
(b) The State Board of Education shall adopt rules to

establish criteria for determining the financial status of

school districts for the purpose of financial reporting.

Section 20. Section 1010.11, Florida Statutes, 1s amended
to read:

1010.11 Electronic transfer of funds.—Pursuant to the
provisions of s. 215.85, each district school board, Florida
College System institution board of trustees, and university
board of trustees shall adopt written policies prescribing the
accounting and control procedures under which any funds under
their control are allowed to be moved by electronic transaction
for any purpose including direct deposit, wire transfer,
withdrawal, investment, or payment. Electronic transactions
shall comply with the provisions of chapter 668. However,
district school boards are exempt from the requirements in s.
668.50(18) (b) .

Section 21. Subsection (2) of section 1010.20, Florida

Statutes, is amended to read:

1010.20 Cost accounting and reporting for school
districts.—

(2) COST REPORTING.—

(a) Each district shall report on a district-aggregate
basis expenditures for inservice training pursuant to s.
1011.62(3) and for categorical programs as provided in s.
1011.62(17) .

(b) Each district shall report to the department on a
school-by-school and on an aggregate district basis expenditures
for:

1. Each program funded in s. 1011.62 (1) (c).

Page 23 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




668
669
670
671
672
673
674
675
676
677
678
679
680
681
682
683
684
685
686
687
688
689
690
691
692
693
694
695
696

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
2. Total operating costs as reported pursuant to s.
1010.215.
3. Expenditures for classroom instruction pursuant to the
calculation in s. 1010.215(4) (b)1l. and 2.

(c) Each charter school shall receive and respond to

monitoring questions from the department.

(d) The department shall:

1. Categorize all public schools and districts into
appropriate groups based primarily on average full-time
equivalent student enrollment as reported on the most recent
student membership survey under s. 1011.62 and in state board
rule to determine groups of peer schools and districts.

2. Annually calculate for each public school, district, and
for the entire state, the percentage of classroom expenditures
to total operating expenditures reported in subparagraphs (b)2.
and 3. The results shall be categorized pursuant to this
paragraph.

3. Annually calculate for all public schools, districts,
and the state, the average percentage of classroom expenditures
to total operating expenditures reported in subparagraphs (b)2.
and 3. The results shall be categorized pursuant to this
paragraph.

4. Develop a web-based fiscal transparency tool that
identifies public schools and districts that produce high
academic achievement based on the ratio of classroom instruction
expenditures to total expenditures. The fiscal transparency tool
shall combine the data calculated pursuant to this paragraph
with the student performance measurements calculated pursuant to

s. 1012.34(7) to determine the financial efficiency of each

Page 24 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
697| public school and district. The results shall be displayed in an
698 easy to use format that enables the user to compare performance
699| among public schools and districts.

700 (e) 4y The Commissioner of Education shall present to the
701| Legislature, prior to the opening of the regular session each
702 year, a district-by-district report of the expenditures reported
703| pursuant to paragraphs (a) and (b). The report shall include

704 total expenditures, a detailed analysis showing expenditures for
705 each program, and such other data as may be useful for

706| management of the education system. The Commissioner of

707 Education shall also compute cost factors relative to the base
708 student allocation for each funded program in s. 1011.62(1) (c).
709 Section 22. Subsections (1) and (3) of section 1011.03,

710 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

711 1011.03 Public hearings; budget to be submitted to

712 Department of Education.—

713 (1) Each district school board shall cause a summary of its
714 tentative budget, including the proposed millage levies as

715| provided for by law, to be posted on the district’s official

716| website and—advertisedeoncedna newSpaper of generat

717 exrrewlationpublishedin—+the distrietr or on a publicly

718 accessible website as provided in s. 50.0311 fe—beposted—at—the
719| eeourthouse3f +therebeno——suvch newspaper.

720 (3) The board shall hold public hearings to adopt tentative
721 and final budgets pursuant to s. 200.065. The hearings shall be

722| primarily for the purpose of hearing requests and complaints
723 from the public regarding the budgets and the proposed tax

724 levies and for explaining the budget and proposed or adopted
725 amendments thereto, if any. The tentative budget must be posted

Page 25 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




726
727
728
729
730
731
732
733
734
735
736
737
738
739
740
741
742
743
744
745
746
7477
748
749
750
751
752
753
754

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
on the district’s official website at least 2 days before the
budget hearing held pursuant to s. 200.065 or other law. The
final adopted budget must be posted on the district’s official

website within 30 days after adoption. The board shall require

the superintendent to transmit Ewe—eepies—ef the adopted budget
to the Department of Education as prescribed by law and rules of
the State Board of Education.

Section 23. Subsections (2) and (4) of section 1011.035,
Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1011.035 School district fiscal transparency.—

(2) Each district school board shall post on its website:

(a) A plain language version of each proposed, tentative,

and official budget which describes each budget item in terms

() Crarnh 2 ~o 1 raoarm v oAt o o no ESWANERS W S S T SN - IS 2 ]
\ =W UJ_L/Lt/J.l_L & g =y J_\_,t/J_\_,g_)\_,J.J.L_,L;LL_,_LUJ.J.;_), [ S ey T t/uu_l__l_ [=J IO 10
PRI PN N, N At e o ] £ P N 1 Attt At £ +1
W I CTITTTT T |\ N EUUD I WS S S W (@R uAw [ S N T [ ANV I B W A W \A—LL)L.,J——L\./L./, g T
1 .
:
| (QETT-CECNNE S SN S N S B L1 N1y Aot o
- uullllllu_}__y [ S S i iy @ B B S N iy @ R C.L_L_L\./_Lcll\./_y AT CTTr
2 .o~ franA LAy g Ay L Nratzrl A 2 e n
I T oCTTOlm C1I T TTT IO TITNTI T IO TT i S T tJ-LCV-LUL«lO e~ _YCDL-LO 1T
~ mh oyt g £ L0177 D s o R, D S £.07 7 2
(=8 [ g i N [ S @ By W w4 O [ S U S S C I C\.iu_LVQL_LClll— O COUTTTITO Ry [ S O f C I
egquivatent—instructional personnet—-
b T ot s £ £..7 7 4+ crrrdszaloamt b Ao o 4 L2717 2
Py [E N o N ) [ S @ By W =y W o [ S U e S (U 4 ) wy \_/\1\4{_!_ T CTTITTCT O COUATTITTO (s [ S U e S C I
egquivalentadministrative perseonnel~-
o mh o o] et S B I I SV ~ s s I S ooy
o T TT AL ey & pu n UtJ _L().L,_Lll\j = tJCll\J._LL,u_LCO tJC-L [ S O i e C TS
eguarvatent——student-
A mh N I N R R S SR, | B I v ~ e i I S ooy
A\ 8 T TT AL ey & pu n TTTOo C T OCTC TIUIrTad T tJ T T T O =] tJ - [ S O S C TS
egquivalent——student-
Tl Sornoaral At g o3 oy PR A IR SR TR N N PN P I
Ay [ S i ) \j\_,l.].\_,J_L/L_I_ (7 AN B 1§ R S Ry R SAYND Jy U Sy € N GSp = = tJ\_/J.J.kA._LL.uJ_\_/n_) & ) T tJ\_/J_\_/\_/J.J.L.L/L\j\_/
£ ot T paa A
o CcC O TTI J\JU\.A.\j\_/L..

Page 26 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




755
756
757
758
759
760
761
762
763
764
765
766
767
768
769
770
771
772
773
774
775
776
777
778
779
780
781
782
783

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002cl
£ Tha o4+ A £ oharnen 2 A o~ A ] Faarn Al o A Aa e~y Laan A
T T T cC— O CrangC——=— o CnCrrar—T ottt S St ottt
balaonce et ~loacaa£2 A S vt A~ A
oot T Crasorr et —ao Tt o Lttt .

(b) A link to the web-based fiscal transparency tool
developed by the department pursuant to s. 1010.20 to enable
taxpayers to evaluate the financial efficiency of the school
district and compare the financial efficiency of the school

district with other similarly situated school districts.

This information must be prominently posted on the school

district’s website in a manner that is readily accessible to the

public.
(4) The website should contain links to—+
JAENA AN VN nlaan v N ~xza A hacleyraamn A 4 £~ o n n
\u, LJ.C_LtJ CAtJ_LQL_Lll A\ t/J_\JV_L\J.C OoTCTT \j_\_\.}ullu i S I A S N S ) ) € N WP S N R 1T
1z o a a1~ 1t aama 1+ N roeryrrr A ey o o r fFoadarT 1 Atz
AL, J S L W W i ) LJLA\J.\jCL_ LT C TS CTIITCT [ R Sy J_C\-iLA_L.LC\J. LJ_Y o C OO CT A\ [ S PR U B N Sy @ R L VY
1N PSP Ao+ PN + + rala+ra~d + + <z
ITX 1T 1TV o T 1O C C ey [ N R Ny &P B \w 8 C

+e) enable taxpayers, parents, and education advocates to
send e-mails asking questions about the budget and enable others
to view the questions and responses.

of section 1011.14, Florida

Section 24. Subsection (1)

Statutes, is amended to read:

1011.14 Obligations for a period of 1 year.—District school
boards are authorized only under the following conditions to
create obligations by way of anticipation of budgeted revenues
accruing on a current basis without pledging the credit of the
district or requiring future levy of taxes for certain purposes
for a period of 1 year; however, such obligations may be
extended from year to year with the consent of the lender for a

period not to exceed 4 years, or for a total of 5 years

Page 27 of 86

words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
784 including the initial year of the loan:
785 (1) PURPOSES.—The purposes for which such obligations may
786| be incurred within the intent of this section shall include only
787 the purchase of school buses, land, and equipment for
788| educational purposes; the erection of, alteration to, or

789 addition to educational plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary

790 facilities; and the adjustment of insurance on educational

791| property on a b-year plan, as provided by rules of the State
792| Board of Education.

793 Section 25. Subsection (2) of section 1011.60, Florida

794 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

795 1011.60 Minimum requirements of the Florida Education

796 Finance Program.—FEach district which participates in the state
797 appropriations for the Florida Education Finance Program shall
798| provide evidence of its effort to maintain an adequate school
799| program throughout the district and shall meet at least the

800 following requirements:

801 (2) MINIMUM TERM.—Operate all schools for a term of 180
802 actual teaching days or the equivalent on an hourly basis as
803 specified by rules of the State Board of Education each school
804 year. The State Board of Education may prescribe procedures for
805 altering, and, upon written application, may alter, this

806| requirement during a national, state, or local emergency as it
807| may apply to an individual school or schools in any district or

808 districts 1f the district school board certifies to the

809 Commissioner of Education that +f—3nthe opinionof the board;

810 it is not necessary feasiblte to make up lost days or hours, and
811 the apportionment may, at the discretion of the Commissioner of

812 Education and if the board determines that the reduction of

Page 28 of 86
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




813
814
815
816
817
818
819
820
821
822
823
824
825
826
827
828
829
830
831
832
833
834
835
836
837
838
839
840
841

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
school days or hours is caused by the existence of a bona fide
emergency, be reduced for such district or districts in
proportion to the decrease in the length of term in any such
school or schools. A strike, as defined in s. 447.203(6), by
employees of the school district may not be considered an
emergency.

Section 26. Subsection (4) of section 1011.68, Florida
Statutes, i1s amended to read:

1011.68 Funds for student transportation.—The annual
allocation to each district for transportation to public school
programs, including charter schools as provided in s.
1002.33(17) (b), of students in membership in kindergarten

through grade 12 and in migrant and exceptional student programs

below kindergarten shall be determined as follows:

Section 27. Subsection (4) of section 1011.69, Florida
Statutes, is amended, and subsection (5) 1is added to that
section, to read:

1011.69 Equity in School-Level Funding Act.—

(4) After providing Title I, Part A, Basic funds to schools
above the 75 percent poverty threshold, which may include high
schools above the 50 percent threshold as permitted by federal
law, school districts shall provide any remaining Title I, Part
A, Basic funds directly to all eligible schools as provided in
this subsection. For purposes of this subsection, an eligible

school is a school that is eligible to receive Title I funds,

Page 29 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




842
843
844
845
846
847
848
849
850
851
852
853
854
855
856
857
858
859
860
861
862
863
864
865
866
867
868
869
870

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

(a) Prior to the allocation of Title I funds to eligible
schools, a school district may withhold funds only as follows:
1. One percent for parent involvement, in addition to the
one percent the district must reserve under federal law for
allocations to eligible schools for parent involvement;

2. A necessary and reasonable amount for administration
which includes the district’s indirect cost rate, not to exceed
a total of 10 percent;

3. A reasonable and necessary amount to provide:

Homeless programs;
Delinquent and neglected programs;

Prekindergarten programs and activities;

o o O

Private school equitable services; and
e. Transportation for foster care children to their school
of origin or choice programs;

4., Up to 5 percent to provide financial incentives and

rewards to teachers who serve students in eligible schools,

including charter schools, identified for comprehensive support

and improvement activities or targeted support and improvement

activities, for the purpose of attracting and retaining

qualified and effective teachers, including teachers of any

subject or grade level for whom a measurement under s.

1012.34(7)

or a state—-approved Alternative Student Growth Model

is unavailable; and

Page 30 of 86

words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002cl
871 5.4— A necessary and reasonable amount;—net—te—exceed—+

872| pereents for eligible schools, including charter schools, to

873| provide educational services in accordance with the approved

874 Title I plan.

875 (b) All remaining Title I funds shall be distributed to all
876| eligible schools in accordance with federal law and regulation.
877! An eligible school may use funds under this subsection to

878| participate in discretionary educational services provided by
879| the school district. Any funds provided by an eligible school to
880| participate in discretionary educational services provided by
881| the school district are not subject to the requirements of this
882 subsection.

883 (c) Any funds carried forward by the school district are
884 not subject to the requirements of this subsection.

885 (5) The Department of Education shall make funds from Title

886 I, Title II, and Title III programs available to local education

887 agencies for the full period of availability provided in federal
888 law.

889 Section 28. Paragraphs (e) and (h) of subsection (2) and
890 subsections (5) and (6) of section 1011.71, Florida Statutes,

891 are amended, and paragraphs (1) and (m) are added to subsection
892 (2) of that section, to read:

893 1011.71 District school tax.—

894 (2) In addition to the maximum millage levy as provided in
895 subsection (1), each school board may levy not more than 1.5
896| mills against the taxable value for school purposes for charter
897 schools pursuant to s. 1013.62(1) and (3) and for district

898 schools to fund:

899 (e) Payments for educational plants, ancillary plants, and

Page 31 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




900
901
902
903
904
905
906
907
908
909
910
911
912
913
914
915
916
917
918
919
920
921
922
923
924
925
926
927
928

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
auxiliary facilities and sites due under a lease-purchase
agreement entered into by a district school board pursuant to s.
1003.02(1) (f) or s. 1013.15(2), not exceeding, in the aggregate,
an amount equal to three-fourths of the proceeds from the
millage levied by a district school board pursuant to this
subsection. The three-fourths limit is waived for lease-purchase
agreements entered into before June 30, 2009, by a district
school board pursuant to this paragraph. If payments under
lease-purchase agreements in the aggregate, including lease-
purchase agreements entered into before June 30, 2009, exceed
three-fourths of the proceeds from the millage levied pursuant
to this subsection, the district school board may not withhold
the administrative fees authorized by s. 1002.33(20) from any
charter school operating in the school district.

(h) Payment of costs of leasing relocatable educational

plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities, of renting

or leasing educational plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary

facilities and sites pursuant to s. 1013.15(2), or of renting or
leasing buildings or space within existing buildings pursuant to
s. 1013.15(4).

(1) The purchase, lease-purchase, or lease of driver

education vehicles; motor vehicles used for the maintenance or

operation of plants and equipment; security vehicles; or

vehicles used in storing or distributing materials and

equipment.

(m) Payment of the cost of premiums, as defined in s.

627.403, for property and casualty insurance necessary to insure

school district educational and ancillary plants. As used in

this paragraph, the term “casualty insurance” means the lines of

Page 32 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

. D, .
— ] [69) (o R
gl 4 4P O O
~ < . ~ D @ P -~ -H O
0} Pl oup D € -H @ R N
o) I Ol W @ )] D -H i1y O o
a > Hl D W ~ 0] . [o9] 0] 3
@ © ® S L HoOF ) TP n o 4 P
o O “ P D & D ® H D D Q ) o -
~ 3 O n| &P D > @ D @ n ™ P S5 4 YH O
—~| O| G| YH| -H|l 4 o -t D HOj - B & ¢ ] ]
e < 0] e} WH - 4 4P o~ @ - D “ 0 ©
~ | >| ™ . T OFE D P » n @« » ¢ ®©® O
ol | —H| n 4 P -H @ D (S (VI )} —H < g o
~ S 4 S O @ D+ W @®© —H 0 @ D & —~ 35 G
—~| O O (@] D D N o D & [ORS | -H . & n O H P
o 3| & S0 -Ho @ -H P 4H n m o o
~ O O| T O P a4 - D D & -d D Rty D @ O —~ O
S | O n| 4P b ¥ © 4@ ¢ P @ g -f e T R TR
< S| H| © D ® My D © # » D (VI (VIR } n © & A
~ b cl o] O o FH o0 e 0) H 0 © = 3 K 2
(= 0w ol | -m 4 o I U I I S B} ® (OB H > O [ O
~ o] g & Ll L ¢ ® P D # & D Q O o —
a3 = s Wheoogouh o - oD g i
< Q| H| O] YWl © [49] D HoO N TR NG 0, ¢ € O©
—~| ®© = O ® D D H0)J B @ & ® © © Y
T | O O < (TG <~ ¢ O -H - H oM . (0] Y
~ -H “ Q 0 o) -rH B Eiy) D [¢p] D 4P ._.u — ® - “ a o “
—~| ®©| Q| ol & B B N B O P & -1 4O & S5 -4 O ®©
— > > H D [0} - H ® D D [0} x in] ~ [0)
~ © 0| © 3| & ¢ gO] D & ®© o -f H oy D n e I A I
To) ol g ¥ K [N C () D 4 « D, e O P o
ol Ol < - D D D s o dH F 4 ¢ ¢ a 2 o0 -
©| TU| © g| T f o @ PO O v Y T P P O n O ®©
| ®| s o] & > -H T y £y g 0 o 0
< gl 3| Al O ¢ H b @ Lo e PN X 4 © ®
N 0l L o & @ D D M i (VS 0] a o -H
Ol o0 G| O] X — D D ©® » B ¥ [09] - & G — -+
H -Hl O O o oo P 0N D D ¢ - T O A M
. © 0 0] B D fH D { @ G © 0]
0 > Q| | -H W jon D D fox) D B |~ P o <© g
PP 3 © H D T @ D -H P~ . 0 o
gl @ | w G| $ - ~ ~ O ¢ - A #H D #H -
-—H| S| ®© o | D P~ D & @© § i T © T v O +~ P C
L 3] ©| -A| -H 4D -Hoo-m @ D O P - M © -~
o 0l Al PTG T T B o~ @ Y B0 |~ H © Yy O
| n| © S| © [op) HO)j SCHIN o N1 R (] D HOREEN (VIR N o a 5P
-~ O O] | 4 o -H T +~ O D @ D O Yy n O ¢ T O
3 0] D D T $H H © ¢ P ~ -H oA D K -A
Al gl O] 4] o O % ¢ T B O H - oo P ~ T L - Y
ol O g O O £ <+ H o~ O -fH D D O @ ~ @ P «© P
ol »| © © (O J] q o) HO) & -HooD A~ H 4 © T ©0
Q O [« o) I} ~ T ¢ D 4 D bl (VI O) D O -~ -
n| 4 >~ | < KN » L p D o ® M T D A @ Y T
D I ) & ®n Ep B . M N D+~ 4L > 4@ 0
Ol o 4| T| H ON B € ¢ -H P (0] B < O -
O a 0} 0] “ — Wy O, +~ D D (49} A~ < O H ~ (49} (49} £ a a
cl oHl Qo P 3 o W e © -H A D D [ I )] -4 O
©| @] © O| — T D Hor P ~x H o, D D H o L -H
[ S S N ) Lt #H T ® O D 0w e D & ®©
S 4l Qf O] H U ® O o o-H . D 0 . 4 P 4 ®©
0 O] a - A~ N P D ey ey - < — O +
cl 9 H o] O D q (0] HORE OO} O @ q Uy N g oA -
A O (@] o < Rty T O D D P N WY D ~ - > O
O O 4 N O < N W ™~ W o0 O 4 N M T 0 W~ 0 o0 O A N M < WO» W~
N MO M M MmO O MO O O O O @ S$OS9°O O T 0 N NN 0N 0 0N w0
O Oy O OO OO O OO0 OO O O OO O O O OO0 OO0 OO0 OO OO0 OO O O O OO OO O O O O

Page 33 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
958 Section 29. Section 1013.15, Florida Statutes, is amended
959 to read:
960 1013.15 Lease, rental, and lease-purchase of educational

961| plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities and sites.—

962 (1) A board may lease any land, facilities, or educational
963| plants owned by it to any person or entity for such term, for
964 such rent, and upon such terms and conditions as the board

965 determines to be in its best interests; any such lease may

966| provide for the optional or binding purchase of the land,

967 facilities, or educational plants by the lessee upon such terms
968 and conditions as the board determines are in its best

969 interests. A determination that any such land, facility, or

970 educational plant so leased is unnecessary for educational

971| purposes 1is not a prerequisite to the leasing or lease-purchase
972 of such land, facility, or educational plant. Prior to entering
973 into or executing any such lease, a board shall consider

974 approval of the lease or lease-purchase agreement at a public
975| meeting, at which a copy of the proposed agreement in its final
976 form shall be available for inspection and review by the public,
977 after due notice as required by law.

978 (2) (a) A district school board may rent or lease

979| educational plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities

980 and sites as defined in s. 1013.01. Educational plants,

981 ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities and sites rented or

982 leased for 1 year or less shall be funded through the operations
983| budget or funds derived from millage proceeds pursuant to s.
984 1011.71(2). A lease contract for 1 year or less, when extended

985 or renewed beyond a year, becomes a multiple-year lease.

986| Operational funds or funds derived from millage proceeds

Page 34 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




987
988
989
990
991
992
993
994
995
996
997
998
999
1000
1001
1002
1003
1004
1005
1006
1007
1008
1009
1010
1011
1012
1013
1014
1015

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
pursuant to s. 1011.71(2) may be authorized to be expended for
multiple-year leases. All leased facilities and sites must be
inspected prior to occupancy by the authority having
jurisdiction.

1. All newly leased spaces must be inspected and brought
into compliance with the Florida Building Code pursuant to
chapter 553 and the life safety codes pursuant to chapter 633,
prior to occupancy, using the board’s operations budget or funds
derived from millage proceeds pursuant to s. 1011.71(2).

2. Plans for renovation or remodeling of leased space shall
conform to the Florida Building Code and the Florida Fire
Prevention Code for educational occupancies or other
occupancies, as appropriate and as required in chapters 553 and
633, prior to occupancy.

3. All leased facilities must be inspected annually for
firesafety deficiencies in accordance with the applicable code
and have corrections made in accordance with s. 1013.12.
Operational funds or funds derived from millage proceeds
pursuant to s. 1011.71(2) may be used to correct deficiencies in
leased space.

4. When the board declares that a public emergency exists,
it may take up to 30 days to bring the leased facility into
compliance with the requirements of State Board of Education
rules.

(b) A board is authorized to lease-purchase educational

plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities and sites as

defined in s. 1013.01, and a district school board is authorized

to lease-purchase educational plants, ancillary plants, and

auxiliary facilities and sites. The lease-purchase of

Page 35 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

1016| educational plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities

1017 and sites must, where applicable, comply with shalt—lbe—as
1018| =xeeguired—Pby s. 1013.37, subject to the authorization in s.

1019| 1013.385 to exempt certain facilities from the requirements of

1020 that section; must shatt be advertised for and receive

1021 competitive proposals and be awarded to the best proposer;+ and

1022| must shadtt be funded using current or other funds specifically

1023 authorized by law to be used for such purpose.

1024 1. A district school board, by itself, or through a direct-
1025 support organization formed pursuant to s. 1001.453 or nonprofit
1026| educational organization or a consortium of district school

1027| Dboards, may, in developing a lease-purchase of educational

1028| plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities and sites

1029| provide for separately advertising for and receiving competitive
1030| bids or proposals on the construction of facilities and the

1031 selection of financing to provide the lowest cost funding

1032 available, so long as the board determines that such process
1033| would best serve the public interest and the available ptedged
1034 revenues are limited to those authorized in s. 1011.71(2) 5=
1035 o2 Her.

1036 2. All activities and information, including lists of

1037 individual participants, associated with agreements made

1038| pursuant to this section shall be subject to the provisions of
1039| chapter 119 and s. 286.011.

1040 (c)l. The term of any lease-purchase agreement, including
1041 the initial term and any subsequent renewals, shall not exceed
1042 the useful life of the educational facilities and sites for

1043 which the agreement is made, or 30 years, whichever is less.

1044 2. The initial term or any renewal term of any lease-

Page 36 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1045
1046
1047
1048
1049
1050
1051
1052
1053
1054
1055
1056
1057
1058
1059
1060
1061
1062
1063
1064
1065
1066
1067
1068
1069
1070
1071
1072
1073

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002cl
purchase agreement shall expire on June 30 of each fiscal year,
but may be automatically renewed annually, subject to a board
making sufficient annual appropriations therefor. Under no
circumstances shall the failure of a board to renew a lease-
purchase agreement constitute a default or require payment of

any penalty or in any way limit the right of a board to purchase

or utilize educational plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary

facilities and sites similar in function to the educational

plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities and sites

that are the subject of the said lease-purchase agreement.

Educational plants, ancillary plants, and auxiliary facilities

and sites being acquired pursuant to a lease-purchase agreement
shall be exempt from ad valorem taxation.

3. No lease-purchase agreement entered into pursuant to
this subsection shall constitute a debt, liability, or
obligation of the state or a board or shall be a pledge of the
faith and credit of the state or a board.

4. Any lease-purchase agreement entered into pursuant to
this subsection shall stipulate an annual rate which may consist
of a principal component and an interest component, provided
that the maximum interest rate of any interest component payable
under any such lease-purchase agreement, or any participation or
certificated portion thereof, shall be calculated in accordance
with and be governed by the provisions of s. 215.84.

(3) Lease or lease-purchase agreements entered into by
university boards of trustees shall comply with the provisions
of ss. 1013.171 and 1010.62.

(4) (a) A board may rent or lease existing buildings, or

space within existing buildings, originally constructed or used

Page 37 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1074
1075
1076
1077
1078
1079
1080
1081
1082
1083
1084
1085
1086
1087
1088
1089
1090
1091
1092
1093
1094
1095
1096
1097
1098
1099
1100
1101
1102

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
for purposes other than education, for conversion to use as
educational facilities. Such buildings rented or leased for 1
year or less shall be funded through the operations budget or
funds derived from millage pursuant to s. 1011.71(2). A rental
agreement or lease contract for 1 year or less, when extended or
renewed beyond a year, becomes a multiple-year rental or lease.
Operational funds or funds derived from millage proceeds
pursuant to s. 1011.71(2) may be authorized to be expended for
multiple-year rentals or leases. Notwithstanding any other
provisions of this section, if a building was constructed in
conformance with all applicable building and life safety codes,
it shall be deemed to meet the requirements for use and
occupancy as an educational facility subject only to the
provisions of this subsection.

(b) Prior to occupying a rented or a leased existing
building, or space within an existing building, pursuant to this
subsection, a school board shall, in a public meeting, adopt a
resolution certifying that the following circumstances apply to
the building proposed for occupancy:

1. Growth among the school-age population in the school
district has created a need for new educational facilities in a
neighborhood where there is little or no vacant land.

2. There exists a supply of vacant space in existing
buildings that meet state minimum building and life safety
codes.

3. Acquisition and conversion to use as educational
facilities of an existing building or buildings is a cost-saving
means of providing the needed classroom space as determined by

the difference between the cost of new construction, including

Page 38 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1103
1104
1105
1106
1107
1108
1109
1110
1111
1112
1113
1114
1115
1116
1117
1118
1119
1120
1121
1122
1123
1124
1125
1126
1127
1128
1129
1130
1131

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
land acquisition and preparation and, if applicable, demolition
of existing structures, and the cost of acgquisition through
rental or lease and conversion of an existing building or
buildings.

4. The building has been examined for suitability, safety,
and conformance with state minimum building and life safety
codes. The building examination shall consist, at a minimum, of
a review of existing documents, building site reconnaissance,
and analysis of the building conducted by, or under the
responsible charge of, a licensed structural engineer.

5. A certificate of evaluation has been issued by an
appropriately licensed design professional which states that,
based on available documents, building site reconnaissance,
current knowledge, and design judgment in the professional’s
opinion, the building meets the requirements of state minimum
building and life safety codes, provides safe egress of
occupants from the building, provides adequate firesafety, and
does not pose a substantial threat to life to persons who would
occupy the building for classroom use.

6. The plans for conversion of the building were prepared
by an appropriate design professional licensed in this state and
the work of conversion was performed by contractors licensed in
this state.

7. The conversion of the building was observed by an
appropriate design professional licensed in this state.

8. The building has been reviewed, inspected, and granted a
certificate of occupancy by the local building department.

9. All ceilings, light fixtures, ducts, and registers

within the area to be occupied for classroom purposes were

Page 39 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1132 constructed or have been reconstructed to meet state minimum
1133 requirements.
1134 Section 30. Subsection (1) of section 1013.16, Florida
1135 Statutes, 1s amended to read:
1136 1013.16 Construction of facilities on leased property;
1137 conditions.—
1138 (1) A board may construct or place educational facilities
1139 and ancillary facilities on land that is owned by any person
1140 after the board has acquired from the owner of the land a long-
1141 term lease for the use of this land for a period of not less
1142 than 40 years or the life expectancy of the permanent facilities

1143 constructed thereon, whichever is longer; however, the minimum

1144 lease term of 40 years does not apply to district school boards.
1145 Section 31. Section 1013.19, Florida Statutes, i1s amended
1146 to read:

1147 1013.19 Purchase, conveyance, or encumbrance of property
1148 interests above surface of land; joint-occupancy structures.—For
1149| the purpose of implementing jointly financed construction

1150| project agreements, or for the construction of combined

1151 occupancy structures, any board may purchase, own, convey, sell,
1152 lease, or encumber airspace or any other interests in property
1153 above the surface of the land, provided the lease of airspace
1154 for nonpublic use is for such reasonable rent, length of term,
1155| and conditions as the board in its discretion may determine. All
1156 proceeds from such sale or lease shall be used by a £he board of

1157 trustees for a Florida College System institution or state

1158 university er—lbeards receiving the proceeds solely for fixed

1159 capital outlay purposes. These purposes may include the

1160 renovation or remodeling of existing facilities owned by the

Page 40 of 86
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1161
1162
1163
1164
1165
1166
1167
1168
1169
1170
1171
1172
1173
1174
1175
1176
1177
1178
1179
1180
1181
1182
1183
1184
1185
1186
1187
1188
1189

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
board or the construction of new facilities; however, for a
Florida College System institution board or university board,
such new facility must be authorized by the Legislature. It is
declared that the use of such rental by the board for public
purposes in accordance with its statutory authority is a public
use. Airspace or any other interest in property held by the
Board of Trustees of the Internal Improvement Trust Fund or the
State Board of Education may not be divested or conveyed without
approval of the respective board. Any building, including any
building or facility component that is common to both nonpublic
and educational portions thereof, constructed in airspace that
is sold or leased for nonpublic use pursuant to this section is
subject to all applicable state, county, and municipal
regulations pertaining to land use, zoning, construction of
buildings, fire protection, health, and safety to the same
extent and in the same manner as such regulations would be
applicable to the construction of a building for nonpublic use
on the appurtenant land beneath the subject airspace. Any
educational facility constructed or leased as a part of a joint-
occupancy facility is subject to all rules and requirements of
the respective boards or departments having jurisdiction over
educational facilities. Any contract executed by a university
board of trustees pursuant to this section is subject to the
provisions of s. 1010.62.

Section 32. Subsection (1) of section 1013.20, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

1013.20 Standards for relocatables used as classroom space;
inspections.—

(1) The State Board of Education shall adopt rules

Page 41 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1190 establishing standards for relocatables intended for long-term
1191 use as classroom space at a public elementary school, middle
1192 school, or high school. “Long-term use” means the use of
1193| relocatables at the same educational plant for a period of 4
1194 years or more. Each relocatable acquired by a district school
1195| board after the effective date of the rules and intended for

1196 long-term use must comply with the standards. Bistrietsechoot

1197 boarda ahalTl cotbandtd o on ] o0 Lo p b oo £ KPR RO, PP, I,
LA L@ I s w Y [SR R = == o AOTIT I C L tJLLALll [ S CTITT | e oL CALObLll\j LT o T O T T CTOOIT O
1199 + 1 D T o¥aValo) N S Sy, S, T B 2N
T U IO O T UTTI T T LJ_Y U(_A.J.J.U(J.J__Y J_, \V v Fany t/J_U\.jJ_\./QQ J_\.at/UJ_L./ [SSJ5 i N &> iy =y T
1200 Brezidad ey 4 cemmmt e o 4 + 1 Sl + 1 S PP £
t/J_UV_L\A.\./\A. LJ_Y T U IO O T UTTI T T ja T ut/\./ui . g T 1T TNO T g
1202 P - SN » DEN PP S, A, [P S, A Sy - P (i I SISV S, 1y P SN P = S
CITC T T O I C T 1T . N T O T T CTOO I T O CTITTOCT [ Y €5 N Sy iy T T T T O COTIdT IS o C T
1203 comel ot it oan £ o+ D N PO S By caed e ~Alacoeo oo
\.z\JllltJ_LCL__Lull A\ - T utJtJ.LUVC\J- tJ_Lull ulu._y ITToCT 1T oo o A\ By @ I WS B W AW p § ) Y )

1204 The standards shall protect the health, safety, and welfare of
1205| occupants by requiring compliance with the Florida Building Code
1206 or the State Requirements for Educational Facilities for

1207 existing relocatables, as applicable, to ensure the safety and
1208 stability of construction and onsite installation; fire and

1209| moisture protection; air quality and ventilation; appropriate
1210 wind resistance; and compliance with the requirements of the
1211| Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990. If appropriate and

1212 where relocatables are not scheduled for replacement, the

1213 standards must also require relocatables to provide access to
1214 the same technologies available to similar classrooms within the
1215| main school facility and, if appropriate, and where relocatables
1216 are not scheduled for replacement, to be accessible by adequate
1217 covered walkways. A relocatable that is subject to this section

1218 and does not meet the standards shall not be reported as

Page 42 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1219
1220
1221
1222
1223
1224
1225
1226
1227
1228
1229
1230
1231
1232
1233
1234
1235
1236
1237
1238
1239
1240
1241
1242
1243
1244
1245
1246
1247

Florida Senate - 2024

594-01839-24

CS for SB 7002

20247002c1

providing satisfactory student stations in the Florida Inventory

of School Houses.

Section 33. Section 1013.21,

Florida Statutes,

is repealed.

Section 34. (a)

1013.28,

Paragraph
Florida Statutes,
1013.28 Disposal of property.—
(2)
(a)

classified as surplus by a district

Tangible personal property

College System institution board of
of in accordance with the procedure

However,

of subsection

TANGIBLE PERSONAL PROPERTY.

(2) of section

is amended to read:

that has been properly
school board or Florida
trustees shall be disposed

established by chapter 274.

the provisions of chapter 274 shall not be applicable

to a motor vehicle used in driver education to which title is

obtained for a token amount from an
manufacturer. In such cases,

be as prescribed in the contractual

automobile dealer or

the disposal of the vehicle shall

agreement between the

automotive agency or manufacturer and the board. Farngiblte

Boarananal v Aty o oo Nraoana~» Aalacaa £ S a0
PSSO T—pPpTropCTrTcy titat s Ot pPTroptCTrIy CraososoTrtrCO oS SurpTasSy
mar] a for A2 oo +h o 131 g K oS Aot A o~ 1
M KCO T O OTropOoOsSary; O Ottt TwIrSC—orntastCO Oy o OroscrrrCt SCIro0o0=T
bhbeoard aho11 W Nratzr A~ £y o Aot~y o~k 17 o o +h o
PO TSt O pPTrov IOt o0 o Ciar e St 0T S oSO ciiC—sSattc
baaoatao -~ 14+ o oA Sxza 2] 11 + +hear a1 2~ o~ 1o n +h
Doorro oo T T To tmaoc—avarrraoTrc—co Ottt oTrrrC— o CIOo0 o=ttt

distriets A charter school receiving tangible personal property

that has been properly classified as surplus,

marked for

disposal, or otherwise unused by a district school board
property—from—the sehool—distriet may not sell or dispose of

such property without the written
district.
Section 35. Section 1013.31,

to read:

Page 43
CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

Florida Statutes,

permission of the school

is amended

of 86

words underlined are additions.




1248
1249
1250
1251
1252
1253
1254
1255
1256
1257
1258
1259
1260
1261
1262
1263
1264
1265
1266
1267
1268
1269
1270
1271
1272
1273
1274
1275
1276

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1013.31 Educational plant survey; localized need
assessment; PECO project funding.—

(1) At least every 5 years, each Florida College System

institution and state university board shall arrange for an

educational plant survey, to aid in formulating plans for
housing the educational program and student population, faculty,
administrators, staff, and auxiliary and ancillary services of
the district or campus, including consideration of the local
comprehensive plan. The Department of Education shall document
the need for additional career and adult education programs and
the continuation of existing programs before facility
construction or renovation related to career or adult education

may be included in the educational plant survey of a seheoot

eistriet—or Florida College System institution that delivers
career or adult education programs. Information used by the
Department of Education to establish facility needs must

include, but need not be limited to, labor market data, needs

analysis, and information submitted by the seheet—distriet—eor

Florida College System institution.

£ Airmatd a7 P i I I, P T L T I B S +1 s
[ S N AW R w8 L/LL._L\JJ.J.L/L_L, v _L_L_LL/LJ__Y, [P ELw ¥ [ muy _L_L_LL/LJ__Y tJ_LL/LJ.J.L. L/LLJ_LL.L/L_L \JUL._LL/L_Y
purposes+

1 Th leoeal ot B U S ~ MU P R R

- LTI [ N Py @ i \/().tJ_LL,()._L UL/[L,_L()._Y _LllltJ_LUV TIT i J_L/lll\J., COTHhO 1O L,_Lll\j A\
Loom Ao ok o Lopmn o A oo PP £+ A bt bl o o o
EER W NN AW ¥ I T OIS 1T 1 OTIT (@ yaw & i oy L tJ()._Lb A\ = LSS iy A\ I EIUD i Ui S S W W) [=] TTO LT

Page 44 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1277
1278
1279
1280
1281
1282
1283
1284
1285
1286
1287
1288
1289
1290
1291
1292
1293
1294
1295
1296
1297
1298
1299
1300
1301
1302
1303
1304
1305

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
\ \ .
’
. ’
Vil On ot 1 o Soaszarnmarnt ~ 1 JeR I SN roaszran
e T A\ Ny N wy OO T T \juv L ITTIT ITCT T O O CTE - \4 TTCr 12
[ Tmia~+ £ o
) J_J.I.I.LJLA.\./L, - =
& Dy xzo+ o 4 o r Ao+ N e A
U e L T VOO TT \.j_LJ_L.,Q A\ AU TITT T T UTT Oy (@R EAw
7 Th A4 ot e At o~ ] + o ] <71 A a1 oo + 4+ o
T e [ N o ) ) |\ S EArUD iy U S S W W [ Y i A W 4w g CTZY TV I OO tJLA.LnJLADLlll. iy =2}

O

H
H

i (D
- 7 =7

1
T

[

by Survey preparation and required data.—Each survey must

shatt be conducted by the Florida College System institution or

state university board or an agency employed by the board.

Surveys must shadtd be reviewed and approved by the board, and a
file copy must shald be submitted to the Department of Education
or the Chancellor of the State University System, as
appropriate. The survey report must shait include at least an
inventory of existing educational and ancillary plants,
including safe access facilities; recommendations for existing
educational and ancillary plants; recommendations for new
educational or ancillary plants, including the general location
of each in coordination with the land use plan and safe access

facilities; campus master plan update and detail for Florida

He
H
A\
@D

College System institutions; the—wuts

a ztEan A~ A ah ] ISR EV SR TN Y L~ narat o n e and
A cCTIOCt ToOOT—Cay O yCorr— oot OpCTaotcTOTy

D

n
T

=l o o
TTo T A\ I S & i 3 R < =)

such other information as may be required by the Department of
Education. This report may be amended, if conditions warrant, at
the request of the department or commissioner.

(b)4e> Required need assessment criteria for district,
Florida College System institution, state university, and
Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind plant surveys.—

Educational plant surveys must use uniform data sources and

Page 45 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

H 4 bl © ©
&y o o — D
— B W - ] -H N (OB H g
© 0 ON D & * o PP > L 0O o Y
q 0} En] D iy U o i) © (@]
O T ® 4 W D & ¢ -H H o B4 - T © L n O n o
H O ¢ PG $ 0 iy P — £ T w T O a L
£ o0 I VR O PR N VI eI (R B () J & - & @© - o O 0 ®©
@ Y T © & D HO) ~ P H O O T 4 O 0O O -~ g P
0o o0 W P 4y D W D ] O o o wm PP nm
3 o, P @ K D @ D & P ® D @ D “W T P P O
o= ¢ 0 S P SO S H > ST SO s O g M o 0 g 0O T O
O ©0 1] o, @ o PP W D D 4 O n O H O > O M 0O <
#$ P D #H ¢ D B & @ -H -H @ nw © &€ W O ®@ -4 P O O P
T > - O D b o © © 4 b r 4 S Q g Q L w4 O
Q 0] & @ ~ O o, T » Hoo- [99] K | — (o] ~ 0 O > X >
0 > QO -d D 4P H & @ ® {9} - D D i) 0] O O O wn o Q
-~ Y B W ¢ O D D - o o & 4O O QO 49 n o~ YW oo .
> 3 n D 4P D O, P U W D @ & D -~ a P (@] 0 0] O £ T
O w0 » 4y ¢ O -f D ¢ ¢ O £ O U O O o+ O O
o D H uwph H E D E1 N OB )] I -4 0O >N 4 O © S <
i) D oW D )] D )] D [} @ n S5 P ~ a [0) —~ - n
S oa ® D W - -H @ P P ~ £ S L © > O ~H Y > -
O ®© S U] D & D #H & @ 4 - > O n 9 4 © O O @© o
o - Q O 0 | 4 D D ST} P > 0T 4 O 3 P UL O E Q .
MO B # -H B @ ¢ >0 >~ - P 3 O 9] r @ 0
& n fH D -f hp D 0] ~ @ D e o~ A P 0] a © o, n P 0]
o D D ¢ -H B U g n H 4 b 4 4 nw 4 ¢ & O T o T ©n -A
< ®© S TT: < I ) PR () B N ¢ © H P O H O A o o 4 © O O P
Q g 1] D - D H b @ D 4 ¢ B D  © O P O - 3y 0] -
© O B - [ SIS K D @ ®  -d 4 D D K] HoH © [o RN >0 @] n a o
S s 0] D D 4@ D D, fH B 4 0] O Q o T © -~ -
o Y B -H @ D D @ & P P & @ D O — 0 O ] O 4 O
© © Lo o N ()N ST+ N R () B 16 0] D 4 ¢ © ® ®© < ®© T P 0 ~ O 0O ®©
4 O (V] -H © H @ -H ¢ 3] g -4 O > 4 <o H ®© ~ N © L M
(VI ©h W T n v ® N uH h -H D o 4 -4 O © n O nu o0 o -
Q, T ~ -H & £ & O A4 TP PP oH O P D Y I I T
0] NID D @ D » D — P D -md ©  F @ O, ®© o' 0 0] 0] o P @] ©
0 O ¢ & ¥ (VIO D ® ()] b n O O £ S > QO -A -A > @
-~ 2 -HE oy D Ow ¢ -H 4P P00 3 o O A 4 wn P g O
e Q H D P D -H be O )] H @ O 0] o - a o~ P I o A
IRE oo D HooE wo oo v b O O g E £ 3 4 0 0 A A P
O 4 P i D 4 D S S ) O P — P 3 @ -4 > A 0 ©
c g -H [( VI S ()] O W )] Hoo-H 4P @] [ S o P 4 o T - O QO O
-4 O HOZEEN () NS D B WH o - D D W ®© up (0N @ -4 O w0 g ©® T 3
® B OB P o o & g D -H g T O B © PR R — 3 W ie
O 0] - P D -mH @ D - i D 0] IS 0] 0 > O L
0] . D D ¢ B D 4P P QD D ¢ ¢ »>» © S T & g £ O T wn g
-H O 9] D B [N ()] H - B 4P B D ® “ O Y - o A g oo~ © “
HoSo o> a4 D D ® D ® o o 3 Q P 4 0O © P O O
-4 © O © v & $H o™ D O oo h B H P nn O >N O g 0 A w0 O 35 WY
O > 0 -fd 0 A O S TV A L > ®© L O > 0O ~ -+ O
O >N Yy 4 W H ¢ © - Qh h <o A - P N © O N 4 O 0
Q, 0 B iy D © @ PN E B P P P O O L P >0 - g < P O P
n > n £ N E BT O ¢ @ D & U @ D @ © S Q > > P 0 w0 [«
Y BH - & F ¢ % SH &9 A E 49 0 n P o -~ 4 T O
T 5w P - O & H H T W W W b F 0] o H n 4 L T o g
- 0 3 . up -H (O] D 0] [0} -Ho4P L,_ o, 0] 0] 0 ] O 3 © 0]
“ o D op 4 HooN " H - P D O @ 4 O Y | e S
o +» A My . @ H D & © ¢ ¢ O oo o » © O O L ®nn -4 O O -H
B L H oo O H O -H P D D 4 4 D ¢ o 4 99 4 » & T L O O I
-4 © O H P D D >N N D D o0 O 4 4 4 0O n 9 © o
IS “ W D TP 4 ® B D -H - - B Ky “ © “ (@] e O 0] a O o, O
o o O D «H Hl @ Y ® $H H T T T © @ O U o L P ™M g 4 n n M
© ™~ W O O 4 N MO < 0 W I~ 0 O O 4 N MO < . W >~ W o O +H N M <
o o o o 4 4 A4 A4 A4 A 4 4 =4 4 N N N N N N N N N N O OO O O oM
M M Mm M MO MO MO O O OO O O O O O OO OO0 H0 O O OO N0 0O O O
R = T T B B B L = T = T L B B e e I I e B B o T R R B e

Page 46 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1335 2.3+ Each Florida College System institution’s survey must
1336 reflect the capacity of existing facilities as specified in the
1337| inventory maintained by the Department of Education. Projections
1338 of facility space needs must comply with standards for
1339| determining space needs as specified by rule of the State Board
1340 of Education. The 5-year projection of capital outlay student
1341 enrollment must be consistent with the annual report of capital
1342 outlay full-time student enrollment prepared by the Department
1343| of Education.
1344 3.4+~ Each state university’s survey must reflect the
1345| capacity of existing facilities as specified in the inventory
1346| maintained and validated by the Chancellor of the State
1347 University System. Projections of facility space needs must be
1348 consistent with standards for determining space needs as
1349| specified by regulation of the Board of Governors. The projected
1350 capital outlay full-time equivalent student enrollment must be
1351 consistent with the 5-year planned enrollment cycle for the
1352 State University System approved by the Board of Governors.
1353 4.5+ The district educational facilities plan of a school
1354 district and the educational plant survey of a Florida College
1355 System institution, state university, or the Florida School for
1356 the Deaf and the Blind may include space needs that deviate from
1357 approved standards for determining space needs if the deviation
1358 is justified by the district or institution and approved by the
1359 department or the Board of Governors, as appropriate, as
1360 necessary for the delivery of an approved educational program.
1361 (c)+e Review and validation.—The Department of Education

1362 shall review and validate the surveys of school districts and

1363 Florida College System institutions, and the Chancellor of the

Page 47 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1364 State University System shall review and validate the surveys of
1365| universities, and any amendments thereto for compliance with the
1366| requirements of this chapter and shall recommend those in

1367 compliance for approval by the State Board of Education or the
1368 Board of Governors, as appropriate. Anrnvatly—the department

1369 P AP, B HE Y OV N IV PRGN APV, [P S N S PR £
[SR R = == tJC.L_L\J_LllI. IT =TT \J.Ct/l«ll (./Lllu_L_YlJ_LLJ - L J_Ct/J_CLJClll«(./LL«_LVC lJ(./Llllt/_LC - -
1370 BN PP NPV DR I Ao Foar £220 Adodond st o n T A b
AT IT [ g = VC_Y L T O O UTIIIMTT T TIAAT OO TTCT T TS [ S [ S S VA |\ S EArUD I U S S W S } oo LT T T T CTT LJ_Y
1371 + 1 PRI P LN - SN SO VRSP [ IS S [ SIS R B P A laraaat - et
T CUTIHIT IO O T UTT T 1T ulllull\j |\ S EArUD I U S S W S } W ITCTTT T Lu.L\jClJl— T TS sy
1372 rAaIrIANr e A+ I r + ™I o £ +1h - o a1l ~+ 1 n + n = +
1OV OTTIOT [ S @ N WS S W ) [ S CTT t/UJ_t/UU\./ g CIT 1O UULJU\./L/L./_LUJ.J., CTT T OO |
1373 czeynoo ol P P S NUUN PP I ST [ ey J [NV I s B~ P £
1OV OTTIOT [ S &> N U W ) A\ 5\ UL UL Wp Sy ) § B Ei i A NS W ) LJ_Y \A._LV_L\A._LJ.J.\.j CTT C O TCTTT 4 _Yk/L/LJ_ A=) [ -
1374 Brotoacta T1io+~d an +h At bt ab a4+ P I Ny L2 A
t/J_UJ\./k/L./Q 10 O T 1T T |\ N SRS I WS S S W ey [ = = V\./-Y LJ_Y T C O TCTTT 4 _Yk/L/LJ_ i - - AW §
1375 At PR, P N N P S SO NN N S S I IS, P reaa
\./utJLlaLALL \JLAL«LLAL_Y 1T OV OTTOT tJ.L\JJC\./laL\Jlan 1T o C OO CT (@ yaw T O T T [SAYAY It Sl wh wyw)

1376| as—determined by the departments- The commissioner may condition
1377 the receipt of direet fixed capital outlay funds provided from

1378| general revenue or from state trust funds by district school

1379 boards fe—be—withheld fromdistriets until such time as the

1380 district school board submits a survey that accurately projects

1381 facilities needs as indicated by the Florida Inventory of School

1382| Houses, as compared with the district’s capital outlay full-time

1383 equivalent enrollment, as determined by the department.

1384 (d)4e) Periodic update of Florida Inventory of School

1385| Houses.—School districts shall periodically update their

1386 inventory of educational facilities as new capacity becomes
1387 available and as unsatisfactory space is eliminated. The State
1388 Board of Education shall adopt rules to determine the timeframe
1389 in which districts must provide a periodic update.

1390 (2) Only the district school superintendent, Florida

1391| College System institution president, or the university

1392| president shall certify to the Department of Education a

Page 48 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1393| project’s compliance with the requirements for expenditure of
1394 PECO funds prior to release of funds.

1395 (a) Upon request for release of PECO funds for planning
1396| purposes, certification must be made to the Department of

1397| Education that the need for and location of the facility are in
1398 compliance with the board-approved survey recommendations, that
1399| the project meets the definition of a PECO project and the

1400 limiting criteria for expenditures of PECO funding, and that the
1401| plan is consistent with the local government comprehensive plan.
1402 (b) Upon request for release of construction funds,

1403| certification must be made to the Department of Education that
1404 the need and location of the facility are in compliance with the
1405| Dboard-approved survey recommendations, that the project meets
1406| the definition of a PECO project and the limiting criteria for
1407| expenditures of PECO funding, and that the construction

1408| documents meet the requirements of the Florida Building Code for

1409| educational facilities construction, subject to the

1410 authorization in s. 1013.385 to exempt certain facilities from

1411 the requirements of s. 1013.37, or other applicable codes as

1412 authorized in this chapter.

1413 Section 36. Section 1013.35, Florida Statutes, is amended
1414 to read:
1415 1013.35 School district educational facilities plan;

1416 definitions; preparation, adoption, and amendment; long-term

1417 work programs.—

1418 (1) NDELTTNTTTANCS N 11a~A EEESNEE 0 SN P a2 n + 1 + rm e
DL TINLT T TOUINO - 2xo ot TIit—tcirtto ottty crrtc—cCTrit.

1419 () WA A~Ar~t+ A~ A Ailr s+ 1 AT E SN I B PTE N EENENT /A C-NENE NPT~ =
Ty OO pPp Tttt COoaCa O taCtrrrr oSS P aott meats—Tce

1420

1421

Page 49 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

¢ H YH &
-H ® in] D o D
[ond . O ~ D -
b 1] D o - 4o [09) HOj )
H H 0] - 4P H n @ N0 B )
® ~ ® -t 4P @ s} 0] D D —H &
D H fon — 4 D ® N 0 o) bl D [( Y
>0 P l 4 & D £ - © 3 - o VIR D
-H - -t 0 « 4P B @ T —~ D £ - 4
(R [ON (0] -H RO Y] O O D o o
+# ¢ T q 0] e D O 4 < oo 4P -
O » [09] [1v] L« P S © - N W 0
@O -H D D op @ 4y D [ O H D P @
£ P - g Lo D D P o L P 4P E D
1b oo D & H 44 ®© D D 4y
N -t ® L D o O S P - D o HO)
T —H 4h S N + £ O ¢ D
(O] - + D . @ - ()] a o L @ n
0} )] o h @ Uy D o +H W -H D [§M
£ ™ ® ® 1] —H 4 -4 ®© @© ©h HO)
D 4 - (I TR OR d L o9 -4 0 B € 9
S OF D -l D Q n o » & ¢ ¢ D
& O — - & 09] D O D 4 Ep D
® ® —H H D ey D T T 0 [09)
A FR— ¢ ® H @ - LN T 49 O ©0 s 4
(X NNOR D ¢ D O 4 (I @ A T D 4 o N
. D D -H D VI N U b B o O L 0 D © D P
NP # - o - b o qQ -+ O . 4 b -4 &
0] o, @ ® Rty D D -mH ) — a 0] HooW
> ) © L0 HORES | — - [ IV h
T )] B (0] b @ D @ O O w [ I ( o
1 B FRT ) §O] B jon W NI O © O ' -f D
o9} D )] D HO)J D @ Rty D S WA D T ¢ -
k3 D T P -H & O + o8 P 4
4P -m NISEE B -H @ & D n o~ - D @ q
) D )] D D P F @ HORER )] - o Y4 & D
1) ) H -H W@ [49] D B i) [ D 4D B ip)
H -H H D . D -H nh o O O D
[OFETY) 4 W P HOJEER ()R} D -~ -4 ®© ¢ @ D 4
- bl n D @ [0} D @& ® HOJIS) O 4 P W D M [ D,
H ® -H P -H -H i1y ® )] @ )] o e © - Y
® -H T O H P O v P ® D ol n O Y h © P D
[ () R0 D 4 4 D ¢ P W Hl A 3 O -t D My
D ® B D @ 9] -m D D P UH O O T WY R Er
-H o UH D on [N L | D O K ® Q 0] . D 4D D
4P P oH g B 090 ® < o - 4 .
® 4P — & D, ® b D D ~ O i) a [ON @ —
v O P W P D - O >~ © O - B0 D
5 b 4P b O b @4 4 = 0 H g - ooE 9 p
OB TR I 4 Lo-d @ — — 4 g D & - D
(R O # -fd + +# D T @ ~ P © L L OB it
0 @ H PO W n 4 b @ e O -
¢ - O e o & O U LB S 0 4 O @ o T
4 A [OTE()] D D @ Ef 0] g O O P o B ®
#H oz uw oo CITR T~ 0w < O 0] o & f m
D [09) al D (o)) D 5 O O O, - & D
[¢p] A~ (] [4p] -H N D A N1 -rH Q V < ”W D —
o O o - c 4P DR R TN O] (OIS} -4 @© [09) D ¢
-H N o A~ e -H D O, - -t — ) ] ~ Y D
® -t ORI — - 44 O @ | HOZER XIS oy
i) P +~ O -H o q - o +» O H (o] R
oo [09) A+~ -f ()] ¢ h O ol el & ® H $H
D -H q w ® H -rH [10] O 0] O - D B Eiy)
) — + ¥ Y [ I HORENET n P - D ® $H ®
N MO < O~ o0 O 4 N M <N W~ 0 o000 4 N O S .0n W~ o o O
N N N N NN N N N MO »mO »”HO O O O O O O O @ @ ¢ ¢ 9 OO0
AU S U S RS RS (RS U S (S U S S LIS s S S U LR S (RS AR S RS IS S I S U U S S I B S N
R = T L e e B L T e L L B B e T T e R e L = T = I

Page 50 of 86

strieken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

§O) $H D h . )
¢ @ D @ P <~ ©h @ UM
-Ho P E » B o HOj n P & B D &
H Ert ® D D D —H b D 4 {
-Ho @ 1Y) . & P HO) 4 @ T P HO) D -H B0 -
HOJTY) . (0] Qh P D ¢ D D ¢ @ -H @ 4w W @
D - P b ¢ O » P + @ - P O D P (o S
£ % £ -0 B P S\ - Lo v 4w Q
- © -H Ul 4 ~ D, ™D D o, > O b & &
O 4 4 ¢ >N @ - b & © ¢ - s P (O] P e b @
¢ & -f D oo PP oE O T O £ ¢ P b @ O S
Bt H < 1 ¢ @ - P - - 0 R OTR N & ¢ A & -7 O
~ & - 4 b O & R L0 @ o o4 b - O B O B
¢ © - 0 P fdow O O & ( D 0 OV (O L R
- ® i) N 4 -d b & H ¢ i I R T ¥ D 0
NOR TR C 1 @ b O D uh o, Lo o O - ¢ ¢« o ¢ -
(VI O)) D LR L] D ¢ n [09] ¥ H -fd 4P [OFEE (VIR q [o9]
H ¢ & P D KORE O ORI )] D 4 D H ¢ © D -1 » ¢ O ¢
-H ® OFEENIS R O D D @ O ~ B -H @~ N >N H @ D
T T ¢ D ® H & H W D O D @© -H O D 4 — -H @
P ¢ D H P -H H O B E O P T O SR VI () B ()] D & ~ & H 4 D
® o - D (OIS P D ® D D O M -H D O 0 N ((VREY: 5| $H
4 oW g E W D #H D HORE | oy 5L Hoon
O P P D & 4 - [ I D @© ¢ & H & 4 v o D O O &
4o k0] D [o9) W B D> ¢ P N n @ b & & D
O ¢ B & 1 O T up P & ¢ b -H & - e & -1 O O {
Lo P O - D D D YH [99] D ¢ [o9] D ~ P )] [0} E [ D
k3 [ T H O U -f D @ - g O - P -t <~ 0O O L0
4 0] D ¢ D ¢ 4 D p o o T W D D H W oW v @
< @ uh b O b & & & 4 @ 0 P ¢ & L ¢ T 0 O ®© oH
W D D o A N B PR () D -H D » 1T (T s ST B B D
op & D D & -H D Qh & B D O TR S (N B D @
SN (ol ™ Db B D @ D © T H P D O, & & -
R ¢ & PP O B oA & O - @ M ju W > Qo g o B
R s - & 1 9 ¢ O O O K M PP ~ - D O & ¥ 0
L Y N ¢ H O ™ @ o-d & S L ORI O BT H P £ @
N B 4l 5 ¢ ©© A @ 4 - P o H0 D D O o ~ O P D -
€ B -H O D @ A >~ @ & - D W ®n P D € - ¢
D)) n WP 9 q 4P ETS Bt VA ( (VI O} -H P ® Y T -
0 # 0 D W [T R o B T D D @ 4 D @ -H D
¢ @ oo D T @ D H @& © O W ¢ P D (VIR R AT VT SR () D
D D 4 D 4 4 oo D b B ¢ ¢ ) ) B (VN O N
gl &g O D ® @ D -H W & -H D 4H D ¢ D W Y -q D @
HOBENO] @ - ¢ 40 T £ ¢ £ O O & O ¢ —H D O T T
P oo T T D <~ B T 0 D O, [0} D D ¢ - D @
¢ P D #H $H -H H A ¢ ()] D N B S FE 4 H L O O HOREN(Y]
c P b 09] D W @® O @ N A I (S O PR, .| D (O T S R S ( O N )
B D | D -H P @ D ¢ D D D D O B -H T 4 Ho O N o~
n # > P FE B o> o-H O & W -t [N D D ¢ 4 T QP
HOoHF® b P o0 B E D B D o N P § BT
B O Q o D P O P ™ ¢ © W & g P b P -H ¢ E A
(OFIRL I P ¢ ¢ b # O O O & @ - b ¢ H [N O R B ) N
Hoo@ v ¢ A B 4 P oA & H D £ O O 0 P L 0 ¥
nh W D @ HO) ~ & O w D D 4 D D ¢ © & D o
O ©h - O ¢ D N PN Y D H D ©® & & H AH WD ot
O -H » n & PP M n ¢ D [ T S L) s B P P O D -H
¢ O D D (] D ¢ > ¢ D D #H W ® v @« - D @
) [og) ey D I () T () B o Y L A o . « 4 CO s B LR D R .
H #H @ N A B s | S+ | S e DR () D < @ W " P & D o op
o £ i} O W @& WP FE -H - D @ [0} P B P ! D W
S LR S E - b @ A T P H D D n D
@ ()] D T iy D B - ¢ D (0] — ¢ O O D 4
D ™ ¢ SUR ¢ 4 ¢ K D D -H P K @ D D & ¢ & .
v © YH ® ® P - D #H O D D -mH H O -H (V= N m
— N M SN O~ 0 OO +H N MO < .0 W >~ W o0 O A NM SN W~ 0 O
0O 0O w0 W W W w0 w0 W W W W Ww Wwuw wuwuw oo r~rM~™~-:M~-:°MM-/M>~>-I>>>@>~> >~
AU SRS IS RS RS U LS RS I SRS SRS (S S U S U SR LS LIS (IS VRS LS NS R SR L S B S L
R = T L e e B L T e L L B B e T T e R e L = T = I

Page 51 of 86

strieken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

< ~H D [09]
1] oy NP
O uH L b 4 1S R N )]
D D H H ¢ -H  -H
. — D ® H D H ¢ fH
o9} i1y ® — D ® D
O D [0} D D WH o} @ o, d H
4P - ao@ — D M- 4P O D ® M @
- Y NOREE (ORENO] N Q - +
N & -H Ef D ¢ ~oa @ Y] D -
$H e [op) ‘m @ 4 D O ® D & O
- b D e | D ¢ -H D W & Wb B
D YH D D O KO N4 -H  EH q
D T & 4y D [OFE Y N @ —H [n
< P D 4 -H ® D ¥ -d - o -l D
()] D oo P oo P n ¢ P My
h D - -H P P D O D Ep B0 T W
jon £ @ LS R OF -t D @ -t D
s oo ® - o . T H0
D D & -H H ® 3] 09} D L9 ) "
uly ol I D q ® b #H BT E ¢ n O
H D & @ D D )] B ® @ - o,
N T 0§ [V ¢ - D b ¢ (VIO D D
@ D @ D O ‘m o)l — KT K
D ) 4P -H P a4 @ D D [OFEENO} P
- ] —H D Uy 4y Hoo> $ Ln R
4 HO) . P P P §O) [OFEE TR OR O TR R« VI
P oo ® @ D @ D
) & « -H ¥ H © P >N q (VST <
D N O O b O © P O b 0
- - £ - (OFSE R Ty Ho0 P ~ b 0
0} - ) L -H - H 4N n @ -4 D
()] - NN ~ ~ — & ® Eis) B n D 8]
+ Ky NN ORENO] v P OV b - 4 S L I L
P ® O ¢ oM D O L P HD
-H D @ ¢ - -H 4 B H @ -Ho B
K HO)J o~ 4 D D HO)J T © H O H &
D, K] o N IS il D @ D & D .« 4 oo ¢ -H P
D 1] D 4 [09] [T (VIO D #H -H W D O O w ®n
Y D D - — [1v] =il —H M D » [ON D mm ® ® D
o, - D 0] Do~ o T O [V 4 ® 4 -d P iy O oW N
ON HOZEEN(V] D o o oo D 4 & P ¢ O N oD
P 5L DA OIS NN D © & 3] D 3] P D <~ D D
D NISE N O) ) D Y] ) N &' o Y & P Y -H H N ¢ 4 T
Y - D ._.u » @ N D ® ® (49} HM D D - -H D — @ @ @ [«
D & & - i - g§ 0 P (VIO O b O ¢
W o} - D T O -H D b B D 4 D D -H o e Ul D
[¢49] —H — )] @ N H D ey fom - =il — [on D It ® Eiy) i1y Eiy) [4p] D
Q EOREEE | B O, P ® D [0} B -H ¢ B @ ® ¢ - G
) D ® H o~ D H -H - ¢ (VI HOJEEY | D o [0} ¢ ) [«
o oy Do W D D O O o, H - D & D © © D B @© W
B - 4 O 0 ¢ 1) -H D § -H e U oo B D H T @
HO)j H D -H -d H H — ® D ()RS} 0] D D )] (VI I O} D 4H
-H be D O P ©® P P D D oo o 4 n 0 -f ™ O
B D IO} D B D @ A T} Bt o4 B L99) D ©h o ¢
o) L S N A Y A F RS S ST OIS RN G B S N R e
P P D +~ & | oo~ 90 0 D # M
Q . D . . . . . . . . & D )] & . ® 3] . Eiy) 0] . K n D
HO) B - D T QO O T D o o+ oo ~ - ® N -1 D [0} ® qoo-H W
-H D @ H H O s D B @
be oo D NISEEN ) D - B - q D D
D [ON H ie n D [} )] 09} D ® 1
K] D, B D -H W D @ ¢ H @ W ¢
OF ® HO) () HORENON ¢ W D & D D Hd
O 4 N O < 0 W >~ 0 00 O 4 N OO < 0w I~ W o0 O A N M S N O~ ©
0 W W 0 W W W W W W & & O O O O O O O O O O O O O o o o O
AU SRS IS RS S U A SRR S AR S S LIS R U L LB S S S S S N T R Yo R o BN To B To RN Vo NN o NN To NN To)
R = T L e B B L T e L L B B e T e e R R R R = T =

Page 52 of 86

strieken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

D P . ~
HO) o ¢ & @ D
- YH [on — P Eiy D -md D —
K D [1v] . — D & -H P P
[00] -H @ uh TR () NS D -
G 9] N D K-S} oo D B & H N
# & —~ . - 4 . - ® o | L (] b B P
- ® D D P P Q@ oy U s D n P @
£ P 4P - L6 (O o P & D & D4
o0 ¢ P - P 0 i P D - ¢ & P Q@
EEITEEN - - - ol T TN ST D 4 H - D M
<~ ¢ Y @& +~ H D O [/ S O BN S () P K -t D, @
N » D W o, H @ H D © ¢ D ¢ @ D I @ b —
L b @ W O » B oM b © 4 P - PP
-9 & P op - Hoop S ] (OREOF T B @ o Hoo& -
£ ¢ O oo OIS U O N D - B O T I T B VR VI O}
-H D -H . - JOTN ] D H @© 4 § $H ¥ ) £ H Hp T o
- o I O (VIS ) P D O A | n o o S A LI - N VR B o
-HO P o - b ¢ ¢ O 0 o O ¢ O A o B O &
)] H T P D n O T D - ® X+ - [y - - -H -H
P & ¢ F e ¢ © ¢ H P © TP (ORI O L P oW U
Yh & D © 4 H H P! 0] -H i} - ¢ T P D -H
. D & . ~ D ¢ QP D D KT () 5 D 44 U4 4P 4P ~
T P O & N ¢ Ul D M T - 4P ® W o & T
O D D 0 ® D 4 ~ H O D WP 3] N © ¢ H D D D
c @ D © 4 — oD O ¢ - -t b HOZEENG I VIR )} D 4P
o & @ D 4 e & ¢ @ @ D D & O D ¢ & ¢ -H O
s B P D O b & H H & O -f - D - ¢ O | D
P 4 R A O R I ORIV IR R () o Dy B -H E NV
L LI TR R ) B (P ) TR - & ¢ P @ D T P WP H P
#H @ D ¢ D ® © W ¢ ¢ D -H  UH -H ¥ S B
« Y -H ¢ & D E O ¢ D O D k3 D O ¢ T ) R (OB ) NN | VI )]
[09] D ¥ D - D @© & o, P P D P D P B B D D &
< ] 9] D ) ~ — 0] T W ® h P Ho P
[ (T D R ) D -M oy ~ 0 O 1 » ¢ -f P [OFE( D
S LA (R (SR 1O B VR P P n ¢ ¢ ¢ » W oo D ® [09) N0}
b o 4 o O ¢ O X d 4 o O K D o O HoH R D
s -H P O & Ww g - D d4 O & H O O @ -H ol R T
Ao n E H D b @ 3 -H ¢ - o 4 4P -H 0 O O
P @ - & DR T V> B R O B VO D - B ¢ H ® O O
EF 0O © H o H O n 0 A O -4 O P (OFE (VIR | LB HoO4
- o0 6 0 ¢ @ TR S Y I+ (o S S (V) (O P E © 0 0
b O » & P v » O T O HO® T O H o O ©
- Y O O 4 b ¢ ¢ 4 © ¢ O P -A ¢ M P & ORI (R
P (OB () . NS 4 B 1 ¢ O Y NIROR b H @
® p q 4 £ ¥ U OF& NP s D T -H
D @© ¢ —H T D on © ()] D D p 4 DT 4P 4P — jou
- - b ¢ P® & - H D D 44 -m ¢ D & n P -H D -
P (ORI L 0 @ O P00 NOREY UL 0 <« o
~ B O © O - n oYW oW QP o P & sH P ¥ O ¢ D K
- D H @ — D — N D D & ® - O 4 — - o) YH v} [on
-H o O Hoo-m SO, I N - I} ~ ¢ ¢ H D @ b @ (OJ S ¥ 0
K B L O B B ) W ¢ ¢ ¢ ¢ D ey P - P P E
1) 1Y) D ¥ @ ® ~ @ D W o P D © O s) ¢ q D
h £ B¢ Db P 4 D H © H -f D @ D L0 U D
-H B0 O P L M D 4 4 & - 4 B B D Q " P
ol b ¢ H D 4 -t (VI - RO P & 0
« A 4 oW ¢ o4 .M D] - e O -H 4 o @
RO} W - ¢ O -H T -H D D m  4b UH 4P (VI O} D - D
ey D ® ® 4P - — @ [)) -t — D ® )] ® HO) D K
H n K 9] ey -H ® B — B ORI D H n
D U4 - 4 (] > O -Ho o = R O TR D D
U 4 A @ K - ® $H D B D D D L 4 D
D P P -H D E UH D ¢ B W #H WP H O OH N PO W
O O 4 N MO < 0O W >~ W o0 O Ad N M P N W I~ 0 o0 O A N M T N O~
o A4 A4 A4 4 A4 A4 A4 4 +d4 4 N N N N N N N N N N O OO O O O O 0O oM
To N To N To N To BT B To N To NNTo NN To BT BN To N To NENTo NENTo o T B To NN To NENTo NENTo NENTo NN To NN To NN T NENTo NENTo NENTo NN T NENTe)
— A4 4 4 4 4 4 A4 4 4 4 4 A4 A4 4 4 4 A4 A A 4 4 A A A A A A

Page 53 of 86

strieken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

D 4 h 1y N
HoD DR H D HO)J k3 D
() > ® W oo D ¢ ol
NI ) P D h P B o D oo ®
O -H ' 4 T & @ [09] W@ ow H D
P » (0] -H P D D D @ ¢ 4 P @ D 4
® D X (] D 4 ¢ P - - ¢ ¢ D ¢ D D 4 ] ®
VR V1)) O PR R O E (V] jon D1 N ()] U (0] D P M ¢ W [( I
T D O @ 4b D B -H @ D D, -H -H $H ¢ -H ™m [op)
» O r 4 ()] B O) D D H 4 - ~ 1Y) D D n @ ~
b D D ®© ©® -H ® (A INO) TR ® ORI R k3 D
¢ [o9) D H 4 P -H P (0] D a O D 4 ™ O w D &
i B O] K] ® O Yd D D ¢© # O e - P N -H | - ® W
b & -H @ s ¢ 4 o4 H D W & PP D H N L) T RO
O ¢ ¥ i D -H 4P D > & B 0 W A -H D & D 4
-HoQ O T O 4 ~ ¥ A T O O QL ¢ O R () 4P
O P H & (V)] D ©® © ¢ P > £ b D D -H - ¢ o O B D
NOREN R O] P w v O B E L Y O ¢ H T Y W oy
4P ] D + D -m o & D 9] o} v - -f o, - T P O D [o))
H O B o I = k< - h @ —H HO)J D 0] - B
— D W o H b D < 4b D - < -H ¢ P & @ N ¢ D
(VIR [4p] HORENS | D D H © Y O, ) ® @ M W 4P D ® ~
O (VI N (V] D ¢ ® ¢ b ©» O @ D D @© 4P (OO ON o I H
[09) P A B D Q - P PO D D 4 B TIY DR )] D H
I Y () E H D O W T M Ry ® 0 LU R p
£ - W@ B D & & &£ 4 D @ P U — D D - D O @O PP
(VI T D o B O 4 0 v W g 0 O £ o4 H b
g4 £ © O "W D -HoW D on 40 T L VI 1 O, ¢ H
o> ¢ -d P D H O ¢ O D 4 > O D VR D @ q
D & P @ D & ¢ © & - D ¢ ¢ O Y ¢ - O RE HH P
SV ) 1] D D @ -H H $H $H H ¢ P P —H D O O )] — D ¢
[OFEENO)) ® D W ¢ P D 4 D [99) ® D ® .« D 4
oo v HORNO) H B D ®© Y © YH Y B W H W D & © Qoo
L O FENT ) o8 ¢ P A & -fd O & D -H o HH o [V« q jon
4 — [ I} D v O - O H O, X P 4 TR TR ) [o9] D
D & uj D O D & ® [ TRNT] D D D ® D D P q
®E Y4 -H ¢ £ ¢ & H -f D & P W ¢ () < -H & W0 ot
D D b @ b € O T O B M 44 - oo oA
h r ~ BN P ~ O B & D ®h 4 T -H & QB -H D
0] oo N g X 4 pp s W & O -H (ONS  E ] N0 RN
M Q 4 >N OE O P4 ¢ ¢ s - @ - D D
boo@ - 0] (O ORE S o b & O - e N O < (O 5 HOBERL
- v n > O £ @ H O & & O} e N b O €
—H E ¢ D & H D -H @ D P D ¢ . W -H 4 T E® Q ©  -H
- O D ® oo D D v P [ 1] 0] D & U Y 9] {
O & T i} D ® $H ¢ D © ¢ £ D g D -H P P < @
©  -H P a4 B H DN D > P D 4y GO [0} D Ud
4d . D ® & H & ® E Y O Ho@ . -H N —H
HORER O P n -H A D b © -H D & D 4P n D oH Py SinE )] ORI
O ¢ ¢ ¢ P P L& oA P P W 4P o D -H @ gO) D
v @& ¢ @ U s < BRIV (¥ — Y O ¢ P - ST D -
-H D & 0} D - H @ D H o @ D D D & ¥ O -H - & 4b
H EOREEN ) H0)J O ¢ D D D D D D ¢ ™ PN D D 4 [op)
PP D D D UH P H YW T P & D @ -t ® P© ~ O
h © H | 4 d ¢ -f ~ P — D 4 B T ¢ Y TR b} >
- D - D D D #H T T #H H © H H -H al N OR EH N Y
T N O | $ P v v O v @ O P + (O ()) . ) " &
O & (ORI, D O B oH 4 C: s @ B 4P S () Y] NP )
4 -1 O @ D ® ® ® P G H & B D ©» U - £ - q o -H  F @ -
® ) 9] H D 0] & HOJEN N ® HOJIS) D B D D H D @
O P ol 0O » © O L B OE O o, - H QM P fix
b SION D — D -H & $H P ¢ & D [09] (0] D n B D
¢ 4 D D & 4« © B O H O @ -t (0] D Ho 4D H ¢
TN VRNt OR O o o b 3 W §O) (VI ON HOZE)) D ©
0 O O +H4H N MO < 1N W ™~ W O O +d N M S 0 W I~ 0 o0 O +d4 N M S .0 W
o TN Co TNES IR BN S VS A RIS S I S S U 7o N Yo NN o N To NN To RN To NN To NN To NN To ENNTo BNV RN Vo BRI\ BN BN BERNo IENNe}
To N To N o BT N T N To N o BT N To NN To NN o N To N To NN To NN To NN o N To NN To NN o BENTo NN To NN T NN o NENTo NN To NN To NN o NENTO BNNTe)
R = T T B L e B T e I e e e B e e e R B R = = =

Page 54 of 86

strieken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

_|_
P ©
¢ H D . o
— y ® - a 4 (0]
P & D 4 @ 4 P © O ~H ~H n A
(V] D L@ D - D DoH P D ® ® ~ iE)
—H H En] D -H P a (o D 4 ¢ @ S ©
- 4y D H B N o Q 1P D D O 0O Y
(o] My @ -H D B 1b D s un 4 | - - -
b [09) b -H B T P U v -H e o0 # ¢ 4P R
® D 0] ORI -H o 4b O A -H Q@ ¢ ® S RS BNG)
B o T | P 4 Hoop O L E O 4 O] n 0
0 ¢ D - D & n O KL F - ' 4D B -—H o+ g
- 4P T O U 4@ 0 9 o ~ ¢ P o) T T «
P §o; B b P -H O S T B S O N ) D
v T O o b @ ORIY — 0O ¢ & ¢ o o -
4P H HO)j (0] ¢ - M jon Q © @ ® 4P S Cm
® D B ¢ T D D © D -H 5 YA - bl 0] S 0]
P >~ P oo Q -H W b Q, T D @ -t -
s & QP T S L TR M6 —~ 9 ¢ P o S WP
ey - & 0 4 ® () #0 4 © O ¢ + n O -d
O] £ o8 - PP o€ ® o o o ¥ P [0) “ >
-t BT 0 (O b ¢ & N O] H O 09 -t @t T -
Ry D ) D ¢ = T @ - - §O) o o0 P
¥ 4P P b O | b 0 O P H o O > D0
S L b 4 o HO& PP T © o £ - D O ®©
4 © -H D 4 B P NO) S O ¢ D 4 P n 3
D 4P R O H @ 4 D E 3 £ » A - T <
4 U ) = N (RO LQ O] — £ >~ S O
o O & & - PO 1 ER) 00 b - iy 9 O A
H [ I s ON (DR 3 @ ©$ Q MO TR 4P O O P
® |+ O @ R w0 ~ M o Lo PP o > O
O ¢ ® D & ¢ & D @ D i O ¢ N uH D o L 3
N0 P L P ' P 4 A « H P . - D & 4P Y
-H P N D n QO 4 ) 4 @ O A o T P
Mo 0 o O [09] D T PP H iB) ® D (O BN ()
P ® ¢ H & D & O ¢ HE @ q n D & o o ®© G
) ) & B D Hoo-H H D D B -H @ -~ D 4 D i1y O O
n B o-H D OV OR - W W ¢ P - Y| T D - o O
-H O P D D ® 4 D B> h 0 L4 YH o ®©
W M o T O 4 OFEENTS I wp W S O { @ P D ] O
OO T TR [ b 4 n b &l » © ¢ ( S o0 g
P u b D D -H - G4 ! 4P - & D 4P P > ®©
¢ O w o -H E & G U e e L S L Y €7 o ©
Q b O T - - b 4 -H B - $ o0 © P ¢ O D n o o
(O} U ()} N ©h O PP [ SR D & 0 c
) ¢ [OR D D D D D -H ® N -H T n g Ky b Eiy) D, o ~ -A
a O -+ P P - H - H T W & D B -4 O D D — — g
£ B © #H P - D -H nh > P h P - —H . o 4
1SR T N ()] b -H ¢ - HOJ D 4P D D » & @] - kY D ¢ P C ©
0 H b — D b 4 O | L () P 4 O T P > ¢ O wn -
b © & —H § -7 & -f - T R n P U O Mg P ©@ D = o
£ 6 0 Hp o0 v D O o) (o q £ 0 P -H HORENOF §e
¢ ®© & Y4 ¢ @ Lo SR} ® D [09] o) D N
¢ Ul Ul KOREN)) H B P D o B D o @ @©
Hon IS D < < -H W @ () ) D o o g
FIS () 4 o 4P n o ~ O & —~ A 4+~ P P -1 ~ Q O
on . B @ ) . [0} . D D { -H D « a D D -H H ™M -
> v O @ o-dH o -d $ P D HOREER R3] [V S B (| D10 o -fH o~ 4 P
¢ — K kS ¢ @ B ® D 0] q (V) @ O ®©
- & oef 4 4P D4 - o YH O b 4P - -H O O
4 D O ¢ ® [00] P (0] B oo c W ¢ K O} S 3
B K8 ® S -H D @ @ » D O YH D B P 0 T
HORE | (VIO O H - - D 0] @] (Vi) ORI n o
™~ 0 O O 4 AN MO < 1" W ™~ W O O —+ N MO <« 1 O ™~ O 6O O d N O < W
© O O r~ ~ >~ >~ ™~ >~ >~ > ™~ >~ W W 0 W W W 0 0 W W & O O O O O
To N To N To N T N To N To N o BT B To N To N o N To B To NN To NN To NN T N To NN To NN o BT NN To NN To NN o NENTo NN Te NN To NN o NENTO BNNTe)
R = T T B L e B T e I e e e B e e e R B R = = =

Page 55 of 86

strieken are deletions

Words ; words underlined are additions.

CODING




1596
1597
1598
1599
1600
1601
1602
1603
1604
1605
1606
1607
1608
1609
1610
1611
1612
1613
1614
1615
1616
1617
1618
1619
1620
1621
1622
1623
1624

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
audit conducted by the Auditor General pursuant to s. 11.45
satisfies this requirement.

(4) 3 SUBMITTAL—OF TENTATIVE BDIESTRICT EDUCATIONAL
FACHEFTFIES PEAN—TOEOCAL GOVERNMENT.—The district school board
shall submit a copy of its tentative district educational
facilities plan to all affected local governments before prier
o adoption by the board. The affected local governments may
shatt review the tentative district educational facilities plan
and comment to the district school board on the consistency of
the plan with the local comprehensive plan, whether a
comprehensive plan amendment will be necessary for any proposed
educational facility, and whether the local government supports
a necessary comprehensive plan amendment. If the local
government does not support a comprehensive plan amendment for a

proposed educational facility, the matter must shalt be resolved

pursuant to the interlocal agreement when required by ss.
163.3177(6) (h), 163.31777, and 1013.33(2). The process for the
submittal and review must shatdt be detailed in the interlocal
agreement when required pursuant to ss. 163.3177(6) (h),
163.31777, and 1013.33(2).

(9) +4) ADOPTEDBISTRICT EPUCATIONALE FACEEETIES PEAN—

Annually, the district school board shall consider and adopt the
tentative district educational facilities plan ecempleted

pursuwant—te—subseetion—{2). Upon giving proper notice to the
public and local governments and opportunity for public comment,
the district school board may amend the plan to revise the
priority of projects, to add or delete projects, to reflect the
impact of change orders, or to reflect the approval of new

revenue sources which may become available. The adopted district

Page 56 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1625| educational facilities plan must shadi:
1626 (a) Be a complete, balanced, and financially feasible
1627 capital outlay financial plan for the district.
1628 (b) Set forth the proposed commitments and planned
1629| expenditures of the district to address the educational
1630 facilities needs of its students and to adequately provide for
1631 the maintenance of the educational plant and ancillary
1632 facilities, including safe access ways from neighborhoods to
1633 schools.
1634 (6) 45 EXECEFION-—OF APORPTED DBISTRICT FPBUCATFONALT—FACT T IES

1635| PEAN-——The first year of the adopted district educational

s shaltl—eons wte the capital outlay

1636 facilities plan constitute
1637| budget required in s. 1013.

6l. Fhe—eadepted—district—educationat
1638 faeititiesplan—shall dnelude—the information reguired—in
1639 2 =7
1640| funded—Tn—the—ptan~
1641 Section 37. Section 1013.356, Florida Statutes, is amended
1642 to read:
1643 1013.356 Local funding for educational facilities benefit

1644 districts or community development districts.—Upon confirmation
1645| by a district school board of the commitment of revenues by an
1646| educational facilities benefit district or community development
1647 district necessary to construct and maintain an educational

1648 facility contained within an individual district facilities work
1649| program or proposed by an approved charter school or a charter
1650 school applicant, the following funds shall be provided to the
1651| educational facilities benefit district or community development

1652 district annually, beginning with the next fiscal year after

1653 confirmation until the district’s financial obligations are

Page 57 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1654 completed:
1655 (1) All educational facilities impact fee revenue collected
1656| for new development within the educational facilities benefit
1657| district or community development district. Funds provided under
1658 this subsection shall be used to fund the construction and
1659| capital maintenance costs of educational facilities.
1660 (2) For construction and capital maintenance costs not
1661 covered by the funds provided under subsection (1), an annual
1662 amount contributed by the district school board equal to one-

1663| half of the remaining costs of construction and capital

1664| maintenance of the educational facility. Any—eceonstrvetion—eosts

1665 ~lhsr +h PSWANR NN S R Do Nt R B NG S atralhl 1 aohad 24 o
o0 vVe—TtnC—COoOS TPt —Sttut it e ra o taor ottt —S
1666 1012 cA(e) (Y] alha11 1 FaanA~A Alaraaxrnlxr sy + 1 Airat 1 Ao
TUTIO - O T (O (O T+ ottaorr T oGO CXCrroo T ve Ty Oy it~ o utacToOhia=x
1667 o~ ]+~ Ihanm Lo A ot g ~ r + 1] commatrma s Atz A A 4
T CTrrTr e POt Tt O St rC o O Tt Coftutr oy OGS veTOPpmcHit

1668| &istriets Funds contributed by a district school board shall not
1669| be used to fund operational costs.

1670
1671 Educational facilities funded pursuant to this act may be

1672 constructed on land that is owned by any person after the

1673 district school board has acquired from the owner of the land a
1674 long-term lease for the use of this land for a period of not

1675 less than 46—ears—oer the life expectancy of the permanent

1676| facilities constructed thereon—whiecheveris—tenger. All

1677| interlocal agreements entered into pursuant to this act must
1678| shatdt provide for ownership of educational facilities funded
1679| pursuant to this act to revert to the district school board if
1680 such facilities cease to be used for public educational purposes

jeor—te the end

s

1681 b f nyra v 1+ 40 <znonvre Sft A~y A~ b~ o A r
erore PTrT=OTr—Tt0O Tuo yCaorsS orctCr COoOScrut oo OTr P
1

1682 of the life expectancy of the educational facilitiess—whichever

Page 58 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

D
o) © . foa) h O
0] [69) oo D 1Y)
o) in) (] [09] -H QD NP 4P
o (] (0] 4 — D D N o]
0} G Q & D D D 4P oo D ow
S O © P T ¢ 4b T O N ) 4
© + - D @ DI n @ P
| o » 0O p W D 4b & © % D, 0] HO)
() > O P O -H -H E D D P th m D
- > O “ a WP HooH H oo [op)
P> T 0 O B O P H ® & - [op)
N -4 P © < B | S TI 3 —H D O ®
0 —~ - @] @] D K 8 D m D D — Ky
O] - “ ~ -4 P ] B i1y @ K3 Y [ [l
iE) Q O [ES) B N ON @ P - [09] b P
3 —H o g Qo»m @ D O] h -H D s
iS] X @© O P UH D -Ho4p a4 @ (V1Y) D
© O g 9 O g« D O D b ¢ @ —H D
iE) — X Q0 P q [o9) D, P B —H
1)) H © 0 O g n v P () < HoQ D
0] # O s T P h & P b
© c o a “ ¢ © O P o D 4 ®
T o L ®© -~ ) P ~ P Q - © N @ @ H
- -—-H A g 3 & m @ & [o9) -H L ()] D O o))
“ P z P o' D @ [99] D D ® ~ D ¢ D
O @] (0] o o-H 4b q [09) D @ - n — (1]
— 3 .Y o . -H @ ¢ © o>~ D B ™ O D
[y 4 >N 0 @ B @ @ E g P B @ ool
n] ° - 0] q D o ¢ D K1Y Q- [l
~ n = — | o -H D [ON @ — 4P D [¢p] D b Yy [on
Lo a “ o -~ 4 kY D, — D b — D D -H
foe) O U © g £ O p ¢ ¢ orx -H < NORN 4P
™ O ~ 0] O D D D K o - k< S IO (o] [OFEH My
. © S () oo P D ¢ O D R N O TN )] o))
™ P O O O 4 H»H oH Y O o -H i e ® -f e -H
— o QO 4 P [99) —H - © ~ @ O] i St
o - o ©n -A ¢ ¢ -H H - T D ¢ D P @
— S [9)] q @R D D 0] [on ® &Y D BN - Q@ H
Y O ¢ O O H -H W § - ®E ¢ 4 @ - D —H D
a n O -H O P [ )] D ®© & 0 H ] 4y
O -—H g o P @ [ON D ® HOJNO)] (OO} D D 4P ~
-— T O 0 & ®» -f D ©® © B D @© O 4 q N D
i) n Q O 0] 0] D @ D #$ P D D . @ HO)j
@) — e A O O © ¢ ©h P 4 ud W op -H -
O] o o P o D D D H D —H 1
0 @] O s —~H A O o T HOREES ! D ~ N D $H D
S 4 9 9 — -f W & @ op D N D HOJERS | D H
. O 4 P g A » D -H & . D @& $H >N 4 4y [oR
[ee} n P -—H 0O D © D o k< D D © P ® .
™ n o @ H @ o+ -H ¢ T h P 4
0 -H a O W [ON D -d P D HO) (V4 D [y @ D
a «©w T A P -H B @ D §H ® 1 4 P ¢ D o
@) ™ in] — g H»H O O i D [{ ) ETO Y LR o]
o s L 0 & ®©® P ® B P ® - D = mn i) D
iB] ™ o O g - 4 D T ¢ VR TR 15 [ox) T @ M
O e g -4 O = ¢ ¢ O @ D 4~ & +~ O O
O T O L oA D -H b P v Q@ -H O -H -f . .
n © O 5 P & ¥ O o C I R O N S 4 T W L
0} H < ®© O b ¢ -H o o IR R D I
“~ — @] @] (@] o # . YH D H ¢ 0]
Q n 5 G oo Qo WO D, p @
O 3 O T O £ D B oW 4H D 9 OB [OFEENOY
s} 0, 4 O ®m B T ' O T ) D uH D ® n 0
N ST N W~ 0 o0 O 4 N M T .0 W M~ 0 o0 O A N S W W s~ W o O o
W W W W W W W O O O & O O O O O O O O O O O O O o o O o o
W W W W VW YW W W VW YW VW VW VW YW v VW © r~ ™~ M™~MN~:0>~:>D>~>M™~ > > >~ >
R = T e T B B B B B B T T T e T e T e H e B B B e R R R R T e T =

Page 59 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

H D
D Y ~ Pl p ot
. D —H Q| £ @» ol ¢ 1b ko]
& D R o B B o o o ¢ 4 o
D bl D D v O ~H| o e R = I R R - <
~ i e o woo o g > S| Q 9o £ O -d O W l
N W oo D O < O £ «© 3| O - Qf - <
b D @ D T »n ©nl o < nl o © L P i} . 0]
e @ £ D 1) o] 3 ~ al ¢ - D | < ™ >
N DO D n W 4 gl a| o o] g ®© W 4 Ol O — -
O ¢ P ¢ #H §O) D O O @ O H| H| | » W ¢ gc| T o s
T < D - -H @ D L H = Ql © ¢ B O - — @®
-HoON o 4b X - ) >y P O ©of El >N O © £ > —
S I R (W D 4P B i) © © > S O 0] O| ] © a a 9]
HO)j (OS] o)l o HO)j -~ g i} ol L -H “ q [4p] { = © . @] -
k< -H HO) o)l D — @] O a — 0] D - D G al -H o
N By H ¢ - H - o O S Q © O ®n T T| L © P 0]
n P P (V! QO @© > O O O -H| 4 D Y —| O —
>~ F ® D D © 0] M- [M] “ | L H 09} © Q| Ay 0]
® ¢ ¥ O 9] D D 9] [O) e 0] = a D ® (@] O n o~
kS - -H D ® O © O g =2 «© L| O O & Q| ©f H +
P ~ © » O -H b < cl M| Al A S H Q O W ()
® 9] ® D @ be (] i) 0 © a H IS 0] ¢ — n| L @] S
D D, $H . ® D & - O H| -A 0] O © o 4 -f (@] — -
K & )] (OO H fH 4 n - (@] S O © ® kY (@] “ Q| —~ [E3]
(VI VI N OF ) -4 © M Sl Al €] O g & H &S| O G
~ 4 4 0 i & 4P £ Q 4 g O 4] of Al ™| H © O L | — = 0
0 oo T C R o P RO -H - S| o| -A| o A s - n| T £
NN P o] ni 0 G| -H| O nl o n P Ol > © ®© O
S B O TR B O O D g n| o g o 4 >N O <l gl O & O O
o9} k4 H D [} (o R En] © ©| -~ ~ o T| Q O [ 0 a © ~ ~
e ¥ -H ¢ ®© D - D H ¢ 0 > - ol S| -d D o 0] 0
Q ® HO)J 9] D oo al Al )] “ O 0] & D > o —~ O )]
K (VR D n O D i 0] ol Al -+ 0] | -H o $H @ O “q4 o P (o]
® k3 N » ool -l - [49] §0) < C 0| T P - “ D q a Q| — —
B - nh P = 0| C —| Q| O ¥4 ©® 0| & T O
D 4 H D 4 D @ D o8 Sl 3l 4] o o & D o K| w O
@ D D @ ® P i1y — D q o P O ol < o 1 P D “ c O LI
-H 4 ed -d - P (ol -H O ~ O £| 0 o V] O O S ®m
A H B H D O @ N 0 >y —~ O Hl 4 H gl 9 4 o
iR A OB 44 -H o> Q| O O Of g Of - o 4 L € O
¢ & 4 -H M D 0o} D » P - ol <l H| P D ¢ 2l O ®© O
(ORI B0 & O o i O A o T| Al 0|l - S|l £ ¢ ol O O <
) D D@ & @ D #$ P H —~ M 0] a Ql H @] B G a0 P 0 ] O
W» QO -H -H F s & O A . G| & O 3|1 O -H D 4 Ol @ Q 4 »m
(BN N Hof P A ® O N -H| ®© A n| O -H gl Pl B ©
O -H ®© 4 D & H P H © o g| H| ol -H kS 0| n =]
¢ H O H DB P D D H O Y| Q| Q| O O > o) ~ X
B D T O-H @ b | SR ) S| gl g A & —| O C ) IS ¢
PO H Y 4 - D D 4 ®© P Al Qo B o] A -H 4 Hl Sl o 0 =
n P b O oy N (R OB 0| ® “ @ - S| Pl P o»
i T ox W Y & w T g » O 4 O F { Q 3
4 B & Y & D D - oo oA ol o | 3| < ¢ © ol g P
D D - D D - — ”W D s @ O n - M O ) — [OR O - O © <
Y LAY "I TR § - & O P © o © wnl < [OTRE(Y] in} -~ P .
b T F I D O = e ) NI o 2 0| | g| O 4 [ T L o o |
H ® (VN OR D T ¢ 4~ © P NS Oo| O| Of T| O O — .
® . (ORI | L o 4 D “ o P T| -H ® M- | T 0] T O )]
-H N | P op H K T O © Al O O L O N ¢ ¢ 4 O] n» T — 0
— HO)J [ (o] & 0, B O S P| o 4o ©O D 4 Al O - (@)
-H P - 1b B O w -AH| | © o Ll o -H 3| Y Q,
X b N Y [09) —H Q ST 0| O o P O oX O S
iy e £ ¢ P oy —H D O 3 0| & O Xl of o ¢ ol ®n — 3
® Q #H -H T -H -H £ 09 Tl Al Hl o] L ©f Hl © Foy Q,
N O TN O >~ 0 OO0 4 N MO S W >~ 0w o0 O 4 N M S 0N W~ W o o
— =4 4 4 4 4 4 4 &N N N N N N N N N N O MO O O O O o0O0oOno0oo0o
~ D~ r~ ™~ ™~ ~ ™~ >~ ™~ ™~ >~ >~“™> ™~ ™>~™/m™~ >~/ ™~ ™~ ™~ >~ > ©>~ @~ >~ ™©~ o ©> o©>
— — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —

Page 60 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




1741
1742
1743
1744
1745
1746
1747
1748
1749
1750
1751
1752
1753
1754
1755
1756
1757
1758
1759
1760
1761
1762
1763
1764
1765
1766
1767
1768
1769

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
(3) SCHOOL DISTRICT EDUCATIONAL FACILITIES PLAN.—It is the

purpose of the Legislature to create s. 1013.35, requiring each

school district annually to adopt an educational facilities plan

that provides an integrated long-range facilities plans+

oA aa
cCO—IC TS

[OR
ar

K N 1
T =4 I

he—suvrvey—ofprojee o FeaF—WOE
program. The purpose of the educational facilities plan is to
keep the district school board, local governments, and the
public fully informed as to whether the district is using sound
policies and practices that meet the essential needs of students
and that warrant public confidence in district operations. The
educational facilities plan will be monitored by the Office of
Educational Facilities, which will also apply performance
standards pursuant to s. 1013.04.

(4) OFFICE OF EDUCATIONAL FACILITIES.—It is the purpose of
the Legislature to require the Office of Educational Facilities
to assist school districts in building SMART schools utilizing

functional and frugal practices. The Office of Educational

Facilities shall must review district facilities weork—programs

aad projects and identify opportunities to maximize design and

construction savingsi—develep—school—distriect—faecilities—word
programperformance—standardss and provide for review and
recommendations to the Governor, the Legislature, and the State
Board of Education.

Section 40. Paragraph (e) of subsection (1) and subsection
(4) of section 1013.45, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1013.45 Educational facilities contracting and construction
techniques for school districts and Florida College System
institutions.—

(1) District school boards and boards of trustees of

Page 61 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1770
1771
1772
1773
1774
1775
1776
1777
1778
1779
1780
1781
1782
1783
1784
1785
1786
1787
1788
1789
1790
1791
1792
1793
1794
1795
1796
1797
1798

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
Florida College System institutions may employ procedures to
contract for construction of new facilities, or for additions,
remodeling, renovation, maintenance, or repairs to existing
facilities, which include, but are not limited to:

(e) Day-labor contracts not exceeding $280,000 for
construction, renovation, remodeling, or maintenance of existing
facilities. This amount shall be adjusted annually based upon

changes in the Consumer Price Index. District school boards are

exempt from the contract limitations provided in this paragraph.

(4) Except as otherwise provided in this section and s.
481.229, the services of a registered architect must be used by

Florida College System institution and state university boards

of trustees for the development of plans for the erection,

enlargement, or alteration of any educational facility. The
services of a registered architect are not required for a minor
renovation project for which the construction cost is less than
$50,000 or for the placement or hookup of relocatable
educational—facilities that conform to standards adopted under
s. 1013.37. However, boards must provide compliance with
building code requirements and ensure that these structures are

adequately anchored for wind resistance as required by law. &

A4 bt A on 1 brenrd a1 o o P E P H Ry

|\ N EUD ) U S T =] TR0 1T T OT IO [N 2 NN Ny & R S [H S W W T ) ) A Ju =y L._Llly 1T C 1T | R N

Ao cimant o D D L E e VA, FAp e B Py, AN o P R
\waw, LW 5§ § A WSl i S A M\_/Q_Lyll = T C T 1T 1T tJL/L T L/Ly\_/bh) [ S - o AT [N S P W TN ) = [ S NS @ RN J S N S Y
P I TE o oAl P [ P S R D P |

ITr tJ_L().\/L,_L\/()._L i . iy L [ Y i A W AW g OO CI T CTC =] v _YC().-L ASPAW B U I Uy & B WP S W i i @ Ry iy
PPN IR I N PN Ty, [N U, IR DAP, 1 P H R £ ISR

T C T T T CTICTWOo WOLTIY tJ_L().ll TTITTCOC TOTCT O T CUTIT o C T OCTIUIT A\ = W O IO 1T

e aoh Ta o oAb 4 PP S| P [P
T [ ¥ AW AW gu uyw) i S o C O CTTITCO =TT CTITCT o I \jJ_().\J.C \j_LUL/ltJ (@ yaw 8 tJ_LU\j_L().lll,

PP N lement arsz st 47 I bl + 1 P R L, 1y bl
o o puy (&) \_/_I_\_/lI.L\_/J.J.L,(_/LJ__Y, lI.L_I_\_A.\_A._I_\_/, A LL_L&LL =] LL\J\J_L, LS N |\ N EUD [ U SR S U [ AP I B A

Page 62 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

words underlined are additions.



1799
1800
1801
1802
1803
1804
1805
1806
1807
1808
1809
1810
1811
1812
1813
1814
1815
1816
1817
1818
1819
1820
1821
1822
1823
1824
1825
1826
1827

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
287.055, a board may purchase the architectural services for the
design of educational or ancillary facilities under an existing
contract agreement for professional services held by a district
school board in the State of Florida, provided that the purchase
is to the economic advantage of the purchasing board, the
services conform to the standards prescribed by rules of the
State Board of Education, and such reuse i1s not without notice
to, and permission from, the architect of record whose plans or
design criteria are being reused. Plans must be reviewed for
compliance with the State Requirements for Educational
Facilities. Rules adopted under this section must establish
uniform prequalification, selection, bidding, and negotiation
procedures applicable to construction management contracts and
the design-build process. This section does not supersede any
small, woman-owned, or minority-owned business enterprise
preference program adopted by a board. Except as otherwise
provided in this section, the negotiation procedures applicable
to construction management contracts and the design-build
process must conform to the requirements of s. 287.055. A board
may not modify any rules regarding construction management
contracts or the design-build process.

Section 41. Section 1013.48, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

1013.48 Changes in construction requirements after award of
contract.—The board may, at its option and by written policy
duly adopted and entered in its official minutes, authorize the
superintendent or president or other designated individual to
approve change orders in the name of the board for

preestablished amounts. Approvals must shatt be for the purpose

Page 63 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1828 of expediting the work in progress and must shalt be reported to
1829 the board and entered in its official minutes. Feor

1830 AAAAAA ESIN ENE N I Y Sy o 1 Adaatrra~t a7 ] s a b~ S A A~
o C UoUTUITCOXD 1T 1T 1T L.,_Y, CIT [ I PN B B A |\ N ERUD [ U S S W Sy [ 2 NN iy & R S IO T 1T C O 10 (S yaw 5 - LJVJ_L_, CIT

1831 T~ £ ~h o r A~ N 2t a Ad ot At A~ + Nl o~ o

_I_J.I.I.LJLA.\_,L_, . \./J.J.(.A.J.J.\j A\ Ep W § 10 A\ iy T CO |\ N ERUD ) U SR S W Sy AP I W B WPy @b Rl WS S U B i) & R iy Ji S @ N N S S S U S W )

1832| prarpursuent—fteo—s-—31013-35

1833 Section 42. Section 1013.64, Florida Statutes, 1s amended

1834 to read:

1835 1013.64 Funds for comprehensive educational plant needs;

1836| construction cost maximums for school district capital

1837| projects.—Allocations from the Public Education Capital Outlay
1838 and Debt Service Trust Fund to the various boards for capital
1839 outlay projects must shatd be determined as follows:

1840 (1) (a) Funds for remodeling, renovation, maintenance,

1841 repairs, and site improvement for existing satisfactory

1842 facilities shall be given priority consideration by the

1843 Legislature for appropriations allocated to the boards from the
1844 total amount of the Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt
1845 Service Trust Fund appropriated. These funds shall be calculated
1846| pursuant to the following basic formula: the building value
1847 times the building age over the sum of the years’ digits

1848 assuming a 50-year building life. For modular noncombustible
1849| facilities, a 35-year life shall be used, and for relocatable
1850 facilities, a 20-year life shall be used. “Building value” is
1851 calculated by multiplying each building’s total assignable

1852 square feet times the appropriate net-to-gross conversion rate
1853 found in state board rules and that product times the current
1854 average new construction cost. “Building age” is calculated by

1855| multiplying the prior year’s building age times 1 minus the

1856| prior year’s sum received from this subsection divided by the

Page 64 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1857
1858
1859
1860
1861
1862
1863
1864
1865
1866
1867
1868
1869
1870
1871
1872
1873
1874
1875
1876
1877
1878
1879
1880
1881
1882
1883
1884
1885

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
prior year’s building value. To the net result shall be added
the number 1. Each board shall receive the percentage generated
by the preceding formula of the total amount appropriated for
the purposes of this section.

(b) Each board is prohibited from using the funds received
pursuant to this section to supplant funds in the current fiscal
year approved operating budget, and all budgeted funds shall be
expended at a rate not less than would have been expended had
the funds under this section not been received.

(c) Each remodeling, renovation, maintenance, repair, or
site improvement project will expand or upgrade current
educational plants to prolong the useful 1life of the plant.

(d) Each board shall maintain fund accounting in a manner
which will permit a detailed audit of the funds expended in this
program.

(e) Remodeling projects must shatd be based on the
recommendations of a survey pursuant to s. 1013.31, or, for

district school boards, as indicated by the relative need as

determined by the Florida Inventory of School Houses and the

capital outlay full-time equivalent enrollment in the district.

(f) At least one-tenth of a Florida College System

institution’s or state university’s board of trustees’ beardls

annual allocation provided under this section must shaid be

spent to correct unsafe, unhealthy, or unsanitary conditions in
its educational facilities, as required by s. 1013.12, or a
lesser amount sufficient to correct all deficiencies cited in
its annual comprehensive safety inspection reports. This
paragraph must shai+ not be construed to limit the amount a

board may expend to correct such deficiencies.

Page 65 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1886
1887
1888
1889
1890
1891
1892
1893
1894
1895
1896
1897
1898
1899
1900
1901
1902
1903
1904
1905
1906
1907
1908
1909
1910
1911
1912
1913
1914

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

(g) When an existing educational plant is determined to be
unsatisfactory pursuant to the survey conducted under s.
1013.31, the board may, by resolution, designate the plant as a
historic educational facility and may use funds generated for
renovation and remodeling pursuant to this section to restore
the facility for use by the board. The board shall agree to pay
renovation and remodeling costs in excess of funds which such
facility would have generated through the depreciation formula
in paragraph (a) had the facility been determined to be
satisfactory. The board shall further agree that the plant shall
continue to house students. The board may designate a plant as a
historic educational facility only if the Division of Historical
Resources of the Department of State or the appropriate historic
preservation board under chapter 266 certifies that:

1. The plant is listed or determined eligible for listing
in the National Register of Historic Places pursuant to the
National Historic Preservation Act of 1966, as amended, 16
U.S.C. s. 470;

2. The plant is designated historic within a certified
local district pursuant to s. 48(g) (3) (B) (ii) of the Internal
Revenue Code; or

3. The division or historic preservation board otherwise
finds that the plant is historically significant.

(h) University boards of trustees may utilize funds
appropriated pursuant to this section for replacement of minor
facilities. Minor facilities may not be replaced from funds
provided pursuant to this section unless the board determines
that the cost of repair or renovation is greater than or equal

to the cost of replacement.

Page 66 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1915
1916
1917
1918
1919
1920
1921
1922
1923
1924
1925
1926
1927
1928
1929
1930
1931
1932
1933
1934
1935
1936
1937
1938
1939
1940
1941
1942
1943

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
(2) (a) The department shall establish, as a part of the
Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund, a
separate account, in an amount determined by the Legislature, to
be known as the “Special Facility Construction Account.” The
Special Facility Construction Account shall be used to provide
necessary construction funds to school districts which have
urgent construction needs but which lack sufficient resources at
present, and cannot reasonably anticipate sufficient resources
within the period of the next 3 years, for these purposes from
currently authorized sources of capital outlay revenue. A school
district requesting funding from the Special Facility
Construction Account shall submit one specific construction
project, not to exceed one complete educational plant, to the
Special Facility Construction Committee. A district may not
receive funding for more than one approved project in any 3-year
period or while any portion of the district’s participation
requirement is outstanding. The first year of the 3-year period
shall be the first year a district receives an appropriation.
During the 2019-2020 school year, a school district that
sustained hurricane damage in the 2018-2019 school year may
request funding from the Special Facility Construction Account
for a new project before the completion of the district’s
participation requirement for an outstanding project. The
department shall encourage a construction program that reduces
the average size of schools in the district. The request must
meet the following criteria to be considered by the committee:
1. The project must be deemed a critical need and must be
recommended for funding by the Special Facility Construction

Committee. Before developing construction plans for the proposed

Page 67 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
1944 facility, the district school board must request a
1945| preapplication review by the Special Facility Construction
1946| Committee or a project review subcommittee convened by the chair
1947 of the committee to include two representatives of the
1948| department and two staff members from school districts not
1949| eligible to participate in the program. A school district may
1950 request a preapplication review at any time; however, if the
1951 district school board seeks inclusion in the department’s next
1952 annual capital outlay legislative budget request, the
1953| preapplication review request must be made before February 1.
1954| Within 90 days after receiving the preapplication review
1955| request, the committee or subcommittee must meet in the school
1956| district to review the project proposal and existing facilities.
1957 To determine whether the proposed project is a critical need,
1958 the committee or subcommittee shall consider, at a minimum, the
1959| capacity of all existing facilities within the district as
1960| determined by the Florida Inventory of School Houses; the
1961 district’s pattern of student growth; the district’s existing
1962 and projected capital outlay full-time equivalent student
1963 enrollment as determined by the demographic, revenue, and
1964 education estimating conferences established in s. 216.136; the
1965 district’s existing satisfactory student stations; the use of
1966 all existing district property and facilities; grade level
1967 configurations; and any other information that may affect the

1968 need for the proposed project.

1969 2. The construction project must be recommended in—themost
1970

1971 district school board amd—the—departments and approved by the
1972| department under the rules of the State Board of Education. If a

Page 68 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




1973
1974
1975
1976
1977
1978
1979
1980
1981
1982
1983
1984
1985
1986
1987
1988
1989
1990
1991
1992
1993
1994
1995
1996
1997
1998
1999
2000
2001

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

district school board employs a consultant in the preparation of

a survey or survey amendment, the consultant may not be employed
by or receive compensation from a third party that designs or
constructs a project recommended by the survey.

3. The construction project must appear on the district’s
approved project priority list under the rules of the State
Board of Education.

4. The district school board must have selected and had

approved a site for the construction project in compliance with
s. 1013.36 and the rules of the State Board of Education.
5. The district school board shall have developed a

district school board adopted list of facilities that do not
exceed the norm for net square feet occupancy requirements under
the State Requirements for Educational Facilities, using all
possible programmatic combinations for multiple use of space to
obtain maximum daily use of all spaces within the facility under

consideration.

s
I__I

Page 69 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2002
2003
2004
2005
2006
2007
2008
2009
2010
2011
2012
2013
2014
2015
2016
2017
2018
2019
2020
2021
2022
2023
2024
2025
2026
2027
2028
2029
2030

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

4~ There shall be an agreement signed by the district
school board stating that it will advertise for bids within 30
days of receipt of its encumbrance authorization from the
department.

7.8+ For construction projects for which Special Facilities
Construction Account funding is sought before the 2019-2020
fiscal year, the district shall, at the time of the request and
for a continuing period necessary to meet the district’s
participation requirement, levy the maximum millage against its
nonexempt assessed property value as allowed in s. 1011.71(2) or
shall raise an equivalent amount of revenue from the school
capital outlay surtax authorized under s. 212.055(6). Beginning
with construction projects for which Special Facilities
Construction Account funding is sought in the 2019-2020 fiscal
year, the district shall, for a minimum of 3 years before
submitting the request and for a continuing period necessary to
meet its participation requirement, levy the maximum millage
against the district’s nonexempt assessed property value as
authorized under s. 1011.71(2) or shall raise an equivalent
amount of revenue from the school capital outlay surtax
authorized under s. 212.055(6). Any district with a new or
active project, funded under the provisions of this subsection,
shall be required to budget no more than the value of 1 mill per
year to the project until the district’s participation
requirement relating to the local discretionary capital
improvement millage or the equivalent amount of revenue from the
school capital outlay surtax is satisfied.

8.9+ If a contract has not been signed 90 days after the

advertising of bids, the funding for the specific project shall

Page 70 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2031
2032
2033
2034
2035
2036
2037
2038
2039
2040
2041
2042
2043
2044
2045
2046
2047
2048
2049
2050
2051
2052
2053
2054
2055
2056
2057
2058
2059

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
revert to the Special Facility New Construction Account to be
reallocated to other projects on the list. However, an
additional 90 days may be granted by the commissioner.

9.36~ The department shall certify the inability of the
district to fund the survey-reecommended project over a
continuous 3-year period using projected capital outlay revenue
derived from s. 9(d), Art. XII of the State Constitution, as
amended, paragraph (3) (a) of this section, and s. 1011.71(2).

10.+}~ The district shall have on file with the department
an adopted resolution acknowledging its commitment to satisfy
its participation requirement, which is equivalent to all
unencumbered and future revenue acquired from s. 9(d), Art. XII
of the State Constitution, as amended, paragraph (3) (a) of this
section, and s. 1011.71(2), in the year of the initial
appropriation and for the 2 years immediately following the
initial appropriation.

11.3+2+ Phase I plans must be approved by the district
school board as being in compliance with the building and 1life
safety codes before June 1 of the year the application is made.

(b) The Special Facility Construction Committee shall be
composed of the following: two representatives of the Department
of Education, a representative from the Governor’s office, a
representative selected annually by the district school boards,
and a representative selected annually by the superintendents. A
representative of the department shall chair the committee.

(c) The committee shall review the requests submitted from
the districts, evaluate the ability of the project to relieve
critical needs, and rank the requests in priority order. This

statewide priority list for special facilities construction

Page 71 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
2060 shall be submitted to the Legislature in the commissioner’s
2061 annual capital outlay legislative budget request at least 45
2062| days prior to the legislative session.
2063 (3) (a) Each district school board shall receive an amount
2064 from the Public Education Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust
2065 Fund to be calculated by computing the capital outlay membership
2066 as determined by the department. Such membership must include,
2067| but is not limited to, prekindergarten through grade 12 students
2068| whose instruction is funded by the Florida Education Finance
2069| Program and for whom the school district provides the
2070| educational facility.
2071 (b) The capital outlay full-time equivalent membership
2072 shall be determined by counting the reported unweighted full-
2073| time equivalent student membership for the second and third
2074 surveys with each survey limited to 0.5 full-time equivalent
2075 student membership per student and comparing the results on a
2076| school-by-school basis with the Florida Inventory of School
2077 Houses.
2078 (c) The capital outlay full-time equivalent membership by
2079| grade level organization shall be used in making calculations.
2080 The capital outlay membership by grade level organization for
2081 the 4th prior year must be used to compute the base-year
2082 allocation. The capital outlay full-time equivalent membership
2083| by grade-level organization for the prior year must be used to
2084 compute the growth over the highest of the 3 years preceding the
2085| prior year. From the total amount appropriated by the
2086| Legislature pursuant to this subsection, 40 percent shall be

2087 allocated among the base capital outlay full-time equivalent

2088| membership and 60 percent among the growth capital outlay full-

Page 72 of 86
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
2089 time equivalent membership. The allocation within each of these
2090 groups shall be prorated to the districts based upon each
2091| district’s percentage of base and growth capital outlay full-
2092 time equivalent membership. The most recent 4-year capital
2093| outlay full-time equivalent membership data shall be used in
2094| each subsequent year’s calculation for the allocation of funds
2095 pursuant to this subsection. If a change, correction, or
2096 recomputation of data during any year results in a reduction or
2097 increase of the calculated amount previously allocated to a
2098| district, the allocation to that district shall be adjusted
2099| accordingly. If such recomputation results in an increase or
2100 decrease of the calculated amount, such additional or reduced
2101 amounts shall be added to or reduced from the district’s future
2102 appropriations. However, no change, correction, or recomputation
2103| of data shall be made subsequent to 2 years following the
2104 initial annual allocation.
2105 (d) Funds accruing to a district school board from the
2106| provisions of this section shall be expended on needed projects
2107 as shown by —survey—er—surveys under the rules of the State Board
2108 of Education.
2109 (e) A district school board may lease relocatable
2110 educational facilities for up to 3 years using nonbonded PECO
2111 funds and for any time period using local capital outlay
2112 millage.
2113 (f) Funds distributed to the district school boards shall
2114 be allocated solely based on the provisions of paragraphs (1) (a)
2115 and (2) (a) and paragraphs (a)-(c) of this subsection. No
2116 individual school district projects shall be funded off the top
2117 of funds allocated to district school boards.

Page 73 of 86
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2118
2119
2120
2121
2122
2123
2124
2125
2126
2127
2128
2129
2130
2131
2132
2133
2134
2135
2136
2137
2138
2139
2140
2141
2142
2143
2144
2145
2146

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
(4) (a) Florida College System institution boards of
trustees and university boards of trustees shall receive funds
for projects based on a 3-year priority list, to be updated
annually, which is submitted to the Legislature in the
legislative budget request at least 90 days prior to the
legislative session. The State Board of Education shall submit a
3-year priority list for Florida College System institutions,
and the Board of Governors shall submit a 3-year priority list
for universities. The lists shall reflect decisions by the State
Board of Education for Florida College System institutions and
the Board of Governors for state universities concerning program
priorities that implement the statewide plan for program growth
and quality improvement in education. No remodeling or
renovation project shall be included on the 3-year priority list
unless the project has been recommended pursuant to s. 1013.31
or 1s for the purpose of correcting health and safety
deficiencies. No new construction project shall be included on
the first year of the 3-year priority list unless the
educational specifications have been approved by the
commissioner for a Florida College System institution project or
by the Board of Governors for a university project, as
applicable. The funds requested for a new construction project
in the first year of the 3-year priority list shall be in
conformance with the scope of the project as defined in the
educational specifications. Any new construction project
requested in the first year of the 3-year priority list which is
not funded by the Legislature shall be carried forward to be
listed first in developing the updated 3-year priority list for
the subsequent year’s capital outlay budget. Should the order of

Page 74 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2147
2148
2149
2150
2151
2152
2153
2154
2155
2156
2157
2158
2159
2160
2161
2162
2163
2164
2165
2166
2167
2168
2169
2170
2171
2172
2173
2174
2175

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
the priority of the projects change from year to year, a
justification for such change shall be included with the updated
priority list.

(b) Florida College System institution boards of trustees
and university boards of trustees may lease relocatable
educational facilities for up to 3 years using nonbonded PECO
funds.

(c) Florida College System institution boards of trustees
and university boards of trustees shall receive funds for
remodeling, renovation, maintenance and repairs, and site
improvement for existing satisfactory facilities pursuant to
subsection (1).

(5) District school boards shall identify each fund source
and the use of each proportionate to the project cost, as
identified in the bid document, to assure compliance with this
section. The data shall be submitted to the department, which
shall track this information as submitted by the boards. PECO
funds shall not be expended as indicated in the following:

(a) District school boards shall provide landscaping by
local funding sources or initiatives. District school boards are
exempt from local landscape ordinances but may comply with the
local requirements if such compliance is less costly than
compliance with the landscape requirements of the Florida
Building Code for public educational facilities.

(b) PECO funds shall not be used for the construction of
football fields, bleachers, site lighting for athletic
facilities, tennis courts, stadiums, racquetball courts, or any
other competition-type facilities not required for physical

education curriculum. Regional or intradistrict football

Page 75 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2176
2177
2178
2179
2180
2181
2182
2183
2184
2185
2186
2187
2188
2189
2190
2191
2192
2193
2194
2195
2196
2197
2198
2199
2200
2201
2202
2203
2204

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
stadiums may be constructed with these funds provided a minimum
of two high schools and two middle schools are assigned to the
facility and—the stadiumsare survey recommended. Sophisticated
auditoria shall be limited to magnet performing arts schools,
with all other schools using basic lighting and sound systems as
determined by rule. Local funds shall be used for enhancement of
athletic and performing arts facilities.

(6) (a) Each district school board must meet all educational
plant space needs of its elementary, middle, and high schools
before spending funds from the Public Education Capital Outlay
and Debt Service Trust Fund or the School District and Community
College District Capital Outlay and Debt Service Trust Fund for
any ancillary plant or any other new construction, renovation,
or remodeling of ancillary space. Expenditures to meet such
space needs may include expenditures for site acquisition; new
construction of educational plants; renovation, remodeling, and
maintenance and repair of existing educational plants, including
auxiliary facilities; and the directly related costs of such
services of school district personnel. It is not the intent of
the Legislature to preclude the use of capital outlay funding
for the labor costs necessary to accomplish the authorized uses
for the capital outlay funding. Day-labor contracts or any other
educational facilities contracting and construction techniques
pursuant to s. 1013.45 are authorized. Additionally, if a school
district has salaried maintenance staff whose duties consist
solely of performing the labor necessary to accomplish the
authorized uses for the capital outlay funding, such funding may
be used for those salaries; however, if a school district has

salaried staff whose duties consist partially of performing the

Page 76 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

i
e P o 5] B
a o & (9] o [« EN0)
O 19)] D — D 0] [0
- 3 Ky o~ [OFEENO) O T P
i #» 4P H A~ D @ K8 3 3
~ “ ()] . @ 9] Q) o~ 0] — ® D ) P
0] @) o Q & D D 0n T wp @ [( I a 9] 9] (@]
S0 W D A O @ oo c @ ¢ O n A
iN) > s D « IO OO 4D D D [ IS 4
O 4 ®© W P g . . N -H N ~ 4 0 o O
4 o O g ¢ H oo & -H #$ ¢ e L S O Q, -A
(@) ] QO (49} ® D o~ s st -H (49} © -H D [ Q, s}
= c o HO) (S I O)] D D [09) O ¢4« O © P w P ©
O 4 c @ oo H o H P A 5 B q E 4 n P n P
n P - BT © > P D HORENE ¢ P o O wn O B
0] © o O YU H 4P My . P e D O] -H “ @] @] (@] O Q,
n 4 O cC #H - N ® -H @ jon (VI = @) =
3 O 3 D B & b ] W - b o 0 o o)
4 T W n I )] ¢ ¢ D 4P D q O N o C O
O o, o P & B -Ho - H B ~ D T in] (@]
O n g H E o~ O, g ¢ @ — o} - Y
N © O i1y ® D Ef HOBENO)] D D YH 0] a ] (@]
-~ — Q 3 D #+ U D D n -t - S D <G (0] o - W
4 © 0 ¢ - D s W P P P . 4 —H 4 H i
o <G 0 O, )] -H - (o R 0] ® D H (O S i)
S n A O NP R - P S I B D D D o -H i) i
D G s P P ow RN N OR Hoon el 4 = n o0 QO
o R e & s S P 4P (OB o] o o g
T O © [ D [OFEEN OV ) QP n bl o O B
-~ g ~ HO)J D [ONEN)] . ® . [ @ D ~ —H (@) O “
0] SRS o Hoo-H - n 9] [ SR ) D D e D — O . ©
<P c ® P P b © © O O @ D ® 3] — $H
i) 0 o -H D (O SR ()] @ D -m B ® 0] D B © D [}
-4 O O OREEN ORI} D ® B $H 'O P 0 G o H S5 T
o T o> G B -fd M T I = TR 1] D [N q @ o - P4
0 o 3 o T A ) 0 o D O @ © ORI O)
—H 0 W D Ml HO) >~NoE ¢ - 4 & O © b <
— < QO D H & # @ D >~ Q D T ¢ HO) @) 4P
Q P g > T v O P T (EENOR H T D D - 20
g 0 ® OB ) b P W @ B b -f - 4 Hol Oo&E >
(@) N — h H O o O -H 4 3] & @ [09] “ P o0 H Q
O o g D [0} ® D ke @ k3 U Lo} LN oy B O o —
O ¢ U 93 B b H H o O D D ® @© ¢ P - El Y ™ O
© - 3 O . v M B O, D Ll v o HO)j o A o )]
T ©0 o - o~ P L @ O U iy D §H ¢ d P S P H o fom
o gc — O % 4 T (d & D @ D D D D Poon (V-
P o © A P w & b -H M @ D @ © YW U4 uy N ol O B
= I O S R B () D B N () O J_—" K ® G FE N ()
> @ -4 4 -4 O H @ D - D D N W P~ @ Q
4 >N 0O 9 O W W ) H 4 o D 4 H op op A~ -~ ®
@ @© @ O B g ® D D My oo o o X} 2 ®© —
n < Y O <L D @ B Woun RIS VN ) N ~ ~ @ < - HOREE
n P O 2 h B P U D -H o O W D o w ¢ ©
o 3 T © . 4 U T O M W ¢ ¢ H o Q e O - (VI
O O > 0 o «H D B © & o~ D Hh ' o U U - N (%)
(0] 4 N P o~ @ P D 4 W -H he P g ~
[oES| o -H Q -H D » U D [OBENe )] [ ® ~ . . . kY O O [e TN @) a
o “~ >~ = X v -f D “o-H o D o] (VO] [« ® a “ [OlNe (@]
4 £ ®© O ®© D -H W N . - D & B 3 @© A & -~
o +4 wn < QO H  » 4P >N pop D D @ — O P q iB)
Q QO ) H > @ N TR (VIR O} ® o n ®© @
© © 3 O D D -H D /A -1 P D O, W ) @] (OS] ~ P
— 0O O ®© ¥ UH b A - U A [OFI 9] D h O M ®w H 0
N O©W ™~ 0 O O 4 N OO < 1 O ~ W O O 4 N O <« 1" O >~ 0 O © 4 N ™M
O 0o o o O 4 A4 A4 =4 A 494 4 =4 4 +d4 N N N N N N N N N N OO N O oM
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN NN N NN N NN
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN N NN NN N NN

Page 77 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

D [1M] H .
ey D ~ H [4p)
~ ¢ a Eny] D N i D Ry
+ S D - P A o 4 o
q Y - o >~ D H D ol D
0) Ol > 4 iu) o) D o D D -M o D &
g T o ¢ O o © v ~ @ D P L ) D
I T B - O D Q wq ® Q© B ¢ 4
“ © in] P & (o] D B ‘m Y 0] Rty D B -
© 0| @ W = 0] T ROREES] D o (09] HO)J D D B
0, O o ® © z G o -H B oo+ 4P 4 ®n o}
O A T O /b & — O [ I} [o9) . i) 4P © D D
S T g 0 D —~ G P LI () fom o s
O O N 0] ) © O o & o D - D ® D @
T O < -4 <4 D < 4P -H -f D & -H g HOREN(Y o
0] < O a B} D 0 — — ﬁm — Eiy) i + Rty B — | D
H O O K O @ T O & -H -Ho oy e 0 F -
Y H O g D 4P o - D [09] c O - n 4 D D 3]
O . O Al P “H P ¢ ¢ N P B [0} H ®
H A WO ¢ @ O 4 G D 4 HO)j ® K - W S
T O 4 0| H -H - o O -f jon D (V] D v » [o9)
[N | 0] n o © ¥ @ ¢ P ¢ [ON D ¢
O 0] > O D [99] P 0] “ (O 1] -H ~ i1y D Rty
—=H 4 O 4 gl O D n 4 o P - [ JEIS] . 4P -Ho N E @
N N O T T SR (VA Y 'R ) - O S @ ¥ D ¢ < n ey B D
T ® H ©n g $H 4 O 0 4 O - P D O 4P U P
+ 4 Y 3 O A ® O © & D Eiy) B D @ ¢ H @ B
n ™ O T @ O ©® O B O -H D D 1] D D +
® o Hl 0 Na RO (O H H W P —H & o0 [op)
P " O A ®© D P nn O D © - B H ® Kd D B
o ¢ g S| & # L P - q (OFEENTS R ) i) D H
0} (OFE} a a B 0] o —H ® 0] ® D YH ® N D
ie) °c S o ¢ R =T R R O W P B ¢ + & @ jON
i D <G ©o| & S < @ & b O, @ ORI VIR =
P PP D WH nl 9 - o H D — H & [OR ® D & Eiy)
0 -—H O P U D o 0 O 3 ()] ® D -H D Y] HOj [op)
# =2 0O O H I n ¥ @4 B Ny B¢ D
“ @ — 0] D © o “~ D b D [ [99] ) [0} D P [«
O ® 0] (O D o| © 5 - W -H D © -H D -H D
Q B L 0 Wl o4 Qo 0o ¢ 9 » - 4P v ¢ k< D —
n ® 0] 4 O D e 4+ ¢ -H ~ D O ®
n Y 49 O Y D — e I S ] D q ¢ D B i3]
2P 0 P N ol ¢ B O be DO KO) m ¢ 4 0 D
)] o, Q (@] © (@] (@] o -A » & @ D P D 4D D H
O © <o PO H @ SlH 0O P oH T b ¢ P P @, b 0O @
o 4 —~ O D, B Ol ¥ 3 © @ ¢ D B ® n O T I D
O - 4 X D @ n © T O &£ ¢ 4 W D -H D o &
O » O © O ¢ ¢ 20 B3 WM D O ¥ 4P n 0 4P
o 0 0O O T ® Bl ie] n c 4 P 4 o ® 4P L
@ — n o o Of O HW MK —d P P H»H | ® L &
Y b O A O T -—H| £ O (] ()R ()] D - D - D
O H O ™ - D 4l 3 “H o -H HooQ D O [OR W 4
> © o P W PO g o D ¢ $H D @© ~H (0] b i
T S @ O O @™ ®| nl O O (oY) o on D B — ® ¢ ®q
@) — -4 Pl B —H O A4 L2 O ®n 0 O H O P H O - 1P
O H o S P nl m A £ o v A i H O O o iy P [ON
T P 4 9 O KO o O Q T T B Q D (I O)] &
4 O ® © B P @ P 3 E W 0N () - D D @ D
= e N ® 4 PO A oD NOR 4P RN b
O 4 D o B ol 9 P 49 Do D b ¢ A P -Ho . D
2P O w JT| D S n © -fd O D OO BN ) { ®  » T
T n > g < 3| q O o O T 4 o e ¢ & B T D
) a © ] o | P O O 0] P 0] )] D B B HOJ Ul D @ kS
n 4 gl O 0O wnl q T O A & W [o9) —H U Ul D -HoP ®
< N W~ W o0 O 4 N M <N O >~ 0000 O A N MO < 0 W I~ 0 o0 O o N
s TN co TN oo NN oo NN o o W e 0 LS UHNNES LIS VR S UES UNIE S LB S VRIS RIS RIS I Vo BN Vo N o NN o BN To NN To NN Vo NENN To RENNTo BN Te BN\ BERNo INNe}
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN NN N NN N NN
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN N NN NN N NN

Page 78 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

>
o} 1S n D
H 4o4b o PP @ O iS) h 4 My
D D @ -H D ! -~ o 0 P D 4P
D n -d O o —~ ®© O - ¢ 4

¢ T @ [0} fH D K] » o ®© - “ O & [OFgEETS] D D
@ & AH D D T S X Qo - D ow 4P

P B o -H D (K [09] D “4 O b o ¢ H S P 4P
S TR A ) o)l T -d F o A (18] @ O D @ 49}
& -H )] ® @ ¢ T > P o - HOJ D ® D Eiy)
b b O, B ¢ D @ @ O T 0O 4 P B T 1b 4y
4 P D - (VIO 3 ¢ O O O #H H P F D
A E R o B ) N1 D, W D O H o -4 > 3 N E 4 D D D,

H h g N O B N Q T 2 0 4 D ®© -Hd H D
n B H ¢ H P H D O —H N 4 >N 0+ 4 i D 4
HOj )] D D D & B . = c O (S n P D (VT [ I
@ D -f [OJ D 4 n D O -H Y (8] °c q O O, ¢ EIS O] D
B O H a0 D in} —~ P © O -~ N H D @ N
Wwo-H W % v ¢ D © 4 © g < 4 n o 0O Y4 4 Y D

o) W D  -H D P O n A O P D # D My
O ¢ -4 ¢ D v -Hd1 > ¢ nw © O O O -4 T 0 D & © & H )

0] D M —H oo Kd [N ] a o v o A o -f D
oI )) N Hor O D 0] P @© L O P T T P ™ D .
¢ ¢ P D H @ @ g o A 3 QO —H N B T
NI RIS O LI (] D @ P & P oa 4 49 0 4 4 4 ¢ P Hd P» A -t D
D D O P -~ -4 O L P O O P D D ®© 1 [ip)
8 D H ¢ ¢ D <~ $H ¢ ~ 4 > U 9 3 ®n g O 4 D D -H D D

M D D W D D T © “ c P o, a o g O] [« on KSR O)] $H [ON
4P D W O, D YH £ 0] O W (@] s - @] @] ® b [( D ® . o, ¥
n P U ¢ O D &P >0 O (] D © @ ¢ s}
B @ T P D -H T O —A 494 0 o - — -t -
€ o > ¢ o fH B D P 4 nw © O O @ S B K~ O B -

#$ B i) D #H & ~ c 0 & H 4 © S O P © 4 @ v e ¢

T P g B P B @ T 4 O — 0 4+ ®© D 4 4P D~ My D

4 © ¢ T B OO O F e o P A T ®© o o0 ¥ D (O} n -

® 4 B ¥ ¢ H D b — 0 A4 P S S Y4 © T~ ) +

D 4 & 9] D 4P D K [ —~ —~ (o] (o] )] O a D 4 A~ H - HOJ [y}
D B E BOD O @ D D B @ ®© -A O “ o0 A 4 D O @ @

d D B [OEE -H < @] O 3 [ e i) ~ B w -

—H q EH D b ® & 0 T T w o g P m D FIER } Y
D 0] H D [)) H <Y 0] 0] QO O O £ o E [N | N -
b © 4 b O B O P 0 —H £ 4 =2 A O & & ¢ P W

T ¢ O oo or & DO OH W S © 949 O L PP O P H PP H D

v -H © -H & D 4P 44y O 0O 0 4 H 4 ®©® 4 -+ & & W D D 1
n O ST DR D @ @ @ =] H Q 4 ®©® L > 4 E (ORI D D,

[ I S ¢ E Py c -4 9O n O -A (V) D D W™
g ) Py n @ D H ~ @] n P O 0] “ O @ o o Koo H D
) -H o WP @ D ® » D T H P (o] c T P © -H @ (V) 0] YH
-H G ® i) [oN n 0O W o> -H &P &0
H O 4 P H D Y G o O O O o o0 - w0 D O
o -H o Q@ [ON D [OFEE(V] D D T P o - o 9 T 4 - )] B @ & D B ®
n P -H D D 4 uf -} o > H 3 © ®© -H M -# 4P @ N ¢
-H @ A D XN 4 D P HO)j o O o 4 -A L2 3 g & g i} D
HOREN ) 4 K @ $ ¢ S g 0 + s o O W & T P - &

B H P ® D M D D ® = o - “ @ )] [ n -H D O, — D
& P D & H ) D O P O 4 O 4 &« P -f o D D e O

=] D ® ¢~ n 0 O H P -H ] © O ~ N T ud

. o -H B O P Q - 3 n L 0 - O ¢ - oM
' 0] )] >~ (O N [ — ~ ~ -~ - AN S5 o D D @ q D
-HowWw P FE ! RO | D P 4 S 4 ®w O D -# B© @ D D 4P

— — (s} )] P D [09] 0] - - ) ) D 4 ® 4D [¢p] It -H

D 4 H -H U 4 g > g O ®w Lop 4 ® o P

B @ B @ D Koo D [0} O O © © O 4 [()R1S) o} D D D B

[a TRENNTI NG (VO E N0 0 O 4 ®© YH O O N © D # W { <L
N T N W~ 0 o0 O 4 N M T N W M~ 0 o0 O dA N S Wm W s~ O o0 O
o VW Vv v v v v ~ ~ M~ ™~ ™~ ™~ ™~ ™~ >~ ™~ 0 W W W W W W W W W O O
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN NN N NN N NN
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN N NN NN N NN

Page 79 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




CS for SB 7002

2024

Florida Senate

20247002c1

594-01839-24

Yh D 0 a
D 0 ] ©
P i D o G —
#H @ 1P N < O T o O
N @ D D H S L N L I
D #$ T ¢ M [e¢) o O S
P H -H B -A N D b Ne} S O -H ®m (o
Yy ® [4p] — 4P - —H . (@] Q “ 0] ©
D > W O @ N O —H N B ™ - TS .
T ¢ W o o - [ = P & — HooH 0 P o
n @ P D -H -H -H ¢ -H D o 5 O H -+ O [
Q ® — H D — 0] ® D -mH — Q O O 4 g S
()] <~ 4 B Y ® D M qoop = g - P ®n ©
Y O O @ D D ~ O ¥ H o, D ® a ~ O 0] O i) 0,
HoP D ¢ @ D O -H D -H Yo 4P (@) P n S © H -A
< B - D D ® D D, 9 D ® - 0 Do H (@)
Qh D b N -H — ¢ ™ P N0 iN) -~ P (OS]
H oH & O - D 4 < Q¢ O P 4P @) T 0O P E . W
h & -H B D © ™ D H ¢ 0] - © O g B3 P
D W K] T B W N 4w N D D 0 | T 4 o O © [«
O B o P 4 -H ! D © HO)J . PP 44 4 P ®
Yy D [4p] D D Y D on n ® @ B 4y n [0) [9)] 9] O, m 3
P ¢ & P h BO P oo D 4P « O o > 4 4 w0 B ()]
O W D ® H & O -f D H D N nw -4 T O ®©® ¥ g 4
(o] D ® O H @ D D » D - HO) — [ () -~ o~ 3
K D ) 9] D fH D 4D D H O O o P O D 0,
NIV D H @ §O) D & @ 3] D ~ e o O S ®© ® O
¢ O T ¢ D 4 4 (0N} [ VEON T £ 4 P O P -~ 0
D D D Y - O D < N B o T @© @© o N e R s )
v O ¢ D #H -H -H & [09] © P 0O 4 >N T O P P <
D ® D D -m 49} D D L0 I} T 4 O 4 A [ g —fd n O
N ¢ -f D H H O ¢ M [ I D o g o 4 -4 Q
O 4o P W h n M () - P E @© O ~ O 4 O ~ W g B ©
HOJIS] ® D 0] et D o)l D ® 0 P M © @] “ D H
B P O 4 D ¢ ¢ ' ~ > O o O
H P oI ¢ F H Y4 @ ® T P T —~ Q, d <q
v ¢ - D D O ¢ O D $H 44D n 0 nu g N 0 P L P
[ T B B R ()} D @ D T D P D c O H ~ g 4 P G
- @ H P N ® H D 4d L 4P @] o+ P @] o -f ~ O
N W ¢ [OFEESY iy -~ 0 b U 9 HdA YW @ n g
¢ @ P LS ¢ n QO O B D Py D P e H QW P T ™
D S B 4 D -H U ¥ 1S R T 11} D @ O @ n 4 ®© ©n T P O ©
-H QO [ TRNT] ) D @, -H O 4 0] E P 494 -4 0 (OO
L0 o P N O 4 T O T OV R || n 0 o0 wm o g 0 § G
¢ @ ¢ O O ¢ D H © B N (O QO 4 0 4 ®©® & S @ 0]
- Hoo-H 4P D @ B 0] D n D 3 © 4 O “ O D » <
h D N QP (02O} ROREEN)) D - H 0 n o O L >N O P
& D P D © D - - N £ @ b 44y . n o+ QO 0} &
Rty Y [0} D @ Qo P ~ D -H @ . 9] 0] O 0] g a “
@ e P A D @ ORI R O P m o0 4 O O 4o g S5 O
O P Q D L < [ LR SR U On D L O R = R 2! H
HOj @ D H » . B D -H -H 0] O, & 3 O [O) e
B P U D -H © O >N 4 T & P P D g L2 oo n P O o A4 O
gl P D —m B St D W St K O @©@ O a L P P 3 0
n o s D P E O H P -H -H - ® D -~ P - &L ®© ©| Al n -H
BT D (] B DB @ Pon o i s 1 +
(PR (DN« R U1 R R T ) ~ HOREEN O RN OB D 0 @) — ~ 0 O T A n 3
o O [ I 9] D D -H B ® -H - O © O v Y4 -A O O ¢ Q
o, W & o - P W Uy ® ® K D ) n TV H = 3 Y =] ©| -~ -
-HooD G F D -H 8 1 ® N - 0 H g W © uy
W» ¢ -H (OB 4 P O ) D 9] B - [N “ S PP
N v B Y & & @ O &F £ 48 9 9 P q @) O M n o n
b & O B O & D @ @ jon D & & T P — nw O O +» O -H
d ® o, ® - 0] 9] [0) - 0] D ® D QO [EX i} O a o -H O T
N MO < O~ o0 O 4 N M <N W~ 0 o000 4 N O S .0n W~ o o O
O O O OO OO OO O OO O O O O O 0O 0O 0O o0 O A A A A A A A o = o «
N N N AN N NN AN AN OO O MmO O O OO O O O O O OO0 0o0no0no0nonon o0
N N N NN NN NN N N NN NN NN NN NN N NN NN N NN

Page 80 of 86

Words strieken are deletions

words underlined are additions.

.
’

CODING




Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
2321 (2) (b). If the district does not require its full bonded
2322 distribution to eliminate such unmet need, it may bond only that
2323| portion of its allocation necessary to meet the needs.
2324 (6) School districts may enter into interlocal agreements
2325| to lend their Classrooms First Program funds as provided in
2326| paragraph (2) (c). A school district or multiple school districts

2327 that receive cash proceeds may, after considering their own new

2328 construction needs ewtlined—in—their S—year distrietfaeilities
2329| werk—pregram, lend their Classrooms First Program funds to

2330 another school district that has need for new facilities. The
2331 interlocal agreement must be approved by the Commissioner of
2332| Education and must outline the amount of the funds to be lent,
2333 the term of the loan, the repayment schedule, and any interest
2334 amount to be repaid in addition to the principal amount of the
2335 loan.

2336 Section 44. Paragraph (e) of subsection (6) of section
2337 163.3180, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

2338 163.3180 Concurrency.—

2339 (6)

2340 (e) A school district that includes relocatable facilities

2341 in its inventory of student stations shall include the capacity

2342 of such relocatable facilities as—preovided—an—5-=

2343 o332 r2+-F~, provided the relocatable facilities were

2344| purchased after 1998 and the relocatable facilities meet the
2345 standards for long-term use pursuant to s. 1013.20.

2346 Section 45. Subsection (5) of section 1002.31, Florida
2347 Statutes, is amended to read:

2348 1002.31 Controlled open enrollment; public school parental
2349 choice.—

Page 81 of 86
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2350
2351
2352
2353
2354
2355
2356
2357
2358
2359
2360
2361
2362
2363
2364
2365
2366
2367
2368
2369
2370
2371
2372
2373
2374
2375
2376
2377
2378

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002cl
(5) For a school or program that is a public school of

choice under this section, the calculation for compliance with

maximum class size pursuant to s. 1003.03(1) s+—36063-63{4) is

the average number of students at the school level.

Section 46. Paragraph (i) of subsection (2) of section
1003.621, Florida Statutes, 1is amended to read:

1003.621 Academically high-performing school districts.—It
is the intent of the Legislature to recognize and reward school
districts that demonstrate the ability to consistently maintain
or improve their high-performing status. The purpose of this
section is to provide high-performing school districts with
flexibility in meeting the specific requirements in statute and
rules of the State Board of Education.

(2) COMPLIANCE WITH STATUTES AND RULES.—Each academically
high-performing school district shall comply with all of the
provisions in chapters 1000-1013, and rules of the State Board
of Education which implement these provisions, pertaining to the
following:

(1) Those statutes pertaining to educational facilities,
including chapter 1013, except that s. 1013.20, relating to

covered walkways for portables, apd—s—3+0132t—retating—teo—Ethe

. PR, I A N i I I R
COo O A T O T O C T CTTo I | % NI NI R S S U S WS )

eligible for exemption.

Section 47. Paragraph (e) of subsection (2) of section
1003.631, Florida Statutes, 1s amended to read:

1003.631 Schools of Excellence.—The Schools of Excellence
Program is established to provide administrative flexibility to
the state’s top schools so that the instructional personnel and

administrative staff at such schools can continue to serve their

Page 82 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2379
2380
2381
2382
2383
2384
2385
2386
2387
2388
2389
2390
2391
2392
2393
2394
2395
2396
2397
2398
2399
2400
2401
2402
2403
2404
2405
2406
2407

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
communities and increase student learning to the best of their
professional ability.

(2) ADMINISTRATIVE FLEXIBILITIES.—A School of Excellence
must be provided the following administrative flexibilities:

(e) Calculation for compliance with maximum class size

pursuant to s. 1003.03(1) s+—3+0863-063H4) based on the average

number of students at the school level.

Section 48. Paragraph (b) of subsection (3) of section
1011.6202, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1011.6202 Principal Autonomy Program Initiative.—The
Principal Autonomy Program Initiative is created within the
Department of Education. The purpose of the program is to
provide a highly effective principal of a participating school
with increased autonomy and authority to operate his or her
school, as well as other schools, in a way that produces
significant improvements in student achievement and school
management while complying with constitutional requirements. The
State Board of Education may, upon approval of a principal
autonomy proposal, enter into a performance contract with the
district school board for participation in the program.

(3) EXEMPTION FROM LAWS.—

(b) A participating school or a school operated by a
principal pursuant to subsection (5) shall comply with the
provisions of chapters 1000-1013, and rules of the state board
that implement those provisions, pertaining to the following:

1. Those laws relating to the election and compensation of
district school board members, the election or appointment and
compensation of district school superintendents, public meetings

and public records requirements, financial disclosure, and

Page 83 of 86

CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2408
2409
2410
2411
2412
2413
2414
2415
2416
2417
2418
2419
2420
2421
2422
2423
2424
2425
2426
2427
2428
2429
2430
2431
2432
2433
2434
2435
2436

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1
conflicts of interest.

2. Those laws relating to the student assessment program
and school grading system, including chapter 1008.

3. Those laws relating to the provision of services to
students with disabilities.

4. Those laws relating to civil rights, including s.
1000.05, relating to discrimination.

5. Those laws relating to student health, safety, and
welfare.

6. Section 1001.42(4) (f), relating to the uniform opening
date for public schools.

7. Section 1003.03, governing maximum class size, except
that the calculation for compliance pursuant to s. 1003.03 is
the average at the school level for a participating school.

8. Sections 1012.22(1) (c) and 1012.27(2), relating to
compensation and salary schedules.

9. Section 1012.33(5), relating to workforce reductions for
annual contracts for instructional personnel. This subparagraph
does not apply to at-will employees.

10. Section 1012.335, relating to annual contracts for
instructional personnel hired on or after July 1, 2011. This
subparagraph does not apply to at-will employees.

11. Section 1012.34, relating to personnel evaluation
procedures and criteria.

12. Those laws pertaining to educational facilities,

including chapter 1013, except that s. 1013.20, relating to

covered walkways for relocatables, apd—s—30132t7—relating—*te

£

+ 1 17 o
crriCc— oo C—OT

+ 1] PPN I I I R
T P o J S N S WS S S ) Ay o

D

el ﬂ
[ S S (&

eligible for exemption.

Page 84 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2437
2438
2439
2440
2441
2442
2443
2444
2445
2446
2447
2448
2449
2450
2451
2452
2453
2454
2455
2456
2457
2458
2459
2460
2461
2462
2463
2464
2465

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

13. Those laws pertaining to participating school
districts, including this section and ss. 1011.69(2) and
1012.28(8) .

Section 49. Subsection (2) of section 1011.73, Florida
Statutes, 1s amended to read:

1011.73 District millage elections.—

(2) MILLAGE AUTHORIZED NOT TO EXCEED 4 YEARS.—The district
school board, pursuant to resolution adopted at a regular
meeting, shall direct the county commissioners to call an
election at which the electors within the school district may
approve an ad valorem tax millage as authorized under s.

1011.71(8) s+—3043+-7+9)>. Such election may be held at any time,

except that not more than one such election shall be held during
any 1l2-month period. Any millage so authorized shall be levied
for a period not in excess of 4 years or until changed by
another millage election, whichever is earlier. If any such
election is invalidated by a court of competent jurisdiction,
such invalidated election shall be considered not to have been
held.

Section 50. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) of section
1012.555, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1012.555 Teacher Apprenticeship Program.—

(2)

(b) As a condition of participating in the program, an
apprentice teacher must commit to spending the first 2 years in
the classroom of a mentor teacher using team teaching strategies

identified in s. 1003.03(4) (b) s—3863-08345+r and fulfilling

the on-the-job training component of the registered

apprenticeship and its associated standards.

Page 85 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




2466
2467
2468
2469
2470
2471
2472
2473
2474
2475
2476
2477
2478
2479
2480
2481
2482
2483
2484
2485
2486
2487
2488

Florida Senate - 2024 CS for SB 7002

594-01839-24 20247002c1

Section 51. Paragraph (a) of subsection (3) of section
1013.62, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1013.62 Charter schools capital outlay funding.—

(3) If the school board levies the discretionary millage
authorized in s. 1011.71(2), the department shall use the
following calculation methodology to determine the amount of
revenue that a school district must distribute to each eligible
charter school:

(a) Reduce the total discretionary millage revenue by the
school district’s annual debt service obligation incurred as of
March 1, 2017, which has not been subsequently retired, and any
amount of participation requirement pursuant to s.

1013.64(2) (a)7. s+—3+043-642r{a)r8+ that is being satisfied by

revenues raised by the discretionary millage.

By October 1 of each year, each school district shall certify to
the department the amount of debt service and participation
requirement that complies with the requirement of paragraph (a)
and can be reduced from the total discretionary millage revenue.
The Auditor General shall verify compliance with the
requirements of paragraph (a) and s. 1011.71(2) (e) during
scheduled operational audits of school districts.

Section 52. This act shall take effect July 1, 2024.

Page 86 of 86

CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.






