F L OR

0o J o b w DD

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

HB 607

I D A H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

2026

A bill to be entitled
An act relating to industries and professional
activities; amending s. 20.165, F.S.; renaming,
removing, and redesignating specified boards,
commissions, and councils established within the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation;
changing the office locations of certain divisions;
prohibiting extension or renewal of certain leases;
requiring the department to provide to the Division of
Professions a summary of changes to statutory law
within a specified time period after adjournment of
session; repealing ss. 310.011, 310.032, 310.042,
455.2124, 455.2228, 468.384, 468.399, 468.4315,
468.4337, 468.4338, 468.521, 468.522, 468.523,
468.605, 468.8316, 468.8416, 471.0195, 472.007,
472.008, 472.009, 472.017, 472.018, 472.019, 473.303,
474.204, 474.205, 474.206, 475.02, 475.03, 475.04,
475.045, 475.05, 475.10, 476.054, 476.064, 477.015,
481.205, 481.2055, 481.305, 482.243, 489.107, 489.507,
492.103, 499.01211, 559.9221, and 570.81, F.S.,
relating to the Board of Pilot Commissioners; oath of
members of the Board of Pilot Commissioners;
organization and meetings of the board; proration of
continuing education; barbers and cosmetologists and

instruction on HIV and AIDS; the Florida Board of

Page 1 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
26 Auctioneers; expenditure of excess funds; the
27 Regulatory Council of Community Association Managers;
28 continuing education; reactivation and continuing
29 education; the Board of Employee Leasing Companies
30 membership, appointments, and terms; rules of the
31 board; applicability of s. 20.165 and chapter 455; the
32 Florida Building Code Administrators and Inspectors
33 Board; continuing education; Florida Building Code
34 training for engineers; the Board of Professional
35 Surveyors and Mappers; rules of the board; board
36 headquarters; continuing education; continuing
37 education for reactivating a license; the Board of
38 Veterinary Medicine; board headquarters; renewal of
39 license; the Board of Accountancy; the Barbers' Board;
40 organization, headquarters, personnel, and meetings of
41 the board; the Board of Cosmetology; the Board of
42 Architecture and Interior Design; authority of the
43 board to make rules; the Florida Real Estate
44 Commission; delegation of powers and duties; legal
45 services; duty of commission to educate members of
46 profession; the Florida Real Estate Commission
47 Education and Research Foundation; power of commission
48 to enact bylaws and rules and decide questions of
49 practice; seal; the Board of Landscape Architecture;
50 the Pest Control Enforcement Advisory Council; the
Page 2 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
51 Construction Industry Licensing Board; the Electrical
52 Contractors' Licensing Board; the Board of
53 Professional Geologists; the Drug Wholesale
54 Distributor Advisory Council; the Motor Vehicle Repair
55 Advisory Council; and the Agricultural Economic
56 Development Project Review Committee, respectively;
57 amending ss. 120.54, 212.08, 215.5586, 215.55871,
58 309.01, 310.0015, 310.002, 310.051, 310.061, 310.071,
59 310.073, 310.075, 310.081, 310.101, 310.102, 310.111,
60 310.121, 310.131, 310.142, 310.151, 310.183, 310.185,
61 326.002, 326.006, 376.303, 381.0065, 403.868,
62 403.9329, 440.02, 448.26, 455.203, 455.271, 468.382,
63 468.385, 468.3851, 468.3852, 468.3855, 468.38¢6,
64 468.387, 468.388, 468.389, 468.392, 468.393, 468.395,
65 468.396, 468.397, 468.398, 468.404, 468.407, 468.431,
66 468.433, 468.4336, 468.435, 468.436, 468.520, 468.522,
67 468.524, 468.5245, 468.525, 468.526, 468.527,
68 468.5275, 468.529, 468.530, 468.531, 468.532, 468.603,
69 468.606, 468.607, 468.613, 468.619, 468.621, 468.627,
70 468.629, 468.631, 468.8312, 468.8315, 468.8412,
71 468.8415, 468.8417, 468.8419, 469.004, 469.012,
72 469.013, 471.011, 471.017, 471.019, 471.045, 472.003,
73 472.005, 472.006, 472.011, 472.0202, 472.0203,
74 473.302, 473.3035, 473.304, 473.305, 473.306, 473.3009,
75 473.3101, 473.311, 473.3125, 473.313, 473.314,

Page 3 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L OR

HB 607

76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99
100

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

I D

473.
473.
.2125,
.2165,
476.
476.
477 .
477 .

474
474

481
481

481

.207,
.221,
481.
.315,
489.
489.
489.
489.
489.
489.
489.
489.
489.
492.
492.
493.
493.

A H O U S

315,
323,

473.316,
474.202,
474.213,
474.217,
476.134,
476.214,
477.019,
477.026,
481.209,
481.222,
481.307,
481.317,
489.109,
489.114,
489.1195,
489.132,
489.142,
489.505,
489.515,
489.519,
489.533,
492.105,
492.1101,

114,
204,
018,
025,

306,

108,
1136,
119,
131,
141,
146,
514,
5185,
525,
104,
109,
6105,
6118,

493.6106,
493.6120,

E O F

473.319,
474.2065,
474.214,
474.221,
476.144,
476.234,
477.0201,
477.0263,
481.211,
481.223,
481.309,
481.323,
489.111,
489.115,
489.121,
489.133,
489.1425,
489.509,
489.516,
489.520,
489.5335,
492.1051,
492.111,

493.6111,
493.6123,

R E P R E S ENTAT I

473.3205,
474.207,
474.215,
475.451,

476.154,

477.013,

477.0212,

477.028,
481.215,
481.225,
481.310,
481.325,
489.113,

489.116,

489.126,
489.1401,

489.143,
489.510,
489.5161,

489.521,

489.537,

492.106,

492.113,

Page 4 of 449

493.6113,
493.6201,

473.
474 .
474 .216,
476.034,
476.155,
477.0135,

321,
211,

477.029,
481.217,
481.2251,
481.311,
489.103,
489.1131,

489.117,

489.127,

489.1402,
489.1455,

489.511,
489.517,
489.522,
489.552,
492.107,
493

477.022,

.6101,
493.6116,
493.6202,

V E S

2026

473.322,

476.074,
476.192,
477.016,

481.203,
481.219,

481.303,
481.313,
489.105,

489.118,
489.129,

489.513,
489.518,
489.523,
492.102,
492.108,

hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
101 493.6203, 493.6301, 493.6302, 493.6303, 493.6304,
102 493.631, 493.6401, 493.6402, 493.6403, 493.640¢6,
103 499.067, 501.015, 501,609, 507.03, 514.0315, 514.075,
104 527,03, 539.001, 553.79, 553.791, 553.998, 559.904,
105 559.928, 627.192, 633.216, and 713.01, F.S.; providing
106 licensing authority to the department rather than
107 licensing boards; removing continuing education
108 requirements; revising licensure renewal periods;
109 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;
110 amending s. 259.1053, F.S.; removing the Babcock Ranch
111 Advisory Group; amending s. 339.035, F.S.; revising
112 the requirements for accessibility of elevators for
113 the physically handicapped; amending s. 455.02, F.S.;
114 specifying that certain license application
115 requirements apply only to certain professions;
116 amending s. 468.609, F.S.; revising the standards for
117 certification as a building code inspector or plans
118 examiner; amending s. 471.007, F.S.; providing for
119 abolishment of the Board of Professional Engineers;
120 amending s. 471.015, F.S.; revising who the department
121 must certify as qualified for a license by endorsement
122 for the practice of engineering; amending s. 473.308,
123 F.S.; revising the education and work experience
124 requirements for a certified public accountant
125 license; directing the department to prescribe

Page 5 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
126 specified coursework for licensure; revising
127 requirements for licensure by endorsement; removing
128 provisions relating to licensure of applicants with
129 work experience in foreign countries; providing
130 applicability; creating s. 473.3085, F.S.; requiring
131 an international applicant who seeks licensure as a
132 certified public accountant in this state to meet
133 specified criteria prescribed by the department;
134 requiring such applicants to apply to the department;
135 requiring such applicants to create and maintain an
136 online account with the department; providing that the
137 applicant's e-mail address serves as the primary means
138 of communication from the department; requiring an
139 applicant to submit any change in certain information
140 within a specified timeframe through the department's
141 online system; requiring the department to certify an
142 applicant who meets certain requirements; requiring
143 the department to adopt rules; amending s. 473.3141,
144 F.S.; revising requirements for certified public
145 accountants licensed in another state or a territory
146 of the United States to practice in this state without
147 obtaining a license; amending s. 474.2021, F.S.;
148 revising requirements relating to prescriptions by
149 veterinarians practicing telehealth; providing
150 licensing authority to the department rather than

Page 6 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
151 licensing boards; amending s. 475.17, F.S.; removing
152 postlicensure education requirements for brokers,
153 broker associates, and sales associates; amending ss.
154 475.175 and 475.180, F.S.; conforming provisions to
155 changes made by the act; amending s. 475.182, F.S.;
156 removing continuing education requirements for
157 licensure renewal as a broker, a broker associate, and
158 a sales associate; amending s. 475.183, F.S.; removing
159 continuing education requirements for licensure
160 renewal due to inactive status; amending ss. 475.25,
161 475.611, 475.612, 475.614, 475.6145, 475.6147,
162 475.615, 475.617, 475.6171, 475.618, 475.619, 475.621,
163 475.6222, 475.6235, 475.624, 475.6245, 475.625,
164 475.626, 475.627, 475.628, 475.629, 475.630, 475.631,
165 F.S.; revising provisions pertaining to the board to
166 transfer powers, duties, and responsibilities of the
167 board to the Department of Business and Professional
168 Regulation; amending s. 475.613, F.S.; granting
169 certain authority to the department, rather than the
170 Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board; amending s.
171 476.184, F.S.; requiring the department to adopt
172 rules; requiring a mobile barbershop to comply with
173 all licensure and operating requirements that apply to
174 a barbershop at a fixed location; providing an
175 exception; requiring a mobile barbershop to have a

Page 7 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
176 permanent business address in a specified location;
177 requiring that certain records be kept at the
178 permanent business address; requiring a mobile
179 barbershop licenseholder to file with the department a
180 written monthly itinerary that provides certain
181 information; requiring that a licenseholder comply
182 with certain laws and ordinances; amending s. 476.188,
183 F.S.; providing that a barbershop must be licensed
184 with the department, rather than registered;
185 authorizing the practice of barbering to be performed
186 in a location other than a licensed barbershop under
187 certain circumstances; amending s. 481.213, F.S.;
188 revising who the department shall certify as qualified
189 for a license by endorsement in the practice of
190 architecture; amending s. 481.321, F.S.; revising
191 provisions relating to seals and display of
192 certificate number of registered landscape architects;
193 amending s. 499.012, F.S.; revising permit application
194 requirements for sale, transfer, assignment, or lease;
195 removing permit application requirements for a
196 prescription drug wholesale distributor to include a
197 designated representative; amending s. 499.0121, F.S.;
198 removing a designated representative as a responsible
199 person who must be listed by a wholesale distributor;
200 amending s. 499.041, F.S.; removing a requirement that

Page 8 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
201 the department assess each person applying for
202 certification as a designated representative a fee,
203 plus the cost of processing a criminal history record
204 check; creating s. 624.341, F.S.; providing
205 legislative findings; requiring the Department of Law
206 Enforcement to accept and process certain
207 fingerprints; specifying procedures for submitting and
208 processing fingerprints; providing fees for
209 fingerprinting; authorizing the department to exchange
210 certain records with the Office of Insurance
211 Regulation for certain purposes; specifying that
212 fingerprints must be submitted in accordance with
213 certain rules; authorizing fingerprints to be
214 submitted through a third-party vendor authorized by
215 the department; requiring the department to conduct
216 certain background checks; requiring certain
217 background checks to be conducted through the Federal
218 Bureau of Investigation; requiring that fingerprints
219 be submitted and entered into a specified system;
220 specifying who bears the costs of fingerprint
221 processing; requiring the office to review certain
222 background checks results and to make certain
223 determinations; requiring that certain criminal
224 history records be used by the office for certain
225 purposes; amending s. 468.609, F.S.; revising the

Page 9 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
226 standards for certification as a building code
227 inspector or plans examiner; amending s. 471.007,
228 F.S.; providing for abolishment of the Board of
229 Professional Engineers; amending s. 471.015, F.S.;
230 revising who the department must certify as qualified
231 for a license by endorsement for the practice of
232 engineering; amending s. 473.308, F.S.; revising the
233 education and work experience requirements for a
234 certified public accountant license; directing the
235 department to prescribe specified coursework for
236 licensure; revising requirements for licensure by
237 endorsement; removing provisions relating to licensure
238 of applicants with work experience in foreign
239 countries; providing applicability; creating s.
240 473.3085, F.S.; requiring an international applicant
241 who seeks licensure as a certified public accountant
242 in this state to meet specified criteria prescribed by
243 the department; requiring such applicants to apply to
244 the department; requiring such applicants to create
245 and maintain an online account with the department;
246 providing that the applicant's e-mail address serves
247 as the primary means of communication from the
248 department; requiring an applicant to submit any
249 change in certain information within a specified
250 timeframe through the department's online system;

Page 10 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
251 requiring the department to certify an applicant who
252 meets certain requirements; requiring the department
253 to adopt rules; amending s. 473.312, F.S.; conforming
254 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
255 473.3141, F.S.; revising requirements for certified
256 public accountants licensed in another state or a
257 territory of the United States to practice in this
258 state without obtaining a license; amending s.
259 474.2021, F.S.; revising requirements relating to
260 prescriptions by veterinarians practicing telehealth;
261 providing licensing authority to the department rather
262 than licensing boards; amending s. 475.17, F.S.;
263 removing postlicensure education requirements for
264 brokers, broker associates, and sales associates;
265 amending ss. 475.175 and 475.180, F.S.; conforming
266 provisions to changes made by the act; amending s.
267 475.182, F.S.; removing continuing education
268 requirements for licensure renewal as a broker, a
269 broker associate, and a sales associate; amending s.
270 475.183, F.S.; removing continuing education
271 requirements for licensure renewal due to inactive
272 status; amending ss. 475.25, 475.611, 475.612,
273 475.6014, 475.6145, 475.6147, 475.615, 475.617,
274 475.6171, 475.618, 475.619, 475.621, 475.6222,
275 475.6235, 475.624, 475.6245, 475.625, 475.626,

Page 11 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
276 475.627, 475.628, 475.629, 475.630, and 475.631, F.S.;
277 revising provisions pertaining to the board to
278 transfer powers, duties, and responsibilities of the
279 board to the department; amending s. 475.613, F.S.;
280 granting certain authority to the department, rather
281 than the Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board; amending
282 s. 476.184, F.S.; requiring the department to adopt
283 rules; requiring a mobile barbershop to comply with
284 all licensure and operating requirements that apply to
285 a barbershop at a fixed location; providing an
286 exception; requiring a mobile barbershop to have a
287 permanent business address in a specified location;
288 requiring that certain records be kept at the
289 permanent business address; requiring a mobile
290 barbershop licenseholder to file with the department a
291 written monthly itinerary that provides certain
292 information; requiring that a licenseholder comply
293 with certain laws and ordinances; amending s. 476.188,
294 F.S.; providing that a barbershop must be licensed
295 with the department, rather than registered;
296 authorizing the practice of barbering to be performed
297 in a location other than a licensed barbershop under
298 certain circumstances; amending s. 481.213, F.S.;
299 revising who the department shall certify as qualified
300 for a license by endorsement in the practice of

Page 12 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
301 architecture; amending s. 481.321, F.S.; revising
302 provisions relating to seals and display of
303 certificate number of registered landscape architects;
304 amending s. 499.012, F.S.; revising permit application
305 requirements for sale, transfer, assignment, or lease;
306 removing permit application requirements for a
307 prescription drug wholesale distributor to include a
308 designated representative; amending s. 499.0121, F.S.;
309 removing a designated representative as a responsible
310 person who must be listed by a wholesale distributor;
311 amending s. 499.041, F.S.; removing a requirement that
312 the department assess each person applying for
313 certification as a designated representative a fee,
314 plus the cost of processing a criminal history record
315 check; creating s. 624.341, F.S.; providing
316 legislative findings; requiring the Department of Law
317 Enforcement to accept and process certain
318 fingerprints; specifying procedures for submitting and
319 processing fingerprints; providing fees for
320 fingerprinting; authorizing the department to exchange
321 certain records with the Office of Insurance
322 Regulation for certain purposes; specifying that
323 fingerprints must be submitted in accordance with
324 certain rules; authorizing fingerprints to be
325 submitted through a third-party vendor authorized by

Page 13 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
326 the department; requiring the department to conduct
327 certain background checks; requiring certain
328 background checks to be conducted through the Federal
329 Bureau of Investigation; requiring that fingerprints
330 be submitted and entered into a specified system;
331 specifying who bears the costs of fingerprint
332 processing; requiring the office to review certain
333 background check results and to make certain
334 determinations; requiring that certain criminal
335 history records be used by the office for certain
336 purposes; providing effective dates.

337
338 Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
339

340 Section 1. Section 20.165, Florida Statutes, is amended to
341 read:
342 20.165 Department of Business and Professional

343| Regulation.—There is created a Department of Business and

344 Professional Regulation.

345 (1) The head of the Department of Business and

346| Professional Regulation is the Secretary of Business and

347 Professional Regulation. The secretary shall be appointed by the
348 Governor, subject to confirmation by the Senate. The secretary
349 shall serve at the pleasure of the Governor.

350 (2) The following divisions of the Department of Business

Page 14 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

351 and Professional Regulation are established:

352 (a) Division of Administration.

353 (b) Division of Alcoholic Beverages and Tobacco.

354 (c) Division of Certified Public Accounting.

355 1. The director of the division shall be appointed by the
356| secretary of the department—subiecet—to approvat by o matority
357| eof—the BoardofAccountaney.

358 2. Effective at the termination of any lease in effect on

359 December 31, 2025, the offices of the division shall be located

360 in Tallahassee Gainesvitlte. Such a lease may not be extended or

301 renewed.
362 (d) Division of Drugs, Devices, and Cosmetics.
363 (e) Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, and

364 Mobile Homes.

365 (f) Division of Hotels and Restaurants.

366 (g) Division of Professions.

367 (h) Division of Real Estate.

368 1. The director of the division shall be appointed by the
369 secretary of the department—subiecet—+toapprovat—by a majority
370| ef—theFloridaReal Fstate Commissien.

371 2. Effective at the termination of any lease in effect on

372 December 31, 2025, the offices of the division shall be located

373 in Tallahassee O¥tande. Such a lease may not be extended or

374 renewed.

375 (1) Division of Regulation.

Page 15 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
376 (j) Division of Technology.
377 (k) Division of Service Operations.
378 (3) The secretary shall appoint a director for each

379| division established within this section. Each division director
380| shall directly administer the division and shall be responsible
381 to the secretary. The secretary may appoint deputy and assistant
382| secretaries as necessary to aid the secretary in fulfilling the
383 secretary's statutory obligations.

384 (4)42)> The following boards and programs are established
385! within the Division of Professions:

386 (a) 3=—DPBeard—-of Architecture and Interior Design licensing

387| program, created under parts part I and II of chapter 481.

388 (b) 2—FleoridaBeard—ef Auctioneers licensing program,

389 created under part VI of chapter 468.

390 (c)3= Barbers' licensing program Beard, created under

391 chapter 476.

392 (d)4~ Florida Building Code Administrators and Inspectors

393 licensing program Beard, created under part XII of chapter 468.

394 (e)5+~ Construction Industry licensing program Beard,

395 created under part I of chapter 489.

396 (f) 6—>Beard—ef Cosmetology licensing program, created

397| under chapter 477.

398 (g)#*= Electrical Contractors' licensing program Reard,

399 created under part II of chapter 489.

400 (h) 8—>PBeard—ef Employee Leasing Companies licensing

Page 16 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

401| program, created under part XI of chapter 468.

402 (i) 8—DBeard—ef Landscape Architecture licensing program,

403| created under part II of chapter 481.

404 (])+6+—PReard—oef Pilot Commissioners licensing program,

405 created under chapter 310.

406 (k)+4~= Board of Professional Engineers, created under

407 chapter 471.
408 (1)32=

o
.

of Professional Geologists licensing program,

o
A\ -

409 created under chapter 492.

410 (m) 33— PBoar

®.
tHh

Veterinary Medicine licensing program,

A\

411 created under chapter 474.

412 (n) 34~ Home inspection services licensing program, created

413| under part XV of chapter 468.
414 (0)3+5+ Mold-related services licensing program, created

415| under part XVI of chapter 468.

416 (p) Talent agency licensing program, created under part

417| VII of chapter 468.

418 (g) The Florida Building Commission, created under chapter
419| b553.
420 (r) The Community Association Managers licensing program,

421 created under part VIII of chapter 468.

422 (s) Yacht and ship brokers licensing program, created

423| under chapter 326.
424 or—TFhe—following board andcommissionare—established

425 PO S P P UL N Dzt ot o £ DA P PN S
/A" S U R R A T g o TOUTT A 1IN T T 170 CTOO T T .

Page 17 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 607

4p uky o §o} D
B D D — D &
1o} -t — N ® . D D D
D, HH [69) D ® - [09] [09] & & on D
-H M@ —H H ® ® 1Y) oy
4 N1y b D 9] - D D 9] 9] Rty
4 -t 1 SRS [(oJTY] LD . @
HO) ® M (OB} D b B H & D D 0 D 4H
jon D, P D ¢ D D & oW D
B ¢ - P D D > fFE "] D D
by Koy e Q4 ¢ A $H Q@ @ 0 RO) P jon
o i) ~ B B N H -H -H WP " D & H D
HO) 0] N [1V] [OFEE. @ oo D oo D D -t
1Y) oo oo H D @ K (o] B » -dH @ - & [o9) P
® B -H - < & | D & ¢ - ¢ & W $H
ey [OTEE V1] D B D P D D D
H © ) D n H Q D v & P iy D,
)] -t T & & $H H ¢ T D
4P k3 D 4 D D ¢ ¢ - D D q D & D T

N ® ow D ORI D D, S A B D
© © n 3 h F D N K & -f -H W oo R
H H - D & D D b & O O O - -
P ) Koo s U N N F OB oo X 4 o,

D ) o) D & n ¢ ¢ D op o b
M - -H ® D & R £ 0 g L D p

o — # 4 D ~ O ¢ H 0 0 P o

H D D Q P W o a D w & 4w & u P
® -H ® D x Rty Rty D H D H D —

[09) [o9) 1] >~ ow D D — D

- n ] T Q@ b & O ® - O O A P &

® - H & D ] [09) [09] oo oo oo My S
4 & e ¢ B -H ®n D $HooH - -H - -H 0

D, &£ [49] D D @ — D 1 o W @ 4 H

o, D - @o b & O P D © N W P D

< d ¢ 9 ¢ ¢ o & 4 ¢ -4 O -d D 4
HO)J € -H Qn @ D D © @© @ O H

HT (0] D D | £ ¢« & ¢ & ¢ -H HO)

4b 1b It ® D, . ] <~ £ D D D D D [OR D

® ® D D (OB D [99] N $H D ) i [0} & (0] b —

s iy D (VIO & D k3 D —

[09] [09] (1] (0] D $H 4 W h op h o up h -H

N N fox) D D & & D © HO) © [o9] (1]
oo D D By ® oo s oo s oo s ®

— — -H 0] (4 ) I—IS] ® ® ® ® ® ® on D

@ (0] ® T ¢ ~ ey D & D & D B HO)
D D D ® ® fH L () 1§ N () 1D N )] &

[a * a e — - ° .hw ® oo B D D K —

up BN & @ pn >y D W D ¢ D ¢ D —

¢ o P D D 9] H D & D & D & D 1P (o]
HOREEAS )} Y & P A D 4 D 4 D 4 ot
-H -H -~ 4 O b 4 & H & D N
H H H D oo (9] H H H [op)

D D c 4 L (O] D ow D ® D ® D ® D HO)j
H W Ep B D D 4d W= D = D =& D oy H
[ PR OTE ¥ - @ o-d 4P L p bl bl ® P

® D H & T o D D
@ A~ - ~ - ¢ -f D 4 oA~ A~ A~ & D

. ) . ) [N( D RT)] & D H B ® [( O] ® 0] 1] D

L q -+ +~ O ¢ O ¢ D ®# +«+ O ¥ T T+ O D D

Y p - O -4 QO & @ o @ &£ oy

D N W ® D D D D D D D Rty

KO) oo o, 4 — — — &

i D D D @ O D ® ® ® jon

HH n v D ¢ (g 4P (0] (0] (0] < D
© ™~ O O O 4 N O < 1 O ~ 0O O O +H4 N O < 1O O -~ ww O O
N N N N MO MmO O O O O O O O O ¢ $9° o0
ESTEEEE S S S R S S U SR A S R S S R S S U R L S S R U A U S A

Page 18 of 449

d are additions.

Ine

words underl

ions;

Words stricken are delet

CODING

hb607-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 607

& @)
D D a 0 Q — P
on - O 0| > —
YH t ) - o| -+ ® ~
D 4P ~ & §O] ® O £ n T| L < Gc
0 e ¢ © & Y D (] S ®© g @ H n O
B N o D D + O ©) a @ O -—
b & 0 - P - -~ -4 O P T ®w
Ao b S ® H S B /» B R () a o -
b D ® bl D D 4P =2 o, 4 L Q M O ] >
P Koo N O B O] @ @ @ o »>» O 3 O - -
H $H D D —~ ®© -4 O 0 ) ~ O
OV oo PP R A ) T 0 (0] -4 O
53} — D D L Dl 4 = Q >Ny > P 0]
® D e ¢ H Q@ -t D H P O 4 o0 B o 3 - <
bl o ® RV} O, O & n @© 0 A n P
U ) G () D D g YW oP q 0
b B0 (VI ¢ o -H n > 0 O O >
0 ¢ o P H OO @ D = g > 4 4 0 S 0 Q
ou HoOq b M (0N -doed D w 5 9 & © A L0
b » et P D | - Lo © O
-H - D T . H @ ™ F D > a0 > (0]
H P £ ¢ ¢ ¢ D @ D & O wn 0 o 4 QO o0 w0
P D P D D 4 o4 4 4 3 - +£ 0 > q
D ) . & -H - o W D 4d o, - Y o) ® O
D, 4 ~ O D D ¢ Q Y EB) [0 @)
) T () D € v - 4 ®© O a0 N -
¢ #H w0 O 0 £ 9 b P O L H - o o e e
@ D UH D @ Y 4 D D - W D S0 ISHN 9
-t ) ® & D D & D H H ) Q Q R O ® 0
oo H H © (OB D B (@) “ S < C [0)
-H D H H H [OFEENON ® H D W D 3 @ L] n ]
| E D P ® D © @ > 4w Q 4 = 3 -
£ 4 4 b P ~ ¢ K¢ G q N O Q@ ©® ®© O g
4P D & D (O] D ® N © P Q 4 O oA 0~ O )
Hqn B 5 ] D 4 - b O O o n O Y
s A 3 ® D 4 b # P o N A > 0O A > 0 © O
= @ YH 4y —H D 0] ool D G - — O < — Q [0) Q
R V) © O O B P9 f el | ) IR > 0~
4 £ O H H H N HO] i} D W O i) o BH £
~ 4P [o9) D oo D (SR o = o [OR @)
¢ £ ¢ -1 D H oo P R @ 4P 0 T Q@ T 0
e $H -4 EF & D D @ -H o 4P L2 B ®w . = £ o O
oy D DI ¥ D @ ® @ n o o0 P - ~ > 0 © u0
0 [OFO} & D L'} HO) oy be < RS a 0 @) a
O, W -H D [99] D ~ 0 @ « P 99} @ Q 0] oo 0 -
P ® P HooHp [ Y] © Lo+ - O IS - o, - 0]
H D b -f O L P H ~ ¢ D = =P + < O O
b ¥ & @ & - P @ D & L | H Y S 0 @ P
£ -H F 0 B (PR T P D @O N o -l A ®© T ®© M
O ¢ & P & € o QL o o1 = O LY ~ O P
$H O & P ® D L H @ S04 0 0 ~ o © > g
D n @ D D H D 0 D D w O T N W O — 0O O
W o ®m 0 4 < = R O AP A m -
B H H D Y ¢ ¢ D ¥ ¥ R Q H a4 ~
D D D D D $ PP g T < 0O 0 ® @)
on N o~ E sH ¢ 4 g 4~ F B¢ H ~ O S P g £ O ~ A4 O
Hoo- £ W P b D n Q0 o & H |l g © PO+ O 4 G
H D T H n 9 © r dA © O — P a 3 H YW o~ O P
'8 15 P D O - D D §O) o) D ~ n  -A o -4 - <
D n Q@ ¢ Y4d 4y U OB c £ < S o o
b P & P D D D D o ¢ o 4 P PO M o >
s O & b O R (R b & O O O H O 0 o —H ©
& & ¥ H & @ kSN O N O B O« T H 2 4l 4 O S
— N M 0 O~ o 0 O 4 N OO ¥ 10 W~ o o0 O +H4 N O < 0
[To N To NN To NENNTo RN To BENNTo NENNTo NENNTO HENNTo NN o RENEV- RNV B Ve BN IRV RN B - B B I S N L T
S S S S S S S U S U S U A R S U R S S

Page 19 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

476| collect taxes and remit them to the officers entitled to them,
477 and to examine the books and records of all licensees. The

478| authorized employees shall require of each licensee strict

479| compliance with the laws of this state relating to the

480 transaction of such business.

481 (b) Each employee serving as a law enforcement officer for
482 the division must meet the qualifications for employment or

483 appointment as a law enforcement officer set forth under s.

484 943.13 and must be certified as a law enforcement officer by the
485 Department of Law Enforcement under chapter 943. Upon

486 certification, each law enforcement officer is subject to and
487| has the same authority as provided for law enforcement officers
488| generally in chapter 901 and has statewide jurisdiction. Each
489 officer also has arrest authority as provided for state law

490 enforcement officers in s. 901.15. Each officer possesses the
491 full law enforcement powers granted to other peace officers of
492 this state, including the authority to make arrests, carry

493 firearms, serve court process, and seize contraband and the

494| proceeds of illegal activities.

495 1. The primary responsibility of each officer appointed
496 under this section is to investigate, enforce, and prosecute,
497 throughout this #he state, violations and violators of parts I
498 and II of chapter 210, part VII of chapter 559, and chapters
499 561-569, and the rules adopted thereunder, as well as other

500 state laws that the division, all state law enforcement

Page 20 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

501| officers, or beverage enforcement agents are specifically

502 authorized to enforce.

503 2. The secondary responsibility of each officer appointed
504| under this section is to enforce all other state laws, provided
505| that the enforcement is incidental to exercising the officer's
506| primary responsibility as provided in subparagraph 1., and the
507 officer exercises the powers of a deputy sheriff, only after
508 consultation or coordination with the appropriate local

509 sheriff's office or municipal police department or when the

510| division participates in the Florida Mutual Aid Plan during a
511 declared state emergency.

512 (7) The Department of Business and Professional Regulation

513 shall provide, via e-mail, to each person licensed by the

514 department, as promptly as possible after the adjournment sine

515 die of the regular session of the Legislature, a summary of

516 changes to existing law relating to each business and profession

517 and the effective date of each change.

518 Section 2. Sections 310.011, 310.032, 310.042, 455.2124,
519| 455.2228, 468.384, 468.399, 468.4315, 468.4337, 468.4338,

520| 468.521, 468.522, 468.523, 468.605, 468.8316, 468.841¢,

521| 471.0195, 472.007, 472.008, 472.009, 472.017, 472.018, 472.019,
522| 473.303, 474.204, 474.205, 474.206, 475.02, 475.03, 475.04,

523| 475.045, 475.05, 475.10, 476.054, 476.064, 477.015, 481.205,

524| 481.2055, 481.305, 482.243, 489.107, 489.507, 492.103,

525 499.01211, 559.9221, and 570.81, Florida Statutes, are repealed.

Page 21 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

526 Section 3. Paragraph (c) of subsection (3) of section

527 120.54, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

528 120.54 Rulemaking.—

529 (3) ADOPTION PROCEDURES.—

530 (c) Hearings.—

531 1. If the intended action concerns any rule other than one

532 relating exclusively to procedure or practice, the agency shall,
533| on the request of any affected person received within 21 days
534 after the date of publication of the notice of intended agency
535 action, give affected persons an opportunity to present evidence
536 and argument on all issues under consideration. The agency may
537 schedule a public hearing on the rule and, if requested by any
538 affected person, shall schedule a public hearing on the rule.
539| When a public hearing is held, the agency must ensure that staff
540 are available to explain the agency's proposal and to respond to

541 questions or comments regarding the rule. If the agency head is

542 a board, licensing program, or commission er—ether—ecoltegialt

543| Pbedy created under s. 20.165(4) or s. 20.43(3) (g), and one or

544| more requested public hearings is scheduled, the board,

545 licensing program, or commission er—ether—eoltegial—boedy shall

B

546| conduct at least one of the public hearings itself and may not
547 delegate this responsibility without the consent of those

548| persons requesting the public hearing. Any material pertinent to
549| the issues under consideration submitted to the agency within 21

550 days after the date of publication of the notice or submitted to

Page 22 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

551| the agency between the date of publication of the notice and the
552| end of the final public hearing shall be considered by the

553 agency and made a part of the record of the rulemaking

554| proceeding.

555 2. Rulemaking proceedings shall be governed solely by the
556| provisions of this section unless a person timely asserts that
557 the person's substantial interests will be affected in the

558| proceeding and affirmatively demonstrates to the agency that the
559| proceeding does not provide adequate opportunity to protect

560 those interests. If the agency determines that the rulemaking
561| proceeding is not adequate to protect the person's interests, it
562 shall suspend the rulemaking proceeding and convene a separate
563| proceeding under the provisions of ss. 120.569 and 120.57.

564 Similarly situated persons may be requested to join and

565| participate in the separate proceeding. Upon conclusion of the
566 separate proceeding, the rulemaking proceeding shall be resumed.
567 Section 4. Paragraph (ttt) of subsection (7) of section
568 212.08, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

569 212.08 Sales, rental, use, consumption, distribution, and
570 storage tax; specified exemptions.—The sale at retail, the

571 rental, the use, the consumption, the distribution, and the

572 storage to be used or consumed in this state of the following
573 are hereby specifically exempt from the tax imposed by this

574 chapter.

575 (7) MISCELLANEOUS EXEMPTIONS.—Exemptions provided to any

Page 23 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

576| entity by this chapter do not inure to any transaction that is
577 otherwise taxable under this chapter when payment is made by a
578 representative or employee of the entity by any means,

579 including, but not limited to, cash, check, or credit card, even
580| when that representative or employee is subsequently reimbursed
581| by the entity. In addition, exemptions provided to any entity by
582 this subsection do not inure to any transaction that is

583 otherwise taxable under this chapter unless the entity has

584 obtained a sales tax exemption certificate from the department
585| or the entity obtains or provides other documentation as

586 required by the department. Eligible purchases or leases made
587| with such a certificate must be in strict compliance with this
588 subsection and departmental rules, and any person who makes an
589| exempt purchase with a certificate that is not in strict

590 compliance with this subsection and the rules is liable for and
591 shall pay the tax. The department may adopt rules to administer

592 this subsection.

593 (ttt) Small private investigative agencies.—
594 1. As used in this paragraph, the term:
595 a. "Private investigation services" has the same meaning

596 as "private investigation," as defined in s. 493.6101(17).
597 b. "Small private investigative agency" means a private
598 investigator licensed under s. 493.6201 which:

599 (I) Employs three or fewer full-time or part-time

600 employees, including those performing services pursuant to an

Page 24 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

601| employee leasing arrangement as defined in s. 468.520 s—=

602| 46852044), in total; and

603 (IT) During the previous calendar year, performed private

604| 1investigation services otherwise taxable under this chapter in
605| which the charges for the services performed were less than

606| $150,000 for all its businesses related through common

607 ownership.

608 2. The sale of private investigation services by a small
609| private investigative agency to a client is exempt from the tax
610 imposed by this chapter.

611 3. The exemption provided by this paragraph may not apply
612 in the first calendar year a small private investigative agency
613 conducts sales of private investigation services taxable under
614 this chapter.

615 Section 5. Paragraph (f) of subsection (1) of section

616 215.5586, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

617 215.5586 My Safe Florida Home Program.—There is

618| established within the Department of Financial Services the My
619| Safe Florida Home Program. The department shall provide fiscal
620 accountability, contract management, and strategic leadership
621 for the program, consistent with this section. This section does
622 not create an entitlement for property owners or obligate the
623 state in any way to fund the inspection or retrofitting of

624 residential property in this state. Implementation of this

625| program is subject to annual legislative appropriations. It is

Page 25 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

626| the intent of the Legislature that, subject to the availability
627 of funds, the My Safe Florida Home Program provide licensed

628| 1inspectors to perform hurricane mitigation inspections of

629| eligible homes and grants to fund hurricane mitigation projects
630 on those homes. The department shall implement the program in
631 such a manner that the total amount of funding requested by

632 accepted applications, whether for inspections, grants, or other
633 services or assistance, does not exceed the total amount of

634 available funds. If, after applications are processed and

635 approved, funds remain available, the department may accept

636| applications up to the available amount. The program shall

637 develop and implement a comprehensive and coordinated approach
638 for hurricane damage mitigation pursuant to the requirements

639| provided in this section.

640 (1) HURRICANE MITIGATION INSPECTIONS.—

641 (f) To qualify for selection by the department as a wind
642 certification entity to provide hurricane mitigation

643 inspections, the entity must, at a minimum, meet the following
644 requirements:

645 1. Use hurricane mitigation inspectors who are licensed or
646 certified as:

647 a. A building inspector under s. 468.607;

648 b. A general, building, or residential contractor under s.
649| 489.111;

650 c. A professional engineer under s. 471.015;

Page 26 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

651 d. A professional architect under s. 481.213; or
652 e. A home inspector under s. 468.8314 and who have
653| completed at least 3 hours of hurricane mitigation training

654 approved by the department Censtruvetion Industry Lieensing

655| Beaxrd, which training must include hurricane mitigation

656| techniques, compliance with the uniform mitigation verification
657 form, and completion of a proficiency exam.

658 2. Use hurricane mitigation inspectors who also have

659| undergone drug testing and a background screening. The

660| department may conduct criminal record checks of inspectors used
661| by wind certification entities. Inspectors must submit a set of
662 fingerprints to the department for state and national criminal
663| history checks and must pay the fingerprint processing fee set
664 forth in s. 624.501. The fingerprints must be sent by the

665 department to the Department of Law Enforcement and forwarded to
666 the Federal Bureau of Investigation for processing. The results
667| must be returned to the department for screening. The

668 fingerprints must be taken by a law enforcement agency,

669| designated examination center, or other department-approved

670 entity.

671 3. Provide a quality assurance program including a

672 reinspection component.

673 Section 6. Paragraph (b) of subsection (3) of section

674 215.55871, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

675 215.55871 My Safe Florida Condominium Pilot Program.—There

Page 27 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

676| 1s established within the Department of Financial Services the
677| My Safe Florida Condominium Pilot Program to be implemented

678| pursuant to appropriations. The department shall provide fiscal
679 accountability, contract management, and strategic leadership
680 for the pilot program, consistent with this section. This

681 section does not create an entitlement for associations or unit
682 owners or obligate the state in any way to fund the inspection
683| or retrofitting of condominiums in the state. Implementation of
684 this pilot program is subject to annual legislative

685| appropriations. It is the intent of the Legislature that the My
686 Safe Florida Condominium Pilot Program provide licensed

687 inspectors to perform inspections for and grants to eligible

688 associations as funding allows.

689 (3) HURRICANE MITIGATION INSPECTORS.—

690 (b) The department shall contract with wind certification
691| entities to provide hurricane mitigation inspections. To qualify
692 for selection by the department as a wind certification entity
693 to provide hurricane mitigation inspections, the entity must, at
694 a minimum, meet all of the following regquirements:

695 1. Use hurricane mitigation inspectors who are licensed or
696 certified as:

697 a. A building inspector under s. 468.607;

698 b. A general, building, or residential contractor under s.
699| 489.111;

700 c. A professional engineer under s. 471.015;

Page 28 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

701 d. A professional architect under s. 481.213; or

702 e. A home inspector under s. 468.8314 who has completed at
703| least 3 hours of hurricane mitigation training approved by the
704| department ECenstruvetion Fnadustry hiecensingReoard, which must
705| include hurricane mitigation techniques, compliance with the
706| uniform mitigation verification form, and completion of a

707| proficiency exam.

708 2. Use hurricane mitigation inspectors who have undergone
709| drug testing and a background screening. The department may

710 conduct criminal record checks of inspectors used by wind

711 certification entities. Inspectors must submit a full set of
712 fingerprints to the department or to a vendor, an entity, or an
713| agency authorized under s. 943.053(13). The department, vendor,
714| entity, or agency shall forward the fingerprints to the

715 Department of Law Enforcement for state processing, and the

716 Department of Law Enforcement shall forward the fingerprints to
717 the Federal Bureau of Investigation for national processing.
718 Fees for state and federal fingerprint processing shall be borne
719| by the inspector. The state cost for fingerprint processing

720 shall be as provided in s. 943.053(3) (e). The results must be
721 returned to the department for screening. The fingerprints must
722| be taken by a law enforcement agency, designated examination
723 center, or other department-approved entity.

724 3. Provide a gquality assurance program including a

725| reinspection component.

Page 29 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

726 Section 7. Subsection (1) of section 309.01, Florida

727 Statutes, is amended to read:

728 309.01 Deposit of material in tidewater regulated.-—

729 (1) It is not lawful for any person to discharge or cause
730 to be discharged or deposit or cause to be deposited, in the
731 tide or salt waters of any bay, port, harbor, or river of this
732| state, any ballast or material of any kind other than clear

733 stone or rock, free from gravel or pebbles, which said clear
734 stone or rock shall be deposited or discharged only in the

735 construction of enclosures in connection with wharves, piers,
736| quays, Jjetties, or in the construction of permanent bulkheads
737 connecting the solid and permanent portion of wharves. It is
738 lawful to construct three characters of bulkheads for retention
739 of material in solid wharves. First, clear stone or rock

740 enclosures, or bulkheads, may be built upon all sides to a

741 height not less than 2 1/2 feet above high watermark; and after
742 the enclosures have been made so solid, tight, and permanent as
743 to prevent any sand, mud, gravel, or other material that may be
744 discharged or deposited in them from drifting or escaping

745 through such enclosures, any kind of ballast may be discharged
746| or deposited within the enclosures. The enclosures may be

7477 constructed of wood, stone, and rock combined, the stone and
748 rocks to be placed on the outside of the wood to a height not
749| less at any point than 2 1/2 feet above high watermark. Second,
750 a bulkhead may be built by a permanent wharf consisting of

Page 30 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

751| thoroughly creosoted piles not less than 12 inches in diameter
752 at the butt end, to be driven close together and to be capped
753 with timber not less than 10 or 14 inches drift, bolted to each
754| pile, and one or more longitudinal stringers to be placed on the
755| outside of the bulkhead and securely anchored by means of iron
756| rods to piles driven within the bulkheads, clear rock to be on
757 the inside of the bulkhead, to a height of not less than 2 1/2
758 feet above high water; and after this is done, ballast or other
759| material may be deposited within the permanent enclosure so

760 constructed. Third, a bulkhead may be constructed to consist of
701 creosoted piles, as described herein, driven not exceeding 4
762 feet apart from center to center, inside of which two or more
763 longitudinal stringers may be placed and securely bolted to the
764| piles. Inside of these longitudinal pieces, two thicknesses of
765 creosoted sheet piling are to be driven, each course of the

766 sheet piling to make a joint with the other so as to form an
767 impenetrable wharf; and within this permanent bulkhead so

768 constructed, any ballast or other material may be deposited. Ne
769 Such an enclosure, pier, quay, or jetty may not begin shaii—be
770| ¥Pbegwrn until the point at which whereat it is to be built shall

771 have been connected by a substantial wharf with a shore or with
772 a permanent wharf; except that the owners of wharves may at any

773 time, with the consent of the Reardef Pileot Commissioners——of

774 the—bPivisteon—eof Preofessieons—of the Department of Business and

775 Professional Regulation, build wharves of clear stone or rock,

Page 31 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

776 or creosoted walls as hereinafter provided, on each side of

777 their wharves from the shore to a point at which the water is
778 not more than 15 feet deep, and when such walls have attained a
779| height of 2 1/2 feet above high watermark and have been securely
780 closed at the deepwater end by stone or creosoted walls of the
781 same height, any kind of ballast may be deposited in them.

782| Nothing contained in this section shall interfere with any

783 rights or privileges now enjoyed by riparian owners. While this
784 section empowers those who desire to construct the several

785 characters of wharves, piers, quays, Jjetties, and bulkheads

786 provided for and described herein, nothing in this section shall
787| be so construed as to require any person not desiring to

788 construct a permanent wharf by filling up with ballast, stone,
789 or other material to construct under the specifications

790 contained herein; and nothing in this chapter shall be so

791 construed as to prevent any person from constructing any wharf
792 or placing any pilings, logs, or lumber in any waters where the
793| person would have heretofore had the right so to do.

794 Section 8. Subsection (3) of section 310.0015, Florida
795 Statutes, is amended to read:

796 310.0015 Piloting regulation; general provisions.—

797 (3) The rate-setting process, the issuance of licenses

798 only in numbers deemed necessary or prudent by the department

799| beard, and other aspects of the economic regulation of piloting
800| established in this chapter are intended to protect the public

Page 32 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

801| from the adverse effects of unrestricted competition which would
802 result from an unlimited number of licensed pilots being allowed
803| to market their services on the basis of lower prices rather

804 than safety concerns. This system of regulation benefits and

805| protects the public interest by maximizing safety, avoiding

806| uneconomic duplication of capital expenses and facilities, and
807 enhancing state regulatory oversight. The system seeks to

808| provide pilots with reasonable revenues, taking into

809| consideration the normal uncertainties of vessel traffic and

810| port usage, sufficient to maintain reliable, stable piloting

811 operations. Pilots have certain restrictions and obligations

812 under this system, including, but not limited to, the following:
813 (a) Pilots may not refuse to provide piloting services to
814 any person or entity that may lawfully request such services,
815| except for justifiable concerns relating to safety, or, in the
816 case of a vessel planning a departure, for nonpayment of

817| pilotage.

818 (b) Pilots may not unilaterally determine the pilotage

819 rates they charge. Such pilotage rates shall instead be

820 determined by the Pilotage Rate Review Committee, in the public
821 interest, as set forth in s. 310.151.

822 (c) Pilots shall maintain or secure adequate pilot boats,
823 office facilities and equipment, dispatch systems, communication
824 equipment and other facilities, and equipment and support

825 services necessary for a modern, dependable piloting operation.

Page 33 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

826 (d) The pilot or pilots in a port shall train and

827 compensate all member deputy pilots in that port. Failure to

828 train or compensate such deputy pilots constitutes a ground for
829| disciplinary action under s. 310.101. Nothing in this subsection
830| may be deemed to create an agency or employment relationship

831| between a pilot or deputy pilot and the pilot or pilots in a

832| port.

833 (e) In any instance of a payment or transfer of funds, a
834 request for the payment or transfer of funds, or a contractual
835 obligation assumed in respect to the payment or transfer of

836 funds from a licensee payor to a pilot or group of pilots, or to
837 any legal entity or fund administered or controlled by or under
838 common control with such pilot or group of pilots, the pilot or
839| group of pilots shall provide to the licensee payor, at the time
840 the payment or transfer or request for the payment or transfer
841 is made or the obligation is assumed in respect to the payment
842 or transfer, a detailed accounting of the specific assets,

843| tangible or intangible, in which an interest is being directly
844 or indirectly purchased or for which the licensee payor is being
845| granted an interest in return for such payment or transfer of
846 funds or such contractual obligation. This paragraph does not
847 apply to either payments or transfers of funds if their

848 aggregate amounts are less than $1,000. As used in this

849| paragraph, "licensee payor" means any current or prospective

850 state pilot or deputy pilot.

Page 34 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

851 Section 9. Subsection (3) of section 310.002, Florida
852 Statutes, is amended to read:
853 310.002 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, except where

854 the context clearly indicates otherwise:

855 ) "Board" means—tae Soardeof Pilet Commissioners.

856 Section 10. Section 310.051, Florida Statutes, is amended
857| to read:

858 310.051 Personnel; employment.—

859 (1) The department may appoint or employ such personnel as
860| may be necessary to assist the department amnd—the board in doing
861 and performing any and all of the powers, duties, and

862 obligations set forth in this chapter. Such personnel need not

863| be licensed state pilots or members of the department beard.

864 Such personnel shall be authorized to do and perform such duties
865 and work as may be assigned by the department. Except as

866| otherwise provided in this chapter, the department shall provide
867 all legal services necessary in carrying out the provisions of
868 this chapter.

869 (2) The department shall hire a person knowledgeable and
870 experienced in matters related to piloting. Such person shall
871 act for the department on matters of examination and

872 investigation and, when he or she deems it necessary, in the

873 selection of legal counsel qualified in admiralty law. Sa—an

874

875 proerann len s PR PTNEN
ISATE SNSATS 3 IS I S ATA) guE AT A Ay e )

Page 35 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



876
877
878

N1 lotra~e~ + £ 171 +haa o~ A+ oA rtmardt  no NN A r

LJ_I__LU L_,_I_J.J.\j ja—y [ SN S S CIT 1O LJU».) L_,, T CTIT oL LJLA.J_ CTIT T J.I.I.LA._Y [ e e LJL., g

rada~t + BN R ot W T I N2 T + Adorm st marnt At A~ hoard! o

- -J =T CTIT - COUTITTHIIT T T 1 OUTT J S CTIT LJLA.J_ CTIT T - -J = CO CTIT 0TI =]
commaendat i o + boagrd ahall ~eadt 2 o + a2

- COUTITTHIIT TTATE L_,_I_UJ.J., CTIT [ WA LG B ER W § [SSJ N Ny & Ry S o OUTTCTTTCr (e awy [ ¥ i § | g Sy wwy

roasA~Amm s Ao 4 o nea ~+ 2] IS 10 A~~~ A~AA Wy 4+ Aoarn ot~ I1n ] oo

- COUTITTHIIT T T I UTTO TIT T 1T = ) [ ey e LJL., oL J\J_Y CTIT A8 LJLA.J_ CTIT T L\ N g iy [Saw)

879
880
881
882
883
884
885
886
887
888
889
890
891
892
893
894
895
896
897
898
899
900

is amended

Section 11. Section 310.061, Florida Statutes,
to read:
310.061 State pilots; number; cross licensing.—The
department beard shall determine the number of pilots based on
the supply and demand for piloting services and the public
interest in maintaining efficient and safe piloting services.
Based on the economic conditions of the port, the department
beard may adopt rules authorizing cross licensing between ports,
if this will best serve the public interest.
(c), and (d) of subsection (1)

and subsections (2) and (3) of section 310.071,

Section 12. Paragraphs (b),
Florida
Statutes, are amended to read:
310.071 Deputy pilot certification.—

(1) In addition to meeting other requirements specified in
this chapter, each applicant for certification as a deputy pilot
must:

(b) Have successfully completed 12 years of formal

Page 36 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00

V E S




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

901| education, as evidenced by a high school diploma or by

902| equivalent evidence thereof that is satisfactory to the

903 department beard.

904 (c) Be in good physical and mental health, as evidenced by
905| documentary proof of having satisfactorily passed a complete

906| physical examination administered by a licensed physician within

907 the preceding 6 months. The department beaxrd shall adopt rules

908 to establish requirements for passing the physical examination,
909| which rules shall establish minimum standards for the physical
910 or mental capabilities necessary to carry out the professional
911 duties of a certificated deputy pilot. Such standards shall

912 include zero tolerance for any controlled substance regulated
913| wunder chapter 893 unless that individual is under the care of a
914| physician, an advanced practice registered nurse, or a physician
915 assistant and that controlled substance was prescribed by that
916| physician, advanced practice registered nurse, or physician

917 assistant. To maintain eligibility as a certificated deputy

918| pilot, each certificated deputy pilot must annually provide

919| documentary proof of having satisfactorily passed a complete
920| physical examination administered by a licensed physician. The
921| physician must know the minimum standards and certify that the
922 certificateholder satisfactorily meets the standards. The

923 standards for certificateholders shall include a drug test.

924 (d) Have had maritime experience satisfactory to the

925| department before beard—prier—+e taking the examination required

Page 37 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

926 under s. 310.081(2), as evidenced by documentation of the

927| following service while holding a United States Coast Guard

928 license:

929 1. At least 2 years of service at sea during the 5-year
930| period immediately preceding the examination, 1 year of which
931| must have been in at least the capacity of an unlimited second
932| mate;

933 2. At least 2 years of service during the 5-year period
934 immediately preceding the examination in a deepwater United

935 States port as an active first-class unlimited pilot serving on
936| at least an unlimited second mate's license or a license as

937| master of freight and towing vessel of at least 1,600 gross

938 registered tons upon oceans, and acting under authority of a
939| duly constituted governmental regulatory entity;

940 3. At least 2 years of service during the 5-year period
941 immediately preceding the examination as an active first-class
942| wunlimited pilot serving on a Great Lakes unlimited master's

943 license;

944 4. At least 2 years of towing experience during the 5-year
945| period immediately preceding the examination, 1 year of which
946| must have been in the capacity of master of a tugboat/barge

947 combination of at least 5,000 gross registered tons, combined
948 tonnage, while holding a license as master of freight and towing
949| wvessel of at least 1,600 gross registered tons upon oceans; or

950 5. At least 3 years of experience as a deck watch officer

Page 38 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

951
952
953
954
955
956
957
958
959
960
961
962
963
964
965
966
967
968
969
970
971
972
973
974
975

HB 607 2026

during the 10-year period immediately preceding the examination,
1 year of which in the 5-year period immediately preceding the
exam must have been as the commanding officer, executive
officer, or operations officer of a United States Navy vessel or
a United States Coast Guard vessel of at least 1,600 gross tons,
and must currently hold a United States Coast Guard license of
at least an unlimited second mate.

(2) The department bea¥rd may adopt rules authorizing

equivalent combinations of service from two or more of the areas
specified in subparagraphs (1) (d)1., 2., 3., 4., and 5. However,

the department beard may waive the maritime experience

requirements prescribed in paragraph (1) (d) when necessary to
fill an opening, provided an applicant meeting such requirements
has not applied for the opening and the opening has been
advertised more than once.

(3) The initial certificate issued to a deputy pilot shall
be valid for a period of 12 months, and at the end of this
period, the certificate shall automatically expire and may shait+
not be renewed. During this period, the department beard shall
thoroughly evaluate the deputy pilot's performance for
suitability to continue training and—shall-make appropriate
recommendations—+to—the department. Upon the finding reeeipt of a

favorable evaluation recommendationlby—theboard, the department
shall issue a certificate to the deputy pilot, which shall be

valid for a period of 2 years. The certificate may be renewed

Page 39 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

976| only two times, except in the case of a fully licensed pilot who
977 is cross-licensed as a deputy pilot in another port, and

978| provided the deputy pilot meets the requirements specified for
979| pilots in paragraph (1) (c).

980 Section 13. Section 310.073, Florida Statutes, is amended
981| to read:

982 310.073 State pilot licensing.—In addition to meeting

983 other requirements specified in this chapter, each applicant for
984 license as a state pilot must:

985 (1) Be at least 21 years of age, as evidenced by a copy of
986 a birth certificate or other legal proof of age.

987 (2) Have successfully completed 12 years of formal

988 education, as evidenced by a high school diploma or by

989| equivalent evidence thereof that is satisfactory to the

990 department beard.

991 (3) Be in good physical and mental health, as evidenced by
992 documentary proof of having satisfactorily passed a complete

993| physical examination administered by a licensed physician within

994 the preceding 6 months. The department beaxrd shall adopt rules

995| to establish requirements for passing the physical examination,
996| which rules shall establish minimum standards for the physical
997 or mental capabilities necessary to carry out the professional
998 duties of a licensed state pilot. Such standards shall include
999 zero tolerance for any controlled substance regulated under

1000 chapter 893 unless that individual is under the care of a

Page 40 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1001| physician, an advanced practice registered nurse, or a physician
1002 assistant and that controlled substance was prescribed by that
1003| physician, advanced practice registered nurse, or physician

1004 assistant. To maintain eligibility as a licensed state pilot,
1005| each licensed state pilot must annually provide documentary

1006| proof of having satisfactorily passed a complete physical

1007| examination administered by a licensed physician. The physician
1008| must know the minimum standards and certify that the licensee
1009| satisfactorily meets the standards. The standards for licensees
1010 shall include a drug test.

1011 (4) Have had at least 2 years of service as a deputy pilot
1012 in the port in which license as a licensed state pilot is

1013 desired, which service must have been attained during the period
1014 immediately preceding the examination required under s.

1015 310.081(1). Further, at the time of application, each applicant
1016| must have a valid United States Coast Guard first-class

1017 unlimited pilot's license covering all of the waters of the port
1018 in which license as a state pilot is desired and must have

1019 successfully completed the department-approved beard-approved

1020 deputy pilot training program in the port in which license as a
1021 state pilot is desired.

1022 Section 14. Section 310.075, Florida Statutes, is amended
1023| to read:

1024 310.075 Deputy pilot training program.—The licensed state
1025| pilots in each port shall submit to the department keard for its

Page 41 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1026| approval a deputy pilot training program of not less than 2

1027 years' duration, applicable to all deputy pilots appointed to
1028 serve at such port. The following requirements constitute the
1029| parameters within which deputy pilot training programs are to be
1030| established and carried out by the licensed state pilots at all
1031| ports in this state:

1032 (1) Upon receiving his or her appointment, a deputy pilot
1033| must report to the licensed state pilots at the port he or she
1034 is appointed to serve and must serve a period of not less than
1035 90 days as an observer trainee. During such period:

1036 (a) The observer trainee must accompany licensed state
1037| pilots, becoming thoroughly familiar with all of the waters, the
1038 channels, the harbor, and the port under varied conditions.

1039 (b) The observer trainee must obtain a valid United States
1040| Coast Guard first-class unlimited pilot's license covering all

1041 of the waters of the port before the department beard may

1042 authorize him or her to pilot vessels within the limits and
1043 specifications established by the licensed state pilots of the
1044 port.

1045 (2) Upon completion of the observer-trainee period, the

1046| deputy pilot must submit to the department bkeaxrd a deputy pilot

1047 vessel handling form for each vessel upon which he or she has
1048 accompanied a licensed state pilot. Each such form must be
1049 signed by the pilot in charge who accompanied the deputy pilot

1050 and must accurately recite:

Page 42 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1051 (a) The vessel's registry, length, gross tonnage, and
1052 draft;
1053 (b) The name of the berth from which or to which the

1054| vessel was piloted;

1055 (c) The weather and sea conditions encountered;
10506 (d) The time of day;
1057 (e) Any marine incidents required to be reported under s.

1058 310.111; and

1059 (f) The comments of the pilot in charge, including

1060| whether, under his or her supervision, the pilot in charge

1061 turned the navigation of the vessel over to the deputy pilot.
1062 (3) Each request to increase the limits and specifications
1063| under which a deputy pilot is authorized to pilot must be

1064 submitted to the department beard and must be accompanied by a

1065 deputy pilot vessel handling form as provided in subsection (2)
1066 for each vessel the deputy pilot has piloted since his or her
1067 limits and specifications were last increased by the department

1068 board.

1069 (4) For successful completion of the deputy pilot training
1070| program, a deputy pilot must have gradually been increased in
1071 his or her authorized limits and specifications until the deputy

1072| pilot has been authorized by the department beard to pilot

1073| vessels with a maximum draft of not more than 3 feet less than
1074 the normal maximum draft allowable in the port in which the

1075 deputy pilot is authorized to pilot, as proposed by the licensed

Page 43 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1076 state pilots in that port and approved by the department beard.

1077 Section 15. Section 310.081, Florida Statutes, is amended
1078 to read:

1079 310.081 Department to examine and license state pilots and
1080 certificate deputy pilots; vacancies.—

1081 (1) The department shall examine persons who file

1082 application as state pilot in all matters pertaining to the

1083| management of vessels and in regard to their knowledge of the
1084 channels, waters, harbors, and port where they wish to serve,
1085 and, if upon examination to determine proficiency the department
1086| finds them qualified to pilot all classes of vessels liable to
1087| enter that port and thoroughly familiar with the waters, the
1088 channels, the harbor, and the port, the department shall appoint
1089 and license as state pilots such number of pilots as in the

1090 discretion of the department bea¥rd are required to act in the

1091| ports of the state. However, the number of pilots appointed and
1092| 1licensed by the department may shatd not exceed the number

1093| provided for in s. 310.061.

1094 (2) The department shall similarly examine persons who
1095 file applications for certificate as deputy pilot, and, if upon
1096| examination to determine proficiency the department finds them
1097 qualified, the department must certify as qualified all

1098 applicants who pass the examination, provided that not more than
1099 five persons who passed the examination are certified for each

1100 declared opening. If more than five applicants per opening pass

Page 44 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1101 the examination, the persons having the highest scores must be
1102 certified as qualified up to the number of openings times five.
1103| The department shall appoint and certificate such number of
1104| deputy pilots from those applicants deemed qualified as in the
1105| discretion of the department beard are required in the

1106| respective ports of the state. A deputy pilot shall be

1107| authorized by the department to pilot vessels within the limits
1108 and specifications established by the licensed state pilots at
1109 the port where the deputy is appointed to serve.

1110 (3) Pilots shall hold their licenses or certificates

1111 pursuant to the requirements of this chapter so long as they:
1112 (a) Possess the qualifications set out in this chapter.
1113 (b) Are in good physical and mental health as evidenced by
1114 documentary proof of having satisfactorily passed a physical
1115 examination administered by a licensed physician or physician

1116 assistant within each calendar year. The department beard shall

1117 adopt rules to establish requirements for passing the physical
1118 examination, which rules shall establish minimum standards for
1119 the physical or mental capabilities necessary to carry out the
1120| professional duties of a licensed state pilot or a certificated
1121| deputy pilot. Such standards shall include zero tolerance for
1122 any controlled substance regulated under chapter 893 unless that
1123 individual is under the care of a physician, an advanced

1124| practice registered nurse, or a physician assistant and that

1125 controlled substance was prescribed by that physician, advanced

Page 45 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1126| practice registered nurse, or physician assistant. To maintain
1127| eligibility as a certificated deputy pilot or licensed state
1128| pilot, each certificated deputy pilot or licensed state pilot
1129| must annually provide documentary proof of having satisfactorily
1130| passed a complete physical examination administered by a

1131 licensed physician. The physician must know the minimum

1132 standards and certify that the certificateholder or licensee
1133 satisfactorily meets the standards. The standards for

1134 certificateholders and for licensees shall include a drug test.
1135 (c) Are subject to a substance abuse program that has been

1136| approved by the department beaxrd, which includes provisions for

1137 drug testing.

1138 () NtE+rm A o I~ A SN~ A anmam o L AN S g
A7 I ICCCTTITD U L AW L i upw § Q«Lt/t/J_UVCM [SSJANSY § § i Sy i iy @ g =y [ S vulll,_LllL«l_Lll\_j
echreation—which inetudes radar certifiecation

1139 Adrroaa+ o K K ] A A + - £ +

1140 (d)4e)> Remain in active service in the ports for which

1141 they are appointed.
1142
1143| Upon resignation or in the case of disability permanently

1144 affecting a pilot's ability to serve, the state license or

1145 certificate issued under this chapter shall be revoked by the
1146 department.

1147 Section 16. Paragraphs (d), (g), and (h) of subsection (1)
1148 and subsections (2), (3), and (4) of section 310.101, Florida
1149 Statutes, are amended to read:

1150 310.101 Grounds for disciplinary action by the department

Page 46 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1151 beaxrd.—

1152 (1) Any act of misconduct, inattention to duty,

1153| negligence, or incompetence; any willful violation of any law or
1154 rule, including the rules of the road, applicable to a licensed
1155 state pilot or certificated deputy pilot; or any failure to

1156| exercise that care which a reasonable and prudent licensed state
1157| pilot or certificated deputy pilot would exercise under the same
1158 or similar circumstances may result in disciplinary action.

1159| Examples of acts by a licensed state pilot or certificated

1160| deputy pilot which constitute grounds for disciplinary action
1161 include, but are not limited to:

1162 (d) Navigating in channels where the depth of water under
1163 the keel is less than the prescribed bottom clearance as

1164 recommended by the licensed state pilots of that port and

1165 approved by the department beaxd.

1166 (g) Making or filing, or inducing another person to make
1167 or file, a report which the pilot knows to be false or

1168 intentionally or negligently failing to file, or willfully
1169| impeding or obstructing the filing of, a report or record

1170 required by state law or by rule of the beard—er—the department.

1171 Such reports or records include only those which are signed by
1172 the pilot in his or her capacity as a licensed state pilot or
1173 certificated deputy pilot.

1174 (h) Being unable to perform the duties of a pilot with

1175 reasonable skill and safety by reason of illness or use of

Page 47 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1176 alcohol, drugs, narcotics, chemicals, or any other type of

1177| material or as a result of any mental or physical condition such
1178 as, but not limited to, poor eyesight or hearing, heart disease,
1179| or diabetes. In enforcing this paragraph, the department shall
1180 have authority, upon recommendation of the probable cause panel

1181 of the department beaxrd, to compel a licensed state pilot or

1182 certificated deputy pilot to submit to a mental or physical

1183| examination by physicians designated by the department. The

1184 failure of a pilot to submit to such an examination when so

1185 directed constitutes an admission of the allegations against the
1186| pilot, unless the failure is due to circumstances beyond his or
1187 her control, consequent upon which an emergency suspension order
1188| may be entered by the department suspending the pilot's license
1189 until he or she complies with the order for a compulsory mental
1190 or physical examination. A licensed state pilot or certificated
1191| deputy pilot affected under this paragraph must be afforded, at
1192 reasonable intervals, an opportunity to demonstrate that he or
1193 she can resume the competent practice of piloting with

1194 reasonable skill and safety.

1195 (2) When the department beard finds any person has

1196 committed any act set forth in subsection (1), it may enter an
1197 order imposing one or more of the following penalties:

1198 (a) Refusing to certify to the department an application
1199 for license or certification.

1200 (b) Revoking or suspending the license or certificate.

Page 48 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1201 (c) Restricting the practice of the wviolator.

1202 (d) Imposing an administrative fine not to exceed $5,000
1203 for each count or separate offense.

1204 (e) 1Issuing a reprimand.

1205 (f) Placing the licensed state pilot or certificated

1206| deputy pilot on probation for such period of time and subject to
1207 such conditions as the department beard may specify, including,

1208| but not limited to, requiring the pilot to submit to treatment,
1209 submit to additional or remedial training, submit to
1210 reexamination, or undergo a complete physical examination.

1211 (3) The department beard shall not reinstate the license

1212 or certificate of a state pilot or deputy pilot or cause a
1213 license or certificate to be issued to a person whom it has

1214 determined to be unqualified until the department beard is

1215 satisfied that such person has complied with all the terms and
1216 conditions set forth in the final order and that such person is
1217 capable of safely engaging in the practice of piloting.

1218 (4) In any foreign vessel or foreign trading vessel

1219| movement that an individual holding a state pilot license or
1220| deputy pilot certificate is engaged in directing, whether

1221 movement of the vessel in or out of the port or movement in
1222 close proximity to a dock or any other movement undertaken in
1223 furtherance of his or her piloting duties, such individual is
1224 operating under the authority of his or her state license or

1225 certificate and is accountable to the department keard for his

Page 49 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1226| or her actions.

1227 Section 17. Subsections (4) and (6) of section 310.102,
1228 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1229 310.102 Treatment programs for impaired pilots and deputy
1230| pilots.—

1231 (4) In any disciplinary action for a violation other than
1232 impairment, if a pilot or deputy pilot establishes that the
1233| wviolation for which the pilot or deputy pilot is being

1234| prosecuted was due to or connected with impairment and further
1235 establishes that the pilot or deputy pilot is satisfactorily
1236| progressing through or has successfully completed an approved
1237 treatment program pursuant to this section, such information may

1238| be considered by the department beaxrd as a mitigating factor in

1239| determining the appropriate penalty. This subsection does not

1240 limit mitigating factors the department beard may consider.

1241 (6) A consultant, licensee, or approved treatment provider
1242| who makes a disclosure pursuant to this section is not subject
1243| to civil liability for such disclosure or its consequences. The
1244 provisions of s. 766.101 apply to any officer, employee, or

1245 agent of the department er—theboard and to any officer,

1246| employee, or agent of any entity with which the department has
1247 contracted pursuant to this section.

1248 Section 18. Section 310.111, Florida Statutes, is amended
1249| to read:

1250 310.111 Marine incident reports.—Each collision,

Page 50 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1251| grounding, stranding, or other marine peril sustained or caused
1252| by a vessel on which there was employed a licensed state pilot

1253| or certificated deputy pilot shall be reported to the department

1254| effiee—of—+thePboeard or the piloting consultant within 48 hours
1255 after of the occurrence. In addition, a written report shall be
1256 submitted to the department on forms and in the manner

1257| prescribed by the department within 7 days after ef the

1258 occurrence. However, any marine incident involving oil spillage,
1259| pollution, physical injury, or death shall be reported to the
1260 department beard or the piloting consultant by telephone or
1261| telegram within 24 hours after ef the occurrence in addition to
1262 submission of the required written report.

1263 Section 19. Section 310.121, Florida Statutes, is amended
1264 to read:

1265 310.121 Application, examination, and biennial fees.—
1266 (1) The department shall, in accordance with rules set by
1267 the department beard, assess and collect the following fees:

1268 (a) A fee not to exceed $300 for each application for
1269 licensure as a state pilot or certification as a deputy pilot.
1270 This fee shall be nonrefundable.

1271 (b) A fee not to exceed $300 for each examination for
1272 licensure as a state pilot or certification as a deputy pilot.
1273 (c) A fee not to exceed $300 for each examination review.
1274 (2) The department shall assess and collect biennially

1275 from each licensed state pilot and each certificated deputy

Page 51 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1276| pilot a fee, not to exceed $200 in the case of a licensed state
1277 pilot or $100 in the case of a certificated deputy pilot, such
1278 fees to be set by the department beaxd.

1279 Section 20. Section 310.131, Florida Statutes, is amended
1280 to read:

1281 310.131 Assessment of percentage of gross pilotage.—The
1282| department shall assess the licensed state pilots in the

1283 respective ports of the state a percentage of the gross amount
1284 of pilotage earned by such pilots during each year, which

1285| percentage will be established by the department beard not to

1286| exceed 2 percent, to be paid into the Professional Regulation
1287 Trust Fund by such pilots at such time and in such manner as the
1288| department beard prescribes or as is set forth in the General
1289| Appropriations Act. The financial records of all pilots and

1290 deputy pilots relating to pilotage are subject to audit by the
1291 department and the Auditor General. The department shall by rule
1292 set a procedure for verifying the amount of pilotage at each
1293| port and may charge costs to the appropriate port if the port
1294 does not comply with such procedure.

1295 Section 21. Section 310.142, Florida Statutes, is amended
1296| to read:

1297 310.142 Pilotage at St. Marys Entrance.—The department may
1298| exercise beoardis—autheorized—toenter inteoan agreement—with +the
1299| BeardefPilotage Commissioners—Ffor—the corporate authority of

1300 St. Marys, Georgia, for reciprocal pilotage of vessels in the

Page 52 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

1301
1302
1303
1304
1305
1306
1307
1308
1309
1310
1311
1312
1313
1314
1315
1316
1317
1318
1319
1320
1321
1322
1323
1324
1325

HB 607 2026

boundary waters and tributaries of St. Marys Entrance.

Section 22. Subsections (1) and (7) of section 310.151,
Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

310.151 Rates of pilotage; Pilotage Rate Review
Committee.—

(1) (a) As used in this section, the term+

3= "committee" means the Pilotage Rate Review Committee

established under this section as—part—eofthe Board eof Pilet
Commissieoners.

2 npo AN Ao
0 p ) < meatto

qar

2N B
e

o
A\ -

ar

(b) To carry out thepreovisiens—ef this section, the

Pilotage Rate Review Committee is established as part of the
A

£ D
- p.

H et Commissioners—within—the department efRBusiress

o
A -

and—Professienat—Regulation. The committee shall consist of the

following seven members ef—the—Pboard: two beard members who are

A\

!

licensed state pilots actively practicing their professiony—whe

2N

T

on
B
L

[OR
-
B

PN NS + £ o+ 14carnand ot + o
LJ_Y llluJ |\ Sy T - T T T C TTTIOoOCTTr T T O

@D

Iz o
VT =]

He

1
T

[0)]
@D

S e~ o a1
= AP ULITTITT A\ = ML LY

N

oare; two beard members who are actively

[0)]
s

erving—on
involved in a professional or business capacity in the maritime
industry, marine shipping industry, or commercial passenger
cruise industry; one beard member who is a certified public
accountant with at least 5 years of experience in financial
management; and two beard members who are citizens of the state.

(c) Committee members shall comply with the disclosure

requirements of s. 112.3143(4) if participating in any matter

Page 53 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1326| that would result in special private gain or loss as described
1327 in that subsection.
1328 (d) The committee may has—autheority—te adopt rules

1329| purswant—te—ss5+—3120-536(1)—and3120-54 to implement provisions of

1330 this section conferring duties upon it. The department shall

1331| provide the staff required by the committee to carry out its
1332| duties under this section.

1333 (e) All funds received pursuant to this section shall be

1334| placed in the account of the department Beard—efPitet

1335| ceommissieners, and the department Beard—eofPiletCommissioners

1336| shall pay for all expenses incurred pursuant to this section.
1337 (7) The decisions of the committee regarding rates are not

1338 appealable to the department beard.

1339 Section 23. Section 310.183, Florida Statutes, is amended
1340 to read:

1341 310.183 Immediate inactivation of license or certificate
1342 for certain violations.—The department shall issue an emergency
1343| order placing on inactive status, for a period not to exceed 15
1344 days, the license of any pilot or certificate of any deputy
1345| pilot who, while providing piloting services, is involved in a

13406 marine incident that results in the death of a human or, as

1347 determined by rule ef—thebeoard, substantial physical injury to
1348 a human or significant property or environmental damage, unless
1349| the department determines that the incident is clearly not the

1350 result of the actions of the pilot or deputy pilot.

Page 54 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1351 Section 24. Subsection (1) of section 310.185, Florida
1352 Statutes, is amended to read:

1353 310.185 Rulemaking.—

1354 (1) The department may beardhas—avtheority—+te adopt rules
1355| pursvent—teo—s5s5+—3120-536{)—and—3120-54 to implement +he

1356| previsiens—ef this chapter.
1357 Section 25. Subsection (2) of section 326.002, Florida

1358 Statutes, is amended to read:

1359 326.002 Definitions.—As used in ss. 326.001-326.006, the

1360 term:

1361 (2) "Division" means the Division of Professions ¥Flerida

1362 Condomintums—Fimeshares—and Mebite Homes of the Department of

1363| Business and Professional Regulation.
1364 Section 26. Subsection (3) of section 326.006, Florida

1365 Statutes, is amended to read:

1366 326.006 Powers and duties efdivisien.—
1367 (3) All fees must be deposited in the Professional
1368 Regulation Bivisieneof FleoridaCorndeominiums,—Fimeshares,——and

1369| MebiteHoemes Trust Fund as provided by law.

1370 Section 27. Paragraph (a) of subsection (3) of section
1371 376.303, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1372 376.303 Powers and duties of the Department of

1373 Environmental Protection.—

1374 (3) INSPECTION OF POLLUTANT STORAGE TANKS.—
1375 (a) The department may inspect the installation of any
Page 55 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1376| pollutant storage tank. Any person installing a pollutant
1377 storage tank, as defined in s. 489.105(16) s+—489-3654++-, shall

1378| certify that such installation is in accordance with the

1379 standards adopted pursuant to this section. The department shall
1380| promulgate a form for such certification which shall at a

1381| minimum include:

1382 1. A signed statement by the certified pollutant storage
1383 systems contractor, as defined in s. 489.105(2) (p) s+

1384 | 4883653 )r4tp), that such installation is in accordance with

1385 standards adopted pursuant to this section; and

1386 2. Signed statements by the onsite persons performing or
1387 supervising the installation of a pollutant storage tank, which
1388 statements shall be required of tasks that are necessary for the
1389| proper installation of such tank.

1390 Section 28. Paragraph (n) of subsection (3) of section
1391 381.0065, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1392 381.0065 Onsite sewage treatment and disposal systems;
1393 regulation.—

1394 (3) DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL
1395 PROTECTION.—The department shall:

1396 (n) Regulate and permit maintenance entities for

1397| performance-based treatment systems and aerobic treatment unit
1398 systems. To ensure systems are maintained and operated according
1399 to manufacturer's specifications and designs, the department

1400 shall establish by rule minimum qualifying criteria for

Page 56 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1401 maintenance entities. The criteria shall include training,

1402 access to approved spare parts and components, access to

1403 manufacturer's maintenance and operation manuals, and service
1404 response time. The maintenance entity shall employ a contractor

1405| licensed under s. 489.105(2) (m) s+—489-36543)fm), or part III of

1406 chapter 489, or a state-licensed wastewater plant operator, who
1407 is responsible for maintenance and repair of all systems under
1408 contract.

1409 Section 29. Section 403.868, Florida Statutes, is amended
1410| to read:

1411 403.868 Requirements by a utility.—A utility may have more
1412 stringent requirements than set by law, including certification
1413| requirements for water distribution systems and domestic

1414| wastewater collection systems operations, except that a utility
1415 may not require a licensed contractor, as defined in s.

1416 489.105(2) 5+—489-3654(3)> to have any additional license for work

1417 in water distribution systems or domestic wastewater collection
1418 systems.

1419 Section 30. Paragraph (e) of subsection (1) of section
1420 403.9329, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1421 403.9329 Professional mangrove trimmers.-—

1422 (1) For purposes of ss. 403.9321-403.9333, the following
1423| persons are considered professional mangrove trimmers:

1424 (e) Persons licensed under part II of chapter 481. The
1425| Department of Business and Professional Regulation Beard—ef

Page 57 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1426| IaondsecapeArehiteeture shall establish appropriate standards and
1427| eentinuvingltegal—educationreguirements to assure the competence

1428 of licensees to conduct the activities authorized under ss.
1429 403.9321-403.9333. Trimming by landscape architects as
1430| professional mangrove trimmers is not allowed until the

1431 establishment of standards by the department beard. The

1432| department beard shall also establish penalties for violating
1433 ss. 403.9321-403.9333. Only those landscape architects who are
1434 certified in the state may qualify as professional mangrove
1435 trimmers under ss. 403.9321-403.9333, notwithstanding any

1436| reciprocity agreements that may exist between this state and
1437 other states;

1438 Section 31. Paragraph (a) of subsection (19) of section
1439 440.02, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

1440 440.02 Definitions.—When used in this chapter, unless the
1441 context clearly requires otherwise, the following terms shall
1442 have the following meanings:

1443 (19) (a) "Employer" means the state and all political

1444 subdivisions thereof, all public and guasi-public corporations
1445 therein, every person carrying on any employment, and the legal
1446| representative of a deceased person or the receiver or trustees
1447 of any person. The term also includes employee leasing

1448 companies, as defined in s. 468.520(4) s+—468-520+45), and

1449| employment agencies that provide their own employees to other

1450| persons. If the employer is a corporation, parties in actual

Page 58 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1451 control of the corporation, including, but not limited to, the
1452| president, officers who exercise broad corporate powers,

1453| directors, and all shareholders who directly or indirectly own a
1454 controlling interest in the corporation, are considered the

1455 employer for the purposes of ss. 440.105, 440.106, and 440.107.
1456 Section 32. Section 448.26, Florida Statutes, is amended
1457| to read:

1458 448.26 Application.—Nothing in this part shall exempt any
1459 client of any labor pool or temporary help arrangement entity as
1460 defined in s. 468.520(3) (a) s+—468-5204)+=)> or any assigned

1461| employee from any other license requirements of state, local, or

1462 federal law. Any employee assigned to a client who is licensed,
1463| registered, or certified pursuant to law shall be deemed an
1464 employee of the client for such licensure purposes but shall
1465 remain an employee of the labor pool or temporary help

1466 arrangement entity for purposes of chapters 440 and 443.

1467 Section 33. Section 455.203, Florida Statutes, is amended
1468 to read:

1469 455.203 Department; powers and duties.—Notwithstanding any

1470 other law, for each profession under the jurisdiction of the

1471| department, and for the boards under its jurisdiction, the
1472 department shall:
1473 (1) Adopt rules establishing a procedure for the biennialt

1474 renewal of licenses every 4 yearss+—however,—thedepartment—may

a
A=

1475 1 oo 171y oS Az 10~ o + an] ot 11 c0aona o
TSooaC—oap oo T yCor xSt —Tto—S T T CCTTToSCTES

Page 59 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1476| netwithstanding anyother provisieons—oftaw to—+the~econtrary.

1477 Fees for such renewal shall not exceed the fee caps for

1478| individual professions on an annualized basis as authorized by
1479 law.

1480 (2) Appoint the executive director of each board, subject
1481 to the approval of the board.

1482 (3) Submit an annual budget to the Legislature at a time
1483 and in the manner provided by law.

1484 (4) Develop a training program for persons newly appointed
1485 to membership on any board. The program shall familiarize such
1486| persons with the substantive and procedural laws and rules and
1487 fiscal information relating to the regulation of the appropriate

1488| profession and with the structure of the department.

1489 (5) Adopt rules pursuwant—te——ss—I20-536(H——and320-54 to

1490 implement £he—provisiens—ef this chapter.

1491 (6) Establish by rule procedures by which the department
1492 shall use the expert or technical advice of the appropriate
1493| Dboard for the purposes of investigation, inspection, evaluation
1494 of applications, other duties of the department, or any other
1495 areas the department may deem appropriate.

1496 (7) Require all proceedings of any board or panel thereof
1497 and all formal or informal proceedings conducted by the

1498| department, an administrative law judge, or a hearing officer
1499| with respect to licensing or discipline to be electronically

1500 recorded in a manner sufficient to assure the accurate

Page 60 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1501 transcription of all matters so recorded.

1502 (8) Select only those investigators, or consultants who
1503 undertake investigations, who meet criteria established with the
1504 advice of the respective boards.

1505 (9) Work cooperatively with the Department of Revenue to
1506| implement an automated method for periodically disclosing

1507| information relating to current licensees to the Department of
1508| Revenue. The purpose of this subsection is to promote the public
1509| policy of this state as established in s. 409.2551. The

1510 department shall, when directed by the court or the Department
1511 of Revenue pursuant to s. 409.2598, suspend or deny the license
1512 of any licensee found not to be in compliance with a support
1513 order, subpoena, order to show cause, or written agreement

1514| entered into by the licensee with the Department of Revenue. The
1515| department shall issue or reinstate the license without

1516| additional charge to the licensee when notified by the court or
1517 the Department of Revenue that the licensee has complied with
1518 the terms of the support order. The department shall not be held
1519| 1liable for any license denial or suspension resulting from the
1520 discharge of its duties under this subsection.

1521 (10) Have authority to:

1522 (a) Close and terminate deficient license application

1523 files 2 years after the board or the department notifies the
1524 applicant of the deficiency; and

1525 (b) Approve applications for professional licenses that

Page 61 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1526| meet all statutory and rule requirements for licensure.

1527 Section 34. Subsections (8) and (9) of section 455.271,
1528 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1529 455.271 Inactive and delinquent status.—

1530 (8) Each board, or the department when there is no board,
1531 shall, by rule, impose an additional fee, not to exceed the
1532 bienniat renewal fee for an active status license, for

1533| processing a licensee's request to change licensure status at
1534 any time other than at the beginning of a licensure cycle.

1535 (9) Each board, or the department when there is no board,
1536| may, by rule, impose reasonable conditions, excluding full

1537 reexamination but including part of a national examination or a
1538 special purpose examination to assess current competency,

1539| necessary to ensure that a licensee who has been on inactive
1540| status for more than one two—consecutive—bienniat licensure
1541| cycle eyetres and who applies for active status can practice with
1542 the care and skill sufficient to protect the health, safety, and
1543| welfare of the public. Reactivation requirements may differ
1544| depending on the length of time licensees are inactive. The
1545 costs to meet reactivation requirements shall be borne by

1546 licensees requesting reactivation.

1547 Section 35. Subsection (4) of section 468.382, Florida
1548 Statutes, is amended to read:

1549 468.382 Definitions.—As used in this act, the term:

1550 I n

Page 62 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1551 Section 36. Subsections (1) and (3) through (7) of section
1552 468.385, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
1553 468.385 Licenses required; qualifications; examination.—

1554 (1) The department shall license any applicant who #he

1555| beardeertifies is qualified to practice auctioneering.

1556 (3) A Ne person may not shad+ be licensed as an auctioneer
1557| or apprentice if he or she:

1558 (a) Is under 18 years of age; or

1559 (b) Has committed any act or offense in this state or any
1560 other jurisdiction which would constitute a basis for

1561| disciplinary action under s. 468.389.

1562 (4) A Any person seeking a license as an auctioneer must

1563| pass a written examination approved by the department beard

1564| which tests his or her general knowledge of the laws of this

1565 state relating to provisions of the Uniform Commercial Code that

1566| are relevant to auctions, the laws of agency, and the—preovisiens
1567| ef this act.

1568 (5) FEach apprentice application and license shall name a
1569| 1licensed auctioneer who has agreed to serve as the supervisor of
1570 the apprentice. An Ne apprentice may not conduct, or contract to
1571 conduct, an auction without the express approval of his or her
1572 supervisor. The supervisor shall regularly review the

1573 apprentice's records, which are required by the department beard

1574 to be maintained, to determine whether +£f such records are

1575 accurate and current.

Page 63 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1576 (6) A Ne person may not shadt+ be licensed as an auctioneer
1577| unless he or she:

1578 (a) Has held an apprentice license and has served as an
1579| apprentice for 1 year or more, or has completed a course of

1580 study, consisting of not less than 80 classroom hours of

1581 instruction, that meets standards adopted by the department

1582 | beard;

1583 (b) Has passed the required examination; and
1584 (c) Is approved by the department beard.
1585 (7) (a) Any auction that is subject to the provisiens—of

1586| this part must be conducted by an auctioneer who has an active
1587 license or an apprentice who has an active apprentice auctioneer
1588 license and who has received prior written sponsor consent.

1589 (b) A Ne business may not shaltd auction or offer to

1590 auction any property in this state unless it is licensed as an

1591 auction business by the department keard or is exempt from

1592| 1licensure under this act. An Baeh application for licensure must
1593| skatt include the names of the owner and the business, the

1594| Dbusiness mailing address and location, and any other information
1595| which the department beard may require. The owner of an auction
1596| business shall report to the department beaxrd within 30 days

1597 after ef any change in this required information.

1598 Section 37. Subsection (2) of section 468.3851, Florida
1599 Statutes, is amended to read:

1600 468.3851 Renewal of license.—

Page 64 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1601 (2) The department shall adopt a procedure for the
1602| bienniat renewal of licenses every 4 years.

1603 Section 38. Section 468.3852, Florida Statutes, is amended
1604 to read:

1605 468.3852 Reactivation of license; fee.—The department

1606| Pbeard shall prescribe a fee not to exceed $250 for the

1607 reactivation of an inactive license. The fee shall be in

1608 addition to the current biennialt renewal fee.

1609 Section 39. Subsections (2) through (5) and (8) of section
1610 468.3855, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1611 468.3855 Apprenticeship training requirements.—

1612 (2) Any auctioneer who undertakes the sponsorship of an
1613 apprentice shall ensure that the apprentice receives training as

1614 required by department beard rule.

1615 (3) An apprentice must actively participate in auction

1616 sales as required by department beard rule, and a record of each

1617 auction for which participation credit is claimed must be made

1618 as required by department beard rule.

1619 (4) Apprentices are prohibited from conducting any auction
1620| without the prior express written consent of the sponsor. The
1621 apprentice's sponsor must be present at the auction site at any
1622 time the apprentice is actively participating in the conduct of
1623 the auction. If the apprentice's sponsor cannot attend a

1624| particular auction, the sponsor may appoint a qualified

1625| auctioneer who meets the requirements of department beaxd rule

Page 65 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1626| to attend the auction in his or her place. Prior written consent
1627| must be given by the apprentice's sponsor for each substitution.
1628 (5) Each apprentice and sponsor shall file reports as

1629 required by department beard rule.

1630 (8) All apprentice applications shall be valid for a
1631| period of 6 months after department beard approval. Any

1632| applicant who fails to complete the licensure process within
1633 that time shall be required to make application as a new
1634 applicant.

1635 Section 40. Subsection (1) of section 468.386, Florida
1636 Statutes, is amended to read:

1637 468.386 Fees; local licensing requirements.—

1638 (1) The department beard by rule may establish

1639 application, examination, licensure, renewal, and other

1640 reasonable and necessary fees, based upon the department's

1641 estimate of the costs fe—theboard in administering this act.
1642 Section 41. Section 468.387, Florida Statutes, is amended
1643 to read:

1644 468.387 Licensing of nonresidents; endorsement;

1645| reciprocity.—The department shall issue a license by endorsement
1646 to practice auctioneering to an applicant who, upon applying to
1647 the department and remitting the required fee, set by the

1648| department beard, demonstrates to the department beard that he

1649 or she satisfies the requirements of s. 468.385(3) and holds a

1650 valid license to practice auctioneering in another state,

Page 66 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1651| provided that the requirements for licensure in that state are
1652 substantially equivalent to or more stringent than those

1653| existing in this state. The endorsement and reciprocity

1654| provisions of this section shall apply to auctioneers only and
1655 not to professions or occupations regulated by other statutes.
1656 Section 42. Subsections (3) and (9) and paragraph (b) of
1657 subsection (10) of section 468.388, Florida Statutes, are

1658| amended to read:

1659 468.388 Conduct of an auction.—

1660 (3) Each auctioneer or auction business shall maintain a
1661 record book of all sales. The record book shall be open to
1662 inspection by the department beard at reasonable times.

1663 (9) The auction business under which the auction is
1664 conducted is responsible for all other aspects of the auction as

1665| required by department beard rule. The auction business may

16606 delegate in whole, or in part, different aspects of the auction
1667 only to the extent that such delegation is permitted by law and
1668 that such delegation will not impede the principal auctioneer's
1669 ability to ensure the proper conduct of his or her independent
1670 responsibility for the auction. The auction business under whose
1671 auspices the auction is conducted is responsible for ensuring
1672 compliance as required by department beard rule.

1673 (10)

1674 (b) Each auction business shall maintain, for not less

1675 than 2 years, a separate ledger showing the funds held for

Page 67 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1676| another person deposited and disbursed by the auction business
1677 for each auction. The escrow or trust account must be reconciled
1678| monthly with the bank statement. A signed and dated record shall
1679| Dbe maintained for a 2-year period and be available for

1680| inspection by the department er—at—therecgquest—of—+the board.

1681 Section 43. Paragraph (j) of subsection (1), subsection
1682 (2) , and paragraph (a) of subsection (3) of section 468.389,
1683 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1684 468.389 Prohibited acts; penalties.—

1685 (1) The following acts shall be grounds for the

1686| disciplinary activities provided in subsections (2) and (3):
1687 (J) Violating a statute or administrative rule regulating

1688| practice under this part or a lawful disciplinary order of the

1689| bearder—+the department.

1690 (2) When the department beard finds any person guilty of

1691 any of the prohibited acts set forth in subsection (1), it may
1692| enter an order imposing one or more of the following penalties:
1693 (a) Refusal to certify to the department an application
1694 for licensure.

1695 (b) Revocation or suspension of a license.

1696 (c) Imposition of an administrative fine not to exceed
1697 $1,000 for each count or separate offense.

1698 (d) Issuance of a reprimand.

1699 (e) Placement of the auctioneer on probation for a period

1700 of time and subject to conditions as the department keard may

Page 68 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1701 specify, including requiring the auctioneer to successfully
1702 complete the licensure examination.

1703 (f) Requirement that the person in violation make

1704 restitution to each consumer affected by that violation. Proof
1705| of such restitution shall be a signed and notarized release
1706| executed by the consumer or the consumer's estate.

1707 (3) (a) Failure to pay a fine within a reasonable time, as

1708| prescribed by department beard rule, may be grounds for

1709| disciplinary action.

1710 Section 44. Section 468.392, Florida Statutes, is amended
1711| to read:

1712 468.392 Auctioneer Recovery Fund.—There is created the
1713 Auctioneer Recovery Fund as a separate account in the

1714 Professional Regulation Trust Fund. The fund shall be

1715| administered by the department FleridaReard—efAuectioneers.

1716 (1) The Chief Financial Officer shall invest the money not
1717 currently needed to meet the obligations of the fund in the same
1718| manner as other public funds may be invested. Interest that

1719 accrues from these investments shall be deposited to the credit
1720 of the Auctioneer Recovery Fund and shall be available for the
1721 same purposes as other moneys deposited in the Auctioneer

1722 Recovery Fund.

1723 (2) All payments and disbursements from the Auctioneer
1724 Recovery Fund shall be made by the Chief Financial Officer upon

1725 a voucher signed by the Secretary of Business and Professional

Page 69 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1726| Regulation or the secretary's designee.
1727 (3) If at any time the moneys in the Auctioneer Recovery
1728 Fund are insufficient to satisfy any valid claim or portion

1729| thereof, the department beard shall satisfy such unpaid claim or

1730| portion thereof as soon as a sufficient amount has been

1731| deposited in or transferred to the fund. When there is more than
1732 one unsatisfied claim outstanding, such claims shall be paid in
1733| the order in which the claims were made.

1734 (4) Upon the payment of any amount from the Auctioneer
1735| Recovery Fund in settlement of a claim in satisfaction of a

1736| Jjudgment against an auctioneer or auction business as described
1737 in s. 468.395, the license of such auctioneer or auction

1738| business shall be automatically suspended until the licensee has
1739 complied with s. 468.398. A discharge of bankruptcy does shald
1740| not relieve a person from the penalties and disabilities

1741| provided in this section.

1742 (5) Moneys in the fund at the end of a fiscal year shall
1743| be retained in the fund and shall accrue for the benefit of

1744 auctioneers and auction businesses. When the fund exceeds the
1745 amount as set forth in s. 468.393(2), all surcharges shall be
1746| suspended until such time as the fund is reduced below the

1747 amount as set forth in s. 468.393(3).

1748 Section 45. Subsections (1), (3), and (4) of section

1749 468.393, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1750 468.393 Surcharge to license fee; assessments.—

Page 70 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1751 (1) At the time of licensure under s. 468.385, s.
1752 468.3851, or s. 468.3852, each licensee shall pay, in addition
1753| to an application and license fee, a surcharge in an amount to

1754| Dbe determined by the department keard, not to exceed $300, which

1755 shall be deposited in the Auctioneer Recovery Fund.

1756 (3) After October 1, 1995, if the total amount in the

1757| Auctioneer Recovery Fund, including principal and interest, is
1758 less than $200,000 at the end of the fiscal year after the

1759 payment of all claims and expenses, the department beard shall
1760 assess, 1in addition to any other fees under s. 468.3852, a

1761 surcharge against a licensee at the time of initial licensure or
1762 at the time of license renewal, according to the following

1763 formula in order to maintain the fund at $500,000:

1764 (a) Determine the amount remaining in the fund at the end
1765 of the state fiscal year after all expenses and claims have been
1766| paid.

1767 (b) Subtract the amount determined under paragraph (a)
1768 from $500,000.

1769 (c) Determine the number of initial licenses and license
1770 renewals in the fiscal year that precedes the current fiscal
1771 year.

1772 (d) Divide the amount determined under paragraph (b) by
1773 the number determined under paragraph (c).

1774 (4) The department beard shall assess the surcharge

1775 described in subsection (3) against each licensee who receives

Page 71 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1776| an initial license or receives a renewal license during the
1777 fiscal year that follows the year in which the amount remaining
1778 in the fund was less than $200,000.

1779 Section 46. Subsections (1) and (4) of section 468.395,
1780 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1781 468.395 Conditions of recovery; eligibility.—

1782 (1) Recovery from the Auctioneer Recovery Fund may be
1783| obtained as follows:

1784 (a) Any aggrieved person is eligible to receive recovery
1785 from the Auctioneer Recovery Fund if the department Flerida
1786| BeardefAuvetioneers has issued a final order directing an

1787 offending licensee to pay restitution to the claimant as the
1788 result of the licensee violating, within this state, any

1789| provision of s. 468.389 or any rule adopted by the department
1790| beard and if the department beard determined that the order of

1791 restitution cannot be enforced; or

1792 (b) Any aggrieved person who obtains a final judgment in
1793 any court against any licensee to recover damages for any actual
1794 loss that results from the violation, within this state, by a
1795 licensee of any provision of s. 468.389 or any rule adopted by
1796 the department bkea¥rd may, upon termination of all proceedings,

1797 including appeals and proceedings supplemental to judgment for
1798 collection purposes, file a verified application to the
1799| department keard for an order directing payment out of the

1800| Auctioneer Recovery Fund of the amount of actual loss in the

Page 72 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1801| transaction that remains unpaid upon the judgment. The amount of

1802 actual loss may include court costs, but may shatdt not include

1803 attorney atterney'ls fees or punitive damages awarded.

1804 (4) The department may beard—shaltld not issue an order for

1805| payment of a claim from the Auctioneer Recovery Fund unless the

1806 claimant has reasonably established to the department beaxrd that

1807 she or he has taken proper and reasonable action to collect the
1808 amount of her or his claim from the licensee responsible for the
1809 loss and that any recovery made has been applied to reduce the
1810 amount of the claim on the Auctioneer Recovery Fund.

1811 Section 47. Subsections (2) and (3) of section 468.396,
1812 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

1813 468.396 Claims against a single licensee in excess of

1814 dollar limitation; Jjoinder of claims, payment; insufficient

1815 funds.—

1816 (2) Upon petition of the department bea¥rd, the court may

1817 require all claimants and prospective claimants against one
1818 licensee to be joined in one action, to the end that the

1819| respective rights of all the claimants to the department beaxrd

1820| may be equitably adjudicated and settled.

1821 (3) On June 30 and December 31 of each year, the

1822| department beard shall identify each claim that the court orders
1823 to be paid during the 6-month period that ended on that day. The
1824 department keard shall pay the part of each claim that is so
1825 identified within 15 days after the end of the 6-month period in

Page 73 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1826 which the claim is ordered paid. However, if the balance in the
1827 fund is insufficient to pay the full payable amount of each

1828 claim that is ordered to be paid during a 6-month period, the
1829| department beard shall pay a prorated portion of each claim that
1830 is ordered to be paid during the period. Any part of the payable
1831 amount of a claim left unpaid due to the prorating of payments
1832| under this subsection shall be paid, subject to the $50,000

1833 limit described in s. 468.395, before the payment of claims

1834 ordered to be paid during the following 6 months.

1835 Section 48. Section 468.397, Florida Statutes, is amended
1836| to read:

1837 468.397 Payment of claim.—Upon a final order of the court
1838 directing that payment be made out of the Auctioneer Recovery
1839 Fund, the department bea¥rd shall, subject to the provisions of
1840 this part, make the payment out of the Auctioneer Recovery Fund
1841 as provided in s. 468.395.

1842 Section 49. Section 468.398, Florida Statutes, is amended
1843 to read:

1844 468.398 Suspension of judgment debtor's license; repayment
1845| Dby licensee; interest.—If the department beard is required to
1846| make any payment from the Auctioneer Recovery Fund in settlement
1847 of a claim or toward the satisfaction of a judgment under this
1848| part, the department beard shall suspend the judgment debtor's
1849 license. The licensee is not eligible to be licensed again as

1850 either an auctioneer or auction business until the licensee has

Page 74 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1851 repaid in full the amount paid from the Auctioneer Recovery
1852 Fund, with interest at the current applicable rate.

1853 Section 50. Subsection (1) of section 468.404, Florida
1854 Statutes, is amended to read:

1855 468.404 License; fees; renewals.—

1856 (1) The department shall establish bienniat fees for

1857 initial licensing, renewal of license every 4 years, and

1858 reinstatement of license, none of which fees shall exceed $400.
1859| The department may establish a delinquency fee of no more than
1860 $50. The fees shall be adequate to proportionately fund the

1861 expenses of the department which are allocated to the regulation
1862 of talent agencies and shall be based on the department's

1863 estimate of the revenue required to administer this part.

1864 Section 51. Subsection (1) of section 468.407, Florida
1865 Statutes, is amended to read:

1866 468.407 License; content; posting.—

1867 (1) The talent agency license shall be valid for the

1868| biemniat period in which issued and shall be in such form as may
1869| be determined by the department, but shall at least specify the
1870 name under which the applicant is to operate, the address of the
1871| place of business, the expiration date of the license, the full
1872 names and titles of the owner and the operator, and the number
1873 of the license.

1874 Section 52. Subsection (5) of section 468.431, Florida

1875 Statutes, is amended to read:

Page 75 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
1876 468.431 Definitions.—As used in this part:
1877 59 "Covreit " means—the Regulatery Couneit——of Community
1878| Asseciation Maragers—
1879 Section 53. Paragraph (d) of subsection (2) and subsection

1880 (3) of section 468.433, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
1881 468.433 Licensure by examination.—

1882 (2) The department shall examine each applicant who is at
1883 least 18 years of age, who has successfully completed all

1884 prelicensure education requirements, and who the department
1885 certifies is of good moral character.

1886 (d) The department eeumeit shall establish by rule the

1887 required amount of prelicensure education, which shall consist
1888 of not more than 24 hours of in-person instruction by a

1889| department-approved provider and which shall cover all areas of
1890 the examination specified in subsection (3). Such instruction

1891 shall be completed within 12 months before prier—te the date of
1892 the examination. Preliecensure—education providers—shall—be

1893 coanaar Ay A A d e A EEWN N Atz a A LA Ao Ao £
CUTT o TTOT 1T \.z\Jlll_.LllL«l_Lll\j OO T O T ITUIT tJ.L\JV_L\J.C.LQ [ S tJLAJ_tJUQCQ o

1894 atr Tl 2 aha ey e aczg Ay e At ] £+ o N 11aoana ah o1 EEWANE N =N
CQL_QLLJ_L_LQLJ._LLL\j tJ.L\JV_L\J.C.L utJtJ.LUVDL_L T T TO « ERY LTI O TITTIOoTT [ ' & g mpgm =y ITTOT T

1895 roay1aa A ool <z rra 1 4+ PV S IR T I Airoat 3 A a0 A A o £
J_C\-iLA_L.LC\J. Ry \.z\JllltJ_L_y W ITCTT T \.z\JllL__LllL«l_Lll\j oA O T O TIUIT J.C\.iu_L_LClllClll—O o

46Q A7 3 + + 1 £ + 14 ]
1896 s+—4-68-433 7 prieor—+teo—thefirstItiecense—renewats The department

1897 shall, by rule, set standards for exceptions to the requirement
1898 of in-person instruction in cases of hardship or disability.

1899 (3) The department eeuwrmeit shall approve an examination

1900 for licensure. The examination must demonstrate that the

Page 76 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1901 applicant has a fundamental knowledge of state and federal laws
1902 relating to the operation of all types of community associations
1903| and state laws relating to corporations and nonprofit

1904 corporations, proper preparation of community association

1905| Dbudgets, proper procedures for noticing and conducting community
1906| association meetings, insurance matters relating to community
1907 associations, and management skills.

1908 Section 54. Subsection (1) of section 468.4336, Florida
1909 Statutes, is amended to read:

1910 468.4336 Renewal of license.—

1911 (1) The department shall renew a license upon receipt of

= o
AT

(8]
H

1912 the renewal application and fee and—uporn—preoof—eof—comp

()}

Q
©

1N

22
>

-

1913| with—+the—eceontinving education reguirements—of—s-—4
1914 Section 55. Section 468.435, Florida Statutes, is amended
1915 to read:

1916 468.435 Fees; establishment; disposition.—

1917 (1) The department eeumeit shall establish fees for the

1918| described purposes and within the ranges specified in this

1919 section:

1920 (a) Application fee: not less than $25, or more than $50.
1921 (b) Examination fee: not less than $25, or more than $100.
1922 (c) Initial license fee: not less than $25, or more than
1923 $100.

1924 (d) Renewal of license fee: not less than $25, or more

1925| than $100.

Page 77 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1926 (e) Delinquent license fee: not less than $25, or more

1927 than $50.

1928 (£) Inactive license fee: not less than $10, or more than
1929 $25.
1930 (2) Until the department eeuneit establishes fees under

1931| subsection (1), the lower amount in each range shall apply.
1932 (3) Fees collected under this section shall be deposited
1933 to the credit of the Professional Regulation Trust Fund.

1934 (4) The department eeurmeit shall establish fees that are

1935 adequate to fund the cost to implement the provisions of this
1936| part. Fees shall be based on the department estimates of the
1937 revenue required to implement this part and the provisions of
1938 law with respect to the regulation of community association

1939| managers.

1940 Section 56. Paragraph (b) of subsection (2) and subsection
1941 (3) of section 468.436, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
1942 468.436 Disciplinary proceedings.—

1943 (2) The following acts constitute grounds for which the

1944| disciplinary actions in subsection (4) may be taken:

1945 (b)1. Violation of this part.

1946 2. Violation of any lawful order or rule rendered or
1947 adopted by the department er—the—ecounecit.

1948 3. Being convicted of or pleading nolo contendere to a

1949| felony in any court in the United States.

1950 4. Obtaining a license or certification or any other

Page 78 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1951 order, ruling, or authorization by means of fraud,

1952 misrepresentation, or concealment of material facts.

1953 5. Committing acts of gross misconduct or gross negligence
1954 in connection with the profession.

1955 6. Contracting, on behalf of an association, with any

1956| entity in which the licensee has a financial interest that is
1957| not disclosed.

1958 7. Failing to disclose any conflict of interest as

1959 required by s. 468.4335.

1960 8. Violating chapter 718, chapter 719, or chapter 720

1961 during the course of performing community association management
1962 services pursuant to a contract with a community association as
1963 defined in s. 468.431(1).

1964 (3) The department eewrmeit shall specify by rule the acts

1965 or omissions that constitute a violation of subsection (2).
1966 Section 57. Subsection (2) of section 468.520, Florida

1967 Statutes, is amended to read:

1968 468.520 Definitions.—As used in this part:
1969 2 —"Board"—means—the Boardeof FmplovyeeTteasing Companies
1970 Section 58. Section 468.522, Florida Statutes, is amended

1971| to read:

1972 468.522 Rules of the department beaxrd.—The department may
1973| beoordhas—authority—+te adopt rules pursuvant—+te—ss+—320-536+H)
1974 ape—320-54 to implement £hepreovisiens—eEf this part. Every

1975 licensee shall be governed and controlled by this part and the

Page 79 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

1976 rules adopted by the department beard.

1977 Section 59. Subsection (2) and paragraph (b) of subsection
1978 (4) of section 468.524, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
1979 468.524 Application for license.—

1980 (2) The department beard may require information and

1981 certifications necessary to determine that the applicant is of
1982| good moral character and meets other licensure requirements of
1983 this part.

1984 (4) An applicant or licensee is ineligible to reapply for
1985 a license for a period of 1 year following final agency action
1986 on the denial or revocation of a license applied for or issued
1987 under this part. This time restriction does not apply to

1988 administrative denials or revocations entered because:

1989 (b) The experience documented to the department beard was

1990 insufficient at the time of the previous application;

1991 Section 60. Section 468.5245, Florida Statutes, is amended
1992 to read:

1993 468.5245 Change of ownership.—

1994 (1) A license or registration issued to any entity under
1995| this part may not be transferred or assigned. The department
1996| beard shall adopt rules to provide for a licensee's or

1997 registrant's change of name or location.

1998 (2) A person or entity that seeks to purchase or acquire
1999 control of an employee leasing company or group licensed or

2000 registered under this part must first apply to the department

Page 80 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2001| beard for a certificate of approval for the proposed change of
2002 ownership. However, prior approval is not required if, at the
2003| time the purchase or acquisition occurs, a controlling person of
2004 the employee leasing company or group maintains a controlling
2005| person license under this part. Notification must be provided to

2006| the department beaxrd within 30 days after the purchase or

2007 acquisition of such company in the manner prescribed by the
2008 department beard.
2009 (3) Any application that is submitted to the department

2010| ®beard under this section shall be deemed approved if the

2011 department beard has not approved the application or rejected
2012 the application, and provided the applicant with the basis for a
2013 rejection, within 90 days after the receipt of the completed
2014 application.

2015 (4) The department beard shall establish filing fees for a

2016 change-of-ownership application in accordance with s.

2017 468.524 (1) .

2018 Section 61. Subsection (2) and paragraphs (c) through (f)
2019 of subsection (3) of section 468.525, Florida Statutes, are

2020| amended to read:

2021 468.525 License requirements.—

2022 (2) (a) As used in this part, "good moral character" means
2023 a personal history of honesty, trustworthiness, fairness, a good
2024 reputation for fair dealings, and respect for the rights of

2025| others and for the laws of this state and nation. A thorough

Page 81 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2026| background investigation of the individual's good moral

2027 character shall be instituted by the department. Such

2028| investigation shall require:

2029 1. The submission of fingerprints, for processing through
2030 appropriate law enforcement agencies, by the applicant and the

2031| examination of police records by the department beard.

2032 2. Such other investigation of the individual as the
2033 department bea¥rd may deem necessary.
2034 (b) The department bea¥rd may deny an application for

2035 licensure or renewal citing lack of good moral character.
2036 Conviction of a crime within the last 7 years may shatd: not
2037 automatically bar any applicant or licensee from obtaining a

2038 license or continuing as a licensee. The department bkeard shall

2039 consider the type of crime committed, the crime's relevancy to
2040 the employee leasing industry, the length of time since the
2041 conviction, and any other factors deemed relevant by the

2042 department beard.

2043 (3) Each employee leasing company licensed by the

2044 department shall have a registered agent for service of process
2045 in this state and at least one licensed controlling person. In
2046| addition, each licensed employee leasing company shall comply
2047| with the following requirements:

2048 (c) An applicant for initial or renewal license of an
2049| employee leasing company license or employee leasing company

2050 group shall have an accounting net worth or shall have

Page 82 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2051 guaranties, letters of credit, or other security acceptable to

2052| the department beard in sufficient amounts to offset any

2053| deficiency. A guaranty will not be acceptable to satisfy this
2054 requirement unless the applicant submits sufficient evidence to

2055 satisfy the department beard that the guarantor has adequate

2056| resources to satisfy the obligation of the guaranty.

2057 (d) Each employee leasing company shall maintain an

2058 accounting net worth and positive working capital, as determined
2059 in accordance with generally accepted accounting principles, or
2060 shall have guaranties, letters of credit, or other security

2061 acceptable to the department beaxrd in sufficient amounts to

2062 offset any deficiency. A guaranty will not be acceptable to

2063 satisfy this requirement unless the licensee submits sufficient
2064 evidence, as defined by rule, that the guarantor has adequate
2065| resources to satisfy the obligation of the guaranty. In

2066| determining the amount of working capital, a licensee shall

2067 include adequate reserves for all taxes and insurance, including
2068| plans of self-insurance or partial self-insurance for claims
2069| incurred but not paid and for claims incurred but not reported.
2070 Compliance with £he—reguirements—of this paragraph is subject to
2071| wverification by department er—beard audit.

2072 (e) Each employee leasing company or employee leasing

2073| company group shall submit annual financial statements audited
2074| by an independent certified public accountant, with the

2075 application and within 120 days after the end of each fiscal

Page 83 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2076 year, 1in a manner and time prescribed by the department beard,

2077| provided, however, that any employee leasing company or employee
2078| leasing company group with gross Florida payroll of less than
2079 $2.5 million during any fiscal year may submit financial

2080 statements reviewed by an independent certified public

2081 accountant for that year.

2082 (f) The licensee shall notify the department er—keard in
2083| writing within 30 days after any change in the application or
2084 status of the license.

2085 Section 62. Subsections (3) and (5) of section 468.526,
2086 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2087 468.526 License required; fees.—

2088 (3) Each employee leasing company and employee leasing
2089 company group licensee shall pay to the department upon the

2090 initial issuance of a license and upon each renewal thereafter a
2091 license fee not to exceed $2,500 to be established by the

2092 department beard. In addition to the license fee, the department

2093| bPbeard shall establish an annual assessment for each employee
2094 leasing company and each employee leasing company group

2095 sufficient to cover all costs for reqgulation of the profession
2096| pursuant to this chapter, chapter 455, and any other applicable
2097| provisions of law. The annual assessment shall:

2098 (a) Be due and payable upon initial licensure and

2099 subsequent renewals thereof and 1 year before the expiration of

2100 any licensure period; and

Page 84 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2101 (b) Be based on a fixed percentage, variable classes, or a

2102 combination of both, as determined by the department beaxrd, of

2103 gross Florida payroll for employees leased to clients by the
2104 applicant or licensee during the period beginning five quarters
2105| before and ending one quarter before each assessment. It is the
2106| intent of the Legislature that the greater weight of total fees
2107 for licensure and assessments should be on larger companies and
2108 groups.

2109 (5) Each controlling person licensee shall pay to the
2110| department upon the initial issuance of a license and upon each
2111 renewal thereafter a license fee to be established by the

2112| department beard in an amount not to exceed $2,000.

2113 Section 63. Subsection (1) of section 468.527, Florida
2114 Statutes, is amended to read:

2115 468.527 Licensure and license renewal.—

2116 (1) The department shall license any applicant who the
2117 department beard certifies is qualified to practice employee
2118 leasing as an employee leasing company, employee leasing company
2119| group, or controlling person.

2120 Section 64. Subsection (2) of section 468.5275, Florida
2121 Statutes, is amended to read:

2122 468.5275 Registration and exemption of de minimis

2123| operations.—

2124 (2) A registration is valid for 1 year. Each registrant

2125 shall pay to the department upon initial registration, and upon

Page 85 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2126| each renewal thereafter, a registration fee to be established by

2127 the department beard in an amount not to exceed:

2128 (a) Two hundred and fifty dollars for an employee leasing
2129 company.

2130 (b) Five hundred dollars for an employee leasing company
2131 group.

2132 Section 65. Subsections (2), (4), and (5) of section

2133 468.529, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2134 468.529 Licensee's insurance; employment tax; benefit

2135| plans.—

2136 (2) An initial or renewal license may not be issued to any
2137 employee leasing company unless the employee leasing company

2138 first files with the department beard evidence of workers'

2139 compensation coverage for all leased employees in this state.
2140| Each employee leasing company shall maintain and make available
2141 to its workers' compensation carrier the following information:
2142 (a) The correct name and federal identification number of
2143 each client company.

2144 (b) A listing of all covered employees provided to each
2145 client company, by classification code.

2146 (c) The total eligible wages by classification code and
2147 the premiums due to the carrier for the employees provided to
2148 each client company.

2149 (4) An initial or renewal license may not be issued to any

2150 employee leasing company unless the employee leasing company

Page 86 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2151 first provides evidence to the department beard, as required by

2152 department beard rule, that the employee leasing company has
2153| paid all of the employee leasing company's obligations for

2154| payroll, payroll-related taxes, workers' compensation insurance,
2155| and employee benefits. All disputed amounts must be disclosed in
2156| the application.

2157 (5) The provisions of this section are subject to

2158 verification by department er—beard audit.

2159 Section 66. Subsections (3) and (4) of section 468.530,
2160 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2161 468.530 License, contents; posting.—

2162 (3) A Ne license is not shadtd—Pbe valid for any person or
2163| entity who engages in the business under any name other than
2164 that specified in the license. A license issued under this part
2165| 1s shat* not be assignable, and a mre licensee may not conduct a
2166| business under a fictitious name without prior written

2167 authorization of the department beard to do so. The department

2168| beard may not authorize the use of a name which is so similar to
2169 that of a public officer or agency, or of that used by another
2170 licensee, that the public may be confused or misled thereby. A
2171| Ne licensee may not shaltt be permitted to conduct business under
2172| more than one name unless it has obtained a separate license. A
2173 licensee desiring to change its licensed name at any time except

2174 upon license renewal shall notify the department beard and pay a

2175 fee not to exceed $50 for each authorized change of name.

Page 87 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2176 (4) FEach employee leasing company or employee leasing

2177 company group licensed under this part shall be properly

2178 identified in all advertisements, which must include the license
2179| number, licensed business name, and other appropriate

2180 information in accordance with rules established by the

2181 department beard.

2182 Section 67. Paragraph (e) of subsection (1) of section

2183 468.531, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

2184 468.531 Prohibitions; penalties.—
2185 (1) No person or entity shall:
2186 (e) Knowingly give false or forged evidence to the

2187 department beard or a member thereof; or

2188 Section 68. Section 468.532, Florida Statutes, is amended
2189| to read:

2190 468.532 Discipline.—

2191 (1) The following constitute grounds for which

2192 disciplinary action against a licensee may be taken by the

2193 department beard:

2194 (a) Being convicted or found guilty of, or entering a plea
2195 of nolo contendere to, regardless of adjudication, bribery,

2196 fraud, or willful misrepresentation in obtaining, attempting to
2197 obtain, or renewing a license.

2198 (b) Being convicted or found guilty of, or entering a plea
2199 of nolo contendere to, regardless of adjudication, a crime in

2200 any jurisdiction which relates to the operation of an employee

Page 88 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P R E S ENTAT I

2201
2202
2203
2204
2205
2206
2207
2208
2209
2210
2211
2212
2213
2214
2215
2216
2217
2218
2219
2220
2221
2222
2223
2224
2225

V E S

HB 607 2026

leasing business or the ability to engage in business as an
employee leasing company.

(c) Being convicted or found guilty of, or entering a plea
of nolo contendere to, regardless of adjudication, fraud,
deceit, or misconduct in the classification of employees
pursuant to chapter 440.

(d) Being convicted or found guilty of, or entering a plea
of nolo contendere to, regardless of adjudication, fraud,
deceit, or misconduct in the establishment or maintenance of
self-insurance, be it health insurance or workers' compensation
insurance.

(e) Being convicted or found guilty of, or entering a plea
of nolo contendere to, regardless of adjudication, fraud,

deceit, or misconduct in the operation of an employee leasing

company.
(f) Conducting business without an active license.
(g) Failing to maintain workers' compensation insurance as

required in s. 468.529.

(h) Transferring or attempting to transfer a license
issued pursuant to this part.

(1) Violating any provision of this part or any lawful
order or rule issued under the provisions of this part or
chapter 455.

(j) Failing to notify the department beard, in writing, of

any change of the primary business address or the addresses of

Page 89 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2226| any of the licensee's offices in the state.

2227 (k) Having been confined in any county jail,

2228| postadjudication, or being confined in any state or federal

2229 prison or mental institution, or when through mental disease or
2230| deterioration, the licensee can no longer safely be entrusted to
2231| deal with the public or in a confidential capacity.

2232 (1) Having been found guilty for a second time of any

2233| misconduct that warrants suspension or being found guilty of a
2234 course of conduct or practices which shows that the licensee is
2235 so incompetent, negligent, dishonest, or untruthful that the
2236| money, property, transactions, and rights of investors, or those
2237 with whom the licensee may sustain a confidential relationship,
2238| may not safely be entrusted to the licensee.

2239 (m) Failing to inform the department beard in writing

2240 within 30 days after being convicted or found guilty of, or

2241 entering a plea of nolo contendere to, any felony, regardless of
2242 adjudication.

2243 (n) Failing to conform to any lawful order of the

2244 department beard.

2245 (0) Being determined liable for civil fraud by a court in
2246| any jurisdiction.

2247 (p) Having adverse material final action taken by any

2248 state or federal regulatory agency for violations within the
2249 scope of control of the licensee.

2250 (q) Failing to inform the department beaxrd in writing

Page 90 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2251| within 30 days after any adverse material final action by a

2252 state or federal regulatory agency.

2253 (r) Failing to meet or maintain the requirements for

2254 licensure as an employee leasing company or controlling person.
2255 (s) Engaging as a controlling person any person who is not
2256 licensed as a controlling person by the department beard.

2257 (t) Attempting to obtain, obtaining, or renewing a license
2258 to practice employee leasing by bribery, misrepresentation, or
2259 fraud.

2260 (2) When the department beard finds any violation of

2261 subsection (1), it may do one or more of the following:

2262 (a) Deny an application for licensure.

2263 (b) Permanently revoke, suspend, restrict, or not renew a
2264 license.

2265 (c) Impose an administrative fine not to exceed $5,000 for
2266| every count or separate offense.

2267 (d) Issue a reprimand.

2268 (e) Place the licensee on probation for a period of time

2269| and subject to such conditions as the department beard may

2270 specify.

2271 (f) Assess costs associated with investigation and

22772| prosecution.

2273 (3) Upon revocation or suspension of a license, the

2274 licensee must immediately return to the department the license

2275 that was revoked or suspended.

Page 91 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2276 (4) The department beard shall specify the penalties for

2277 any violation of this part.
2278 Section 69. Subsection (1) of section 468.603, Florida

2279 Statutes, is amended to read:

2280 468.603 Definitions.—As used in this part:

2281 o o

2282 opd—InaspeceteorsBoards

2283 Section 70. Section 468.606, Florida Statutes, is amended

2284 to read:

2285 468.606 Authority of the department beard.—The department
2286| may beard—is—auvtherized—to:
2287 (1) Adopt rules purswant—teo—ss+—3120-536(H)—and—326-54 to

2288 implement £he—provisiens—ef this part.

2289 (2) Certify individuals as being qualified under £he

2290| provisiens—ef this part to be building code administrators,
2291| plans examiners, and building code inspectors.

2292 Section 71. Section 468.607, Florida Statutes, is amended
2293 to read:

2294 468.607 Certification of building code administration and
2295 inspection personnel.—The department beard shall issue a

2296 certificate to any individual whom the department beared

2297| determines to be qualified, within such class and level as
2298| provided in this part and with such limitations as the
2299| department beard may place upon it. A Ne person may not be

2300 employed by a state agency or local governmental authority to

Page 92 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2301| perform the duties of a building code administrator, plans
2302| examiner, or building code inspector after October 1, 1993,

2303| without possessing the proper valid certificate issued in

2304| accordance with &he—provisieons—of this part. A Any person who
2305 acts as an inspector and plans examiner under s. 1013.37 while
2306| conducting activities authorized by certification under that
2307 section is certified to continue to conduct inspections for a
2308 local enforcement agency until the person's UBCI certification
2309 expires, after which time such person must possess the proper
2310 valid certificate issued in accordance with this part.

2311 Section 72. Section 468.613, Florida Statutes, is amended
2312| to read:

2313 468.613 Certification by endorsement.—The department beard

2314 shall examine other certification or training programs, as

2315| applicable, upon submission to the department beard for its

2316 consideration of an application for certification by

2317 endorsement. The department beard shall waive its examination,

2318 qualification, education, or training requirements, to the

2319 extent that such examination, qualification, education, or

2320 training requirements of the applicant are determined by the
2321 department beard to be comparable with those established by the
2322| department beard. The department beard shall waive its

2323 examination, qualification, education, or training requirements
2324 if an applicant for certification by endorsement is at least 18

2325 years of age; is of good moral character; has held a valid

Page 93 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2326 building administrator, inspector, plans examiner, or the

2327| equivalent, certification issued by another state or territory
2328 of the United States for at least 10 years before the date of
2329| application; and has successfully passed an applicable

2330| examination administered by the International Code Council. Such
2331 application must be made either when the license in another
2332 state or territory is active or within 2 years after such

2333 license was last active.

2334 Section 73. Subsections (5) and (7) of section 468.619,
2335 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2336 468.619 Building code enforcement officials' bill of

2337 rights.—

2338 (5) The enforcement official shall be considered an agent
2339 of the governmental entity employing him or her and as such

2340 shall be defended by that entity in any action brought by the

2341 department er—theboard, provided the enforcement official is
2342| working within the scope of his or her employment.
2343 (7) If any action taken against the enforcement official

2344| by the department er—the—board is found to be without merit by a

2345| court of competent jurisdiction, or if judgment in such an

2346 action is awarded to the enforcement official, the department e
2347| +he—Pboard, or the assignee of the department er—beard, shall
2348 reimburse the enforcement official or his or her employer, as
2349| appropriate, for reasonable legal costs and reasonable attorney

2350| attermrey's fees incurred. The amount awarded may shalt not

Page 94 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2351| exceed the limit provided in s. 120.595.

2352 Section 74. Paragraph (a) of subsection (1) and

2353 subsections (2), (3), and (4) of section 468.621, Florida

2354 Statutes, are amended to read:

2355 468.621 Disciplinary proceedings.—

2356 (1) The following acts constitute grounds for which the
2357| disciplinary actions in subsection (2) may be taken:

2358 (a) Violating or failing to comply with any provision of
2359 this part, or a valid rule or lawful order of the beard—er
2360 department pursuant thereto.

2361 (2) When the department beard finds any person guilty of

2362 any of the grounds set forth in subsection (1), it may enter an

2363| order imposing one or more of the following penalties:

2364 (a) Denial of an application for certification.

2365 (b) Permanent revocation.

2366 (c) Suspension of a certificate.

2367 (d) Imposition of an administrative fine not to exceed

2368 $5,000 for each separate offense. Such fine must be rationally
2369 related to the gravity of the violation.

2370 (e) 1Issuance of a reprimand.

2371 (f) Placement of the certificateholder on probation for a

2372| period of time and subject to such conditions as the department

2373| Pbeard may impose, including alteration of performance level.

2374 (g) Satisfactory completion of continuing education.
2375 (h) Issuance of a citation.
Page 95 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA

2376
2377
2378
2379
2380
2381
2382
2383
2384
2385
2386
2387
2388
2389
2390
2391
2392
2393
2394
2395
2396
2397
2398
2399
2400

H O U S E O F R E P R E S ENTAT I

HB 607 2026

(3) Where a certificate is suspended, placed on probation,

or has conditions imposed, the department beard shall reinstate

the certificate of a disciplined building code administrator,
plans examiner, or building code inspector upon proof the
disciplined individual has complied with all terms and
conditions set forth in the final order.

(4) A Ne person may not be—addewed—te apply for

certification under this part for a minimum of 5 years after the
date of revocation of any certificate issued pursuant to this
part. The department keard may by rule establish additional
criteria for certification following revocation.

Section 75. Subsections (1) and (5) of section 468.627,
Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
468.627

(1) The department beard shall establish by rule fees to

Application; examination; renewal; fees.—

be paid for application, examination, reexamination,

certification and certification renewal, inactive status

application, and reactivation of inactive certificates. The
department beard may establish by rule a late renewal penalty.

The department beard shall establish fees which are adequate,

when combined with revenue generated by the provisions of s.

468.631, to ensure the continued operation of this part. Fees

shall be based on department estimates of the revenue required
to implement this part.
+

=
-

o
J g e oy &

(5 Th
T L

ooy
TIIrc—CTCTT

Page 96 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb607-00

V E S



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 607

o)l Y |
oo O .
-0 “ o)
i b $H ¢ a
io] g (V] D ¢ D ® = ~ (1] ]
- D Wi 0 D W ko) [y

D D - [N ) on O !

h P HOREEE! - P D + #H 0 2] 0
® oo n D ® ®  -H 0 o o o
£ - + Hoo? O 0 w0 — @]
& -H O n P D D 7] D < cT) s
Y o)l - - o) 4P - ) O
P jon o' @ © D -H 4 L] HO) ~ O
5 b Y D 1D 4 (T o oo ™ Q,
— Mo} H D ¢ ¢ ©© O O (VI () ™ 0
D H B @ D @ B —~ D O o a

) — b ¥ © @ -4 & T i QA . H

® )] ow oo ] [09) D ~ U4 [oe]

4 jon @ ~ D & -f .. O W o o)
¢ A - o &£ i H P g ° < O < =
D R N LT SN = 0O o +H ©

-H4p ~ ~ 0 9 -f o H 0 o =

WP D 4P . D #H B PN O ® o )

-H b o ] H 0] 0p] oo 0 EB) i ~

b ® 5T Q D - O O S +H O
4 D ) « W W HORC 4 n | O O - 0 +

-H D ~ D D @ Q . O 0] Q ©

v YH L ~ O O H O 85 9 © G R r
kY -H £ ® O ¢ H PO n 0 o O O © +

B 4P s VI, O NI (I TR T A T 0O O W 0

o D H c E Moo B " g b = > -4 0 -
1 DRl -H (O] D ™ O o @ - > O W @
L ) & b ¢ © $ Q@ D m © O H A o~ -

# & S S R (OB H — o o P =
® D £ P O YW O >N ] o) (0] T £ 4 ~ ©O

&0 & 4P -HP g -~ u QO o 0 o e &
DG il P WY P i} £ © - o o g o

[09) D ¢ W — e o~ 4 g O ® O
~ 0] U . @ D D O [0} o, ~ 9] @] © o A Q O
® D P D ®© © YW @& ¢ M © c (= PN O

—H ey © (V] D 4 0 O .o ~ O 0 @)
() — D™ QO D @ @ b P A > 4 4 o @O0 O
H ® B Q@ ¢ 4 - ~ [ 3 i) © @] (OB n P o

< k3 D T P O d D 4 P 4 E Qo < Q9 q

T “ h b & D ¢ - @ ®© QO o & A B O A
KA oo [09) ® Y 4 D -H h A P H a 0 Q T 0 Q T
| NoBoH O d T A w g o 4 E L T

D [09) K H & [09) Ho-H ® [09) 0 0 ] Q [«
RO ® D 9] [0} b @ ® . [} “ oY @ O . Q 3
$H ™ 0 D b ¢ 9 ©W ™ ~ 0O ~ m m
b lat D D s ¢ -fd @ H D ~ A o O 94 Yoo~
D 4P B & P O b ¢ 7] > O O
4 © D D -H -H H B & 0O o O -H g n -

ORI ()] v ¢ -H4 H H T @ D 0 H o Z O ~ 0O O H ™M

¢ T U T 4o B0 Loon A ©

Qo P ® > £ © Q ¢ ¢ P + . o O P ~ .
n ) @ D D -H 4 [N TR ¢ ~ 0O ~ ~ 0 O 0 n ©

-Ho 4D [09) - D Y [09) [09) Q© - D @@ O W +H T <] . Q Q ©

— [09] N W D & D D 4 W ” N < — — P S5 n P <

o -H oo [09) H D 0] (OB (Lo} S (o} 3
(VEEOR b @ o O M D . © +
P E D @ h H B O P © 0, O (0]

[09] D iy -H D D B b O D (o] (O +H
) +# — (O TS T H v © ¢ < T P n

— N MO N O ™~ 0 O O +d4 N OO < 10 O ™~ 0O O O A N O < W0

(@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) (@) — — — — — — — — — — [QV] [Q\ [Q\ (QV] N N

ESTEEEE SIS S SRR LS R U SRR LS R LB S U LS U S S R (R U SRR S (S BN

N N N N N NN N N N NN N N N N N N N N NN N NN

Page 97 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2426 (1) This part shall be funded through a surcharge, to be
2427 assessed pursuant to s. 125.56(4) or s. 166.201 at the rate of
2428 1.5 percent of all permit fees associated with enforcement of
2429| the Florida Building Code as defined by the uniform account

2430 criteria and specifically the uniform account code for building
2431| permits adopted for local government financial reporting

2432| pursuant to s. 218.32. The minimum amount collected on any

2433| permit issued shall be $2. The unit of government responsible
2434 for collecting permit fees pursuant to s. 125.56 or s. 166.201
2435 shall collect such surcharge and shall remit the funds to the
2436| department on a quarterly calendar basis beginning not later
2437 than December 31, 2010, for the preceding quarter, and

2438 continuing each third month thereafter; and such unit of

2439| government shall retain 10 percent of the surcharge collected to
2440 fund the participation of building departments in the national
2441 and state building code adoption processes and to provide

2442 education related to enforcement of the Florida Building Code.
2443 There is created within the Professional Regulation Trust Fund a
2444 separate account to be known as the Building Code Administrators
2445 and Inspectors Fund, which shall deposit and disburse funds as
2446| necessary for the implementation of this part. The proceeds from
2447 this surcharge shall be allocated equally to fund the Florida
2448 Homeowners' Construction Recovery Fund established by s. 489.140

2449 | and—the—funetions—of +the Buitding CodeAdministraters—and
2450| Irspeeteors—Beard. The department may transfer excess cash to the

Page 98 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2451 Florida Homeowners' Construction Recovery Fund that it

2452| determines is not required to fund the implementation of this

24573 art beard frem—=t eard e oo R R IS S Do fraat apmo
p T EERw 1T OUTIT CTIT WA LG B R W § =] o T OUTUITTCT W I CTITTTT CTIT J S N oo T OUTITN T

2454 | Regutotien Frust—Fund. However, the department may not transfer

2455| excess cash that would exceed the amount appropriated in the

2456| General Appropriations Act, and any amount approved by the

2457| Legislative Budget Commission pursuant to s. 216.181, to be used
2458 for the payment of claims from the Florida Homeowners'

2459| Construction Recovery Fund.

2460 Section 78. Subsections (4) and (7) of section 468.8312,

2461 Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2462 468.8312 Fees.—

2463 (4) The bienniat renewal fee shall not exceed $200.

2464 +H—TFhe—fee—forapplicationsfrom providers—ofecontinuing
2465| education may notexceed—S$500

2466 Section 79. Section 468.8315, Florida Statutes, is amended
2467 to read:

2468 468.8315 Renewal of license.—

2469 (1) The department shall renew a license upon receipt of
2470 the renewal application anrd—upeon—ecertification by the department
2471 thaot—+the licenscehas satisfaocteorily completed—+the econtinuging
2472 | edoeatieon—reguirements—oefs+—468-8316.

2473 (2) The department shall adopt rules establishing a

2474 procedure for the bienmniat renewal of licenses every 4 years.
2475 Section 80. Subsection (5) of section 468.8412, Florida

Page 99 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



2476

F L ORI D A H O U S E O F R E P R E S ENTAT I
HB 607 2026
Statutes, is amended to read:

468.8412 Fees.—

2477
2478
2479
2480
2481
2482
2483
2484
2485
2486
2487
2488
2489
2490
2491
2492
2493
2494
2495
2496
2497
2498
2499
2500

(5) The fee for a biremniat license renewal shall not
exceed $400.

Section 81. Section 468.8415, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:
468.8415 Renewal of license.—

(1) The department shall renew a license upon receipt of

the renewal application and—fee—anduporn—ecertification by —+the

2N

T

[OR
qar

(2) The department shall adopt rules establishing a

procedure for the biemniat renewal of licenses every 4 years.

Section 82. Subsection (2) of section 468.8417, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

468.8417 1Inactive license.—

(2) A license that becomes inactive may be reactivated
upon application to the department. Fhe department—may preseribe
bz 111 ot 2o 1 e diront+ 2 PN NP ST BN N~ I N NP 2N I I n £
LJ_Y [ S U R S ) \.'\Jlll__Lllel_Lll\j ANPAW B U I WPy & N Wb B N i § J.C\-iu.L.LClllClll—Q TS T CUITTO T CTITOUTT A\ -

LA AR i B & i i T = W ] oo o Th a1 o ot Yooy r mao +h o n

_LCL«L\.,L__LVLzLL__Lll\j T T CT TTTIO T [ N o N ) [ SN S wey ) lllu_y ITToCT J_C\.iLA_L_LC IO 1T CITITTIT T

o N | =1 ~ ot a9 ner Aja~ o+ by + 1 ~ ~ 1 r + ~ 1 SN o

T O T T T WO _Y [ .y e UJ.J.L_,_I_J.J.\,I._I_J.J.\j A\NCAW B I UPY & R WS SN i § \a [ S NPy @5 ) W U T (& T IO CTTIO O
Section 83. Paragraph (d) of subsection (1) and paragraph

(d) of subsection (2) of section 468.8419, Florida Statutes, are
amended to read:
468.8419

Prohibitions; penalties.—

Page 100 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00

V E S




F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2501 (1) A person may not:

2502 (d) Perform or offer to perform any mold remediation to a
2503 structure on which the mold assessor or the mold assessor's
2504| company provided a mold assessment within the last 12 months.
2505| This paragraph does not apply to a certified contractor who is

2506 classified in s. 489.105(2) 5+—489-31065(3) as a Division I

2507 contractor. However, the department may adopt rules requiring
2508 that, i1if such contractor performs the mold assessment and offers
2509 to perform the mold remediation, the contract for mold

2510 remediation provided to the homeowner discloses that he or she
2511 has the right to request competitive bids.

2512 (2) A mold remediator, a company that employs a mold

2513 remediator, or a company that is controlled by a company that
2514 also has a financial interest in a company employing a mold
2515 remediator may not:

2516 (d) Perform or offer to perform any mold assessment to a
2517 structure on which the mold remediator or the mold remediator's
2518 company provided a mold remediation within the last 12 months.
2519| This paragraph does not apply to a certified contractor who is

2520 classified in s. 489.105(2) s+—489-31065{3)> as a Division I

2521 contractor. However, the department may adopt rules requiring
2522 that, if such contractor performs the mold remediation and

2523| offers to perform the mold assessment, the contract for mold
2524 assessment provided to the homeowner discloses that he or she

2525 has the right to request competitive bids.

Page 101 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2526 Section 84. Subsection (4) of section 469.004, Florida
2527 Statutes, is amended to read:
2528 469.004 License; asbestos consultant; asbestos

2529 contractor.—

2530 (4) A license issued under this chapter must be renewed
2531| every 4 2 years. Before—anasbestos—contractor's—Iicensemaybe
2532 rerewedr—thetieensce wust—ecomplete ot —dayv course-of continsiag
2533 echreation—during cach of the preceding 2 —years—Refore—an

2534 | &asbestes—ceoensuttant'ls tiecense may berenewed;—the licensee—must
2535 comprete—a 2—dayecourse—of —continving eduecationduring—each—of
2536 the—preeceding 2 —years-

2537 Section 85. Subsection (5) of section 469.012, Florida

2538 Statutes, is renumbered as subsection (4), and subsection (1)
2539 and present subsection (4) of that section are amended to read:
2540 469.012 Course requirements for onsite supervisors and
2541 asbestos abatement workers.—

2542 (1) FEach asbestos contractor's onsite supervisor must

2543 complete an asbestos contractor/supervisor course of not less
2544 than 5 days before prier—+e engaging in onsite supervision. Such
2545 training shall cover the nature of the health risks, the medical
2546 effects of exposure, federal and state asbestos laws and

2547 regulations, worker protection, and work area protection. Eaech

2548| eonstte—supervisor mustolso——complete a——continuing—education

2549| eeourseof nettess—than 1t day intength ecach—vyear
2550 H—>21t—easbestos—abatement—workers—inetuding—onsite
Page 102 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
2551 JeEEE~VANE L T BN Ao mitat A + NN I i n £ —~ 1 £
UULJ J—V—LUVJ—U, TITCO oS T \./VJ.I.I.LJ—L |y I o L AN U B B\ A S WS S N i . - 1T WL LT .
2552 N~ E SN S I ST LN £ A a0~ PN EEENE I N N N
[ S e \J._LL.,LA.L.,_LVJ.J., o o T A\ZA AW I Ear e ) g \./VJ.J.L,_LJ.J.LA_LJ.J.\j A T T T ITTUIT \NPN & B _Y\/LA.J_ & )
2553 N NS N G T A Arm A v~ A Ny Adornar+tmoan+
& N LA.LJLJJ—VV A\ 8 (S yLw § - %U_LJ_ A\ 8 J\J_Y CIT LJLA.J_ CTIT Ny N wy
2554 Section 86. Subsection (1) of section 469.013, Florida

2555 Statutes, is amended to read:

2556 469.013 Course requirements for asbestos surveyors,

2557| management planners, project monitors, and project designers.—
2558 (1) All asbestos surveyors, management planners, and

2559| project monitors must comply with the requirements under set

2560| ferth—+n this section before prier—+e commencing such activities
2561 ard—mast—also—complete—theecontinugingedueationneecessary—E£e
2562 | medrteinoecereditation—ecach year.

2563 (a) Management planners must complete all requirements of
2564 s. 469.005(2) (b) and (d).

2565 (b) Asbestos surveyors must complete all requirements of
2566| s. 469.005(2) (a).

2567 (c) Project monitors must complete all requirements of s.

2568 469.005(3) (a) and must also complete an asbestos sampling course

2569| which is equivalent to NIOSH Course 582.

2570 (d) Project designers must complete all requirements of s.
2571 469.005(2) (d) .
2572 Section 87. Subsection (5) of section 471.011, Florida

2573 Statutes, is amended to read:
2574 471.011 Fees.—
2575 (5) The bienniat renewal fee shall not exceed $125.

Page 103 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 607

P
D D
O i D iy i
~ r D o) oo o
~ ) — i D ~ D |
— e} OB 0 @ n -
o 0} £ $H D - [o ()} D
. O D D D — YH D @ K8 D
! @) [0} N 4w 4 B D KT - O, ®m
r~ “ 4h @ 0] Ko D P @
< Q, D Y] D } ® (OB D D D
(O O I )] D . D b © O
=} © o B - B ey n ) & D -
o . D £ D ® 4 (O] -H £
-~ o n| -H ow D - (OB 44
+ o) ST ) D D Y © ow [49] D (V] D
0 -—H o @ D & ¢ ¢ 4+ By [N
Q g (0] H n 4P D O ® D D D ¢
0 [ S oo - D D b HORNNRY |
- 0 D 4 4 - H o H P P D
W — < o (0] D ® H D ® oo ® & BN
lo} Q D -H 0} D P @ D —
o > F H %P D ON D O D h gl
— s} “ D ® o) ® - -H 4P o @ D
™ n ol v >N D o) n D -H 4D
~ 0] > KN pe ® 0] [09) D -t ®
.. ol @ D [N 3 D D P ] <~
T O [9) p ow oo D [09) W @ ® ® n D
g © O ©w D m P -H & -t D 4P - 4 D
g @ — O W e B D 0 H D ¢
~ | S n - . D & ¢ 4 (OFENO} H D @ D
—~ . “ o B D - i N D m
N O 0] o o H SIS B D D b D TR ()]
~ P n P 0O D B D @ (0] By 4P D ® . H D D
a o -+ ¢ h 4 D @ 4 & O OFE T
w ¥ o0 O H oo () D D D @ T ORI, <
g 0 O T L D nh P 0 -f — D D
O U A ®© Y f O ¢ b ® . P D H (VI ( @
) a O ® - B D —H H H ] D q A
P 0 — o — D My D D D D D -H
0 m =) D @ TS B 15 L@ o D O
9 O ® © H oy . OB N - ot -
(7] g 20 ¢ -dH P HoF PP o O q < W
Q 0o —~ »u o ¢ $H D D J+ ® & N &F ¢ ¢ D @ -H
3 4 ®© o P b - ¢ d & B O P -0 N1 U N O
n o 2 O O D 1S T BN D & i [90] oo D D
o M H 4 o ¢ ¢ ¢ - N sH -H U 4 -hF @
~ q © ® () IR [OTEIY] q - Ko B ® D D 4 N
- W O O D ® 0P P B 4 B D & oo
o 0 QO & D < 0] D 4 D @ D D — D @
o - Er o D T ¢ LT ow H (0] ® 1 4P
ja] 0} D b & H 4 -H ¢ & -
e P -~ < 4 o - D D D D D B D 4 D D ¥
O ® - H A~ ¢ ¢ @ ¢ T ¢ D L0 -Ho
- P O - ® D - D D ©» (d ¢ d £ EH ® n n
P 0 . - [09) B O, W @ B . H N <~
0 — o~ A~ o o -H [OR D 09} D
d ® —~ N O o D -H D B O] . . . W 0
nn v < - o ¥ O b B h & D o o S D D © &
o~ + - oo k3 ¢ - By ow 4 [ D
H o L S PR R D, P d -H
(o) “ [0} @ [0} @ D D
- O Y D - D HO) D $H D P
c3} H D g H o H O ® P D % D
© ™~ 0O O O +H N MO T O W >~ W O O 4 N O < 0 O >~ W O O
.~ >~ [~ [~ 0 W W W W W W W W W O O O O O O O O O o O
[To N To BT o N To N To NN To NN To NN To NENNTo NENNTe NN To NN To NENNTo NN To NN To ENNTo BENNTo NENNTo NN To NN To NENNTo HENNTo NENNTo BENNTo NENNN)
N N NN N N N N NN N N N NN N NN N N N N N NN

Page 104 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb607-00



V E S

R E P R E S ENTAT I

F

H O U S E O

D A

F L OR

2026

HB 607

P ~
q D D o) (]
fon i1y D — (o)) [}
® ~ (0] -H H B oo o) [0) th
& TR )) 1] K b ® H - [ — 3]
N P E D @ D — ¢ 1y} B Q ] o
s & Do P —H D @& H on m Y D
P P E B4 ® - @ P - &
m D @ & ® [4p] D -rH D + D Rty >y D
¢ D b a 4 -f Wb ¢ © P N [00) oo n Q H H
- () [09) [o9) B ¢ P = oo b D e — -H
b VI [ JE VIR O P () P P B P ) S0P B
K O @ - D W D & @ ~ n @ o}
Y b - & H P D ) b @ ~ P P 0 = | D
[09] D ® @ 4P D D QD BT N O N O D Q — H
4 Hoo| B @ ¢ H o H + Q D
b o)) D -H - N D W -H @ m - fa} © o
D jon b ¢ ¢ P 4 -t D XN D -H - + PP D
Ho-H DB P W D D D n o L) n -
MOJNS B T (VI D T E N D +H 0] 4
- (ol (VI TR ® D D ¥ D H H 0 D P
@ F o <~ D p ¢ B @ D e q
4 &£ 4¢© H $H O nh @ i) -H W EH () D (] —  EH B
® D -fH 4 -H P T @ o e} © P
O o ¢ H» O P N LR D D O . D P s e . D
R s On D D & o ¥ & TV @& P — 2] n n
(o] D ®© H & D n -H P D o (o) Q [ox)
D Ho@ & ¢ [ N ] B By D - — O 0] @
¢ ) D D D O b 1 W O -f o (0] c]) 4 g -H
b D © o L @ H ® H D ) P [V O) B
P P ¢ ® WD B od BB P - D D P ~ o O @
&£ O - B - B H 9 O ¢ M ey D () Q- -H
¢ @ D & 4 LI O (v oo D O ® — — 4
@® A £ @ 4 D D 4P 4D D D D o Q o
L v X e Y O & & 9 4@ D ) 4D . o o D
B @ @ D o - [OF D D D -1 @ H — = -H ¢
b @ D I R O L (O B R O PR O} D n r~ _ 9
&4 - -H QL -1 @& B @ b & & D D D < - D D
O PP E W P W s D MW 4 oo - o oy
I - b © ¢ D up =t g - ) q o Y Er
+ O ¢ & D b s Hoo? m - o -4 O
D H o ] ] i D ® [ I ] D H o oo ) e .
Lo PP ® B ORI D @© 4y B D B H ® D
o, ¢ D & T >N & © & ¢ D 4P 0] > m n
[ON D B n v B D N ¢ H H (0] - 0 @
DN 1 P PN OF RO D -H & L ® D ()] £ 0 D
H @ & e L O TR O B VN < | D & o OF 0O O q
. Q©h -d P (V] D © # ®© ¢ D D OF @ O -
be B @ H Y D D -rH D -rH D . . QO “ It
O -H 4 & 4 - b > - &0 @ W o ¢ ] N o AR oY
-Ho 4D D -H [OFI. ® B H D ® [99] [09) H 4 00 1Y)
N1V R () B TR D ¢ D & o D -H W )] D -H P 2
P ¢ & 4@ P D 4 D & ' & Mm@ 4 5 b g > g ol
® D ® [o9) [( T )] M B —H D -1 4 0 — 0) @
H s P )] g Rty O W 0] H — T o = -H
(OO} h N D ¢ @ D @« o, ¢ B - QO 4
NP HO) D o~ D -M D ™ D O ¢ — P ®
4o - — P . b @ ¥ B A & P 1 @ ™ o~ © b
D ¢ ¢ B W D H & ~+ © ¢ - D b 4 0 a® < P -
(OO P L L I 3 H H @ 0 0 4
|- b P RTINS | o o ¢ O - b O H = (
w9 H D s ¢ ¢ P o 4P P B - B
o Ud (n ® . D D D D D D O o [0} D
® D ¢ S 4 D D © 4 v g ® H [09] D + Y H
— N MO < N O ™~ 0 O O 4 N OO < N0 W ™~ 0o O O +H N M oW
o o o o o o o o o A4 A A4 A A4 4 4 +H4 4 +H4 &N N N N N
O W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W W
N N N N N NN N N N NN NN N N N N NN NN N NN

Page 105 of 449

words underlined are additions.

)

CODING: Words stricken are deletions

hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026
2626 for—reagetivating o ticensefeor a ticensed engincer may ot
2627 ceced—the—econtinuningeducation reguirements preseribed pursuant
2628 to—s5+—471-01t7feorecach vyearthe Iicense—was—inactiv
2629 Section 90. Section 471.045, Florida Statutes, is amended
2630 to read:
2631 471.045 Professional engineers performing building code

2632 inspector duties.—Notwithstanding any other provision of law, a
2633| person who is currently licensed under this chapter to practice
2634 as a professional engineer may provide building code inspection
2635 services described in s. 468.603(4) and (7) s+—468-603{5)—and

2636| +H48)» to a local government or state agency upon its request,

2637| without being certified by the Florida Building Code

2638| Administrators and Inspectors licensing program Beard under part

2639| XII of chapter 468. When performing these building code

2640 inspection services, the professional engineer is subject to the
2641| disciplinary guidelines of this chapter and s. 468.621 (1) (c)-
2642 (h) . Any complaint processing, investigation, and discipline
2643| that arise out of a professional engineer's performing building
2644 code inspection services shall be conducted by the Board of

2645| Professional Engineers rather than the Florida Building Code

2646| Administrators and Inspectors licensing program Bea¥re. A

2647| professional engineer may not perform plans review as an
2648 employee of a local government upon any job that the
2649| professional engineer or the professional engineer's company

2650 designed.

Page 106 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2651 Section 91. Subsection (4) of section 472.003, Florida
2652 Statutes, is amended to read:

2653 472.003 Persons not affected by ss. 472.001-472.037.—

2654 Sections 472.001-472.037 do not apply to:

2655 (4) Persons employed by county property appraisers, as
2656| defined at s. 192.001(3), and persons employed by the Department
2657 of Revenue, to prepare maps for property appraisal purposes

2658 only, but only to the extent that they perform mapping services

2659| which do not include any surveying activities as described in s.

2660| 472.005(3) (a) and (b) s+—47200654H+ta)r—=and—tb).

2661 Section 92. Subsection (1) of section 472.005, Florida
2662 Statutes, is amended to read:

2663 472.005 Definitions.—As used in ss. 472.001-472.037:

2664 o "Board'means—the Beard—eoef Preofessieonat—Surveyeors—and
2665| Mappers—

2666 Section 93. Subsection (1) of section 472.006, Florida
2667 Statutes, is amended to read:

2668 472.006 Department; powers and duties.—The department
2669| shall:

2670 (1) Adopt rules establishing a procedure for the biennialt

2671 renewal of licenses every 4 years. Hewever;—the department—may
2672 issge—up—teo—o4-yearlicense—+to selectedlicensees
2673| rnetwithstandingany other law—te—+theeentrary- Fees for such

2674 renewal may not exceed the fee caps for individual professions

2675| on an annualized basis as authorized by law.

Page 107 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2676 Section 94. Subsection (5) of section 472.011, Florida

2677 Statutes, is amended to read:

2678 472.011 Fees.—
2679 (5) The bienniat renewal fee shall not exceed $500.
2680 Section 95. Subsections (7) through (10) of section

2681 472.0202, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2682 472.0202 Inactive and delinquent status.—

2683 (7) The board, by rule, shall impose an additional

2684| delinquency fee, not to exceed the bienmnialt renewal fee for an
2685 active status license, on a delinquent status licensee when such
2686 licensee applies for active or inactive status.

2687 (8) The board, by rule, shall impose an additional fee,
2688| not to exceed the biemniat renewal fee for an active status

2689 license, for processing a licensee's request to change licensure
2690 status at any time other than at the beginning of a licensure
2691 cycle.

2692 (9) The board, by rule, may impose reasonable conditions,
2693 excluding full reexamination but including part of a national
2694 examination or a special purpose examination to assess current
2695 competency, necessary to ensure that a licensee who has been on
2696 inactive status for more than one two—econsecutivebienniat

2697 licensure cycle eyetes and who applies for active status can
2698| practice with the care and skill sufficient to protect the

2699 health, safety, and welfare of the public. Reactivation

2700 requirements may differ depending on the length of time

Page 108 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2701 licensees are inactive. The costs to meet reactivation

2702 requirements shall be borne by licensees requesting

2703| reactivation.

2704 (10) Before reactivation, an inactive or delinquent

2705 licensee shall meet the same continuing education requirements,
2706| 1if any, imposed on an active status licensee for all biemnialt
2707| licensure periods in which the licensee was inactive or

2708 delinquent.

2709 Section 96. Subsection (2) of section 472.0203, Florida
2710 Statutes, is amended to read:

2711 472.0203 Renewal and cancellation notices.—

2712 (2) Each licensure renewal notification and each notice of
2713| pending cancellation of licensure must state conspicuously that
2714| a licensee who remains on inactive status for more than one &we
2715| conseewtive—bienniatr licensure cycle eyetres and who wishes to
2716 reactivate the license may be required to demonstrate the

2717 competency to resume active practice by sitting for a special
2718| purpose examination or by completing other reactivation

2719 requirements, as defined by rule of the board.

2720 Section 97. Section 473.302, Florida Statutes, is amended
2721 to read:

2722 473.302 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:
2723 u u
2724 (1)42> "Department" means the Department of Business and

2725 Professional Regulation.

Page 109 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2726 (2)43> "Division" means the Division of Certified Public
2727| Accounting.

2728 (3)+4) "Certified public accountant" means an individual
2729| who holds a license to practice public accounting in this state
2730 or an individual who is practicing public accounting in this
2731 state pursuant to the practice privilege granted in s. 473.3141.
2732 The term "Florida certified public accountant" means an

2733 individual holding a license under the authority of this

2734 chapter.

2735 (4)45> "Firm" means any legal entity that is engaged in
2736 the practice of public accounting.

2737 (5)+46)> "Home office" means the principal headquarters of
2738 an entity. An entity may have only one principal headquarters.
2739 (6)4+r "Licensed firm" or "public accounting firm" means a
2740 sole proprietorship, partnership, corporation, limited liability
2741 company, firm, or any other legal entity licensed under s.

2742 473.3101.

2743 (7)48> "Practice of," "practicing public accountancy," or
2744 "public accounting" means:
2745 (a) Offering to perform or performing for the public one

2746 or more types of services involving the expression of an opinion
2747 on financial statements, the attestation as an expert in

2748 accountancy to the reliability or fairness of presentation of
2749 financial information, the utilization of any form of opinion or

2750 financial statements that provide a level of assurance, the

Page 110 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2751 utilization of any form of disclaimer of opinion which conveys
2752 an assurance of reliability as to matters not specifically

2753| disclaimed, or the expression of an opinion on the reliability
2754 of an assertion by one party for the use by a third party;

2755 (b) Offering to perform or performing for the public one
2756| or more types of services involving the use of accounting

2757 skills, or one or more types of tax, management advisory, or
2758 consulting services, by any person who is a certified public
2759 accountant who holds an active license, issued pursuant to this
2760 chapter, or who is authorized to practice public accounting
2761| pursuant to the practice privileges granted in s. 473.3141,
2762 including the performance of such services by a certified public
2763 accountant in the employ of a person or firm;

2764 (c) Offering to perform or performing for the public one
2765| or more types of service involving the preparation of financial
2766 statements not included within paragraph (a), by a certified
2767 public accountant who holds an active license, issued pursuant
2768 to this chapter, or who is authorized to practice public

2769 accounting pursuant to the practice privileges granted in s.
2770 473.3141; by a firm of certified public accountants; or by a
2771 firm in which a certified public accountant has an ownership
2772 interest, including the performance of such services in the
2773 employ of another person. The department beaxrd shall adopt rules
2774 establishing standards of practice for such reports and

2775 financial statements; provided, however, that nothing in this

Page 111 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2776| paragraph shall be construed to permit the department beaxrd to

2777 adopt rules that have the result of prohibiting Florida

2778 certified public accountants employed by unlicensed firms from
2779| preparing financial statements as authorized by this paragraph;
2780 or

2781 (d) Offering to perform or performing for the public one
2782 or more types of services involving any attestation engagements
2783 in accordance with the Statements on Standards for Attestation
2784 Engagements.

27785 (8)+45%> "Uniform Accountancy Act" means the Uniform

2786| Accountancy Act, Eighth Edition, dated January 2018 and

2787| published by the American Institute of Certified Public

2788| Accountants and the National Association of State Boards of
2789| Accountancy.

2790
2791 However, these terms may shadtd not include services provided by
2792 the American Institute of Certified Public Accountants or the
2793 Florida Institute of Certified Public Accountants, or any full
2794 service association of certified public accounting firms whose
2795| plans of administration have been approved by the department
2796| Pbeard, to their members or services performed by these entities
2797 in reviewing the services provided to the public by members of
2798 these entities.

2799 Section 98. Section 473.3035, Florida Statutes, is amended
2800| to read:

Page 112 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2801 473.3035 Division of Certified Public Accounting.—

2802 (1) All services concerning this chapter, including, but
2803| not limited to, recordkeeping services, examination services,
2804 legal services, and investigative services, and those services
2805 in chapter 455 necessary to perform the duties of this chapter
2806| shall be provided by the Division of Certified Public

2807| Accounting. The department beard may+—by mateority—veote;r delegate

2808 a duty or duties to the appropriate division within the

2809 department. The department beard may+—by majerity—veter rescind

2810 any such delegation of duties at any time.
2811 (2) The Division of Certified Public Accounting shall be
2812 funded by fees and assessments of the department beard, and

2813 funds collected by the department beard shall be used only to

2814 fund public accounting regulation. Funding for the Division of
2815 Certified Public Accounting shall be governed by ss. 215.37 and
2816 455.219.

2817 Section 99. Section 473.304, Florida Statutes, is amended
2818 to read:

2819 473.304 Rules of department beard; powers and duties;

2820 legal services.—
2821 (1) The department beard shall adopt rules pursuant—teo—-S5=
2822 | I20-536{H—and—320-54 to implement £he—provisiens—ef this act.

2823| Every certified public accountant and firm shall be governed and

2824 controlled by this act and the rules adopted by the department
2825| beoard.

Page 113 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2826 (2) Subject to the prior approval of the Attorney General,
2827 the department beard may retain independent legal counsel to

2828| provide legal advice to the department beaxrd on a specific

2829| matter.
2830 (3) An attorney employed or used by the department beaxrd

2831| may not both prosecute a matter and provide legal services to
2832 the department beard with respect to the same matter.

2833 Section 100. Section 473.305, Florida Statutes, is amended
2834| to read:

2835 473.305 Fees.—The department beard, by rule, may establish

2836| fees to be paid for applications, examination, reexamination,
2837 licensing and renewal, reinstatement, and recordmaking and

2838 recordkeeping. The fee for the examination shall be established
2839| at an amount that covers the costs for the procurement or

2840 development, administration, grading, and review of the

2841| examination. The fee for the examination is refundable if the
2842 applicant is found to be ineligible to sit for the examination.
2843 The fee for initial application is nonrefundable, and the

2844 combined fees for application and examination may not exceed
2845 $250 plus the actual per applicant cost to the department for
2846| purchase of the examination from the American Institute of

2847 Certified Public Accountants or a similar national organization.
2848 The bienniat renewal fee may not exceed $250. The department
2849 beard may also establish, by rule, a reactivation fee, and a

2850 delingquency fee not to exceed $50 for continuing professional

Page 114 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2851| education reporting forms. The department beard shall establish

2852 fees which are adequate to ensure the continued operation of the
2853 department beard and to fund the proportionate expenses incurred
2854| Dby the department which are allocated to the regulation of

2855| public accountants. Fees shall be based on department estimates
2856| of the revenue required to implement this chapter and the

2857| provisions of law with respect to the regulation of certified
2858| public accountants.

2859 Section 101. Paragraph (b) of subsection (3) and

2860 subsections (4), (5), and (6) of section 473.306, Florida

2861 Statutes, are amended to read:

2862 473.306 Examinations.—

2863 (3) An applicant is entitled to take the licensure

2864 examination to practice in this state as a certified public

2865| accountant if:

2866 (b) The applicant shows that she or he has good moral

2867 character. For purposes of this paragraph, the term "good moral

2868 character" has the same meaning as provided in s. 473.308(6) (a)

2869| s+—44+3-3068{H+a). The department beard may refuse to allow an

2870 applicant to take the licensure examination for failure to
2871 satisfy this requirement if:

2872 1. The department beard finds a reasonable relationship

2873| between the lack of good moral character of the applicant and
2874 the professional responsibilities of a certified public

2875 accountant; and

Page 115 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2876 2. The finding by the department beaxrd of lack of good

2877| moral character is supported by competent substantial evidence.
2878
2879 If an applicant is found pursuant to this paragraph to be

2880| wunqualified to take the licensure examination because of a lack

2881 of good moral character, the department beard shall furnish to

2882| the applicant a statement containing the findings of the

2883 department beard, a complete record of the evidence upon which
2884 the determination was based, and a notice of the rights of the
2885 applicant to a rehearing and appeal.

2886 (4) The department beard shall have the authority to

2887 establish the standards for determining and shall determine:
2888 (a) What constitutes a passing grade for each subject or
2889| part of the licensure examination;

2890 (b) Which educational institutions, in addition to the
2891 universities in the State University System of Florida, shall be
2892 deemed to be accredited colleges or universities;

2893 (c) What courses and number of hours constitute a major in
2894 accounting; and

2895 (d) What courses and number of hours constitute additional
2896 accounting courses acceptable under s. 473.308(4).

2897 (5) The department beard may adopt an alternative

2898 licensure examination for persons who have been licensed to
2899| practice public accountancy or its equivalent in a foreign

2900 country so long as the International Qualifications Appraisal

Page 116 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2901| Board of the National Association of State Boards of Accountancy
2902| has ratified an agreement with that country for reciprocal

2903 licensure.

2904 (6) For the purposes of maintaining the proper educational

2905| qualifications for licensure under this chapter, the department

2906| Pbeard may appoint an Educational Advisory Committee, which shall
2907| be composed of one member of the department beard, two persons

2908 in public practice who are licensed under this chapter, and four
2909| academicians on faculties of universities in this state.

2910 Section 102. Subsections (1), (2), and (3) of section

2911 473.309, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

2912 473.309 Practice requirements for partnerships,

2913 corporations, and limited liability companies; business entities
2914| practicing public accounting.—

2915 (1) A partnership may not engage in the practice of public

2916 accounting, as defined in s. 473.302(7) (a) s+—493302&+=), or

2917| meet the requirements of s. 473.3101(1) (b), unless:

2918 (a) It is a form of partnership recognized by Florida law.
2919 (b) Partners owning at least 51 percent of the financial
2920 interest and voting rights of the partnership are certified

2921| public accountants in some state. However, each partner who 1is a
2922 certified public accountant in another state and is domiciled in
2923 this state must be a certified public accountant of this state
2924 and hold an active license.

2925 (c) At least one general partner is a certified public

Page 117 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2926 accountant of this state and holds an active license or, in the
2927 case of a firm that must have a license pursuant to s.

2928 473.3101(1) (c), at least one general partner is a certified

2929| public accountant in some state and meets the requirements of s.

2930 473.3141(1) s—47+3=32

iy

AY r (1)
7

1 (1N (o
[ S e Sy B W @ Y OT A\

2931 (d) All partners who are not certified public accountants
2932 in any state are engaged in the business of the partnership as
2933 their principal occupation.

2934 (e) It is in compliance with rules adopted by the

2935| department beard pertaining to minimum capitalization, letters
2936 of credit, and adequate public liability insurance.

2937 (2) A corporation may not engage in the practice of public

2938 accounting, as defined in s. 473.302(7) (a) s+—493-302&+=), or

2939| meet the requirements of s. 473.3101(1) (b), unless:

2940 (a) It is a corporation duly organized in this or some
2941 other state.

2942 (b) Shareholders of the corporation owning at least 51
2943| percent of the financial interest and voting rights of the
2944 corporation are certified public accountants in some state and
2945| are principally engaged in the business of the corporation.
2946| However, each shareholder who is a certified public accountant
2947 in another state and is domiciled in this state must be a

2948 certified public accountant of this state and hold an active
2949 license.

2950 (c) The principal officer of the corporation is a

Page 118 of 449

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb607-00



F L ORI DA H O U S E O F R E P RESENTATI V E S

HB 607 2026

2951 certified public accountant in some state.

2952 (d) At least one shareholder of the corporation is a

2953| certified public accountant and holds an active license in this
2954 state or, in the case of a firm that must have a license

2955 pursuant to s. 473.3101(1) (c), at least one shareholder is a
2956| certified public accountant in some state and meets the

2957 requirements of s. 473.3141 (1) 47334+ r—oer—b).

[0)]

2958 (e) All shareholders who are not certified public

2959 accountants in any state are engaged in the business of the

2960 corporation as their principal occupation.

2961 (f) It is in compliance with rules adopted by the

2962| department beard pertaining to minimum capitalization, letters
2963 of credit, and adequate public liability insurance.

2964 (3) A limited liability company may not engage in the

2965| practice of public accounting, as defined in s. 473.302(7) (a) s+
2966 49330248y +a), or meet the requirements of s. 473.3101(1) (b),
2967 unless:

2968 (a) It is a limited liability company duly organized in
2969| this or some other state.

2970 (b) Members of the limited liability company owning at
2971 least 51 percent of the financial interest and voting rights of
2972 the company are certified public accountants in some state.
2973 However, each member who is a certified public accountant in
2974 some state and is domiciled in this state must be a certified

2975| public accountant of this state and hold an ac